
Bid Opening Date: 07/05/2017

RFB: 2017-154-07-05-TDL "PURCHASE OF Tires, Installation & Other Services"

Mounting Rotation

(Cost) (Cost)

1.         10.00R20 ZEEMAX HIGHWAY, TT INC. TUBE252.19$            18.00$     -$            

2.         11R22.5 DUNLOP SP 348 305.00$            18.00$     -$            

3.         11R24.5 DUNLOP SP 348 325.00$            18.00$     -$            

4.         215/85-R16  A/T GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 122.36$            5.00$       -$            

5.         215-60-17 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S85.05$              5.00$       -$            

6.         225/75-R16 GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA109.95$            5.00$       -$            

7.         225-45-17 GOODYEAR EAGLE SPORT A/S94.45$              5.00$       -$            

8.         225-55-17 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S91.43$              5.00$       -$            

9.         225-60-18 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S97.75$              5.00$       -$            

10.       235/65-R17 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE FUEL MAX95.61$              5.00$       -$            

11.       235-55-R17   CP4 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA110.00$            5.00$       -$            

12.       235-55-R17  (speed rated)      CP1 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA110.00$            5.00$       -$            

13.       235-55-ZR17 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA110.00$            5.00$       -$            

14.       235-55-ZR17    99W M +S GOODYEAR EAGLE SPORT A/S106.17$            5.00$       -$            

15.       235-85-R16 (hwy all steel -10 ply) GOODYEAR WRANGLER HTS129.09$            5.00$       -$            

16.       245/75-R16  A/T GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 101.48$            5.00$       -$            

17.       245-70-R19.5  (hwy) DUNLOP SP348 222.26$            5.00$       -$            

18.       255-50.19 GOODYEAR ULTRA GRIP SUV ROF265.62$            5.00$       -$            

19.       P255-60-R16 NO BID NO BID 5.00$       -$            

20.       255-70-18 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE CS FUEL MAX130.33$            5.00$       -$            

21.       265-70-R17 M + S GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA114.92$            5.00$       -$            

22.       275-55-20 GOODYEAR EAGLE SPORT A/S128.13$            5.00$       -$            

23.       275-60-20 GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA103.81$            5.00$       -$            

24.       285-45-22 GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE156.06$            5.00$       -$            

25.       285-60-R18 M + S NO BID NO BID -$            

26.       295-75-R22.5 DUNLOP SP348 300.00$            5.00$       -$            

27.       305-55-20 GOODYEAR WRANGLER AT ADVENTURE292.40$            5.00$       -$            

28.       325-65-18 GOODYEAR FIERCE ATTITUDE M/T229.18$            5.00$       -$            

29.       37x12.50x17 GOODYEAR WRANGLER MT/R320.86$            5.00$       -$            

30.       8.25R20 NUTECH N-100 HIGHWAY TT, TUBE INCLUDED210.81$            5.00$       -$            

31.       9.00R20 ZEEMAX HIGHWAY, TT INC. TUBE214.31$            5.00$       -$            

32.       LT235-75-R15 (all terrain -10 ply) NO BID NO BID -$            

33.       235-75-R15XL GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT125.97$            5.00$       -$            

34.       LT245-78-R16 (all terrain -10 ply) NO BID NO BID -$            

35.       LT245-75-R16 (all terrain -10 ply) GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 125.17$            5.00$       -$            

36.       LT265-75-R16 (all terrain -10 ply) GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 138.75$            5.00$       -$            

NO. TIRE SIZE AND DESCRIPTION

GOOD YEAR

BRAND Unit Price per Tire

Optional Services



37.       LT325-65-R18 (all terrain) GOODYEAR FIERCE ATTITUDE M/T229.18$            5.00$       -$            

38.       P205-50-R16 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S78.65$              5.00$       -$            

39.       P205-55-R16 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S68.06$              5.00$       -$            

40.       P205-65-R15 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S63.71$              5.00$       -$            

41.       P205-75-R15 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S63.39$              5.00$       -$            

42.       P215-60-R16 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE A/S72.29$              5.00$       -$            

43.       P225-60-R16  (speed rated) GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA95.00$              5.00$       -$            

44.       P235-55-R17  (speed rated) CP3 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA110.00$            5.00$       -$            

45.       P235-70-R17 GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 117.16$            5.00$       -$            

46.       P235-75-R17  (10 ply) NO BID NO BID -$            

47.       P235-65-R17  (regular  tire) GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 117.16$            5.00$       -$            

48.       P245-70-R17  (10 ply) GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 134.71$            5.00$       -$            

49.       P255-65-R17 GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE101.46$            5.00$       -$            

50.       P255-70-R16 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE CS FUEL MAX106.21$            5.00$       -$            

51.       P255-70R17    11OT Silent Amor GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE131.59$            5.00$       -$            

52.       P255-70-R17    (10 ply) NO BID NO BID -$            

53.       P255-70-R17 M + S 11OT Silent ArmorGOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE131.59$            5.00$       -$            

54.       P265-60-R17 (speed rated) GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA125.00$            5.00$       -$            

55.       P265-60-R17 108-H GOODYEAR ULTRA GRIP 135.00$            5.00$       -$            

56.       P265-70-R17  (10 ply) GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 146.01$            5.00$       -$            

57.       P265-70-R18 GOODYEAR ASSURANCE CS FUEL MAX125.50$            5.00$       -$            

58.       P265-90-R17 108-H NO BID NO BID -$            

59.       P265-70-R17 GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA114.92$            5.00$       -$            

60.       P265-65-R18 GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 144.05$            5.00$       -$            

61 LT265-70-R17 GOODYEAR WRANGLER TRAIL RUNNER 146.01 5.00$       -$            

7,880.76$    $329.00GRAND TOTAL



Balancing Mounting Rotation Balancing

(Cost) (Cost) (Cost) (Cost)

8.00$          ECED BT168 HWY                                          #EC1026 337.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$          FIRESTONE FS561                                        #248307 314.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$          FIRESTONE FS561                                        #248358 332.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT2                    #000178 106.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #014825 88.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT2                    #000180 116.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015522 91.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015590 95.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015301 92.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015012 86.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015641 97.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER     #015641 97.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z PURSUIT     #003874 111.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z PURSUIT     #003874 111.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          LING LONG LION SPORT                              #221005339 100.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          TIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT2                    #000181 118.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FS561                                         #248443 146.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                    #002013 130.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK PV41                       #067911 97.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                    #097878 115.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                    #097912 115.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                    #136162 118.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                    #136145 124.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          BRIDGESTONE DUELER A/T REVO2            #123276 149.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

BRIDGESTONE DUELER H/T 684 II             #122889 166.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FS561                                        #248273 310.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$           FIRESTONE DESTINATION M/T                  #000173 255.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT                    #192353 203.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          MASTERCRAFT COURSER                          #90000020126 274.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

8.00$          NO BID                                                            NO BID NO BID

8.00$          LING LONG LLA08                                        #211002777 288.00$          18.50$        10.00$        18.00$        

FIRESTONE TRANFORCE AT                      #189650 105.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                  #097623 98.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT2                   #000181 118.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT2                   #000181 118.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT2                   #000182 132.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

GOOD YEAR SOUTHERN TIRE MART
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8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT                    #192353 203.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015420 77.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015148 71.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015199 60.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIREDESTINATION AT                                 #026495 92.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015029 73.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015607 75.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER   #015641 97.00$            8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                  #037776 104.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT                    #003480 113.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                  #097776 104.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT                    #232990 119.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                 #098048 107.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                 #097844 112.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                 #136043 116.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                 #136043 116.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                 #136043 116.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT V                    #023189 122.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT V                    #023189 122.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT                    #200156 137.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                  #097929 120.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2                  #098065 109.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2               #097912 115.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT2               #000190 153.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

8.00$          FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT2              #000187 140.00$          8.50$          5.00$          6.00$          

432.00$  8,125.00$  580.00$  335.00$  444.00$  


