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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4 Nature of interest (check applicable)
City, State, Country (place of business)

Intermediary

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 03/18/2016

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
G&K Services
San Antonio, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the goods or services to be provided under the contract.

3

Hidalgo County

Uniforms
E-16-110B-04-05

2016-28087

03/18/2016

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

G&K Services XSan Antonio, TX United States

Signature of officer administering oath

6

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL  ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Title of officer administering oath

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said  _____________________________________, this the ____________ day of ______________,

20________, to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

AFFIDAVIT

Printed name of officer administering oath

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5

Version V1.0.312www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
TABULATION SHEET 

DESCRIPTION OF BID: Hidalgo County -RENTAL and /or PURCHASE of INDUSTRIAL UNIFORMS 
BID NO: 2014-013-02-05-SMA 

BID OPENING DATE: February 05, 2014 @   9:30 A.M BUYER:  Sandra Montalvo 

 PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

Item Description 

UNIFIRST HOLDING, INC. 
McAllen, TX 

MODEL LAUDRY, LLC 
LOS INDIOS, TX 

G & K SERVICE 
SAN ANTONIO, TX 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

1. 
SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.26 $1.71 $13.00 $11.00 $3.90 $2.50 $15.00 $16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

2. 
SHIRTS-LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 100% cotton 

$4.25 $3.00 $15.00 $13.00 $5.04 $3.00 $18.43 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

3. 

SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.68 $3.78 $22.00 $18.00 $9.00 $5.66 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

4. 
SHIRTS-SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.15 $1.65 $11.00 $9.00 $3.75 $2.25 $12.25 16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

5. 
SHIRTS-SHORT  SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL  (men & women) 
100% cotton 

$4.10 $2.94 $13.00 $11.00 $4.85 $2.90 $17.82 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

6. 

SHIRTS- SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.50 $3.41 $19.00 $16.00 $9.00 $5.44 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

7. 
SHIRTS- EXECUTIVE WESTERN 
STYLE (Men)  65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.92 $2.07 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $19.43 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

8. POLO SHIRTS (men & women) 50% 
Polyester 50% Cotton $3.88 $2.06 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $17.95 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

9. 

SHORT SLEEVE SMOCK (women) 
65 % Polyester 35% Cotton $3.52 $2.38 $16.00 $13.50 $4.88 $3.50 $17.00 $20.00 $2.65 $1.47 $20.95 $20.95 

10. TROUSERS-Industrial (men) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.08 $1.68 $16.50 $13.90 $3.99 $2.50 $16.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

11. TROUSERS-INDUSTRIAL (WOMEN) 
65% Polyester 35% Cotton $3.96 $2.16 $18.00 $15.00 $5.00 $2.90 $18.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

12.

EXECUTIVE PANTS  (Men) *must be 
available for Supervisory positions as 
requested by dept. 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.41 $1.86 $17.00 $15.00 $5.50 $3.50 $22.95 $30.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

13.
RIPSTOP PANTS-(MEN)100% ripstop 
cotton pants military-grade heavyweight 
10-oz 

NO BID  NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID  
Dickies 
Cargo 
$4.25 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$2.75 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

14.
DENIM BLUE JEANS-100% Cotton- 
(MEN)  (Boot Cut, Flare & Straight Leg)14 
3/4 Oz. Denim 

$4.40 $2.40 $18.00 $15.00 $4.90 $2.95 $17.35 $18.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

15. SHORTS- Pleated Uniform  (Men) 65% 
Polyester/35% Cotton $2.64 $1.68 $12.50 $10.00 $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

16. SHORTS- Pleated Uniform (Women) 
65% Polyester/35% Cotton N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

17. COVERALLS- 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton ---- ----- $19.00 $16.00 $7.92 $3.35 $29.00 $30.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

18. PATCHES AND/OR LOGOs-- one 
time charge for Shirt $57.75 $31.50 

$5.25 
/pc N/A $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 N/A NO CHARGE 

19.

ADDITIONAL FEES (if any):   per shirt per shirt per shirt ----- ------------------------------------ 
SHIRTS---3XL-5XL   
upcharge per pcs  20% 20% 25% N/A 

  
PANTS -Size 44’plus/ 
Size 20” plus upcharge per pcs. 20% 20% 25% N/A 
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EXIBIT- A 
QUESTIONAIRE  

UNIFIRST	HOLDING,	
INC.	

McAllen,	TX	
(vendors	response) 

MODEL	LAUDRY,	LLC	
LOS	INDIOS,	TX	

(vendors	response) 

G	&	K	SERVICE	
SAN	ANTONIO,	TX	
(vendors	response) 

1) Is there a fee for returned 
uniforms upon 
termination or resignation 
of an employee?  If so, 
what is your fee and how 
long must an employee 
lease a uniform without 
paying termination 
charges? 

no termination fee or charge for 
employee no linger employee no 
longer employed with county 

NO 

loss/damage only applies if 
garments are not returned or 
damaged when an employee 
leaves the program 

2) Will your company be 
capable of depicting 
actual charges? 

there are no definite numbers of 
employees for rental, value lease 
or purchase that will allow my 
company to depict and actual 
charges for any given program 

YES YES 

3) Will your company 
furnish coveralls, free of 
charge, with the rental or 
purchase of uniforms?  If 
so, how many? 

Loaners are available of Grade 2 
(semi used garments ) for up to 
but not exceeding 20 business 
days, when there is a delay of 
specified uniform at no charge to 
be reviewed on case by case 
method of rental uniforms 
service only this does not apply 
to purchased uniforms 

NO 
we can add coveralls to the 
rentals or lease program, but 
not for free 

4) If contract is awarded to 
your company, the prices 
will be in effect for the 
length of the contract. 

there will be a 2% price increase 
per anum for life of contract 

YES   

5) Please list any warranties 
and any other policies not 
described in Attachment 
A. 

Manufactures warranties 
extended to all programs for 
defective or faulty merchandise 
no other warranties or guarantees 
apply 

------ 
covered under G&K 
SERVICES “CUSTOMER 
PROMISE” 





DATE(MM/DDNYVY)

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
3/11/2014

DPC#165 D7
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms
and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in
lieu of such endorsement(s).
PRODUCER CONTACT

NAME: Melody Kronbach or Dawn DeBuhr
PHONE I PHONE

Hays Companies
(Ale. No. Ext: 612-333-3323 (Ale. No. Ext: 612-333-3323
E·MAIL

IDS Center, Suite 700 ADDRESS: g&kcerts@hayscompanies.com
PRODUCER

80 South 8
1h

Street CUSTOMERID#: G&K···1
Minneapolis, MN 55402 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC#

INSURER A: ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY 16535
INSURED INSURER B: AMERICAN ZURICH INSURANCE COMPANY 40142

INSURER C: GREAT AMERICAN E&S INSURANCE COMPANY 37532
G & K Services, Inc. & Its Subsidiaries INSURER D:
5995 Opus Parkway INSURER E:
Minnetonka, MN 55343 INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER· REVISION NUMBER·

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR TYPE OF INSURANCE ADDL SUBR POLICY NUMBER POLICY EFF POLICY EXP LIMITSLTR INSU WVD (MMIDDIYYYY) (MMIDDIYYYY)
~RAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000

DAMAGE TO RENTEDA X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ 1,000,000

I CLAIMS-MADE 0 OCCUR MED EXP (Anyone person) $ 10,000
GL0585230301 12/01/2013 12/01/2014 PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 1,000,000

GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 15,000,000

~ AGGREGATFlIT APPLlE~R: PRODUCTS - COMPlOP AGG $ 2,000,000
POLICY j~g~ X LOC $

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT $ 3,000,000(Ea accident)
-

A X ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) $
-

ALL OWNED AUTOS BODLlY INJURY (Per accident) $
-

BAP585230401 12/01/2013 12/01/2014SCHEDULED AUTOS PROPERTY DAMAGE-
(Per accident) $

X HIRED AUTOS
-
X NON-OWNED AUTOS $
-
X PHYSICAL DAMAGE - SELF-INSURED $

UMBRELLA L1AB H CLAIMS-MADE

EACH OCCURRENCE $
-

EXCESS L1AB AGGREGATE $

DEDUCTIBLE $
-

RETENTION $ $
I WCSTATU- I I OTH-WORKERS COMPENSATION

WC585230101 - X TORYLIMITS ER
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

YIN DEDUCTIBLE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
B ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVEG N/A 12/01/2013 12/01/2014A OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

WC585230201 -
E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $ 1,000,000

(Mandatory in NH)

If yes, describe under RETRO E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $ 1,000,000DESCRIPTIONOF OPERATIONS below

ECA3719729 12/01/2013 12/01/2014
Per Person $ 5,000,000

C Texas Employers Excess Indemnity Ins.
Per Occurrence $ 25,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS I LOCATIONS I VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, if more space is required)

Evidence of Insurance.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

Hidalgo County ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

2812 S. Bus Hwy. 281 AUTHORIZEDREPRESENTATIVE
Edinburg, TX 78539

{~~~

ACORD 25 (2009/09)
© 1988-2009 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



   

AI-43935     Purchasing Department      21. A. 4.             

CC REGULAR

Meeting Date: 04/08/2014  

Submitted For: Martha L. Salazar Submitted By: Letty Saenz, PURCHASING DEPT.

Department: PURCHASING DEPT.

Information

CAPTION

Presentation of bids received for the purpose of award and approval of contract documents to multiple 

responsible vendors submitting the lowest and best bids (meeting all specifications and/or requirements)

for: Rental and/or Purchase of Industrial Uniforms" for Hidalgo

County-RFB:2014-013-02-05-SMA.

BACKGROUND

Recommended multiple vendors: 

1) C-14-013-04-08-(UNIFIRST HOLDING CO.)

2) C-14-013A-04-08(MODEL LAUNDRY)

3)  C-14-013B-04-08 (G&K SERVICES, INC.

Contracts to commence on April 30, 2014.

Contracts reviewed and approved by legal counsel as to form.

Fiscal Impact

FISCAL YEAR: 2014 ACCT. #:

FUNDS AVAILABLE Y/N?: MATCHING FUNDS Y/N?:

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

**Note-Various funding sources are utilized for this contract (Countywide Contract) (on an as needed

basis)

2014 Budget - Object codes (possible): 343 & 605

Attachments

Recommendations

Recommendations 2

Tabulation

C-14-013-04-08-Unifirst Holding Co-HC

C-14-013A-04-08-Model Laundry LLC-HC

C-14-013B-04-08-G & K Servcies Inc-HC

Legals approval

part log

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Purchasing Department Marty Salazar 04/04/2014 10:43 AM
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leticia.saenz
Approved

leticia.saenz
Accepted
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SPECIAL MEETING - April 8, 2014 

BE IT REMEMBERED, that on this 8th day of April A.D., 2014, there was begun and held a SPECIAL MEETING of the Honorable
Commissioners’ Court of Hidalgo County, Texas, wherein the following members thereof were present, to-wit: 

HONORABLE RAMON GARCIA

HONORABLE A.C. CUELLAR, JR.

HONORABLE HECTOR "TITO" PALACIOS

HONORABLE JOE M. FLORES

HONORABLE JOSEPH PALACIOS

HIDALGO COUNTY JUDGE

COMMISSIONER, PRECINCT NO. 1

COMMISSIONER, PRECINCT NO. 2

COMMISSIONER, PRECINCT NO. 3

COMMISSIONER, PRECINCT NO. 4

and ARTURO GUAJARDO, JR., COUNTY CLERK & EX-OFFICIO CLERK OF THE COMMISSIONERS’ COURT of Hidalgo County, Texas,
wherein the following proceedings were had, to-wit:

                                                                                                                         1 

April 8, 2014 
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AGENDA
CC REGULAR

HIDALGO COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS COURT MEETING

April 8, 2014
8:45 A.M.

                                          

NOTICE is hereby given in accordance with Chapter 551, Texas Government Code, that a SPECIAL MEETING of the Commissioners' Court will be

held at the Edinburg Council Chambers 415 W. University Drive, Edinburg, Hidalgo County, Texas. Discussion and possible action relating to the

following business will be transacted: 

           

1.   Roll Call

All members of the Court were counted present.
 

2.   Pledge of Allegiance

Marely De La Cruz led the Court and Audience in reciting the Pledge of Allegiance.
 

3.   Prayer

Virginia Townsend led the Court and Audience in Prayer.
 

4.   Approval of Consent Agenda

The Court moved to approve the Consent Agenda for the exception of Item 7.B to be pulled for discussion.
 

5.   Open Forum

Fern McClaugherty commented on the cost of living raise the Head Start Program is requesting.  

 Opal Billman stated she never received her share of the community property owed to her and she never received
payment for it, either.  She stated that she still owns it and she should get paid for it.

 Yvonne Ramon commented on a news story that aired the prior evening stating that voters from San Angelo
were registered as Hidalgo County voters.  She researched where the information derived and will continue her
fact-finding regarding this issue.

 

6.   AI-43924    A.  Appointment of Interim Constable, Pct. #4

Judge Garcia named the four candidates and are as follows: Deborah Marmolejo, Raul Ramos, Atanacio Gaytan,
and Horaldo Sanchez. 

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C.
CUELLAR, JR., the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  5 - 0 - Unanimously

B.  Approval to set bond amount for Interim Constable, Pct. #4

Mr. Valde Guerra stated the bond would be set at the maximum amount of $1,500.00.

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 4, JOSEPH
PALACIOS, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  5 - 0 - Unanimously

C.  Approval of bond for Interim Constable, Pct. #4  

This Item was voted on during Open Session.  Commissioner Joseph Palacios was not present for the vote.

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 2, HECTOR
“TITO” PALACIOS, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously

At this time, Mr. Atanacio "J.R." Gaitan was sworn in by the Honorable Judge Rudy Delgado.

  

 

7.   Constables:
 

A.   AI-43923    Constable Precinct No. 4:
1. Discussion, consideration, and approval to appoint the persons listed below as Deputy Constable by
Constable ____________,Constable Precinct 4 in accordance with Texas Local Government Code Section 86.011:

  

                                                                                                                         2 

April 8, 2014 
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A.   AI-43936    Approval to rename "G.I. Road" to "Capt. Ken Baker Road"   

 

  On motion by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C.
CUELLAR, JR. , the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval. 

  Vote: 4 - 0 - Unanimously
 

B.   AI-43919    Requesting approval to process the following invoices as claims with authority for County Treasurer to issue
payment after review, audit, and processing procedures are completed by the County Auditor. 

Vendor Invoice # Amount

Magic Valley Concrete  140226  $400.00 

Magic Valley Concrete  141468  $560.00

Magic Valley Concrete  141499  $1,840.00

Magic Valley Concrete  142281  $560.00 

Magic Valley Concrete  142594  $920.00

Safety-Kleen System Inc. 62783278  $171.56

  

 

  On motion by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 2, HECTOR PALACIOS, seconded by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 1,
A.C. CUELLAR, JR. , the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval. 

  Vote: 4 - 0 - Unanimously
 

21.   Purchasing Department - Marty Salazar:
Notes: 
A. FOR ANY CONTRACT(S) AWARDED AND APPROVED UNDER THIS AGENDA, EXECUTED COPIES OF
THE CONTRACT(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE ON THE COUNTY INTRA-NET WEBSITE AND WILL BE
FOWARDED VIA E-MAIL, FAX OR HAND DELIVERED TO HIDALGO COUNTY AUDITOR'S OFFICE. 

B. ANY AND ALL REQUESTS FOR PAYMENT(S) APPROVED WILL BE SUBJECT TO COUNTY AUDITORS
PROCESSING PROCEDURES INCLUDING AUTHORITY FOR COUNTY TREASURER TO ISSUE
PAYMENT(S)/CHECK(S).

 

A.   Hidalgo County
 

1.   AI-43950    Presentation for consideration, discussion, acceptance, and approval of Work Authorization No. 5 (with a estimated
cost of $2,838.93) for construction materials testing Services for the, "Renovations to Former Administration
Building"  with L&G Engineering Laboratory, LLC, to provide engineer services to Hidalgo County. C-13-220-08-13

  

 

  On motion by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 2,
HECTOR PALACIOS , the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval. 

  Vote: 4 - 0 - Unanimously
 

2.   AI-43577    LAW LIBRARY:
A. Requesting exemption form competitive bidding requirements under Texas Local Government Code 262.024
(a)(7) -"an item that can obtained from only one source";

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT.  1, A.C.
CUELLAR, JR., the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously

At this time, Commissioner Hector "Tito" Palacios stepped away from the meeting.

B. Approval of the Sole Source Declaration for "West Publishing Corporation -Thomson Reuters", to include the
purchase of all future upgrades, software, maintenance-support and related services for the Hidalgo County-Law
Library for:  "Online  Legal Research Services" with said declaration to remain in effect unless revoke by HCCC.

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M.
FLORES, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  3 - 0 - Unanimously

  

 

3.   AI-43926    Acceptance and approval to award proposal received in the amount of $6,439.32 from Herrera and Hunt, Inc.,   
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3.   AI-43926    Acceptance and approval to award proposal received in the amount of $6,439.32 from Herrera and Hunt, Inc.,
awarded Job Order Contractor through County's participation with HCDE-Choice Facility Partners JOC contract No.
JOC-09-040JC-07, for the project: Hidalgo County Facilities Management -"Storefront Doorway Installation at the
Health Department". 

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M.
FLORES, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  3 - 0 - Unanimously

Commissioner Hector "Tito" Palacios joined the meeting.

  

 

4.   AI-43935    Presentation of bids received for the purpose of award and approval of contract documents to multiple  responsible
vendors submitting the lowest and best bids (meeting all specifications and/or requirements) for: Rental and/or
Purchase of Industrial Uniforms"  for Hidalgo County- RFB:2014-013-02-05-SMA.

  

 

  On motion by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C.
CUELLAR, JR. , the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval. 

  Vote: 4 - 0 - Unanimously
 

5.   AI-43816    Presentation by Purchasing Department for acceptance, adoption, and approval  of Hidalgo County Fixed Asset
Policy & Procedures Manual for use by all applicable Elected Offices, Departments, Programs & Agencies.

NO ACTION taken on this Item.

  

 

6.   AI-43913    a. Acceptance and approval of an Amendment No. 2 to the AIA A101-2007 Standard Form of Agreement with D.
Wilson Construction Company, for the "Remodel of Existing Old Administration Building (1st and 2nd Floor)," to
remove the allowance schedules and re-direct to Betterment Allowance;

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M. FLORES, seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C.
CUELLAR, JR., the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval subject to legal review.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously

b. Requesting approval of clarifications to the following Construction Change Directives:      
       1. Change Directive No. 1 (approved CC 11/26/13) to be funded by allowance;
       2. Change Directive No. 2  (CC 3/11/14-NOT APPROVED) thus null and void;
       3. Change Directive No. 3 (CC 3/18/14) to be funded by either the allowances or Betterment Allowance;

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE M.
FLORES, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously

c. Requesting approval of Change Order No. 1 (increase) in connection: "Repairs and Renovations-1st and 2nd
Floor to the Former Administration Building," in the amount of $124,541.00 to awarded general contractor, D. Wilson
Construction, Inc., and as recommended by project architect, Alcocer Garcia Associates with concurrence by
construction manager, Prodigy, including authority for County Judge to execute document;
 
     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT. 2, HECTOR
“TITO” PALACIOS, the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously
  d. Approval of Request for Payment-Application No. 5 in the amount of $491,913.80 from D. Wilson Construction
Co. awarded contractor for the, "Repairs and Renovations-1st and 2nd Floors to the Former Administration
Building", and as certified for payment by project architect, Alcocer Garcia Associates, Inc. and reviewed & initialed
by construction manager, Prodigy C-12-029-10-23.

     On motion by COMMISSIONER PCT. 2, HECTOR “TITO” PALACIOS, seconded by COMMISSIONER PCT.  1,
A.C. CUELLAR, JR., the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval.

     Vote:  4 - 0 - Unanimously

  

 

B.   Pct. 1
 

1.   AI-43820    Acceptance and approval to purchase One (1) New 2015 Cat Model CT660 Brush Truck with standard equipment
through Hidalgo County's membership/participation with National Joint Powers Alliance (NJPA) awarded Contract
#060311-CAT in the amount of $123,616.26 through assigned requisition #254466.

  

 

  On motion by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 1, A.C. CUELLAR, JR., seconded by  COMMISSIONER PCT. 3, JOE
M. FLORES , the Court made a UNANIMOUS vote of approval. 

  Vote: 4 - 0 - Unanimously
 

C.   Pct. 2
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