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COMPANIES 4 MY CLINIC, INC. PREMIER SCIENTIFIC  
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Samples Yes  Samples Yes  

MEDICAL SUPPLIES  COST PER UNIT 

 

Size Qty per 
box 

Qty per 
case 

TtL Cost 
per case 

Price Qty per 
box 

Qty per 
case 

TtL Cost 
per case 

Price 

1 
 

 
Sterile Surgilance –One 
Step Lancets  SLN 

200 - 1.8 Punt. 
depth 

Needle: 23 ga 

200 2000 
 

$ 240.00 
 

$ 0.12 
 

100         --- --- 7.61 
 

  

 

 

 
2 
 

Band-Aids – Sterile     ¾ in x 3 in 80 1920 $ 45.00 $ 0.023 
 

100 3600 
 

$ 40.32 $ 1.12  

 
 

3 
 
 

Alcohol Preps 
 
 

 
------ 

200 3000 
 

$ 30.00 
 

$ 0.01 
 

200 4000 
 

$ 28.60 $ 1.43  

 

 

4 
Sharps Containers 14 QT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid --- 10 $ 62.20 $ 6.42  

 

 

 
5 
 

Vinyl Exam Gloves- Small   
(powder free-non sterile) 
 

Small 100 1000 
 

$ 40.00 $ 0.04 
 

100 1000 
 

$ 22.30 $ 2.23  
 
 

 
6 

Vinyl Exam Glove-Medium 
(powder free-non sterile) 
 

Medium 100 1000 
 

$ 40.00 $ 0.04 
 

100 1000 
 

$ 22.30 $ 2.23  
 

 

 
7 
 
 
 

Vinyl Exam Gloves–Large   
(powder free-non sterile) 

Large 100 1000 
 

$  40.00 $ 0.04 
 

100 1000 
 

$ 22.30 $ 2.23  

 

 

8 
 
 
 
 
 

Alasta Nitrile Gloves-Large  
(powder  free-non sterile) 
 

Large 
 

100 1000 
 

$ 55.00 $ 0.055 
 

300 
 

3000 
 

$ 89.00 $ 8.90 
 

 
 

 



TABULATION SHEET                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      
HIDALGO COUNTY – WIC PROGRAM                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               

“MEDICAL SUPPLIES”                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           
BID NO.: 2018-179-08-08-SGS 

 

Tabulation Sheet 

 

 

9 
 

Cotton Glove Liners    (12) 
per bag 
 
 

Medium 12 120 
 
 
 

$ 140.00 $ 1.166 12 ---- 
100 

------- 
349.00 

$ 3.49  
 

 

10 

 

 
Gauze          

2 in. x 2 in. 200 5000 $ 39.20 $ 0.0079 200 8000 $ 26.40 $ 0.66  

 

  

 
11 

 

 
Alcohol         

16 oz 1 12 $ 25.00 $ 2.083 ---- 12 $ 15.00 $ 1.25  

 

 

12 

 

 

 
Cotton tipped applicators      
(non sterile) 

6 in.  100 1000 $ 15.00 $ 0.015 1000 10,000 

10 bx 

$ 37.00 $ 3.70 

 

 

 

 

 


