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so as to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever there is 

any conflict between any provision of this Agreement and any present or future law, 

ordinance or administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or decree, or 

amendment thereof, contrary to which the parties have no legal right to contract, 

the latter shall prevail, but in such event the affected provision or provisions of this 

Agreement shall be modified only to the extent necessary to bring them within the 

legal requirements and only during the time such conflict exists. 

 

b. No Waiver.  No waiver by Buyer of any breach of any provision of this 

Agreement shall be deemed to be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach of 

the same or any other provision hereof. 

 

c. Entire Agreement.  This Agreement contains the entire contract between 

the parties hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either 

directly or through any agent or representative) any representations or agreements 

in connection with this Agreement not specifically set forth herein.  This Agreement 

may be modified or amended only by agreement in writing executed by Buyer and 

Seller, and not otherwise. 

 

d. Texas Law to Apply.  THIS AGREEMENT SHALL BE CONSTRUED UNDER 

AND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LAWS OF THE STATE OF TEXAS, AND ALL 

OBLIGATIONS OF THE PARTIES CREATED HEREUNDER ARE PERFORMABLE IN 

HIDALGO COUNTY, TEXAS.  THE PARTIES HEREBY CONSENT TO PERSONAL 

JURISDICTION IN HIDALGO COUNTY, TEXAS. 

 

e. Notice.  Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, 

all notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder 

shall be in writing and shall either be (i) personally delivered against a written 

receipt, or (ii) sent by registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage 

prepaid and addressed to the parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such 

other addresses as may have been theretofore specified by written notice delivered 

in accordance herewith: 

 

If to Buyer:   Hidalgo County  

Attn: County Judge 

100 E. Cano St. 2nd Floor 

Edinburg, Texas  78539 

 

If to Seller: Delta Specialties Signs & Supplies 

 Attn. Martin Peña 

 10205 East  Highway 108 

 Edinburg, Texas 78542 

  

Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed 

in the manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at 

such time as it is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as 

it is deposited in the Unites States mail. 
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f. Additional Documents.  The parties hereto covenant and agree that they 

will execute such other and further instruments and documents as are or may 

become necessary or convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this 

Agreement. 

 

 

g. Successors.  This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit 

of the parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal 

representatives, successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement. 

 

h. Assignment.  This Agreement shall not be assignable. 

 

i. Headings.  The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are solely 

for convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or 

interpretation of any provision or paragraph hereof. 

 

j. Gender and Number.  All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the 

other gender, whether used in the masculine, feminine or neuter gender, and the 

singular shall include the plural whenever and as often as may be appropriate 

 

k. Authority to Execute.  The execution and performance of this Agreement by 

Buyer and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or 

corporate action, and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable 

obligations of Buyer and Seller in accordance with its terms. 

 

l. Commitment of Current Revenues Only.  In the event that, during any term 

hereof, the Commissioners Court of Buyer does not appropriate sufficient funds to 

meet the obligations of Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this 

Agreement upon sixty (60) days written notice to Seller.  Buyer agrees, however, to 

use reasonable efforts to secure funds necessary for the continued performance of 

this Agreement.  The parties intend this provision to be a continuing right to 

terminate this Agreement at the expiration of each budget period of Buyer pursuant 

to the provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. ' 271.903 (Vernon Supp. 1996). 

 

m. Insurance. Seller shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and 

all persons connected with providing services under this Contract naming Buyer as 

an additional insured (with coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit “C” 

attached hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall 

furnish to Buyer certificates of such insurance coverage. 

 

n.       Purchasing Ethics.  Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the 

process of being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of 

Buyer and, upon and after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the 

following ethical standards of Buyer:  
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(1) It shall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected 

official, department head or employee, or former elected official, department 

head or employee, of Hidalgo County, or for any elected official, department 

head or employee or former elected official, department head or employee of 

Hidalgo County, to solicit, demand, accept or agree to accept from another 

person, entity or organization, a gratuity or an officer of employment in 

connection with any decision, approval, disapproval, recommendation, 

preparation or any part of a program requirement or purchase request, 

influencing the content of any specification or procurement standard, 

rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other advisory capacity 

in any proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination, claim or 

controversy, or other particular matter pertaining to any program 

requirement or a contract or subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal 

therefore pending before any department or agency of Hidalgo County. 

 

(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of 

employment to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract 

to the prime contractor or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for 

Hidalgo County, or any person associated therewith, as an inducement for 

the award of a subcontract or order. 

 

o. Immunities.  Nothing in this Agreement is intended to and Buyer does not 

hereby waive, release or relinquish any right to assert any of the defenses Buyer  

enjoys by virtue of the state or federal constitution, laws, rules or regulations, and 

any sovereign, official or qualified immunity available to Buyer as to any claim or 

action of any person, entity, or individual against Buyer. 

 

p. Nondiscrimination: Seller, including subcontractors, assignees and 

successors in interest, ensures that no person shall on the grounds of race, religion 

(where the primary objective of the financial assistance is to provide employment 

per 42 U.S.C. §2000d-3), color, national origin, sex, age, or disability be excluded 

from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to 

discrimination or retaliation in any federally or non-federally funded program or 

activity when providing any services described herein under this 

contract/agreement.   

q. Additional Documents.  The parties hereto covenant and agree that they 

will execute each such other and further instruments and documents as are or may 

become necessary or convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this 

Contract. 
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EXHIBIT “A” 

REQUEST FOR BID (RFB) 

PROCUREMENT PACKET 
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EXHIBIT “B” 

BID PAGE 



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 

Reflec-tive
High 

Intensity

Diamond 

Grade
Reflec-tive

High 

Intensity

Diamond 

Grade

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X30X30 $23.75 $28.36 $54.25 $17.81 $21.27 $40.68

36X36X36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.93 $34.72 $40.68 $62.19

48X48X48 $77.60 $87.60 $127.00 $58.20 $65.70 $95.25

24x18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

36x30 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.23 $31.68 $49.31

48x36 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

21X15 $10.50 $12.95 $20.85 $7.87 $9.71 $15.63

30X24 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

21X15 $10.50 $12.95 $20.85 $7.87 $9.71 $15.63

30X24 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

6 ALL WAY R1-3P 18X6 $3.65 $4.55 $6.85 $2.73 $3.41 $5.13

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X42 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

36X48 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

30X36 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.23 $31.68 $49.31

36X48 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

48X60 $139.00 $210.00 $240.00 $104.25 $157.50 $180.00

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $142.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

13 DO NOT PASS R4-1 18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X18 $24.40 $29.16 $47.15 $18.30 $21.87 $35.36

36X24 $35.00 $42.00 $69.00 $26.25 $31.50 $51.75

42X30 $49.95 $57.90 $86.55 $37.46 $43.42 $64.83

48X36 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

17 DO NOT ENTER R5-1

18 WRONG WAY - (Red Back, White Text) R5-1a

15
TRAFFIC KEEP RIGHT ARROW 

(SYMBOL)
R4-7

16 TRAFFIC KEEP LEFT ARROW (SYMBOL) R4-8

$33.1824X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32

12
NO TURNS

R3-3

14 SLOWER TRAFFICE KEEP RIGHT
R4-3

10 NO RIGHT TURN (SYMBOL) R3-1

11 NO LEFT TURN (SYMBOL) R3-2

8 YIELD HERE TO PEDESTRAIANS (TEXT) R1-5aL(R )

9 SPEED LIMIT R2-1

$59.2136X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68

5 TO TRAIN R12cTP

7
YIELD HERE TO PEDESTRAIANS 

(SYMBOL)
R1-5L(R )

3 TO ONCOMING TRAFFIC R1-2aP

4 TO RAMP R1-2bTP

1 STOP SIGN R1-1

2 YIELD SIGN R1-2

New Signs Re-Facing Of SignsDescription of Items TxDot Code Sizes

Category-A Category- B

Vendor mus thoroughly fill in each section of the Bid Page, if applicable. INCOMPLETE submittals shall be  considiered a probable 

cause for disqualification. All must be in compliance to the Texas Department of Transportaton stancads and Federal Highway 

standars. Legend of signs will be on one or two sided; reflective grade will bary by dept. Bid Prices are on a unit price basis. REGULARTORY SIGNS-(NIGP CODE: 801-40)

VENDOR: DELTA SPECIALTIES SUPPLY



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36x36 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

48x48 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X12 $19.21 $23.20 $37.60 $14.40 $17.40 $28.20

54X18 $38.65 $45.25 $70.75 $28.98 $33.93 $53.06

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

30X36 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.33 $31.68 $49.31

36X48 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

48X60 $139.00 $210.00 $240.00 $104.25 $157.50 $180.00

30X24 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

36X30 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.33 $31.68 $49.31

12X18 $9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39

12X30 $14.63 $20.44 $29.75 $10.97 $15.33 $22.31

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

31 NO PARKING (SYMBOL) R8-3 36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

32 EMERGENCY PARKING ONLY R8-4 30X24 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

33 DO NOT STOP ON TRACKS R8-8 30X24 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

34 NO PEDESTRIAN CROSSING (variations) R9-3a 12X18 $9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99
$14.39

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

36 CROSSWALK SIGNS (variations) R10-1 12X18 $9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39

38 LEFT ON GREEN ARROW ONLY R10-5L (R) 18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

39 STOP HERE ON RED W/ARROW R10-6 24X36 $35.00 $42.00 $69.00 $26.25 $31.50 $51.75

40 DO NOT BLOCK INTERSECTION R10-7 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

18X12 $9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39

36X24 $38.05 $46.06 $74.87 $26.25 $31.50 $51.75

42 LEFT OR RIGHT TURN SIGNAL R10-10L (R) 30X36 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.33 $31.68 $49.31

43 NO TURN ON RED R10-11 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.33 $33.19

44 LEFT TURN YIELD ON GREEN R10-12 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.33 $33.19

45 ROAD CLOSED R11-2 48X30 $63.60 $76.93 $120.00 $47.70 $57.70 $90.00

46 BRIDGE CLOSED R11-2aT 48X30 $63.60 $76.93 $120.00 $47.70 $57.70 $90.00

47 ROAD CLOSED TO THRU TRAFFIC R11-4 60X30 $69.00 $78.00 $115.00 $51.75 $58.50 $86.25

48 WEIGHT LIMIT Xx TONS R12-1 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.19

49 2 HR PARKING w/TIME (OR Varations)
R7-18(DBL,R,L) 12X18

$9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.40

41
PROTECTED LEFT ON GREEN ARROW R10-9T

$10.50 $4.42 $5.16 $7.87
37

PUSH BUTTON FOR CROSSWALK 

W/ARROW
R10-4bR(L) 9X12 $5.90 $6.89

30 NO PARKING R8-3a

35

NO PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SYMBOL 

(VARIATIONS) R9-3a

29

NO PARKING ON PAVEMENT    (OR 

VARIATION) R8-1

$29.75 $10.97 $15.33 $22.31
28 NO PARKING BUS STOP SYMBOLS

R7-L07ar 

(L,DBL)
12X30 $14.63 $20.44

27 NO PARKING BUS STOP W/ARROW

R7-107R 

(L,DBL)

$19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39
26

HANDICAP PARKING W/ARROW 

(R,L,DBL)(green/white)
R7-8P 12X18 $9.99 $11.99

$19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39
25 HANDICAP PARKING

R7-8 12X18 $9.99 $11.99

$19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39
24

NO PARKING 8:30 AM TO 5:30 PM 

W/ARROW
R7-2aL (R,DBL) 12X18 $9.99 $11.99

$19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39
23 NO PARKING ANYTIME W/ARROW

R7-1L (R,DBL) 12X18 $9.99 $11.99

21
ONE WAY (LEFT OR RIGHT ) WITH 

ARROW
R6-2R(L)

22 DIVIDED HIGHWAY R6-3

19 NO TRUCKS R5-2

20 ONE WAY  (LEFT TO RIGHT) R6-1R(L)



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 
50 NO DUMPING ALLOWED R19-5T 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.33 $33.19

51 TOW AWAY ZONE (Text Or Symbol) R7-201aP 12X6 $4.32 $5.00 $7.38 $3.25 $3.75 $5.54

6X18 $7.65 $8.95 $13.95 $5.74 $6.71 $10.46

6X24 $10.50 $11.99 $18.25 $7.88 $8.99 $14.40

6X30 $12.85 $15.15 $22.95 $9.64 $11.37 $17.21

6X36 $13.00 $17.95 $27.50 $9.75 $13.46 $20.63

12X6 $5.50 $6.75 $9.95 $4.12 $5.06 $7.46

12X9 $13.25 $15.75 $25.50 $9.94 $11.81 $19.13

18X6 $7.50 $8.75 $13.55 $5.63 $6.56 $10.16

18X9 $10.65 $12.50 $19.85 $7.99 $9.38 $14.89

24X6 $8.85 $10.75 $17.00 $6.64 $8.06 $12.75

24X9 $13.00 $15.75 $25.25 $9.75 $11.81 $19.13

30X6 $10.95 $13.25 $21.25 $8.21 $9.95 $15.95

30X9 $16.10 $19.45 $27.50 $12.08 $14.59 $20.63

36X6 $13.10 $15.75 $25.26 $9.83 $11.81 $18.95

36X9 $19.25 $23.25 $32.85 $14.44 $17.44 $24.64

48X9 $25.50 $30.70 $39.50 $19.13 $23.05 $29.65

WARNING SIGNS (NIGP CODE: 801-83)

1 DELINEATOR (LEFT OR RIGHT) H1-1L (R ) 12X36 $19.21 $23.20 $37.60 $14.45 $17.40 $28.20

24x24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.59

30x30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36x36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.75 $37.69 $59.21

4

DEAF CHILD AREA (yellow back, 

black text) N-12 30x30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.75 $37.69 $59.21

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.33 $33.19

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.69 $14.96 $26.59

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.56 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.75 $37.69 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $95.00 $147.00 $58.95 $71.25 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.69 $14.96 $26.59

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.73 $37.69 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $95.00 $147.00 $58.95 $71.25 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X12 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $12.36 $14.37 $21.57

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $25.01 $29.31 $45.51

48X24 $49.00 $59.00 $95.00 $36.75 $44.25 $71.25

60X30 $72.30 $83.65 $124.75 $54.22 $62.73 $93.56

24X12 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $12.36 $14.37 $21.57

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $25.01 $29.31 $45.51

48X24 $49.00 $59.00 $95.00 $36.75 $44.25 $71.25

60X30 $72.30 $83.65 $124.75 $54.22 $62.73 $93.56

12X18 $9.99 $11.99 $19.19 $7.49 $8.99 $14.39

18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

10 ARROW SYMBOL (left or right) W-1-6R (L)

11 DOUBLE ARROW SYMBOL W1-7

8 CURVE SYMBOL (left or right) W1-2R (L)

9
CURVE SYMBOL - (sharp left, sharp 

right)
W-1-3R (L)

6 NEIGHBORHOOD WATCH
CW-G-

120RA5

7 CURVE SYMBOL (sharp right or left) W1-1R (L)

3 SLOW (yellow back, black text) N-11

5 CAUTION N-17

$13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

52 STREET NAME SIGNS (Legend to be on both sides) 

2
CAUTION DEAF CHILD AT PLAY 

(yellow back, black text)
N-8 18X24



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $16.76 $20.32 $33.18

30X36 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.33 $31.68 $49.31

36X48 $61.38 $71.99 $110.25 $46.03 $53.99 $82.68

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

26 BUMP W8-1

24 MEDIAN SYMBOL W6-1

25 TWO WAY TRAFFIC W6-3

22 ROAD NARROWS W5-1

23 NARROW BRIDGE W5-2

20 MERGE RIGHT OR LEFT SYMBOL W4-1R(L)

21 LANE ENDS RIGHT OR LEFT W4-2R(L)

18 YIELD AHEAD SYMBOL W3-2

19 STOP SIGNAL AHEAD - SYMBOL W3-3

16 Y-SYMBOL W2-5

17 STOP AHEAD - SYMBOL W3-1

14
T-INTERSECTION SYMBOL - (left or 

right) 
W2-2 R(L)

15 T-SYMBOL W2-4

12 CHEVRON - (left or right) W1-8R (L)

13 CROSSROAD Symbol W2-1



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

31 SLOW CHILDREN W9-11 18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

32 SLOW CHILDREN AT PLAY 29-12 18X24 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X30 $33.65 $42.25 $65.75 $25.33 $31.68 $49.31

18X18 $13.95 $16.25 $27.00 $10.46 $12.56 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

18X18 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

39
LOW CLEARANCE-Yellow back  Black Text 

Diamond
W-12-2TP 24X18 $13.95 $16.25 $27.00 $10.46 $12.19 $20.25

18X18 $13.95 $16.25 $27.00 $10.46 $12.19 $20.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $59.21

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

36X36 $42.30 $50.25 $78.95 $31.72 $37.68 $57.46

48X48 $78.60 $85.00 $147.00 $58.95 $63.75 $110.25

24X6 $6.73 $8.06 $12.97 $5.05 $6.05 $9.73

36X8 $15.36 $19.07 $29.17 $11.52 $14.30 $21.88

24X12 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $12.36 $14.37 $21.57

30X18 $24.40 $29.16 $47.15 $18.30 $21.87 $35.36

36X24 $35.00 $42.00 $69.00 $26.25 $31.50 $51.75

43 DEAD END W14-1aR(L)

44 AHEAD W16-9P

41 DEAD END W14-1

42 NO OUTLET W14-2

38
HEIGHT SYMBOL (YELLOW BCK, 

BLACK TEXT DIAMOND)
W-12-2

40 35MPH W13-1P

36
HANDICAP SYMBOL -YELLOW 

BACK, BLACK  TEXT DIAMOND
W-11-9

37 TRUCK CROSSING SYMBOL W11-10R(L)

34 RAILROAD CROSSING SYMBOL W10-1

35 PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SYMBOL W11-2

30 WATCH FOR ICE ON BRIDGE

W8-18aT 

(Folding 

sign)

33 WATCH CHILDREN W9-13

28 PAVEMENTS ENDS W8-3

29 TRUCK CROSSING (TEXT) W8-6

27 DIP W8-2



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 24X24 $15.58 $19.95 $35.45 $11.68 $14.96 $26.58

30X30 $23.75 $29.15 $49.95 $17.81 $21.86 $37.46

CONSTRUCTION SIGNS (NIGP CODE: 801-40)

12X6 NO BID NO BID $4.10 NO BID NO BID $3.15

24X12 NO BID NO BID $12.90 NO BID NO BID $10.14

30X15 NO BID NO BID $23.85 NO BID NO BID $17.89

24X12 NO BID NO BID $12.90 NO BID NO BID $9.68

30X15 NO BID NO BID $23.85 NO BID NO BID $17.89

30X24 NO BID NO BID $38.15 NO BID NO BID $28.61

48X36 NO BID NO BID $108.59 NO BID NO BID $81.45

60X48 NO BID NO BID $216.10 NO BID NO BID $162.10

30X24 NO BID NO BID $38.15 NO BID NO BID $28.61

48X36 NO BID NO BID $108.57 NO BID NO BID $81.45

60X48 NO BID NO BID $216.10 NO BID NO BID $162.10

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $26.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

9 LOW CLEARANCE CW12-2TP 24X18 NO BID NO BID $22.96 NO BID NO BID $17.22

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

21X15 NO BID NO BID $18.61 NO BID NO BID $13.98

24x12 NO BID NO BID $12.90 NO BID NO BID $10.14

30x18 NO BID NO BID $23.85 NO BID NO BID $17.89

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.26 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

60X60 NO BID NO BID $360.50 NO BID NO BID $270.40

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

24X24 NO BID NO BID $30.11 NO BID NO BID $22.58

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.21

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

30X30 NO BID NO BID $46.24 NO BID NO BID $34.70

36X36 NO BID NO BID $74.95 NO BID NO BID $56.25

17 FRESH OIL & FRESH TAR CW21-2

18 ROAD MACHINERY AHEAD CW21-3D

15 WORKERS SYMBOL CW21-1aT

16 WORKERS AHEAD (TEXT) CW21-1bT

13 ROAD CLOSED AHEAD CW20-3D

14 FLAGGER AHEAD CW20-7Ad

11 ARROW SIGN (POINTING DOWN)
CW16-

7PR(L) 

12 ROAD WORK AHEAD CW20-1D

8 ARROW (POINTNG DOWN) CW12-1

10 DEAD END CW14-1

6 PAVEMENTS ENDS CW8-3

7 WATCH FOR ICE ON BRIDGE CW8-18aT

4 BUMP CW8-1

5 DIP CW8-2

2 END M4-8b

3
DETOUR-TEXT & SYMBOL, RIGHT, 

UP ARROW

M4-9R(L)

M4-9S

45
BRIDGE OUT-(080 ALUMINUM - Yellow 

Back/ Black Text - Diamond
W42-3

1 DETOUR M4-8



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 48X48 NO BID NO BID $144.35 NO BID NO BID $108.26

19 OBEY WARNING SIGNS STATE LAW R20-3T 48X42 NO BID NO BID $112.50 NO BID NO BID $84.39

TRAFFIC FINES DOUBLE (PLAQUE 

WHITE BACK, BLACK TEXT)
R-20-5T 24X30 NO BID NO BID $38.15 NO BID NO BID $28.61

WHEN WORKES ARE PRESENT R20-5ATP 36X18 NO BID NO BID $48.85 NO BID NO BID $36.70

18" NO BID NO BID $40.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

24" NO BID NO BID $49.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18" $26.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24" $37.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18" $26.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24" $37.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

23

36x36

NON                                              

$45.00

REF   

$85.00

48x48

NON                                              

$56.00

REF   

$131..00

25 $6.80

26 $24.95

27 $13.50

SIZE NON REFLECT

48X48 $155.95 $225.00

SCHOOL SIGNS (NIGP CODE: 801-83)

30X30 $27.75 $33.15 $54.25 $19.43 $23.21 $37.98

36X36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.95 $32.41 $37.98 $58.07

48X48 $97.60 $112.15 $167.00 $69.32 $78.51 $116.90

30x30 $27.75 $33.15 $54.25 $19.43 $23.21 $37.98

36x36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.95 $32.41 $37.98 $58.07

48x48 $97.60 $112.15 $167.00 $69.32 $78.51 $116.90

30X30 $27.75 $33.15 $54.25 $19.43 $23.21 $37.98

36X36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.95 $32.41 $37.98 $58.07

48X48 $97.60 $112.15 $167.00 $69.32 $78.51 $116.90

30X30 $27.75 $33.15 $54.25 $19.43 $23.21 $37.98

36X36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.95 $32.41 $37.98 $58.07

48X48 $97.60 $112.15 $167.00 $69.32 $78.51 $116.90

24X10 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $11.54 $13.42 $20.14

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $23.34 $27.36 $42.48

48X24 $52.43 $63.08 $101.50 $36.70 $44.16 $71.05

24X10 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $11.54 $13.42 $20.14

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $23.34 $27.36 $42.48

48X24 $52.43 $63.08 $101.50 $36.70 $44.16 $71.05

24X10 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $11.54 $13.42 $20.16

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $23.34 $27.36 $42.48

48X24 $52.43 $63.08 $101.50 $36.70 $44.16 $71.05

24X48 $52.43 $63.08 $101.50 $36.70 $44.16 $71.05

36X72 $152.25 $175.15 $257.50 $106.57 $122.60 $180.25

48X96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24X48 $52.43 $63.08 $101.50 $36.70 $44.16 $71.05

36X72 $152.25 $175.15 $257.50 $106.57 $122.60 $180.25

48X96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24X30 $22.35 $27.10 $44.25 $15.65 $18.97 $30.98

36X48 $61.25 $70.75 $110.25 $42.88 $50.23 $77.18

11 End School Zone S5-2aTP 24X10 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $9.77 $11.73 $18.90

9

School Speed Limit Sign when/Flashing S5-1

10 End School Zone S5-2

7 When Flashing (white back, black text) S4-3P

8
School Speed Limit Sign w/When 

Flashing (white back, black text)
S4-4P

5
7:30 - 8:30 A.M. / 2:30 - 3:30 P.M. 

(WHITE BACK, BLACK TEXT)
S4-1P

6
When Children Are Present (White back 

, black text)
S4-2P

3
School Bus Stop Ahead (green 

fluorescent back, black text)
S3-1T

4
School Bus Turn Ahead (green 

fluorescent back, black text)
S3-2

1

School Crossing Advance Symbol- 

Pedestrian walking (green fluorescent 

back,black text)

S1-A

2 School Bus Stop Ahead-Symbol (green 

fluorescent back, black text)

S3-1

PRICE

28 Complete Set Roll-Up Sign w/Universal Stand Non-Reflective

ROLL-UPS:Corner  Pocket-Corner Poacket (Plastic

24

ROLL-UP VINYL SIGNS-SIGNS-

legends needed for rollup signs 

(including rib w/orage back ground) will 

be as follows but not limited to (i.e, road 

construction ahead, mowers ahead, right 

lane closed ahead, men working ahead, 

right & left lane closed ahead, end road 

work, flagman, fresh oil, liter pickup, 

ROLL-UPS: Flag Holder System 

ROLL-UPS Left Overlay Left Velcro Overlay

ROLL-UPS: OVERLAYS-Overlya for Roll-Up Signs

20

21 HAND PADDLES & HANDLES
Stop/Stop or 

Stop/Slow Paddle 

w/72 in PVC Staff

22 HAND PADDLES & HANDLES

Stop/Stop 

Paddle w/6in 

handle
Stop/Slow 

Paddle w/6 in 

handle



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 24X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $9.77 $11.73 $18.90

36X18 $33.35 $39.09 $60.69 $23.34 $27.36 $42.48

48X36 $66.25 $76.85 $115.00 $46.38 $53.80 $80.50

24X18 $13.95 $16.75 $27.00 $9.77 $11.73 $18.90

30X24 $22.38 $27.10 $44.25 $15.65 $18.97 $30.98

21X15 $10.50 $12.95 $20.85 $7.41 $9.07 $14.60

24X12 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $11.54 $13.42 $20.14

30X18 $24.40 $29.16 $47.15 $17.08 $20.41 $33.01

24X12 $16.49 $19.17 $28.77 $11.54 $13.42 $20.14

30X18 $24.40 $29.16 $47.15 $17.08 $20.41 $33.01

36X24 $58.05 $46.06 $74.87 $26.64 $32.24 $52.41

16
YIELD TO PEDESTRIANS green 

fluorescent back, black & red text) R1-6 12X36 $19.21 $23.20 $57.60 $13.45 $16.24 $26.33

18X18 $19.33 $23.20 $35.18 $13.56 $15.75 $24.25

24X24 $19.85 $23.80 $57.60 $15.25 $17.00 $27.55

30X30 $27.75 $33.15 $59.95 $19.45 $23.25 $37.98

36X36 $46.30 $54.25 $82.95 $32.41 $37.98 $58.01

48X48 $97.60 $112.15 $167.00 $68.32 $78.51 $116.90

OBJECT MARKERS:

1
OBJECT MARKERS YELLOW - Object 

Marker w/9 Yellow Reflectors OM1-1 18X18 $25.00 $29.00 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2
OBJECT MARKERS YELLOW - Object 

Marker w/3 Yellow Reflectors OM2-1V 12X6 $12.95 $16.95 $23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3
OBJECT MARKER: EGP-Bridge Marker 

(Yellow/Black Stripes) L or R OM-3R (L) 36X12 $13.72 $16.57 $26.96 $9.60 $11.60 $18.80

4
OBJECT MARKERS EGP- Bridge Marker 

(yellow/black chevrons) center OM-3C 36X12 $13.72 $16.57 $26.96 $9.60 $11.60 $18.80

5
OBJECT MARKERS: RED- End of Roadway 

Marker-Barricade maerkers w/9 Red OM4-1 18X18 $25.00 $29.00 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

6
OBJECT MARKERS: RED- End of Roadway 

Marker - Black w/9Red Reflectors OM4-2 18X18 $25.00 $29.00 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

12X24 $12.25 $14.70 $21.55 $9.15 $11.00 $16.25

12X36 $13.72 $16.57 $26.86 $9.60 $11.60 $18.80

8X24 $7.50 $9.00 $14.00 $6.00 $6.75 $10.50

18X24 $13.95 $17.00 $27.00 $9.80 $12.00 $19.00

SPECIALTY SIGNS .080 ALUMINUM (NIGP CODE: 801-40)

D/F 2"X16" $4.75 $5.80 $8.90 $3.33 $4.06 $6.23

S/F 2"X16" $4.25 $4.80 $6.95 $2.46 $3.36 $4.87

D/F 4'X8' $200.00 $275.00 $485.00 $140.00 $192.50 $334.50

S/F 4'X8' $150.00 $195.00 $295.00 $105.00 $136.50 $206.50

D/F 5"X5" $3.50 $4.45 $7.75 $2.45 $3.12 $5.43

S/F 5"X5" $2.90 $3.50 $5.35 $2.03 $2.45 $3.75

D/F 6"X12" $4.65 $5.60 $9.72 $3.26 $3.92 $6.81

S/F 6"X12" $3.85 $4.50 $6.75 $2.70 $3.15 $4.73

D/F 9"X6" $2.49 $2.70 $4.32 $1.62 $1.89 $3.24

S/F 9"X6" $1.90 $2.16 $3.51 $1.35 $1.62 $2.54

D/F 9"X30" $13.95 $16.50 $28.40 $9.75 $11.55 $19.88

S/F 9"X30" $10.75 $12.85 $20.50 $7.53 $9.00 $14.35

D/F 12'X3' $225.00 $310.00 $550.00 $157.30 $217.00 $385.00

S/F 12'X3' $185.00 $230.00 $343.00 $129.50 $161.00 $240.10

D/F 12"X6" $3.32 $3.60 $5.76 $2.16 $2.52 $4.32

S/F 12"X6" $2.52 $2.88 $4.68 $1.80 $2.16 $3.38

D/F 12"X9" $10.99 $13.75 $23.19 $7.70 $9.63 $16.23

S/F 12"X9" $8.55 $9.85 $14.65 $4.02 $6.90 $10.26

D/F 12"X18" $10.70 $13.10 $21.50 $7.49 $9.17 $15.05

S/F 12"X18" $8.80 $10.15 $14.90 $6.16 $7.11 $10.43

D/F 12"X24" $16.45 $20.90 $34.15 $11.80 $14.63 $23.91

S/F 12"X24" $13.50 $15.75 $24.75 $9.45 $11.03 $17.33

D/F 18"X12" $10.70 $13.10 $21.50 $7.49 $9.17 $15.05

S/F 18"X12" $8.80 $10.15 $14.90 $6.16 $7.11 $10.43

11 SPECIALTY SIGNS

12 SPECIALTY SIGNS

8 SPECIALTY SIGNS

9 SPECIALTY SIGNS

10 SPECIALTY SIGNS

5 SPECIALTY SIGNS

6 SPECIALTY SIGNS

7 SPECIALTY SIGNS

2 SPECIALTY SIGNS

3 SPECIALTY SIGNS

4 SPECIALTY SIGNS

17 Bicycle Symbol W11-10R(L)

7 VERTICAL PANELS

1 SPECIALTY SIGNS

14 ARROW-(pointing down) 
SW-16 -7P  

R  (L)

15 AHEAD SW-16 9P

12
Cell Phone Use Prohibited upto $200 

Fine
S7-1T

13 500 Feet SW16-2P



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation D/F 18"X18" $16.62 $19.19 $31.50 $11.63 $13.43 $22.05

S/F 18"X18" $13.85 $15.99 $23.70 $9.70 $11.19 $16.59

D/F 18"X24" $19.15 $23.75 $40.65 $13.41 $16.63 $28.46

S/F 18"X24" $15.30 $17.95 $27.55 $10.71 $12.57 $19.26

D/F 18"X30" $26.75 $31.50 $48.65 $18.73 $22.05 $34.06

S/F 18"X30" $21.96 $25.50 $35.50 $15.37 $17.85 $24.85

D/F 18"X6" $7.25 $8.52 $13.65 $5.08 $5.97 $9.56

S/F 18"X6" $5.61 $6.27 $8.75 $3.93 $4.39 $6.13

D/F 18"X9" $9.00 $10.45 $16.80 $6.30 $7.32 $11.76

S/F 18"X9" $7.50 $8.50 $11.95 $5.25 $5.95 $8.37

D/F 24"X12" $16.20 $18.90 $29.58 $11.34 $13.23 $20.71

S/F 24"X12" $13.50 $15.75 $24.65 $9.45 $11.03 $17.26

D/F 24"X18" $18.36 $21.55 $33.13 $12.85 $15.09 $23.16

S/F 24"X18" $15.30 $17.96 $27.51 $10.71 $12.57 $19.26

D/F 24"X24" $22.40 $26.63 $42.54 $15.68 $18.64 $29.78

S/F 24"X24" $18.66 $22.19 $35.45 $13.06 $15.53 $24.82

D/F 24"X30" $29.40 $34.20 $53.40 $20.58 $23.95 $37.38

S/F 24"X30" $24.50 $28.50 $44.50 $17.15 $19.95 $31.15

D/F 24"X36" $32.62 $39.48 $64.18 $22.83 $27.64 $44.93

S/F 24"X36" $27.18 $32.90 $53.48 $19.03 $23.03 $37.44

D/F 30"X30" $33.80 $40.93 $66.66 $23.66 $28.65 $46.66

S/F 30"X30" $28.16 $34.11 $55.55 $19.71 $23.87 $38.89

D/F 30"X24" $29.40 $34.20 $53.40 $20.58 $23.94 $37.38

S/F 30"X24" $24.50 $28.50 $44.50 $17.15 $19.95 $31.15

D/F 30"X36" $49.68 $54.00 $86.40 $32.40 $37.80 $64.80

S/F 30"X36" $37.80 $43.20 $70.20 $27.00 $32.40 $57.76

D/F 36"X12" $17.70 $21.00 $32.53 $12.39 $14.70 $22.56

S/F 36"X12" $14.75 $17.50 $26.86 $10.33 $12.25 $18.76

D/F 36"X18" $29.80 $32.40 $51.84 $19.44 $22.68 $38.88

S/F 36"X18" $22.68 $25.92 $42.12 $16.20 $19.44 $30.47

D/F 36"X36" $46.20 $60.67 $97.87 $32.34 $42.47 $68.51

S/F 36"X36" $38.50 $50.56 $81.56 $26.95 $35.39 $57.09

D/F 36"X42" $69.55 $75.60 $120.96 $45.36 $52.92 $90.72

S/F 36"X42" $52.92 $60.48 $98.28 $37.80 $45.36 $71.06

D/F 42"X24" $46.37 $50.40 $80.64 $30.24 $35.28 $60.48

S/F 42"X24" $35.28 $40.32 $65.52 $25.20 $30.24 $47.38

D/F 42"X30" $57.96 $63.00 $100.80 $37.80 $44.10 $75.60

S/F 42"X30" $44.10 $50.40 $81.90 $31.50 $37.80 $59.22

D/F 42"X36" $69.55 $75.60 $120.96 $45.36 $52.92 $90.72

S/F 42"X36" $52.92 $60.48 $98.28 $37.80 $45.36 $71.06

D/F 48"X24" $52.99 $57.60 $92.16 $34.56 $40.32 $69.12

S/F 48"X24" $40.32 $46.08 $74.88 $28.80 $34.56 $54.14

D/F 48"X36" $79.49 $86.40 $138.24 $51.84 $60.48 $103.68

S/F 48"X36" $60.48 $69.12 $112.32 $43.20 $51.84 $81.22

D/F 48"X48" $91.08 $107.40 $168.60 $65.75 $75.18 $118.02

S/F 48"X48" $75.90 $89.50 $140.50 $53.13 $62.65 $98.35

D/F 48"X60" $132.48 $144.00 $230.40 $86.40 $100.80 $172.80

S/F 48"X60" $100.80 $115.20 $187.20 $72.00 $86.40 $135.36

D/F 48"X72" $174.00 $228.00 $348.00 $121.50 $159.60 $243.63

S/F 48"X72" $145.00 $190.00 $290.00 $101.50 $133.00 $203.00

D/F 48"X96" $180.00 $228.00 $354.00 $126.00 $159.60 $247.80

S/F 48"X96" $150.00 $195.00 $295.00 $105.00 $136.50 $206.50

D/F 54"X18 $44.72 $48.60 $77.76 $29.16 $34.02 $58.32

S/F 54"X18 $34.02 $38.88 $63.18 $24.30 $29.16 $45.68

D/F 60"X24" $66.24 $72.00 $115.20 $43.20 $50.40 $86.40

S/F 60"X24" $50.40 $57.60 $93.60 $36.00 $43.20 $67.68

38 SPECIALTY SIGNS

39 SPECIALTY SIGNS

40 SPECIALTY SIGNS

35 SPECIALTY SIGNS

36 SPECIALTY SIGNS

37 SPECIALTY SIGNS

32 SPECIALTY SIGNS

33 SPECIALTY SIGNS

34 SPECIALTY SIGNS

29 SPECIALTY SIGNS

30 SPECIALTY SIGNS

31 SPECIALTY SIGNS

26 SPECIALTY SIGNS

27 SPECIALTY SIGNS

28 SPECIALTY SIGNS

23 SPECIALTY SIGNS

24 SPECIALTY SIGNS

25 SPECIALTY SIGNS

20 SPECIALTY SIGNS

21 SPECIALTY SIGNS

22 SPECIALTY SIGNS

17 SPECIALTY SIGNS

18 SPECIALTY SIGNS

19 SPECIALTY SIGNS

14 SPECIALTY SIGNS

15 SPECIALTY SIGNS

16 SPECIALTY SIGNS

13 SPECIALTY SIGNS



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation D/F 60"X36" $99.36 $108.00 $172.80 $64.80 $75.60 $129.60

S/F 60"X36" $75.60 $86.40 $140.40 $54.00 $64.80 $101.52

D/F 60"X48" $174.00 $222.00 $342.00 $121.80 $155.40 $239.80

S/F 60"X48" $140.00 $185.00 $285.00 $98.00 $129.50 $199.50

D/F 72"X36" $72.12 $84.90 $130.74 $50.48 $59.43 $91.52

S/F 72"X36" $60.10 $70.75 $168.95 $42.17 $49.53 $76.27

D/F 72"X48" $174.00 $228.00 $348.00 $121.80 $159.60 $243.60

S/F 72"X48" $145.00 $190.00 $290.00 $101.50 $133.00 $203.00

D/F 96"X36" $132.00 $163.50 $255.30 $92.40 $114.45 $178.70

S/F 96"X36" $110.00 $136.25 $212.75 $77.00 $95.39 $148.93

D/F 96"X48" $180.00 $228.00 $354.00 $195.00 $245.00 $247.80

S/F 96"X48" $150.00 $195.00 $295.00 $126.00 $159.60 $105.00

1 Blank Signs 6X12 $2.85 $3.30 $5.00 $2.00 $2.51 $3.50

2 Blank Signs 6X18 $3.15 $3.85 $6.40 $2.21 $2.72 $4.48

3 Blank Signs 6X24 $4.29 $5.25 $8.45 $3.00 $3.68 $6.01

4 Blank Signs 6X30 $5.65 $7.00 $10.50 $3.96 $4.70 $7.26

5 Blank Signs 6X36 $7.51 $8.90 $14.00 $5.26 $6.23 $9.80

6 Blank Signs 6X48 $9.99 $11.81 $18.67 $6.99 $8.26 $13.06

7 Blank Signs 9X12 $3.90 $4.55 $7.10 $2.73 $3.19 $4.97

8 Blank Signs 9X18 $4.95 $5.95 $9.80 $3.47 $4.17 $6.86

9 Blank Signs 9X24 $6.35 $7.70 $12.85 $4.45 $5.39 $9.00

10 Blank Signs 9X30 $7.95 $9.66 $16.07 $5.57 $6.76 $11.25

11 Blank Signs 9X36 $9.80 $11.85 $19.57 $6.86 $8.30 $13.70

12 Blank Signs 9X48 $13.77 $15.59 $22.45 $9.63 $10.91 $15.71

13 Blank Signs 18X12 $7.05 $8.45 $13.57 $4.94 $5.92 $9.51

14 Blank Signs 18X18 $10.63 $12.67 $20.41 $7.46 $9.07 $14.29

15 Blank Signs 18X24 $11.97 $18.70 $24.99 $8.38 $10.29 $17.50

16 Blank Signs 21X15 $9.25 $11.25 $18.70 $6.48 $7.88 $13.09

17 Blank Signs 24X18 $10.65 $12.69 $20.41 $7.46 $8.88 $14.29

18 Blank Signs 24X24 $15.82 $19.45 $32.15 $11.07 $13.62 $22.51

19 Blank Signs 24X30 $19.75 $24.25 $41.00 $13.83 $19.98 $28.70

20 Blank Signs 24X36 $24.00 $29.54 $48.95 $16.80 $20.68 $34.27

21 Blank Signs 30X30 $24.95 $30.61 $52.00 $17.47 $21.43 $36.40

22 Blank Signs 30X36 $30.40 $37.25 $62.95 $21.28 $26.08 $44.07

23 Blank Signs 36X12 $12.15 $14.70 $25.25 $8.51 $10.43 $17.60

24 Blank Signs 36X36 $37.50 $45.65 $76.50 $26.25 $31.96 $53.55

25 Blank Signs 36X48 $52.15 $63.00 $100.00 $36.51 $44.10 $70.00

26 Blank Signs 48X9 $13.77 $15.59 $22.45 $9.63 $10.91 $15.71

27 Blank Signs 48X24 $41.80 $44.58 $72.05 $29.26 $31.21 $50.44

28 Blank Signs 48X48 $88.65 $103.15 $158.00 $62.06 $72.21 $110.60

29 Blank Signs 48X96 $192.00 $232.40 $331.00 $144.00 $175.00 $248.25

30 Blank Signs 60X24 $65.90 $75.00 $109.50 $46.13 $52.50 $76.65

31 9x6 $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

32 9x6 $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

33 9x6 $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1

2

3

4

VEHICLE LETTERING (NIGP CODE: 225-26)

Municipal Emblems (Pressure sensitive) $14.95

Door Graphics - Non Reflective Installation included 30"x24" $95.00

Lettering on Door Glass-(Including installation, County Seal, Names, 

Suite & Telephone Number) std 30" $120.00

Decal 11 ½x16" $10.95

BLANK SIGNS (NIGP CODE: 801-09)

ADA Men Restroom Sign w/Symbol

ADA Unisex Restroom Sign w/Symbol

ADA Women Restroom Sign w/Symbol

SHOP AND OFFICE SIGNS (FACILITY) (NIGP CODE: 255-30)

Description of Items Size Price

44 SPECIALTY SIGNS

45 SPECIALTY SIGNS

46 SPECIALTY SIGNS

41 SPECIALTY SIGNS

42 SPECIALTY SIGNS

43 SPECIALTY SIGNS



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 
1

2

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

2

3

5

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29 Bracket: Dome Cap
2" $0.91

3" $0.91

Stub Post & Hardware $101.40

Post Driver - (manual) NO BID

POSTS: Wood Post 6'X 8" Dia. Dome-Top Wood Post, Dome 

Tops Posts 8" Diam 6'x3" NO BID

POSTS: Valve Markers $26.53

POSTS: Splice connector $1.91

POSTS: Ground Stub for Slip Base Assembly 3"x36" $53.30

POSTS: Socket & Wedge for Poz-Loc $13.27

POSTS: Socket 27" for Poz-Loc 27" $9.99

POSTS: Keeper Plate only (no hardware) $1.10

POSTS: Pozloc Wedge-Poz-Loc Wedge G210 $3.27

POSTS: Casting (Top part of Base for Slipbase Assembly) 

w/Bolts & Keeper Plate $48.10

POSTS: Flange Base 2-⅜" $19.50

POSTS: Green U-Channel 6" $6.95

POSTS-Poz-Loc Post 8" $26.09

POSTS: Galv Delineator Post 6' $11.24

POSTS: Green Delineator Post 6' $10.26

POSTS: Wood Posts Painted White 4"x4"x10' $47.53

POSTS: Wood Post 4"x4"x12' $55.93

POSTS: Slipbase 10 BWG TX DOT 12' $165.10

POSTS: Post ONLY 10 BWG 12'x3" $56.80

12' $25.29

POSTS: Poz-Loc System 12' $33.74

$32.11

7 POSTS: Green Q-Channel ribbed

8' $25.20

10' $21.06

6 POSTS: Galv. U-Channel

8' $21.90

10' $23.53

12'

2"x2"x12' $27.82

POSTS: 10'X3" 10 BWG. GAL. 2.⅞" Dia. 10 $50.70

POSTS: Slipbase Assembly System 10' $146.90

4 POSTS: Sq. Tubing
10'x1½ $19.91

12' $18.68

POSTS: Poz-Loc (Includes Post, Socket & Wedge) 10' $29.70

1 POSTS: Post Galv. G90

8' $12.81

10' $15.53

Jiggle Bars 6'x6' $12.32

POSTS-BRACKETS-HARDWARE (NIGP CODE: 801-30)

Qwik Stix Adhesive Bar NO BID

Rumble Strip w/out Adhesive-Yellow 4"x24" $16.75

Butyl Pads (Adhsesive for Pavement Markers) 4"x4" $1.75

Ceramic Button w/ou Reflector White or Yellow 6"x6" $13.50

Plastic Pavement Marker w/out Adhesive -White 4" $1.35

Plastic Pavement Marker w/out Adhesive -Yellow 4" $1.35

Pavement Markers 2-Way with Adhesive 4"x4" $2.33

Ceramic Pavement Marker w/out Adhesive. White or Yellow 4" $0.84

Pavement Markers 2-Way w/out Adhesive 4"x4" $1.55

Pavement Markers 1-Way with Adhesive 4"x4" $1.85

Vehicle Lettering-Tailgate - Non Reflective, Including Installation 48"x12 $90.00

PAVEMENT MARKERS (NIGP CODE: 550-08)

Vehicle Lettering-2-Door Lettering-2-Door, Non-Reflective, Including 

installation 24"x18" $120.00



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 30

33

37

40

41

43

44

45

46

47

2

3

4

5

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14 Quick Fence Safety System
20 lbs $60.95

Marker 24"x24" $25.00

Temporary Barrier Fence Orange Temp. Mesh Barrier Fence 4'x100' $39.00

Type III Plastic Break-Away Barricade,D/S Orange &White H/I 8' $180.00

Type III Plastic Break -Away Barricade, S/S Orange & White H/I 8' $150.00

Type III Brricade End of Road - Wood EG S/S Red & White 8' $170.00

Type I Plastic A FRAME Barricade w/1 Panel & 2 Legs 8' $125.00

Type III Barricade End of Road - Wood S/S Red&White 10' $195.00

Type III Barricade End of Road - Wood S/S Red&White 12' $295.00

Plastic Barricade Panel, HIP, SS Orange & White 8' $32.80

Wood Barricade Panesl EG, SS: END OF ROAD (Red & White 8' $21.35

Wood Paneds, EG SS: END OF ROAD (Red & White) 12' $28.55

Plastic Barricade Panel DS HIP Orange & White 8' $45.29

BARRICADE PANEL (NIGP CODE: 550-78)

Wood Barricade Panels, EG, SS: End of Road (Red & White 10' $24.35

Flex Delineator w/ Stripe 72" $20.65
Guardrail Elineator - Steel 1-way Yellow Guardrail Delineator 

…Bolt On $5.75

Flexible Dleineator, Orange or Yellow w/2HIP Stripes & Butyl 

Pad 60" $17.68

Flex Marker White Post w/ White or Yellow Reflector Stipe 66" $22.50

DELINEATOR (NIGP CODE: 550-08)

1 Delineator: Surface Mount Delineators including Epoxy
36" $27.95

48" $34.45

5" $5.00

Allen Wrench Tool 12" $12.50

BOLTS ¼ x 2" $0.65

SCREWS for Bracket (blade holders) ¼ $0.25

ANTI-THEFT NUTS 5/16" $0.55

BOLTS 5/16 x 2 ½x 3 $0.53

42 ANTI-THEFT BOLTS
5/16 x 2 ¼ $0.47

5/16 x 1 ¾ $0.53

BRACKET: Mast arm buckle bracket 16 $21.50

LOCKNUTS $0.08

39 BRACKET: Wing Bracket (cantilever bracket)
16" $21.50

24" $22.75

18" $11.00

24" $19.50

BRACKET: Post Cap-flat 1 ¾ sq post $3.95

38 BRACKET: Wing Bracket (all sign plate)

12" $8.75

36 BRACKET: Post Cap - 9" Blade
2"x12" $11.70

3"x12" $14.30

35 BRACKET: Post Cap 6" Blade
3"x5½" $5.85

2"x5½" $3.90

34 BRACKET: U Bolt Clamp
2" $2.32

3" $2.44

3" $6.95

BRACKET: Post Cap U-Channel $3.54

12" $11.70

32 BRACKET: Post Round Sign Bracket
2" $4.50

BRACKET: Back to Back Bracket 2" $5.17

31 BRACLET: Cross Bracket
5½" $3.90



Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

"Traffic Road Signs Other Related Misc. Equipment

Bid Tabulation 

1

2

3

2

3

4

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

1

2

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

2

1

2

3

4

White S/S 3"x4" HIP Sheeting 16" S/S Concrete 

Barrier Marker 16" $15.75

Barrier Reflector w/4" Single Side HIP Sheeting 14" $14.70

D/S Concrete Barrier Markers Yellw or White 

w/3"X4 HIP 16" $17.50

REFLECTORS (NIGP CODE: 055-76)

Block of Bituminous Marker Adhesive 100 lbs $123.25

3"x30 yds $165.00

Green 6"W NO BID

1
General Purpose Tape-Red, White Yellow 

Rolls

1"x30" yds $54.99

2"x30 yds $128.75

Fire Line - Do Not Cross 3"x1000' $9.03

REFLECTIVE TAPES (NIGP CODE: 345-79)

Conspicuity Strips D/G 2"x18" NO BID

Crosswalk Pavement Marking 12'x25 yds $462.00

Conspicuity Tape - D/G Solid Red 4" $208.00

Conspicuity Tape  D/G, Red & White 2'x50 yds $95.62

Caution Tape 3 MIL 3"x1000' $9.03

Cpms[ciotu Tape D/G Red, yellow or White 2"x50 yds $101.40

Conspicuity Tape - D/G Red, Yellow or White 3"x50 yds $156.00

Barrier Tape 3"x1000' $9.03

FLAGS: Safety Flag with Stay 24x24 $4.16

MARKING TAPE (NIGP CODE: 550-72)

FLAGS

FLAGS: Safety Flag with Stay 18"x18" $3.25

CONES: Channerlizer for Caution Tape w/ Refleictive 

Collars 42" $86.45

CONE SIGNS Snap on Cone Sign w/Wording 12"x13" $10.80

CONES: Reflective Collar 4" $3.45

CONES: Reflective Collar 6" $3.45

CONES Cone Slim 28" $13.18

CONES: Cone w/Collar 28" $18.27

CONES: Cone Slim 18" $5.95

CONES: Cone w/Collar 18" $9.26

Vertical Panesls W/ H/I sheeting & 20 lb base $48.95

CONES (NIGP CODE: 550-78)

Barrel with Tire Ring Base $50.58

Tire Rings $8.45

BARRELS (NIGP CODE: 550-42)

1 Barrel Tape - White Engineering Grade
4"x50 yds $57.20

6"x50 yds $85.80

Barricade Tape Orange or White Left or Right 8"x50 yds H/I $227.50

Barricade Tape Red & White Left or Right 8"x50 ys H/I $227.50

BARRICADE TAPES (NIGP CODE: 550-72)
Barricade Tape Red & White Left or Right 8"x50 yds E/G $128.20

14 Quick Fence Safety System
30 lbs $64.50
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6

7

8

2

3

4

6

1

2

3

4

5

PAVEMENT MARKING STENCIL (NIGP CODE: 962-53)

36"

48"

2 4"

3 4"

4 4"

5 4"

6 4"

7 42"

8 42"

9 42"

72"x63"

48x48

11 4"

12 4"

1

1 gal $101.50

Clear Ovelay Stops-Graffiti Proof Overlya 24" $682.50

30" $852.25

Fire Lane No Parking Maxi Stencil NO BID $35.60

MISC

NO BID $90.90

Fire Lane No Parking Duro Stencil NO BID $29.95

Arrow Kit, Standard Arrow Kit One (1) arrow  UP one Arrow  Curve Tail NO BID $39.50

10 Handicap Symbol Maxi
NO BID $130.00

Arrow- Duro NO BID $19.95

Arrow - Max NO BID $39.50

Number Kit Maxi NO BID $29.95

Working Kit NO BID $32.95

Fire Lane Stencil NO BID $16.98

No Parking Stencil NO BID $90.50

$55.95 $57.95

Brass Interlocking Stencils NO BID $16.98

Letters Stencil

1 STOP (Lettering) in  Duro
$47.18 $53.70

6
Tripod for Construction Signs w/ Flag Holder

36" $96.95

48" $105.50

Universal $99.41

Zephyr Stand $70.65

Little Buster Portable Stand $149.50

Portable Stop 7' Stand Portable Stop Stand with a 7' 

Plastic  X-Tube Upright, Yeti Rubber Foot wi/ 4" Riser 

Stub, 24" HIP Stop Sign $145.00

STANDS (NIGP CODE: 801-12)

Big Buster Stand $191.10

9' $130.29

Speed Bump Spikes 12"x ½" $4.48

Cement Car Stop (unpainted) w/12: Spkes for asphalt 

or Cement 6' $33.15

5 Speed Bump Plastic

6' $104.20

Black & Yellow Speed Bumps 6' $120.64

Car Stops Yellow & Blk Recycled Rubber w/12" 

Spikes for Asphalt or Gravel 6' $66.23

1
Speed Bumps with all hardware

10' $224.44

12' $249.01

Rectangular Type A & C 3"x8" $7.95

SPEED BUMP (NIGP CODE: 550-79)

Plastic Pavement Marker Yellow Button Round 3" $0.85

Reflectors Round Plastic 3" $1.01

.080 Reflector D-9-S Aluminum Delineator 

Reflectors DG Yellow, White or Red 4"x4" $9.10
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3

4

5

6

7

9

10

11

12

OTHER MISCELLANEOUS LIST PERCENTAGE
On all roads signs, posts, y misc. supplies not listed-Hidalgo County will receive a percentage off 

bidders catalog list prices. All applicable Catalogs with list prices must accompany any bids 

submitted. 10.00%

Estimated Delviery  Time  for Standard (in-stock) signs: 3 DAY

Estimated Delviery  Time  for Non Standard (not in-stock) 10-30 DAYS

TXDOT Placard .040 Aluminum 10"x10" $14.95

DELIVERY

18' $65.75

TXDOT Placard (OSHA) DECALS 10"x10" $9.95

15" $56.35

16' $58.44

13" $48.25

14" $51.75

10" $37.25

12" $44.95

6" $22.54

8" $29.65

2' $7.51

4" $23.40

Mast Arm Buckle Bracket 16" $16.95

8 Trasnfer Tape

1" $3.69

Fence Sign Holder - Link Fence Sign Holder $4.60

Warning Trinagles (Set of 3) 16" $35.95

Slow Moving placard  triangle $16.95

Slow Moving decal Triangle $9.95

4x4 pads $0.95

quick sticks NO BID

2 Epoxy (Kit, Pads, Sticks)
5 gal $507.50
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