REQUIREMENTS AGREEMENT
C-18-248C-02-12

THIS AGREEMENT (the "Agreement") is entered into as of the 12" of February,
2019 by and between Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. ("Seller") and Hidalgo
County ("Buyer").

WHEREAS, Buyer has solicited sealed bids for the supply of its requirements of
“Purchase Of Mosquito Control Chemicals” (on an as needed basis), (the "Product") as
further described in Exhibit "A", Request for Sealed Bids (RFB) Procurement Packet as attached
hereto and incorporated herein by reference for all purposes (the "RFB"), and

WHEREAS, Seller has submitted a proposal to supply Buyer's requirements in
accordance with the specifications as bid. A copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit B and is
incorporated herein for all purposes (the “Specifications”); and

WHEREAS, Buyer has determined that Seller has submitted the lowest and best bid to
meet Buyer's requirements for certain of the Products, as herein after described.

NOW THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual covenants and conditions
hereinafter set forth, and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of
which is hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto agree as follows:

l. Buyer agrees to purchase from Seller, and Seller agrees to sell and deliver to
Buyer, all of the Products that Buyer may require for use by Buyer in “Purchase of Mosquito
Control Chemicals,” in the areas of Hidalgo County projects for a period of one (1) year
commencing February 13, 2019 and ending February 12, 2020, and may be extended with the
County’s sole discretion for an additional two (2) - one (1) year terms under the same rates,
terms, and conditions, and it is agreed that the Products will meet the specifications set forth in
Exhibit “A” hereto. County reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional sixty (60) day
grace period at the end of the contract term for unforeseen delay in award of new bid for next
contract term.

2. When Buyer determines that it needs a quantity of the Products to be delivered, it
will, according to its Purchasing Policies, complete and submit to Seller a Purchase Order
describing the type and quantity of the Products required. The Products are to be delivered by
Seller to the location in Hidalgo County specified by Buyer in its Purchase Order.

3. Buyer agrees to pay Seller for each Purchase Order based on the prices set out in
Exhibit "B". Seller shall render invoices for each Purchase Order, and the invoices shall be paid
by Buyer in accordance with the Texas Prompt Payment Act, Tex. Govt. Code Ch. 2251.

4. Seller represents that it is licensed by the State of Texas and qualified to perform
and execute the services provided above. If such license is suspended or revoked, this Contract
shall automatically be terminated and Seller shall immediately notify the County Judge of
Hidalgo.

5. Seller must comply with all applicable laws and regulations of the State of Texas,
and County policies. Notwithstanding the foregoing sentence, Seller represents and maintains
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that Seller is an independent Contractor and is not an employee of the County, or any agency
thereof, and represents and warrants that Seller does not desire or request any fringe benefits
provided to employees of County, and/or any agency of the County.

6. Buyer may terminate this Agreement at any time for any reason or no reason
at all upon giving thirty (30) days written notice.

7. General Provisions

a. Conflict with Applicable Law. Nothing in this Agreement shall be construed so
as to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever there is any
conflict between any provision of this Agreement and any present or future law,
ordinance or administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or decree, or
amendment thereof, contrary to which the parties have no legal right to contract, the latter
shall prevail, but in such event the affected provision or provisions of this Agreement
shall be modified only to the extent necessary to bring them within the legal requirements
and only during the time such conflict exists.

b. No Waiver. No waiver by Buyer of any breach of any provision of this
Agreement shall be deemed to be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach of the
same or any other provision hereof.

c. Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire contract between the
parties hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly or
through any agent or representative) any representations or agreements in connection
with this Agreement not specifically set forth herein. This Agreement may be modified
or amended only by agreement in writing executed by Buyer and Seller, and not
otherwise.

d. Texas Law to Apply. This Agreement shall be construed under and in
accordance with the laws of the State of Texas, and all obligations of the parties created
hereunder are performable in Hidalgo County, Texas. The parties hereby consent to
personal jurisdiction in Hidalgo County, Texas.

e. Notice. Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, all
notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder shall be in
writing and shall either be (1) personally delivered against a written receipt, or (i1) sent by
registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage prepaid and addressed to the
parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such other addresses as may have been
theretofore specified by written notice delivered in accordance herewith:

If to Buyer: Hidalgo County
Attn:  County Judge
100 E. Cano
Edinburg, Texas 78539

If to Seller: Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
675 Sidwell Ct.,
St. Charles, IL. 60174
2
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Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed in the
manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at such time
as it is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as it is deposited in
the Unites States mail.

f. Additional Documents. The parties hereto covenant and agree that they will
execute such other and further instruments and documents as are or may become
necessary or convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this Agreement.

g. Successors. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the
parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives,
successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

h. Assignment. This Agreement shall not be assignable.

1. Headings. The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are solely for
convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or interpretation of
any provision or paragraph hereof.

] Gender and Number. All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the
other gender, whether used in the masculine, feminine or neuter gender, and the singular
shall include the plural whenever and as often as may be appropriate.

k. Authority to Execute. The execution and performance of this Agreement by
Buyer and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or
corporate action, and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable obligations of
Buyer and Seller in accordance with its terms.

1. Insurance. Seller agrees to provide liability insurance covering all activities,
vehicles and persons connected with providing services under this Contract in an amount
not less than the minimum amounts prescribed by the Texas Tort Claims Act, §100.001,
et seq., Texas Civil Practices and Remedies Code. Seller shall name Buyer as an
additional insured and shall furnish Buyer a certificate issued by the insurer (attached as
Exhibit “C”) that such insurance is in full force and effect.

m. Commitment of Current Revenues Only. In the event that, during any term
hereof, the Commissioners Court of Buyer does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet
the obligations of Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this Agreement
upon sixty (60) days written notice to Seller. Buyer agrees, however, to use reasonable
efforts to secure funds necessary for the continued performance of this Agreement. The
parties intend this provision to be a continuing right to terminate this Agreement at the
expiration of each budget period of Buyer pursuant to the provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt.
Code Ann. " 271.903 (Vernon Supp. 1996).

n. Indemnification: Seller will indemnify and hold Buyer harmless from any

and all claims, actions, liability, and expenses (including costs of judgments,

settlements, court costs, and attorneys’ fees, regardless of the outcome of such claim

or action) caused by, resulting from, or alleging negligent or intentional acts or
3
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omissions or any failure to perform any obligation undertaken or any covenant in
this Contract, whether such act, omission, or failure was the Seller’s or that of any
person providing services hereunder through or for the Seller. Upon written notice
from the County, the Company will resist and defend at its own expense, and by
counsel reasonably satisfactory to County, any such claim or action. The Company
will carry proper insurance with the County as an additional named insured.

0. Purchasing Ethics. Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the process of
being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of Buyer and, upon
and after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the following ethical
standards of Buyer:

(1) It shall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected
official, department head or employee, or former elected official, department head
or employee, of Buyer, or for any elected official, department head or employee
or former elected official, department head or employee of Buyer, to solicit,
demand, accept or agree to accept from another person, entity or organization, a
gratuity or an officer of employment in connection with any decision, approval,
disapproval, recommendation, preparation or any part of a program requirement
or purchase request, influencing the content of any specification or procurement
standard, rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other advisory
capacity in any proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination, claim
or controversy, or other particular matter pertaining to any program requirement
or a contract or subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal therefore pending
before any department or agency of Buyer.

(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of employment
to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract to the prime contractor
or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for Buyer, or any person associated
therewith, as an inducement for the award of a subcontract or order.

p. Immunities. Nothing in this Agreement is intended to and Buyer does not hereby
waive, release or relinquish any right to assert any of the defenses Buyer enjoys by virtue of
the state or federal constitution, laws, rules or regulations, and any sovereign, official or
qualified immunity available to Buyer as to any claim or action of any person, entity, or
individual against Buyer.

q. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of and be
enforceable by the parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal
representatives, successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

r. Nondiscrimination: Seller/Contractor/Vendor, including subcontractors, assignees
and successors in interest, ensures that no person shall on the grounds of race, religion, color,
national origin, sex, age, disability, or any other protected class under law, be excluded from
participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimination or
retaliation in any federally or non-federally funded program or activity when providing any
services described herein under this contract/agreement.
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S. Appendix II to CFR 200-Contract Provisions: Pursuant to 2 CFR 200.236, a non-
Federal entity’s contracts must contain the applicable provisions described in Appendix II to
2 CFR 200-Contract Provisions for non-Federal Entity Contracts under Federal Awards.
Therefore, if applicable, the provisions of Appendix II to 2 CFR 200 are attached and
incorporated by reference into this County contract should it be subject to Federal award.
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EXECUTED effective as of the day and year first above written.

Buyer:
HIDALGO COUNTY

By:
Richard F. Cortez, County Judge

ATTEST:

Arturo Guajardo, Jr., County Clerk

Seller:
By:

Printed Name:

Title:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Office of the Criminal District Attorney, Ricardo Rodriguez, Jr.
By:
Robert Viiia, Assistant District Attorney
Civil Litigation Division

APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT:
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EXHIBIT “A”

REQUEST FOR BID (RFB)
PROCUREMENT PACKET





















































































































EXHIBIT “B”

BID PAGE
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The following chemicals are the minimum requirements/specifications that will be a

EXHIBIT-¢
BID PAGE
HIDALGO COUNTY HEALTH DEPARTMENT
“Purchase of Mosquito Control Clhiemicals”

GB”

RFB No, 2018-248-12-19-SGS

and/or No Bid, INCOMPLETE submittals may be considered a probab

“equal to or better”, as stated in Exhibit “A”, of the Bid Packet.
Iniernal use only-Commodity Code: 675-54

ClarkeMosquitoContro

G 126y

If not applicable fill in with
le cause for disqualification.

WIG and may be

N/A

-i

CHEMICALS
DECRIPTION OF ITEMS Price
(Equtivalent and/or Betier) (£ ugl;?:ﬂh(;’:‘%:ﬂcr) Per Prive Priee Price Price
Sizes/ " Ché?nii:n! & Corapasttion Pachage Per Gallen Per Cpse Per Drum Per Tote
Description iZes/quantity | /Pail/Bag
Adulticiding Chemical 275 gal. tole Biomist 4+4 $17.00
Biolaryicide 2x2, 5 gal case NO BID
Biological Larvielde Aqueous 30 gal dum NO BID
Suspension 250 gal lote NQ BID
Insecticide 5 gal- case NO BID
30 gal dum NO BID
o Insectieid 5 gal pail NO BID
Mg;sgu Q insecticida 55
gal dam NQ BID
260 gal tole NO BID
Inscelieida 16x1ptos NO BID
30 gal drum NO BID
‘ LAVICIDAL APPLICATION - BRIQUETTES OR DUNKS
Brand Name Price ’
. ; e Pricé Prico Price Price
Description Sizes (Equivaient Or Betéer) Per Pail/ | R ,
Chemical & Composition Bag /Plg, Pe_' Gallon Pengse Per Dyum Per Tote -
MetaLarv S-PT Mosquito Growth doz Altosid P35 $690'Q~g/#0 b $690.00
Repulnter - Petlets 20 0z d
Teknar SC  Biological Larvacide 2x2.5 gl - case
Aqueous Suspension 30 ga! drum
264 gal tote
VecloBac G, GS and GR Bivlogica . h408.03/35 IH bag
Larvicide  Granule 40 1bs, Fourstar Bti CRG $408.03
) Brand Name Price Price Price Price Pricc
Description Sizes (Equivalent Or Belter) Per Pail / Per Gallon | Por Gallon Per Drum Per Tote
) Chemniical & Composifion Bag /Plgs
VeatoBac WDC Biological Larvicide
Water Dispersible Granule 24 x 11b, cuse NO BID
| | . ’ 2 x2, 5 gh, cose NO BID
VectoBas 12A8 Biological Larvacide
Agueous Suspension 30 gl. Drum NO BID
264 gl. Tote NO BID
Liquid oz-gal
3 ﬂlﬂs'd"Mosquﬂo Growth Regulalor |~ iirdo 1os, Altosid 30 day briquet |$476.00
rlguettes
Pellct 200 MWosy ), 14p day 1152940
Briquette 200-300 :
Liguid - oz - gal
Altosid P35 Mosquito Growth Granular 40 Ibs, $690.00

Regulator  Granular

Pellet - 200

Briguello 200-300
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BIDDER’S INFORMATION:

I/We the undersigned hereby certify that I/'We am/are a duly authorized official of the company and have the
authority to sign on behalf of the company and assure that all statements made in the bid are true, 1/We agree o
furnish and deliver the specified items/services at the prices stated herein, and have read, understand, and agree
to the terms and conditions contained herein and on all of the attachments.

®

BIDDER/COMPANY NAME:  Clarke Mosquito Contro! Products, Inc

ADDRESS: 675 Sidwell Ct

PHONE & FAX NO’S;  800-323-5727 630-443-3070

CELLULAR NO:

E-MAIL ADDRESS:  customercare@clarke.copf )

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: V/ M / f L L\/_,‘
7 Y

PRINTED NAME: | Gordon Anderson

TITLE  yp & CFO

1ICHD -2018-248 ‘
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HIDALGO COUNTY
"Purchase of Mosquito Control Chemicals"
RFB 2018-248-12-19-SGS

CLARKE
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS
Brand Name/equal |Price per Pkg /| Price per | Price per | Price per | Price per
to or better Pail /Bag Gallon Case Drum Tote
ADULTICIDING CHEMICAL IBiomist 4 + 4 No Bid $17.00 gl No Bid No Bid No Bid
BIOLARVICED BIOLOGICAL
LARVICIDE AQUEOUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUSPENSION
INSECTICIDE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
INSECTICIDE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Name/equal |Price per Pkg /| Price per | Price per | Price per | Price per
LARVICIDE APPLICATION to or better Pail /Bag Gallon Case Drum Tote
BRIQUETTES or DUNKS
METALARV S-PT MOSQUITO $690.00
GROWTH REGULATOR Altosid P35 40 Ib'b No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PELLETS &
TEKNAR SC BIOLOGICAL
LARVACIDE AQUEOUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUSPENSION
VECTOBAC G, GS and GR $408.03
BIOLOGICAL LARVICIDE JFourstar BTl CRG 35 1b b No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GRANULE %
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CLARKE

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS
Brand Name/equal |Price per Pkg /| Price per | Price per | Price per | Price per
to or better Pail /Bag Gallon Case Drum Tote
Brand Name-equal | Price per Pkg /| Price per Price per | Price per | Price per
° DESCRIPTION to or better Pail /Bag Gallon Case Drum Tote
VECTOBAC WDC BIOLOGICAL
10 LARVICIDE WATER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DSPERSIBLE GRANULE
VECTOBSC 12AS BIOLOGICAL
11 LARVACIDE AQUEOUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUSPENSION
ALTOSID MOSQUITO GROWTH JAltosid 30 day Brig $476.00 . ) ) .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 IREGULATOR BRIQUETTES |Altosid 150 day $752.40 o o o o
ALTOSID P35 MOSQUITO .
13 [[GROWTH REGULATOR Alosid P35 $690.00 401b | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid
GRANULAR Mosquito Growth
Regulator
Granular

BID TABULATION--Page 2




EXHIBIT “C”

CERTIFICATE OF
INSURANCE



DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

’ (]
ACORD
E_/ 10/31/2018

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
e

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTR
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER,

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the polley(les) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or he endorsed.
If SUBROGATION 1S WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policles may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate hoider In lleu of such endorsement(s).

CONTACT .
ﬁﬁ%"if\?ernaﬁonal Midwest Limited Eﬁgﬁé €SU Chicago - Midwes FAX
55 East Jackson Boulevard PG No. By 312.922:5000 {80C, Hol: _
Chicago IL 60804 AnbRress: CSUChicago@hubinternational.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING GOVERAGE NAIC #
INSURER A : Lexington Insurance Company 18437
INSURED ) INsURER B ; Commerce & Industry Insurance Company 19410
g_i{asr}é?dl\\'dvce)ﬁqcuggif ontrol Products, Inc. INSURER ¢ ; Natlonal Union Fire insurance Company of Pitisburg 19445
Saint Charles, IL 60174 INSURER B ;
INSURERE ;
INSURER F :

COVERAGES REVISION NUMBER:

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MA

NSR ADDLISUBR] POLICY EFF | POLICY EXB
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | @ POLICY NUMBER MMIODYYYY) | (MMIDDIYYYY) LIMITS
b FOLICYNUMBER | L(MMID
A X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EG1950828 11/1/2018 M12019 | aGH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
 DAMAGE 70 RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE QCCUR PREMISES {Ea occurrence) _ $ 300,000
X | Pollution Legal MED EXP {Any one person) | § 26,000
Liability PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE § 2,000,000
X | poLicy i Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/CP AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: Poliullon Legal Liab $1,000,000
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
B | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY CAB530642 11H/2018 Titizate | GOMEINED § $ 1,000,000
X ’ ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
OWNED SCHEDULED
| o [ ] giisgue s
| N
| X [AUTos onty | X AUTOS ONLY | (Per accident) $
$
A | X | UMBRELLA LIAB X | accur EGLHM950829 11142018 U R [P T — $ 10,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $ 10,000,000
pep | X [ reventions
C |WORKERS COMPENSATION WCO77711058 11172018 Itzots X [EER T TOTR
C |AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN WCO77711050 11112018 11172019
ANYPROPRIETORIPARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? NiA
{Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| § 1,000,000
If Eas, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. OISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OFERATIONS { LOCATIONS / VEHICLES {ACORD 101, Additfonal Remarke Schedule, may b attached if mare space is requirad)
Poltution Legal Liability Includes coverage for Third Parly On-site, Third Party Off-site, Hostlle Fire
and Building Equipment, Produets Poliutlon, Contraclors Pollution and Transperiation Cargo,

Hidalgo County is included as Additional Insured {excluding Workers' Compensation coverage) as required by written contract with the named insured.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESC
THE EXPIRATION DATE THERE
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY P/

RIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
OF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ROVISIONS.

Hidalgo County

Aftn; Purchasing Deparimen
2812 8. Business Hwy 281
Edinburg TX 78530

t

2802 S, Highway Bus,

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

® 1988-2015 ACORD CORPO
The ACORD name and logo are reglstered marks of ACORD

RATION. All rights reserved,






