TABULATION SHEET

Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)

“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items”
RFB No.: 2019-100-05-15-TDL

CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE

NIGP CODE: 665-89 POlyvinyl Chloride (PVC)

Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
12” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CATEGORY (A) — PIPES

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE

NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)

TYPE “IR” PIPE

Rio Valley Pipe LLC " : Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
12” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102”LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“CONTINUED”

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE
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NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)
TYPE “I” PIPE
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
12” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
“CONTINUED”
CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE
NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)
TYPE “IA” PIPE
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
12” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - RUBBER GASKET JOINT PIPE
NIGP CODE: 658-68
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
CLASS | CLASS | CLASS | CLASS | CLASS CLASS CLASS CLASS | CLASS | CLASS | CLASS | CLASS
11} \Y Y% 11} IV Vv 11} \Y v 11} \Y Y%
12°LF 14.91 19.16 | 2118 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
15" LF 1754 | 2219 | 2420 | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
18" LF 19.96 | 2521 | 27.23 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
24" LF 2825 | 3227 | 3429 | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 25.71 27.12 28.67
30 LF 4179 | 4530 | 47.29 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 43.18 4554 48.14
36" LF 5898 | 6454 | 68.94 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 56.86 59.97 63.40
42" LF 7835 | 79.16 | 90.84 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 76.36 80.54 85.14
48" LF 9023 | 99.83 | 114.76 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 97.56 102.89 108.78
54" LF 107.49 | 122.32 | 139.76 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
60" LF 13480 | 152.03 | 180.02 | No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 120.11 126.69 133.92
72" LF 186.14 | 21463 | 263.33 | NoBid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 222.75 234.96 248.38
REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - TONGUE & GROOVE PIPE
NIGP CODE: 658-68
VENDORS o gﬁ;}gglg;l‘l‘c Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguaworks Pipe and Supply
CLASS | CLASS | CLASS | CLASS CLASS CLASS CLASS CLASS [ CLASS CLASS CLASS | CLASS
1 IV v 11} vV Vv 11} \Y v 11} v v
12°LF 1249 | 1642 | 1767 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
15" LF 1517 | 1950 | 20.61 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
18" LF 17.85 | 2258 | 2356 18.75 23.96 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
24" LF 2522 | 2874 | 2945 26.05 3125 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 25.71 27.12 28.67
30” LF 3848 | 40.20 | 48.86 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 43.18 45.54 48.14
36" LF 5274 | 5828 | 6845 55.73 60.94 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 56.86 59.97 63.40
42" LF 7176 | 7389 | 8273 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 76.36 80.54 85.14
48" LF 9041 | 97.09 | 110.33 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 97.56 102.89 | 108.78
54" LF 106.21 | 118.28 | 132.96 No Bid NoBid_| No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
60” LF 13116 | 148.70 | 169.41 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 120.11 126.69 | 133.92
72° LF 189.43 | 21843 | 247.33 No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 222.75 234.96 | 248.38
REINFORCED POLYTHYLENE PIPE - 20 FOOT JOINTS
NIGP CODE: 658-58
Rio Valley Pipe . . .
VENDORS LLC d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguaworks Pipe & Supply
24" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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AWWA C900 PVC PLASTIC PRESSURE PIPE
NIGP coDE:658-56 PLASTIC PIPES OR
NIGP cODE: 658-60 PVC PIPES
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS Core and Main Act Pipe and Suppl
d/b/a CAPA P PPy Supply
DR DR DR DR DR DR

. g . o - - DR 14 DR 18 DR 25 DR 14 DR18 | DR25

4" LF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 2.80 2.18 1.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.07 2.40 1.76

6" LF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 5.46 4.35 3.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.99 4.77 3.47

8” LF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 9.38 7.52 5.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.29 8.25 5.97

10" LF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 1427 | 11.94 8.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.66 12.40 9.02

12" LF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 20.16 | 15.95 11.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.13 1751 12.75

AWWA C905 PVC PLASTIC WATER PIPE
NIGP coDE: 658-56 PLASTIC PIPES OR
NIGP coDE: 658-60 PVVC PIPES
Rio Valley Pipe LLC - : .
VENDORS yrip Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguaworks Pipe and Supply
d/b/a CAPA
DR| DR [ DR | DR | DR | DR | DR DR DR | DR [ DR [DR| DR | DR [DR| DR | DR DR | DR DR
18 | 25 | 325 | 41 | 51 | 18 25 32,5 41 51 18 | 25 | 325 | 41 | 51 18 | 25 25| 4 51
14” LF No | No No No No | No No No No No No No | No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
16" LF No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid |Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
18" LF No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
247 LF No | No No No No | No No No No No No No | No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
30” LF No | No No No No | No No No No No No No | No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid |Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
36” LF No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid |Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
42” LF No | No No No No | No No No No No No No | No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
48” LF No | No No No No | No No No No No No No | No No No No No No No No
Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid | Bid Bid | Bid | Bid Bid
SDR 26 AND SDR 35 GASKETED GRAVITY SANITARY SEWER PIPE
NIGP CODE: 210-35
SEWER PIPE JOINT SEALING COMPOUND
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS Core and Main Act Pipe and Suppl
d/b/a CAPA P PP Suppl
SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35
4°LF No Bid No Bid 1.20 .90 No Bid No Bid 1.32 .99

6" LF No Bid No Bid 2.59 1.96 No Bid No Bid 2.86 2.15

8”LF No Bid No Bid 468 351 No Bid No Bid 5.14 3.85

10" LF No Bid No Bid 7.33 5.50 No Bid No Bid 8.05 6.05

12” LF No Bid No Bid 10.47 7.91 No Bid No Bid 11.48 8.68

15" LF No Bid No Bid 15.88 11.78 No Bid No Bid 17.43 12.91
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Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items”
RFB No.: 2019-100-05-15-TDL

HIGH PERFORMANCE (HP) POLYPROPYLENE STORM PIPE

Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
12°LF No Bid 511 7.10 6.96
15" LF No Bid 7.82 8.88 8.69
18" LF No Bid 10.62 1171 11.46
24" LF No Bid 16.47 19.74 19.33
30” LF No Bid 25.39 30.72 30.08
36" LF No Bid 31.93 33.66 32.96
42°LF No Bid 44.93 43.22 4232
48" LF No Bid 50.36 56.65 55.47
60" LF No Bid 85.17 88.80 86.96
HIGH DESTINY POLYETHYLENE PIPE (HDPE)
NIGP CODE: 658-58 POlyethylene Pipe And Fitting
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Supply
4”LF No Bid No Bid .73 0.75
6”LF No Bid No Bid 1.58 1.55
8”LF No Bid No Bid 3.31 3.24
10”LF No Bid No Bid 5.10 4.52
12”LF No Bid 6.96 5.23 5.12
15”LF No Bid 8.68 7.98 8.48
18”LF No Bid 11.46 10.85 10.63
24”LF No Bid 19.32 16.83 16.48
30”LF No Bid 30.06 25.95 25.41
36”LF No Bid 32.93 32.64 31.96
42”LF No Bid 42.29 45.41 44.46
48”LF No Bid 55.43 51.46 50.39
54”LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60”LF No Bid 86.89 87.06 85.25
PLUMBING PIPES - 20 FOOT SECTIONS
NIGP CODE: 967-60
PVC
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . Aguaworks Pipe and
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Ferguson Waterworks Supply
142 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00
1 %2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
2% No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.40
3” No Bid No Bid No Bid 36.00
4” No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00
PLUMBING PIPES - 20 FOOT SECTIONS
NIGP CODE: 967-60
COPPER
Rio Valley Pipe LLC . . Aguaworks Pipe
VENDORS d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply and Supply
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3> No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items”
RFB No.: 2019-100-05-15-TDL

TEGORY (B) — INLETS

NIGP CODE: 210-31
INLETS, AREA, SEWER DRAIN, PRECAST, CONCRETE, STORM DRAIN, NO BOTTOM FLOORS

DESCRIPTION Rio \J/E;)I/IS)E;O:E;LLC Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguawg;l;sp:‘—;lpe and
2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type "A" 214 891.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 3’ 896.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(5'x3) 314 915.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ 954.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v 1007.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5° 1061.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 1123.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ 1202.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6% 1269.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ 1337.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7V’ 1402.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ 1453.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 1446.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ 1485.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 1538.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° 1592.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type "A-1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(5'x4) 31, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1y’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type "A-2" 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 21y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(5'x 5 3° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7V No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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814 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

91y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "A-3" 2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Inlet 214 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(5'x6) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

314 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7V No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 1y’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

T A 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ype "A" : _ : _ _

(SPL-1) Inlet 2V No B!d No B!d No B!d No B!d

(5. X 3.) 3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 vy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6V No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

]’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 14’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

915 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "A-1" 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(SPL-1) Inlet | 2 vy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(5" x 4) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6V No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type IIA_2H 2? No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(SPL-1) Inlet | 51> No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(5'x5) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 1y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
]’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
915 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
T A3 2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ype "A-3" : : : :
’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(SPL-1) Inlet | 272 - o= o= o
(5'x 6" 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1y’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TYPE “C” 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 21 588.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(2°xX27) 3 634.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
314 681.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ 724.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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5’ 814.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 860.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ 003.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 993.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ 1083.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9’ 1173.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1/2a 121932 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° 1262.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TYPE “C” 2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 21 762.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(37X3) 3 A50058 No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 878.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 93731 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4y 995.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5° 1054.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 1112.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid

67 117087 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 v 1229.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

77 128766 No Bid No Bid No Bid

A 1346.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ 1404.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 1y’ 1464.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1521.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1/2a 157961 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° 1638.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TYPE “C” 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4!n}|{ezy 2% 1041.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
( ) 3° 1127.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid
314 1214.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ 1300.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4y 1385.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ 1473.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 1558.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ 1643.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid

614 1728.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 1816.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7y 1901.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ 1986.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 1y 2077.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 2162.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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9 1 2247.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10’ 233562 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TYPE “CC” 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet - - -

(5’ X 3’) PRVA 1249.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3’ 1254.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

314 1275.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ 1289.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 4 1342.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ 1397.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 1459.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ 1537.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 1605.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7’ 1673.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 1 1737.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ 1789.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 14’ 1806.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9’ 1821.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1/2a 187411 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "F" Inlet 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(W=3) 2 Uy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 1y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

g’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 1y’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "F-1" 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Inlet 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(W=4) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type nE_on 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
W=5'
( ) 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
614 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
714 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9V’
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type "F-3" 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inlet 3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(W=6") 3 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type =0 2’ No B?d No B?d No B?d No B?d
(SPL-1) Inlet | 2%’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(W=3" 3° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7Yy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "F-1" 2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(SPL-1) Inlet 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(W=4" 3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 1y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "F-2" 2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(SPL-1) Inlet 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(W=5) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type "F-3" 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(SP (L\‘le) 6I,I)ﬂet 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
314 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Yy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
]’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
914 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY (C) - MANHOLES, NO BOTTOM FLOORS
VENDORS / PRICE
DESCRIPTION ” Rio \d//abI/I:yCIIDAI\IE;LLC Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguawgﬁ;spf;pe and
3 596.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 650.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ 703.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 v 739.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5’ 789.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
514 825.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TYPE “A” 6’ 881.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MANHOLE 6 Y’ 917.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ 970.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 1006.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ 1060.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 14’ 1096.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ 1145.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
915 1181.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° 1288.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TYPE “A-1” 3 747.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MANHOLE 31 765.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4’ 801.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 vy 903.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5’ 939.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 998.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ 1034.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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6 1171.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ 1207.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 v 1306.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ 1342.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 14 1444.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 1480.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
914 1540.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° 1576.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
314 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TYPE “M” 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MANHOLE =75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
514 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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CATEGORY (D) - MISCELLANEOUS

DESCRIPTION
Vendors Rio Valley Pipe LLC |~ 1 vain Act Pipe and Aguaworks Pipe and
d/b/a CAPA Supply Supply
WATER VALVE
2” ea. No Bid 247.94 No Bid No Bid
4” ea. No Bid 406.53 No Bid No Bid
6” ea. No Bid 518.07 No Bid No Bid
8” ea. No Bid 825.12 No Bid No Bid
10” ea. No Bid 1285.71 No Bid No Bid
90 DEGREE ELBOW
2” ea. No Bid 33.51 No Bid No Bid
4” ea. No Bid 37.27 No Bid No Bid
6” ea. No Bid 60.99 No Bid No Bid
8” ea. No Bid 88.47 No Bid No Bid
10” ea. No Bid 140.71 No Bid No Bid
45 DEGREE ELBOW
2” ea. No Bid 25.60 No Bid No Bid
4” ea. No Bid 30.87 No Bid No Bid
6” ea. No Bid 49.69 No Bid No Bid
8” ea. No Bid 72.28 No Bid No Bid
10” ea. No Bid 104.66 No Bid No Bid
STEEL PIPE CASING WITH
SPACERS
4 1f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6” If No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 1f No Bid 127.11 No Bid No Bid
167 If No Bid 234.22 No Bid No Bid
247 If No Bid 298.00 No Bid No Bid
eF{J:.FQE HYDRANT W/VALVE No Bid 2930.00 No Bid No Bid
PVC SCHEDULE 40 WATER
LINE DR 18
27 1f No Bid 1.00 No Bid No Bid
8 If No Bid 2.50 No Bid No Bid
PVC SCHEDULE 40
1.571f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.75”1f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.571f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WATER SADDLE W/2’
CORPORATE VALVE
87 x2” ea. No Bid 550.00 No Bid No Bid
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HP Dual Wall Marmac Couplers
Rio Valley Pipe . . Aguaworks
Vendor LLC d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Pipe and Supply
PIPE SIZE

12” ea. No Bid 48.61 48.61 45,94

15 ea. No Bid 55.10 55.10 52.07

18” ea. No Bid 67.76 67.76 64.03

24" ea. No Bid 87.70 87.70 82.88

30 ea. No Bid 113.39 113.39 107.15

36” ea. No Bid 132.68 132.68 125.38

42” ea. No Bid 147.73 147.73 139.61

48” ea. No Bid 288.73 288.73 272.85

607¢ea. No Bid 323.88 323.88 291.49

HP Dual Wall Fabricated Tees
Rio Valley Pipe . . .
Vendor LLC d/b/a CAPA Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguaworks Pipe and Supply
PIPE SIZE

12” ea. No Bid 325.37 325.37 307.47
15” ea. No Bid 361.53 417.09 394.15
18” ea. No Bid 525.47 525.47 496.57
24” ea. No Bid 784.71 784.71 741.55
30 ea. No Bid 1312.32 1312.32 1240.14
36” ea. No Bid 1728.97 1728.97 1633.87
42”ea. No Bid 1949.78 1949.78 1842.54
48” ea. No Bid 2672.32 2672.32 2525.34
60” ea. No Bid 4287.08 4287.08 4051.29

HP Dual Wall Fabricated Bends

Ven Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a . . .
dors {:AFF)’A Core and Main Act Pipe and Supply Aguaworks Pipe & Supply
*
PIPE 11.25 225 30* 45* 90* 11.25 225 30* 45* 90* 11.25 22.5 30* 45* Bgeond 11.25 22.5 30* 45* 90*
SIZE | Bend | Bend Bend | Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend Bend
127 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 149.84 159.01 161.03 161.86 171.90 149.84 159.01 161.13 161.86 141.60 =] g2 B2 Bz
ea. 171.90
157 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 193.03 203.89 207.12 402.13 227.69 193.03 203.89 207.12 402.13 22713 182.42 [F7E e =2 P
ea. :
187 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 217.49 248.78 244.91 232.82 295.26 217.49 248.78 24491 25351 205,26 205.53 =] 2 2057 a2
ea. ¥
247 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 337.86 400.11 37221 406.72 451.81 337.86 400.11 377.21 406.72 181 319.27 7 7] 5 [
ea.
307 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 520.08 547.02 579.72 603.24 738.67 520.08 547.02 579.72 603.24 73844 491.47 ] 7 ] 77
ea.
367 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 637.47 717.46 813.77 777.47 940.01 637.47 717.46 813.77 777.44 940t 602.41 A B 57 =
ea.
427 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 790.39 948.94 980.58 1007.26 1210.83 790.39 948.94 980.58 1007.26 121083 746.92 =] = R R
ea.
48” N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 968.27 1188.28 1229.34 1253.27 1318.89 968.27 1187.83 1229.34 1253.27 131889 915.01 == [ EEE S
ea.
> 2447.98 1911.70 1763.36 1999.80 231334
60 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B 1439.88 2022.97 1865.99 2116.19 2447.98 1438.88 2022.97 1865.99 2116.19 1360.68
ea.
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