The City of Lorain, Ohio
Division of Buildings
Rey Carrion, Safety/Service Director

DATE: January 7, 2026
TIME: 9:00 A.M.
PLACE: Council Chambers

PUBLIC HEARING

C.U.P. 01-2026 Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Conditional Use
Permit for Truck Livery, Section 1143.07(j) in a I-1 Light Industrial district, and Section 1127.02 Schedule
of Allowed Uses at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy, applicant.

C.U.P. 02-2026 Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Conditional Use
Permit for Outdoor Storage Related to Principal Uses, Section 1143.08(a) in a I-1 Light Industrial district,
and Section 1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking-
Jose Laboy, applicant.

P.D.P. 01-2026, Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Preliminary
Development Plan for residential new construction, in a PUD-Planned Unit Development district, Chapter
1131 and Section 1145 Site Development Plans located at, PPN’s 02-02-009-101-089 and
02-02-008-107-061. Kevin Hoffman, Polaris Engineering & Surveying, (agent) applicant.

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS AGENDA

ROLL CALL:
DISPOSITION OF MINUTES:

December Public Hearing Minutes

December Zoning Minutes

MATTERS FOR CONSIDERATION:



B.A. 01-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a variance to allow
parking in the rear yard in a R-1B Residential district. Section 1149.04(f)(3) Off-Street Parking Facility &
Design at, 3828 Ivanhoe Dr. George Wilson Jr., applicant.

B.A. 02-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use variance to
allow the operation of outdoor storage, rental, sales, and service of construction equipment in a I-2 Heavy
industrial district. Section 1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses at, 7405 Industrial Pkwy. Lake Pointe
Partners, applicant.

B.A. 03-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, an appeal regarding
the plan review denial for a fence at PPN 02-01-003-111-052. Section 1175.01(a) Decisions- Appeals.
Kathleen M. Wise, applicant.

B.A. 04-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, an appeal regarding
the plan review denial for a shed at PPN 02-01-003-111-052. Section 1175.01(a) Decisions- Appeals.
Kathleen M. Wise, applicant.

B.A. 05-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use variance to
allow parking of Industrial and Recreational vehicles within the required 200-foot setback (near residential
districts) in a I-1 Light industrial Section 1143.07(j)(5) Retail and Service-Oriented Uses at, 1305 Oberlin
Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy, applicant.

B.A. 06-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a variance from the
maximum dimensional standards for wall signs in an HMD- Hospital Medical Center district (150 feet).
Section 1151.06 Signs By District at, 5800 Cooper Foster Park Rd. John Benedict -Brilliant Electric Sign
(agent), Cleveland Clinic, applicant.

MISCELLANEOUS CONCERNS:

ADJOURNMENT

EVELISSE ATKINSON, PLANNING & ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

IF APPLICANT UNABLE TO ATTEND, PLEASE CALL (440) 204-2034

Lorain City Hall, 200 West Erie Avenue, 5th Floor, Lorain, OH 44052
Phone: 440-204-2045 / Fax: 440-204-2540



CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 1. a.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:

C.U.P. 01-2026 Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Conditional Use Permit for
Truck Livery, Section 1143.07(j) in a I-1 Light Industrial district, and Section 1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses
at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy, applicant.




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 1.b.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:
C.U.P. 02-2026 Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Conditional Use Permit for

Outdoor Storage Related to Principal Uses, Section 1143.08(a) in a I-1 Light Industrial district, and Section
1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy, applicant.




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 1.c.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:

P.D.P. 01-2026, Submission for Planning Commission’s review and consideration, a Preliminary Development
Plan for residential new construction, in a PUD-Planned Unit Development district, Chapter 1131 and Section 1145
Site Development Plans located at, PPN’s 02-02-009-101-089 and 02-02-008-107-061. Kevin Hoffman, Polaris
Engineering & Surveying, (agent) applicant.




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals
Meeting Date: ~ 01/07/2026

Subject:
December Public Hearing Minutes

December Public Hearing Minutes

Attachments




Public Hearing Minutes

DATE: December 3rd, 2025
TIME: 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: Council Chambers

Public Hearing For:

Z.C.A. 03-2025 Submission for Planning Commission’s review and recommendation to
Lorain City Council, the Zoning Reclassification of, 2973 G St., from a B-2 General
Commercial District to an R2-Transitional Residential district. Iraida Robles, applicant.

Iraida Robles, the applicant, spoke in regard to this matter.

Evelisse Atkinson, City of Lorain Planning and Zoning Administrator, spoke in
regard to this matter.

Beth Henley spoke in regard to this matter.
Mary Springowski spoke in regard to this matter.

David Faciana, Chief Building Official for The City of Lorain, spoke in regard to
this matter.

Adjournment:

The public hearing was adjourned without objection.

Rey Carrion, Chairman

Recorded by: Megan Warrens

Accepted:



CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals
Meeting Date: ~ 01/07/2026

4. b.

Subject:
December Zoning Minutes

Attachments
December Zoning Minutes




ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
MINUTES

DATE: December 3rd, 2025
TIME: 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: Council Chambers

Attendance:
Chairman: Rey Carrion Board Members: Henry Patterson, Ken Kramer, Brandon
Wysocki, Shawn Lloyd

A Quorum was established
The meeting was called to order on December 3rd, 2025 by Rey Carrion.

Minutes:

A motion was made by Henry Patterson to approve minutes from the Zoning Board of
Appeals Meeting that was held on November 5th, 2025. The motion was supported by
Brandon Wysocki.

5 in favor/ 0 opposed

Matters of Consideration:

B.A. 37-2025 (previously held in abeyance) Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals
review and consideration, a variance from the required paved driveway access to the rear of
the property, a variance of 169 parking spaces for open air businesses, a variance to allow
storage and display areas on unpaved areas of the property, and a variance from the outdoor
display areas being attached to the principal building (setbacks will be met) in a B-2 General
Commercial district. Section 1143.07(h) Outdoor Display and Storage of Retail and Service
Establishments at, 4953 W Erie Ave. Parma Park Properties, owner and Jacob Zook,
applicant.

Jacob Zook, the applicant, spoke in regard to this matter.

Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator for The City of Lorain,
spoke in regard to this matter.

A motion was made by Brandon Wysocki to deny the variance request for a paved
driveway. No support



A motion was made by Brandon Wysocki to approve the variance request for a
paved driveway, and was supported by Ken Kramer

4 in favor/ 1 opposed

A motion was made by Brandon Wysocki to approve the variance request for the
required 169 parking spaces, and was supported by Ken Kramer.

5 in favor/ 0 opposed
A motion was made by Brandon Wysocki to approve the variance request to allow
storage and display areas on unpaved areas of the property, and was supported by

Ken Kramer.

4 in favor/ 1 opposed

Adjournment:

The meeting was adjourned without objection.

Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator

Rey Carrion, Chairman

Recorded by: Megan Warrens

Accepted:

**A full recording of this meeting can be found at www.cityoflorain.org.



CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5. a.
Meeting Date: ~ 01/07/2026

Subject:

B.A. 01-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a variance to allow parking
in the rear yard in a R-1B Residential district. Section 1149.04(f)(3) Off-Street Parking Facility & Design at, 3828
Ivanhoe Dr. George Wilson Jr., applicant.

Attachments
BA 1-2026
BA 1-2026 Staff Report




~_CEIVER
CITY OF LORAIN NOV 17 2025

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS '3\,

Jack Bradley _
Mayor O .
BOARD OF APPEALS NO. l w 2’3

APPLICATION FOR A VARIANCE FROM THE ZONING CODE

APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LORAIN,
STATE OF OHIO, FOR A VARIANCE OF THE ZONING CODE,

George A. Wilson, Jr.
Address: 3828 Ivanhoe Drive
Lorain

Name:

OH Zip: 440563

) 216-219-7037

City: State:

216-219-7037

Phone: (Residential) (Business

Address or location of property requiring a variance if different from above:

Site Plan Submitted: Yes Letter Submitted: Yes

1149.04 13

Section of Zoning Code Involved

Reason for the Appeal or Variance:
Reason is to finish off the driveway on the east side of the new garage.

Non-refundable Application Fee: $165.00 (Ordinance 168-20 effective January 21, 2021)

/// %,/ 11-13-2025
/Applicant Signature / Date

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org




. George A. Wilson, Jr
3828 Ivanhoe Drive

Lorain, OH 44053

City of Lorain Zoning Board of Appeals
200 West Erie, 5™ Floor
Larain, OH 44052

Dear Zoning Board of Appeals,

We are removing our existing barn structure in our backyard. It will be replaced by a 24 x 32
ft. garage. We have completed a residential accessory/addition permit application for that
structure.

We are requesting a variance to finish off the driveway on the east side of the property to
match the existing driveway along side the new building. We are asking for a property line
variance to the east, adjacent neighbor — Greg Wright, and the end of the driveway with stop

at the end of the building to comply to the 5 ft setback to our rear neighbors, the
Rodriguez’s.

Warm regards,

George A. Wilson, Jr

Owner



Neighbors Names and Addresses to Request for Concrete Variance

Abutting
Greg Wright

3814 lvanhoe Drive
Lorain, OH 44053

Next Door

Anthony Marcucci
3904 lvanhoe Drive
Lorain, OH 44053

Backyard

Natalio Rodriguez
3827 Woodstock
Lorain, OH 44053

Across the street

Stella James
3827 Ivanhoe Drive
Lorain, OH 44053



ST
L2 Ya10d awesd Udo

£

i T4
15 8ZS z
o abeses) Asuosel Ny P Y \ v
oy 30 5 9891 At Y wﬂw g VML
50 Jaweseq %
- Auosey Aols aug .
* vnw v~ O Iy, Q

i
ﬁl'ﬂ 121

)s09¢
oneg 212.0U0D | \
....om - e e
) \
) " _.(oh.\ﬁ\s 003D ;UINM(
v L |
. 8\_%,,” Esoik HA MYYVIT
] e ] P YT aC3E sy
i
]

\f.uuvmov\ Ao ¥y

: : m?«?.ﬁﬁko AviVeng
N m\ﬂg T(.::va. A2V aMm

s e — _h : .
& ﬂ\ N 7ou 74 ‘ k. - .Y*)\\\H\ e et e gt g e ooy

- e et Wi v g i S i&ll.lll. .







CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

- Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Jack Bradley Director Chief Building Official

Mayor

December 30, 2025

To: Zoning Board of Appeals
From: Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator

Re: B.A. 01-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a
variance to allow parking in the rear yard in a R-1B Residential district. Section 1149.04(f)(3) Off-
Street Parking Facility & Design at, 3828 lvanhoe Dr. George Wilson Jr., applicant.

My responses regarding compliance are below:

Section 1149.04(f)(3) Off-street parking in other areas of the front yard, side street yard or rear
yard may be permitted when in the opinion of the Board of Zoning Appeals no practical
alternative exists, the purpose of the district would not be compromised, and no detrimental
impact would result.

Section 1175.03 (d) A variance shall only be granted upon a finding by the Board of Appeals
that all the following standards have been satisfied:

(1) That special conditions and circumstances exist which are particular to the property
involved and are not generally applicable to other properties in the same district.

(2) That the literal interpretation of the provisions of this Zoning Code would deprive the
applicant of rights commonly enjoyed by other properties in the same district

(3) That the special conditions and circumstances which exist are not the result of actions of
the applicant

(4) That granting the requested variance will not give the applicant any special privileges
denied to other properties in the same district.

Respectfully,

G~

Evelisse Atkinson
Planning & Zoning Administrator

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540
Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Email: bhp@cityoflorain.org www.cityoflorain.org



mailto:bhp@cityoflorain.org
http://www.cityoflorain.org/

14 19215 3)6oog ®

10 s0YUEAL 8Z8F




0202020106017




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5. b.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:
B.A. 02-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use variance to allow the

operation of outdoor storage, rental, sales, and service of construction equipment in a [-2 Heavy industrial district.
Section 1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses at, 7405 Industrial Pkwy. Lake Pointe Partners, applicant.

Attachments
BA 2-2026
BA 2-2026 Staff Report




CITY OF LORAIN

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Jack Bradley
Mayor

BOARD OF APPEALS NO.

APPLICATION FOR A VARIANCE FROM THE ZONING CODE

APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LORAIN,
STATE OF OHIO, FOR A VARIANCE OF THE ZONING CODE.

Name: Lake Pointe Partners, LLC
Address: 47704 Alden Ter. S.
city: Northville state: M! Zip: 48168

Phone: (Residential) (Business) (248)891-5829

Address or location of property requiring a variance if different from above:

7405 Industrial Parkway Dr. | Lorain, OH

Site Plan Submitted: Yes Letter Submitted: Yes

Section of Zoning Code Involved | @ble 1127.02 Schedule of Uses - Industrial District

Reason for the Appeal or Variance:

Permit the operation of construction equipment outdoor storage, rental, sales, and
service.

Non-refundable Application Fee: $165.00 (Ordinance 168-20 effective January 21, 2021)

7—,(4»%&*% Dzﬂiﬁm 11/25/25
(/4

Applicant Signature Date

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org



Lorain City Planning Commission / Zoning Board of Appeals
City of Lorain

200 West Erie Avenue

Lorain, OH 44052

Re: Request for Zoning Variance — 7405 Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, OH
Parcel No.: 01-00-023-000-036

To the Members of the Lorain Zoning Board of Appeals:

On behalf of Lake Pointe Partners, LLC | would respectfully request a zoning variance to allow the
outdoor storage, rental, sales, and service of construction equipment at the property located at 7405
Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, Ohio.

The subject property is located within the I-2 Heavy Industrial zoning district. These proposed uses—
equipment storage, rental, sales, and service—are explicitly permitted by right within the I-1 Light
Industrial district under the City of Lorain’s zoning code. While the I-2 district is intended to
accommodate more intense industrial activities, the requested uses are of equal or lesser impact than
many uses permitted within I-2 and are consistent with the industrial character of the surrounding area.

Approval of this variance would:

e Allow a use that is already recognized by the City as appropriate within industrial zoning
classifications

e Comply with and complement nearby industrial properties and their operations

e Maintain the intended character and purpose of the Industrial Parkway corridor and the existing
property

e Support economic development and productive use of the existing site

The proposed operation will maintain a clean, orderly, and professionally managed outdoor yard, with
equipment neatly staged and screened where appropriate. No negative impacts to adjacent properties
are anticipated.

We respectfully request the Board’s consideration and approval of this variance so that the property may
be utilized in a manner consistent with its industrial setting and the City’s zoning framework.

Thank you for your time and attention to this request. Please feel free to contact me if additional
information, plans, or testimony are needed prior to the hearing.

Sincerely,

Anthony DeAgostino
Managing Principal | Lake Pointe Partners, LLC






Re: Authorization to Submit Zoning Variance Application — 7405 Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, Ohio

As we move toward finalizing the purchase agreement for the property located at 7405 Industrial
Parkway Dr., Lorain, OH, we are preparing to begin the municipal approval process required for our
intended use of the site.

The City of Lorain requires confirmation that the current property owner authorizes the applicant to
submit a zoning variance request. In order to proceed with due diligence and maintain our project
timeline, we raspectfully request your written approval to file a zoning variance application with the
Lorain Zoning Board of Appeals for the proposed use of the property for construction equipment
outdoor storage, rental, sales, and service.

This authorization does not obligate you to participate in the hearings, and it does not commit you to
any cost or iegal responsibility. it simply acknowledges that, as the current owner, you consent to our
submitting the application during the contract and due-diligence period.

If acceptahle, please sign and return the acknowledgment below,

Owner Authorization

As the current owner of 7405 industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, Ohio, | hereby authorize Lake Pointe
Partners, LLC (o submit a zoning variance application to the City of Lorain for the proposed use of the

property for co ructiawipment ydoyorage,_ rental, sales, and service.
Signature: A& £~ [ /

Name: _ Lo i D" LSt
Date: //"'47/"‘ A0AS




Zoning Variance
7405 Industrial Parkway Dr. | Lorain, OH

Neighboring Property Owners

Property Address Property Owner
7425 Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, OH 7425 Industrial Parkway, LLC
7400 Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, OH Turtle Building, LLC
7369 Industrial Parkway Dr., Lorain, OH Ergomat Inc.




CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Director Chief Building Official

Jack Bradley
Mayor

December 30, 2025

To: Zoning Board of Appeals
From: Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator

Re: B.A. 02-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use
variance to allow the operation of outdoor storage, rental, sales, and service of construction
equipment in a I-2 Heavy industrial district. Section 1127.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses at, 7405
Industrial Pkwy. Lake Pointe Partners, applicant.

My responses regarding compliance are below:
Heavy equipment/semi-tractor trailer sales, rental and service is a permitted use in an I-1 Light
Industrial district.

Section 1175.01 Decisions:
b) Variances.

(1) The Zoning Board of Appeals is authorized to grant, upon appeal in specific cases, such
variances from the terms of the Zoning Code as will not be contrary to the public interest,
where owing to special conditions of the property, a literal enforcement of the provisions of
this Code will result in unnecessary hardship.

(2) A nonconforming use of neighboring lands or structures in neighboring lands in the
same or other zoning district shall not be considered grounds for the issuance of a variance.

(3) Variance shall not be granted on the grounds of convenience or economics, but only
where strict application of the provisions of this Zoning Code would result in undue hardship
due to conditions of the property.

(4) Variances shall not be granted which permit any use not otherwise permitted or
expressly, or by implication, prohibited in the district involved.

Respectfully,

G~

Evelisse Atkinson
Planning & Zoning Administrator

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540
Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Email: bhp@cityoflorain.org www.cityoflorain.org



mailto:bhp@cityoflorain.org
http://www.cityoflorain.org/

CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5.c.
Meeting Date: ~ 01/07/2026

Subject:

B.A. 03-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, an appeal regarding the plan
review denial for a fence at PPN 02-01-003-111-052. Section 1175.01(a) Decisions- Appeals. Kathleen M. Wise,
applicant.

Attachments
BA 3-2026
BA 3-2026 Plan Review




CITY OF LORAIN

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Jachl;Btadley 0 2 - 202{0
ayor
WRITTEN NOTICE OF APPEAL
02-01-063-11-052

Address of Property-2PH6201003T14620—

Date of Appeal: 12/10/2025

Name: Kathleen M. Wise

Address: 4325 Liberty Ave.

City: Vermilion State: CH le 44089 Phone Number: 440-687-4829

Please describe in detail the reason for your appeal:
| am appealing two denials, one for the, Fence and the other the, Shed. Dated November 21st, 2025.

As current zoning of R2, Section 3.01 Zone Districts Established, along with but not limited too,
Section 4.01 District Purpose., see attachments, along with but not limited too,
Table 4-2, Schedule of Use, Residential Districts , R2 tansional residential properties are lawfully

zoned, for conditional use of dwelling units, in my case condional primative residential use for myself

onul_y. and primary use of property for community garden , to improve the neighborhood by providing
a safe and beautiful space in which to nurchure unity ameng residents in a common goal of

‘a sustainable life and way of living, that will bring the comunity closer and tigher in bond so that

encou;e;ging a deeper sence of pride not only in there own neighborhoods but in that of also their
surrounding neighborhoods, thus improving blight and improving the value of the surrounding remainder of

homes already erected.
Thus falling with in the lawful right estabilshed by code, of use of acessory uses and structures as

the permitted primary principle use of the fand making the shed and fence permitted accessory structures.

materials or documentation to:
Building, Housing, & Planning, 200 W. Erie Ave., 5" Floor, Lorain, OH 44052

¢ Filing Fee (due at the time of submission) = $100

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Chio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org


Evelisse Atkinson
Highlight


Current zoning of PPN 0201003111020 Delaware Ave., Lorain, OH 44052, of R2 tanstional
residential, or transtioning from a primarily residential single family neighborhood to a
permanet parcel for non-residential neighborhood uses. Allowing uses that are compatible
and traditional to single family neighborhoods, such as fences that protect property from
tresspass , vandolism and other crimes, and are traditionally consistant in all neighborhoods,
including R2., along with sheds and gardens (non-residential uses)(Sec 4.01 District purpose,

Lorain Zoning Code.).

Where attached and detached structures and uses are permitted, such as sheds, fences, and
gardens and are compatiable, consistant , and traditional to the city neighborhoods walkable
characeteristics and permitted by current zoning of PPN 0201003111020, R2 transitional

residential. (Sec 4.01 {D)(R2) District Purpose). specifically.

Furthur -more Sec. 4.02 Schedule of allowed uses, of the Lorain Zoning code, states,
The land on PPN 0201003111020, has permited uses of Accessory uses, accessory structures to
the those uses, such as sheds,fences and gardens, and accessory dwelling units. Sec. 21.01 of

the Lorain Zoning Code states, an accessory use is incidental to and subordinate to the

principle use of the land /PPN, or building. {not only a principle building.).

Thus per section 4.01(D)(R-2), Section 4.02(A), Table 4-2, and Sec. 21.01 (A-B), of the Lorain
Zoning Code, the current zoning already allows these uses of PPN 0201003111020. These
uses are consistant and traditional to the walkable character of these traditionally single

family neighborhoods, now transitioning to non-residential neighborhoods, which have



always included sheds, fences, gardens, and other traditoinal neighborhood uses and

structures, but not limited to.

As PPN 0201003111020, has a current zoning of R-2 transitional residential use and purposes,
detached dwellings, buildings , and or structures consistant with the walkable neighborhood
character, which again include fences, sheds, gardens, etc., but not limited to and are well
suited as a buffer and are normally part of these neighborhoods chracteristics, and buffers
this transitioning time to the PPN's final stage from normally a single family neighborhood to

non-residential neighborhood uses and purposes. (Sec. 21.01 A-B, Definitions)

Furthure more also backed by the 2024 Ohio Building Code, Sec. 101.2 Scope, specifically
sections {1 )(26), along with 102.2 non required work, 102.10 work exempted from approval
(or permit not needed), building (1}(2)(5), allow these accessory uses and structures per

board of building codes standards.



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 3 ZONE DISTRICTS AND MAP

Section 3.01 Zone Districts Established
The following zone districts are established:

Category Deslgnation District Name
R-1A Low Density Single Family
R-1B Moderate Density Single Family
R-1C Medium Density Single Family
Residential Districts R-2 Transitional Residential
R-3 High Density Residential
R-4 Manufactured Home
Residential
B-1 Neighborhood Commercial
Commercial Districts B-2 General Commercial
B-3 Downtown Commercial
e I-1 Light Industrial
Industrial Districts 2 Heavy Industrial
HMD Hospital/Med Center
MU Mixed Use
Special Purpose Districts PUD Planned Unit Development
oS Open Space
DR-O Design Review Overlay

Section 3.02 Official Zoning Map

A. The official zoning map shall be identified by the signature of the mayor and attested by the clerk of
council, shall show the date of adoption of this zoning ordinance, and shall be further defined as
being the zoning districts as shown on the set of Lorain County Tax Maps maintained by the city
building department.

B. If, in accordance with the provisions of this zoning ordinance and Chio R.C. Chapter 713, changes
are made in district boundaries or other matters portrayed on this zoning map, such changes shall
be duly-noted on the zoning map no later than seven (7) days after the effective date of the
amendment. No changes shall be made in the zoning map except in conformity with the

amendment procedures set forth in this ordinance.

C. Regardless of the existence of copies of the zoning map, the official zoning map bearing the original

signature of the mayor shall be recognized as the official map as to current zoning status.

D. In the event that the official zoning map becomes damaged, destroyed, or difficult to interpret
because of changes, council may, by resolution, adopt a new zoning map which shall supersede the
prior map. The new map may correct drafting or other errors or omissions, but no such correction

shall have the effect of amending the zoning ordinance.

Page/3-4 Zoning Districts and Map



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 4 RESIDENTIAL ZONING DISTRICTS

Section 4.01 District Purpose.

A. R-1A, Low Density Single-Family. This district is intended to create a single-family neighborhood
environment on relatively large lots, while retaining the urban character of the community. It is
most appropriate near the outer perimeter of the city, especially the west end. Net densities of just
over two (2) units per acre can be achieved.

B. R-1B, Moderate Density Single-Family. This is an urban residential district intended to create
cohesive, single family, walkable neighborhoods at a net density of approximately four {4) units per
acre. The principal use of land is for single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious, and
educational facilities needed to provide the basic elements of a balanced, safe, and attractive living
environment.

C. R-1C, Medium Density Single-Family. This residential district is intended to reinforce the traditional
singie-family neighborhood pattern prevalent throughout much of the city. It supports cohesive,
walkable neighborhoods along a grid street network at a net density of approximately six (6} units
per acre. The principal use of land is for single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious,
and educational facilities contributing to a rich neighborhood fabric.

D. R-2, Transitional Residential. A variety of housing options are permitted within this district
consistent with the walkable, neighborhood character intended for single-family neighborhoods.
Attached and detached dwellings are permitted at densities compatible with traditional city
neighborhoods and well suited as a buffer to transition from single-family neighborhoods to non-
residential uses.

E. R-3, High Density Residential. This district provides for development of a range of housing types,
including multiple-family units at densities up to 18 units per acre, in order to accommodate open
space and recreational amenities within each development. Consistent with the city's
comprehensive plan, the district provides for housing choice in the community where increased
density would be compatible with existing development and promote economically viable
development on infill and redevelopment sites. The district may also be established as a transition
zone between lower density residential districts and nonresidential or mixed use districts.

F. RM, Manufactured Home Community. This district provides for a single family residential
environment within planned communities to accommodate manufactured homes. The principal use
of land is for manufactured single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious, and
educational facilities needed to provide the basic elements of a balanced, safe, and attractive
residential area.

Section 4.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses.

Buildings or land shall not be used and buildings shall not be erected, except for the following specified
uses, unless otherwise provided for in this ordinance. Land and/or buildings in the districts indicated at
the top of Table 4-2 may be used for the purposes denoted by the following abbreviations:

A. Permitted Use (P). Land and/or buildings with this designation may be used for these purposes by
right.

Page/4-6 Residential Zoning Districts



City of Lorain Zoning Code

8. Conditional Use (C}). Land and/or buildings with this designation may be used for these purposes if
conditional approval is granted by the planning commission upon a finding that all applicable
requirements in Chapter 11 are satisfied.

C. Specific Conditions. Indicates that conditions related to the specific use must be satisfied in addition
to the review procedures and general criteria of Sections 11.02 and 11.03.

Table 4-2, Schedule of Use, Residential Districts

Residential Districts
Uses R1A | R1B | R1C [R2 | R3 vl Specific Conditions
Residential
Assisted living facility 1 1 . l . C P
Bed and breakfast C C C See Section 11.04B
| Boarding house C C See Section 11.06C
Dwelling, manufactured home
Dwelling, multiple family o [ P
Dwelling, single-family attached P P
Dwelling, single-family detached P P P P
Dwelling, two-family P P
Family home p P P
Group home B P P
Manufactured home :
community/subdivision
Nursing home and extended care C P
Residential social services facility =i L C See Section 11.06F
Retirement community c P
Sober living facility C See Section 11.06G
Recreation and Leisure
Adult day care C C C C
| Child care facilities ) _ C C C C
Private noncommercial recreation P P P P P
| Public parks/playgrounds P | P | ¢ [SSRSSIESR
Public/Quosi-Public
Cemeteries [ Cill|=ic c C
| Government buildings and facilities | EIE] [ [ ¢ C C
Places of worship C C C C C See Section 11.05A
| Pre-school nursery C C C C C
Schools {K-12) C C C C C See Section 11.058
Accessory Uses
| Accessory dwelling units (o C C See Section 11.06A
Accessory uses and structures P P P P P
Cafeteria facilities located within a
principal use (not including dwelling P p P P P
| units)
Ch.l|d. care facilities located within a p p p p P
principal use - | |ESHE =
Home occupations P P P P
Single-user sola!' gnergy system as c C c C c
accessory to a principal use

Page/4-7 Residential Zoning Districts



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 21 DEFINITIONS

Section 21.01 Definitions A-B

ACCESSORY BUILDING. A subordinate building detached from, but located on the same lot as, the
principal building, the use of which is incidental and accessory to that of the principal building or use. A
storage container, trailer, or similar item is not an accessory building.

ACCESSORY USE. A use customarily incidental and subordinate to the principal use or building and
located on the same lot as the principal use or building.

ALLEY. A public thoroughfare or way, not more than 30 feet in width except for necessary turnarounds,
and which normally provides a secondary means of access to abutting property.

ALTERATION: Any change to any land, structure or building.

ALTERATION, BUILDING: Any change in the use of a building or any physical alteration made which
modifies the existing foundation, load bearing walls or roof of a building; or requires an electrical,
plumbing or mechanical permit.

ANIMAL HOSPITAL. An enclosed structure allowing for overnight or continuous care, diagnosis, and
treatment of animal ilinesses by a veterinarian.

BAR: Any place devoted primarily to the retailing and
drinking of malt, vinous, or other alcoholic beverages, or
which derives at least 75 percent of its total annual gross
sales from the sale of such beverages for consumption on -
the premises. i

BASEMENT: That portion of a building all or partly
underground but having at least one-half (1/2} of its

height below the average level of the adjoining ground. o 5*07)’._;
BED AND BREAKFAST: An owner-occupied private single- véad: ]

family residence which is the principal residence of the | L «

owner and the principal structure on the premises, with Harement
bedrooms available for rent to the general public and

with breakfast served at no additional cost. Basement = A < B

BOARDING HOUSE. A dwelling or part thereof, other than a hotel or motel, providing rooms for
compensation for three (3) or more unrelated persons who may reside for extended periods. Cooking
facilities are not provided in the individual units. Accessory uses may include dining rooms and
recreation rooms for use by the occupants, but not for the general public.

BUFFER: Any visual buffer, screening, open spaces, landscaped areas, fences, walls, berms, or any
combination thereof required by this ordinance used to physically separate or screen one use of
property from another so as to visually shield or physically block noise, lights, or other nuisances.
BUILDING: Any structure, either temporary or permanent, having walls and a roof, designed for the
shelter of any person, animal or property and occupying more than 100 square feet of area. .

Page / 21-153 Definitions



ACTION: Final

DATE: 08/11/2023 1:21 PM

4101:1-1-01

Administration.

Section 101

101.1 Incorporation by reference, title and rules of construction. Except as
provided in Chapters 4101:1-1 to 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code, the
International Building Code 2021 edition, Chapters 2 through 35 and appendix H,
as published by the “International Code Council, Inc.” including all subsequently

published errata and printings, and readily available at https://www.iccsafe.org, are

hereby incorporated by reference in accordance with sections 121.71 to 121.74 of

the Revised Code as if set out at length herein.

101.1.1 Rules of construction. The following rules of construction are to be

applied to Chapters 4101:1-1 to 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code:
1. All references to the International Building Code. International Mechanical

Code. International Plumbing Code. and International Residential Code mean

the Ohio Building Code, Ohio Mechanical Code, Ohio Plumbing Code, and
Residential Code of Ohio, respectively, unless otherwise noted, References to
“this code” in Chapters 4101:1-1 to 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code mean
the “Ohio Building Code.” References to “building code” in divisions 4101:1,

4101:2, 4101:3 and 4101:8 of the Administrative Code mean “Ohio Building
Code.”
2. The phrase "applicable energy conservation code referenced in Chapter 13"

is substituted for "International Energy Conservation Code."
3. Except as otherwise noted and in Chapter 34 of this code, “Chapter 34” is

substituted for “International Existing Building Code.”
4. The terms “approval” or “approvals” are substituted for “permit” or
“permits,” respectively, when referring to documentation _indicating

compliance with this code.
5. The phrase “owner’s representative” is substituted for “owner’s authorized

agent.”
6. Except as otherwise noted, “building official” is substituted for “fire code

official.”

7. The phrase “building official” is substituted for “code official.”
8. The provisions of this code are mandatory whether or not the term “shall” is

used.

101.2 Scope. The provisions of the “Ohio Building Code.” the “Ohio Mechanical
Code,” and the “Ohio Plumbing Code” apply to the construction, alteration,

movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,

location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every building or structure or any

print dace; 51172023 E234 PM



4101:1-1-01 2

appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures. As provided

in division (B) of section 3791.04 of the Revised Code, no plans or specifications
are to be approved or inspection approval given unless the building represented by

those plans or specifications would, if constructed, repaired, erected. or equipped
according to those plans or specifications. comply with Chapters 3781. and 3791.
of the Revised Code and any rules adopted by the board. An owner may exceed the

requirements of the “Ohio Building Code” in compliance with section 102.9. This

code applies to detached one-, two-, and three-family dwellings and structures

accessory to those dwellings only to the extent indicated in section 310 of this code.
Exceptions:

1. Detached one-, two-. or three- family dwellings, structures accessory to
those dwellings. one-, two-, and three-family dwellings used as models, or

those single family dwellings with five or fewer persons receiving care in

a supervised environment but capable of self-preservation with or without

limited verbal or physical assistance are within the scope of the “Residential
Code of Ohio for One-, Two-, or Three-Family Dwellings".

2. Buildings owned by and used for a function of the United States
govemment,

3. Buildings or structures which are incident to the use for agricultural purposes
of the land on which said buildings or structures are located. provided such
buildings or structures are not used in the business of retail trade: for the
purposes of this section, a building or structure is not considered used in the
business of retail trade if fifty per cent or more of the gross income received
from sales of products in the building or structure by the owner or operator
is from sales of products produced or raised in a normal crop year on farms
owned or operated by the seller (see sections 3781.06 and 3781.061 of the
Revised Code).

4. Apgricultural labor camps.

5. Type A or Type B family day-care homes, except for the inspection required
for licensure by the “Ohio Department of Jobs and Family Services
(ODIJFS)”. This required inspection is conducted by the certified building

department having jurisdiction or the division of industrial compliance and
labor in accordance with the inspection checklist found on the board of
building standard’s website.

6. Buildings or structures which are designed, constructed, and maintained in
accordance with federal standards and regulations and are used primarily

for federal and state military purposes where the U.S. secretary of defense.
pursuant to 10 U.S.C. Sections 18233(A)(1) and 18237, has acquired by

purchase. lease. or transfer. and constructs, expands, rehabilitates, or
corrects and equips, such buildings or structures as he determines to be
necessary toe carry out the purposes of Chapter 1803 of the U.S.C.




4101:1-1-01 3

7. Manufactured homes constructed under “24 CFR Part 3280.”

“Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards” and within the
scope of the rules adopted by the division of industrial compliance of the
department of commerce, including additions, alterations and all utility
connections from the utility service point to the manufactured home. This
exception does not apply to changes of occupancy of manufactured homes,

except that a manufactured home located within a manufactured home park
and used by the park operator to promote the sale/rental of manufactured

homes in that park remains exempt.

8. Sewerage systems, treatment works, and disposal systems (tanks, piping,
and process equipment associated with these systems) regulated by the
legislative authority of a municipal corporation or the governing board of a
county or special district owning or operating a publicly owned treatment
works or sewerage system as stated in division (A) of section 6111.032 of
the Revised Code, however, a building that houses such process equipment
is within the scope of this code.

9. Building sewer piping.

10. Amusement rides and portable electric generators and wiring supplying
carnival and amusement rides regulated by the Ohio Department of
Agriculture pursuant to Chapter 993. of the Revised Code.

11. Structures on_the premises of and directly related to the operation of a
generating plant defined as a major utility facility regulated by the power
siting board, including the structures associated with generation,
transmission, and distribution. As a condition of the power siting board’s
approval, the building department may be requested to review and inspect
these structures for compliance with the rules of the board of building
standards. However, the building department has no enforcement authority.

12. Buildings or structures used for equipment housings and enclosures,
telemetry enclosures, and associated tanks, foundations, platforms, process

piping and equipment on the premises of and directly associated with the
operation of pipelines regulated by federal or state agencies and used for the

gathering, transmission, or distribution of natural gas or other gas or liquid
hydrocarbons.

13. Public water systems (the tanks, foundations, piping. and process equipment

associated with these systems) regulated by the Ohio Environmental
Protection Agency in accordance with division {A) of section 6109.07 of
the Revised Code, however, a building that houses such process equipment
is within the scope of this code.

14. Private water systems (the tanks, foundations, piping, and process
equipment associated with these systems) regulated by the Ohio

Department of Health in accordance with section 3701.344 of the Revised




4101:1-1-01 4

Code, however, a building that houses such process equipment is within the
scope of this code.

15. Fixed or floating docks (including the electrical wiring, lighting, and fire
protection systems serving the docks) at marinas or boatyards. unless the

docks directly serve as a means of egress from, or an accessible route to, a
regulated building located at the marina or boatyard.

16. Floating buildings that have been issued a Hull Identification Number (HIN)
and a vessel registration from the Ohio department of natural resources

division of parks and watercraft.
17. Portable mobile vehicles which have been issued a Vehicle Identification

Number (VIN) by the United States department of transportation. The
vehicles have wheels and license plates and are intended for transportation
on_the public streets and highways. Examples of the exempt vehicles
include, but are not limited to, recreational vehicles, book mobiles, blood

mobiles. mobile medical imaging units, mobile concession trailers, network
television transmission and production trailers used at sporting events,
mobile restroom facilities, mobile pet grooming units, etc.

18. Wind turbines and solar arrays not connected to building services
equipment.

19. Pumps, site lighting, and flagpoles not connected to building services
equipment.

20. Mine elevator shafts and structures.

21. Unless otherwise required by this code, ground signs not over six feet in
height above the adjacent grade.

22. Signs erected by federal, state and local transportation authorities.

23. Oil or gas beam pumping units and derricks.

24. Bungee jumping and zip line structures, and miniature golf courses.

25. Retaining walls, bridges, walkways or site stairs unless associated with or
necessary for the building or the building egress to comply with the rules of
the board.

26. Primitive transient lodging structures with only provisions for sleeping, with
no building services equipment or piping, and not greater than 400 sq. ft. in
arca.

27. Intermodal shipping or freight containers, moving containers, storage
containers, if used exclusively as a storage container temporarily for a
period not to exceed 180 days.

28. Underground storage tanks regulated by the bureau of underground storage
tank regulations (BUSTR) of the state fire marshal.

29. Mobile computing units as defined in section 3781.06 of the Revised Code.

30. Industrialized units exempt from regulation in accordance with division
4101:10 of the Administrative Code.




4101:1-1-01 6

appurtenances. including ventilating, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and
refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other energy-related systems.

101.4.3 Plumbing. Chapters 4101:3-1 to 4101:3-15 of the Administrative
Code, designated as the “Ohio Plumbing Code™ or the “plumbing code.” apply
to the installation, alterations. repairs and replacement of plumbing systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and
where connected to a water or sewerage system and all aspects of a medical gas
system. The rules of the “Ohio Department of Health.” chapter 3701-29 of the
Administrative Code, govern for household sewage disposal systems, also
known as private sewage disposal systems.

101.4.4 Elevator. The provisions of the “Ohio Elevator Code” (Chapters
4101:5-1 to 4101:5-3 of the Administrative Code) apply to the design

construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of elevators and other lifting
devices as listed and defined therein.

101.4.5 Fire prevention. The provisions of the “Ohio Fire Code” (Chapters
1301:7-1 to 1301:7-7 of the Administrative Code), designated as the “fire

code.” apply to the preventive measures which provide for fire-safe conduct
such as fire drills and fire safety and evacuation plans and provides for fire-safe
operations in buildings such as good housekeeping practices for combustible
commodity storage; storage, handling, and use of flammable and combustible

solids, liquids and gases and other hazardous materials; and processes to reduce
the risk from the hazards of fire and explosion and includes the maintenance of
fire-detection, fire alarm, fire extinguishing equipment and systems, exit
facilities, opening_protectives, and other fire- safety devices ;and protection
features.

101.4.6 Boiler. The provisions of the “Ohio Boiler and Pressure Vessel Rules”
(Chapters 4101:4-1 to 4101:4-10 of the Administrative Code) apply to the
design, construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of boilers and unfired

pressure vessels as listed and defined therein.

Section 102
Applicability and Jurisdictional Authority

102.1 Conflicts. Where, in any specific case, different sections of this code specify

different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, the most
restrictive govern. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a

specific requirement, the specific requirement are applicable.




4101:1-1-01 7

102.2 Other laws. The provisions of this code are not to be deemed to nullify any

provisions of state or federal law. Municipal corporations may make further and
additional regulations. not in conflict with Chapters 3781. and 3791. of the Revised
Code or with the rules of the board of building standards. However, approval by
the board of building standards of any fixture, device, material, system, assembly
or product of a manufacturing process, or method or manner of construction or
installation constitute approval for their use anywhere in Ohio,

102.3 Other rules. As provided in division (B) of section 3781.11 of the Revised
Code, the rules of the board of building standards supersede and govern any order,

standard. or rule of the divisions of the fire marshal or industrial compliance in the
department of commerce, and the department of health and of counties and
townships, in all cases where such orders, standards or rules are in conflict with the
rules of the board of building standards. except that rules adopted and orders issued
by the fire marshal pursuant to Chapter 3743. of the Revised Code prevail in the
event of a conflict.

There may be other reguirements owners may be required to meet as set forth by

other licensing agencies such as the Ohio State Fire Marshal, Ohio Department of
Health, the Ohio Department of Jobs and Family Services, Ohio Department of

Mental Health and Addiction Services, Ohio Department of Developmental
Disabilities, federal agencies, or other licensing authorities. Owners and designers

should investigate these additional licensing agency requirements to_ensure they

are incorporated into the building design before submitting to the certified building
department for plan approval.

The rules of the board of building standards adopted pursuant to section 3781.10 of
the Revised Code govern any rule or standard adopted by the board pursuant to
sections 4104.02 and 4105.011 of the Revised Code.

102.4 Application of references. References to chapter or section numbers, or to

provisions not specifically identified by number, are to be construed to refer to such
chapter, section or provision of this code, inclusively.

102.5 Referenced codes and standards. When a reference is made within the
building, mechanical, or plumbing codes to a federal statutory provision, an
industry consensus standard, or any other technical publication, the specific date
and title of the publication as well as the name and address of the promulgating
agency are listed in Chapter 35 of the building code, Chapter 15 of the mechanical
code, or Chapter 15 of the plumbing code.




4101:1-1-01 8

The codes and standards referenced in the building, mechanical, and plumbing

codes are considered part of the requirements of these codes as though the text were
printed in this code, to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where

differences occur between provisions of these codes and the referenced standards,
the provisions of these codes apply.

102.6 Partial invalidity. In the event any part or provision of this code is held to

be illegal or void, this does not have the effect of making void or illegal any of the
other parts or provisions thereof, and it is to be presumed that this code would have

been adopted without such illegal or invalid parts or provisions.

102.7 Existing structures. The provisions of the International Existing Building
Code as modified by Chapter 34 of this code control the alteration, repair, addition,

maintenance, relocation, and change of occupancy of any existing structure. The

occupancy of any structure currently existing on the date of adoption of this code
shall be permitted to continue without change provided there are no orders of the

building official pending, no evidence of fraud, or no serious safety or sanitation
hazard.

102.8 Temporary structures. The building official is authorized to issue approvals
for temporary structures. Such approvals are to be in the form of a “Certificate of
Occupancy for a Temporary Building” in accordance with section 111.1.6. This

section does not apply to time-limited occupancies in existing structures. See
section 111.1.5 for time-limited occupancies.

102.8.1 Conformance. Temporary structures are to conform to the structural
strength, fire safety, means of egress, accessibility, light, ventilation and
sanitary requirements of this code only to the extent necessary to ensure the
public health, safety and general welfare. Temporary tents and membrane
structures are to also comply with the applicable provisions in section 3103,

102.8.2 Termination of approval. The building official is_authorized to
terminate approval for a temporary structure and to order the temporary
structure to be discontinued if conditions of the approval have been violated or
the structure or occupancy poses an immediate hazard to the public or occupants
of the structure.

102.9 Non-required work. Any component, building element. equipment, system

or portion thereof not required by this code are to be permitted to be installed as a
partial or complete system provided that it is constructed or installed in accordance

with this code to the extent of the installation.




4101:1

-1-01 9

102.10 Work exempt from approval. Approval is not required for the following

work: however, this work is still to comply with all applicable provisions of the

rules of the board:

Building:

1.

6.
7

8.
9
1

11.
12,

13.
14.
15.
16.

One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
plavhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed one

hundred twenty square feet (11.15 m?) and playground structures.
Fences not over seven feet (1829 mm) high.

. Retaining walls which are not over four feet (1219 mm) in height measured

from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a

surcharge or impounding Class [, II or III-A liquids.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed
five thousand gallons (18 927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width
does not exceed two to one.

Sidewalks, parking lots and driveways not more than thirty inches (762 mm)
above grade and not over any basement or story below and which are not

part of an accessible route.
Finishes not regulated by this code, decorating, or other work defined as
maintenance or minor repair.

. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R-3.

. Tents and membrane structures exempted in section 3103.1.3.
0.

Above-ground storage tanks as defined in rule 4101:1-2-01 of the
Administrative Code and the associated tank foundations.

Battery operated smoke or carbon monoxide alarms installed in existing
buildings where no construction is taking place.

Crypts. mausoleums, and columbaria structures not exceeding 1500 square
feet if the building or structure is not for occupancy and used solely for the
interment of human or animal remains.

Signs painted directly on building surfaces.

Temporary yard signs.
Signs not more than 2.5 ft.? in area (0.23m?).

Signs required in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 11.

17. Signs undergoing minor repairs in accordance with section 102.10.2.

18.

Temporary or time-limited occupancy of a building used or constructed to

respond to conditions directly connected to an emergency declaration issued

by the governor or federal government.

Electrical:



4101:1-1-01 10

1. Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection of

approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed

receptacles.
Electrical equipment used for radio and television transmissions except

equipment and wiring for power supply, and the installations of towers and
antennas.

3. The installation of any temporary system required for the testing or

servicing of electrical equipment or apparatus.
Electrical wiring, devices. appliances, apparatus or equipment operating at

less than twenty-five volts and not capable of supplying more than fi

watts of energy, unless specifically addressed in this code.

Process equipment and the associated wiring on the load side of the power
disconnect to the equipment.

6. Electrical wiring equipment not connected to building services equipment

in and adjacent to natural or artificially made bodies of water as defined in
Article 682 of NFPA 70 as referenced in Chapter 35.

L

o

=

Gas:
1. Portable heating appliances;

2. Replacement of any part that does not alter approval of equipment or make
such equipment unsafe.

3. Gas distribution piping owned and maintained by public or municipal
utilities and located upstream of the point of delivery.

4. Process equipment, including the associated tanks, foundations, and process

piping. For combination building services/process or power piping
systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control
valve which separates the process from the building services piping is

exempt from approval.
5. When installed by the servicing gas supplier, replacement of existing LP-gas

containers by servicing gas supplier of the same capacity in the same
location and associated regulators.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliances;

2. Portable ventilation equipment;

3. Portable cooling units:

4. Replacement of any part of an appliance which does not alter its approval or

make it unsafe;

5. Portable evaporative cooler;

6. Process equipment including the associated tanks, foundations, and process
piping. For combination building services/process or power piping




4101:1-1-01 11

systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control
valve which separates the process from the building services piping is

exempt from approval.
7. Heating and cooling distribution piping installed and maintained by public

or municipal utilities.

8. Self-contained refrigeration system containing ten pounds (4.54 kg) or less
of refrigerant and actuated by motors of one horsepower {0.75 kW) or less.

Plumbing:
1. The repair of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided,

however, that if any concealed trap. drain-pipe. water. soil. waste or vent
pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the
same with new material, such work is to be considered as new work and an
approval is to be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearance of stoppages or the repair of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures,
and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repaits

do not involve the replacement of more than one fixture or rearrangement
of valves, pipes or fixtures.

3. Process equipment including the associated tanks. foundations, and process
piping. For combination building services/process or power piping
systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control

valve which separates the process from the building services piping is
exempt from approval,

102.10.1 Emergency repairs. Where equipment replacements and repairs must
be performed in an emergency situation, an application for approval is to be

submitted within the next working business day to the building official.

102.10.2 Minor repairs. Minor repairs to structures may be made without
application or notice to the building official. Such repairs are not to include the

cutting away of any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of
any structural beam or load bearing support. or the removal or change of any
required means of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the

egress requirements; nor do minor repairs include addition to, alteration of,
replacement or relocation of any standpipe, water supply. sewer, drainage, drain

leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric wiring or mechanical or
other work affecting public health or general safety.

102.11 Building department jurisdictional limitations. A municipal, township.
or county building department that has been certified by the board of building

standards. pursuant to rule 4101:7-2-01 of the Administrative Code, has jurisdiction




CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Director Chief Building Official

Jack Bradley
Mayor

RESIDENTIAL ZONING REVIEW

December 30, 2025

Kathleen Wise
4325 Liberty Ave
Vermilion, OH 44089

Re: Fence permit application PPN 0201003111052 — Delaware Ave
Subject plans were reviewed for conformance with the 2021 Lorain Codified Ordinance
4-21, Zoning Code. The permit application for a fence is DENIED. A fence is an accessory use

to a principal use and building. PPN 0201003111052 is currently vacant and does not have a
principal building or use.

RESIDENTIAL REVIEW COMMENTS:

- Accessory Use- A use customarily incidental and subordinate to the principal use or
building and located on the same lot as the principal use or building. (1191.01 A-B)
https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378

You have the You have the Right to Appeal this decision within 20 days from the date of this
notice per Chapter 1175.01(a) of the Lorain Codified Ordinances.

Respectfully,

A~

Evelisse Atkinson

Planning & Zoning Administrator

City of Lorain — Building Housing & Planning
440-204-2306 // Evelisse_Atkinson@cityoflorain.org

200 West Erie Avenue, 5 Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Cityoflorain.org


https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378

Jack W. Bradley ~ Direcor
Mayor

CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matt Kusznir David Faciana
Chief Building Official

NOTICE OF VIOLATION

To: Kathleen Wise

Parcel No.: 02-01-003-111-052

Property Address / Description: Vacant lot — Delaware Avenue
Re: Unpermitted use and structures on residential lot

Dear Kathleen Wise:

This letter constitutes formal notice that the City of Lorain (“City”) has observed and
documented violations of the City’s zoning, building, and property maintenance codes on the
above-referenced parcel. The parcel is within a residential zoning district and under the
jurisdiction of the City’s Building, Housing & Planning Department.

Observed violations include, but are not limited to:

1.

2.

Use of the lot for habitation or temporary living accommodations (e.g., tents) on an
undeveloped residential parcel without permit or authorization.

Installation of fencing without a proper permit, and/or in violation of the City’s fence
provisions (for example, see the Residential Fence Permit application instructions). (
Construction of an accessory structure (shed or similar) without required building permit
or zoning approval, in violation of the City’s building code requirement for permitting.
Storage of a recreational vehicle (RV) on the residential lot in a manner inconsistent with
the City’s zoning and property maintenance regulations.

Use of the property in a manner inconsistent with its zoning classification and the general
prohibition against living on a vacant lot without proper development, permit, or
occupancy certificate under the City’s Zoning Code. See the City’s Planning & Zoning
Code, Part Eleven.

Maintenance, occupancy, or structure-erection on the property that may constitute a
violation of the property maintenance code adopted by the City.

Applicable Code Sections:

Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Part Eleven — Planning & Zoning Code,
Chapter 1121 (Zoning Districts and Map) and Chapter 1141 (General Provisions) set
forth zoning classification, permitted uses, accessory uses, and enforcement procedures.
Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Part Fifteen — Building Code, including
Chapter 1503 (Ohio Building Code adoption) and Chapter 1509 (Property Maintenance
Code) govern the permitting and structural requirements and occupancy standards.

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lerain, Ohio 44052

Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080

Cityoflorain.org



CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matt Kusznir David Faciana
Chief Building Official

Jack W. Bradley ~ Director
Mayor
¢ Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Chapter 557 — Weeds/High Grass addresses
property maintenance and abatement of nuisances such as overgrown vegetation, though
some conditions may relate to maintenance of vacant lots.
+ The City’s Fence Permit document: “Residential maximum 6 ft height, no barbed wire,
neighbor consent if on property line”.

Required Corrective Action:
You are hereby instructed to take the following corrective measures on or before [insert
compliance date, e.g., 14 days from the date of this notice]:

1. Immediately cease any living, residing, or overnight occupancy on the vacant lot unless
properly permitted and developed.

2. Apply for any required permits or remove unpermitted structures (sheds, tents, etc.). If
removal, ensure complete removal of debris and restoration of the lot to a condition
consistent with the zoning and property maintenance requirements.

3. Remove or relocate the recreational vehicle from the lot so that its storage or operations
comply with City ordinances.

4, Submit for and obtain a fence permit (if desired) or remove any fence erected without
proper permit/approval (or otherwise bring into compliance with the City’s fence
regulations).

5. Maintain the property in compliance with all applicable property maintenance and zoning
regulations, including removal of any debris, unauthorized materials, and resolving any
health/safety hazards.

Consequences of Non-Compliance:

If the directed corrective actions are not taken by the compliance date above, the City may
initiate enforcement action, which may include fines, liens, stop-work orders, condemnation of
unsafe structures, abatement at the owner’s expense, and/or referral to the municipal court. The
owner may also be required to pay all costs incurred by the City in enforcement and abatement.

We appreciate your prompt attention to this matter. Ensuring compliance helps protect
neighborhood health, welfare, safety, and the character of our residential districts.

Andreg M. Arochlo

Housing Inspector

City of Lorain

200 West Erie Ave — 5" Floor
{440) 204 — 2301 - Office

{440} 752 — 6497 - Cell

Andres Arochodcityoflorain.org

200 West Erie Avenue, 5 Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Cityoflorain.org



..f ¥ .m__.,,m.
Fio
e .U.M..V

s

Qw# 8407} -
O Ul |
h@m
& Eam_@
m_,{ o .




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5.d.
Meeting Date: ~ 01/07/2026

Subject:

B.A. 04-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, an appeal regarding the plan
review denial for a shed at PPN 02-01-003-111-052. Section 1175.01(a) Decisions- Appeals. Kathleen M. Wise,
applicant.

Attachments
BA 4-2026
BA 4-2026 Plan Review




CITY OF LORAIN

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Jk Bradley Oq ’ ’I/OZV
Mayor
WRITTEN NOTICE OF APPEAL

02-01-60 7-//1-052.
Address of Property, 2PN0201063++1626—

Date of Appeal; 12/10/2025

Name: Kathleen M. Wise

Address: 4325 Liberty Ave.

City: Vermilion State:OH _ Zip: 44089 phone Number: 440-687-4829

Please describe in detail the reason for your appeal:
| am appealing two denials, one for the, Fence and the other the, Shed. Dated November 21st, 2025.

As current zoning of R2, Section 3.01 Zone Districts Established, along with but not limited too,

Section 4.01 District Purpose., see attachments, along with but not limited too,

Table 4-2, Schedule of Use, Residential Districts , R2 tansional residential properties are lawfully

zoned, for conditional use of dwelling units, in my case condional primative residential use for myself

only, and primary use of properly for community garden , to improve the neighborhood by providing

a safe and beautiful space in which to nurchure unity among residents in a common goal of

a sustainable life and way of living, that will bring the comunity closer and tigher in bond so that
encouraging a deeper sence of pride not only in there own neighborhoods but in that of also their
surrounding neighborhoods, thus improving blight and improving the value of the surrounding remainder of

homes already erected.
Thus falling with in the lawful right estabilshed by code, of use of acessory uses and structures as
the permitted primary principle use of the land making the shed and fence permitted accessory siructures.

¢ Please return the completed Notice of Appeal form, along with any supplemental
materials or documentation to:

Building, Housing, & Planning, 200 W. Erie Ave., 5% Floor, Lorain, OH 44052

¢ Filing Fee (due at the time of submission} = $100

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org


Evelisse Atkinson
Highlight


Current zoning of PPN 0201003111020 Delaware Ave., Lorain, OH 44052, of R2 tanstional
residential, or transtioning from a primarily residential single family neighborhood to a
permanet parcel for non-residential neighborhood uses. Allowing uses that are compatible
and traditional to single family neighborhoods, such as fences that protect property from
tresspass , vandolism and other crimes, and are traditionally consistant in all neighborhoods,
including R2., along with sheds and gardens (non-residential uses)(Sec 4.01 District purpose,

Lorain Zoning Code.).

Where attached and detached structures and uses are permitted, such as sheds, fences, and
gardens and are compatiable, consistant , and traditional to the city neighborhoods walkable
characeteristics and permitted by current zoning of PPN 0201003111020, R2 transitional

residential. (Sec 4.01 (D)(R2) District Purpose). specifically.

Furthur -more Sec. 4.02 Schedule of allowed uses, of the Lorain Zoning code, states.
The land on PPN 0201003111020, has permited uses of Accessory uses, accessory structures to
the those uses, such as sheds,fences and gardens, and accessory dwelling units. Sec. 21.01 of

the Lorain Zoning Code states, an accessory use is incidental to and subordinate to the

principle use of the land /PPN, or building. (not only a principle building.).

Thus per section 4.01({D)(R-2), Section 4.02(A), Table 4-2, and Sec. 21.01 (A-B), of the Lorain
Zoning Code, the current zoning already allows these uses of PPN 0201003111020. These
uses are consistant and traditional to the walkable character of these traditionally single

family neighborhoods, now transitioning to non-residential neighborhoods, which have



always included sheds, fences, gardens, and other traditoinal neighborhood uses and

structures, but not limited to.

As PPN 0201003111020, has a current zoning of R-2 transitional residential use and purposes,
detached dwellings, buildings , and or structures consistant with the walkable neighborhood
character, which again include fences, sheds, gardens, etc., but not limited to and are well
suited as a buffer and are normally part of these neighborhoods chracteristics, and buffers
this transitioning time to the PPN's final stage from normally a single family neighborhood to

non-residential neighborhood uses and purposes. (Sec. 21.01 A-B, Definitions})

Furthure more also backed by the 2024 Ohio Building Code, Sec. 101.2 Scope, specifically
sections (1 ){(26), along with 102.9 non required work, 102,10 work exempted from approval
(or permit not needed), building (1)(2)(5), allow these accessory uses and structures per

board of building codes standards.



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 3 ZONE DISTRICTS AND MAP

Section 3.01 Zone Districts Established
The following zone districts are established:

Table 3-1, Zone Districts Established

Category Designation District Name
R-1A Low Density Single Family
R-1B Moderate Density Single Family
R-1C Medium Density Single Family
Residential Districts R-2 Transitional Residential
R-3 High Density Residential
R4 Manufactured Home
Residential
B-1 Neighborhood Commercial
Commercial Districts B-2 General Commetrcial
B-3 Downtown Commercial
o -1 Light Industrial
Industrial Districts 12 Heavy Industrial
HMD Hospital/Med Center
MU Mixed Use
Special Purpose Districts PUD Planned Unit Development
0s Open Space
DR-O Design Review Overlay

Section 3.02 Official Zoning Map

A. The official zoning map shall be identified by the signature of the mayor and attested by the clerk of
council, shall show the date of adoption of this zoning ordinance, and shall be further defined as
being the zoning districts as shown on the set of Lorain County Tax Maps maintained by the city
building department.

B. If, in accordance with the provisions of this zoning ordinance and Ohio R.C. Chapter 713, changes
are made in district boundaries or other matters portrayed on this zoning map, such changes shall
be duly-noted on the zoning map no later than seven (7) days after the effective date of the
amendment. No changes shall be made in the zoning map except in conformity with the
amendment procedures set forth in this ordinance.

C. Regardless of the existence of copies of the zoning map, the official zoning map bearing the original
signature of the mayor shall be recognized as the official map as to current zoning status.

D. In the event that the official zoning map becomes damaged, destroyed, or difficult to interpret
because of changes, council may, by resolution, adopt a new zoning map which shall supersede the
prior map. The new map may correct drafting or other errors or omissions, but no such correction
shall have the effect of amending the zoning ordinance.

Page/3-4 Zoning Districts and Map



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 4 RESIDENTIAL ZONING DISTRICTS

Section 4.01 District Purpose.

A. R-1A, Low Density Single-Family. This district is intended to create a single-family neighborhood
environment on relatively large lots, while retaining the urban character of the community. It is
most appropriate near the outer perimeter of the city, especially the west end. Net densities of just
over two (2) units per acre can be achieved.

B. R-1B, Moderate Density Single-Family. This is an urban residential district intended to create
cohesive, single family, walkable neighborhoods at a net density of approximately four (4} units per
acre. The principal use of land is for single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious, and
educational facilities needed to provide the basic elements of a balanced, safe, and attractive living
environment.

C. R-1C, Medium Density Single-Family. This residential district is intended to reinforce the traditional
single-family neighborhood pattern prevalent throughout much of the city. It supports cohesive,
walkable neighborhoods along a grid street network at a net density of approximately six (6) units
per acre. The principal use of land is for single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious,
and educational facilities contributing to a rich neighborhood fabric.

D. R-2, Transitional Residential. A variety of housing options are permitted within this district
consistent with the walkable, neighborhood character intended for single-family neighborhoods.
Attached and detached dwellings are permitted at densities compatible with traditional city
neighborhoods and well suited as a buffer to transition from single-family neighborhoods to non-
residential uses.

E. R-3, High Density Residential. This district provides for development of a range of housing types,
including multiple-family units at densities up to 18 units per acre, in order to accommodate open
space and recreational amenities within each development. Consistent with the city’s
comprehensive plan, the district provides for housing choice in the community where increased
density would be compatible with existing development and promote economically viable
development on infill and redevelopment sites. The district may also be established as a transition
zone between lower density residential districts and nonresidential or mixed use districts.

F. RM, Manufactured Home Community. This district provides for a single family residential
environment within planned communities to accommeodate manufactured homes. The principal use
of land is for manufactured single-family dwellings and related recreational, religious, and
educational facilities needed to provide the basic elements of a balanced, safe, and attractive
residential area.

Section 4.02 Schedule of Allowed Uses.

Buildings or land shall not be used and buildings shall not be erected, except for the following specified
uses, unless otherwise provided for in this ordinance. Land and/or buildings in the districts indicated at
the top of Table 4-2 may be used for the purposes denoted by the following abbreviations:

A. Permitted Use {P). Land and/or buildings with this designation may be used for these purposes by
right.

Page/4-6 Residential Zoning Districts



City of Lorain Zoning Code

B. Conditional Use {€). Land and/or buildings with this designation may be used for these purposes if
conditional approval is granted by the planning commission upon a finding that all applicable
requirements in Chapter 11 are satisfied.

€. Specific Conditions. Indicates that conditions related to the specific use must be satisfied in addition
to the review procedures and general criteria of Sections 11.02 and 11.03.

Table 4-2, Schedule of Use, Residential Districts

Uses

Residential Districts
R-1A | R1B [R1C [R2

| R-3

Residential

Assisted living facility

C

P

| Bed and breakfast
Boarding house

T

C

Dwelling, manufactured home
Dwelling, multiple family

v

Dwelling, single-family attached

Dwelling, single-family detached

-

Dwelling, two-family

'?amily home

Group home

Manufactured home
| community/subdivision
Nursing home and extended care

Residential social services facility

Retirement community

Sober living facility

(g lh-Rigli-i

Recreation and Leisure

Adult day care

Child care facilities

Private noncommercial recreation

Public parks/playgrounds

U V(OO

VO O|O

-1-Aialla)

- dh-Siglia

| Public/Quasi-Public

Cemeteries

Government buildings and facilities

Places of worship

Pre-school nursery

Schools (K-12)

(2 lalizlizls]

[(zllalizllzls]

nionnle

ololalolo

[zllallalisliz!

Accessory Uses

Accessory dwelling units

[}

()

[}

Accessory uses and structures

h-

Cafeteria facilities located within a
principal use {not including dwelling
units}

Child care facilities located within a
_principal use

Home occupations

accessory to a principal use

Single-user solar energy system as

I?]

(o]

Page/4-7

Specific Conditions

See Section 11.048
See Section 11.06C

See Section 11.06F

See Section 11.06G

| See Section 11.05A

See Section 11.058

See Section 11.06A

Residential Zoning Districts



City of Lorain Zoning Code

CHAPTER 21 DEFINITIONS

Section21.01  Definitions A-B

ACCESSORY BUILDING. A subordinate building detached from, but located on the same lot as, the
principal building, the use of which is incidental and accessory to that of the principal building or use. A
storage container, trailer, or similar item is not an accessory building.

ACCESSORY USE. A use customarily incidental and subordinate to the principal use or building and
located on the same lot as the principal use or building.

ALLEY. A public thoroughfare or way, not more than 30 feet in width except for necessary turnarounds,
and which normally provides a secondary means of access to abutting property.

ALTERATION: Any change to any land, structure or building.

ALTERATION, BUILDING: Any change in the use of a building or any physical alteration made which
modifies the existing foundation, load bearing walls or roof of a building; or requires an electrical,
plumbing or mechanical permit.

ANIMAL HOSPITAL. An enclosed structure allowing for overnight or continuous care, diagnosis, and
treatment of animal illnesses by a veterinarian,

BAR: Any place devoted primarily to the retailing and
drinking of malt, vinous, or other alcoholic beverages, or /\
which derives at least 75 percent of its total annual gross

sales from the sale of such beverages for consumption on
the premises.

BASEMENT: That portion of a building all or partly
underground but having at least one-half {1/2) of its

height below the average level of the adjoining ground. o 22,
BED AND BREAKFAST: An owner-occupied private single- véalt P‘ P I e
family residence which is the principal residence of the ; g
owner and the principal structure on the premises, with L
bedrooms available for rent to the general public and

with breakfast served at no additional cost. Basement = A < B

BOARDING HOUSE. A dwelling or part thereof, other than a hotel or motel, providing rooms for
compensation for three (3) or more unrelated persons who may reside for extended periods. Cooking
facilities are not provided in the individual units. Accessory uses may include dining rooms and
recreation rooms for use by the occupants, but not for the general public.

BUFFER: Any visual buffer, screening, open spaces, landscaped areas, fences, walls, berms, or any
combination thereof required by this ordinance used to physically separate or screen one use of
property from another so as to visually shield or physically block noise, lights, or other nuisances.
BUILDING: Any structure, either temporary or permanent, having walls and a roof, designed for the
shelter of any person, animal or property and occupying more than 100 square feet of area. .

Page / 21 - 153 Definitions



ACTION: Final

DATE: 08/11/2023 1:21 PM

4101:1-1-01

Administration.

Section 101

101.1 Incorporation by reference, title and rules of construction. Except as

provided in Chapters 4101:1-1 to 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code, the
International Building Code 2021 edition, Chapters 2 through 35 and appendix H,

as published by the “International Code Council, Inc.” including all subsequently
published errata and printings. and readily available at https://www.iccsafe.org, are
hereby incorporated by reference in accordance with sections 121.71 to 121.74 of

the Revised Code as if set out at length herein,

101.1.1 Rules of construction. The following rules of construction are to be
applied to Chapters 4101:1-1 to 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code:

1. All references to the International Building Code, International Mechanical
Code, International Plumbing Code, and International Residential Code mean
the Ohio Building Code, Ohio Mechanical Code, Ohio Plumbing Code. and
Residential Code of Ohio, respectively. unless otherwise noted. References to
“this code” in Chapters 4101:1-1t0 4101:1-35 of the Administrative Code mean
the “Ohio Building Code.” References to “building code” in divisions 4101:1,
4101:2, 4101:3 and 4101:8 of the Administrative Code mean “Ohio Building
Code.”

2. The phrase "applicable energy conservation code referenced in Chapter 13"
is substituted for "International Energy Conservation Code."

3. Except as otherwise noted and in Chapter 34 of this code, “Chapter 34” is
substituted for “International Existing Building Code.”

4, The terms ‘“approval” or “approvals” are substituted for ‘“permit” or
“permits,” respectively, when referring to documentation indicating
compliance with this code.

5. The phrase “owner’s representative” is substituted for “owner’s authorized
agent.”

6. Except as otherwise noted, “building official” is substituted for “fire code
official.”

7. The phrase “building official” is substituted for “code official.”

8. The provisions of this code are mandatory whether or not the term “shall” is
used.

101.2 Scope. The provisions of the “Ohio Building Code,” the “Ohio Mechanical
Code,” and the “Ohio Plumbing Code™ apply to the construction, alteration,

movement, enlargement, replacement. repair, equipment, use and occupancy,

location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every building or structure or any

prim date; 087112023 1254 PM



4101:1-1-01 2

appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures. As provided
in division (B) of section 3791.04 of the Revised Code, no plans or specifications

are to be approved or inspection approval given unless the building represented by

those plans or specifications would, if constructed. repaired, erected, or equipped
according to those plans or specifications, comply with Chapters 3781. and 3791.
of the Revised Code and any ruies adopted by the board. An owner may exceed the
requirements of the “Qhio Building Code” in compliance with section 102.9. This
code applies to detached one-, two-, and three-family dwellings and structures
accessory to those dwellings only to the extent indicated in section 310 of this code.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one-. two-, or three- family dwellings, structures accessory to
those dwellings, one-, two-, and three-family dwellings used as models. or
those single family dwellings with five or fewer persons receiving care in
a supervised environment but capable of self-preservation with or without
limited verbal or physical assistance are within the scope of the “Residential
Code of Ohio for One-, Two-. or Three-Family Dwellings".

2. Buildings owned by and used for a function of the United States
government.

3. Buildings or structures which are incident to the use for agricultural purposes
of the land on which said buildings or structures are located. provided such
buildings or structures are not used in the business of retail trade; for the
purposes of this section. a building or structure is not considered used in the
business of retail trade if fi er cent or more of the gross income received

from sales of products in the building or structure by the owner or operator

is from sales of products produced or raised in a normal crop vear on farms
owned or operated by the seller (see sections 3781.06 and 3781.061 of the

Revised Code).

4. Agricultural labor camps.

5. Type A or Type B family day-care homes, except for the inspection required
for licensure by the “Ohio Department of Jobs and Family Services
{ODJESY”. This required inspection is conducted by the certified building
department having jurisdiction or the division of industrial compliance and

labor in accordance with the inspection checklist found on the board of
building standard’s website.

6. Buildings or structures which are designed, constructed, and maintained in
accordance with federal standards and regulations and are used primarily
for federal and state military purposes where the U.S. secretary of defense,
pursuant to 10 U.S.C. Sections 18233(A)(1) and 18237, has acquired by
purchase, lease, or transfer, and constructs, expands, rehabilitates, or

corrects and equips, such buildings or structures as he determines to be
necessary to carry out the purposes of Chapter 1803 of the U.S.C.




4101:1-1-01 3

7. Manufactured homes constructed under “24 CFR Part 3280.”

“Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards™ and within the
scope of the rules adopted by the division of industrial compliance of the
department of commerce, including additions, alterations and all utility
connections from the utility service point to the manufactured home. This

exception does not apply to changes of occupancy of manufactured homes,
except that a manufactured home located within a manufactured home park

and used by the park operator to promote the sale/rental of manufactured

homes in that park remains exempt.
8. Sewerage systems, treatment works, and disposal systems (tanks. piping,
and process equipment associated with these systems) regulated by the

legislative authority of a municipal corporation or the governing board of a
county or special district owning or operating a publicly owned treatment

works or sewerage system as stated in division (A} of section 6111.032 of
the Revised Code, however, a building that houses such process equipment
is within the scope of this code.

9. Building sewer piping.

10. Amusement rides and portable electric generators and wiring supplying
carnival and amusement rides regulated by the Ohio Department of

Agriculture pursuant to Chapter 993. of the Revised Code.

11. Structures on the premises of and directly related to the operation of a
generating plant defined as a major utility facility regulated by the power
siting board, including the structures associated with generation,
transmission, and distribution. As a condition_of the power siting board’s
approval, the building department may be requested to review and inspect
these structures for compliance with the rules of the board of building
standards. However, the building department has no enforcement authority.

12. Buildings or structures used for equipment housings and enclosures,
telemetry enclosures, and associated tanks, foundations, platforms, process

piping and equipment on the premises of and directly associated with the
operation of pipelines regulated by federal or state agencies and used for the
gathering, transmission, or distribution of natural gas or other gas or liquid

hydrocarbons.
13. Public water systems (the tanks, foundations, piping, and process equipment

associated with these systems) regulated by the Ohio Environmental
Protection Agency in accordance with division (A) of section 6109.07 of

the Revised Code. however, a building that houses such process equipment

is within the scope of this code.
14, Private water systems (the tanks, foundations, piping, and process

equipment associated with these systems) regulated by the Ohio
Department of Health in accordance with section 3701.344 of the Revised




4101:1-1-01 4

Code, however, a building that houses such process equipment is within the
scope of this code.

15. Fixed or floating docks (including the electrical wiring, lighting. and fire
protection systems serving the docks) at marinas or boatyards. unless the
docks directly serve as a means of egress from, or an accessible route to. a
regulated building located at the marina or boatyard.

16. Floating buildings that have been issued a Hull Identification Number (HIN})
and a vessel registration from the Ohio department of natural resources

division of parks and watercraft.
17. Portable mobile vehicles which have been issued a Vehicle Identification
Number (VIN) by the United States department of transportation. The

vehicles have wheels and license plates and are intended for transportation
on the public streets and highways. Examples of the exempt vehicles

include, but are not limited to. recreational vehicles, book mobiles, blood
mobiles. mobile medical imaging units, mobile concession trailers, network
television transmission and production trailers used at sporting events,
mobile restroom facilities, mobile pet grooming units, etc.

18. Wind turbines and solar arrays not connected to building services
equipment.

19. Pumps, site lighting, and flagpoles not connected to building services

equipment.
20. Mine elevator shafts and structures.

21, Unless otherwise required by this code, ground signs not over six feet in
height above the adjacent grade.

22. Signs erected by federal, state and local transportation authorities.

23. Oil or gas beam pumping units and derricks.

24. Bungee jumping and zip line structures, and miniature golf courses.

25. Retaining walls, bridges, walkways or site stairs uniess associated with or
necessary for the building or the building egress to comply with the rules of
the board.

26. Primitive transient lodging structures with only provisions for sleeping, with
no building services equipment or piping, and not greater than 400 sq. ft. in
arca.

27. Intermodal shipping or freight containers, moving containers, storage

containers, if used exclusively as a storage container temporarily for a
period not to exceed 180 days.

28. Underground storage tanks regulated by the bureau of underground storage
tank regulations (BUSTR) of the state fire marshal.
29. Mobile computing units as defined in section 3781.06 of the Revised Code.

30. Industrialized units exempt from regulation in accordance with division
4101:10 of the Administrative Code.




4101:1-1-01 6

appurtenances, including ventilating, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and
refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other energy-related systems.

101.4.3 Plumbing. Chapters 4101:3-1 to 4101:3-15 of the Administrative

Code, designated as the “Ohio Plumbing Code” or the “plumbing code.” apply
to the installation, alterations. repairs and replacement of plumbing systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and
where connected to a water or sewerage system and all aspects of a medical gas

system. The rules of the “Ohio Department of Health,” chapter 3701-29 of the
Administrative Code, govern for household sewage disposal systems. also

known as private sewage disposal systems.

101.4.4 FElevator. The provisions of the “Ohio Elevator Code” (Chapters
4101:5-1 to 4101:5-3 of the Administrative Code) apply to the design,

construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of elevators and other lifting
devices as listed and defined therein.

101.4.5 Fire prevention. The provisions of the “Ohio Fire Code” (Chapters
1301:7-1 to 1301:7-7 of the Administrative Code), designated as the “fire

code,” apply to the preventive measures which provide for fire-safe conduct

such as fire drills and fire safety and evacuation plans and provides for fire-safe
operations in buildings such as good housekeeping practices for combustible
commodity storage; storage. handling. and use of flammable and combustible

solids, liquids and gases and other hazardous materials; and processes to reduce
the risk from the hazards of fire and explosion and includes the maintenance of

fire-detection, fire alarm, fire extinguishing equipment and systems, exit
facilities, opening protectives, and other fire- safety devices ;and protection
features.

101.4.6 Boiler. The provisions of the “Ohio Boiler and Pressure Vessel Rules”
(Chapters 4101:4-1 to 4101:4-10 of the Administrative Code) apply to the

design, construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of boilers and unfired
pressure vessels as listed and defined therein.

Section 102
Applicability and Jurisdictional Authority

102.1 Conflicts. Where. in any specific case, different sections of this code specify
different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, the most

restrictive govern. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a

specific requirement. the specific requirement are applicable.




4101:1-1-01 7

102.2 Other laws. The provisions of this code are not to be deemed to nulli

provisions of state or federal law. Municipal corporations may make further and
additional regulations. not in conflict with Chapters 3781. and 3791. of the Revised
Code or with the rules of the board of building standards. However, approval by

the board of building standards of any fixture, device, material, system, assembly

or product of a manufacturing process, or method or manner of construction or
installation constitute approval for their use anywhere in Ohio.

102.3 Other rules. As provided in division (B) of section 3781.11 of the Revised

Code, the rules of the board of building standards supersede and govern any order,
standard, or rule of the divisions of the fire marshal or industrial compliance in the
department of commerce, and the department of health and of counties and

townships. in all cases where such orders. standards or rules are in conflict with the
rules of the board of building standards, except that rules adopted and orders issued

by the fire marshal pursuant to Chapter 3743. of the Revised Code prevail in the
event of a conflict.

There may be other requirements owners may be required to meet as set forth by
other licensing agencies such as the Ohio State Fire Marshal, Ohio Department of

Health, the Ohio Department of Jobs and Family Services, Ohio Department of
Mental Health and Addiction Services, Ohio Department of Developmental

Disabilities, federal agencies, or other licensing authorities. Owners and designers
should investigate these additional licensing agency requirements to ensure they
are incorporated into the building design before submitting to the certified building
department for plan approval.

The rules of the board of building standards adopted pursuant to section 3781.10 of
the Revised Code govern any rule or standard adopted by the board pursuant to
sections 4104.02 and 4105.011 of the Revised Code.

102.4 Application of references. References to chapter or section numbers, or to

provisions not specifically identified by number. are to be construed to refer to such
chapter, section or provision of this code, inclusively.

102.5 Referenced codes and standards. When a reference is made within the
building. mechanical, or plumbing codes to a federal statutory provision. an
industry consensus standard. or any other technical publication, the specific date

and title of the publication as well as the name and address of the promulgating

agency are listed in Chapter 35 of the building code, Chapter 15 of the mechanical
code, or Chapter 15 of the plumbing code.




4101:1-1-01 8

The codes and standards referenced in the building, mechanical, and plumbing
codes are considered part of the requirements of these codes as though the text were
printed in this code, to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between provisions of these codes and the referenced standards,
the provisions of these codes apply.

102.6 Partial invalidity. In the event any part or provision of this code is held to
be illegal or void, this does not have the effect of making void or illegal any of the

other parts or provisions thereof, and it is to be presumed that this code would have
been adopted without such illegal or invalid parts or provisions.

102.7 Existing structures. The provisions of the International Existing Building
Code as modified by Chapter 34 of this code control the alteration, repair, addition,
maintenance, relocation. and change of occupancy of any existing structure. The
occupancy of any structure currently existing on the date of adoption of this code
shall be permitted to continue without change provided there are no orders of the
building official pending, no evidence of fraud. or no serious safety or sanitation

hazard.

102.8 Temporary structures. The building official is authorized to issue approvals
for temporary structures. Such approvals are to be in the form of a “Certificate of

Occupancy for a Temporary Building” in accordance with section 111.1.6. This
section _does not apply to time-limited occupancies in existing structures. See

section 111.1.5 for time-limited occupancies.

102.8.1 Conformance. Temporary structures are to conform to the structural

strength, fire safety, means of egress, accessibility, light, ventilation and

sanitary requirements of this code only to the extent necessary to ensure the
public health, safety and general welfare. Temporary tents and membrane

structures are to also comply with the applicable provisions in section 3103.

102.8.2 Termination of approval. The building official is authorized to
terminate approval for a temporary structure and to order the temporary
structure to be discontinued if conditions of the approval have been violated or
the structure or occupancy poses an immediate hazard to the public or occupants
of the structure.

102.9 Non-required work. Any component, building element, equipment, system
or portion thereof not required by this code are to be permitted to be installed as a

partial or complete system provided that it is constructed or installed in accordance
with this code to the extent of the installation.




4101:1-1-01 9

102.10 Work exempt from approval. Approval is not required for the following

work: however, this work is still to comply with all applicable provisions of the
rules of the board:

Building:

1.

a

oo w =

11

12.

13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.

0.

One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds.

plavhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed one
hundred twenty square feet (11.15 m?) and playground structures.

Fences not over seven feet (1829 mm) high.

. Retaining walls which are not over four feet (1219 mm) in height measured

from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall. unless supporting a
surcharge or impounding Class [, II or III-A liquids.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed
five thousand gallons (18 927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width
does not exceed two to one.

Sidewalks, parking lots and driveways not more than thirty inches (762 mm)
above grade and not over any basement or story below and which are not
part of an accessible route.

Finishes not regulated by this code. decorating, or other work defined as
maintenance or minor repair.

Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.
Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R-3.

Tents and membrane structures exempted in section 3103.1.3.
Above-ground storage tanks as defined in rule 4101:1-2-01 of the

Administrative Code and the associated tank foundations.

. Battery operated smoke or carbon monoxide alarms installed in existing

buildings where no construction is taking place.
Crypts. mausoleums, and columbaria structures not exceeding 1500 square

feet if the building or structure is not for occupancy and used solely for the
interment of human or animal remains.

Signs painted directly on building surfaces.

Temporary yard signs.

Signs not more than 2.5 ft.2 in area (0.23m?).

Signs required in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 11.

Signs undergoing minor repairs in accordance with section 102.10.2.
Temporary or time-limited occupancy of a building used or constructed to
respond to conditions directly connected to an emergency declaration issued
by the governor or federal government.

Electrical:



4101:1-1-01 10

1. Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection of
approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed
receptacles.

2. Electrical equipment used for radio and television transmissions except

equipment and wiring for power supply, and the installations of towers and
antennas.

3. The installation of any temporary system required for the testing or

servicing of electrical equipment or apparatus.

4. Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus or equipment operating at
less than twenty-five volts and not _capable of supplying more than fi

watts of energy, unless specifically addressed in this code.
5. Process equipment and the associated wiring on the load side of the power

disconnect to the equipment.

6. Electrical wiring equipment not connected to building services equipment
in and adjacent to natural or artificially made bodies of water as defined in
Article 682 of NFPA 70 as referenced in Chapter 35.

Gas:

1. Portable heating appliances:

2. Replacement of any part that does not alter approval of equipment or make
such equipment unsafe.

3. Gas distribution piping owned and maintained by public or municipal
utilities and located upstream of the point of delivery.

4. Process equipment, including the associated tanks, foundations, and process

piping. For combination building services/process or power piping
systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control

valve which separates the process from the building services piping is
exempt from approval.

5. When installed by the servicing gas supplier, replacement of existing LP-gas
containers_by servicing gas supplier of the same capacity in the same

location and associated regulators.

Mechanical:
1. Portable heating appliances;
2. Portable ventilation equipment;

3. Portable cooling units;

4. Replacement of any part of an appliance which does not alter its approval or
make it unsafe;

5. Portable evaporative cooler;
6. Process equipment including the associated tanks, foundations, and process

piping. For combination building services/process or power piping




4101:1-1-01 11

systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control
valve which separates the process from the building services piping is
exempt from approval.

7. Heating and cooling distribution piping installed and maintained by public
or municipal utilities.

8. Self-contained refrigeration system containing ten pounds (4.54 kg) or less
of refrigerant and actuated by motors of one horsepower (0.75 kW) or less.

Plumbing:

1. The repair of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe: provided.
however. that if any concealed trap. drain-pipe. water. soil, waste or vent
pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the
same with new material, such work is to be considered as new work and an
approval is to be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearance of stoppages or the repair of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures,
and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs
do not involve the replacement of more than one fixture or rearrangement
of valves. pipes or fixtures.

3. Process equipment including the associated tanks, foundations, and process
piping. For combination building services/process or power piping
systems, the power or process piping located downstream of the control
valve which separates the process from the building services piping is
exempt from approval.

102.10.1 Emergency repairs. Where equipment replacements and repairs must
be performed in an emergency situation, an application_for approval is to be

submitted within the next working business day to the building official.

102.10.2 Minor repairs. Minor repairs to structures may be made without

application or notice to the building official. Such repairs are not to include the

cutting away of any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of
any structural beam or load bearing support, or the removal or change of any

required means of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the
egress requirements: nor do minor repairs include addition to, alteration of,
replacement or relocation of any standpipe, water supply. sewer, drainage, drain

leader. gas. soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric wiring or mechanical or

other work affecting public health or general safety.

102.11 Building department jurisdictional limitations. A municipal. township,
or county building department that has been certified by the board of building

standards, pursuant to rule 4101:7-2-01 of the Administrative Code, has jurisdiction




CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Jack Bradley Director Chief Building Official

Mayor
RESIDENTIAL ZONING REVIEW

November 21, 2025

Kathleen Wise
4325 Liberty Ave
Vermilion, OH 44089

Re: Shed permit application PPN 0201003111052 — Delaware Ave

Subject plans were reviewed for conformance with the 2021 Lorain Codified Ordinance 4-21,
Zoning Code. The permit application for a shed is DENIED A shed is an accessory building and
use to a principal use and building. PPN 0201003111052 is currently vacant and does not have a
principal building or use.

RESIDENTIAL REVIEW COMMENTS:

- Ashed is an Accessory Building- A subordinate building detached from, but located on
the same lot as, the principal building, the use of which is incidental and accessory to
that of the principal building or use. A storage container, trailer, or similar item is not an
accessory building. (1191.01 A-B)
https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378

- Accessory Use- A use customarily incidental and subordinate to the principal use or
building and located on the same lot as the principal use or building. (1191.01 A-B)
https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378

You have the You have the Right to Appeal this decision within 20 days from the date of this
notice per Chapter 1175.01(a) of the Lorain Codified Ordinances.

Respectfully,

A OR

Evelisse Atkinson

Planning & Zoning Administrator

City of Lorain — Building Housing & Planning
440-204-2306 // Evelisse_Atkinson@cityoflorain.org

200 West Erie Avenue, 5 Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Cityoflorain.org


https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378
https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/lorain/latest/lorain_oh/0-0-0-46378

Jack W. Bradley ~ Direcor
Mayor

CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matt Kusznir David Faciana
Chief Building Official

NOTICE OF VIOLATION

To: Kathleen Wise

Parcel No.: 02-01-003-111-052

Property Address / Description: Vacant lot — Delaware Avenue
Re: Unpermitted use and structures on residential lot

Dear Kathleen Wise:

This letter constitutes formal notice that the City of Lorain (“City”) has observed and
documented violations of the City’s zoning, building, and property maintenance codes on the
above-referenced parcel. The parcel is within a residential zoning district and under the
jurisdiction of the City’s Building, Housing & Planning Department.

Observed violations include, but are not limited to:

1.

2.

Use of the lot for habitation or temporary living accommodations (e.g., tents) on an
undeveloped residential parcel without permit or authorization.

Installation of fencing without a proper permit, and/or in violation of the City’s fence
provisions (for example, see the Residential Fence Permit application instructions). (
Construction of an accessory structure (shed or similar) without required building permit
or zoning approval, in violation of the City’s building code requirement for permitting.
Storage of a recreational vehicle (RV) on the residential lot in a manner inconsistent with
the City’s zoning and property maintenance regulations.

Use of the property in a manner inconsistent with its zoning classification and the general
prohibition against living on a vacant lot without proper development, permit, or
occupancy certificate under the City’s Zoning Code. See the City’s Planning & Zoning
Code, Part Eleven.

Maintenance, occupancy, or structure-erection on the property that may constitute a
violation of the property maintenance code adopted by the City.

Applicable Code Sections:

Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Part Eleven — Planning & Zoning Code,
Chapter 1121 (Zoning Districts and Map) and Chapter 1141 (General Provisions) set
forth zoning classification, permitted uses, accessory uses, and enforcement procedures.
Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Part Fifteen — Building Code, including
Chapter 1503 (Ohio Building Code adoption) and Chapter 1509 (Property Maintenance
Code) govern the permitting and structural requirements and occupancy standards.

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lerain, Ohio 44052

Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080

Cityoflorain.org



CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

Matt Kusznir David Faciana
Chief Building Official

Jack W. Bradley ~ Director
Mayor
¢ Codified Ordinances of the City of Lorain — Chapter 557 — Weeds/High Grass addresses
property maintenance and abatement of nuisances such as overgrown vegetation, though
some conditions may relate to maintenance of vacant lots.
+ The City’s Fence Permit document: “Residential maximum 6 ft height, no barbed wire,
neighbor consent if on property line”.

Required Corrective Action:
You are hereby instructed to take the following corrective measures on or before [insert
compliance date, e.g., 14 days from the date of this notice]:

1. Immediately cease any living, residing, or overnight occupancy on the vacant lot unless
properly permitted and developed.

2. Apply for any required permits or remove unpermitted structures (sheds, tents, etc.). If
removal, ensure complete removal of debris and restoration of the lot to a condition
consistent with the zoning and property maintenance requirements.

3. Remove or relocate the recreational vehicle from the lot so that its storage or operations
comply with City ordinances.

4, Submit for and obtain a fence permit (if desired) or remove any fence erected without
proper permit/approval (or otherwise bring into compliance with the City’s fence
regulations).

5. Maintain the property in compliance with all applicable property maintenance and zoning
regulations, including removal of any debris, unauthorized materials, and resolving any
health/safety hazards.

Consequences of Non-Compliance:

If the directed corrective actions are not taken by the compliance date above, the City may
initiate enforcement action, which may include fines, liens, stop-work orders, condemnation of
unsafe structures, abatement at the owner’s expense, and/or referral to the municipal court. The
owner may also be required to pay all costs incurred by the City in enforcement and abatement.

We appreciate your prompt attention to this matter. Ensuring compliance helps protect
neighborhood health, welfare, safety, and the character of our residential districts.

Andreg M. Arochlo

Housing Inspector

City of Lorain

200 West Erie Ave — 5" Floor
{440) 204 — 2301 - Office

{440} 752 — 6497 - Cell

Andres Arochodcityoflorain.org

200 West Erie Avenue, 5 Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540 | Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Cityoflorain.org



..f ¥ .m__.,,m.
Fio
e .U.M..V

s

Qw# 8407} -
O Ul |
h@m
& Eam_@
m_,{ o .




CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5.e.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:

B.A. 05-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use variance to allow
parking of Industrial and Recreational vehicles within the required 200-foot setback (near residential districts) in a
I-1 Light industrial Section 1143.07(j)(5) Retail and Service-Oriented Uses at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial
Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy, applicant.

Attachments
BA 5-2026
BA 5-2026 Staff Report




CITY OF LORAIN

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

BOARD OF APPEALS NO. 0 5 - 2024

APPUCATION FOR A VARIANCE FROM THE ZONING CODE

APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LORAIN,
STATE OF OHIO, FOR A VARIANCE OF THE ZONING CODE.

Name: I”{ili)’l!]a’ (S“) g!;i ‘l”ll H]l Klg LCg _Jas e‘-am\/

Address: 50'3 Obﬂ’"n a\/c

City: _LOYOI | ﬂ State: Oh 10, Zip: LI ’4 O 52_
Phone: (Residential) (Business) L‘{LI 0-258 433

Address or location of property requiring a variance if different from above:

Plot Plan Submitted: Més | No Letter Submitted: [3¥és | | No

Section of Zoning Code Involved

Reason for the Appeal or Variance:

To obtain peymission for [Bdustvial and Recreatonal

J&chs_{o_pam_mumgmm&@mgtﬁzmmm

e 2006 st blck from esidentiad znnmg.

Non-refundable Application Fee: $165.00 (Ordinance 168-20 effective January 21, 2021)

@VXOLR(C@@OWAW D (S-S

pligant Sign Date

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org



Industrial Storages and Parking LLC
1305 Oberlin Ave

Lorain, Ohio 44052
LaboyrealestateLLC@gmail.com
440-258-6433

Date:  12-10-2025

City of Lorain ~ Building, Housing & Planning Department
Attn: Board of Zoning Appeals

200 West Erie Avenue

Lorain, Ohio 44052

RE: Variance Application — Request for Permission to Allow Semi-Truck Parking Within 200 Feet
of Residential Property

To the Honorable Members of the Lorain Board of Zoning Appeals:

| am submitting this cover letter along with the formal variance application on behaif of Industrial
Storages and Parking LLC, located at 1305 Oberlin Ave, Lorain, Ohlo 44052. The purpose of this
request is to obtain permission to allow Industrial and Recreational Vehicles to park within designated
areas of the property that fall within the 200-foot setback from residential zoning.

The layout and dimensions of this land make strict compliance with the 200-foot setback impractical
and significantly restrict the reasonable commercial use of the property. Granting this variance will allow
the site to be utilized safely and efficiently as a controlled, secure parking and storage facility—while
continuing to respect and protect nearby residential areas.

To minimize any impact on neighboring homes, Industrial Storages and Parking LLC is committed to
implementing strong mitigation measures, including designated parking zones, a no-idling policy,
security monitoring, downward-directed lighting, fencing/screening, and regular maintenance to ensure
a clean and orderly environment, These measures will help ensure safe, compliant operations with
minimal disturbance to surrounding residents.

This facility will also provide an important benefit to Lorain by offering safe, organized parking for
commercial frucks—reducing lllegal parking on city streets, supporting local truck drivers, and
contributing to Lorain's economic growth and infrastructure.

Thank you for your time, attention, and consideration. | look forward to working cooperatively with the
City of Lorain throughout this process. Please feel free to contact me at any time with questions or
requests for additional information.

Respectfully,

Jose Laboy

industrial Storages and Parking LLC
LaboyrealestateLLC@gmail.com
440-258-6433



1305 Oberlin Ave Lorain, Ohio 44052

v~ Requested
_um_._a.m:m s

=

07/20/2019



Abutting Property Owners — 1305 Oberlin Ave, Lorain, OH Industrial
Parking and Storages LLC

Martha Ann Stalinski
1133 W. 12th St

James Scott
1129 W. 12th St

Jasmine Opps LLC
1125 W. 12th St

Charles York
1121 W. 12th St

JS Opportunities LLC
1119 W, 12th §t

Helen Mullins
1115 W. 12th St

Potter Hank Russell & Katherine
1113 W. 12th 5t

Potter Hank R & Catherine
1111 W.12th St

David Morales
1228 Oberlin Ave

Lisa Mcie
1204 W. 13th St

Bradley Smith / Deborah Smith
1245 Oberlin Ave

Felix Rosario
1239 Oberlin Ave

HSP Holdings LLC
1229 Oberlin Ave

Alexis Crispin Mojica / Maria Yvette Mojica
1145 W. 12th 5t



Danielle Price
1143 W.12th St

Brian Mcdermott
1141 W, 12th St

Javier Gonzalo Ambrosi Devera Sr
1135 W. 12th St



CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

: Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Jack Bradley ~ Directer Chief Building Official

Mayor

December 30, 2025

To: Zoning Board of Appeals
From: Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator

Re B.A. 05-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a use
variance to allow parking of Industrial and Recreational vehicles within the required 200-foot
setback (near residential districts) in a I-1 Light industrial district. Section 1143.07(j)(5) Retail and
Service-Oriented Uses at, 1305 Oberlin Ave. Industrial Storages and Parking- Jose Laboy,
applicant.

My responses regarding compliance are below:
Section 1175.01 Decisions:
b) Variances.

(1) The Zoning Board of Appeals is authorized to grant, upon appeal in specific cases, such
variances from the terms of the Zoning Code as will not be contrary to the public interest,
where owing to special conditions of the property, a literal enforcement of the provisions of
this Code will result in unnecessary hardship.

(2) A nonconforming use of neighboring lands or structures in neighboring lands in the
same or other zoning district shall not be considered grounds for the issuance of a variance.

(3) Variance shall not be granted on the grounds of convenience or economics, but only
where strict application of the provisions of this Zoning Code would result in undue hardship
due to conditions of the property.

(4) Variances shail not be granted which permit any use not otherwise permitted or
expressly, or by implication, prohibited in the district involved.

Section 1173.04 Application and Standards for Variances
{d) A variance shall only be granted upon a finding by the Board of Appeals that all the
following standards have been satisfied:

(1} That special conditions and circumstances exist which are particular to the property
involved and are not generally applicable to other properties in the same district.

{2} That the literal interpretation of the provisions of this Zoning Code would deprive the
applicant of rights commonly enjoyed by other properties in the same district.

(3} That the special conditions and circumstances which exist are not the result of actions
of the applicant.

(4} That granting the requested variance will not give the applicant any special privileges
denied to other properties in the same district.

200 West Erie Avenue, 5% Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540
Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Email: bhpicityoflorain.org www.cityoflorain.org




Respectfully,

AsD~

Evelisse Atkinson
Planning & Zoning Administrator

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540
Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Email: bhpi@cityoflorain.org




| Ayl '.--:'||;:-;| :
'-3'4_.,_;,1." 3






CITY OF LORAIN

Zoning Board of Appeals 5.f.
Meeting Date:  01/07/2026

Subject:

B.A. 06-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a variance from the
maximum dimensional standards for wall signs in an HMD- Hospital Medical Center district (150 feet). Section
1151.06 Signs By District at, 5800 Cooper Foster Park Rd. John Benedict -Brilliant Electric Sign (agent),
Cleveland Clinic, applicant.

Attachments
BA 6-2026
BA 6-2026 Staff Report




CITY OF LORAIN

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Jack Bradley
Mayor

BOARD OF APPEALS NO. __ 06-2026

APPLICATION FOR A VARIANCE FROM THE ZONING CODE

APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LORAIN,
STATE OF OHIO, FOR A VARIANCE OF THE ZONING CODE.

John Benedict - Brilliant Electric Sign Co., LTD.

Name:

Address: 4811 Van Epps Rd

city: Cleveland Ssre: OH zip: 44131
Phone: (Residential) (Business) 216-741-3800

Address or location of property requiring a variance if different from above:

5800 Cooper Foster PK Rd.

Site Plan Submitted: Yes Letter Submitted: Yes

1151. @ - Signs

Section of Zoning Code Involved

Reason for the Appeal or Variance:

Requesting a variance to allow for 221 sq ft of wall signage where 150 sq ft of wall
signage is allowed. The increase in allowable square footage is important for the
read-ability of the sign text.

Non-refundable Application Fee: $165.00 (Ordinance 168-20 effective January 21, 2021)

J ' f -
/M/ // £ S thes (/25

()

{

Apphcant Signature Date

200 West Erie Avenue, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Phone:440-204-2306
www.cityoflorain.org



Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

[ 4811 VAN EPPS ROAD, CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131-1082
(216) 741-3800 / (800) 969-7446 / FAX (216) 741-8733 / www.brilliantsign.com

4

12/15/2025

Evelisse Atkinson

Planning & Zoning Administrator
City of Lorain

200 W Erie Ave., Lorain, OH 44052

Dear Evelisse,

Cleveland Clinic Lorain Family Health Center operates a center for outpatient joint
replacement at 5800 Cooper Foster Park Rd. This facility is adjacent to 5700 Cooper
Foster Park Dr, where Cleveland Clinic Operates the Lorain Family Health and Surgery
Center.

The nature of the buildings and lot conditions create unique challenges for sign
visibility. Therefore, we are requesting a variance for an increase in allowable
area for a wall sign on the north facing elevation of the property per 2021 Lorain
Codified Ordinance 04-21, Planning and Zoning Code Chapter 1151.06- Signs
permitted by district. The requested variance is for 221 sq ft where 150 sq ft is
allowed.

Sincerely,
// / = 7 // &
/

John M. Benedict

Brilliant Electric Sign Co.
jbenedict@brilliantsign.com
216-741-3800 x236

MEMBER

R ——

ot
G
JLE)
e i



Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

i 4811 VAN EPPS ROAD, CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131-1082
(216) 741-3800 / (800) 969-7446 / FAX (216) 741-8733 / www.brilliantsign.com

1. That special conditions and circumstances exist which are particular to the
property involved and are not generally applicable to other properties in the
same district.

This is a large medical campus with unique topography and large trees situated along
the roadside that can negatively impact sign visibility. The building is also setback a
significant distance from Cooper Foster Park Rd and the freeway.

2. That the literal interpretation of the provisions of this zoning code would
deprive the applicant of rights commonly enjoyed by other properties in the same
district.

Not granting the variance would deprive the applicant of rights commonly enjoyed by
other properties with regards to sign visibility.

3. That the special conditions and circumstances which exist are not the result of
actions of the applicant.

The special conditions and circumstances which create the need for a variance are
not the results of the actions of the applicants.

4. That granting the requested variance will not give the applicant any special

privileges denied to other properties in the same district.

Granting the variance would not confer any special privilege to the applicant.

B

MEMBER

[ ——



Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

P 4811 VAN EPPS ROAD, CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131-1082
(216) 741-3800 / (800) 969-7446 / FAX (216) 741-8733 /| www.brilliantsign.com

4

Abutting Property Owners

Parcel #: 0500020000076
CAMPANA DEVELOPMENT Il LLC
6055 PARK SQUARE DR., LORAIN OH 44053

Parcel #: 0500020000077

NOMS PROPERTY LLC

6055 PARK SQUARE DR., LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020702010

CAMPANA DEVELOPMENT Il LLC

6055 PARK SQUARE DR., LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020702011

DK RESIDENTIAL INVESTMENTS LLC

6145 PARK SQUARE DR, STE 2, LORAIN OH 44053

Parcel #: 0500020702012

GTX PROPERTIES LLC

145 PARK SQUARE DR, STE 3 LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020702013

CAMPANA DEVELOPMENT IV LLC

6145 PARK SQUARE DR, STE 4, LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020702014

CAMPANA DEVELOPMENT IV LLC

6145 PARK SQUARE DR, STE 4, LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020701005

PINEWOOD LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY

5750 COOPER FOSTER PARK RD, LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020701006

CLEVELAND CLINIC FOUNDATION

5750 COOPER FOSTER PARK RD, LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020701008

CLEVELAND CLINIC FOUNDATION

5750 COOPER FOSTER PARK RD, LORAIN OH 44053
Parcel #: 0500020000112

CLEVELAND CLINIC FOUNDATION

5700 COOPER FOSTER PARK RD., LORAIN OH 44053

Y I

MEMBER

[ P —



(s191191) IH4 ureio] JJ /mau 3 a3 gnuN 314
ge0e NMOHS dJ HO ‘NIVH0T “GY Y71S04 434009 0085
@ 1HODIHALOD IIVIS H3INDIS3A NOILVOO1
6€.1-9¢8 sz/cL/z1 wr JH4 NIYH01 JINITI GNYTINTT1I
'ON NDIS3a NOISIA3Y 31vd NVINSITVS JINVN ANVdINOD

‘NOIHSVd ANV NI d3ligiHX3 dHO d3id0d
‘d30nAaoyd3y ‘a3sn 39 OL LON SI 1l "NOA HOo4d
G3NNV1d ONIF9 LO3rodd V HLIM NOILONNIFNOD
NI ‘3SN TVNOSH3d HNOA HO4 @aLlINENS SI
1l "SNDIS LNVITIIHE A9 @3lvIHO ‘ONIMVHA
a3HSITandNN TVNIDIHO NV SI SIHL 310N

008€-1v2(912) LELYY OIHO ‘ANVI3ATTO “aH Sdda NVA Lisy

‘P¥T °0)) ubIg d1)I3[] JueI[IIg

*$J0|09 8NJ} J0} SUBYD [ela)ew 0} Jajay "paljioads yojew Ajoexs jou Aew UMOUS $40j0d ‘suone)iwi| Jajulid 0} anp :31ON




37'-2 1/2" |

--ﬁﬁnter for Outpatient Joint Replacement

1'-6"
NOTE: THIS IS AN ORIGINAL UNPUBLISHED

DRAWING, CREATED BY BRILLIANT SIGNS. IT
IS SUBMITTED FOR YOUR PERSONAL USE, IN
CONJUNCTION WITH A PROJECT BEING PLANNED
FOR YOU. IT IS NOT TO BE USED, REPRODUCED,
COPIED OR EXHIBITED IN ANY FASHION.

i N
¥+ '
) 4 .
UL R R
e 0
—_— e T o
. por 9 Vi -

> Aggaas {957
SIGN ELEVATION: 1/4"=1"-0’ ‘I/II/M/;“I _

Notes W AR RO P ey V3

Manufacture & install one (1) set of internally illuminated, LED I
channel letters flush mounted to the east elevation of the building;

remote power supplies

- LED channel letters to have white 2447 plexiglass faces

with first surface, black perforated duo-film; trim to be painted black;
returns to be painted matthews brushed aluminum 41-342

rmae

4811 VAN EPPS RD., CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131 (216)741-3800

Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

4

COMPANY NAME

RATED 120 VOLTS

NOTE: due to printer limitations, colors shown may not exactly match specified. Refer to material charts for true colors.

EAST ELEVATION PHOTO RENDERING NTS

DESIGN NO.
B25-1692
COPYRIGHT ©
2025
cleve ¢ new/ CC lorain FHC (letters)

REVISION
FILE NAME

11/26/25
SHOWN

DATE
SCALE

JM
CP

SALESMAN
DESIGNER

CLEVELAND CLINIC LORAIN FHC
5800 COOPER FOSTER RD., LORAIN, OH

LOCATION




‘ 1 9'_0"

Center for Outpatient
Joint Replacement

SIGN ELEVATION: 3/8"=1"-0’

Notes

Remove existing logo/letters reading “Cleveland Clinic,”
relocate to the left of the sign band

Manufacture & install one (1) set of internally illuminated, LED
channel letters reading “Center for Outpatient Joint Replacement,”
to be flush mounted to the right of the moved logo/letters on the sign £3
band; remote power supplies

- LED channel letters to have white 2447 plexiglass faces with first
surface, black perforated duo-film; trim to be painted black; returns
to be painted matthews brushed aluminum 41-342

RATED 120 VOLTS

i al,

‘ 1 l_6"

3'_6"

1 l_6" ‘

PHOTO RENDERING NTS

NOTE: due to printer limitations, colors shown may not exactly match specified. Refer to material charts for true colors.

IT

NOTE: THIS IS AN ORIGINAL UNPUBLISHED

DRAWING, CREATED BY BRILLIANT SIGNS.
IS SUBMITTED FOR YOUR PERSONAL USE, IN

CONJUNCTION WITH A PROJECT BEING PLANNED
FOR YOU. IT IS NOT TO BE USED, REPRODUCED,

COPIED OR EXHIBITED IN ANY FASHION.

Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

—
ol £
o
N'IN
) ag
o)) O
3lO |E
. — =
o 'l =
z le S
(=)
Zols I3
= o Q
2 15 |2
o o N
2
(L]
L
2
Q
w
z =
e} =
%) P4
2 =
o [TH
<
Sl =
~al S
=1 ©
T
™~ x
w wed
= <
< 13}
= »n
4
S_|ES
7
458
P a

4811 VAN EPPS RD., CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131 (216)741-3800

V|

COMPANY NAME

CLEVELAND CLINIC LORAIN FHC
5800 COOPER FOSTER RD., LORAIN, OH

LOCATION




Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

| , 4811 VAN EPPS RD., CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131 (216)741-3800




Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

i , 4811 VAN EPPS RD., CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131 (216)741-3800




Brilliant Electric Sign Co., Ltd.

| , 4811 VAN EPPS RD., CLEVELAND, OHIO 44131 (216)741-3800




CITY OF LORAIN

Department of Building, Housing & Planning

- Matthew Kusznir David Faciana
Jack Bradley Director Chief Building Official

Mayor

December 31, 2025

To: Zoning Board of Appeals
From: Evelisse Atkinson, Planning and Zoning Administrator

Re: B.A. 06-2026 Submission for the Zoning Board of Appeals review and consideration, a
variance from the maximum dimensional standards for wall signs in an HMD- Hospital Medical
Center district (150 feet). Section 1151.06 Signs By District at, 5800 Cooper Foster Park Rd. John
Benedict -Brilliant Electric Sign (agent), Cleveland Clinic, applicant.

My responses regarding compliance are below:
The applicant is requesting a variance of 71sf.

Section 1175.03 (d) A variance shall only be granted upon a finding by the Board of Appeals
that all the following standards have been satisfied:

(1) That special conditions and circumstances exist which are particular to the property
involved and are not generally applicable to other properties in the same district.

(2) That the literal interpretation of the provisions of this Zoning Code would deprive the
applicant of rights commonly enjoyed by other properties in the same district

(3) That the special conditions and circumstances which exist are not the result of actions of
the applicant

(4) That granting the requested variance will not give the applicant any special privileges
denied to other properties in the same district.

Respectfully,

D~

Evelisse Atkinson
Planning & Zoning Administrator

200 West Erie Avenue, 5" Floor, Lorain, Ohio 44052
Building Division: (440) 204-2045 Fax: (440) 204-2540
Housing & Planning Division: (440) 204-2020 Fax: (440) 204-2080
Email: bhp@cityoflorain.org www.cityoflorain.org



mailto:bhp@cityoflorain.org
http://www.cityoflorain.org/

	Agenda
	AI_11948_CUP 1-2026
	AI_11949_CUP 2-2026
	AI_11950_PDP 1-2026
	AI_11951_December Public Hearing Minutes
	       ATT_December Public Hearing Minutes
	AI_11952_December Zoning Minutes
	       ATT_December Zoning Minutes
	MINUTES

	AI_11953_BA 1-2026
	       ATT_BA 1-2026
	       ATT_BA 1-2026 Staff Report
	AI_11954_BA 2-2026
	       ATT_BA 2-2026
	BOARD OF APPEALS NO. ____________
	APPLICATION FOR A VARIANCE FROM THE ZONING CODE
	APPLICATION IS HEREBY MADE TO THE ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE CITY OF LORAIN, STATE OF OHIO, FOR A VARIANCE OF THE ZONING CODE.



	       ATT_BA 2-2026 Staff Report
	AI_11955_BA 3-2026
	       ATT_BA 3-2026
	       ATT_BA 3-2026 Plan Review 
	AI_11956_BA 4-2026
	       ATT_BA 4-2026
	       ATT_BA 4-2026 Plan Review
	AI_11957_BA 5-2026
	       ATT_BA 5-2026
	       ATT_BA 5-2026 Staff Report
	AI_11958_BA 6-2026
	       ATT_BA 6-2026
	5800 Cooper Foster Park Rd Signage.pdf
	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6


	       ATT_BA 6-2026 Staff Report

