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NOTICE OF TELECONFERENCE MEETING
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
October 22, 2020
Special Meeting at 10:00 a.m.
City Council Chambers

504 N. Queen Street
Palestine, Texas

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Order of the Governor issued March 16, 2020, the Palestine
City Council will conduct its meeting by telephone/video conference in order to advance the public health
goal of limiting face-to-face meetings (also called "social distancing") to slow the spread of the
COVID-19. There will be public access to the location described above. All attendees are required to
wear a face covering.

Zoom Link:
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/86466663445?pwd=U3ltanIl5bkhiekEOUEZza3JVdDUyZz09

Meeting ID: 864 6666 3445
Passcode: 680567

One tap mobile
+13462487799,,86466663445#,,,,,,0#,,680567# US

Note: when you are joining a Zoom meeting by phone, you can use your phone’s dial pad to enter the
commands *6 for toggling mute/unmute and *9 to “raise your hand.” Learn more here.

Follow us live at: facebook.com/palestinetx/

The public will be permitted to submit public comments electronically as provided by the agenda and as
permitted by the presiding officer during the meeting.

SPECIAL MEETING
A. CALL TO ORDER

B. PUBLIC COMMENTS
Members of the public may submit their comments by completing the required Request to
Speak form by using the weblink below. All comments submitted by 9:30 a.m., the day of
the meeting will be read during the meeting. All comments must be no more than five
minutes in length.

http://cityofpalestinetx.com/government/city-secretary/policies-forms/request-to-speak/

It is not the intention of the City of Palestine to provide a public forum for the
embarrassment or demeaning of an individual or group. Neither is it the intention of the
Council to allow a member of the public to slur the performance, honesty and/or integrity of
any person or threaten any person. Accordingly, profane, insulting, or threatening language


https://us02web.zoom.us/j/86466663445?pwd=U3ltanl5bkhiekE0UEZza3JVdDUyZz09
http://support.zoom.us/hc/en-us/articles/201362663-Joining-a-meeting-by-phone
http://www.facebook.com/palestinetx/
http://cityofpalestinetx.com/government/city-secretary/policies-forms/request-to-speak/

will not be read aloud at the meeting.

C. REGULAR AGENDA
1. Discussion and possible action on Coronavirus Relief Funds.
D. ADJOURNMENT

| certify that the above Notice of Meeting was posted on the outdoor bulletin board at the main entrance
to City Hall, 504 N. Queen Street, Palestine, Texas, in compliance with Chapter 551 of the Texas
Government Code on Monday, October 19, 2020, at 9:30 a.m.

]
=il 1,2-"'1[ LB,

Teresa Herrera, Interim City Manager/City Secretary

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THE AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT (ADA)
PERSONS IN NEED OF SPECIAL ACCOMMODATION TO PARTICIPATE IN THIS PROCEEDING
SHALL, CONTACT THE CITY SECRETARY'S OFFICE VIA EMAIL AT therrera@palestine-tx.org or
903-731-8414.


mailto:therrera@palestine-tx.org

PALESTINE
&g 185

Agenda Date: October 22, 2020

To: City Council

From: Teresa Herrera, City Secretary
Agenda ltem:

Date Submitted:

SUMMARY:
Discussion and possible action on Coronavirus Relief Funds.

RECOMMENDED ACTION:
CITY MANAGER APPROVAL:

Attachments
Cares Act




Palestine Fire Department

Palestine Fire Department

Christian Heritage Academy

Christian Heritage Academy
Christian Heritage Academy
Christian Heritage Academy

Visitors Center

City of Palestine

City of Palestine

City of Palestine

City of Palestine

City of Palestine

City of Palestine

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020 Amount
ITEMS Requested

EW30 Package 30lb Extractor, 5 gallon pail of
Citro Squeeze detergent and case of

Responder wipes 1
Lion VF Golad Armor AP Loat P>LUL4L1//-E

$1,342.00 Each
Lion VF Gold Armor AP Pant PSGQ14177-E

$895.00 Each 39 Coat & 39 Pant
Dem Technology, LLC Saniguard (8 oz Aerosol)
Item# DET55002 $119.04 per case of 12 16 Cases

10 boxes (1 size) 1

Disposable Nitrile Gloves Case
Lysol/Disinfecting spray 1 case
Disinfecting Wipes 300 tubs
RECEPTION DESK 1
Bid #1 Sloan Valve Toilets 23
Bid #2 Sloan Valve Toilets 23
Bid #3 Sloan Valve Toilets 23
Bid #1 Sloan Valve Urinals 16
Bid #2 Sloan Valve Urinals 16
Bid #3 Sloan Valve Urinals 16

S

Aprx Total $

7,345.00

87,243.00

1,904.64

70.00
249.95
3,947.50
3,650.00
11,445.49

12,204.48

7,962.08

8,490.08



City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine

City of Palestine

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests
10/12/2020

Bid #1 Sinks

Bid #2 Sinks

Bid #3 Sinks

Bid #1 Tank Toilets

Bid #2 Tank Toilets

Bid #3 Tank Toilets

Bid #1 Water Fountains

Bid #2 Water Fountains

Bid #3 Water Fountains

Bid #1 Paper Towel Dispensers
Bid #2 Paper Towel Dispensers
Bid #3 Paper Towel Dispensers
Bid #1 Soap Dispensers

Bid #2 Soap Dispensers

Bid #3 Soap Dispensers

Bid #1 Hand Sanitizer Stations

55

55

55

29

29

29

15

15

15

39

39

39

33

33

33

15

30,261.00

24,475.00

48,550.06

43,057.95

69,750.00

819.00

1,121.67

3,375.00



City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine
City of Palestine

City of Palestine

City of Palestine
UT Tyler University Palestine
Campus

UT Tyler University Palestine Campus

UT Tyler University Palestine Campus

UT Tyler University Palestine Campus
UT Tyler University Palestine Campus
UT Tyler University Palestine Campus

UT Tyler University Palestine Campus

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests
10/12/2020

Bid #2 Hand Sanitizer Stations
Bid #3 Hand Sanitizer Stations
Bid #1 Toilets Seat Cover Holders
Bid #2 Toilets Seat Cover Holders
Bid #3 Toilets Seat Cover Holders
Paper towels per case of 6

Hand Soap 6 per case

Hand Sanitizer 4/1 gallon (case)

Toilet Seat Covers

Automatic Paper Towel Dispenser Model
#REB05176-WB

Automatic Soap Dispenser GOJO1919

Automatic Faucets SF-2350-BAT-BDM-CP-0.5GPM-
MLM-IR-FCT

Automatic Flush Valves Royal 111 SM0-1.28
Hand Sanitizer Refills 313830854

Hand Washing Sinks EPS1010 x/EPS1000-
BS1/EPS1000-F11

Picnic Tables PP240D

15

15

52

52

52

5000

14

11

12

12

60

12

20

1,014.00

59.30

55.25

129.98

54.67

1,050.00

660.00

4,680.00

4,680.00

8,158.20

15,368.76

22,680.00



UT Tyler University Palestine Campus

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests
10/12/2020

Umbrellas w/base & UTT logo

Demco Social Distancing Window Decal 5" x 7"
2/sheet W13803660

Social Distancing Floor Decal Orange/Black
Spanish W13803600

Social Distancing Floor Decal Green/White English
W1380540

Social Distancing Floor Decal One Way Arrow
1/Each W13804300

MooreCo Large Mobile Clear Divider w/platinum
Frame W13804340

Demco Portable Health Shield, 31-1/2" x 23 -1/2"
x 3/16" W13802980

MooreCo Standard Mobile Clear Divider
w/platinum Frame W13804330

HamiltonBuhl HygenX Vray Portable UV Sanitizer
89235001

Hamilton Buhl V-Claw Holder for HygenX Vray and
Other Devices 89236001

Universal Keyboard Covers 10970001

Visiontron Rectracta-Belt 10' Double Belt Barrier
with Black Post 30950102

Copernicus Hand Sanitizer Stands, Wall-Mounted
Dispenser 32546001

Copernicus Battery-operated Hand Sanitizer
Dispenser 32572001

Visiontron Rectracta-Belt Barrier Sign holder with
Black Bracket 30947001

StepNPull Hands Free Door Opener (Black 1 piece)

15,300.00

19.96

15.98

15.98

31.96

2,679.96

389.97

1,019.98

308.00

48.25

16.99

750.00

151.80

153.64

171.75

179.70



LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

Free Door Opener, Foot Oper%%&%{gglzepener
for Office, Schools, and Bathrooms

Mobile Print Subscription Remote Installation
(wireless printing)

Ruckus Zone Flex R510-Wireless access point Wi-
Fi

Ruckus Secure mounting bracket for Wireless
Access Point

Ruckus Cloud Wi-Fi Subscription license 1 year
Ruckus ZoneFlex T610s Wireless access point-
8011ac Wave2-Wi-Fi Dual Band

Ruckus Network device mounting kit pole
mountable, wall mountable outdoor for Ruckus
T610; ZoneFlex T610s

Ruckus Cloud Wi-Fi Subscription license 1 year-1
access point hosted

Ruckus T310sWireless Access Point-802.11 ac
Wave 2-Wi-Fi Dual Band

Sennheiser EW112PG4-A Wireless Portable
Lavalier

Microphone System

Apple Smart - Keyboard and folio caseQWERTY-US
Apple Lightning Digital AV Adapter - Lightning to
HDMI adapter - HDMI / Lig

Apple AirPods Pro - true wireless earphones with
mic

UAG Rugged Case for iPad 10.2-in (7/8 Gen,
2019/2020) - Metropolis Magma -

CTA Digital Heavy-Duty Gooseneck Clamp Stand -
stand

14.99

1,025.00

1,955.95

72.45

404.85

1,156.19

95.28

161.94

866.42

569.05

411.01

155.10

41.65

212.49

46.58

65.11



LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

LIBRARY

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

CTA Heavy-Duty Security Goog%égﬁ%gr Stand -
cart

Apple Lightning to 3.5 mm Headphone Jack
Adapter -

CTA Digital Heavy-Duty Gooseneck Clamp Stand -
stand

Zorpro Infrared body temperature scanner
w/estimated shipping

Bid #1 Reagan Park Men's Lower Restroom Demo
(see quote for complete list)

Bid #1 Reagan Park Women's (lower) Demo (see
qguote for complete list)

Bid #1 Reagan Park Men's Upper Demo (See
Quote for complete list)

Bid #1 Reagan Park Women's Upper Demo (See
Quote for complete list)

Bid #1 Willie Myers Men's Restroom (see quote)
Bid #1 Willie Myers Women's Restroom (see
quote)

Bid #1 Mitchell Campbell Men's Demo Restroom
(see quote for complete list)

Bid #1 Mitchell Campbell women's Demo
Restroom (see quote for complete list)

Bid #1 Larry Street Park Men's Restroom Demo

Bid #1 Larry Street Park Women's Restroom Demo
Bid #2 Stainless Steel Plumbing Fixtures W/Sensor
Controls ALL Baths Parks Toilets

Bid #2 Stainless Steel Hand Sink ADA compliant 9
inch backsplash All Baths Parks

158

158

158

158

105.10

7.65

65.11

4,066.00

4,893.24

4,893.24

3,858.24

3,858.24

4,388.24

4,388.24

5,568.24

5,568.24

4,843.24

4,203.24

4,875.28

2,888.20



Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

Parks & Rec

City of Palestine

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

Bid #3 Stainless Steel Toilets #A442A28Pies All
Parks Park
Bid #3 Labor and Material for All Parks Bath

Bid #1 Reagan Park Gazebo

Bid #2 Reagan Park Gazebo

Bid #3 Reagan Park Gazebo

Bid #1 Memorial Cemetery

Bid #2 Memorial Cemetery

Bid #3 Memorial Cemetery

Automatic Soap Dispenser & Hand sanitizer Stand

Automatic Soap dispenser bids no units

Seek Scan Thermal Imaging System with stands

20 $

20 S

7%

49,159.00

6,999.00

22,500.00

20,700.00

16,128.00

4,500.00

3,500.00

8,160.00

5,660.00

10,680.00

14,795.62



List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020
VENDOR Bid Vendors Total S Bids
Fire Safety USA Fire-End Croker
Corporation
Fire Safety USA Fire-End Croker
Corporation
Supplyworks.com
Amazon
Amazon Total for CHA S 6,172.09
Amazon

Bluebonnet Remodeling

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)



Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing (no bid)

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing (no bid)

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing (no bid)

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can

get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests
10/12/2020



Neches Plumbing (no bid)
Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Andy's Plumbing

Neches Plumbing (no bid)

Thomas Plumbing (Unavailable can
get a bid later)

Price per Case (city vendor)

Price per Case (city vendor)

Price per Case (city vendor)

Price per Case (city vendor)
Renown Paper Towel $75.00 per
unit

Golo Soap GOJ 1911-02 and GOJ 1912-
02 $60.00 per unit

Sloan $390.00 per unit
Sloan $390.00 per unit
Safety First $135.97 per unit

$1280.73 per unit

$1134.00 Per unit

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020
Andy's Plumbing S 97,937.68
Neches Plumbing (bid
incomplete) S 114,919.57

Thomas Plumbing
(unavailable to bid)  $ -

UT Tyler University
Palestine Campus S 72,576.96




List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020

$765.00 per unit
Demco $4.99 per unit
Demco $7.99 per unit
Demco $7.99 per unit
Demco $7.99 per unit

LIBRARY TOTAL (with

estimated freight of
Demco $669.99 per unit $710.00 S 17,999.44

Demco $129.99 per unit
Demco $509.99 per unit
Brodart

Brodgar

Brodgar

Brodgar $250.00 per unit
Brodgar $75.90 per unit
Brodgar $76.82 per unit
Brodgar $57.25 per unit

Amazon $29.95 per unit



Amazon

TLC (see Quote)

Cynergy $391.19 per unit Outdoor
Wireless Access Point

Cynergy $14.49 per unit Outdoor
Wireless Access Point

Cynergy $80.97 per unit Outdoor

Wireless Access Point

Cynergy Outdoor Wireless Access Point

Cynergy Outdoor Wireless Access Point
Cynergy $80.97 per unit Outdoor
Wireless Access Point

Cynergy Outdoor Wireless Access Point
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment

CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment

CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests
10/12/2020



List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020

CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
CDW-G Virtual Programming Equipment
Zortemp 1000. $3476.00 with $590.00
shipping. (purchased head scans)
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing
Andy's Plumbing

Total Bid Parks Restrooms
Andy's Plumbing Andy's Plumbing S 46,462.40
Thomas Plumbing (This price is per unit, Restrooms Thomas
Total amounts not given) Plumbing Inc. (@ 15) S 73,129.20
Thomas Plumbing (This price is per unit, Restrooms Thomas
Total amounts not given) Plumbing Inc. (@ 15) S 43,323.00




for demo and replace concrete (this will
be city cost so will any other demo on

Neches Plumbing Labor and Material

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Concrete work for Social Distancing

Auto units and stands included

Several bids obtained with no units
Schoolscapes Inc. Bid #2 Game time
$10896.53 Bid #3 Bliss $10980.00 Bid
#4 MDF Hand w/bag $16550.00 Bid #5
no unit MDF $780 per unit Bid #6 Bliss
$10980.00

Cynergy

List for City Council Meeting
Cares Act Funding Requests

10/12/2020
Neches Plumbing S 56,158.00
Sanchez Concrete Constr $ 22,500.00
Ty Cobble S 20,700.00
Bid Mocrete S 16,128.00
Sanchez Concrete Constr $ 4,500.00
Ty Cobble S 3,500.00
Bid Mocrete S 8,160.00

No units on these bids
(please see quotes)
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