ADSP0O17-166117-Peoria Ford

Current Vehicles, New Purchases Statewide Pricing

PFVT Motors, LLC Pricing for Light Duty Vehicles

Make Model Model Fuel Additional Description MSRP 201? |.3ase 201.8 .Base 201_9 Fase

Code Pricing Pricing2 Pricing
FORD CMAX PsA |Hybrid 5DR FHEV SE SERIES $24,995.00 | $21,628.66 | $21,959.46 No Bid
FORD CMAX PsE |Electric 5DR PHEV SE SERIES PLUG IN $27,995.00 | $23,060.28 No Bid No Bid
FORD ECONOLINE E3F |Unleaded |E350 Cutaway $34,035.00 | $24,504.09 | $25,387.49 $26,312.29
FORD ECONOLINE E4F |Unleaded |E450 Cutaway $36,480.00 | $26,649.09 | $27,532.49 $28,457.29
FORD EDGE K3G |Unleaded |[SEFWD $29,845.00 | $25,237.48 | $25,910.28 $27,054.88
FORD EDGE K4G |Unleaded |SEAWD $31,340.00 | $26,586.48 | $27,701.28 $28,844.88
FORD ESCAPE UOF |Unleaded |S4X2 $24,645.00 | $18,361.26 | $18,881.06 $19,560.66
FORD EXPEDITION U1F |Unleaded |[XL4X2 $44,870.00 | $30,039.06 | $36,139.66 $37,075.86
FORD EXPEDITION U1G |[Unleaded |XL 4X4 $48,210.00 | $32,986.06 | $38,807.66 $39,819.86
FORD EXPEDITION EL K1F |Unleaded |EL XL 4Xx2 $47,645.00 | $33,084.06 | $39,423.66 $40,356.86
FORD EXPEDITION EL K1G |Unleaded |EL XL 4X4 $50,665.00 | $35,753.06 | $42,090.66 $43,107.86
FORD EXPLORER K7B |Unleaded |BASE FWD $32,605.00 | $24,718.13 | $25,394.93 $26,182.53
FORD EXPLORER K8B |Unleaded |BASE 4WD $34,755.00 | $26,647.13 | $27,324.93 $28,111.53
FORD F150 F1C |Unleaded |F1504X2 SS R/CAB $29,640.00 | $19,213.31 | $19,810.91 $21,096.11
FORD F150 F1IE |Unleaded |F1504X4 SS R/ICAB $34,445.00 | $23,049.31 | $24,133.91 $24,733.11
FORD F150 wic |Unleaded [F1504X2SS CREW $36,355.00 | $23,754.31 | $24,350.91 $24,858.11
FORD F150 WI1E [Unleaded |F1504X4 SS CREW $40,595.00 | $27,474.31 | $28,071.91 $28,579.11
FORD F150 Xx1C |Unleaded |F1504X2SS S/CAB $33,900.00 | $21,387.31 | $22,468.91 $22,691.11
FORD F150 X1E |Unleaded [F1504X4 SS S/ICAB $38,060.00 | $25,037.31 | $25,634.91 $26,342.11
FORD FIESTA P4A |Unleaded |4 Door Sedan S $15,630.00 | $13,517.28 | $14,248.08 $14,449.68
FORD FLEX KsB |Unleaded |SEFWD $30,920.00 | $26,201.03 | $26,784.83 $27,576.43
FORD FLEX K6C |Unleaded [SELAWD $35,575.00 | $30,032.03 | $30,614.83 $31,411.43
FORD FOCUS P3E |Unleaded [S 4-Door Sedan $18,745.00 | $14,641.18 | $15,945.98 No Bid
FORD FOCUS P3R |Electric BEV 5-Door Sedan $29,995.00 | $25,831.00 No Bid No Bid
FORD DUTY F2A |Unleaded |F2504X2 R/C PU SRW $36,110.00 | $23,174.87 | $23,586.07 $24,624.47
FORD DUTY F2B |Unleaded |F2504X4 R/C PUSRW $39,005.00 | $25,712.87 | $26,124.07 $27,162.47
FORD DUTY F3A |Unleaded |F3504X2 R/C PUSRW $37,280.00 | $25,801.87 | $26,212.07 $27,251.47
FORD DUTY F3B |Unleaded |F3504X4 R/C PUSRW $40,180.00 | $27,343.87 | $27,754.07 $28,793.47
FORD DUTY F3C |Unleaded |F3504X2 R/C PUDRW $38,730.00 | $26,274.87 | $26,686.07 $27,724.47
FORD DUTY F3D |Unleaded |F3504Xx4 R/C PUDRW $41,625.00 | $29,212.87 | $29,624.07 $30,662.47
FORD DUTY W2A |Unleaded [F2504X2 Crew PU SRW $40,130.00 | $26,711.87 | $27,123.07 | $27,825.47
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FORD DUTY w28 |Unleaded [F250 4x4 crew PU SRW $43,030.00 | $29,253.87 | $29,665.07 | $30,367.47
FORD DUTY w3A |Unleaded [F350 4x2 Crew PU SRW $41,305.00 | $28,542.87 | $28,953.07 | $29,656.47
FORD DUTY w3B |Unleaded |[F350 4x4 Crew PU SRW $44,210.00 | $31,689.87 | $32,100.07 | $32,802.47
FORD DUTY wac [Unleaded [F350 4x2 Crew PU DRW $42,950.00 | $30,787.87 | $31,198.07 | $31,903.47
FORD DUTY w3D [Unleaded |F350 4x4 Crew PU DRW $45,850.00 | $33,129.87 | $33,540.07 | $34,245.47
FORD DUTY w4D |Diesel F450 4X4 Crew Cab DRW $57,655.00 | $46,904.65 | $47,316.95 | $48,218.85
FORD DUTY x2A |Unleaded |F250 4x2 Super PU SRW $38,445.00 | $25,243.87 | $25,655.07 | $26,357.47
FORD DUTY x28 |Unleaded |F250 4X4 Super PU SRW $41,345.00 | $27,785.87 | $28,192.07 | $28,894.47
FORD DUTY x3A |Unleaded |F350 4x2 Super PU SRW $39,620.00 | $27,475.87 | $27,886.07 | $28,588.47
FORD DUTY x3B |Unleaded |F350 4X4 Super PU SRW $42,520.00 | $29,217.87 | $29,427.07 $30,330.47
FORD DUTY x3c |Unleaded [F350 4x2 Super PUDRW $41,265.00 | $28,919.87 | $29,130.07 | $30,033.47
FORD DUTY x3D |Unleaded [F350 4X4 Super PUDRW $44,160.00 | $32,257.87 | $32,467.07 | $33,372.47
FORD FUSION P0G |Unleaded [SFwD $22,995.00 | $17,729.78 | $17,385.58 | $18,495.18
FORD FUSION Pos |Hybrid  |SEPHEV FWD $31,995.00 | $27,620.78 | $26,813.58 | $30,171.18
FORD FUSION poL [Hybrid  [sHYBRID $26,170.00 | $22,973.78 | $23,002.58 | $25,203.18
FORD MUSTANG PST |Unleaded [V6 Coupe $27,535.00 | $23,714.28 | $23,227.08 | $23,890.68
FORD TAURUS P2D |Unleaded [SE FWD $28,220.00 | $20,229.03 | $20,778.83 | $21,529.43
FORD TRANSIT EIC |Unleaded [0 e amna nomb srans comn - oo | $35,285.00 | $24,714.06 | $25,904.66 | $27,088.86
FORD TRANSIT EID [Unleaded [o o nic manme saons come s o $35,935.00 | $25,284.06 | $26,475.66 | $27,658.86
FORD TRANSIT E1Y |Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $35,400.00 | $22,808.06 | $23,876.66 | $25,073.86
FORD TRANSIT E1Z |Unleaded [CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $35,250.00 | $22,676.06 | $23,744.66 | $24,941.86
FORD TRANSIT E2C |Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $36,985.00 | $26,205.06 | $27,396.66 | $28,602.86
FORD TRANSIT E2D |Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 8600# GVWR $37,635.00 | $26,775.06 | $27,967.66 | $29,172.86
FORD TRANSIT E2Y |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $36,250.00 | $23,553.06 | $24,622.66 | $25,844.86
FORD TRANSIT E9Z |Unleaded |CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $36,100.00 | $23,421.06 | $24,490.66 | $25,709.86
EXTENDED LENGTH DUAL SLIDING CARGO DOORS
FORD TRANSIT F4U |Unleaded |9950# GVWR DRW $43,525.00 | $31,944.06 | $33,135.66 | ©35,931.86
EXTENDED LENGTH SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR
FORD TRANSIT F4X" |unleaded |9950# GVWR DRwW $42,875.00 | $31,374.06 | $32,565.66 | ©35,361.86
FORD TRANSIT F6P |Unleaded |T350 HD DRW CUTAWAY W/MED WHEELBASE $32,658.00 | $22,418.06 | $23,433.66 | $24,600.86
FORD TRANSIT F6Z |Unleaded |T350 HD CHASSIS CAB W/MED WHEELBASE $33,233.00 | $22,422.06 | $23,438.66 | $24,604.86
FORD TRANSIT F8P |Unleaded [T350 HD DRW CUTAWAY W/LONG WHEELBASE $33,108.00 | $22,313.06 | $23,328.66 | $24,495.86
FORD TRANSIT F8Z |Unleaded |T350 HD DRW CHASSIS CAB W/LONG WHEELBASE $33'683_00 522,817.06 523,833.66 $24,999,86
FORD TRANSIT F9P |Unleaded |WHEELBASE $33,858.00 | $22,971.06 | $23,986.66 | $25,153.86
FORD TRANSIT F9Z |Unleaded |T350 HD DRW CHASSIS CAB W/LONG WHEELBASE | $34,433.00 | $23,475.06 | $24,991.66 | $26,157.86
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FORD TRANSIT KIC [Unleaded [SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $38,925.00 | $27,610.06 | $28,774.66 | $29,957.86
FORD TRANSIT K1y [Unleaded [SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR 8600% GVWR $38,475.00 | $26,693.06 | $27,001.66 | $28,185.86
FORD TRANSIT K1z [Unleaded [cARGO DOOR 8600# GVWR $38,325.00 | $26,561.06 | $26,870.66 | $28,053.86
FORD TRANSIT RiC [Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $36,235.00 | $25,547.06 | $26,738.66 | $27,922.86
FORD TRANSIT R1ID [Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 9000# GVWR $36,885.00 | $26,118.06 | $27,308.66 | $28,492.86
FORD TRANSIT R1Y |Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $36,350.00 | $23,641.06 | $24,709.66 | $25,907.86
FORD TRANSIT R1Z [Unleaded [CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $36,200.00 | $23,510.06 | $24,578.66 | $25,775.86
FORD TRANSIT R2C |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $37,935.00 | $27,039.06 | $28,230.66 | $29,436.86
FORD TRANSIT R2D [Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 9000# GVWR $38,585.00 | $27,609.06 | $28,800.66 | $30,006.86
FORD TRANSIT R2U_|Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 9000# GVWR $40,735.00 | $29,496.06 | $30,687.66 | $31,893.86
FORD TRANSIT R2x_[Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $40,085.00 | $28,926.06 | $30,116.66 | $31,323.86
FORD TRANSIT R2Y |Unleaded [PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $37,245.00 | $24,426.06 | $25,456.66 | $26,678.86
FORD TRANSIT R2Z [Unleaded [CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $37,095.00 | $24,294.06 | $25,324.66 | $26,543.86
EXTENDED LENGTH DUAL SLIDING DOORS 9000#
FORD TRANSIT RV lunleaded [cvwR $42,035.00 | $30,636.06 | $31,828.66 | $33,033.86
EXTENDED LENGTH SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR
FORD TRANSIT R3X |Unleaded [9000# GVWR $41,385.00 | $30,066.06 | $31,257.66 | $32/463.86
FORD TRANSIT rRsP_|Unleaded [GVWR $30,988.00 | $20,452.06 | $21,467.66 | $22,633.86
FORD TRANSIT R5Z |Unleaded |GVWR $31,558.00 | $20,952.06 | $21,967.66 | $23,134.86
FORD TRANSIT R7P_|Unleaded [GVWR $31,183.00 | $20,622.06 | $21,638.66 | $22,805.86
FORD TRANSIT R7Z |Unleaded [GVWR $31,758.00 | $21,127.06 | $22,142.66 | $23,309.86
EXTENDED LENGTH DUAL SLIDING DOORS 10360#
FORD TRANSIT %Y |unleaded |GvwR DRW $45,740.00 | $33,841.06 | $33,442.66 | $34,648.86
EXTENDED LENGTH SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR
FORD TRANSIT S |Unleaded [10360# GVWR DRW $45,090.00 | $33,270.06 | $32,872.66 | »34.077.86
FORD TRANSIT s6P |Unleaded [GVWR $32,913.00 | $22,642.06 | $23,657.66 | $24,823.86
FORD TRANSIT s6z |Unleaded [GVWR $33,483.00 | $22,642.06 | $23,658.66 | $24,823.86
FORD TRANSIT s8p_|Unleaded [10360# GVWR $33,358.00 | $22,532.06 | $23,548.66 | $24,714.86
FORD TRANSIT s8z_[Unleaded [10360# GVWR $33,938.00 | $23,041.06 | $24,056.66 | $25,223.86
FORD TRANSIT soP |Unleaded [WHEELBASE 10360# GVWR $34,108.00 | $23,189.06 | $24,205.66 | $25,372.86
FORD TRANSIT soz_[Unleaded [10360# GVWR $34,683.00 | $23,696.06 | $24,711.66 | $25,876.86
EXTENDED LENGTH W/SLDG PASS SIDE CARGO DR
FORD TRANSIT uax_|Unleaded |10360# GVWR $45,275.00 | $32,683.06 | $33,843.66 | $35897.86
FORD TRANSIT wip [Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 9500% GVWR $38,135.00 | $27,214.06 | $28,406.66 | $29,589.86
FORD TRANSIT w1y [Unleaded [PASS cARGO DOOR 9500 GVWR $38,405.00 | $25,444.06 | $26,512.66 | $27,709.86
FORD TRANSIT w1z [Unleaded [cARGO DOOR 9500% GVWR $38,255.00 | $25,313.06 | $26,381.66 | $27,578.86
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FORD TRANSIT w2C |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 9500# GVWR $39,185.00 | $28,135.06 | $29,327.66 $30,532.86
FORD TRANSIT W2D |Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 9500# GVWR $39,836.00 | $28,706.06 | $29,897.66 $31,102.86
FORD TRANSIT W2U |Unleaded [SLIDING DOORS 95004 GVWR $41,985.00 | $30,592.06 | $31,784.66 $32,989.86
FORD TRANSIT w2X |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 9500# GVWR $41,335.00 | $30,022.06 | $31,214.66 $32,419.86
FORD TRANSIT w2y |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 9500# GVWR $39,255.00 | $26,191.06 | $27,258.66 $28,482.86
FORD TRANSIT w2z |Unleaded |CARGO DOOR 9500# GVWR $39,105.00 | $26,059.06 | $27,127.66 $28,350.86
EXTENDED LENGTH DUAL SLIDING DOORS 9500#
FORD TRANSIT W3U lynleaded |GVWR $43,285.00 | $31,734.06 | $32,924.66 | $34131.86
EXTENDED LENGTH SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR
FORD TRANSIT W3X lUnleaded [9500# GVWR $42,635.00 | $31,163.06 | $32,354.66 | $33,559.86
FORD TRANSIT wsP |Unleaded |GVWR $31,758.00 | $21,627.06 | $22,642.66 $23,809.86
FORD TRANSIT W5Z |Unleaded |GVWR $32,333.00 | $22,132.06 | $23,148.66 $24,313.86
FORD TRANSIT W7P |Unleaded |GVWR $31,958.00 | $21,803.06 | $22,818.66 $23,985.86
FORD TRANSIT W7z |Unleaded |GVWR $32,533.00 | $22,307.06 | $23,323.66 $24,489.86
FORD TRANSIT woc |Unleaded |PASS CARGO DOOR 9500# GVWR $37,485.00 | $26,644.06 | $27,835.66 $29,019.86
FORD TRANSIT X2C |Unleaded [SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $42,625.00 | $30,859.06 | $32,020.66 $33,574.86
FORD TRANSIT X2X |Unleaded [SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $44,075.00 | $32,132.06 | $33,292.66 $34,846.86
FORD TRANSIT X2Y |Unleaded |SLIDING PASS CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $41,390.00 | $29,273.06 | $30,248.66 $31,566.86
FORD TRANSIT X2Z |Unleaded |CARGO DOOR 9000# GVWR $41,240.00 | $29,143.06 | $30,116.66 $31,434.86
FORD | TRANSIT CONNECT | E6E |[Unleaded |dls $25,270.00 | $21,025.83 | $21,324.63 $22,267.23
FORD | TRANSIT CONNECT [ E7E |Unleaded [wi/fixed gls $26,270.00 | $21,913.78 | $22,212.63 $23,155.23
FORD [ TRANSIT CONNECT [ E9E |Unleaded [up/down wirr Iftgate wifxd gls $28,165.00 | $23,587.83 | $23,886.63 $24,882.23
FORD | TRANSIT CONNECT | se6E |Unleaded [180 degsym drs $25,270.00 | $21,025.83 | $21,324.63 $22,267.23
FORD | TRANSIT CONNECT | s7E [Unleaded [180 degsym drs $26,270.00 | $21,913.83 | $22,212.63 $23,155.23
WAGON XL LWB - dual sldg drs 2nd row gls slides
FORD | TRANSIT CONNECT | sge |Unleaded |up/down 3rd row fixed gls wirr 180 deg sym drs $28165.00 | $23,587.83 | $23,886.63 | ©24,882.23
FORD Ecosprot s2F |Unleaded |[SFwD $18,993.28
FORD Ecosprot Ss3F |Unleaded [S4x4 $20,441.28
FORD Utility Interceptor K8A |Unleaded [interceptor Utility AWD 3.7L V6 $29,307.18
FORD| Sedan Interceptor P2L |Unleaded [Interceptori Sedan FWD 3.5L V6 $25,375.68
FORD Sedan Interceptor P2M |Unleaded |interceptori Sedan AWD 3.7L V6 $26,429.68
FORD F150 Responder W1P |Unleaded |F150 Responder 4x4 3.5L V6 Ecoboost $33,631.00
FORD Fl;ig;o?]z;zrrid POA Unleaded Fusion Hybrid Responder Sedan 2.0L I-4cyl $27,371.58
CORD F“Si";eps';g:ge':yb”d POW |Unleaded |Fusion Plug-in Hybrid Responder Sedan 2.0L I-4cyl $32,860.68
FORD Ranger R1A |Unleaded |[Ranger Super Cab 4x2 chassis $23,349_20
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FORD Ranger R1E |Unleaded [Ranger Super Cab 4x2 pickup $23,619.20
FORD Ranger R1F |[Unleaded [Ranger Super Cab 4x4 pickup $25,252.20
FORD Ranger R4E |Unleaded [Ranger Crew Cab 4x2 pickup $24,611.20
FORD Ranger R4F |Unleaded |Ranger Crew Cab 4x4 pickup $27,244.20
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