SERIAL 200125-C TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLES AND COMPONENTS

DATE OF LAST REVISION: November 08, 2023 CONTRACT END DATE: November 30, 2025

CONTRACT PERIOD THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2024 2023 2025

TO: All Departments
FROM: Office of Procurement Services
SUBJECT: Contract for TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLES AND COMPONENTS

Attached to this letter is published an effective purchasing contract for products and/or services to be
supplied to Maricopa County activities as awarded by Maricopa County on December 11, 2019.

All purchases of products and/or services listed on the attached pages of this letter are to be obtained
from the vendor holding the contract. Individuals are responsible to the vendor for purchases made
outside of contracts. The contract period is indicated above.

Yowwn Tipre—

Kevin Tyne, Chief Procurement Officer
Office of Procurement Services

LN/mm
Attach

Copy to: Office of Procurement Services
Suzi Wil MCDOT
Efren Guevara, MCDOT
Martie Billings, MCDOT
Kyle Randall, MCDOT

(Please remove Serial 13043-C from your contract notebooks)



SERIAL 200125-C

ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC., DEPT LA 24173 PASADENA, CA 91185-4173

SERIAL: 200125-C

NIGP CODE: 55089

RESPONDENT'S NAME:

Econolite Control Products, Inc.

COUNTY VENDOR NUMBER:

VC0000009491

ADDRESS:

Dept LA 24173 Pasadena, CA 91185-4173
1250 N. Tustin Avenue Anaheim, CA 92807

P.O. ADDRESS:

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

714-630-3700

FACSIMILE NUMBER:

714-630-5120

WEB SITE:

www.econolite.com

CONTACT (REPRESENTATIVE):

Lori Maclntyre

REPRESENTATIVE'S E-MAIL ADDRESS:

Lmacintyre@econolite.com

YES NO
WILL ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES TO PURCHASE FROM THIS
CONTRACT: [X] [1]
WILL ACCEPT PROCUREMENT CARD FOR PAYMENT: [X] [ ]
| PAYMENT TERMS: [X]NET 30 DAYS |
Title Unit Price Qty | UofM Bidder Notes

Traffic & Standard Signal Poles-Provide
Catalogs

Freight Charges to applied
for Poles section only
based on weight of the
$222,161.30 1 each | poles and quantities
ordered. Freight to be
determined at time of the
order.

Traffic Signal Hardware-Provide Catalog

$159,003.00 1 each

Traffic Signal Controllers-Provide Catalog

$55,650.00 1 each

Traffic Signal Controller Cabinets-Provide
Catalog

$118,844.11 1 each

Videodetection Systems-Provide Catalog

$18,802.31 1 each

Removed Eff. 12-01-2023
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CONTRACT: [ X ] 


SERIAL 200125-C

ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

Added Effective 12-01-2023

ATTACHMENT D ADDITIOANL PRICING

PARTS CATALOG PERCENT
ghe of Poles | DESIGNATION & CATALOG DISCOUNT D e TNCE
Components BATE PRICE FROM LIST PRICE CONTRACTOR’S
ate 10/28/2019 PRICE
. Catalo % Sell Price After | Est .
Categories: Part Code List Pr?ce Discount Discount Shipping Weight
T 4738-Type-A-14 $1,064.00 [ 5% $1,010.80 180 lIbs
4738-Type-A-16 $1,182.00 | 5% $1,122.90 210 lbs
4738-Type-A-18 $1,528.00 | 5% $1,451.60 310 lbs
PR 4 740-Type-E $7,832.00 | 5% $7,440.40 300 lbs
4740-E-MA-12 $1,514.00 | 5% $1,438.30 90 lbs
4740-E-MA-15 $1,540.00 | 5% $1,463.00 110 lbs
4740-E-MA-18 $1,632.00 | 5% $1,550.40 135 lbs
4740-E-MA-20 $1,806.00 | 5% $1,715.70 175 lbs
P 4 741-Type-F $10,162.00 | 5% $9,653.90 450 lbs
4741-F-MA-6 $1,414.00 | 5% $1,343.30 45 lbs
4741-F-MA-8 $1,428.00 | 5% $1,356.60 55 lbs
4741-F-MA-10 $1,44000 | 5% $1,368.00 65 lbs
4741-F-MA-12 $1,478.00 | 5% $1,404.10 95 lbs
4741-F-MA-15 $1,502.00 | 5% $1,426.90 115 lbs
4741-F-MA-18 $1,640.00 | 5% $1,558.00 140 lbs
4741-F-MA-20 $1,806.00 | 5% $1,715.70 175 lbs
T 4 742-Type-J $12,190.00 | 5% $11,580.50 675 lbs
4742-J-MA-20 $4,480.00 | 5% $4,256.00 300 lbs
4742-J-MA-25 $4,682.00 | 5% $4,447.90 335 lbs
4742-J-MA-30 $5,110.00 | 5% $4,854.50 425 lbs
4742-J-MA-35 $6,232.00 | 5% $5,920.40 640 lbs
4742-J-MA-40 $6,762.00 | 5% $6,423.90 760 Ibs
R £ 743-TypeQ $13,488.00 | 5% $12,813.60 1050 [ lbs
4743-Q-LMA-15 $1,484.00 | 5% $1,409.80 100 lbs
4743-Q-LMA-20 $1,806.00 | 5% $1,715.70 175 lbs
4743-Q-SMA-20 $4,480.00 | 5% $4,256.00 300 lbs
4743-Q-SMA-25 $4,682.00 | 5% $4,447.90 335 lbs
4743-Q-SMA-30 $5,108.00 | 5% $4,852.60 425 lbs
4743-Q-SMA-35 $6,232.00 | 5% $5,920.40 640 lbs
4743-Q-SMA-40 $6,762.00 | 5% $6,423.90 760 lbs
R 748-TypeK $14,716.00 | 5% $13,980.20 925 lbs
4748-K-MA-45 $12,768.00 | 5% $12,129.60 1100 | Ibs
4748-K-MA-45 $12,894.00 | 5% $12,249.30 1200 | Ibs
4748-K-MA-45 $13,020.00 | 5% $12,369.00 1300 | Ibs
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

Hardware & Fittings

Electronic Components Cat.alog % Sell Price
Part Date: 10/28/19 List UOM | piscount | After
Number Description Price Discount
44623P5 FLASHER, 2 CKT 15A SOLID STATE 810 $4400 | Ea 35% $28.60
1084-020 Power Supply 1.25 Amp $425.00 | Ea 35% $276.25
1084-046 Power Supply 5 Amp $872.00 | Ea 35% $566.80
1084-049 Power Supply 3 Amp $395.00 | Ea 35% $256.75
1084-050 Power Supply 3 Amp ECPI $395.00 | Ea 35% $256.75
NO BID Tee, 1-1/2" reamed w/set screw
NO BID Pole, PB5100-L
E1001P2F Elbow, 1-1/2" reamed w/set screw $11.00 | Ea 35% $7.15
E1004P2F Elbow, 1-1/2" serrated, one port $22.00 | Ea 35% $14.30
NO BID Tee, 1-1/2" reamed on outlet w/set screw
NO BID Tee, 1-1/2" reamed on run 1 port
NO BID Door, Horiz term comp
NO BID Hub Plate
NO BID Terminal Compartment
NO BID Nipple
NO BID Coupling
E1205P5 Ornament Cap, short $4.00 | Ea 35% $2.60
E1206P5 Ornament Cap, long $4.70 | Ea 35% $3.06
NO BID Post top adapter
NO BID Elbow
NO BID Lock Nipple
NO BID Post top adapter
NO BID Mast Arm
NO BID Pole Plate
44623P8 FLASHER, 2 CKT 15A SOLID STATE 204 $4500 | Ea 35% $29.25
31637P11 Surge Arrestor Edco SHA-1210-IRS $236.00 | Ea 35% $153.40
44665G55 | Detector Card LM-622-E $181.00 | Ea 35% $117.65
160-1003-501 | BIU (Bus Interface Unit) $230.00 | Ea 35% $149.50
1133-141 MMU2-16LEip $1,943.00 | Ea 35% $1,262.95
37006P2 Load Switches 510 $42.00 | Ea 35% $27.30
1084-003 Power Supply 1.25 Amp ECPI PS-200 $436.00 | Ea 35% $283.40
NO BID Police Manual PB - 12'
9464238P2 | Police Manual PB - 6' $38.00 | Ea 35% $24.70
NO BID Police Manual PB - 3' $80.00 | Ea 0% $80.00
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

MS-5005-CCF-PNC Flash Drive, 2

$100.00

GB, Custom Configuration-Flash

Intellicross-XXX

Drive, IntelliCros

Ea

0%

$100.00

MS-5005-CCP-4-PNC Flash Drive, 2

$120.00

GB, Custom Configuration-Pelco

Intellicross-XXX

Added for 4 Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$120.00

MS-5005-CVMCF-PNC Flash Drive,

$140.00

2 GB, Custom Voice Message &

Configuration-Flash Drive,

Intellicross-XXX

IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$140.00

MS-5005-CVMCP-2-PNC Flash

$460.00

Drive, 2 GB, Custom Voice Message

& Configuration-Pelco Added for 2

Intellicross-XXX

Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$460.00

MS-5005-CVMCP-4-PNC Flash

$840.00

Drive, 2 GB, Custom Voice Message

& Configuration-Pelco Added for 4

Intellicross-XXX

Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$840.00

MS-5005-CVMCP-6-PNC Flash

$1,300.00

Drive, 2 GB, Custom Voice Message

& Configuration-Pelco Added for 6

Intellicross-XXX

Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$1,300.00

MS-5005-CVMCP-8-PNC Flash

$1,400.00

Drive, 2 GB, Custom Voice Message

& Configuration-Pelco Added for 8

Intellicross-XXX

Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$1,400.00

MS-5005-CVMCP-10-PNC Flash

$80.00

Drive, 2 GB, Custom Voice Message

& Configuration-Pelco Added for 10

Intellicross-XXX

Buttons, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$80.00

MS-5005-CVMF-PNC Flash Drive, 2

$48.00

GB, Custom Voice Message-Flash

Intellicross-XXX

Drive, IntelliCross

Ea

0%

$48.00

SE-2171-PNC Adapter Assy, 9" x 12",

$48.00

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

$48.00

SE-2171-PXX Adapter Assy, 9" x

$60.00

12", IntelliCross, Alum, Powder

Intellicross-XXX

Coated (Specify Color)

Ea

0%

$60.00

SE-2174-PNC Adapter Assy, 9" x 15",

$35.00

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

$35.00

SE-2174-PXX Adapter Assy, 9" x

$35.00

15", IntelliCross, Alum, Powder

Intellicross-XXX

Coated (Specify Color)

Ea

0%

$35.00

SE-2175-PNC Adapter Assy, 9" x 3", IntelliCross,

$180.00
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

$180.00

SE-2175-PXX Adapter Assy, 9" x 3",

$180.00

IntelliCross, Alum, Powder Coated

Intellicross-XXX

(Specify Color)

Ea

0%

$180.00

SE-2180-04-PNC Mounting Assy,

$200.00

Push Button Extender w/ 4" Nipple

Intellicross-XXX

for IntelliCross Stations, Alum

Ea

0%

$200.00

SE-2180-06-PNC  Mounting Assy, Push

$200.00

Intellicross-XXX

for IntelliCross Stations, alum

Ea

0%

$200.00

SE-2180-12-PNC  Mounting Assy,

$60.00

Push Button Extender w/ 12" Nipple

Intellicross-XXX

for IntelliCross Stations, Alum

Ea

0%

$60.00

SE-2180-16-PNC Mounting Assy,

$120.00

Push Button Extender w/ 16" Nipple

Intellicross-XXX

for IntelliCross Stations, Alum

Ea

0%

$120.00

SE-2526-PNC...... Installation Driver Kit,

$1,700.00

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

$1,700.00

SE-2900-PXX APS Assy, Intelli-

$18.00

Cross w/ Single Arrow, for 5" x 7-3/4"

Sign, Alum, Powder Coated (Specify

Intellicross-XXX

Color)

Ea

0%

$18.00

SE-2901-PXX APS Assy, Intelli-

$18.00

Cross, Custom Configured w/ Single

Arrow, for 5" x 7-3/4" Sign, Alum,

Powder Coated (Specify Color) (See

Intellicross-XXX

note below)......

Ea

0%

$18.00

SE-6170-2-P33 Arrow, Double for

$3,400.00

APS IntelliCross Push Button, w/

Intellicross-XXX

Hardware, Alum, Gloss Black

Ea

0%

$3,400.00

SE-6172-PNC CIU, Communication

$6.00

Interface Unit, Compact for APS

Intellicross-XXX

button

Ea

0%

$6.00

SE-6175-PNC Noise Baffle, APS, AP Armaflex

$240.00

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

$240.00

SE-6186-PNC External Speaker

$580.00

Beacon, for Intelli-Cross, 4-Terminal

Intellicross-XXX

Plug, 9' 6" Lead

Ea

0%

$580.00

SE-6190-PNC ...PIM, Power

$8,000.00

Interface Module 2.0, APS

Intellicross-XXX

IntelliCross Button

Ea

0%

$8,000.00

SP-1055-TX-2-S-PXX Standard 2

$10,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single

Arrow, CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15"
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

Intellicross-XXX

Signs and Adapters, Alum

Ea

0%

$10,000.00

SP-1055-TX-4-S-PXX Standard 4

$8,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single

Arrow, CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15"

Intellicross-XXX

Signs and Adapters, Alum

Ea

0%

$8,000.00

SP-1055-TX-6-S-PXX Standard 6

$8,560.00

$8,560.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single

Arrow, CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15"

Intellicross-XXX

Signs and Adapters, Alum

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-7-S-PXX...... Standard 7

$18,000.00

$18,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single

Arrow, CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15"

Intellicross-XXX

Signs and Adapters, Alum

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-8-S-PXX Standard 8

$22,500.00

$22,500.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-10-S-PXX Standard 10

$27,000.00

$27,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-12-S-PXX Standard 12

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-16-S-PXX Standard 16

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-2-C-PXX Custom 2

$19,000.00

$19,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-8-C-PXX Custom 8

$23,000.00

$23,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

SP-1055-TX-10-C-PXX Custom 10

$13,000.00

$13,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea | 0%

SP-1055-TX-12-C-PXX Custom 12

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow, CIU-
C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea | 0%

PARTS CATALOG DESIGNATION & DATE DT i
Category: Date: 10/28/2019

Part Number Description Catalo%hi(:set UoM
TBD TS2-Type 1 Plug-N-Go P44" $11,274.00 EA
TBD TS2-Type 1 Plug-N-Go R77" $13,440.00 EA
TBD TS2-Type 1 Plug-N-Go P44" $13,440.00 EA
ATCCTBD ATC Cabinet R77 Painted Solar application 16/48 $12,477.00 EA
44693G234 32 Channel CMU ATCC 48VDC $435.00 EA
44693G235 ATCC SIU ITS Serial Interface $154.00 EA
44693G237 ATCC High Density SP 48VDC $139.00 EA
44693G238 CMU Auxiliary Display Unit $322.00 EA
44665G88 4-Channel Detectors $153.00 EA
SK3051P8 Extender Base for P or R Cabinets 18" $1,040.00 EA
SK3051P6 Extender Base for P or R Cabinets 12" $336.00 EA
SK3051P3 Extender Base for P or R Cabinets 15" $414.00 EA
171-1910-501 Cabinet Tester 84 4 $722.00 EA
171-1910-502 Cabinet Tester 8 4 4 FYA $722.00 EA
171-1910-503 Cabinet Tester 8 4 4 FYA $722.00 EA
171-1910-504 Cabinet Tester 8 4 4 $722.00 EA
171-1910-505 Cabinet Tester 8 4 4 FYA $722.00 EA
171-1910-507 Cabinet Tester 16 Channel *recommended $722.00 EA
BIU-700 BIU (Bus Interface Unit) $519.00 EA
744500010 DC ISOLATOR, 242, PDC DCI-82 $57.00 EA
764200025 206L P/S $225.00 EA
33550G3 ASSY, CABLE, TS2, RS-485 $67.00 EA
219-1013-001 CABLE, DATA & PWR, 1000 $2.05 FT
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ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

54408P38 RELAY 120VAC 3PDT 5 AMP $38.00 EA
44665G55 Detector 2 channel RM $181.00 EA
44665G59 Detector 2 channel RM W/Timing $242.00 EA
44623P5 FLASHER, 2 CKT 15A SOLID STATE 810 $44.00 EA
44623P8 FLASHER, 2 CKT 15A SOLID STATE 204 $45.00 EA
37006P2 Load Switches 510 $42.00 EA
44623P5 FLASHER, 2 CKT 15A SOLID STATE $44.00 EA
54408P38 RELAY 120VAC 3PDT 5 AMP $38.00 EA
1133-128 MMU2-16LEip $1,943.00 EA
1133-141 MMU2-16LEip-E $1,943.00 EA
1133-138 MMU2-16LE $1,637.00 EA
1133-184 MMU2-16LE-E $1,637.00 EA
1133-342 MMU Programming Card MMU2-16LE-PGM-CARD $107.00 EA
MMU-EXT MMU Program Card Cabinet Testing $383.00 EA
1084-003 Power Supply 1.25 Amp ECPI $436.00 EA
1084-020 Power Supply 1.25 Amp $425.00 EA
1084-046 Power Supply 5 Amp $872.00 EA
1084-049 Power Supply 3 Amp $395.00 EA
1084-050 Power Supply 3 Amp ECPI $395.00 EA
756700010 Detector Safetran LM222 $113.00 EA
756700020 Detector Safetran LMD222 $113.00 EA
44623P11 Flashers Safetran $34.00 EA
744500040 Isolators DC Safetran $52.00 EA
37006P5 Load Switch Safetran $37.00 EA
1084-044 Power Supply 5 Amp Safetran PS206L-SF $296.00 EA
1133-042 I\Pﬂ(())v:gtr Supply 5 Amp Safetran PS206L-SF Rack $665.00 EA
764200025 Power Supply 5 Amp Safetran TC206L $225.00 EA
767104800 Flash Transfer Relay (FTR) Safetran $36.00 EA
1089-201 Zinc Blue 2 Inverter $3,629.00 EA
1089-202 Zinc Blue 2 Hinge Battery $3,814.00 EA
1089-204 Zinc Blue 2 Nema Battery $3,814.00 EA
ZB2-AC-Cable-INT | Zinc Blue 2 AC Power Cable $69.00 EA
éﬁﬁ;ﬁ‘c'cab'e' Zinc Blue 2AC Power Cable Daisy Chain $65.00 | EA
ZB2-DC-Cable Zinc Blue 2 DC Cable $389.00 EA
ZB2-Power-Cover | Zinc Blue 2 Cover AC $7.50 EA
UPS-3439ASM Zinc Blue 2 Brackets Under shelf $165.00 EA
1089-220 Zinc Blue 2 PIM $963.00 EA
Speedy Sleeve Zinc Blue 2 Speedy Sleeve $30.00 EA
Spacer Bar Zinc Blue 2 Spacer Bar $15.00 EA
TBS KIT Zinc Blue 2 Incoming Power Block $124.00 EA
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STCAB2656 341A ANOD CAB ARIZONA $4,453.00 EA
9464238P10 MANUAL SWITCH, SPST, 72" L $110.00 EA
34030G1 ASSY, DETECTOR RACK, 16 CH,TS1 $588.00 EA
142-1002-501 ASSY, APPLICATIONS $692.00 EA
43029P2 QUENCHARC 47 OHM 1uF $34.00 EA
43029P2 QUENCHARC 47 OHM 1uF $34.00 EA
45010G8 ASSEMBLY, LOAD RESISTOR $41.00 EA
43029P2 QUENCHARC 47 OHM 1uF $33.00 EA
9464238P10 MANUAL SWITCH, SPST, 72" L $19.00 EA
171-1804-501 ASSY, CABLE, SDLC EXTENSION, 6' $59.75 EA
171-1153-501 ASSY, HUB, SDLC, DB15, 7 CONN $166.00 EA
171-1164-502 ASSY, CABLE, DET TEST P2-MALE P4 $115.50 EA
A700-1166-01 ASSY, ACP PRIMARY MODEL $2,859.00 EA
1080-008 GALAXY FIELD PROGRAMMING UNIT $440.00 EA
171-1369-502 GPS Garmin , 16X, W/DB25 CABLE $671.00 EA
AX5- AXIOM SINGLE RADIO $3,990.00 EA
BT-ETH BlueToad Ethernet System $4,000.00 EA
CAT-5-75 75' Cat-5 Cable $70.00 EA
CAT-5-150 150" Cat-5 Cable $110.00 EA
RT-#of Years ;}Lz%re‘snyslﬁzwySewices filtering and displaying data $660.00 Ea
Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo,
Alum
SE-2119-PNC Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo, $114.40 Ea
Alum, Powder Coated
SE-2119-PXX (Specify Color) $114.40 Ea
SE-2119-P29 chl)}:sr ?:gg,ra?(\)(l;r;g VI\'—/’asspor‘[ Push Button, Piezo, $114.40 Ea
SE-2119-P33 iﬁj\ﬁrélsossys Egg;d Passport Push Button, Piezo, $114.40 Ea
Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo,
Latching, Alum
SE-2119-LCH-PNC Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo, $114.40 Ea
Latching, Alum, Powder
SE-2119-LCH-PXX | Coated (Specify Color) $114.40 Ea
Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Pole
Mount, Alum
SE-2120-PNC Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Pole $133.50 Ea
Mount, Alum, Powder Coated
SE-2120-PXX (Specify Color) $133.50 Ea
Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo Latching, Round
Pole Mount, Alum
SE-2120-LCH-PNC Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo Latching, Round $133.50 Ea
Pole Mount, Alum,
SE-2120-LCH-PXX | Powder Coated (Specify Color) $133.50 Ea
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SE-2120-P29

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Pole
Mount, Alum, Federal Yellow

$133.50 Ea

SE-2120-P33

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Pole
Mount, Alum, Gloss Black

$133.50 Ea

SE-2120-P34

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Pole
Mount, Alum, Flat Black

$133.50 Ea

SE-2154-PNC

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, Round Flat Back,
Alum

Push Button Station Assy w/o Cable Guide, 5" x 7"
w/ Passport Piezo Cover,

$131.50 Ea

SE-2155-PNC

Alum

Push Button Station Assy w/ Cable Guide, 5" x 7"
w/ Passport Piezo Cover,

$162.30 Ea

SE-2156-PNC

Alum

Push Button Station Assy w/o Cable Guide, 9" x
12" w/ Passport Piezo Cover,

$162.30 Ea

SE-2159-PNC

Alum

Push Button Station Assy w/ Cable Guide, 9" x 12"
w/ Passport Piezo Cover,

$195.00 Ea

SE-2160-PNC

Alum

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$195.00 Ea

SE-2161-1-LCH-
PNC

Alum

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-1-LCH-
PXX

Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Alum, Gloss

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-1-P33

Black

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-1-PNC

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Alum

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-2-LCH-
PNC

Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-2-LCH-
PXX

Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-2-PNC

Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Cover Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Latching,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2161-2-PXX

Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Push Button Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport
Piezo, Pole Mnt, Alum,

$166.90 Ea

SE-2162-1-P29

Federal Yellow

Push Button Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport
Piezo, Pole Mnt, Alum,

$210.20 Ea
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SE-2162-1-P33

Gloss Black

$210.20 Ea

SE-2162-1-PNC

Push Button Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport
Piezo, Pole Mnt, Alum

Push Button Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport
Piezo, Pole Mnt, Alum,

$210.20 Ea

SE-2162-1-PXX

Powder Coated (Specify Color)

$210.20 Ea

SE-2163-PXX

Push Button Assy w/ Directional Arrow, Passport
Piezo, Flat Mnt, Alum,

$234.90 Ea

SE-2164-PNC

Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo, w/o
LED, Alum

Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo, w/o
LED, Alum, Powder

$108.60 Ea

SE-2164-PXX

Coated (Specify Color)

Cover Assy, Round Passport Push Button, Piezo,
w/o LED, Alum,Federal

$108.60 Ea

SE-2164-P29

Yellow

$108.60 Ea

SE-2165-PNC

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, w/o LED, Round
Pole Mount, Alum

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, w/o LED, Round
Pole Mount, Alum,

$126.90 Ea

SE-2165-PXX

Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, w/o LED, Round
Pole Mount, Alum,

$126.90 Ea

SE-2165-P29

Federal Yellow

$126.90 Ea

SE-2170-PNC

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-Hole Round
Pole Mount, Alum

Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-Hole Round
Pole Mount, Alum, Powder

$131.50 Ea

SE-2170-PXX

Coated (Specify Color)

$131.50 Ea

SE-2170-LCH-PNC

Latching, Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-
Hole Round Pole Mount, Alum Latching, Passport
Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-Hole Round Pole
Mount, Alum,

$131.50 Ea

SE-2170-LCH-PXX

Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Latching, Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-Hole
Round Pole Mount, Single

$131.50 Ea

SE-2170-LCH-1-
PXX

Arrow, Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color)

Latching, Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo, 4-Hole
Round Pole Mount,

$131.50 Ea

SE-21720-LCH-2-
PXX

Double Arrow, Alum, Powder Coated (Specify
Color)

$131.50 Ea

SE-2171-PNC

Adapter Assy, 9" x 12", IntelliCross, Alum

$131.50 Ea

SE-2171-PXX

Adapter Assy, 9" x 12", IntelliCross, Alum, Powder
Coated (Specify Color)

$131.50 Ea

SE-2172-PNC

Cover Assy, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Button,
Piezo, Alum

$114.40

Cover Assy, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Button,
Piezo, Alum, Powder

Ea



mailto:sales@amsignalinc.com
http://www.amsignalinc.com/

ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

SE-2172-PXX Coated (Specify Color) $114.40 Ea
Cover Assy, Latching, 4-Hole Round Passport Push
SE-2172-LCH-PNC Button, Piezo, Alum $114.40 Ea
Cover Assy, Latching, 4-Hole Round Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Alum,
Powder Coated (Specify Color) $114.40
SE-2172-LCH-PXX | Cover Assy, Latching, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Ea
Button, Piezo, Single
Al Al P if I 114.4
SE-2172-LCH-1- rrow, Alum, owc.jer Coated (Specify Color) $ 0 e
PXX Cover As_sy, Latching, 4-Hole Round Passport Push
Button, Piezo, Double
SE-2172-LCH-2- Arrow, Alum, Pow.der Coated (Specify CoI?r) $114.40
PXX Push Button Station Assy w/o Cable Guide, 9" x Ea
12" w/ Passport Piezo Cover
SE-2177-PXX w/o LED, Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color) $190.20 Ea
Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo w/o LED, 4-Hole
SE-2178-PNC Round Pole Mount, Alum $131.50 Ea
Cover Assy, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Button, $136.40
SE-2179-PNC Piezo w/o LED, Alum ’ Ea
Cover Assy, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Button,
Piezo w/o LED, Alum,
Powder Coated (Specify Color) $136.40
SE-2179-PXX Cover Assy, Rectangular Passport Push Button, Ea
Piezo, Alum, Powder Coated
(Specify Color) $117.30
SE-2182-PXX Passport Push Button Assy, Piezo Rectangular, Pole Ea
Mount, Alum, Powder
Coated (Specify Color) $146.00
SE-2183-PXX Cover Assy, 4-Hole Round Passport Push Button, Ea
Piezo w/ 2 Sets of
SP-4072-PXX Hardware, Alum, Powder Coated (Specify Color) $190.20 Ea
Sub Total $111,844.60
COBALT Price List
COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, NO RECEPTACLE NO
COB21100210000 DATAKEY, FSK CARD 9-PIN $4,216.50
COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, NO RECEPTACLE NO
C0OB21100310000 DATAKEY, FSK CARD 25-PIN $4,216.50
COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, RECEPTACLE NO
COB21110110000 DATAKEY, NO COMM CARD $3,730.50
COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, RECEPTACLE NO
C0OB21110110000 DATAKEY, NO COMM CARD $3,142.50
COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, RECEPTACLE NO
COB21110210000 DATAKEY, FSK CARD 9-PIN $4,339.50



mailto:sales@amsignalinc.com
http://www.amsignalinc.com/

ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC

SERIAL 200125-C

COBALT G-SERIES, TS1, RECEPTACLE WITH

COB21120110000 VB DATAKEY NG GO CARD $3,768.00
COB21120210000 gﬁBB”[‘)fokSEEYFT'ESSkTCS:F’{DRS')E_(;;FNPTACLE WITH $4,377.00
COB21120310000 gﬁBBA[‘)'ATTﬁ;(SEE(F?'ESSkTCTF’{DR%C_EIF;\ITACLE WITH $4,377.00
COB21130110000 gfﬁg;}?@?ﬁggg,’\AF;AE(?E;BAC"E WITH $3,809.25
COBC10100000000000 ggﬁf}"F'QBELSEERR'ES SOOI AR $2,856.75
COBC10121300000000 | CommRopiom o oW FOS V3.213 TS2-T1 $2,856.75
COBC10121400000000 | CormRoieR o o FO0 V3214 182 $2,856.75
COBC11100000000000 | SOSALT S-SERIES SMEOS T52-TH $2,979.75
COBC11100000000000 | SOSALT S-SERIES SMEOS T52-TH $2,744.25
COBC12100000000000 gg?ﬁkgf'SER'ES SMEOS CV TS2-T1 8MB $3,017.25
COBC12121200000000 | SOPALT C-SERIES SMEOS 3.2.12782-T1 8MB $3,017.25
COBC12121300000200 | Sooal] SORRES SM SOS 92,13 TS2-T1 8MS $3,017.25
COBC13100000000000 | SoPAcT &-SERIES SMEOS CVITS2-T1 32MB $3,058.50
COBC20100000000000 gggéﬂ ﬁ'OSEDF/i'EfKSE'\\"( EgSCTOS,\;/ TS2-2NO $3,041.25
COBC20121400000000 gggé‘lﬂ fC'fEFf\:gSC%“fM'\EAOS USAEZ2NO $3,041.25
COBC21100000000000 | Noord COERES S EOS TS1TS2-2 RECERT $3,164.25
COBC21100000000000 | ol SIOPRES SV EOS TO1/T52:2 RECERT $2,933.25
COBC21100050020000 | SOPALY S-OERIES SHLEOS OV WIPM 5002 $3,164.25
COBC21621000000000 | SOPALT S-SERIES SN EOS V3,210 TS1/TS2-2 $3,610.50
COBC22100000000000 gg?:kgﬁ\%ggﬁﬁm EOS TS1/TS2-2 8MB $3,201.75
COBC22120200009200 | SOBALT SSERIES S FOS V9.2.0219200 $3,201.75
COBC22120700009200 | SOBALT SSERIES SM FOS V3.2.0719200 $3,201.75
COBC22121100000000 | SODALT S-SERES SM EOS V3.2.11 TS1/TS2-2 $3,201.75
COBC22121200000000 | COBALT C-SERIES SM EOS V3.2.12 TS1/T52-2 $3.201 75

8MB DATAKEY
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COBALT C-SERIES SM EOS V3.2.12 L9200

COBC22121200000200 | SOBALT S SERES SM EC $3,201.75
COBC22121300000000 gﬁBB’E'XTg;(SEER'ES SMEOS V3.2.13 TS1/TS2-2 $3,201.75
COBC22121300000200 | SOBALT S-SERIES SM EOS V3.2.13 19200 $3,201.75
COBC22121400000000 | gol T S-oERIES SMEOS VS.2.14 TS1/TS2-2 $3,201.75
COBC22121500000000 | SODALT S-SERIES SMEOSVS.2.15T81/TS2-2 $3,201.75
cOBCz2121600000000 | COBALT C-SERIES SMEOS V3.2:16 TS1TS22 $3.201 75
COBC22121800000000 gﬁggﬂTgksEiR'Es SISO S22 $3,201.75
COBC22122000000000 | goopel S-SERIES SMEOS V3,220 TS1/TS2-2 $3,201.75
COBC2212400000000 COBALT C-SERIES SM EOS V3.2.24 TS1TS22 -
COBC22200000000000 | Soppbr oo nis SMEOS TS1/T52:2 BMB KEY $3,810.75
COBC22300000000000 | SOPALT S-OERIES SMIEOS TS1/TS2-2 8MB $3,810.75
COBC22500000000000 | SOPALT S-SERIES SM FOS TS1/TS52-2 BMB $3,810.75
COBC23100000000000 | SOPALT C-SERIES SMEOS TS1/T52-2 32MB $3,243.00
COBC23300000000000 | SooAT SOERIES SMEOS TS1/TS2-2 32MB $3,852.00
COBCRM12100000000000 | onaa E-SERIES R EOS S3X CTNO PWR $4,338.00
COBCRM12121600000000 ggTB/fl'('gf'SER'ES RMEOS V3.2.16 33X C1 8MB $4,338.00
COBCRM21100000000000 gg?ﬁk;ﬁ%ggﬁﬁ“" 2O ORISR GOIND XY $4,398.75
COBCRM21122400000000 | Souiey St XIES RMEOS V3.2.24 33X C1 $4,398.75
COBCRM22100000000000 | goil ] S-SERIES RMEOS CVCT PR CORD $4,439.25
COBCRM32121600000000 | S cLS-OERIES RIf £O5 V3216 NEMANO $4,338.00
COBCRM32121800000000 | SOPALL S-OERIES RIf OS5 V3218 NEMANO $4,338.00
COBCRM41100000000000 882@"{1 ngETFXEEYRMoEggl\%MA W/POWER $4,398.75
COBCRM41121400000000 | YOS Af('gﬁﬂ%sc'g\,’\'ﬂaos Wiz [FUIR GO $4,398.75
COBCRM42121600000000 | DALT SEOPRIES RETEOS V3216 NEMA $4,439.25
COBG10100000000000 | COBALT G-SERIES SM EOS CV TS2-T1 NO e

RECEPT/DATAKEY/COMM
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COBALT G-SERIES SM EOS TS2-T1

COBG11100000000000 | SOSAEL S5 $3,567.00
COBG12100000000000 | o orbl SOERIES TS2-TT EOS 8MB DATAKEY, $3,604.50
COBG12121100000000 gggﬁkg\fﬁg%gf&séﬂgos 3.2.11 8MB $3,604.50
COBG12600000000000 | SPS/LT SOERIES TS2-TT EOS SMB DATAKEY $4,050.75
COBG13100000000000 | SOPACT B-SERIES SMEQS CVTS2-T1 328 $3,645.75
COBG20100000000000 | SOBALT S-SERIES SN FQS 19111522 NO $3,669.00
COBG21100000000000 | SOBALT S-SERIES S EOS TS1/TS2-2 RECEPT $3,792.00
COBG22100000000000 | SOPALT B-SERIES BOS TS1/TS2-2 8MB $3,829.50
COBG22121100000000 | SORALI SOERIES SMEOS VER 3.2.11 TS1/TS2- $3,829.50
COBG22121400000000 | SODALI SOERIES SMEOS VER 3.2.14 TST/TS2- $3,829.50
cOBG22121600000000 | COBALT G-SERIES SMEOS VER 3216 TS1/TS2- $3.829.50
COBG22200000000000 | Bl T B SRS SHEDS TSTTS2-2 8B $4,438.50
COBG22300000000000 | COBALT G-SERIES TST EOS 8B DATAKEY FSK $4.438.50
COBGRM11100000000000 | SIPALT SSERIES EOS RAGKMOUNT NO PWR $4,800.00
COBGRM21100000000000 | Somny So=RIES B OB 883 CT POWER $4,920.00
COBGRM22100000000000 gﬁggﬂfkﬁfﬁg o VI TH PWR CORD, $4,960.50
COBGRM22100000005000 | SOpry STOERIES RM E08 33X C115000 $4,960.50
COBGRM22120400000000 | SODALT S-SERES B £OS 3.2.4 PWR CORD $4,960.50
COBGRM22121100000000 | SOBALT S-SERIES FOS RACKIOUNT W/PWR $4,960.50
COBGRM41100000000000 | Sopa-T &"SERIES RMEOS NEMA W/PWR $4,920.00
COBGRM42100000000000 | SOPALT S-SERIES RMEOS CVNEMA POWER $4,960.50
COBRM11120110000 882@%2@;&?&&5@%@”@8&& A $4,765.50
COBRM11120310000 COBALT G-SERIES RACKMOUNT, NO PWR N

CORD, 8MB DATAKEY, FSK CARD 25-PIN
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COBALT G-SERIES RACKMOUNT, WITH PWR

COBRM21110110000 CORD. NG DATA KEY MO COMM CARD $4,833.75
COBRM21110110000 88E’S‘:LS'SE?AEPEEF%%EMC%UI\N mp R $3,662.64
COBRM21120110000 gggggﬁésgﬂiigé%@ﬂggu& SppT R $4,874.25
COBRM21120610000 gﬁgg‘;}f@%ﬁfi?gﬁwoum WIPWR CORD $5,913.75
COBS12100120000 N A?(-S\Emgségfﬂzdé}x’;% RECEPTACLE $2,795.25
COBS12100127200 COBALT C-SERIES SM TS2-T1 SW VER 32.70.0 $2,795.25
COBS12110120000 gggﬁ‘kgﬁ'ﬁg%%m\;s&gb RECEPTACLE NO $3,558.75
COBS12110120000 ggfﬁ‘éﬁﬁg%gmzsg&% NSRS RSN $2,744.25
COBS 12120120000 COBALT C-SERIES, TS2-T1, 6MB DATAKEY, NO $2.955.75
COBS22100120000 ggsﬁkgﬁ-ﬁg%gfj&s&gg NACZACES MO $2,979.75
COBS22100220000 ggﬁfkgﬁfggf&gﬁ_ﬁﬁ RECEPTACLE NO $3,588.75
COBS22100320000 gg?ﬁkgﬁfgﬁffﬁgsgég% RECEPTACLE NO $3,588.75
COBS22110120000 gg?:k;ﬁﬁg%%%,\;SQAESCEPTACLE NO $3,102.75
COBS22110120000 ggTB:}'Zgﬁﬁg%Eoﬁ,\;SJASECEPTACLE NO $2,933.25
COBS22120120000 g%?égc%ﬁﬁgg?b;ss“ TS2-2, 8MB DATAKEY, $3,140.25
COBS22120220000 OB T STOERIES, TST, 8MB DATAKEY, FSK $4,571.25
COBS22120320000 e s B NIES, TST, 8MB DATAKEY, FSK $3,749.25
COBS22200120000 gggﬁkgﬁ-ﬁg%gm;s&%ov, IS RELAZESLS $2,979.75
COBSRM12110120000 882@%2}?&?5%5@%#%?&?& PWR $4,230.00
COBSRM12120120000 883@%5&%55?<.§¢,CNK3"88W ggRP[\)N R $4,270.50
COBSRM12120320000 | SOBALT SrSEIUES RIF ASCS LX BMB DATAKEY $4,980.75
COBSRM22110120000 | COBALT C-SERIES RACKMOUNT, WITH PWR P

CORD, NO DATAKEY, NO COMM CARD
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COBSRM22120120000

COBALT C-SERIES RACKMOUNT, WITH PWR
CORD, 8MB DATAKEY, NO COMM CARD

$4,371.75

COBSRM22120220000

COBALT C-SERIES RACKMOUNT, W/PWR
CORD, 8 MB DATAKEY, 9-PIN FSK TELEMETRY

$4,980.75

COBSRM22130120000

COBALT C-SERIES RM ASC/3 LX POWER CORD

32MB DATAKEY

$4,408.50

SP-1055-TX-8-S-PXX Standard 8

$22,500.00

$22,500.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-10-S-PXX Standard 10

$27,000.00

$27,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-12-S-PXX Standard 12

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-16-S-PXX Standard 16

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-2-C-PXX Custom 2

$19,000.00

$19,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-8-C-PXX Custom 8

$23,000.00

$23,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX

Ea

0%

SP-1055-TX-10-C-PXX Custom 10

$13,000.00

$13,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum
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Intellicross-XXX Ea | 0%

SP-1055-TX-12-C-PXX Custom 12 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

Button APS Kit, IntelliCross w/ Single Arrow,
CIU-C, Flash Drive, 9" X 15" Signs and
Adapters, Alum

Intellicross-XXX Ea | 0%

ATTACHMENT D ADDITIOANL PRICING

Part #s Date: 10/12/23 List Price UOM % Discount Sell Price
Item Description After Discount

Vision Video Detection Camera $5,250.00 o

AVISION Sensor $6500 Ea 10% $4.725.00-$5850.00
Standard camera Mounting $59-00 o

AMBKTM11S Bracket $73.00 Ea 10% $53.10-$65.70

AMBKTM16S Astro Bracket Extension $249.00 Ea 10% $224.10

AMBKTM17A Sky Bracket Extension $271.00 Ea 10% $243.90
- _— $3,250.00 o

AVCM Vision Communications Panel $4125.00 Ea 10% $2,925.00-$3712.50
. $72.00 o

171-184-501 SDLC Cable extension $90.00 Ea 10% $64.80-$81.00

1175-044019 g&%’:E’ ROUND,3 COND, 4000" | ¢ 74 4 10% $0.67

1175-010 CABLE,ROUND,3 COND, 500 $0.74 Ea 10% $0.67

Autoscope Video Detection

TotalVu Monitor Software $5,000.00 Ea 80% $1,000.00
ASGANG0OC Panel $4:500-00-Ea ” $4,275.00
219-1038-501 Ascuscan-TMIB-Cable $86.00-Ea 5% $81.70
249-1025-502 Accuscan-Standalone-Enclosure | $65:00-Ea 5% $61-75
34974P4 Acecuscan-Cable $14.00-Ea 5% $43.30
-ASCAN-ED-1P4 Accuscan-nterface Panel $450.00-Ea 5% $427.50

Sub-Total $18,802.31

EVO RADAR PRICE LIST
Cross Reference

Item Number Description List Price
Number

792280560 CBL DB25P TO DB25P (57.0") EVOIO-1 92.00

143-1001-503 KIT, SENSOR, EVO RADAR EVOR 14800.00

143-1001-503 KIT, SENSOR, EVO RADAR EVOR 11000.00
ASSY, WALL MOUNT, EVO RADAR HUB

143-1003-502 ENCLOSURE EVOHUB-W 10500.00
ASSY, SHELF MOUNT, EVO RADAR HUB

143-1003-503 ENCLOSURE EVOHUB-S 10500.00
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ASSY, RACK MOUNT, EVO RADAR HUB
143-1003-504 | AoOF RACK EVOHUB-R 10500.00
ASSY, SWING OUT, RACK MOUNT, EVO
143-1003-505 | A0 % SHING OUT RECK EVOHUB-H 10500.00
151-0987 Aoy CABLE EVOHUBTOM5, MALE, 1 gyoi0.2 149.00
151-0088 ASSY, CABLE, EVO HUB TO 15, FEMALE. | gy 00,5 145,00
CABLE, COND, IMSA 50-2, 14AWG, 2
158-0034 COND, 500FT, SHIELDED, 19 STRAND, | EVOCBL-05 120
600V, POLYETHYLENE
CABLE, COND, IMSA 50-2, 14AWG, 2
158-0035 COND, 1,000FT, SHIELDED, 19 STRAND, | EVOCBL-10 120
600V, POLYETHYLENE
211-1004-501 | ASSY,CABLE,24 OUTPUT,TERRA l/O EVOIO-4 149.00
211-1028-501 | CABLE ASSY, I/O 104 PIN EVOIO-5 689.00

PRICING SHEET: NIGP CODE 55089

Terms: NET 30
Vendor Number: VC0000009491
Certificates of Insurance Required

Contract Period:

To cover the period ending November 30, 2021 2023 2025.
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