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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Jamail & Smith Construction, LP 1 EA $0.73 $0.73

Sterling Structures, Inc. 1 EA $0.80 $0.80

FRAGMA Construction Services, LLC1 EA $0.83 $0.83 Coefficient for unit price book - RSMeans online is: 83%

The Thomas Group, Inc. 1 EA $0.84 $0.84

Sullivan Contracting Services (Pounds Group, LLC)1 EA $0.85 $0.85

Near Future LLC 1 EA $0.85 $0.85

floors 2 adore 1 EA $0.86 $0.86

SDB Contracting Services (SDB, Inc)1 EA $0.87 $0.87

Mooring Recovery Services 1 EA $0.88 $0.88

Reliable Commercial Roofing Services, Inc.1 EA $0.89 $0.89

Blackmon Mooring 1 EA $0.90 $0.90

LMC Corp (Lee Construction and Maintenance)1 EA $0.90 $0.90 Regions: 2-Corpus Christi, 3-Victoria, 4-Houston, 5-Beaumont, 6-Huntsville, 10-Richardson, 11-Fort Worth, 12-Waco, 13-Austin, 20-San Antonio

AAA Time Saver Services 1 EA $0.91 $0.91

Radius Design Works, LLC 1 EA $0.93 $0.93

Hallmark Mitigation & Construction1 EA $0.94 $0.94 94%

Bass Constuction Co., Inc. 1 EA $0.95 $0.95

Mid-Continental Restoration Company, Inc.1 EA $0.95 $0.95

THE FENCE LADY INC. 1 EA $0.96 $0.96

Centennial Moisture Control, Inc.1 EA $0.98 $0.98

Falkenberg Construction Company, Inc.1 EA $0.99 $0.99

L-Sync, LLC 1 EA $0.99 $0.99

The Trevino Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

J Reynolds & Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Jamail & Smith Construction, LP 1 EA $0.75 $0.75

The Thomas Group, Inc. 1 EA $0.87 $0.87

Sullivan Contracting Services (Pounds Group, LLC)1 EA $0.89 $0.89

floors 2 adore 1 EA $0.89 $0.89

Sterling Structures, Inc. 1 EA $0.90 $0.90

FRAGMA Construction Services, LLC1 EA $0.91 $0.91 Coefficient for RSMeans online - after hours and overtime hours is: 90.5%

Mooring Recovery Services 1 EA $0.92 $0.92

AAA Time Saver Services 1 EA $0.93 $0.93

Blackmon Mooring 1 EA $0.93 $0.93

Near Future LLC 1 EA $0.95 $0.95

Coefficient for unit price book - RSMeans online

Coefficient for RSMeans online - after hours and overtime hours
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Radius Design Works, LLC 1 EA $0.95 $0.95

LMC Corp (Lee Construction and Maintenance)1 EA $0.95 $0.95

SDB Contracting Services (SDB, Inc)1 EA $0.95 $0.95

THE FENCE LADY INC. 1 EA $0.96 $0.96 There will be no extra charge for afterhours or overtime. We schedule and rotate our crews accordingly.

Hallmark Mitigation & Construction1 EA $0.99 $0.99 99%

Reliable Commercial Roofing Services, Inc.1 EA $1.10 $1.10

Bass Constuction Co., Inc. 1 EA $1.10 $1.10

Mid-Continental Restoration Company, Inc.1 EA $1.10 $1.10

L-Sync, LLC 1 EA $1.13 $1.13

Falkenberg Construction Company, Inc.1 EA $1.15 $1.15

The Trevino Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.33 $1.33

Centennial Moisture Control, Inc.1 EA $1.35 $1.35

J Reynolds & Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Mooring Recovery Services 1 EA $1.13 $1.13

The Thomas Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.15 $1.15

THE FENCE LADY INC. 1 EA $1.15 $1.15

Blackmon Mooring 1 EA $1.17 $1.17

Jamail & Smith Construction, LP 1 EA $1.17 $1.17

L-Sync, LLC 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

Near Future LLC 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

Hallmark Mitigation & Construction1 EA $1.20 $1.20 115%

Sullivan Contracting Services (Pounds Group, LLC)1 EA $1.20 $1.20

Radius Design Works, LLC 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

Mid-Continental Restoration Company, Inc.1 EA $1.20 $1.20

floors 2 adore 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

LMC Corp (Lee Construction and Maintenance)1 EA $1.20 $1.20

AAA Time Saver Services 1 EA $1.20 $1.20

Falkenberg Construction Company, Inc.1 EA $1.22 $1.22

The Trevino Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.24 $1.24

SDB Contracting Services (SDB, Inc)1 EA $1.24 $1.24

FRAGMA Construction Services, LLC1 EA $1.25 $1.25

Centennial Moisture Control, Inc.1 EA $1.25 $1.25

Sterling Structures, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Bass Constuction Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Reliable Commercial Roofing Services, Inc.1 EA No Bid

J Reynolds & Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Coefficient for National Construction Estimator book by Craftsman
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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Mooring Recovery Services 1 EA $1.22 $1.22

THE FENCE LADY INC. 1 EA $1.25 $1.25 Due to the Pricing schedules in Craftsman we are unable to provide no charge for after hours and overtime like RS Means

The Thomas Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.25 $1.25

Jamail & Smith Construction, LP 1 EA $1.27 $1.27

Mid-Continental Restoration Company, Inc.1 EA $1.27 $1.27

AAA Time Saver Services 1 EA $1.27 $1.27

Blackmon Mooring 1 EA $1.29 $1.29

Near Future LLC 1 EA $1.30 $1.30

Hallmark Mitigation & Construction1 EA $1.30 $1.30

Radius Design Works, LLC 1 EA $1.30 $1.30

floors 2 adore 1 EA $1.30 $1.30

L-Sync, LLC 1 EA $1.30 $1.30

Sullivan Contracting Services (Pounds Group, LLC)1 EA $1.30 $1.30

FRAGMA Construction Services, LLC1 EA $1.32 $1.32

SDB Contracting Services (SDB, Inc)1 EA $1.32 $1.32

Falkenberg Construction Company, Inc.1 EA $1.32 $1.32

The Trevino Group, Inc. 1 EA $1.34 $1.34

Centennial Moisture Control, Inc.1 EA $1.35 $1.35

LMC Corp (Lee Construction and Maintenance)1 EA $1.35 $1.35

Reliable Commercial Roofing Services, Inc.1 EA No Bid

J Reynolds & Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Sterling Structures, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Bass Constuction Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Sterling Structures, Inc. 1 EA $10.00 $10.00 10%

AAA Time Saver Services 1 EA $10.00 $10.00 10%

THE FENCE LADY INC. 1 EA $10.00 $10.00 10%

Falkenberg Construction Company, Inc.1 EA $12.00 $12.00 12%

The Thomas Group, Inc. 1 EA $12.00 $12.00 12%

FRAGMA Construction Services, LLC1 EA $1.15 $1.15 15%

floors 2 adore 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

Reliable Commercial Roofing Services, Inc.1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

The Trevino Group, Inc. 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

Sullivan Contracting Services (Pounds Group, LLC)1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

Coefficient for overtime hours for the National Construction Estimator book by Craftsman

Usual and customary mark up for any non-pre-priced items that may come up.  This is not a coefficient.  It is a percent mark up of actual cost.
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SDB Contracting Services (SDB, Inc)1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

Bass Constuction Co., Inc. 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

Near Future LLC 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 15%

L-Sync, LLC 1 EA $17.00 $17.00 17%

Jamail & Smith Construction, LP 1 EA $1.18 $1.18 18%

Hallmark Mitigation & Construction1 EA $19.00 $19.00 19%

Centennial Moisture Control, Inc.1 EA $0.20 $0.20 20%

Radius Design Works, LLC 1 EA $0.20 $0.20 20%

LMC Corp (Lee Construction and Maintenance)1 EA $1.20 $1.20 20%

Blackmon Mooring 1 EA $20.00 $20.00 20%

Mooring Recovery Services 1 EA $20.00 $20.00 20%

Mid-Continental Restoration Company, Inc.1 EA $20.00 $20.00 20%

J Reynolds & Co., Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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