BID # 2010-960
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES ANNUAL CONTRACT

Bid Opening: Friday, March 26, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

CLEANING AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	CC-1
	Air Freshener


	38.20 case

10 oz. 12/case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	32.50

	CC-2
	Metered Aerosol Room Deodorant
	34.00 case

7 oz.12/case
	
	
	34.10

	CC-3
	Odor Counteractant


	12.10 gal.

1 gal ctn 4/ case
	
	
	11.70

	CC-4
	Bowl Rim Hangers


	7.75 case

12/case
	
	
	7.50

	CC-5
	Urinal Screens


	14.60 case

12/case
	
	
	14.00

	CC-6
	Scouring Powder


	32.50 case

21 oz.24/case
	
	
	18.90

	CC-7
	Non-Abrasive Cleaner
	34.00  case

24 oz.9/case
	
	
	29.95  

	CC-8
	All Purpose Aerosol Cleaner
	34.10 case

20 oz/12case
	
	
	30.50

	CC-9
	Cleaner, Disinfectant
	23.25 case

1 gal ctn./4 case
	
	
	20.00

	CC-10
	Non-Acid Toilet Bowl Cleaner
	27.50 case

32 oz. 12/case
	
	
	27.50

	CC-11
	Bleach
	10.60 case

1 gal ctn 6/case
	
	
	10.00


CLEANING AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS
	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	CC-12
	Degreaser
	7.50 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.50

	CC-13
	Laundry Detergent – Liquid Allstar D-terge
	29.80 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	
	
	25.40

	CC-14


	Automatic Dishwasher Gel
	44.70 case

155 oz. 4/case
	
	
	33.90

	CC-15


	Liquid Dishwashing Liquid
	36.05 case

38 oz. 8/case
	
	
	32.90

	CC-16


	Steel Wool Soap Pads
	34.00 case

15 per box 12/case
	
	
	34.00

	CC-17


	Aerosol Disinfectant
	64.70 case

19 oz. 12/case
	
	
	26.65

	CC-18


	Non Acid Drain Opener
	44.80 case

80 oz. 6/case
	
	
	42.10

	CC-19


	Furniture Polish
	38.00 case

17.7 oz. 6/case
	
	
	32.40

	CC-20


	Windex Glass Cleaner
	10.70 gal.

1 gal ctn 4/case
	
	
	10.70

	CC-21


	Mildew Stain Remover
	31.00 case

16 oz. 12/case
	
	
	28.50

	CC-22


	Stainless Steel Cleaner
	27.90 case

17.5 oz. 12/case
	
	
	26.90

	CC-23


	Oven Cleaner


	33.50 case

24 oz. 6/case
	
	
	28.95

	CC-24


	Large Wrapped Cellulose Sponges
	41.00 case

24/case
	
	
	23.50


CLEANING AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS
	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous

Contract

	CC-25


	Spray bottle with trigger spray head
	1.90 each


	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.10

	CC-26


	Small Latex Gloves
	22.00 pkg

12/pkg
	
	
	17.90

	CC-27


	Large Latex Gloves
	22.00 pkg

12/pkg
	
	
	17.90

	CC-28


	X-Large Latex Gloves
	22.00 pkg

12/pkg
	
	
	17.90

	CC-29


	Small Disposable Gloves
	5.40 box

100/box
	
	
	3.95

	CC-30


	Medium Disposable Gloves
	5.40 box

100/box
	
	
	3.95

	CC-31


	Large Disposable Gloves
	5.40 box

100/box
	
	
	3.95

	CC-32


	X-Large Disposable

Gloves
	5.40 box

100/box
	
	
	3.95

	CC-33


	Soap, Liquid Hand Refill
	62.90 case

800 ml 12/case
	
	
	62.90

	CC-34


	Heavy-Duty Hand Cleaner-Lava 4oz bar
	42.00 case

4 oz. 48/case
	
	
	43.90

	CC-35


	Remover
	53.40 case

32 oz. 12/case
	
	
	34.80

	CC-36
	Medium Scrub Sponge
	17.25 case

20/case
	
	
	13.30

	CC-37
	Fabric Softener Sheets
	55.10 case

160 ct 6/case
	
	
	49.80


CLEANING AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS
	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous

Contract

	CC-38
	Vinyl Protectant

and Cleaner
	52.80 case

32 oz. 6/case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	51.80

	CC-39
	Multi Purpose Lubricant
	59.90 case

16 oz. 12/case
	
	
	58.05

	CC-40
	Waterless hand wipes
	63.10 case

75 ct 6/case
	
	
	63.10

	CC-41
	Cleaning Cloths
	73.00 case

50 ct 4/case
	
	
	76.50

	CC-42
	Hand Sanitizer Refills
	74.00 case

1,000 ml 8/case
	
	
	68.40

	CC-43


	Disinfecting Wipes


	28.90 case

75/ct 6/case
	
	
	28.90

	CC-44


	Cleaner/Degreaser

Simple Green
	81.00 case

24 oz. 6/case
	
	
	New Item

	CC-45


	All-Purpose Cleaner

Simple Green
	65.50 case

24 oz. 6/case
	
	
	New Item

	CC-46
	Lime Scale Remover


	59.60 case

32 oz. 12/case
	
	
	New Item

	CC-47
	Stainless Steel Cleaner – Simple Green
	65.00 case

32 oz. 6/cases
	
	
	New Item

	CC-48
	Micro Cloths

Yellow
	44.00 pkg.

12/pkg.
	
	
	New Item

	CC-49
	Micro Cloths

Red
	44.00 pkg.

12/pkg.
	
	
	New Item


CLEANING AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS
	VENDORS

	Item #


	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, Texas
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous 

Contract

	CC-50
	Micro Cloths

Blue
	44.00 pkg.

12/pkg.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	New Item



	CC-51
	Micro Cloths

Green
	44.00 pkg.

12/pkg.
	
	
	New Item



	
	TOTAL BID

AMount
	$29,098.00
	--------
	-----
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	-----
	-----
	


DISPENSERS

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous 

Contract

	D-1


	Sanitary Napkin Disposal Dispenser
	28.80 each


	NO BID
	NO BID
	28.80

	D-2


	All Purpose Wiper Dispenser
	20.00 each
	
	
	15.90

	D-3


	Roll Toilet Tissue Holder – regular
	14.00 each
	
	
	11.50

	D-4


	Jumbo Toilet Tissue Roll Dispenser
	NC
	
	
	New Item

	D-5


	Cone Cup Dispenser
	10.90 each
	
	
	10.90

	D-6

	Cup Dispenser – adjustable
	18.90 each
	
	
	18.00

	D-7

	Soap Dispenser – Window
	NC
	
	
	NC


DISPENSERS

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	 Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contact

	D-8

	Sanitary Napkin Dispenser
	28.80 each
	NO BID
	NO BID
	28.80

	D-9

	Toilet Seat Cover Dispenser
	69.00 each
	
	
	57.70

	D-10

	Metered Aerosol Room Deodorizer
	36.00 each
	
	
	28.50

	D-11

	Mill Dispenser
	NC
	
	
	NC

	D-12

	Hand Cleaner-In Sight Santi Tuff Dispenser
	NC
	
	
	NC

	D-13

	Paper Towel Dispenser-In Sight
	NC
	
	
	NC

	D-14

	Multi fold Paper Towel Dispenser-metal
	30.00 each
	
	
	25.80

	D-15
	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser
	14.25 each
	
	
	14.25

	
	TOTAL BID AMOUNT
	$1,603.80


	--------
	--------
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	--------
	--------
	


FLOOR CARE PRODUCTS
	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	FC-1


	Stripper
	7.90 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	63.47/5 gal pail
	NO BID
	6.25

	FC-2


	Neutralizer and Conditioner
	35.00 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	42.34 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	
	33.00


FLOOR CARE PRODUCTS

	VENDOR

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	FC-3


	Sealer
	9.50 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	93.23/5 gal pail


	NO BID
	9.50

	FC-4


	Wax
	11.25 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	79.15/5 gal pail
	
	11.25


	FC-5


	Recoat Floor Finish
	9.50 gal.

1 gal ctn 4/case
	106.89/5 gal pail
	
	9.05

	FC-6


	Gym Finish
	28.40 gal


	175.09/5 gal pail


	
	27.50

	FC-7


	Carpet Cleaner
	6.10 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	67.38 gal

1 gal ctn 4/case
	
	5.95

	FC-8


	Carpet Stain Remover
	39.90 case

16 oz. 12/case
	58.78 case

18 oz. 12/case
	
	34.90

	FC-9


	20” White Polish Pad
	16.10 case

5 pads/case
	27.76 case

5 pads/case
	
	15.90

	FC-10


	20” Red Buffer Pad
	16.10 case

5 pads/case
	27.76 case

5 pads/case
	
	15.90

	FC-11


	20” Green Stripping Pad
	16.10 case

5 pads/case
	27.76 case

5 pads/case
	
	15.90

	FC-12


	20” Black Stripping Pad
	16.10 case

5 pads/case
	27.76 case

5 pads/case
	
	15.90

	FC-13


	30” Push Broom Head
	20.00 each
	14.61 each
	
	20.00

	FC-14


	36” Push Broom Head
	21.90 each
	25.38 each
	
	21.90

	FC-15


	Street/Barn Broom Head
	11.10 each
	15.56 each
	
	9.80


FLOOR CARE PRODUCTS

	VENDOR

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	FC-16


	Push Broom Handle

For FC 14
	3.50  each
	4.50  each
	NO BID
	3.35  

	FC-17


	Push Broom Handle

For FC 13
	3.50 each
	4.50 each
	
	4.50

	FC-18


	All Corn Broom
	6.05 each
	5.76 each
	
	4.50

	FC-19


	Angled Broom
	6.05 each
	8.23 each
	
	4.96

	FC-20
	Dust Pan
	4.00 each


	4.68 each


	
	2.90

	FC-21


	Lobby Dust Pan
	8.95 each
	19.34 each
	
	13.50

	FC-22


	Complete Mop Bucket and Wringer
	48.75 set
	87.08 set
	
	49.95

	FC-23


	Mop Handle
	15.95 each
	18.97 each
	
	6.50

	FC-24


	Mop Head –Cotton saddles, 24 ounce
	4.50 each
	6.12 each
	
	3.50

	FC-25


	Mop Head – Rayon saddles, 24 ounce
	5.60 each
	6.66 each
	
	4.98

	FC-26


	Dust Mop Handle
	7.90 each
	12.22 each
	
	8.90

	FC-27


	Dust Mop Frame
	4.80 each
	6.82 each
	
	4.10

	FC-28


	Dust Mop Head
	7.25 each
	14.06 each
	
	6.90

	FC-29


	Dust Mop Treatment
	41.40 case

18 oz. 12/case
	57.67 case

18 oz. 12/case
	
	33.50

	FC-30


	Bowl Cleaner Mops
	.85 each
	1.18 each
	
	.70

	FC-31
	Utility Pads
	6.50 case

20/case
	109.04 case

20/case
	
	5.90


FLOOR CARE PRODUCTS

	VENDOR

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	FC-32
	Whisk Broom
	2.30 each


	4.10 each


	NO BID
	2.05

	FC-33
	Disposable Dust Heads
	7.40 each
	11.21 each
	
	4.65

	FC-34


	Clip-On Dust Mop Frame
	7.10 each
	10.47 each
	
	6.55

	FC-35


	All Purpose Cleaner
	24.00 case

1 gal 4/case
	58.94 case
1 gal 4/case
	
	5.90

	FC-36

	Heavy-Duty Floor Squeegee
	16.00 each
	33.88 each
	
	New Item

	FC-37

	Standard Squeegee
	17.40 each


	22.04 each


	
	New Item

	
	TOTAL BID AMOUNT
	$7,614.35


	$12,200.87

	--------
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	20%
	--------
	


SANITARY PAPER PRODUCTS

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	SP-1


	Hard Roll Towels-

8”x600’, white Kleenix
	39.00 case

6/600 case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	37.25

	SP-2


	Hard Roll Towels-

8”x800’, white Scott
	78.40 case

8/800 case
	
	
	37.25

	SP-3


	Tall Fold Napkins
	34.60 case

250/40 case
	
	
	31.25


SANITARY PAPER PRODUCTS

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	SP-4


	All Purpose Wipers
	43.40 case

90/12 case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	36.90

	SP-5


	Toilet Tissue-regular
	53.50 case

605/80 case
	
	
	44.80

	SP-6
	Cone Cups
	57.00 case

200/25 case
	
	
	46.00

	SP-7


	Styrofoam Cups-8 oz
	17.00 case

1,000/case
	
	
	16.80

	SP-8


	Styrofoam Cups-12 oz
	28.65 case

1,000 case
	
	
	23.95

	SP-9


	Napkin Receptacle

Liners
	18.95 case

500/case
	
	
	17.80

	SP-10
	Seat Covers
	33.90 case

2,500/case
	
	
	29.00

	SP-11


	Kleenex Facial Tissues
	43.00 case

100 box/30 case
	
	
	35.65

	SP-12


	WypAll X80 Shop Pro Red Towels-

Pop up
	13.90 box

80 box 5/case
	
	
	12.00

	SP-13


	Utility Wipers-Pop up box-9”x10.5”white
	6.20 box

125 box 18/case
	
	
	5.30

	SP-14
	Multifold towels – one-ply, white
	25.80 case

250 box 16 case
	
	
	18.95

	SP-15
	Coreless Jumbo Toilet Tissue
	49.00

1,150 12/cases
	
	
	49.00

	
	TOTAL BID

AMOUNT
	$34,298.00
	--------
	--------
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	--------
	--------
	--------


TRASH LINERS 

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.
Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	T-1


	24” x 32” Trash Liners .60 mil
	23.75 case

500/case
	22.45 case

500/case (.45 mil)
	19.40 case

500/case
	23.75

	T-2


	33” x 39” Trash Liners .80 mil
	15.90 case

150/case
	$21.02 case

150/case (.74 mil)
	16.20 case

250/case
	15.90

	T-3


	38” x 58” Trash Liners 1.7 mil
	34.90 case

100/case
	31.67 case

100/case (1.2 mil)
	18.10 case

100 case
	16.95

	T-4


	38” x 63” Trash Liners 2.7 mil
	32.00 case

50 rolls/case
	32.31 case

75/case (1.8 mil)
	17.40 case

50 case
	32.00

	
	TOTAL BID

AMOUNT
	$20,480.50
	Does not meet specs
	Does not meet delivery requirements
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	--------
	--------
	--------


MISCELLANEOUS
	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	M-1
	Hand Cleaner-Naturally Tuff Orange
	74.80 case

4 gal/case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	69.80

	M-2
	Citrus Emulsion Degreaser
	619.00 55 gal

drum
	
	
	601.00

	M-3
	Tar and Asphalt Cleaner
	619.00 55 gal

drum
	
	
	616.00

	M-4
	Liquid Car Wash
	36.00 

5 gal
	
	
	7.25

	
	TOTAL BID

AMOUNT
	$10,110.00
	--------
	--------
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	--------
	--------
	--------


CHEMICAL DISPENSING SYSTEM

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	DS-1
	Disinfectant/germicidal
	49.35 case

3/Smart Sac bags
	98.95 case

4X21 case
	NO BID
	New Item

	DS-2
	Neutral floor cleaner


	37.60 case

3/Smart Sac bags
	94.57 case

4X2 L case
	
	“

	DS-3
	All purpose cleaner


	42.20 case

3/Smart Sac bags
	60.08 case

4X2 L case
	
	“

	DS-4
	Restroom cleaner
	16.50 gal


	80.58 case

4X2 L case
	
	“

	DS-5
	Glass cleaner

Non-ammoniated
	65.35 case

3/Smart Sac bags 
	91.69 case

4X2 L case
	
	“

	DS-6
	Floor stripper


	18.30 gal
	63.47/5 gal pail
	
	“

	DS-7
	Floor finish

high solids
	19.40 gal
	110.58/5 gal pail
	
	“

	DS-8
	Concrete floor finish sealer
	20.20 gal


	113.87/5 gal pail

	
	“

	DS-9
	Floor finish sealer

combination
	16.60 gal
	93.04/5 gal pail
	
	“

	DS-10
	Odor counteractant


	70.45 case

3/Smart Sac bags
	184.48 case

4X2 L case
	
	“


CHEMICAL DISPENSING SYSTEM

	VENDORS

	Item #
	Description of Product
	Kleen Supply

Galveston, TX
	Sanitary Supply

Beaumont, Texas
	Central Poly Corp.

Linden, NJ
	Previous Contract

	DS-11
	Finish enhancer


	23.35 gal
	22.47 gal
	NO BID
	New Item

	DS-12
	Carpet extractor cleaner
	67.00 case

3/Smart Sac bags
	86.46 case

4X2 L case
	
	“

	DS-13
	Bowl cleaner


	46.25 case (3.85 qt)

12 quarts/case
	2.89 each
	
	“

	DS-14
	Non acid bowl cleaner


	35.30 case

12 quarts/case
	32.75 case

12 quarts/case
	
	“

	
	TOTAL BID

AMOUNT
	$2,563.25
	$5,806.20
	--------
	--------

	
	Discount
	25%
	20%
	--------
	--------
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