BID TABULATION

Bid # 2010-969
VEGETATION MANAGEMENT CHEMICALS

ANNUAL CONTRACT

Bid Opening: Friday, July 23, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.
	ITEM #
	Crop Production Services
Houston, Texas
	Alligare LLC
Opelika, AL
	John Deere
Cleveland, Ohio
	Red River Specialties, Inc.
Houston, Texas
	Previous

Contract

Pricing

	1. 41 % Glyphosate

per 2.5 gal
	$30.63
	$27.50

	$44.43

	$32.00
	$36.62

	2. 41 % Glyphosate

per 30 gal drum
	$358.50
	$327.00
	$500.87
	$420.00
	$420.00

	3. Aquatic Glyphosate

per 2.5 gal
	$36.25
	$30.63
	$48.75

	$40.00
	$49.62

	4. Aquatic Glyphosate

per 30 gal drum
	$435.00
	$366.00
	$753.16
	$480.00
	$595.50

	5. Veterans 720

per 2.5 gal
	$75.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$70.00
	$52.07

	6. Veterans 720

per 30 gal drum
	$900.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$822.00
	$615.90

	7. Arsenal

per 2.5 gal
	$250.00
	$132.50
	No Bid
	$250.00
	$302.50

	8. Arsenal

per 30 gal drum
	$3,000.00


	$159.00
	No Bid
	$2,850.00
	$5,844.00



	9. Garlon 3-A

per 2.5 gal
	$130.00
	$102.38
	No Bid
	$158.00
	$120.00

	10. Garlon 3-A

per 30 gal drum
	$1,560.00
	$1,224.00
	No Bid
	$1,896.00
	$1,440.00

	11.Plateau

per gal
	$157.90
	$135.00
	No Bid
	$150.00
	$277.00

	12. Oust

per 3 lb container
	$240.00
	$114.00
	No Bid
	$240.00
	$177.00

	13. Surfactant

per 2.5 gal
	$25.00
	$22.50
	No Bid
	$22.25
	$21.00

	14. Surfactant

per 30 gal drum
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$264.00
	$246.00

	15. Aquatic Surfactant

per 2.5 gal
	$25.00
	$22.50
	$68.15
	$22.25
	$22.00

	16. Nu Film – IR

per 2.5 gal
	$85.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$97.50
	$54.12

	17. Drift Control

per quart
	$10.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$14.00
	$8.25

	18. Drift Control

per gal
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	

	19. Tank Cleaner

per gal
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$7.03
	No Bid
	$13.00

	20. Marking Dye

per gal
	$40.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$42.00
	$26.00

	21. Marking Dye

per 2.5 gal
	$85.00
	No Bid
	$58.30


	$105.00
	$60.00

	22. Reward

per gal
	$110.00
	No Bid
	$169.27
	$130.00
	$103.00


