WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION
PRINTING SERVICES

ANNUAL CONTRACT # 10WCAQG24

Recommended award:

Vendor items

Safeguard Business Systems | #1,2,3 part2,4part2,5, Spart2,6, 6part2, 7 part2, 8 part2,9, 9 part 2, 10,
10 part 2, 11, 29, 30, 31, 32, 34, 37, 38, 35, 41, 44, 58, 60, 61, 62, 65, 69, 70, 71,
85, 86, 92, 95, 96, 98, 104, 106

Speedy Gonzales Printing #12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 76, 91, 93, 94, 97,99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 105,

107

D&L Printing #22, 24, 25, 26, 28, 36, 40, 42, 45, 47, 53, 64, 66, 68, 75, 77 bound, 78 bound, 87,
89

Roberts Printing #3,4,7,8, 23,27,33,35,49,59, 63, 74

Office Depot #21, 46, 48, 50, 51, 52, 54, 55, 56, 57, 77 unbound, 78 unbound, 79, 80, 81, 82,
88, 90

Print Logics 867

Evaluation of items involved representatives from several departments.
Each item was reviewed and recommend award to overall low.
When an item was tied, recommend award to vendor with lowest bid on large volume.

After extensive evaluation of samples recommended award on some items was not based primarily on price but also quality of product.



WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PRINTING SERVICES
BID # 10WCAQ24

Speedy Gonzales D&L
Description Price for Printing Safeguard  [Minuteman Press Roberts Printing Office Depot
Group 1 - Envelopes

250 28 41.4 35 34 55.75%
500 32.75 a6 42 48 64.3
1 Envelopes (Case Jackets) 1000 49.6 57.96 59 &0 84.3
2500 97.5 90.16 110 96 171.45
5000 176.65 156.4 200 155 282.85
250 28 53 a6 52 55,75
500 42 75 60 56 64.3
2 Envelopes (Civil Jackets) 1000 68 126.2 98 68 84.3
2500 143 279 217.5 171,45
5000 269 514.8 405 282.85
250 41,95 60| 55.75
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 68.95 69 100 64.3
3 Without Tint, Without Graphics Flip & 1000 122 89 163 84.3
Seal 2500 278.5 345 171.45
5000 538.55 670 282.85

250 26 41.4 35

Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 32.75 46 42

Ipart2 | Without Tint, Without Graphics, Gum 1000 49,6 57.96 59

Seal 2500 97.5 90.16 110

5000 176.65 i56.4 200
250 41.95 55.75
Envelopes, Busingss Return, #10-24, 500 68.95 69 64.3
4 Without Tint, With Graphics, Flip & 1000 122 80 84.3
seal 2500 278.5 175 171.45
5000 538.55 275 282.85

250 26 41.4
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 32.75 46 42
4 part 2 Without Tint, With Graphics, Gum 1000 49.6 57.96 59




Seal

2500 97.5 90.16 110
5000 176.65 156.4 200
250 43.75 62,5 44 68.6
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 72.8 102.5 48 77.15
5 With Security Tint, Without Graphics, 1000 1297 168 60 97.15
Flip & Seal 2500 297.75 375 98 203.6
5000 575.3 700 172 347.1
250 26.5 43.2 37
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 38.2 47.8 50
5part2 | With Security Tint, Without Graphics, 1000 60.4 60.7 74.7
Gum Seal 2500 1245 98.4 142.5
5000 230.5 172 255
250 43.75 62.5 44 68.6
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 72.8 102.5 48 77.15
B With Security Tint, With Graphics, 1000 129.7 168 60 97.15
Flip & Seal 2500 297.75 375 98 203.6
5000 575.3 700 172 347.1
250 26.5 43.2 37
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 i8.2 47.86 50
6 part2 With Security Tint, With Graphics, 1000 60.4 60.7 74.4
Gum Seal 2500 124.5 98.4 142.5
5000 230.5 172 255
250 45.4 65| 58.6
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 75.3 74 107.5§; 67.15
7 Window Without Tint, Without 1000 134.55 a6 178} 90
Graphics, Flip & Seal 2500 3116 187 400} 190
5000 600 299 750 321.45
250 25.35 46.9 37
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, S00 35.85 515 47
7 part2 Window Without Tint, Without 1000 55.75 63.45 66
Graphics, Gum  Seal 2500 112.95 96.6 125
5000 207.45 163.75]: 222
250 454 65 58.6
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 753 74 107.5 67.15




8 Window Without Tint, With Graphics, 1000 134.55 96 178l 90
Flip & Seal 2500 3116 400 150
5000 600 750): 321.45
250 25.35 46.9 37
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 35.85 51.5 47
8part2 [Window Without Tint, With Graphics, 1000 55.75 63.45 66
Gum Seal 2500 112.95 96.6 125
5000 207.45 163.75 222
250 47.65 75 48 71.45
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 80.5 120 56 80.3
9 Window With Security Tint, Without 1000 145.1 198 68 102.85
Graphics, Flip & Seal 2500 336,25 425 110 222.15
5000 654 800 180 385.7
250 27.3 48.75 44
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 39.7 53.35 57
9part 2 Window With Security Tint, Without 1000 53.45 67.15 a2
Graphics, Gum Seal 2500 132.25 104.85 160
5000 245,95 180.3 250
250 47.65 75 48 71.45
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 500 B80.5 120 56 B0.3
10 Window With Security Tint, With 1000 145.1 198 68 102.85
Graphics, Flip & Seal 2500 336.25 425 110 222.15
5000 654 800 180 385.7
Envelopes, Business Return, #10-24, 250 273 A48.75 a4
Window With Security Tint, With 500 39.7 53.35 57
10 part 2 Graphics, Gum Seal lowest overall - 1000 63.45 67.15 82
however majority of orders are of 2500 132.25 104.85 160
larger quantity
5000 245,95 180.3 290
250 28 48.75 50 52 55.75
500 42 54,25 86 56 64.3
11 Envelopes, Business Return, Color to 68 84.3
be specified, #10-24 1000 58 68 132 :
2500 108.5 272 110 171.45
5000 187 500 180 28285
250 48,75 50 40 74.3




so0}:

55 70 65 &4 a0

12 Envelapes, X5 15/16, {money 1000}: 87.24 84 a7 106 134.3
evidence)

2500 183.45 210 190 230 288.6

5000 327.17 380 347 438 535,75

250 35 70 52 104.65

500 55 80 84 126.15

13 Enveiopes,ﬁxa‘B/B, tan, printing on 100 75 116 144 172.3

one side, #10-24 ‘

25001 189.75 245 330 358.5

5000 341 440 655 655.4

250]: 43.9 20 35 40 104.65

500} 50.93 40 43 58 126.15

14 Envelopes {Election Return} 1000 66.9 54 &0 g2 172.3

25008 132.5 118 113 199 358.5

5000j: 238.34 168 200 368 655.4

250]; 55 75 53 97.15

500[; 78.75 94 70 117.15

15 Envelopes {car voter's ballot 1000 1182 115 104 160
envelope)

2500(: 233.5 215 207 332.85

5000 399.25 345 378 608.6

: 59 75 53 76 97.15

500} 78.75 94 70 112 117.15

16 Envelopes {ballot envelope) 1000} 118.2 115 104 176 160

2500 2335 215 207 382 332.85

5000 399.25 345 378 690 608.6

250} £65.99 97.15

500]. 92.5 117.15

17 Envelopes [ballot by mail envelope) 1000/ 145 160

2500} 269.95 332.85

5000} 525 608.6

2507 97.15

500 117.15

18 Envelopes (ballot by mail envelope) 1000 160

2500 332.85

5000

608.6




2504 43 59 57 48 97.15
500 . 56 71 77 74 117.15
19 Envelope (ballot by mail envelope) 1000 89 94 116 120 160
2500 1875 230 235 265
5000 335 415 430 505
250
500
20 Envelopes (affidavit) 1000F
2500}
5000}:
250 187.5 300
500 350 550
21 Envelopes (large envelopes) 1000 650 1000
2500 1500 1280
5000 2500 1880

Robert's Printing was low bid on flip and seal security tint window envelopes.

these items.

Due to visibility of tint, Safeguard was awarded



Group # 2

Speedy
Gonzales
Iitem # Description Price for Printing D & L Printing  |Safeguard Hart Label  [Print Logics Minuteman Prass {Roberts Printing |Office Depot
250 39.35 40 a2 3z 14.19
NCR - 2part, short 500 58.7 54 60 44 26.69
22 forms, 4 X 8 1/4 1000 94.7 78 92 62 53.38
printing on one side 2500 186 172 190 133.44
5000 357.5 227 350 266.89
250 40,9 24.8 40 50 18.63
NCR - 2part, 81/2x5 500 61.8 a1 53 69 36.16
23 7/8, printing an one 1000 100.85 735 89 107 72.25
side 2500 152.3 158.15 133 220 180.63
5000 368.35 230 412 361.26
250 43 40 52 18.06
NCR - 2part, 81/2x7, 500 74 68 70 104 35.56
24 printing on one side, 1000 130 110 106 152 71.13
color ta be specified 2500 298,95 195 215 290 177.82
5000 397 265 395 430 355.63
250 45,3 45 70 70 25
NCR - 2part, 8 500 75.25 81 104 90 50
25 1/2x.11, printing on an 1000 131 118 170 135 100
side, colors to be
specified 2500 296 244 370 260 250
5000 570.4 360 600 355 500
NCR-2part, 8 250 165 90 72
1/2x11 continuous 500 178.25 145 104
26 feed cnreruter form 000 18 o5 152
paper with State of
Texas Seal, screened in 2500 3381 200 290
background,printed 5000 538 250 430
250 49.35 45 8o} 65 35
NCE-Zoart. B 500 81.4 81 120 70
S pri:?:iné orone 1000 143.4 142 199 140
side 2500 326.8 265 437.5 350
5000 468.50 360 745 700
5000 468.5 3860 745 700
250 60.95 80 80 85 85.71




NCR - 2part, 8

500 102. 120 98 122.86
28 1/2)(.14‘ printing on one 1000 181.6] 199 128 202.86
side, colors to be il :
specified 2500 3617} 437.5 280 418,57
5000 522,45} 745 380 791.43
250 130.5 93 113 562.5
500 193 123 130 1125
29 NCR -2part {Deputy 1000 322.75 183 195 2250
Voter Registrar)
2500 657.5 350 370 5625
5000 12305 630 605 11250
250 71 80 65 50
500 123.75 120 110 100
NCR-3part, 8 1000 226.35 199 170 200
30 1/2x14, printing on cne
side 2500 439,85 437.5 385 500
5000 663.1 745 510 1000
250 45 48 60 17.09
NCR - 3part, 81/2x3 500 65.75 65 102 32.86
a1 5/8, printing on one 1000 107.25 107 112 65,71
side 2500 203.5 200 212 162.96
5000 355 370 340 324,61
250 47.3 53 30 18.21
NCR - 3part, 8 1/2x4, 500 73.45 74 50 33.98
32 short form, printing on 1000 127.65 116 90 67.95
one side 2500 242.1 2425 167.47
5000 432 455 332.49
250 50.75 325 40 s1f 24.31
NCR - 3part, 8 1/2x5 500 80.3 59.85 68 87 48.06
i3 1/2, printing on one 1000 135.75 98,3 98 139 96.13
side 2500 278.95 205.2 195 297.5 24032
5000 513.4 337.7 347 530 480.63
250 63 36.75 ' o5 48,06
NCR - 3part, 81/2x7 500 107.65 70.95 150 65 96.13
24 1/2, Memo reply with 1000 194 113.7 263 115 192.25
return address, printing
on one side 2500 355.6 2525 565 250 A80.63
5000 484.5 373.6 1000 375 961.26
250 89.2 76.1 103 138.57




NCR - 3part, 8 500 143.85 121.4 138 168 154,29
35 1/2x11, printing on 1000 247.85 193.2 202 297 321.43
two sides 2500 470.35 350.55 359 660 £72.86
5000 659.7 471 478 1220 1154.28
250 85.45 95 100
NCR -3part, 8 500 127.75 150 151.43
36 1/2)(:.[1‘ printing on 1000 214 263 264,29
one side, colors to be
spacified 2500 427 565 564.29
5000 607 1000 1008.57
250 116.55 140 125.71
500 171.25 200 135 178.57
1000 275.25 321 200 280
NCR - 3part, B8 2500 470.35 635 370 631.43
37 1/2x11, two ink colors,
printing on one side
5000 659.7 1685 k30 1224.29
250 71 110 65 50
NCR - 3part, 8 500 123.75 177 110 100
38 1/2x14, printing on one 1000 226.35 311 170 200
side 2500 430,85 680 385 500
5000 663.1 1200 510 1000
NCR - 3part, 91/2x 250
st | e
33 priniing on onepsize,' 1000
printed border in 2500
purple ink with 5000
250 104
Jpart, 81/2x11, 500 152
20 laser form,lwhite, 000 -,
yeilow, and pink copy,
red numbering 2500 590
5000 1690
NCR - 3part, 81/2x 250
5 contin:ous feed 500
computer form paper,
41 red :umbering snihe 1000
top right hand corner, 2500




seal scanned in the 5000
250 188
500 252
43 NCR - 3part books,
(bondsmen fees) 1000 379
2500 820
5000 1435
43{item deleted
250 480
500 799
44 NCR - 4part books,
{patrol booklets) 1000 1378.25
2500 2968.57
5000 5664.25
250 81| 122 110 67.5
500 143 119 202 154 135
45 NCR - 4 part, 8 1/2x11,
printing on one side 1090 263 217 363 305 270
2500 495.85 384 755 610 675
5000 758.6 535 1425 1450 1350

D&L recommended for some iterns due to paper quality.




Group 3 - Froms Bond Paper

Speedy
Gonzales Roberts
ltem # Description Price for |Printing D & L Printing  |Safeguard !Minuteman [Printing  {Office Depot  |Hart Print Logic
250 6.25 6.25 10 12.5 e E 15.93
8 1/2 x 13, 204 Bond 500 12.5 12.5 20 21.45 40| 31.85
46 Paper, white, printing 1000 25 25 g 36.6 53.7
on one side 2500 60 55 70 73 74] 99,25
5000 100 100 115 131 130{ " 10 168.5
250 17 25 32 11 16,23
8 1/2x 11, 20# Bond 500 34 435 42 22 32.45
47 Paper, color to b 1000 a9 74.6 &5 a4 54.9
specified, printing on
two sides 2500 119 145 85 110 102.25
5000 205 260 145 220 169
8 1/2 x 11, 20# Bond 250 38 15 :
Paper, printing on two 500 51 37,62 49 24
48 S.idE?’ bound.a.t topor 1000 99.3 67.55 55 40
side in quantities of 50 .
with chip board 2500 152.3 116.55 94 77.5
backing, on ink color 5000 262.15 196.65 163 140
8 1/2x 11, 20# Bond 250 64.25 75.24 0 27.5)
Faper, printing on two 500 87.9 82.08 102 42.5|
49 s.ide?’ bound.a.t topor 1000 135.25 99,18 117 75(:
side in quantities of 50 :
with chip board 2500 183.45 151.34 195 ;
backing, two Ink colors 5000 316.5 239.4 340 250
250 12.5 7 13 15 16.23
8 1/2 x 14, 20# Bond 500 25 14 20 26 32,45
50 Paper, printing on one 1000 39.79 28 40 43 54.9
side 2500 70 62.5 95 97.5 102.25
5000 129 115 155 180 169
250 17 16.88 20 23.75 18.75
8 1/2 x 11, 20# Bond 500 34 33.75 35 40.5 37.5
51 Paper, white, printing 1000 61.5 58.5 45 71 &5
ontwa sides 2500 102.75 135 105 140 127.5
5000 169.85 247.5 175 255 220
250 20 17.33 14 27 18.75
8 1/2 x 14, 20# Bond 500 38 34.65 27 44 37.5
52 Paper, white, printing 1000 66.4 60.3 54 73 b5




on two sides 2500 114.5 94 162.5 110 1275
5000 193.6 160 290 175 220
250 81 30 59 65 100
8 1/2x 11, 20# 8and 500 107 60 97 90 101.42
53 Paper, white, black 1000 142.65 105 111 120 127.14
ink, blue borders,
printing on two sides 2500 221 185 152.5 150 275.72
5000 349 295 225 190 530
250 7.25 10.49 8 8.5 12 9.5
81/2 x5 1/2, 204 500 14 15.73 17 135 ' 185
54 Bond Paper, white, 1000 28 25.34 33 22.4 28.5
printing on one side 2500 67.5 55.06 58 40.5 60| 60.5
5000 132.5 69,92 a8 69 85| 95.5
250 8.25 11.36 12 g 14} 9.5
81/2x51/2, 208 500 15.5 17.48 19 145 18] 18.5
55 Band Paper, color to 1000 30 27.9 33 24.4 28{ 285
be specified, printing -
on one side 2500 725 59.48 a6 44.75 62| 60.5
5000 142.5 76.9 86 76.5 87| 95.5
250 15 11.36 16 16.75 16 9.5
81/2 x 7, 204 Bond 500 25 20.98 27 28 20 18.5
56 Paper, printing on two 1000 40 38.45 48 47 32} 28.5
sides 2500 65 90.9 98 90.75 64| 60.5
5000 105 133.72 164 165 =0 95.5
8 1/2 x 11, 204 Bond 250 10 13.8 10 16.88 28 15.93
Paper, with state seal 500 20 23 20 286 a0l 31.85
57 10% screened In the 1000 35 41.4 38 48.9 GOJ: 53.7
background, printing 2500 75 78.2 58 96 75] 99.25
on one side !
5000 120 124.2 173 115} 168.5
250 88 82,8l 70
500 1405 147.2 133
58 81/2x51/2, 208 1000 245.1 250,24 255
Bond Paper, . .
2500 549,85 595.24 600
5000 1046.5 1169,32 1175
41/4x5 1/4, 204 Bond 250 32.05 33.4 7.5 397.5
Paper, paper color to 500 8.4 43.61 125 795
59 be SDECifi.Ed. attime of 1000 71.9 64.68 20.5{ 1590
order, printing on one : =l
side, consecutiveley 2500 159 132.28 46} 3975
numbered, number 5000 279.8 240.86 80| 7950




Group 4 - Letterheads, postcards, labels etc.

Speedy
Gonzales D&L Minuteman Roberts
Iltem # Description Price for Printing Printing Safeguard Press Printing Office Depot Hart Label |Print Logics
250 245 16.5 43,5 28 71.43 15.93
500 34.3 25.44 56 35 87.14 31.85
60 Letterhet';ld, 20# - 25 .Rag Bond 1000 52.85 55.2 81.5 50 114.2% 53.7
without graphics
2500 106.5 112.24 157.5 110 232.86 98.25
5000 1595.3 198.72 285 190 39571 168.5
250 24.5 16,5 43,5 28 71.43 15.93
500 343 29.44 56 36 87.14 31.85
61 Le}cterhea?‘ 208 - 2? Rag Bond 1000 52.85 55.2 81.5 50 114.29 53,7
with graphics

2500 106.5 112.24 157.5 116 232.86 099.25
5000 195.3 198.72 285 150 3585.71 168.5
250 32 16.5 23 18 97.14 21
postcards, 5 1/2x 3 1/2, color 500 34.85 21.16 37.25 24 105.71 32
62 to be specified, printing on 1000 43.2 33.12 63 26 131.43 a4
two sides 2500 70,95 68.08 143,75 60 207.14 110
5C00 98.6 112.24 250 271.43 220
250 61.45 30 60| 30.94 35
Docket sheets, Vellum Bristol, 500 8415 55 76 101] 5906 70
63 printing on two sides, 16000 128 105 93 176/ 115.32 130

landscape, two holes punched j
in left margin 2500 254.8 255 234 407.5| 264.7 300
5000 465 505 425 755| 526.84 600
250 31.5 101.5 20.62 97 35
White labels with lines, 6 1/2 500 36.9 1015 52 41.24 117.5 70
64 x3/4 1000 445 143 56 82.48 129 130
2500 69.3 495 110 i50.44 1525 300
5000 105§ 875 145 300.88 163 600
250 38.65 26.35 77 36.35 218 70
500 47.15 49.5 108 72,12 227 130
&5 Chain of Custody labels 1000 63.95 94 142 144,25 248 300
2500 116.85 217.5 226 360.62 291 600
5000 200 420 353 721,25 364 1200
250 40.8 65 58 81.43 25




9X 4 1/4Door Hanger, Vellum 500 49.75), 34 86 60 120 35
66 Bristol, color to be specified, 1000 72 68 128 80 192.29 70
printing on one side 2500 139/ 145 255 130 428,57 175
5000 246.35) 235 455 230 750 250
250 45 49 74.75 58 81.43
11x4 1/4Doar Hanger, Astro 500 58.75 79 53 101 60 120
67 Bright, color to be specified, 1000 90 g5 71 156 80 192.29
printing on one side 2500 184.35 142 195 320 130 428,57
5000 336.65 220 365 595 230 750
250 25.7|: 1 59 12.5 58 92.86
500 30.65 &0 17.15 69 108.57 30
68 Fingerprint cards 1000 54.3 85 24.2 87.5 150 60
2500 84.55 114 50 152 244.29 150
5000 151.2 147 91 270 401.43 300

Due to guality of paper and errors on sample of low bid, D&L recomm

4|

ended for ftems 60,61 & 63



Group #5 folders

ltem #

Description

Price for

Speedy
Ganzales
Printing

D & L Printing

Safeguard

Hart Label

Print Logics

Minuteman Press

Roberts
Printing

Dffice Depot

69

Smead Folder

250

No Bid

No Bid

5{No Bid

No Bid

Neo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

500

1000

2500

5000

5000+
Discount

70

Folders

250

500

1000

2500

5000

5000 +
Discount

71

Folders

250

500

1000

2500

5000

5000 +
Discount




Speedy
Gonzales D&L
[tem# |Description Price for  |Printing Printing Safepuard Hart Label  |Print Logics Minuteman Press Roberts Printing Office Depot

Group & - directories, pamphlets etc.

250 172 93 87.25 240 460
500 309 128 1745 426 501.53
74 {County Directory 1000 462 175 349 730 620
2500 1110.5 394 872.5 1585 1057
5000 2147 685 1745 3045 : 1742.85
Victim's 250 150 390 a0 109 114 254,41
Assistance 500 279.45 480 180 192 148 508.82
75 I"f.mmati?n', two 1000 509,46 620 360 354 209 1017.64
sided printing,
folded, 2500 616.5 930 900 813 393 2525
staggered pages 5000 1750 1800 1560 705 5050
81 90 79 180
Victim's 121 180 140 210
76 Assistance 199 360 262 263
Pamphlet, 430 900 355 434
725 _ 1800 470 694

Due to errors of sample on low bid, D&L recommended for itemi# 76



Group 7 D & L Printing Safeguard Print Logles Minuternan Press Office Depot

10 20 50 75 100 =100 i0 20 Z0 5 100 > 100 1c 20 50 75 100 > 100 10 0 50 75 10 >I00 10 20 30 75 100 > 100
ltem# |Descrip. # of pages manuals |manuals |manuals fmanuals [manuals [manuals [manuvals [manuals {menvals [manuats [manuals [manuals |manuals |manuats [manuats |manvals |manuats |mancals  {manuals manuals |manuals |manuals |manuals fmanuals (manuats  |manuals  Jmanuzls [manuals  |manuals  {manuals
1-25  unh, 16.9 E 715 87 102.5 5% 14 28 2] 104 13%|no hid €6.5 95.4 230.1 351,99 A58.1}4.58ez 8.8 16 365 49.5 60[11.407100() 4 .22ea
26-50 unb, 26.9 AB.6 86.5 124.5 165 5% 23 45 113 180 228{no bid 95.4 174.72 456,42 £54.06 912.42|9.3%ea 17 30.8 70 95.25 115218571000 S72ea
51-75 unb. 344 536 134 154.5 180 5% 31 63 156 234 A15fno bid 139.6 255.58 584,28 957.67| 136B.28(13.68ea 25 45.4 iog 140,25 170(32.30/1004 2| L12ca
76-100 unb, 44.4 6B.6 14E.5 18075 230 5% 46 8D 200 299 402 no bid 1845 3368.51 91221} 1261.35| 1824.21(18.23ea 33 60 13h.5 186 225(42.75/100( ; 1.672ea
122.6 201.9 4485 545,75 687.5 114 216 538 Bos 1084 486.1 86221} 2283.01| 3225.07| 4563.01 3.8 152.2 343 471 570
Manuals > 100  unb, .03 0,03 0.02 5% 0,03s 0.035 0.035 0.035 D.035[no bid 18.45ea |33.66ea  [91.22ez |126.1Mea |18.24ea {1B.24sa+ |.30/sheet |.50/sheet f1.00fsheet|1.50/sheet]z.00/sheet|.38/1000 222 44.4 111 156.5 222|2.22ea
77{with 3 1-25 bound 8% 25 48 122 184 245|no bid 7275 105.6 260,86 90.24 519.62§5.19%a i38 b1 615 87 110|20.90/300( 71 34,2 855 128.2 171]1.71e
coforinks 1650 baund 5% 33 66 166 249 235{no bid 10055 19512 4s7.aB| 730.56] 9v3sa|a7tea 22 40.8 os| 13275 16%|31.35/100 05 512 103 1545 206 2.0520a
51-75  baund 5% 41 83 207 313 417|no bid 145,75 2B6.18 71504 1072.42 1429.8|14.30ea 30 55.4 128 17775 220|431.80/100]] 26.1 52.2 130.5 195.7 261{2.612ea
76-100 baund b 5% 53 105 268 355 534 fno bid 150.65 377.31, ©42.397] 1414.35| 1B85.73(18.8Rea 38 ] iBlSs 2235 275{52.25/1004] 16 63.2 158 237 316|3.162e5
126.68 224,73
>100 bound |nobid no hid no bid o bid no bid 5% 0.035 0.035 0.035 0.035 0.035[no bid 15.6lea  |37.73ea  [94.30en  |14l4dea |1B.B6ea+ |1B.86ea+ {.30/sheet [.50fsheet |1/sheet {1.50/sheet|2.00/shest|.38/1000 7.1 4.2 185.5 782 a71|3.712e=
colored page .04 5% 0.47 0.47 0,47 0.47 0.47 |no bid 0.162 0.162 G.152 0.162 0,162 0.162 15 2.4 5.5 15 s{1.71/1000 0.34
1-25  unh, 125 225 50.5 56,25 £62.5 L3 9 18 A4 &5 8B{no bid a1 264 576 93.24 113.1}+024PP 8.8 i6 6.5 49.5 66| 11.40/100( 1.71ea
2650 unh, 225 a0 75.5 93.75 i25 5% 23 45 113 159 228{no bid 43.2 38.4 1131 138.24 224.1[+024PP 17 30.8 70 85.25 115} 21.85/100(] 2.062az
51-75 unb. 33.75 45 113 123.75 150, 5% 31 63 156 234 A15fno bid 54.3 50.4 164.5 1B3.24 335.1|+024PP 25 45.4 100 140.25 170}32.30/100( 1.12ea
76-100 unb. 40 &0 1255 150 120 5% 44 BD 200 299 A402no hid 65.4 62.4 2241 228.24 507.62|+024FP 33 £ 1365 186 225]|42.75/1004 1.672ez
28 xl::i:ik >300 unb. 0.03 . 0.03 0.025 0.02 0.!1}!? 3% 0.03% 0.035 0.03s 0.635 0.03% | no bid +.024PP |+.024PF |+.024PP [+ 024PP |+024PPF {+024FP .30/shaet |.50/sheet |1./sheet |1.50/sheet{2.fsheet |.38/100G 222 45.4 111 156.5 232]2.22sa
ink 1-25 bitstnd ; 5% i9 3% 87 131 154 | no bid 38.25 36.6 £8.36| 131.49 174.62{+024PP 13.8 ] 61.% a7 110{20.30/100( 17.1 34.2 BS.5 4128.2 171[1.71ea
26-50  bound 5% a3 66 166 249 335 |no bid 49,35 58.8 143,86 214.74 2BS.6Z]+024FP 22 408 a5 132.75 155(31.35/100( 20.6 412 103 154.5 206 2.062e2
51-75 bound 534 41 83 plir 311 417 no bid 60.45 a1 159.36 297.93 396,62 f+024FF 30 55.4 128 17775 270|41.80/160( 261 52.2 130.5 195.7 261)|2.612ea
76-100 baund L 3 5% 53 105 268 359 534|nobid 71.55 103.2 254.86 381,24 A46.1[+024PF 38 70 16815 2235 275152.25/1004 31.6 63.2 158 237 116)3.162ea
>100 bound {nobid no bid no hid no hid no bid 5% 0035 0.035 0.033 0,035 0.035}no bid +0Z4PP  |+024PP  [+024PP  {+024PP  [+024PP  |+024PF .30/sheet |.50/sheet {1./sheet |1,.50/sheet|2./sheet {.3871000 371 74.2 1B5.5 278.2 371)3.7120a
21-.50 35.18 57.66 11B.28] 171.06 2193 5% b1 20 50 75 100|no bid 34.02] 2815 67.21 59.77 132,33|1.32¢ea 5.8 52.5 1090.5 138.75 177{33.63/100 3 16104
26-50 5729 38.25 217.49 313.07 413.2 5% 14 2 70 105 140 no bid 45,12 50.35 i 183,02 243.33|2.43ea 56.5 B5.6 190.5 270 34465.36/100 .BBen
Vietirs 51-75 76.68 137.94 312,16 453.74 600.75 5% 1B 36 51 136 182 [no bid 56,22 7255 178.21 256.27 354.33|3.54ea 75 128 2765 394.5 512f97.268/100 Of1.4ea
Assist. 76-100 98 179,43 411.39 599.84 737.82 5% 23 a6 112 157 224 na hid 67.32 94.75 23371 348.52 465,33 |4.65ea a4 164.6 360.5 5235 680(173.20/10( 3F1.53ea
79§5upp. Info {> 100 0.022{ng hid no bid no bid ne bid 5% [no bid no bid na bid no hid ne hid na bld +.0240¢  ]+.024PP  [+.024PP [+.024PP {+.024PP |+.024PF  |1.00/sheet]i.80fsheet|4.10/sheet|5.65/sheatf6,80/sheet| 1.29/100 no bid
21-50 10.5 15.5 30 45 &0 5% 12 18 4% 70 92ino bid 35.37 30.B5 73.96 109.89 145.83}1.43ea 12.1 208 44 6375 B2|15.58/100 320ea
26-50 15 30 57.5 B6.25 135 5% 18 37 92 141 185fna bid 47.82 55.75 136.21 203.27 270.33|2.70ez 2.1 3.2 B7.5 125.25 182|30.78/100 B4lea
51-75 19,25 34 a5 1275 170 3% 31 58 147 200 2B9|no bid 60,27 BO.6S 158,46 296.64 354.83|3.94¢a 3.4 56.8 128 184.5 241{45.79/100 1.64ea
Supp. T6-100 225 45 1125 168.75 225 5% 38 75 188 282 376 no hid 7272 105.55 260.71 350.02 515.33|5,19%a 398 74 168 246,75 320{60.80/100 |- 4 2.44ea
B0{Guide > 100 £.022{no bid no bid no 5id na hid 5% 2.04 0.04 .04 0.04 .64 |no bid +.024PF  [+.024PP |+.024PF |+.024PP |+,024PF [+.024PP |50/sheet |.B&fsheet [1.55/shectj2.65/sheat|3,20/sheetf.63/100 3.28ea
21-50 103,55 151.05 306,05 557.26(|no bid 5% EE] 53 o2 125 i7i|nobid B64.85 89.81 22139 33103 A40.67|4.4ea 222 EE] a0 136,75 164(31.16/100 i 30,6356
2&-S0 201.05 296,05 B807.26| 1114.52{nobid 5% 37 73 135 191 230]{no bid 12531 210,71 523.64 784.4| 1045.17{10.43ea 40 5.2 169 248 32461.56/100 9] 1.669
51-75 298.55 441.05 91C.841 1671.78|nobid 5% 52 103 215 314 417fna bid 175,31 31271 778.64 1166.9] 1585,17]15.508a &0,7 105.8 2523 371.25 485(92.35/100 | 32738
Pail 76-100 336,05 586.05| 1214,52] 2229.04{nobid 5% 76 127 282 358 S40fno kid 22731 414.71| 103364 1542.4) 2085.17]20.60ea 76.8 1328 EESS 48%1.5 646)122.74/10(: ; 4.845
Workar's | 100 0.22{ne bid no bid no bid no bid 5% D06 0.06 .06 0.06 0,06 ne bid +162PP  |+.162PP  [+.162PP |+.362PP B+.162PP [+ 162PP |.96/sheet |1.74/sheet|3.95/sheet|S.40/sheat|6.50/sheat]1.24/5heet 64513
81 [Manual colored page no bid no hid ne bid no bid no bid 5% 05 0.5 a5 5 0.5|no hid +.162PF  |+.182PP |+.162PP |+.I62PPF [+.1G2PP |+.162FF 1.4 2.4 5.5 7.5 91.71/180 0.37
2150 25.08 47.63 108.87 210.93]ne bid 5% 26 40 83 120 153 [ne bid 39.5 78.01 197,52 296.28 395.04|3.95ea 36.7 63.6 146.5 213,75 280(53.20/100 : - 0.6336
26-50 47.63 88.51 210.83 4172.8{n0 bid 5% 40 72 153 224 294]na bid 56.85 113.71 284,27 426.4 568.545.65ea ES.5 1206 288 424 558|106.02/100 e 511669
51-75 67.85) 12074 31073 611.49)no bid 5% 54 57 224 332 435]{na bid 7420  1e41] ano2| 55633 742.04(7.40ea 94,7 135.2 A28 633 834|158.46/10( .= 32,74 £3:68) - aela.2738
Eloction  |76-100 gg91| 17147 4128]  784.84|no bid 5% 72 125 291 435 576} no bid 9155 18311f asv77|  sm6Es|{  915.54]5.15es 1225 236.4 566.6 B41.5 1111 zn.nehmf AR5 : s3] = agame o 4.845
A2|Quick Ref. |> 100 B.075|no hid no bid no bid no hid 5% Q.045 0.0a% 0.045 0.045 (.045 | no bid + (BEP +.06PP +,06PP +.DBRP +.0GPP +.08PP 1.60/sheet|2.90/sheet| 6.60/sheet|9./sheet  |11/sheat |2.09/100 | 6457 X 6.4519

Due 1o errors on sample of low biddar itam#t 77 bound was recommended to DEL Printing

Qnly yendars whe submitted bids for this group are refiected on this tabulation.



Group 8 continuous forms

Speedy
Gonzales D&L
ltem# |Description [Price for |Printing Printing Safeguard Print Logics Minuteman Press Roherts Printing | Office Depot
250
Receipt forms
500
85 with state of
TX seal 1000
2500
Computer 450 96
form paper 500 545.45 107
86 with seal 1000 602.7 130
screened in 2500 799.95 229
hackground
5000 117455 300




Group 9 non-continuous forms

Speedy
Gonzales D&L
Item # Description Price for Printing Printing Safeguard Hart Label |Print Logics Minutemnan Press Roberts Printing Office Depot

250 6.25 ¢ 10 15,83 12.5 25 5.5
500 125 20 31.85 21.45 38 11
87 11x81/2 1000 25 38 53.7 36.6 55 22
2500 60 74 59.25 73 65 55
5000 100 133 168.5 131 110 110




Speedy

Gonzales D&L Minuteman  |Roberts
ftem # Description Price for Printing Printing Safeguard  [HartLabel |Print Logics |Press Printing Office Depot
Group 10 fists
1 list 20 22 27.38 16 45
88 VR Alpha list 500 pages |5 lists 97.75 107 136.88 70 225
10 lists 194 213 273.76 137.8 425
1list 9 7 11.13 6.44 18
89 Street Guide 200 pages |5 fists 43.8 36 55.67 27.1 90
10 lists 87.6 73 11%.34 52.5 170
1 list 20 22 27.38 17.5
90 Election Day Alpha list |5 lists 97.75 107 136.88 70.75
10 lists 194 213 273.76 139.7




Speedy
Gonzales D&L Minuteman Roberts

ltem # Description Price for Printing Printing Safeguard Mart Label [Print Logics |Press Printing Office Depot
Group 11 - business cards

250 24 29.67 13 43 65 32.85

500 28 34.32 15 45,5 35,75

91 White 1000 34 42.18 19 75 41.45
recylced

2500 46 85.16 30 182.5 90

5000); 85 148,02 55 125 157.15

250 24 5 13 27 23.95

500 28 15 30 27.15

92 White non- 1000 34 19 38 32.85
recylced

2500 46 30 90 4.3

5000 85 55 140 107.15

250 48 14.75 68.85 68.55

White 500 56 18 76.5 71.45

93 recylced, two 1000 68 24 105 77.15

sided printing 2500 91 40 223 147.15

5000 166 75 475 250.58

250 48 14.75 52.2 59.65

White non- 500} 56 18 58 62.85

94 recylced , two 1000 68 24 58 68.55

sided printing 2500 91 40 186 121.46

5000 166 75 290 200.05

250 51.75 40 12 61.65 106.45

White 500 57.75 48 16.5 68.5 108.6

95 recylced, prms 1000 65.25 54 20 g5 115.75

blue 282 and

black 2500 147.35 100 40 256.5 182.85

5000 284.25 200 70 435 285,75

250 51.75 40 12 45 96.8

White non- 500 57.75 48 16.5 50 102,15

gg  |recvlced, pms 1000 65.25 54 20 58 107.85

blue 282 and
black 2500 147.35 100 40 164 150
5000 284.25 200 70 250 221.45




24 29,7 27.5 43.65 32.85

28 34,32 28.5 45,5 35.75

57 White 34 42.18 i3 75 41.45
recylced

46 88.17 70 182.5 90

85 154.25 135 325 157.15

27.5 27 23.95

28.5 30 27.15

98 White non- 33 38 32.85
recylced

70 90 64.3

135 140 107.15

52,5 68.85 68.55

52.5 76.5 71.45

99 White 61 105 77.15
recylced

135 223 147.15

166 239.7 260 475 250.05

48 45.76 52.5 52.5 58,65

56 51.48 52.5 58 62.85

100 White non- 68 58.63 61 68 68.55
recylced

91 124.56 135 186 121.45

166 217.1 260 290 200.05

80 63.28 71 87 100.2

White 100 70,78 71 96.5 102.45

101 recylced, black 108 81.51 79 123 109.6

and golden ink 124 168,18 180 332.5 207.35

230 294,05 350 575 361.3

80 61.49 71 70 90.65

White non- 100 67.21 71 78 95

102 recylced, black 108 74.36 79 86 101.75

and golden ink 124 158.88 180 240 174.5

230 267.45 350 390 297




Due to errars on sampte of low bid, recommended award for item# 91, 93, 94 to Speedy's Printing

250 40 33,97 40 58 43.6

White 500|. 49 38.61 40 64.5 46.45

103 recylced, tan 1000 55 43.87 46 89 58.6
stock 2500 110 94.6 100 2325 117.15

50004 : 235 190 415 207.15

250 33.75 40 40 41.5 43.6

White non- 500 36.75 49 a0 46 46.45

104 recylced, tan 1000 41.25 55 46 52 58.6
stock 2500 91.85 110 100 140 117.15

5000 176.25 235 190 230 207.15

250 40 40 58 43.6

White 500]" 49 40 64.5 46.45

105 recylced, 1000 55 46 89 58.6
brown ink 2500 110 100 2325 117.15

5000} 235 190 415 207.15

250 33.75 40 40 415 43,6

White non- 500 36.75 45 40 46 46.45

106 recylced, 1000 41,25 55 46 52 58.6
brown ink 2500 91.85 110 100 140 117.15

5000 176.25 235 190 230 207.15

and itern# 92, 95, 96 to Safeguard Business Systems



Speedy
Gonzales D&L Minuteman Roberts
ltem # Description Price for Printing Printing Safeguard Hart Label |Print Logics |Prass Printing Office Depot
Group 12 - Overprinting
250 30 25 11.25 25 38.57
address voter 500 30 35 20.5 38 42.86
107 aps - 1000 30 60 37 55 57.14
overprinting 2500 70 135 82,5 65 108.57
5000 128 260 150 80 185,71




