Recommend award: GT - ltems # 1, 5, 7, 14, 15, 17-24, 26
Mitler - ftem # 2, 3, 4, 6, 8, 9-13, 16, 25, 27-42

WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS FOR EMIS PERSONNEL

BID # 10WCAD31

GT Dist Miller
ttem#  |Description sl -|Brand Bid - |Style NumbdSizes - {Price Each. . |Brand Bid - |Style Number|Sizés - Price Each
Uiniform Shirts long sleeve elbeco 14-17 elbeco 14-17
1 Uniform $hirts long sleeve Oversize elbeco 18-20 elbeco 18-20
Uniform Shirts shart sleeve elbeco s-x elbeco s-x|
Uniform Shirts shart sleeve Oversize elbeco 2xl-4xl }|elbeco 2xi-4xl
EMT Trousers Men's elbeco 28-42 28-42
2 EMT Trousers Men's Oversize elbeco 44-56 44-56
EMT Trousers Ladies elbeco sz4-18 524-18
EMT Trousers Ladies Oversize elbeco 20-24 20-24
Uniform Trousers Men's elbeca 28-42- 28-42-
3 Uniform Trousers Men's Oversize elbeco 44-56 44-56
Uniform Trousers Ladies elbeco 524-18 s24-18
Uniform Trousers Oversize elbeco 20-24 20-24
Uniform Cargo Trousers Men's elbeco 28-42 28-42
4 Uniform Cargo Trousers Men's Oversize elbeco 44-56 44-56
Uniform Cargo Trousers Ladias elbeco sz4-18 524-18
Uniform Cargo Trousers Ladies Qversize elbeco 20-24 20-24
TDU Pants Men's 5.11 X5-xx| x5-%x|
5 TDU Pants Men's Oversize 5.11 Ixl-4xl Ixl-4x]
TDU Pants Ladies 2.11 522-20 522-20
TDU Pants Ladies Oversize 5.11 5z2-20 : : 522-20
Long Sleeve Shirt Men's Elbeco 14-17.5 31.47|blaver 14-17.5
6 L.ong Sleeve Shirt Men's Oversize Elbeco 18-20 39.71|blaver 18-20
Long Sleeve Shirt Women's Elbeco 32-44 31.47iblauer 32.44
Long Sleeve Shirt Women's Oversize Elbeco 56-48 39.71|blaver h6-48
2 Polostyle Pullover Shirt port auth s-xl part Auth 5-x}
Palostyle Pullover Shirt Qversize port auth 2x1-4x] | port Auth 2xl-4x|
8 Professional Polo Shirt port auth X5-Xx| port Auth x5-xxl
Professional Polo Shirt Oversize port auth Irg-5x| 8| port Auth Irg-5xI
9 Short Sleeve Knit Shirt Elbeco xs-xl blauer x5~
Short Sleeve Knit Shirt Oversize Elbeco 2xl-4xl blauer 2xl-4x




Short Sleave Shirt Men's Elbeco s-xt 27.81thlaver 5x

19 Short Sleeve Shirt Men's Oversize Elbeco 2xl-axI 36.15}blauer 2xl-4xl
Short Sleeve Shirt Ladies Elbeco 32-44 27.81|blauer 32-44
Short Sleeve Shirt Ladies Qversize Elbeco 46-48 36.15|blauer 46-48

11 Zip Pullover Shirt no bid xs-xl blauer xs-xl
Zip Pullover Shirt Oversize no bid 2xl-axl blauer 2xl-4x|

12 Lightweight Commando Sweater liberty X5-x| 35,97 |blauer %5-xl
Lightweight Commando Sweater Oversize liberty 2xl-axl 44.96|blaver 2xl-4x|

13 Uniform Jacket spiewak Xs5-x| 97.15|blauer *5-X 160;07/

14 |Dress Gloves hatch 5-x1 premier s-xt 6.95

15  [Uniform Tie broome 5|broome 5.41/6.78
Class A Dress Uniform Coat Men's Fech 34-50 na bid Fech 34-50

16 Class A Dress Uniform Coat Men's Oversize Fech 52-60 no bid Fech 52-60
Class A Dress Uniform Coat Ladies Fech 34-50 no bid Fech 34-50
Class A Dress Uniform Coat Ladies Oversize Fech 52-60 Fech 52-60

17 |Dress Patent Leather Belt dutyman ' dutyman

18 |Plain Leather Belt dutyman 5|dutyman

19  |Dress Patent Leather Shoes bates thorogood

20 |Composite Safety Toe Boot 5.11 4-15 511 4-15

21  [Non-Safety Toe Boot 5.11 4-15 511 4-15

22 8" Side Zip Boot 5.11 4-15 5.11 4-15

23  |6" Side Zip Boot 5.11 4-15 5.11 4-15

24  [Shield Boot 511 4.15 511 4-15
Side Pocket Trouser Men's Elbeco 28-42 A7.B|blauer 28-42

75 Side Pocket Trouser Men's Qversize Elbeco 44-56 %7.36]|blaver 44-56
Side Pocket Trouser Ladies Elbeco 5z4-18 47.8|blauver 5z4-18
Side Pocket Trouser Ladies Oversize Elbeco 20-24 57.36|blauer 20-24

L |Taclite Pro-pants 511 28-44 511 28-44
Taclite Pro-Pants Oversize 5.11 46-54 511 46-54

27 Long Sleeve Shirt no bid sx-xxl blauver sx-%xl
Long Sleeve Shirt Oversize no bid 3l blauer axl

28 Short Sleeve Knit Shirt Elbeco SX-xx| 43.45|blauer SX-xx}
Short Sleeve Knit Shirt Oversize Fibeco 3xd 56.5|blauer 3xl

29 Fleece Jacket no bid xs-xl blauer x5-xl
Fleece Jacket Oversize no bid 2xl-4xl blauer 2x1-4x

30|EMT-P Patch - Certified hero 2.05
31|EMT-P Patch - Licensed hero 2.35




32{USA Flag Patch hero 1.42
Collar Rank Insignia-Cloth Lieutenant -
33|Embroidered Gold Bar on White Twill Background/White
Embroidered Border premier 1.65 pr
Color Rank Insignia-Cloth Captain -
34{Embroidered Gold Bars on White Twill Background/White
Embroidered Border premier 1.65 pr
Collar Rank Insignia - Cloth Embroidered Gold Single
33)5tar on White Twil Background/White Embroidered
Border - custom premier 1.65pr
Collar Rank Insignia - Cloth Embroidered Gold Double
36 Star on White Twill Background/White Embroidered
Border - custom no bid
Collar Rank Insignia - Cloth Embroidered Gold Double
37 Star on White Twill Background/White Embroidered
Border - custom na bid
3a|Metal Collar Rank Cellar Rank
Insignia - Mini Captain Smooth Gold hero 3.35pr
3g|Metal Collar Rank Collar Rank
Insignia - Mini Lieutenant Smooth Gold hera 3.35pr
Metal Collar Rank Collar Rank
49| \nsignia - 3/4" Single Smooth Star blackinton 6.78
vietal Collar Rank Collar Rank
41 Insignia - 5/8" Triple Smooth Star blackinton 12.57
Metal Collar Rank Collar Rank
42 |nsignia - 3/4" Smaoth Star blackinton 6.78

Substituted brands did not meet specifications




