
WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION 
CULVERTS – CORRUGATED METAL 

BID NUMBER 12IFB00022 
CONTRACT PERIOD MAY 8, 2012 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2013 

 
Recommended Award: Wilson –    Primary on Items 1.1 - 2.22; 3.1-3.9; 4.4-4.24  
                Contech – Primary on Items 2.23 – 2.30; 4.25-4.30 
        Secondary on Items 1.1 – 2.22; 3.1 – 3.9; 4.4-4.24   
          

 
 

 Item# Description *Wilson **Contech 

   
Unit 

Unit 
Price 

 
Unit 

Unit 
Price 

1 Round-Galv. item bid 
Linear 

Ft 

 
item bid Linear Ft 

 

1.1 12" 

16 G             
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 6.23 16 gauge Linear Ft 6.70 

1.2 15" 

16 G                 
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 7.78 

 
Linear Ft 8.04 

1.3 18" 

16 G                 
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 9.30 

 
Linear Ft 10.05 

1.4 24" 

16 G                  
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 12.38 

 
Linear Ft 12.73 

1.5 30" 

16 G              
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 15.50 

 
Linear Ft 16.08 

1.6 36" 

16 G               
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 18.75 

 
Linear Ft 19.43 

1.7 42" 

16 G              
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 21.68 

 
Linear Ft 23.80 

1.8 48" 

16 G        
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 29.78 14 gauge Linear Ft 33.60 

1.9 54" 

16 G       
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 33.50 14 gauge Linear Ft 37.80 

1.1 60" 

16 G      
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 36.8 16 gauge Linear Ft 38.50 

1.11 72" 

16 G     
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 44.15 16 gauge Linear Ft 46.20 

        



2 

Round-Galv. 
Sloped End 

Treat. 
 

each 

  
each 

 2.1 12" 6:1 
 

each 37.35 
 

each 56.80 
2.2 12" 4:1 

 
each 30.82 

 
each 50.10 

2.3 12" 3:1 
 

each 27.57 
 

each 46.75 
2.4 15" 6:1 

 
each 53.00 

 
each 68.19 

2.5 15" 4:1 
 

each 42.62 
 

each 58.14 
2.6 15" 3:1 

 
each 37.57 

 
each 53.12 

2.7 18" 6:1 
 

each 70.67 
 

each 85.28 
2.8 18" 4:1 

 
each 56.00 

 
each 70.20 

2.9 24" 3:1 
 

each 48.70 
 

each 62.66 
2.1 24" 6:1 

 
each 113.8 

 
each 119.11 

2.11 24" 4:1 
 

each 93.35 
 

each 93.65 
2.12 30" 3:1 

 
each 80.30 

 
each 80.92 

2.13 30" 6:1 
 

each 166.72 
 

each 166.68 
2.14 30" 4:1 

 
each 125.95 

 
each 126.48 

2.15 30" 3:1 
 

each 109.65 
 

each 106.38 
2.16 36" 6:1 

 
each 229.37 

 
each 224.30 

2.17 36" 4:1 
 

each 170.7 
 

each 166.01 
2.18 36" 3:1 

 
each 141.35 

 
each 136.87 

2.19 42" 6:1 
 

each 314.37 
 

each 607.40 
2.2 42" 4:1 

 
each 221.95 

 
each 440.80 

2.21 42" 3:1 
 

each 187.72 
 

each 375.50 
2.22 48" 6:1 

 
each 446.85 

 
each 933.60 

2.23 48" 4:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 664.80 
2.24 48" 3:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 530.40 

2.25 54" 6:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 1156.20 
2.26 54" 4:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 816.00 

2.27 54" 3:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 645.90 
2.28 60" 6:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 1292.00 

2.29 60" 4:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 907.00 
2.30 60" 3:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 714.50 

2.31 72" 6:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each no bid 
2.32 72" 4:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each no bid 

2.33 72" 3:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each no bid 
 

 

 

 



Item # Arched Galvanized Wilson   Contech 

3 

Arched 
Galv. 
Design 

Equiv. 
round 
dia.   Description   Unit  

Unit 
Price   Unit  

Unit 
Price 

3.1 Design 1 15"   17"x13" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 8.78   Linear Ft 7.28 

3.2 Design 2 18"   21"x15" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 10.3   Linear Ft 10.92 

3.3 Design 3 24"   28"x20" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 13.38   Linear Ft 13.84 

3.4 Design 4 30"   35"x24" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 16.5   Linear Ft 17.48 

3.5 Design 5 36"   42"x29" 
14G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 23.33   Linear Ft 26.22 

3.6 Design 6 42"   49"x33" 
14G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 27.08   Linear Ft 31.96 

3.7 Design 7 48"   57"x38" 

14G           
5"x1           
3"x1 

Linear 
Ft 37.05   Linear Ft 36.52 

3.8 Design 8 54"   64" 43"   
Linear 
Ft 41.75   Linear Ft 46.41 

3.9 Design 9 60"   71"x47"   
Linear 
Ft 45.25   Linear Ft 50.98 

 

Item# Description Wilson Contech 
    Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price 

4 

Arched-Galv. 
Sloped End 
Treat. Each   Each   

4.1 12" 6:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.2 12" 4:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.3 12" 3:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.4 15" 6:1 Each 86.45 Each 60.94 
4.5 15" 4:1 Each 66.35 Each 55.48 
4.6 15" 3:1 Each 56.30 Each 49.10 
4.7 18" 6:1 Each 109.57 Each 81.87 
4.8 18" 4:1 Each 82.32 Each 68.22 
4.9 18" 3:1 Each 68.67 Each 61.40 

4.10 24" 6:1 Each 172.7 Each 113.04 
4.11 24" 4:1 Each 125.5 Each 89.79 
4.12 24" 3:1 Each 101.87 Each 78.43 
4.13 30" 6:1 Each 243.42 Each 152.36 



Item# Description Wilson Contech 
    Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price 

4 

Arched-Galv. 
Sloped End 
Treat. Each   Each   

4.14 30" 4:1 Each 173.72 Each 117.4 
4.15 30" 3:1 Each 138.87 Each 99.92 
4.16 36" 6:1 Each 429.8 Each 246.31 
4.17 36" 4:1 Each 301.05 Each 182.6 
4.18 36" 3:1 Each 236.67 Each 151.26 
4.19 42" 6:1 Each 603.85 Each 651.26 
4.20 42" 4:1 Each 418.5 Each 475.48 
4.21 42" 3:1 Each 175.8 Each 387.59 
4.22 48" 6:1 Each 772.5 Each 826.92 
4.23 48" 4:1 Each 532.35 Each 595.62 
4.24 48" 3:1 Each 412.27 Each 479.98 
4.25 54" 6:1 Each no bid Each 1150.63 
4.26 54" 4:1 Each no bid Each 818.03 
4.27 54" 3:1 Each no bid Each 651.26 
4.28 60" 6:1 Each no bid Each 1359.99 
4.29 60" 4:1 Each no bid Each 960.64 
4.30 60" 3:1 Each no bid Each 760.97 

 

*Wilson was overall low on items they bid (1 - 2.22; 3-3.9; 4.4-4.24), vendor checked “all or none” 
**Contech is recommended to be awarded the items Wilson did not bid (Items 2.23 – 2.30;  
      4.25-4.30), vendor checked “low item basis”, and secondary on the items Wilson bid 
 
 
 


