
           

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC 
WILLIAMSON COUNTY COMMISSIONER’S COURT 

MAY 8TH, 2012
9:30 A.M.

           

The Commissioner’s Court of Williamson County, Texas will meet in regular
session in the Commissioner's Courtroom, 710 Main Street, in Georgetown,
Texas to consider the following items:

 

1. Review and approval of minutes.
 

2. Consider noting in minutes any off right-of-way work on any County road done by Road & Bridge Division.
 

 

3. Hear County Auditor concerning invoices, bills, Quick Check Report, Wire Transfers and Electronic
Payments submitted for payment and take appropriate action including, but not limited to approval for
payment provided said items are found by the County Auditor to be legal obligations of the county. 

 

4. Citizen comments. Except when public hearings are scheduled for later in the meeting, this will be the
only opportunity for citizen input. The Court invites comments on any matter affecting the county, whether
on the Agenda or not. Speakers should limit their comments to three minutes. Note that the members of
the Court may not comment at the meeting about matters that are not on the agenda.

 

CONSENT AGENDA
The Consent Agenda includes non-controversial and routine items that the Court may act on with one
single vote. The Judge or a Commissioner may pull any item from the consent agenda in order that the
court discuss and act upon it individually as part of the Regular Agenda.
( Items 5 – 15 )
 

 

5. To discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for District Attorneys office
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0440-004350 Printed Materials & Biniding $1500

From 0100-0440-005758 Law Books >$5000 $1000

To 0100-0440-003100 Office Supplies $2500

 

6. Discuss and Consider approving a line item transfer for Emergency Communications.
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 100.0581.003100 Office Supplies 1295.00

To 100.0581.003006 Office Equipment 1295.00

 

7. Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for Extension Services
 

  



Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 100-0655-004544 Repairs to Office Equipment 120.00

To 100-0655-004221 Livestock Show 120.00

 

8. To discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for Justice of the Peace Pct. One.
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0451-001100 Full Time Employee 2000.00

to 0100-0451-001107 Temp. Position 2000.00

 

9. To discuss and take appropriate action on the approval of a Line Item Transfer for Road and Bridge.
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0200-0210-005000 Capital Outlay $505.34

To 0200-0210-004531 Maint. Agreements - Brushy Cre $505.34

 

10. Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the Parks Department
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100.0510.001100 F/T Salaries 217.00 1

To 0100.0510.001110 Overtime 217.00 2

From 0100.0510.001100 F/T Salaries 8752.00 3

To 0100.0510.001107 Temp Labor - Seasonal Help 8752.00 4

 

11. Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the Sheriff's Office
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0409-004998 Non Dept/Contingencies $30,000

To 0100-0560-003530 SO/Inv. Svcs/Supplies $30,000

 

12. Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the 277th District Court:
 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
To 0100-0437-004010 277th Dist Ct/Visiting Judge 3,000.00

From 0100-0409-004998 Non Dept/Contingencies 3,000.00

 

13. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding closing Engadina Pass for a block party on May 12, 2012
from 5:00 p.m. until 8:00 p.m.

  



 

14. Consider accepting a $100.00 donation for a Memorial Tree planting in Honor of Mr. Jim Flaggert.
 

15. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing the transfer of various equipment items
through inter-office transfer, auction, donation, destruction, or trade-in.

 

REGULAR AGENDA
 

16. Discuss and take appropriate action on National Children's's Mental Health Awareness Day and
supporting resolution.

 

17. Discuss and take appropriate action on Recognizing the Receipt of the Texas Comptroller Leadership
Circle Gold Member Award for the third consecutive year.

 

18. Hear presentation and recognize David Dukes, Assistant Financial Director, of the County Auditor's Office
with the Certified Public Finance Officers designation of the Government Finance Officers Association.

 

19. Hear update by the Williamson County Conservation Foundation (WCCF) on proposed endangered
species listing for Williamson County salamanders.

 

20. To discuss and take appropriate action on the Department of Infrastructure's projects and issues update.
 

21. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing the publication of notice pursuant to Section
272.001 of the Texas Local Government Code to exchange certain real property owned by Williamson
County for real property within the proposed future expansion of SH 29.

 

22. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate
Contract with Sylvia Ann Thomas for ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 132)

 

23. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a letter agreement
with Janis K. Johnson for easements needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109C)

 

24. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate
Contract with Wilford C. Schneider, Trustee of the ECS Heritage Trust for ROW needed on SH 195.
(PARCEL 109B)

 

25. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate
Contract with John B. Schneider, Trustee of the JBS Heritage Trust for ROW needed on SH 195.
(PARCEL 109A)

 

26. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding  authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate
Contract with W. Charles Schneider A/K/A Wilford Charles Schneider, Individually and as Trustee for the
WCS Heritage Trust, Janis K. Johnson F/K/A Jan Schneider, Individually and as Trustee of the
JHJ Heritage Trust, and John B. Schneider A/K/A John Behrens Schneider, Individually and as Trustee of
the JBS Heritage Trust for ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109)

 

27. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a SECOND
AMENDMENT TO DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT AND FIRST AMENDMENT TO POSSESSION AND
USE AGREEMENT with Highland Six Twenty Residential, LTD. a Texas limited partnership regarding the
reimbursement of construction costs incurred by Developer in relation to the extension of Great Oaks and
O'Connor Blvd.

 

28. Consider and take appropriate action on Determination Letter for mitigation under the County's Habitat
Conservation Plan (HCP) for improvements to Ranch-to-Market (RM) 620 between Cornerwood Drive
and Wyoming Spring Drive under the county's road bond program.

 

  



 

29. Consider and take appropriate action on authorizing the Tax Assessor/Collector's participation in the
LOGIC - Local Government Investment Cooperative Participation Agreement.

 

30. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding approving renewal of the Non-Emergency Curfew
Resolution.

 

31. Discuss and take appropriate action on creation of a subcommittee of the Williamson County Mental
Health Task Force for children and youth called the Williamson County Children and Youth Behavioral
Health Subcommittee.

 

32. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding awarding bids received for Culverts-Corrugated Metal to
the low bids meeting specifications; Wilson Culverts and Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC.

 

33. Discuss and take appropriate action regarding awarding bids received for Asphalt Emulsions to the
lowest  bids meeting specifications, Ergon Asphalt, Cleveland Asphalt and Martin Midstream.

 

34. Hear update on Medicaid 1115 Waiver, discuss and take appropriate action if needed.
 

EXECUTIVE SESSION
"The Commissioners Court for Williamson County reserves the right to
adjourn into executive session at any time during the course of this
meeting to discuss any of the matters listed above, as authorized by Texas
Government Code Sections 551.071 (Consultations with Attorney), 551.072
(Deliberations regarding Real Property), 551.073 (Deliberations regarding
Gifts and Donations), 551.074 (Personnel Matters), 551.076 (Deliberations
regarding Security Devices) and 551.087 (Deliberations regarding
Economic Development Negotiations)."

 

35. Discuss real estate matters (EXECUTIVE SESSION as per VTCA Govt. Code sec. 551.072 Deliberation
Regarding Real Estate Property if deliberation in an open meeting would have a detrimental effect on the
position of the governmental body in negotiations with third person.)
1. Proposed or potential purchase or lease of property by the County:
a) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for SH 195 0.805 South of Bell County Line to
IH 35.
b) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for US 183 Extension from 1,000 feet South of
San Gabriel to 1,000 feet North of SH 29.
c) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for O'Connor Boulevard and 620 projects.
d) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for Ronald Reagan Blvd. Phase II project from
FM 3405 to Reagan Blvd.
e) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for Ronald Reagan Blvd. Phase III and Phase
IV.
f) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for proposed SH 29 project.
g) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way along Lakeline extension.
h) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way along CR 170. 
i) Discuss proposed acquisition and/or sale of property for Arterial H.

 

36. Discuss pending or contemplated litigation, settlement matters and other confidential attorney-client legal
matters (EXECUTIVE SESSION as per VTCA Govt. Code sec. 551.071 consultation with attorney.),
including the following: 

a) Litigation or claims or potential litigation or claims against the County or by the County. 
b) Status Update-Pending Cases or Claims;
c) Cause No. 06-453-C277; Kerry Heckman et al. v. Williamson County, et al., In the District Court of
Williamson County, Texas, 277th Judicial District 
d) Civil Action No. 1:10-CV-869-LY; Heather Clark, David Claxton & David M. Compton v. Williamson

  



County; In the United States District Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division 
e) Case No. A11CA403 SS; Ruben Yzquierdo v. Williamson County and the Williamson County Sheriff’s
Department; In the United States District Court, Western District of Texas, Austin Division
f) Case No. A11CA 300LY; Michelle Sheffield v. John Doe I, Individually and in his Official Capacity,
Williamson County and the Williamson County Sheriff’s Department; In the United States District Court,
Western District of Texas, Austin Division; 
g) Civil Action No. 11-278; Will Aguilar v. Williamson County, Texas; Daniel Robertson, and Michael
Baxter; In the United States District Court, Western District of Texas, Austin Division
h) Employment related matters. 
i) Other confidential attorney-client matters, including contracts and certain matters related to county
defense issues in which the duty of the attorney to the governmental body within the attorney/client
relationship clearly conflicts with Chapter 551 of the Texas Government Code.
j) Civil Action No. 1:11-cv-907, Sarah Doe et al. v. Jerald Neveleff et al., In the United States District Court
for the Western District of Texas Austin Division
k) Mortgage Electronic Recording Systems (MERS) litigation.
l) Legal matters regarding the Williamson County Justice Center Parking Garage
m ) Civil Action No. A12CV0062LY; Kevin Jones v. Williamson County Sheriff’s Office; In the United
States District Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division.
n) Civil Action No. 1:12-CV-190-LY; Steven Hester v. Williamson County; In the United States District
Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division.

 

37. Discuss and take appropriate action on real estate.
 

38. Discuss and take appropriate action on pending or contemplated litigation, settlement matters and other
confidential attorney-client legal matters, including the following: 

a) Litigation or claims or potential litigation or claims against the County or by the County. 
b) Status Update-Pending Cases or Claims;
c) Cause No. 06-453-C277; Kerry Heckman et al. v. Williamson County, et al., In the District Court of
Williamson County, Texas, 277th Judicial District 
d) Civil Action No. 1:10-CV-869-LY; Heather Clark, David Claxton & David M. Compton v. Williamson
County; In the United States District Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division 
e) Case No. A11CA403 SS; Ruben Yzquierdo v. Williamson County and the Williamson County Sheriff’s
Department; In the United States District Court, Western District of Texas, Austin Division
f) Case No. A11CA 300LY; Michelle Sheffield v. John Doe I, Individually and in his Official Capacity,
Williamson County and the Williamson County Sheriff’s Department; In the United States District Court,
Western District of Texas, Austin Division; 
g) Civil Action No. 11-278; Will Aguilar v. Williamson County, Texas; Daniel Robertson, and Michael
Baxter; In the United States District Court, Western District of Texas, Austin Division
h) Employment related matters. 
i) Other confidential attorney-client matters, including contracts and certain matters related to county
defense issues in which the duty of the attorney to the governmental body within the attorney/client
relationship clearly conflicts with Chapter 551 of the Texas Government Code.
j) Civil Action No. 1:11-cv-907, Sarah Doe et al. v. Jerald Neveleff et al., In the United States District Court
for the Western District of Texas Austin Division
k) Mortgage Electronic Recording Systems (MERS) litigation.
l) Legal matters regarding the Williamson County Justice Center Parking Garage
m ) Civil Action No. A12CV0062LY; Kevin Jones v. Williamson County Sheriff’s Office; In the United
States District Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division.
n) Civil Action No. 1:12-CV-190-LY; Steven Hester v. Williamson County; In the United States District
Court for the Western District of Texas, Austin Division.

 

39. Comments from Commissioners.
 

40. Recess 1:00 pm.

Hear Presentation by Alvin Lankford, Chief Appraiser, Williamson County Appraisal District

Hear Presentation by Eric Smith, benefits consultant for Williamson County

  



 

_________________________ 
Dan A. Gattis, County Judge 

This notice of meeting was posted in the locked box located on the south side of the Williamson County
Courthouse, a place readily accessible to the general public at all times, on the ______ day of ________, 2012 at
________ and remained posted for at least 72 continuous hours preceding the scheduled time of said meeting.

  



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   5.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line item transfer for the purchase of office supplies
Submitted By: Judy Kocian, District Attorney
Department: District Attorney
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
To discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for District Attorneys office

Background
Necessary to purchase office supplies for District Attorney employees to use in their daily job responsibilities

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0440-004350 Printed Materials & Biniding $1500

From 0100-0440-005758 Law Books >$5000 $1000

To 0100-0440-003100 Office Supplies $2500

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/01/2012 03:48 PM
District Attorney (Originator) Judy Kocian 05/01/2012 04:29 PM

Form Started By: Judy Kocian Started On: 04/30/2012 09:59 AM
Final Approval Date: 05/01/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   6.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line Item Transfer
Submitted For: Scott Parker Submitted By: Gene Smith, Emergency

Communications
Department: Emergency Communications
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and Consider approving a line item transfer for Emergency Communications.

Background
Shredder is non functioning and repair is cost prohibitive.  Must have shredder to destroy secure
TLETS information.

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 100.0581.003100 Office Supplies 1295.00

To 100.0581.003006 Office Equipment 1295.00

Attachments
2604CC

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/01/2012 03:48 PM
Budget Office Ashlie Blaylock 05/02/2012 09:05 AM

Form Started By: Gene Smith Started On: 05/01/2012 01:24 PM
Final Approval Date: 05/02/2012 



SALES QUOTE

Sales Quote No: Q34357

Account No:

Date: 5/1/12

WC1168

Williamson County Emergency Communication
Attn: Gene Smith
508 South Rock Street
Georgetown, TX  

Ship To:Williamson County Emergency Communication
Attn: Gene Smith
508 South Rock Street
Georgetown, TX  

Bill To:

10360 Sorrento Valley Road
Suite C San Diego, CA 92121
P: (800) 992-5279 F: (858) 552-8609

Sales Person P.O. Number Ship Method Payment Terms Quote Expires On

Notes

5/31/12Net 30 Days*Kevin Wong Best Way

 - FREE SHIPPING - Customer is responsible for getting the unit off the truck and inside facility
 - GSA Contract # GS-02F-0166V - Exp. Date August 11th, 2014

Amount  DiscUMDescription Quantity PriceItem No

2604CC Destroyit Shredder 2604CC Cross Cut - includes automatic oiler 1.00 EACH $1,295.00 0.00 $1,295.00

Discount

Sales Tax

Freight

Sales Order Total

Subtotal

$0.00

$1,295.00

$0.00

Email address: sales@claryco.com

WE WILL BEAT ANY COMPETITOR QUOTE OR ADVERTISED PRICE BY 5%

$1,295.00

$0.00

Page 1 of 1



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   7.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line Item Transfer
Submitted By: Donna Colburn, Ag Extension
Department: Ag Extension
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for Extension Services

Background

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 100-0655-004544 Repairs to Office Equipment 120.00

To 100-0655-004221 Livestock Show 120.00

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/01/2012 03:48 PM
Donna Colburn (Originator) Donna Colburn 05/01/2012 04:22 PM

Form Started By: Donna Colburn Started On: 05/01/2012 03:42 PM
Final Approval Date: 05/01/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   8.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

To discuss and consider transferring funds 
Submitted For: Dain Johnson Submitted By: Bonnie Sims, J.P.

Pct. #1
Department: J.P. Pct. #1
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
To discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for Justice of the Peace Pct. One.

Background
Consider transfering funds from Full time position to Temp. position to finish our the month of May and 1rst week of
June to allow time to consider hiring empolyee full time or posting position outside the county. 

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0451-001100 Full Time Employee 2000.00

to 0100-0451-001107 Temp. Position 2000.00

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/02/2012 02:46 PM
Bonnie Sims (Originator) Bonnie Sims 05/02/2012 03:21 PM

Budget Office Ashlie Blaylock 05/03/2012 10:32 AM
Form Started By: Bonnie Sims Started On: 05/02/2012 09:22 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   9.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

To discuss and take appropriate action on the approval of a line item transfer for Road and Bridge
Submitted By: Megan Smith, Unified Road System
Department: Unified Road System
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
To discuss and take appropriate action on the approval of a Line Item Transfer for Road and Bridge.

Background
The Brushy Creek MUD performs maintenance of the roadway median through an agreement with the County. 
The agreement stipulates a base rate and includes an automatic CPI rate increase.  A transfer of $505.34 is
necessary to cover the cost of the final Brushy Creek invoice for this fiscal year.

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0200-0210-005000 Capital Outlay $505.34

To 0200-0210-004531 Maint. Agreements - Brushy Cre $505.34

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 08:49 AM
URS (Originator) Lydia Linden 05/03/2012 09:47 AM
Budget Office Ashlie Blaylock 05/03/2012 10:32 AM

Form Started By: Megan Smith Started On: 05/03/2012 08:09 AM
Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   10.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line item transfer for Parks Department
Submitted For: Randy Bell Submitted By: Randy Bell, Parks
Department: Parks
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the Parks Department

Background
Funds are necessary to assist with park operations.

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100.0510.001100 F/T Salaries 217.00 1

To 0100.0510.001110 Overtime 217.00 2

From 0100.0510.001100 F/T Salaries 8752.00 3

To 0100.0510.001107 Temp Labor - Seasonal Help 8752.00 4

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:18 AM
Budget Office Ashlie Blaylock 05/03/2012 10:35 AM

Form Started By: Randy Bell Started On: 05/03/2012 08:32 AM
Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   11.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line Item Transfer
Submitted By: Ashlie Blaylock, Budget Office
Department: Budget Office
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the Sheriff's Office

Background
On going investigation requiring expensive testing

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
From 0100-0409-004998 Non Dept/Contingencies $30,000

To 0100-0560-003530 SO/Inv. Svcs/Supplies $30,000

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:44 AM
Form Started By: Ashlie Blaylock Started On: 05/03/2012 11:04 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   12.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Line Item Transfer
Submitted By: Wendy Coco, County Judge
Department: County Judge
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and consider approving a line item transfer for the 277th District Court:

Background

Fiscal Impact

From/To Acct No. Description Amount Sort Seq
To 0100-0437-004010 277th Dist Ct/Visiting Judge 3,000.00

From 0100-0409-004998 Non Dept/Contingencies 3,000.00

Form Review
Form Started By: Wendy Coco Started On: 05/03/2012 03:42 PM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   13.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Engadina Pass Block Party
Submitted For: Valerie Covey Submitted By: Rachel Rull,

Commissioner Pct. #3
Department: Commissioner Pct. #3
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding closing Engadina Pass for a block party on May 12, 2012 from 5:00
p.m. until 8:00 p.m.

Background
This has been through the road closure request process.

Location: Engadina Pass in Teravista
Date: May 12, 2012
Time: 5:00 p.m. - 8:00 p.m.
Number of Attendees: Approx. 30 people
Contact Person: Penny Bradshaw
Contact Number: 512/699-5022

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Rachel Rull Started On: 05/03/2012 08:42 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   14.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Memorial Tree in Honor of Jim Flaggert
Submitted For: Randy Bell Submitted By: Randy Bell, Parks
Department: Parks
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Consider accepting a $100.00 donation for a Memorial Tree planting in Honor of Mr. Jim Flaggert.

Background
The Williamson County Parks & Recreation Department is in receipt of a $100.00 donation for the Memorial Tree
Program. The donation is given in Honor of Mr. Jim Flaggert by Cathy and Louis Sariego. A Monterey Oak
tree was planted at Berry Springs Park and Preserve.

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Randy Bell Started On: 05/03/2012 09:28 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   15.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Asset Change
Submitted For: Auditors Office Submitted By: Connie Singleton,

Purchasing
Department: Purchasing
Agenda Category: Consent

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing the transfer of various equipment items through
inter-office transfer, auction, donation, destruction, or trade-in.

Background

Attachments
Asset Change Form

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/02/2012 11:09 AM
Form Started By: Connie Singleton Started On: 05/02/2012 09:07 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/02/2012 











   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   16.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

National Childrens Mental Health Awareness Day 
Submitted For: Cynthia Long Submitted By: Kathy Pierce,

Commissioner Pct. #2
Department: Commissioner Pct. #2
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action on National Children's's Mental Health Awareness Day and supporting
resolution.

Background

Attachments
Resolution 

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Kathy Pierce Started On: 05/02/2012 12:16 PM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 







   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   17.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

County Auditor
Submitted For: David U. Flores Submitted By: David Dukes, County

Auditor
Department: County Auditor
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action on Recognizing the Receipt of the Texas Comptroller Leadership Circle Gold
Member Award for the third consecutive year.

Background
Williamson County, again this year, received the highest distinction from the Comptroller of Public Accounts that
recognizes local governments that are striving to meet a high standard for financial transparency online.  "Gold"
highlights those entities that are setting the bar with their transparency efforts.

Requirements Include:
-Presentation of current CAFR and at least the 2 previous years.
-Transparency web page accessible from the home page which will link the user to the various departments
concerned with financial transparency.
-Easy to access financial documents for at least the previous 3 years.
-Payment descriptions must be included within the payment registers.
-Visual representation of financial data - charts or graphs that make the financial data more easily understood by
the public.

Williamson County received 19 out of a possible 20 points.  This award is good for one year and must be re-applied
for each year meeting revised and improved criteria.

Questions may be directed to Julie Kiley in the Auditor's Office.  512/943-1552 or jkiley@wilco.org.

Attachments
Letter from Susan Combs State Comptroller
2012 Gold Leadership Circle Award

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/01/2012 03:48 PM
Form Started By: David Dukes Started On: 04/27/2012 09:38 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/01/2012 

mailto:jkiley@wilco.org






   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   18.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Certified Public Finance Officer Designation for David Dukes
Submitted For: Julie Kiley Submitted By: Julie Kiley, County

Auditor
Department: County Auditor
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Hear presentation and recognize David Dukes, Assistant Financial Director, of the County Auditor's Office with the
Certified Public Finance Officers designation of the Government Finance Officers Association.

Background
Micki Rundell, Chief Financial Officer for the City of Georgetown, and Past President for the Government Finance
Officers Association of Texas will make the presentation.  

David Dukes has been employed with the County for almost 7 years. He has worked in HR and the Auditor's Office
during his tenure. He holds a degree in accounting from the University of Texas at Arlington. All of David’s prior
work experience is in oil and gas with employers such as Duke Energy and ConocoPhillips.  As the Assistant
Financial Director, David manages the accountanting staff and assists the staff with their daily assignments.
Reviews accounting transactions, is responsible for producing the Popular Annual Financial Report and is the
administrator for the County Auditor’s website. 

Attached is the letter, press release and certificate from the Government Finance Officers Association.

Attachments
DavidDukesCPFO

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Julie Kiley Started On: 05/03/2012 08:22 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Williamson County Conservation Foundation
Submitted For: Mary Clark Submitted By: Mary Clark, Commissioner

Pct. #1
Department: Commissioner Pct. #1
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Hear update by the Williamson County Conservation Foundation (WCCF) on proposed endangered species listing
for Williamson County salamanders.

Background
Beginning in October 2011, the WCCF initiated a process of scientific and economic review to respond to the U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service, (FWS) on potential listing of salamander species in Williamson County. The existing
research on these species – the Georgetown salamander, the Jollyville Plateau salamander and Salado
salamander– is limited and narrow in scope. The WCCF, and their consultants have teamed up to develop a
knowledge and resource base to assist the County in responding to the potential listing. The expected timing of the
Federal Register notice of listing action(s) for the three Williamson County species is late spring, 2012.

The presentation today will summarize the findings, to date, of the review team and provide an overview of
practicable alternatives to be considered and acted upon by the WCCF.

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:44 AM
Form Started By: Mary Clark Started On: 05/02/2012 04:24 PM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   20.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

To discuss and take appropriate action on the Department of Infrastructures projects and issues update 
Submitted For: Robert Daigh Submitted By: Lydia Linden, Unified

Road System
Department: Unified Road System
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
To discuss and take appropriate action on the Department of Infrastructure's projects and issues update.

Background

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 04/16/2012 08:27 AM
Form Started By: Lydia Linden Started On: 04/13/2012 12:53 PM

Final Approval Date: 04/16/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Notice of Publication 
Submitted For: Cynthia Long Submitted By: Kathy Pierce,

Commissioner Pct. #2
Department: Commissioner Pct. #2
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing the publication of notice pursuant to Section 272.001 of
the Texas Local Government Code to exchange certain real property owned by Williamson County for real property
within the proposed future expansion of SH 29.

Background

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:46 AM
Form Started By: Kathy Pierce Started On: 05/03/2012 10:40 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   22.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

SH 195 Contract
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate Contract
with Sylvia Ann Thomas for ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 132)

Background

Attachments
Thomas Contract

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:20 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

SH 195 Easement Letter Agreement
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a letter agreement with Janis
K. Johnson for easements needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109C)

Background

Attachments
Johnson Letter Agreement

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:22 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

SH 195 Contract
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate Contract
with Wilford C. Schneider, Trustee of the ECS Heritage Trust for ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109B)

Background

Attachments
Schneider 109B Contract

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:24 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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SH 195 Contract
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate Contract
with John B. Schneider, Trustee of the JBS Heritage Trust for ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109A)

Background

Attachments
SCHNEIDER 109A Contract

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:25 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

SH 195 Contract
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding  authorizing County Judge to execute a Real Estate Contract
with W. Charles Schneider A/K/A Wilford Charles Schneider, Individually and as Trustee for the
WCS Heritage Trust, Janis K. Johnson F/K/A Jan Schneider, Individually and as Trustee of the JHJ Heritage Trust,
and John B. Schneider A/K/A John Behrens Schneider, Individually and as Trustee of the JBS Heritage Trust for
ROW needed on SH 195. (PARCEL 109)

Background

Attachments
Schneider 109 Contract

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:16 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:32 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 























































































   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   27.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Great Oaks OConnor Amendment
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding authorizing County Judge to execute a SECOND AMENDMENT TO
DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT AND FIRST AMENDMENT TO POSSESSION AND USE AGREEMENT with
Highland Six Twenty Residential, LTD. a Texas limited partnership regarding the reimbursement of construction
costs incurred by Developer in relation to the extension of Great Oaks and O'Connor Blvd.

Background

Attachments
Highland 620 Amendment

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:15 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:36 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Determination Letter RM 620 WCCF appl 20120424
Submitted For: Gary Boyd Submitted By: Gary Boyd, Parks
Department: Parks
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Consider and take appropriate action on Determination Letter for mitigation under the County's Habitat
Conservation Plan (HCP) for improvements to Ranch-to-Market (RM) 620 between Cornerwood Drive and
Wyoming Spring Drive under the county's road bond program.

Background
A copy of the proposed Determination Letter is attached which outlines impact mitigation for this roadway project.

Attachments
determination letter RM 620

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:18 AM
Form Started By: Gary Boyd Started On: 04/30/2012 09:15 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



WILLIAMSON COUNTY
CONSERVATION FOUNDATION

Also by email to Mike Weaver,
Prime Strategies; Christen
Eschberger, HNTB

Board of Directors
As of April 11, 2012

Pet. 1 Commissioner
Usa Birkman,

Board President
Williamson County, TX

Pet. 3 Commissioner
Valerie Covey

Board Vice President
Williamson County, TX

I
VACANT I

Patty Eason I
Council Member

Gty of Georgetown, TX

Maria Acosta
Cedar Park, TX

Rob Rothenberg
Rothenberg Realty

Georgetown, TX

LanyQuick
President, Upper Brush Creek

Water Control &
Improvement District

Round Rock, TX

c/o Parks and Recreation
219 Perry Mayfield
Leander, TX 78641

April 25, 2012

Williamson County Road Bond Program
c/o The Honorable Dan Gattis, County Judge.
710 Main Suite 101
Georgetown, Texas 78626

Re: Improvements to Ranch-to-Market (RM) 620 between Cornerwood Drive
and Wyoming Spring Drive.

Dear Judge Gattis:

The review of the referenced project has been completed in accordance with
the Williamson County Regional Habitat Conservation Plan (RHCP). Based on
the provided supporting documents, the Williamson County Conservation
Foundation makes the following determination as to this application:

1. The mitigation fee for the referenced project will be $550,897.00 (Five
hundred fifty thousand Eight hundred ninety-seven and no hundredths
Dollars). This amount ("Participation Fee") will be reflected in Paragraph
2 of the Participation Agreement (the "Agreement").

2. Please notify this office as soon as possible - by email to
wccf@wilco.org or by fax to 512-260-4237 - of agreement to these
mitigation terms.

3. Following acceptance by the Williamson County Road Bond Program
funds will be appropriately transferred to the accounts of Williamson
County Conservation Foundation.

4. Upon transfer of the Participation Fee the Agreement will be prepared
and sent to you for signature. Please return a signed copy of the
agreement to us. This office will handle filing of documents in
Williamson County official public records.

These actions will complete this portion of the county's participation in the
RHCP for the referenced project. When WCCF receives notice that the
consultation is complete, this office will subsequently prepare and mail a
participation certificate to the Williamson County Road Bond Program.
Although the certificate is not an official document, it may be posted at the
project site as notification of participation in the Williamson County RHCP.

Should you have any questions about this letter, please contact WCCF.

mailto:wccf@wilco.org


Sincerely,

Gary D. Boyd
Director, Environmental Pr grams
Williamson County Conservation Foundation

Agreed as to both form and substance:

By: _

Title:

Date: ------------

Page 2 of 2
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

LOGIC - Local Government Investment Cooperative Participation Agreement
Submitted For: Deborah Hunt Submitted By: Sandra Surratt, County Tax Assessor

Collector
Department: County Tax Assessor Collector
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Consider and take appropriate action on authorizing the Tax Assessor/Collector's participation in the LOGIC -
Local Government Investment Cooperative Participation Agreement.

Background

Attachments
LOGIC Participation Agreement

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

Hal Hawes Lucille D'Elia 05/03/2012 11:36 AM
Jalyn Morris Jalyn Morris 05/03/2012 11:41 AM

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:46 AM
Form Started By: Sandra Surratt Started On: 05/03/2012 10:00 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Non-Emergency Curfew Resolution
Submitted By: Deborah Wolf, Sheriff
Department: Sheriff
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding approving renewal of the Non-Emergency Curfew Resolution.

Background
To renew expired Non-Emergency Curfew Resolution.

Attachments
Curfew Resolution

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:17 AM
Form Started By: Deborah Wolf Started On: 05/02/2012 09:13 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 













   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   31.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Childrens Mental Health Subcommittee 
Submitted For: Cynthia Long Submitted By: Kathy Pierce,

Commissioner Pct. #2
Department: Commissioner Pct. #2
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action on creation of a subcommittee of the Williamson County Mental Health Task
Force for children and youth called the Williamson County Children and Youth Behavioral Health Subcommittee.

Background

Attachments
Children and Youth Subcommittee bylaws

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:17 AM
Form Started By: Kathy Pierce Started On: 05/02/2012 11:45 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 







   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   32.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Award Culverts-Corrugated Metal 12IFB00022
Submitted By: Kerstin Hancock, Purchasing
Department: Purchasing
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding awarding bids received for Culverts-Corrugated Metal to the low bids
meeting specifications; Wilson Culverts and Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC.

Background
Recommended Award: Wilson – Primary on Items 1.1 - 2.22; 3.1-3.9; 4.4-4.24
Wilson was overall low on items they bid (1 - 2.22; 3-3.9; 4.4-4.24), vendor checked “all or none”
Contech – Primary on Items 2.23 – 2.30; 4.25-4.30
Secondary on Items 1.1 – 2.22; 3.1 – 3.9; 4.4-4.24 
Contech is recommended to be awarded the items Wilson did not bid (Items 2.23 – 2.30; 
4.25-4.30), vendor checked “low item basis”, and secondary on the items Wilson bid

Attachments
Bid Tabulation Culverts - Corrugated Metal

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

Purchasing (Originator) Kerstin Hancock 05/03/2012 11:24 AM
County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:44 AM

Form Started By: Kerstin Hancock Started On: 05/03/2012 08:04 AM
Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION 
CULVERTS – CORRUGATED METAL 

BID NUMBER 12IFB00022 
CONTRACT PERIOD MAY 8, 2012 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2013 

 
Recommended Award: Wilson –    Primary on Items 1.1 - 2.22; 3.1-3.9; 4.4-4.24  
                Contech – Primary on Items 2.23 – 2.30; 4.25-4.30 
        Secondary on Items 1.1 – 2.22; 3.1 – 3.9; 4.4-4.24   
          

 
 

 Item# Description *Wilson **Contech 

   
Unit 

Unit 
Price 

 
Unit 

Unit 
Price 

1 Round-Galv. item bid 
Linear 

Ft 

 
item bid Linear Ft 

 

1.1 12" 

16 G             
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 6.23 16 gauge Linear Ft 6.70 

1.2 15" 

16 G                 
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 7.78 

 
Linear Ft 8.04 

1.3 18" 

16 G                 
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 9.30 

 
Linear Ft 10.05 

1.4 24" 

16 G                  
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 12.38 

 
Linear Ft 12.73 

1.5 30" 

16 G              
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 15.50 

 
Linear Ft 16.08 

1.6 36" 

16 G               
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 18.75 

 
Linear Ft 19.43 

1.7 42" 

16 G              
2 2/3" 
corrug. 

Linear 
Ft 21.68 

 
Linear Ft 23.80 

1.8 48" 

16 G        
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 29.78 14 gauge Linear Ft 33.60 

1.9 54" 

16 G       
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 33.50 14 gauge Linear Ft 37.80 

1.1 60" 

16 G      
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 36.8 16 gauge Linear Ft 38.50 

1.11 72" 

16 G     
5"x1" OR 

3"x1" 
Linear 

Ft 44.15 16 gauge Linear Ft 46.20 

        



2 

Round-Galv. 
Sloped End 

Treat. 
 

each 

  
each 

 2.1 12" 6:1 
 

each 37.35 
 

each 56.80 
2.2 12" 4:1 

 
each 30.82 

 
each 50.10 

2.3 12" 3:1 
 

each 27.57 
 

each 46.75 
2.4 15" 6:1 

 
each 53.00 

 
each 68.19 

2.5 15" 4:1 
 

each 42.62 
 

each 58.14 
2.6 15" 3:1 

 
each 37.57 

 
each 53.12 

2.7 18" 6:1 
 

each 70.67 
 

each 85.28 
2.8 18" 4:1 

 
each 56.00 

 
each 70.20 

2.9 24" 3:1 
 

each 48.70 
 

each 62.66 
2.1 24" 6:1 

 
each 113.8 

 
each 119.11 

2.11 24" 4:1 
 

each 93.35 
 

each 93.65 
2.12 30" 3:1 

 
each 80.30 

 
each 80.92 

2.13 30" 6:1 
 

each 166.72 
 

each 166.68 
2.14 30" 4:1 

 
each 125.95 

 
each 126.48 

2.15 30" 3:1 
 

each 109.65 
 

each 106.38 
2.16 36" 6:1 

 
each 229.37 

 
each 224.30 

2.17 36" 4:1 
 

each 170.7 
 

each 166.01 
2.18 36" 3:1 

 
each 141.35 

 
each 136.87 

2.19 42" 6:1 
 

each 314.37 
 

each 607.40 
2.2 42" 4:1 

 
each 221.95 

 
each 440.80 

2.21 42" 3:1 
 

each 187.72 
 

each 375.50 
2.22 48" 6:1 

 
each 446.85 

 
each 933.60 

2.23 48" 4:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 664.80 
2.24 48" 3:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 530.40 

2.25 54" 6:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 1156.20 
2.26 54" 4:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 816.00 

2.27 54" 3:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 645.90 
2.28 60" 6:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 1292.00 

2.29 60" 4:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each 907.00 
2.30 60" 3:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each 714.50 

2.31 72" 6:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each no bid 
2.32 72" 4:1 

 
each no bid 

 
each no bid 

2.33 72" 3:1 
 

each no bid 
 

each no bid 
 

 

 

 



Item # Arched Galvanized Wilson   Contech 

3 

Arched 
Galv. 
Design 

Equiv. 
round 
dia.   Description   Unit  

Unit 
Price   Unit  

Unit 
Price 

3.1 Design 1 15"   17"x13" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 8.78   Linear Ft 7.28 

3.2 Design 2 18"   21"x15" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 10.3   Linear Ft 10.92 

3.3 Design 3 24"   28"x20" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 13.38   Linear Ft 13.84 

3.4 Design 4 30"   35"x24" 
16G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 16.5   Linear Ft 17.48 

3.5 Design 5 36"   42"x29" 
14G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 23.33   Linear Ft 26.22 

3.6 Design 6 42"   49"x33" 
14G 2 
2/3 

Linear 
Ft 27.08   Linear Ft 31.96 

3.7 Design 7 48"   57"x38" 

14G           
5"x1           
3"x1 

Linear 
Ft 37.05   Linear Ft 36.52 

3.8 Design 8 54"   64" 43"   
Linear 
Ft 41.75   Linear Ft 46.41 

3.9 Design 9 60"   71"x47"   
Linear 
Ft 45.25   Linear Ft 50.98 

 

Item# Description Wilson Contech 
    Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price 

4 

Arched-Galv. 
Sloped End 
Treat. Each   Each   

4.1 12" 6:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.2 12" 4:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.3 12" 3:1 Each no bid Each no bid 
4.4 15" 6:1 Each 86.45 Each 60.94 
4.5 15" 4:1 Each 66.35 Each 55.48 
4.6 15" 3:1 Each 56.30 Each 49.10 
4.7 18" 6:1 Each 109.57 Each 81.87 
4.8 18" 4:1 Each 82.32 Each 68.22 
4.9 18" 3:1 Each 68.67 Each 61.40 

4.10 24" 6:1 Each 172.7 Each 113.04 
4.11 24" 4:1 Each 125.5 Each 89.79 
4.12 24" 3:1 Each 101.87 Each 78.43 
4.13 30" 6:1 Each 243.42 Each 152.36 



Item# Description Wilson Contech 
    Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price 

4 

Arched-Galv. 
Sloped End 
Treat. Each   Each   

4.14 30" 4:1 Each 173.72 Each 117.4 
4.15 30" 3:1 Each 138.87 Each 99.92 
4.16 36" 6:1 Each 429.8 Each 246.31 
4.17 36" 4:1 Each 301.05 Each 182.6 
4.18 36" 3:1 Each 236.67 Each 151.26 
4.19 42" 6:1 Each 603.85 Each 651.26 
4.20 42" 4:1 Each 418.5 Each 475.48 
4.21 42" 3:1 Each 175.8 Each 387.59 
4.22 48" 6:1 Each 772.5 Each 826.92 
4.23 48" 4:1 Each 532.35 Each 595.62 
4.24 48" 3:1 Each 412.27 Each 479.98 
4.25 54" 6:1 Each no bid Each 1150.63 
4.26 54" 4:1 Each no bid Each 818.03 
4.27 54" 3:1 Each no bid Each 651.26 
4.28 60" 6:1 Each no bid Each 1359.99 
4.29 60" 4:1 Each no bid Each 960.64 
4.30 60" 3:1 Each no bid Each 760.97 

 

*Wilson was overall low on items they bid (1 - 2.22; 3-3.9; 4.4-4.24), vendor checked “all or none” 
**Contech is recommended to be awarded the items Wilson did not bid (Items 2.23 – 2.30;  
      4.25-4.30), vendor checked “low item basis”, and secondary on the items Wilson bid 
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Award Asphalt Emulsions 12IFB00020
Submitted By: Kerstin Hancock, Purchasing
Department: Purchasing
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss and take appropriate action regarding awarding bids received for Asphalt Emulsions to the lowest  bids
meeting specifications, Ergon Asphalt, Cleveland Asphalt and Martin Midstream.

Background
Recommended Award:
Ergon Asphalt primary on item # 1-4; secondary item# 5
Cleveland Asphalt primary on item# 5, 6; secondary on item# 2; tertiary on item# 4
Martin Midstream secondary on item# 4

Attachments
Bid Tabulation Asphalt Emulsions

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

Purchasing (Originator) Kerstin Hancock 05/03/2012 11:24 AM
County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 11:44 AM

Form Started By: Kerstin Hancock Started On: 05/03/2012 10:06 AM
Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 



WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION FOR 
ASPHALT EMULSIONS 

BID# 12IFB00020 
Contract period May 8, 2012 through September 30, 2012 

 
Recommended Award:  Ergon Asphalt primary on item # 1-4; secondary item# 5 
   Cleveland Asphalt primary on item# 5, 6; secondary on item# 2; tertiary on item# 4 
           Martin Midstream secondary on item# 4 

    *Ergon  Martin Midstream PGA  ***Cleveland Asphalt 
 Item 

# Description FOB Site Unit 
Unit 
Price FOB Site Unit Unit Price FOB Price Unit 

Unit 
Price FOB Site Unit  Unit Price 

 
1 

HFRS-2, TxDot Item 
300.2, Table 7  

2.5250 Gal 2.40 N/B Gal N/B N/B Gal N/B N/B Gal N/B 

 

2 
CRS-2,TxDot Item 
300.2, Table 8 

2.5392 Gal 2.40 2.65 Gal 2.5 any site in 
Wilco Gal 2.25 2.5791 Gal 2.37 

 
3 

HFRS-2P , TxDot 
Item 300.2, Table 9 

3.125 Gal 3.00 N/B Gal N/B N/B Gal N/B N/B Gal N/B 

 
4 

CRS-2P, TxDot Item 
300.2, Table 9 

3.1392 Gal 3.00 3.15 Gal 3.00 any site in 
Wilco Gal 3.00 3.2091 Gal 3.00 

 
5 

SS-1 Emulsion, 
TxDot Item 300.2, 
Table 7 

2.525 Gal 2.40 2.65 Gal 2.50 any site in 
Wilco Gal 2.25 2.4591 Gal 2.25 

 
6 

RS-1P Emulsion, 
TxDot Item 300.2, 
Table 9 

**3.1892 Gal **3.05 N/B Gal N/B N/B Gal N/B 3.2091 Gal 3.00 

 

               * Ergon: Bid is for full load of 5500 gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not ordered. 
    The common carrier bills demurrage at $80.00 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff.  
    Pump and Hose charge is $80.00 per load. Federal Environmental Fee will be added to above prices at rate of $.4424/ton for  
    Asphalt Polymer loads or $.00133/gal for emulsion loads. 

         **Item # 6 Ergon bid CRS-IP In Lieu of RS-1P Emulsion, TX Dot Item 300.2, Table 9 
      ***Cleveland Asphalt Products: All prices are based on 5000 gallons minimum delivery.  Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hr after 2 free hours 
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Medicaid 1115 Waiver Update
Submitted For: Cynthia Long Submitted By: Kathy Pierce,

Commissioner Pct. #2
Department: Commissioner Pct. #2
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Hear update on Medicaid 1115 Waiver, discuss and take appropriate action if needed.

Background

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/02/2012 01:30 PM
Form Started By: Kathy Pierce Started On: 05/02/2012 12:22 PM

Final Approval Date: 05/02/2012 



   

Commissioners Court - Regular Session   35.           
Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Executive Session
Submitted By: Charlie Crossfield, Road Bond
Department: Road Bond
Agenda Category: Executive Session

Information
Agenda Item
Discuss real estate matters (EXECUTIVE SESSION as per VTCA Govt. Code sec. 551.072 Deliberation Regarding
Real Estate Property if deliberation in an open meeting would have a detrimental effect on the position of the
governmental body in negotiations with third person.)
1. Proposed or potential purchase or lease of property by the County:
a) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for SH 195 0.805 South of Bell County Line to IH 35.
b) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for US 183 Extension from 1,000 feet South of San
Gabriel to 1,000 feet North of SH 29.
c) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for O'Connor Boulevard and 620 projects.
d) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for Ronald Reagan Blvd. Phase II project from FM 3405
to Reagan Blvd.
e) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way for Ronald Reagan Blvd. Phase III and Phase IV.
f) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for proposed SH 29 project.
g) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way along Lakeline extension.
h) Discuss proposed acquisition of property for right-of-way along CR 170. 
i) Discuss proposed acquisition and/or sale of property for Arterial H.

Background

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/03/2012 10:15 AM
Form Started By: Charlie Crossfield Started On: 05/03/2012 09:43 AM

Final Approval Date: 05/03/2012 
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Meeting Date: 05/08/2012  

Budget Workshop
Submitted By: Ashlie Blaylock, Budget Office
Department: Budget Office
Agenda Category: Regular Agenda Items

Information
Agenda Item
Recess 1:00 pm.

Hear Presentation by Alvin Lankford, Chief Appraiser, Williamson County Appraisal District

Hear Presentation by Eric Smith, benefits consultant for Williamson County

Background

Form Review
Inbox Reviewed By Date

County Judge Exec Asst. Wendy Coco 05/02/2012 11:09 AM
Form Started By: Ashlie Blaylock Started On: 05/01/2012 04:17 PM

Final Approval Date: 05/02/2012 
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