Williamson County Bid Tabulation
Bid Number : 1511-034, Signs and Markers
Contract Period: 1 year, w/2 annual renewals
RECOMMENDED AWARD: Vulcan Signs, Pathmark, Safelane, Osburn, Garden State

TMUTCD SIGNS - REGULATORY SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1.01 |24" Stop/Slow Paddles and 6' Wooden Staff EACH $89.00 $41.50 $57.90 $64.48 $57.45
1.02 24" Octagon (H.1.P.) EACH $23.70 $13.40 $15.69 $14.32 $17.42
1.03 30" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH $29.25 $20.81 $24.49 $21.48 $26.42
1.04 36" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH S44.00 $30.16 $38.49 $30.87 $38.03
1.05 48" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH $95.00 $53.46 $67.99 $54.88 $68.22
1.06 30" Triangle (H.l.P.) EACH $21.20 $11.50 $14.44 $11.19 $14.32
1.07 36" Triangle (H.I.P.) EACH $29.50 $15.49 $18.89 $16.11 $20.92
1.08 12"x 6" (H.I.P.) EACH $3.90 $2.21 $2.59 $1.79 $3.10
1.09 12"x 9" (H.I.P.) EACH $5.94 $2.81 $3.79 $2.69 $4.06
1.10 15"x 30" (H.1.P.) EACH $23.55 $11.04 $13.29 $11.19 $14.21
1.11 18"x 6" (H.I.P.) EACH $5.19 $3.18 $3.99 $2.69 $3.56
1.12 18"x 12" (H.1.P.) EACH $8.69 $5.48 $6.29 $5.37 $6.54
1.13 18"x 18" (H.1.P.) EACH $15.06 $8.20 $9.49 $8.06 $10.02
1.14 18"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $16.38 $10.29 $12.54 $10.74 $13.34
1.15 21"x 15" (H.I.P.) EACH $14.69 $8.01 $12.54 $7.80 $9.74
1.16 24"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $25.00 $13.72 $16.72 $14.32 $17.78
1.17 24"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $26.00 $17.15 $20.90 $17.88 $22.23
1.18 24"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $30.88 $20.58 $24.99 $21.48 $26.68
1.19 24"x 42" (H.I.P.) EACH $52.50 $24.01 $29.49 $25.06 $31.12
1.20 24"x 48" (H.I.P.) EACH $49.69 $27.44 $33.44 $28.64 $35.57
1.21 30"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $23.56 $12.86 $15.99 $13.43 $16.67
1.22 30"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $26.00 $17.15 $20.90 $17.88 $22.23
1.23 30"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $32.06 $21.44 $25.99 $22.38 $27.79
1.24 30"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $46.88 $25.73 $31.35 $26.85 $33.34
1.25 30"x 42" (H.I.P.) EACH $65.00 $30.01 $36.99 $31.33 $38.89
1.26 36"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.38 $10.29 $12.54 $10.74 $13.34
1.27 36"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $27.81 $15.44 $18.99 $16.11 $19.98
1.28 36"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $30.88 $20.58 $24.99 $21.48 $26.67
1.29 36"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $47.56 $30.87 $37.62 $32.22 $39.98
1.30 48"x 9" (H.1.P.) EACH $19.31 $10.88 $12.99 $10.74 $7.93
1.31 48"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $49.69 $27.44 $33.44 $28.64 $35.57
1.32 48"x 30" (H.1.P.) EACH $61.06 $34.30 $41.80 $35.80 S44.46
1.33 60"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $75.25 $42.88 $51.99 S44.75 $55.57
$640.31 $793.53 $683.39




TMUTCD SIGNS - WARNING SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
2.01 30" Circle (H.1.P.) EACH $32.06 $21.37 $25.99 $22.38 $27.23
2.02 36" Circle (H.1.P.) EACH $47.56 $29.94 $37.62 $32.22 $39.18
2.03 12"x 18" (H.1.P.) EACH $8.69 $5.48 $6.29 $5.37 $6.54
2.04 18"x 18" (H.1.P.) EACH $15.06 $8.20 $9.49 $8.06 $10.02
2.05 18"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $16.38 $10.29 $12.54 $10.74 $13.34
2.06 24"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $13.63 $7.33 $8.49 $7.16 $8.89
2.07 24"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $25.00 $13.72 $16.72 $14.32 $17.78
2.08 24"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $26.00 $17.15 $20.90 $17.88 $22.23
2.09 30"x 15" (H.I.P.) EACH $23.55 $11.04 $13.39 $11.19 $14.21
2.10 30"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $32.06 $21.44 $25.99 $22.38 $27.79
2.11 30"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $46.88 $25.73 $31.80 $26.85 $33.34
2.12 36"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.38 $10.29 $12.54 $10.74 $13.34
2.13 36"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $27.81 $15.44 $18.99 $16.11 $19.98
2.14 36"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $30.88 $20.58 $24.99 $21.48 $26.68
2.15 36"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $47.56 $30.87 $37.62 $32.22 $39.98
2.16 36"x 48" (H.I.P.) EACH $72.44 $41.16 $50.88 $42.96 $53.31
2.17 48"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $49.69 $27.44 $33.44 $28.64 $35.57
2.18 48"x 48" (H.1.P.) EACH $95.13 $54.88 $67.20 $57.28 $71.14
2.19 48"x 60" (H.1.P.) EACH $126.25 $68.60 $84.99 $71.60 $88.92
2.20 60"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $75.25 $42.88 $51.99 S44.75 $55.57
2.21 66'"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $34.73 $18.87 $23.49 $19.69 $24.45
2.22 84"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $88.38 $48.02 $59.99 $50.12 $62.24

$550.72 $675.34 $574.14

TMUTCD SIGNS - SCHOOL SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
3.01 |30" Pentagon (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $53.00 $27.53 $37.00 $30.50 $36.62
3.02 36" Pentagon (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $76.50 $39.87 $53.28 $43.92 $52.78
3.03 24"x 8" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $14.00 $6.49 $7.99 $6.51 $9.59
3.04 24"x 10" (H.I.P. - White) EACH $11.06 $8.13 $6.99 $5.97 $9.98
3.05 24"x 12" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $17.00 $9.62 $11.99 $9.76 $11.96
3.06 24"x 48" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green and H.I.P. - White)* EACH $67.06 $32.38 $39.99 $39.04 $47.86
3.07 30"x 30" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $53.00 $28.81 $37.00 $30.50 $37.39
3.08 36"x 12" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $25.50 $13.83 $17.76 $14.64 $17.94
3.09 36"x 36" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $76.50 $41.49 $53.28 $43.92 $53.84

*per TMUTCD S5-1 $208.15 $265.28 $224.76




BRACKET/POST AND HARDWARE SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4.01 2 3/8" Post Bracket EACH $1.19 NO BID $1.14 NO BID NO BID
4.02 3" Post Bracket EACH $2.39 NO BID $1.98 NO BID NO BID
4.03 2 3/8" Back to Back Post Brackets EACH $1.90 NO BID $1.69 NO BID NO BID
4.04 Wedge and Universal Anchor EACH $12.30 NO BID $46.99 NO BID NO BID
4.05 Triangular Slipbase System EACH $97.50 NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID
4.06 10' Steel T-Leg Assembly Base EACH $78.00 NO BID $109.00 NO BID NO BID
$193.28 $210.80
STREET SIGNS BLANKS AND HARDWARE SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
5.01 6"x 18" Flat (H.l.P. - White) EACH $8.47 $4.20 $4.48 $3.18 $4.69
5.02 6"x 24" Flat (H.l.P. - White) EACH $11.29 $5.43 $5.99 $4.24 $6.26
5.03 6"x 30" Flat (H.I.P. - White) EACH $14.06 $6.73 $7.49 $5.30 $7.84
5.04 6"x 36" Flat (H.l.P. - White) EACH $16.88 $8.08 $8.99 $6.36 $9.43
5.05 9"x 24" Flat (H.1.P. - White) EACH $16.88 $8.15 $7.39 $6.36 $9.41
5.06 9"x 30" Flat (H.l.P. - White) EACH $21.12 $10.10 $9.19 $7.95 $11.78
5.07 9"x 36" Flat (H.I.P. - White) EACH $25.35 $12.08 $10.99 $9.54 $14.14
5.08 Cap Round -2 3/8" x5 1/2" Flat Blade Holder EACH $3.13 $3.50 $2.44 $3.25 $3.69
5.09 |CapRound-23/8"x 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH $8.69 $8.25 $6.59 $5.75 $9.25
5.10 Cap Round - 3" x 5 1/2" Flat Blade Holder EACH $5.75 $4.97 $5.79 NO BID $5.22
5.11 |Cap Round-3"x 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH $14.12 $11.20 $13.99 NO BID $16.20
5.12 90° Tee - 5 1/2" Flat Blade EACH $3.13 $3.36 $2.44 $3.25 $3.69
5.13 90° Tee - 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH $8.69 $8.25 $6.59 $5.25 $9.25
$157.56 $94.30 $92.36 $110.85
POSTS SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6.01 10'x 2 3/8" 0.D. Round Post EACH $14.56 NO BID $11.79 NO BID $18.29
6.02 12'x 2 3/8" 0.D. Round Post EACH $16.95 NO BID $13.99 NO BID $21.96
6.03 6' Green Wing Channel EACH $5.69 NO BID $5.51 NO BID $10.60
6.04 6" Galvanized Wing Channel Post EACH $7.90 NO BID $6.99 NO BID $13.20
6.05 12' Green Wing Channel Post EACH $20.50 NO BID $17.49 NO BID $21.19
6.06 10' x 1-3/4" Perforated Square Metal Tubing EACH $18.00 NO BID $15.19 NO BID NO BID
6.07 1-3/4" Perforated Square Metal Tubing - Base End (Foot) with Clamps EACH $14.50 NO BID $29.00 NO BID NO BID
6.08 2" Perforated Square Metal Tubing - Single Leg Base with Clamps EACH $31.00 NO BID $59.00 NO BID NO BID
6.09 12'x 2-7/8" 0.D. 10 BWG Post complete assembly with Clamps EACH $155.00 NO BID $139.00 NO BID NO BID
$284.10 $297.96




ROLL GOODS SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
7.01 6"x 50 Yards - Barricade Tape (H.l.P.) EACH $136.00 $125.25 $122.00 $79.50 $126.20
7.02 7"x 50 Yards - Barricade Tape (H.I.P.) EACH $155.00 $146.13 $124.00 $92.75 $145.70
7.03 30" Reflective Sheeting (E.G.) EACH $337.00 $303.75 $307.50 $258.75 $258.33
7.04 30" Reflective Sheeting (H.1.P.) EACH $645.00 $483.75 $510.00 $397.50 $491.25
7.05 30" Reflective Sheeting (D.G.) EACH $1,650.00 $933.75 $1,162.00 $783.75 $970.25
7.06 30" Non Reflective Sheeting (Vinyl) EACH $99.00 $270.00 $135.00 $243.75 $416.64
7.07 30" E.C. Film EACH $499.00 $382.50 $412.00 $333.75 $399.78
7.08 48" Reflective Sheeting (E.G.) EACH $540.00 $486.00 $498.00 $414.00 $413.32
7.09 48" Reflective Sheeting (H.l.P.) EACH $1,025.00 $774.00 $816.00 $636.00 $786.00
7.10 48" Non Reflective Sheeting (Vinyl) EACH $159.00 $432.00 $228.00 $390.00 $666.62
7.11 48" E.C. Film EACH $790.00 $612.00 $660.00 $534.00 $639.64
$6,035.00 $4,949.13 $4,974.50 $4,163.75 $5,313.73
BARRICADE MATERIAL SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
8.01 [1"x 8"x 8' Barricade Rail (plank) EACH $11.50 NO BID $9.99 $103.48 $14.50
8.02 |Typel 24" Barricade with Sheeting EACH $45.00 NO BID $39.00 $93.07 $47.75
8.03  [Type Il 24" Barricade with Sheeting EACH $55.00 NO BID $45.00 $114.35 $57.50
8.04 Type lll 8' Barricade with Sheeting EACH $149.00 NO BID $139.00 $271.78 $225.00
$260.50 $232.99 $582.68 $344.75
FLEXIBLE ROLL UP SIGNS SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
9.01 36" Non Reflective Sign EACH $31.50 NO BID $28.99 $36.36 $36.50
9.02 36" Reflective Sign EACH $68.50 NO BID $51.99 $73.49 $74.80
9.03  |48" Non Reflective Sign EACH $43.75 NO BID $35.99 $45.45 $42.00
9.04 48" Reflective Sign EACH $93.00 NO BID $79.99 $109.84 $111.50
9.05 Sign Base EACH $77.00 NO BID $85.99 $55.48 $118.70
$313.75 $282.95 $320.62 $383.50




DELINEATOR AND OBJECT MARKERS SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

10.01 |62" Flexable Posts w/stub w/ 3"x 12" Yellow H.I.P. Sheeting EACH $31.00 NO BID $12.31 $23.48 $18.60
10.02 28" Cones w/ Reflective Bands - 9.5 Ibs. min weighted base EACH $15.29 NO BID $12.89 $19.48 $17.98
10.03 [36"-42" Drums w/ Reflective Bands with Tire Ring Base EACH $38.00 NO BID $30.99 $88.98 $87.50
10.04 |Barrier reflector - GF-1 EACH $2.29 NO BID $2.39 NO BID $87.50

10.05 |Barrier reflector - GF-2 EACH $3.99 NO BID $10.49 NO BID $3.85
10.06 |Barrier reflector - CTB EACH $1.39 NO BID $1.99 NO BID $26.20

10.07 [Temporary Flexible-Reflective Roadway Marker Tabs EACH $0.40 NO BID $0.36 NO BID $4.25

10.08 [Reflector 6" x 12" (Size 3) EACH $3.90 NO BID $2.69 $2.44 $0.82
10.09 |Object Marker - OM -3L EACH $16.38 NO BID $12.99 $10.74 $13.34
10.10 |Object Marker - OM -3R EACH $16.38 NO BID $12.99 $10.74 $13.34
10.11 |Object Marker- OM -3C EACH $16.38 NO BID $12.99 $10.74 $13.34
10.12 |Object Marker - OM -4 EACH $13.25 NO BID $8.99 $24.48 $10.02
$158.65 $122.07 $191.08 $296.74

CWZTCDL SUBSTRATES FOR SIGNS BLANKS FOR SHORT-TERM/SHORT DURATION SAFELANE VULCAN PATHMARK OSBURN GARDEN STATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

11.01 |24" x 30" 10 MM Coroplast EACH $6.25 NO BID $4.88 $24.40 $7.60
11.02 |48" x 96" 10 MM Coroplast EACH $33.50 NO BID $30.08 $156.16 $45.00
11.03 60" x 30" 10 MM Coroplast EACH $17.00 NO BID $12.50 $61.00 $18.60
$56.75 S47.46 $241.56 $71.20




