Williamson County Department of Infrastructure
Bid #1807-252 - San Gabriel Ranch Road Bridge
Bid Tabulation

5,2018
BID TABULATION
Engineer's Estimate A Greater Austin D Chasco Constructors. James Construction SB C Austin Filter Systems Patin Construction Jordan Foster Capital Excavation Winters Construction MAC, Inc
Bid Item | TxDOT Item |Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price [ Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price. Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
1 5006001 | MOBILIZATION Ls L $87,000.00 $87,000.00 $142,500.00 $142,500.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $158,000.00 $158,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 NO BID TABS $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $186,200.00 $186,200.00 $196,000.00 $196,000.00 NO BID TABS NO BID TABS
2 5066002 |ROCK FILTER DAMS (INSTALL) (TY 2) LF 210 $22.00 $4,620.00 $24.00 $5,040.00 $23.00 $4,830.00 $21.50 $4,515.00 $24.00 5,040.00 $25.00 $5,250.00 $23.00 $4,830.00 $22.00 $4,620.00
3 5066011 |ROCK FILTER DAMS (REMOVE) LF 210 8.00 $1,680.00 $6.70 $1,407.00 5.00 $1,050.00 $6.00 $1,260.00 9.00 $1,890.00 $25.00 $5,250.00 $7.00 $1,470.00 $6.00 $1,260.00
4 5066038 |TEMP SEDMT CONT FENCE (INSTALL) LF 645 2.00 $1,250.00 $2.50 $1,612.50 $4.00 $2,580.00 $2.25 $1,451.25 3.00 $1,935.00 $2.50 $1,612.50 $3.00 $1,935.00 $3.00 $1,935.00
5 5066039 |TEMP SEDMT CONT FENCE (REMOVE) LF 645 0.60 $387.00 $0.56 $361.20 0.50 $322.50 $0.50 $322.50 1.00 $645.00 $1.00 $645.00 $0.60 $387.00 $1.00 $645.00
6 1006001 |PREPARING ROW. AC 32 $10,000.00 $32,000.00 $4,000.00 $12,800.00 $24,000.00 $76,800.00 $20,000.00 $64,000.00 $6,500.00 $20,800.00 $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $26,000.00 $83,200.00 $60,000.00 $192,000.00
7 Care of Water During Construction Ls 1 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
8 4966007 _|REMOV STR (PIPE) LF 48 $25.00 $1,200,00 $22.50 $1,080.00 $20.00 $960.00 $14.12 $677.76 $22.00 $1,056.00 $20.00 $960.00 $30.00 $1,440.00 $30.00 1,440.00
9 ABANDON 30-INCH CMP Ls 1 $5,000.00 $5,000,00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,295.90 $1,295.90 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $7,000.00 7,000.00
10 1106004 |EXCAVATION (ROADWAY AND CHANNEL) oy 15000 $18.00 $270,000.00 $7.50 $112,500.00 $11.00 $165,000.00 $4.00 $60,000.00 10.00 $150,000.00 $6.00 $90,000.00 $17.00 $255,000.00 $11.00 $165,000.00
11 1326007 |EMBANKMENT (FINAL)(ORD COMP)(TY D) [ 10000 $12.00 $120,000.00 $3.00 $30,000.00 $5.00 $50,000.00 $5.00 $50,000.00 10.00 $100,000.00 $6.00 $60,000.00 $8.00 $80,000.00 $8.00 $80,000.00
12 4326032 |RIPRAP (STONE PROTECTION)(15 IN) [ 500 $150.00 $75,000.00 $45.00 $22,500.00 $85.00 $42,500.00 $90.00 $45,000.00 95.00 $47,500.00 $150.00 75,000.00 $100.00 $50,000.00 $140.00 $70,000.00
13 4326036 |RIPRAP (STONE PROTECTION)(30 IN) o 3000 $130,00 $390,000.00 $58.00 $174,000.00 $85.00 $255,000,00 $86.23 $258,690.00 $102.00 $306,000.00 $170.00 $510,000.00 $138.00 $414,000.00 $150.00 $450,000.00
14 Rock Vane LF 200 $200.00 $40,000.00 $61.00 $12,200.00 $115.00 $23,000.00 $182.92 $36,584.00 $40.00 $8,000.00 $40.00 $8,000.00 $150.00 $30,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00
15 Coir Mat - Erosion Control sY 1400 $5.00 $7,000.00 $4.90 $6,860.00 $5.50 $7,700.00 $4.35 $6,090.00 $5.00 $7,000.00 $2.00 $2,800.00 $5.00 $7,000.00 $5.00 $7,000.00
16 1606004 |FURNISHING AND PLACING TOPSOIL (6") sY 6300 $1.50 $10,350.00 $1.00 $6,900.00 $1.50 $10,350.00 $1.73 $11,937.00 $4.00 $27,600.00 $6.00 $41,400.00 $1.50 $10,350.00 $4.00 $27,600.00
17 1666001 |FERTILZER AC 1.5 $1,100.00 1,650.00 $220.00 $330.00 $415.00 $622.50 $195.00 $292.50 $400.00 $600.00 $950.00 $1,425.00 $200.00 $300.00 $400.00 $600.00
18 164 6003 |BROADCAST SEED (PERM) (RURAL) (CLAY) sY 6300 $0.60 54,140,00 $0.13 $897.00 $0.16 1,104.00 $0.12 $828.00 $0.15 $1,035.00 $0.50 $3,450.00 $0.14 $966.00 $0.20 $1,380.00
19 1686001 _|Vegetative Watering MG 257 $30.00 7,710.00 $56.00 $14,392.00 $30.00 7,710,00 $25.28 6,496.96 $45.00 $11,565.00 $26.00 6,682.00 $18.00 $4,626.00 $35.00 $8,995.00
20 1696004 |SOIL RETENTION BLANKETS (CL 1) (TY D) sY 5500 $3.00 $16,500.00 $1.30 $7,150.00 $1.20 $6,600.00 $1.46 $8,030.00 $0.15 $825.00 $1.75 $9,625.00 $1.75 $9,625.00 $1.00 $5,500.00
21 4026001 _[TRENCH EXCAVATION PROTECTION LF 688 $6.00 $4,128.00 $1.10 $756.80 $3.00 $2,064.00 $3.26 2,242.88 $1.00 $688.00 $2.00 1,376.00 $2.00 $1,376.00 $5.00 3,440.00
22 70326132 _|Pipe Water Main (DI)(8") LF 236 $90.00 21,240.00 $140.00 $33,040.00 $85.00 $20,060.00 $109.70 $25,889.20 $120.00 $28,320.00 $75.00 $17,700.00 $65.00 $15,340.00 150.00 35,400.00
23 Pipe Water Main (Steel)(8") LF 67 $220,00 14,740.00 $250.00 $16,750.00 $180.00 $12,060.00 $385.40 $25,821.80 $200.00 13,400.00 $130.00 $8,710.00 $160.00 $10,720.00 200.00 13,400.00
24 8-inch Coated 150 psi Steel Pipe with Insulation (Suspended - includes pipe supports) LF 138 $325.00 544,850.00 $500.00 $124,200.00 $250.00 $34,500.00 $367.97 $50,779.86 $275.00 37,950.00 $330.00 $45,540.00 $260.00 $35,880.00 5400.00 $55,200.00
25 8-inch PVC Bypass Line Ls 1 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $20,230.94 $20,230.94 $49,000.00 549,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $31,800.00 $31,800.00 $27,000.00 27,000.00
26 Remove Existing 8-inch PVC Waterline LF 460 $20,00 $9,200.00 $11.00 $5,060.00 $10.00 54,600.00 $27.00 $12,420.00 $15.00 $6,900.00 $15.00 $6,900.00 $8.00 $3,680.00 $10.00 $4,600.00
27 2-inch Manual Air Release Corporation Stop (Complete) EA 1 $500.00 $500.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $4,000.00 54,000.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00
28 8-inch Gate Valve and Box (Complete) EA 2 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,700.00 $3,400.00 $1,450.00 $2,900.00 $4,775.00 $9,550.00 $2,000.00 54,000.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $1,700.00 $3,400.00
29 Concrete Encasement for Waterline and Conduit cy 8 $700.00 $5,600.00 $390.00 $3,120.00 $150.00 $1,200.00 $255.00 $2,040.00 $240.00 1,920.00 $200.00 $1,600.00 $200.00 $1,600.00 $240.00 $1,920.00
30 2476238 |FLBS (CMP IN PLC) (TY A GR 4) (12") sY 1261 $30.00 $37,830.00 $12,00 $15,132.00 $16.00 $20,176.00 $24.00 $30,264.00 $42.00 $52,962.00 NO BID TABS $23.00 $29,003.00 $20.00 $25,220.00 $15.00 $18,915.00 NO BID TABS NO BID TABS
31 2606002 | LIME (HYDRATED LIME (SLURRY)) TON 10 $150.00 $1,500.00 $160.00 $1,600.00 $225.00 $2,250.00 $221.25 $2,212.50 $155.00 $1,550.00 $220.00 $2,200.00 $180.00 $1,800.00 $200.00 $2,000.00
32 2606079 | LIME TRT (SUBGRADE) (6") sY 1261 $5.00 $6,305.00 $5.00 $6,305.00 $5.00 $6,305.00 $9.30 $11,727.30 $4.00 $5,044.00 $4.00 $5,044.00 $7.00 $8,827.00 $13.00 $16,393.00
33 3406122 |D-GR HMA(SQ) TY-D PG70-22 TON 218 $100.00 $21,800.00 $180.00 $39,240.00 $125.00 $27,250.00 $120.75 $26,323.50 $123.00 $26,814.00 $150.00 $32,700.00 $185.00 $40,330.00 $172.00 $37,496.00
34 3106027 | PRIME COAT(MC-30 OR AE-P) GAL 227 $70.00 $15,850.00 $5.60 $1,271.20 $6.00 $1,362.00 $5.52 $1,253.04 $6.00 $1,362.00 $7.15 $1,623.05 $5.00 $1,135.00 $6.00 $1,362.00
35 4166001 | DRILL SHAFT (18 IN) LF 52 $70.00 $3,640.00 $110.00 $5,720.00 115,00 $5,980.00 $100.00 $5,200.00 $100.00 $5,200.00 $180.00 $9,360.00 $108.00 $5,616.00 $90.00 $4,680.00
36 4166004 | DRILL SHAFT (36 IN) LF 306 $160.00 548,960.00 $200.00 $61,200.00 185,00 $56,610.00 $180.00 $55,080.00 $150.00 $45,900.00 $300.00 $91,800.00 $195.00 $59,670.00 $160.00 $48,950.00
37 4206013 _[CL C CONC (ABUT) cy 58.6 $1,200.00 70,320.00 $1,400.00 82,040.00 750.00 543,950.00 $1,200.00 70,320.00 $1,100.00 64,460.00 $1,000.00 $58,500.00 $1,325.00 $77,645.00 $1,200.00 $70,320.00
38 4206029 _|CL C CONC (CAP) cY 15.5 $1,400,00 21,700.00 $1,200.00 $18,600.00 $1,000.00 $1,600.00 24,800.00 $1,500.00 $23,250.00 $1,000.00 $15,500.00 $1,430.00 $22,165.00 $1,000.00 $15,500.00
39 4206037 __|CL C CONC (COLUMN) cY 14.1 $1,000.00 14,100.00 $1,500.00 $21,150.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $16,920.00 $1,200.00 $16,920.00 $1,000.00 $14,100.00 $1,450.00 $20,445.00 $1,000.00 $14,100.00
40 4226001 | REINF CONC SLAB SF 5148 $20.00 $102,950.00 $22.00 $113,256.00 $16.00 $25.00 $128,700.00 $14.00 72,072.00 $50.00 $257,400.00 $24.00 $123,552.00 $18.00 $92,664.00
41 4226013 _|BRIDGE SIDEWALK SF 980 $11.00 10,780.00 $16.00 $15,680.00 $14.00 $20.00 $19,600.00 $14.00 13,720.00 $11.00 $10,780.00 $15.00 $14,700.00 $9.00 $8,820.00
42 4226015 | APPROACH SLAB cY 70 $500.00 $35,000.00 $580.00 $40,600.00 $390.00 $500.00 $35,000.00 $450.00 $31,500.00 $811.00 $56,770.00 $405.00 $28,350.00 $500.00 $35,000.00
43 4256036 | PRESTR CONC GIRDER (TX34) LF 710 $140.00 99,400.00 $175.00 $124,250.00 $155.00 $180.00 $127,800.00 $135.00 $95,850.00 $250.00 $177,500.00 $165.00 $117,150.00 $135.00 $95,850.00
44 4346001 |ELASTOMERIC BEARING (PLAIN) EA 20 $200.00 $4,000.00 $0.01 $0.20 $10.00 $1.00 $20.00 $120.00 $2,400.00 $10.00 $200.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $370.00 $7,400.00
45 4426008 |STR STEEL (MISCELLANEOUS BRIDGE) LB 154 $5.00 $770.00 $15.00 $2,310.00 $22.00 $25.00 $3,850.00 $22.00 $3,388.00 $7.00 $1,078.00 $30.00 $4,620.00 $19.00 $2,926.00
46 4506004 |RAIL (TY T221) LF 172 $70.00 $12,040.00 $110.00 $18,920.00 $140.00 $95.00 $16,340.00 $90.00 $15,480.00 $170.00 $29,240.00 $118.00 $20,296.00 $85.00 $14,620.00
47 4506030 _|RAIL (TY C221) LF 162 $140,00 $22,680.00 $140.00 $22,680.00 $175.00 $160.00 $25,920.00 $110,00 $17,820.00 $170.00 $27,540.00 $153.00 $24,786.00 $130.00 $21,060.00
48 4546001 _|SEALED EXPANSION JOINT (4 IN) (SEJ - A) LF 73 $85.00 $6,205.00 $130.00 $9,450.00 $85.00 $100.00 $7,300.00 $72.00 $5,256.00 $90.00 $6,570.00 $85.00 $6,205.00 $100.00 7,300.00
49 5406001 | MTL W-BEAM GD FEN (TIM POST) LF 95 $30.00 $2,850.00 $30.50 $2,897.50 $25.00 $2,375.00 $27.22 $2,585.90 $25.00 $2,375.00 $25.00 $2,375.00 $28.00 $2,660.00 $25.00 2,375.00
50 5406007 | MTL BEAM GD FEN TRANS (TL2) EA 4 $750.00 $3,000.00 $1,100.00 54,400.00 $900.00 $3,600.00 $1,005.00 $4,020.00 $855.00 3,420,00 $800.00 $3,200.00 $1,015.00 $4,060.00 $880.00 $3,520,00
51 5406016 |DOWNSTREAM ANCHOR TERMINAL SECTION EA 2 $950.00 ,900.00 $1,200.00 2,400.00 $981.00 $1,962.00 $1,075.00 $2,150.00 $925.00 $1,850.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $950.00 $1,900.00
52 5446001 | GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT (INSTALL) EA 2 $3,600.00 7,200.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $2,450.00 $4,900.00 $2,527.00 $5,054.00 $2,377.00 $4,754.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 £
53 6446001 _|IN SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG (1) SA (P) EA 1 $500.00 $500.00 $690.00 $680.00 $850.00 $850,00 $620.00 $620.00 $475.00 $475.00 $350.00 $350.00 $525.00 $525.00 $700.00 $700.00
54 6186078 | CONDT (RM) (4") Including Coating LF 170 60.00 $10,200.00 71.00 $12,070.00 $130.00 $22,100.00 88,09 $14,975.30 $55.00 $9,350.00 $100.00 $17,000.00 $185.00 $31,450.00 $170.00 $28,900.00
55 6186058 | CONDT (PVC) (SCH 80) (4") LF 185 30.00 $5,550.00 31.50 $5,827.50 $32.00 $5,920.00 24.04 $4,447.40 $50.00 $9,250.00 $30.00 $5,550.00 $25.00 $4,625.00 $45.00 $8,325.00
56 5406014 |SHORT RADIUS LF 31 30.00 $930.00 48.00 $1,488.00 $50.00 $1,550.00 $43.00 $1,333.00 $49,00 $1,519.00 $45.00 $1,395.00 $45.00 $1,395.00 $50.00 $1,550.00
57 5406005 | TERMINAL ANCHOR SECTION EA 4 $600.00 2,400.00 $760.00 $3,040.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $678.00 $2,712.00 $678.00 2,712.00 $600.00 2,400.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $700.00 $2,800.00
58 4326046 |RIPRAP (MOW STRIP)(5 IN) cy 18 $400.00 7,200.00 $640.00 $11,520.00 $610.00 $10,980.00 $683.73 $12,307.14 $400.00 7,200.00 $215.00 3,870.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $600.00 $10,800.00
59 5306005 | DRIVEWAYS (ACP) sY 116 $40.00 54,640.00 $73.00 $8,468.00 $60.00 $6,960.00 $43.85 $5,086.60 $55.00 $6,380,00 NO BID TABS $50.00 $5,800.00 $75.00 $8,700.00 $84.00 $9,744.00 NO BID TABS NO BID TABS
Project Total $1,830,035.00 $1,425,301.90 $1,479,474.00 $1,600,117.23 $1,642,102.00 | $1,787,006.70 $1,922,273.55 $1,944,452.00 $1,977,215.00 T $2,560,656.00 [ $2,565,813.00
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BID TABULATION

Austin Fllter Systems
Unit Price Total Price

Jordan Foster

NOBIDTABS

Winters Constructlon MAC, Inc
UnitPrice | Total Price UnitPrice | Totai Price

NO.BID TARS

NOBIDTABS.."0 .2

T NOBIDTABS

--NOBIDTABS

BidItem [ TXDOT Jtem |Pescription Unit Estimated Quantity
1 5006001 |MOBILIZATION Ls 1
506 6002 [ROCK FILTER DAMS {INSTALL} {TY 2) LE 210
3 506 6011 [ROCK FILTER DAMS (REMOVE} LF 210
4 5066038 | TEMP SEDMT CONT FENCE {INSTALL) LF 645
5 5066039 | TEMP SEDMT CONT FENCE (REMOVE) LF 845
6 1006001 | PREPARING ROW AC 3.2
7 Care of Water During Construction LS 1
8 496 6007 [REMOV STR (PIPE} LF 48
9 ABANDON 30-INCH CMP LS 1
10 1106004 __|EXCAVATION (ROADWAY AND CHANNEL) Y 15000
11 132 6007 _|EMBANKMENT (FINAL)J{ORD COMPY(TY D) (%4 10000
12 4326032 |RIPRAP (STONE PROTECTION}{15 IN) (94 500
13 4326036 |RIPRAP {STONE PROTECTION){3Q IN) (%4 3000
14 Rock Vane LF 200
15 Colr Mat - Eroslon Control SY. 1400
16 1606004 |FURNISHING AND PLACING TOPSOIL (6"} sy 6900
17 1666001 |FERTIILZER AC 15
18 1646003 |BROADCAST SEED {PERM} (RURAL} (CLAY) sy 6900
19 1686001 | Vegetative Watering MG 257
20 1696004 [SOIL RETENTION BLANKETS {CL 1) (TY D} sy 5500
21 402 6001 | TRENCH EXCAVATION PROTECTION LF 688
22 70326132 _|Pipe Water Main {D1){8") LF 236
23 Pipe Water Maln {Steel}(8"} iF 67
24 8-Inch Coated 150 psl Steel Plpe with Insulation (Suspended - Includes pipe supports) LF 138
25 8-Inch PVC Bypass Line is 1
26 Remove Existing 8-Inch PVC Waterline LF 460
27 2-inch Manual Air Release Corporation Stop {Complete EA i
28 8-inch Gate Valve and Box {Complete; EA 2
29 Concrete Encasement for Waterline and Conduit <Y 8
30 2476238 |FL BS [CMP IN PLC) (TY AGR 4) {12") sY 1261
31 2606002  |LIME {(HYDRATED LIME {SLURRY}} TON 10
32 2606079 |LIME TRT (SUBGRADE) {6"} SY 1261
33 3406122 [D-GR HMA(SQ) TY-D PG70-22 TON 218
34 3106027 _|PRIME COAT{MC-30 OR AE-P) GAL 227
35 4166001 | DRILL SHAFT {18 IN} LF 52
36 416 6004 _ | DRILL SHAFT {36 IN) LF 306
37 4206013 | CL C CONC {ABUT} <y 58.6
38 4206029 _|CL C CONC {CAP) Y 15.5
39 4206037 | CL C CONC {COLUMN} Y 141
40 4226001 | REINF CONC SLAB SF 5148
41 4226013 | BRIDGE SIDEWALK SF 98¢
42 4226015 | APPROACH SLAB Y 70
43 4256036 | PRESTR CONC GIRDER {TX34) LE 710
44 434 6001 |ELASTOMERIC BEARING (PLAIN) EA 20
45 4426008  |STR STEEL {MISCELLANEQUS BRIDGE} L8 154
46 4506004 |RAIL {TY T221) LF 172
47 4506030 |RAIL {TY €221} L 162
48 4546001 |SEALED EXPANSION JOINT {4 IN}) (SEJ - A} LF 73
49 5406001 |MTL W-BEAM GD FEN {TIM POST) LF 95
50 5406007 {MTL BEAM GD FEN TRANS (TL2) EA 4
51 5406016 |DOWNSTREAM ANCHOR TERMINAL SECTION EA 2
52 544 6001 | GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT {INSTALL) EA 2
53 6446001 _|IN SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG (1) SA (P) EA 1
54 618 6078 _ |CONDT (RM) (4"} Including Coatlng LF 170
55 6186058 | CONDT (PVC) (SCH 80) (4"} LF 185
56 5406014 |SHORT RADIUS LF 31
57 5406005 | TERMINAL ANCHOR SECTION EA 4
58 4326046 | RIPRAP {MOW STRIP)(S IN} cY 18
59 5306005 | DRIVEWAYS (ACP) sy 116
Project Total

NOBIDTABS.

A Greater Austin Development James Construction
Unlt Price Total Price Unlit Price Total Price
$142,500.00 $142,500,00 $158,000.00 $158,000.00
$24.00 5,040,00 $21.50 4,515.00
6.70 1,407.00 $6.00 $1,260.00
2.50 $1,612.50 $2.25 1,451.25
0.56 $361.20 3050 $322.50
$4,000.00 $12,800.00 $20,000.00 $64,000,00
$1,700.00 $1,700.00 $70,000,00 $70,000.00
$22.50 $1,080.00 $14.12 $677.76
$4,100,00 $4,100.00 $1,295,90 $1,295,90
$7.50 $112,500.00 $4.00 $60,000.00
$3.00 $30,000.00 $5,00 $50,000.00
$45.00 $22,500.00 $90.00 $45,000.00
$58.00 $174,000.00 $86.23 $258,690.00
$61.00 $12,200.00 $182.92 $36,584.00
$4.90 $6,860.00 $4.35 $6,090.00
$1.00 $6,900.00 $1.73 $11,937.00
$220.00 $330,00 $195.00 $292.50
$0.13 $897.00 $0.12 $828.00
$56.00 $14,392,00 §25.28 6,496.96
$1.30 $7,150.00 $1,46 $8,030,00
$1.10 $756.80 43,26 2,242,88
$140.00 $33,040.00 $109,70 $25,889.20
$250.00 $16,750.00 $385.40 $25,821.80
$900.00 $124,200,00 $367.97 $50,779.86
$20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,230.94 $20,230.94
$11.00 $5,060.00 $27.00 $12,420.00
$2,800.00 $2,800.00 $1,750.00 1,750.00
$1,700.00 3,400.00 $4,775.00 $9,550.00
$390.00 43,120.00 $255.00 2,040.00
$12.00 $15,132,00 $24.00 $30,264.00
$160.00 $1,600,00 $221.25 $2,212.50
$5,00 $6,305.00 $9.30 $11,727,30
$180.00 $39,240.00 $120,75 $26,323.50
$5.60 $1,271.20 $5,52 $1,253.04
$110.00 $5,720.00 $100,00 $5,200.00
$200.00 $61,200.00 $180.00 $55,080.00
$1,400.00 82,040.00 $1,200.00 $70,320.00
$1,200.00 $18,600.00 $1,600.00 $24,800.00
$1,500.00 $21,150.00 $1,200.00 $16,920.00
$22.00 $113,256.00 $25.00 $128,700.00
$16.00 $15,680.00 $20.00 $19,600.00
$580.00 $40,600,00 $500.00 $35,000.00
$175.00 $124,250.00 $180.00 $127,800.00
$0.01 $0.20 $1.00 $20.00
$15,00 $2,310,00 $25.00 $3,850.00
110,00 $18,920,00 $95.00 $16,340.00
140,00 $22,680.00 $160.00 $25,920,00
130,00 $9,490.00 $100,00 $7,300,00
$30.50 $2,897.50 $27,22 $2,585.90
$1,100,00 $4,400,00 $1,005.00 $4,020.00
$1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,075.00 $2,150.00
$2,800.00 $5,600.00 $2,527.00 $5,054.00
$690.00 $690.00 $620,00 $620.00
$71.00 $12,070.00 $88.09 $14,975.30
$31.50 5,827.50 $24.04 $4,447.40
$48.00 1,488.00 $43.00 $1,333.00
$760.00 3,040.00 $678.00 $2,712.00
$640.00 $11,520,00 $683.73 $12,307.14
$73.00 $8,468.00 $43.85 $5,086.60
$1,425,301.90 $1,600,117.23

$1,787,006.70

NG BIDTABS

NOBIDTABS

Unlt Price Total Price
$186,200.00 $186,200.00
$23.00 $4,830,00
$7.00 $1,470,00
$3.00 $1,935.00
$0.60 $387.00
$26,000.00 $83,200.00
$9,500.00 $9,500.00
$30.00 $1,440.00
1 $7,80000 $7,800.00
$17.00 $255,000.00
$8.00 $80,000.00
$100.00 $50,000.00
$138,00 $414,000.00
$150.00 $30,000.00
$5.00 $7,000.00
$1.50 $10,350.00
$200.00 $300.00
$0.24 $966.00
$18.00 4,626.00
$1.75 $9,625.00
$2.00 1,376.00
$65.00 15,340.00
$160.00 10,720.00
$260.00 35,880.00
$31,800.00 $31,800,00
$8.00 $3,680.00
$3,500.00 $3,500.00
$1,800.00 $3,600.00
$200.00 $1,600.00
$20.00 $25,220.00
$180.00 $1,800.00
$7.00 $8,827.00
$185.00 $40,330.00
$5.00 $1,135.00
$108.00 45,616.00
$195.00 $59,670.00
$1,325.00 $77,645.00
1,430.00 $22,165.00
1,450.00 $20,445,00
$24.00 $123,552,00
$15.00 $14,700,00
405.00 $28,350.00
165.00 $117,150.00
150.00 $3,000.00
$30.00 $4,620.00
$118.00 $20,296.00
$153.00 $24,786.00
$85.00 $6,205.00
$28.00 $2,660.00
$1,015.00 4,060.00
$1,200.00 2,400.00
$2,600.00 $5,200.00
$525.00 $525.00
$185.00 431,450,00
$25.00 4,625,00
$45.00 $1,395.00
$700.00 4$2,800.00
4500.00 $9,000.00
$75.00 $8,700.00
$1,944,452.00

| $2,560,656.00

$2,565,813,
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