IFB # 1807-245 Bulk Fuel for Williamson County Tabulatio

IPC (USA), Inc. Tank Wagon UNL 0.0595
Mansfield Oil Company * Tank Wagon UNL 0.1400
Petroleum Traders Corporation Tank Wagon UNL 0.1050
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. Tank Wagon UNL 0.0992
RKA Petroleum Tank Wagon UNL 0.1463
Sun Coast Resources Inc. ** Tank Wagon UNL 0.0875
IPC (USA), Inc. Tank Wagon DSL 0.0580
Mansfield Oil Company Tank Wagon DSL 0.1400
Petroleum Traders Corporation Tank Wagon DSL 0.1050
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. Tank Wagon DSL 0.1555
RKA Petroleum Tank Wagon DSL 0.1883
Sun Coast Resources Inc. ** Tank Wagon DSL 0.0875
IPC (USA), Inc. Transport UNL 0.0155
Mansfield Oil Company* Transport UNL 0.0000
Petroleum Traders Corporation Transport UNL -0.0197
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. Transport UNL 0.0025
RKA Petroleum Transport UNL 0.0044
Sun Coast Resources Inc. ** Transport UNL 0.0452
IPC (USA), Inc. Transport DSL 0.0170
Mansfield Oil Company * Transport DSL 0.0122
Petroleum Traders Corporation Transport DSL 0.0043
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. Transport DSL 0.0452
RKA Petroleum Transport DSL 0.0274
Sun Coast Resources Inc. ** Transport DSL 0.0452

Vendor Item Cost Per Stop |[Markup |Cost to County

IPC (USA), Inc. Generator DSL $180| 0.017| $2.2155 + Per stop fee
Mansfield Oil Company * Generator DSL $175( 0.1400 TBD
Petroleum Traders Corporation Generator DSL No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. Generator DSL $175 0.25 .25 + Per stop fee
RKA Petroleum Generator DSL $375 375

Sun Coast Resources Inc. ** Generator DSL $200 1.00| $3.3278 + Per stop fee

Notes:

*Mansfield Pricing has delivery fee per stop in place of demurrage plus additional fees, please

** Sun Coast Resources Inc. has exceptions to specifications and terms and conditions to the IFB, please s¢




Demurrage Hourly

$100

(1/4 hr $40) or $160/hr
No Bid

$95

$75

(after 1st hr) $1.25/min. or $75/hr

» see fee attachment

:e exceptions document attached




