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7/29/2018 Mail - leroysmith@wilco.org

Re: Relevel Home / bathroom floor S
5o

Billie Pauley <bapsyl05@yahoo.com>

Sat 7/28/2018 3:.46 PM

To:Leroy Smith <leroysmith@wilco.org>;

EXTERNAL email: Exercise caution when opening.

The bids are from Salero transport and set Victoria Texas 361-571-5253
Sent from my iPhone

> On Jul 28, 2018, at 4:.02 PM, Billie Pauley <bapsy105@yahoo.com> wrote:

>

> Louis has sent me your contact info for Relevel. Let me know your year model of home the manufacture and size
with some pictures and | will get you an estimate and schedule

>

> Sent from my iPhone

https:/foutlook.office365.com/owa/

M




7/29/2018 _ Re: Relevel Home / bathroom floor - Leroy Smith

Re: Relevel Home / bathroom floor
Sliro

Billie Pauley <bapsyl05@yahoo.com>

Sat 7/28/2018 3:45 PM

To:Leroy Smith <leroysmith@wilco.org>;

EXTERNAL email: Exercise caution when opening.

Bid Relevel home and bathroom floor repaired $2700
Sent from my iPhone

> On Jul 28, 2018, at 4:02 PM, Billie Pauley <bapsy105@yahoo.com> wrote:

>

> Louis has sent me your contact info for Relevel. Let me know your year model of home the manufacture and size
with some pictures and | will get you an estimate and schedule

>

> Sent from my iPhone

https:f/outlook.office 365.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageltem&ltemID=AAMkADAS5Z]IxZjU5SLTBjMmMQINDRINCO5MjcyL TkdZGNmMYTE4N2MyNgB...  1/1




712912018 Re: Relevel Home / bathroom floor - Leroy Smith

Re: Relevel Home / bathroom floor Sﬂa l/o

Billie Pauley <bapsyl05@yahoo.com>

Sat 7/28/2018 3:44 PM

To:Leroy Smith <leroysmith@wilco.org>;

EXTERNAL email: Exercise caution when opening.

Bid Relevel home 2001 patriot home Barton creek model 28x68 $1800
Sent from my iPhone

> OnJul 28, 2018, at 4.02 PM, Billie Pauley <bapsyl05@yahoo.com> wrote:

>

> Louis has sent me your contact info for Relevel. Let me know your year model of home the manufacture and size
with some pictures and | will get you an estimate and schedule

>

> Sent from my iPhone

https://outlock.office365.com/owal?viewmodel=ReadMessageltem&ltemID=AAMKADAS5ZjIxZjU5LTBjMmQINDRINCO5MjcyLTk4d ZGNmMYTE4N2MyNgB... 1/1






