
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT Zhou Medical Solutions Antillean Rx Penny's Medical Supplies Clinical Solutions Medline Premiere Scientific Bound Tree Medco Quadmed IGMC CPR Savers
GENERAL MEDICAL SUPPLIES
4 X 4 NON-STERILE GAUZE 12-Ply 0.0178 0.0183 0.0233 0.0276 0.2300 0.0175 0.0539 0.0432 0.0488 0.0213 0.0400
ALCOHOL PREP PADS MEDIUM 200 PACKS PER BOX 0.0053 0.0072 0.0098 0.0098 0.0100 0.0077 0.0070 0.0081 0.0072 0.0111 0.0750
URINE CHEM STRIP - 10 TESTS (100-STRIPS) 0.2690 0.5214 0.2156 0.4923 0.5300 0.1326 0.4979 0.1565 NO BID 0.2700 NO BID
GRADUATED MEDICINE CUPS 1OZ PLASTIC DISPOSABLE 0.0067 0.0083 0.0082 0.0090 NO BID 0.0071 0.0082 0.0089 0.0078 0.0080 NO BID
SILENT KNIGHT PILL CRUSHER POUCH 50 PACK 0.0736 0.6940 0.0431 0.0456 NO BID 0.0320 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0360 NO BID
DIABETIC SUPPLIES
GLUCOMETER KIT - TRUE TRACK SMART SYSTEM 13.3280 18.8000 26.9400 34.5300 Meter Agreement 12.0000 Included w/ Purch of Strips NO BID 16.5000 FREE W/purch of strips NO BID
GLUCOMETER TEST STRIPES - TRUE TRACK SMART SYSTEM 0.3067 0.4734 0.4380 0.5181 0.1000 0.2000 0.1700 NO BID 0.2598 0.1688 NO BID
INSTANT GLUCOSE - 15 GRAMS/TUBE 1.4033 4.1600 4.3100 4.9333 1.8800 NO BID 1.1600 1.4600 3.1400 2.3040 NO BID
INSULIN SYRINGE W/NEEDLE 1ML 28GA 1/2INCH 0.1040 0.0891 0.1240 0.1172 0.1600 0.0894 0.1045 NO BID 0.1147 0.1107 NO BID
LANCETS - UNISTICK 2 COMFORT 28G 0.1830 0.1493 0.1584 0.1794 0.2600 0.1405 0.1535 NO BID 0.0963 0.0911 NO BID
OVER-THE-COUNTER DRUGS/MEDICATION
ACETAMINOPHEN 325MG 1000ct 0.0070 0.0080 0.0086 0.0094 0.0014 0.0140 0.0814 0.0086 0.0058 NO BID NO BID
ASA 325MG 100ct 0.0100 0.0119 0.0131 0.0116 0.0244 0.0106 0.0073 0.0081 0.0099 NO BID NO BID
ASPRIN 81mg, BABY CHEWABLE TABLETS 36ct 0.0200 0.0258 0.0272 0.0342 0.0314 0.0236 0.0264 0.0316 0.0256 NO BID NO BID
CLOTRIMAZOLE CREAM 1%, 1 OZ TUBE 0.9720 2.1400 2.7200 2.0500 1.3400 2.5000 4.7200 8.3000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENSURE PLUS CHOCOLATE FLAVOR 8-OZ 2.4850 1.3929 1.3575 1.6171 1.4100 3.3267 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FOLIC ACID 1 MG 100ct 0.0180 0.0649 0.1211 0.0702 0.1700 0.0149 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROCORTISONE CREAM 1%- .9 GM PACKETS 0.0570 0.0470 0.0584 0.0817 1.1700 0.1200 0.0680 0.0522 0.0746 NO BID NO BID
IBUPROFEN 200 MG – 1000ct BTL 0.0160 0.0115 0.0122 0.0137 0.0189 0.0149 0.0212 0.0184 0.0188 NO BID NO BID
OMEPRAZOLE 20MG 0.0420 0.1762 0.0158 0.6579 NO BID 0.7002 0.1827 1.0454 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LICE SHAMPOO -1 GAL 63.0420 51.0300 62.8800 59.2700 77.4500 71.2500 105.6100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
IMODIUM MULTI-SYSPTOM 125-2 MG 12-BX 0.6560 0.1083 0.5535 0.1342 0.1283 1.5792 0.4283 0.2198 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NAPROXEN 500mg 1000ct 0.0630 0.1293 0.1559 0.1399 NO BID 0.0505 0.0699 0.1157 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MILK OF MAGNESIA 12oz 1.8840 1.5200 1.9000 2.4100 1.8700 2.9000 2.6900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MULTI-VITAMIN SUPPLEMENT 0.0170 0.0107 0.0107 0.0102 0.0153 0.0229 NO BID 0.0758 NO BID NO BID NO BID
AMMONIA CAPSULES-STIMULANT INHALENT 0.2480 0.5290 0.3210 0.2850 NO BID NO BID 1.3892 0.3460 0.1600 NO BID NO BID
BENADRYL 50mg 0.0330 0.0253 0.0346 0.4447 NO BID 0.0167 0.0235 0.4150 0.0920 NO BID NO BID
ORAJEL MAX .25-OZ TUBE 5.7600 7.2800 4.9600 5.5900 1.2300 6.4300 5.5900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRENATAL VITAMIN SUPPLEMENT 0.0310 0.0031 0.0440 0.0366 0.0320 0.0357 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC CREAM PACKETS .9GM 0.0630 0.1020 0.1381 0.1187 1.1600 0.0800 1.6200 0.0634 0.0565 NO BID NO BID
TUMS/ANTACID 500mg 0.0380 0.0368 0.0133 0.0198 0.0153 0.0167 0.0524 0.0170 0.0430 NO BID NO BID

91.1593 89.5736 107.615 113.8670 89.24 101.7334 124.7351 12.3937 20.6608 3.02094 0.1150

Williamson County Bid Tabulation
IFB 1903-305 Medical Supplies for Williamson County Jail

Contract Period July 7, 2019 Through July 6, 2020

3-5 daysDelivery Time 30 Days ARO Next Day on Orders 
Placed Before 2:00 CST

2 Days ARO For 
Stocked Items 7-10 Days 2-3 Days ARO 3-5 Business Days N/A 7 Days 14 DaysN/A


	Unit Price

