Williamson County Bid Tabulation

Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for Williamson County Regional Animal Shelter
IFB 1902-297

Recommended Award: Patterson Veterinary

Albon 5% 473ml NO BID 72.55 72.55
Albuterol 2.5mg/ml 20ml NO BID |[NO BID 3.36
Amoxicillin Suspension 50mg/ml 30ml NO BID 7.52 7.52
AmoxiClav Suspension 80mg/20mg NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Ampicillin INJ (Polyflex or equivalent) 25gm bottle NO BID 42.68 42.68
Apoquel 5.4mg NO BID |[NO BID NO BID

Artificial Tears ointment 3.5gm tube NO BID 4.64 2.22
BNP antibiotic ointment (w/o dexamethasone) 3.5gm tube NO BID 4.69 7.44
Butorphic 10mg/ml 20ml NO BID 61.76 50.57
Cephalexin capsules 250mg 500btl NO BID 21.51 25.52
Cephalexin capsules 500mg 500btl NO BID 36.9 38.92
Cerenia Inj NO BID [NO BID NO BID

Cetirizine Tablets 10mg 500btl NO BID 20.75 3.32 (100ct)
Chlorpheniramine Tab 4dmg 1000btl NO BID 5.11 5.55
Cidofovir (drops) 0.005 NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Cipro (ciprofloxacin) 250mg 100tab NO BID 4.77 5.63
Cipro (ciprofloxacin) 500mg 100tab NO BID 6.08 9.43
Ciprofloxacin ophthalmic solution 0.30% 5ml NO BID 9.03 9.83
Clavamox tabs 62.5mg NO BID 64.51 64.51
Clavamox tabs DECHRA 125mg NO BID 119.54 119.54
Clavamox tabs DECHRA 250mg NO BID 196.87 196.87
Clavamox tabs DECHRA 375mg NO BID 281.3 281.3
Clindamycin oral PVL 25mg/ml 20ml NO BID 2.67 2.69
Clindamycin tablets 150mg bottle NO BID 5.45 9.38
Convenia Inj 80mg/ml 10ml bottle NO BID 308.9 308.9




Cough Tabs 1000/ct NO BID 76.83 80.72
Depomedrol 20mg 10ml NO BID 57.3 57.3
Dexamethasone 2mg/ml 100ml NO BID 3.86 3.58
Dolorex INJ 10mg/ml NO BID 155.65 155.65
Doxycycline tablets 100mg 500btl NO BID 40.45 36.93
Doxycycline Suspension (hyclate) 50mg/ml 480ml btl NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Diphenhydramine (Benadryl equiv) 50mg cap 1000ct NO BID 14.82 15.06
Diphenhydramine (Benadryl equiv) 25mg cap 1000ct NO BID 13.44 12.44
Diphenhydramine INJ 50mg 10/bx NO BID 16.02| 27.27 (25/box)
Enalapril 2.5mg 100{NO BID 4.74 6.78
Enalapril 20mg 100({NO BID 7.28 10.63
Enrofloxacin INJ (generic to Baytril 100) 100 250ml NO BID 96.6 93.52
Enrofloxacin/Ketoconazole/Triamcinolone 1%/2%/0.1% NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Epinephrine 1/1000 30ml btl NO BID |NO BID 12.35 (50ml)
Erythromycin Opthalmic ointment 0.50% 3.5gm NO BID 5.26 4.36
Famotidine tablets 10mg 100ct NO BID 9.25 (70 ct) 10.01 (70ct)
Famvir (Famciclovir) 250mg NO BID 495 7.1
Fluconazole tablets 100mg 30|{NO BID 3.34 12.55
Fluconazole tablets 200mg 30(NO BID 5.85 25
FortiFlura, Feline case 6x30/case NO BID 114.01 114.01
Furosemide 12.5mg NO BID 46.83 46.83
Furosemide 40mg NO BID 4.75 5.06
Gentamycin Spray 60ml NO BID 5.44 3.69
Gentamycin 100mg/ml 20ml NO BID 18.20 (100ml)| 18.20 (100ml)
Heparin 1000 u/ml NO BID 4.2 7.84
Idoxuridine ophthalmic solution 0.10% 15ml NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Isofluorane 250ml btl NO BID 24.94 20.63
Itrafungol 10mg/ml 52ml btl NO BID 35.15 35.15
Ivermectin oral 10mg/ml 200ml btl NO BID 14.12 (100ml)|NO BID

Ivermectin Inj 0.10% 500ml NO BID 63.6 44.89
Ketamine 100mg/ml 10ml btl NO BID 6.18 4.26
Levothyroxine 0.1mg 120ct NO BID |NO BID 4.32
Lidocaine 1% 10mg/ml 30ml btl NO BID [NO BID 1.82 (20ml)
Lixotinic Supplement gallon NO BID 109.32 109.32




Metacam injectable 5mg/ml 10ml NO BID 63.45 58.52
Metacam Oral 1.5mg/ml 32ml NO BID 21.68 19.56
Metoclopramide INJ 5mg/ml 30ml NO BID 1.2 1.2
Metronidazole 250mg 500 tablets NO BID 15.28 16.48
Metronidazole 500mg 500 tablets NO BID 25.36 26.14
Mirtazapine 15mg 30/btl NO BID 1.2 1.7
Mirtazapine Transdermal 0.02 tube NO BID |NO BID 18.5
Morphine Sulfate 15mg/ml 20ml| NO BID |NO BID 68.1
NeoPolyBac Ointment (w/o Dex) tube NO BID 4.69 7.44
NeoPolyDex Ointment tube NO BID 4.68 5.43
Otomax or Generic bottle NO BID 121.32 (12X7.5gm tube) 10.36
Panacure suspension 10% 1000ml NO BID 117.75 117.75
Panacure Granules 22.20% 1lb NO BID 349.8 297.33
Panolog ointment 240ml NO BID 66.36 57.54
Penicillin G penject 300000 units |250ml NO BID 10.08 9.47
Ponazuril 90mg/ml bottle NO BID [NO BID NO BID

Prednisone tablets 20mg 100ct NO BID 8.13 18.07
Prednisolone oral 20mg/ml bottle NO BID [NO BID 58.95
Pyrantel Pamoate gallon NO BID 17.78 (qt) 22.94 (3202)
Praziquantel tablets 23mg bottle NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Praziquantel tablets 34mg bottle NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Praziquantel INJ 56.8mg/ml 10ml btl NO BID 81.88 77.73
Quadritrop Ointment (or Animax equivalent) 30ml tube NO BID 9.53 9.51
Ringers solution 500ml bag NO BID 3.94 2.27
Rimadyl or generic 25mg 60ct NO BID 13.5 11.82
Rimadyl or generic 75mg 60ct NO BID 16.8 14.77
Rimadyl or generic 100mg 60ct NO BID 20.7 18.18
Propylene glycol USP 99% gallon NO BID 17.26 13.47
Sidenafil 20mg NO BID 3.98(NO BID

Simplicef 100mg NO BID 127.15 127.15
Simplicef 200mg NO BID 247.05| 317.55 (250ct)
Spironolactone 25mg NO BID 2.49 2.69
Sulfer Lime Dip 0.978 4oz NO BID 6.57 5.06
Terramycin generic Opth Oint tube NO BID 13.5 13.5




Tobramycin eye ointment 0.003 3.5gm tube NO BID |NO BID 3.41
Trazodone 10mg bottle NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Trazodone 50mg bottle NO BID 2.06 3.59
Vetmedin Generic 1.25mg bottle NO BID |NO BID 28.33
Vetmedin Generic 5mg bottle NO BID |NO BID 54.08
Vitamin B complex, Inj 100ml btl NO BID 417 4.39

Canine Heartworm tests IDEXX 25 box NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Canine Heartworm tests ABAXIS 100 box NO BID 261 261
Canine Parvovirus tests IDEXX 5 box NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Canine Parvovirus tests ABAXIS 10 box NO BID 128.7| 232.20(20ct)
FELV Tests IDEXX 30 box NO BID |[NO BID NO BID
FELV Tests ABAXIS 25 box NO BID 312.75 312.75
FELV Tests ZOETIS 10 box NO BID 110.11 133.9
Fecatect or ova-sol fecal float solution gallon NO BID 7.15 6.45
Fecal Float Diagnostic Test box NO BID 14.45 9.02

Alcohol, Isopropyl 70% gallon bottle 29.99 2.94 (qt) 29.9
Hydrogen Peroxide gallon bottle NO BID 5.8 3.93
Bandage Scissors (Lister) 5.5" German #j74WA 5.5 inch each NO BID 28.5 18.82
Syringe, 3cc w/needle LL 22x1 3cc 100/box NO BID 7.98 5.23
Syringe, 1cc w/needle LL 25x5/8 lcc 100/box NO BID 12.27 7.84
Syringe, 1cc w/o needle lcc 100/box NO BID 10.33 6.65
Syringe, 6¢c no needle LL 6cc 50/box NO BID 10.75 7.16
Syringe, 10cc no needle LL 10cc 100/box NO BID 12.83 8.2
Syringe, u-40 .5 cc, 29x.5" .5cc 100/box NO BID 9.79 9.09
Syringe, u-100 .3 cc, 29x.5" .3cc 100/box NO BID 21.53 9.55
Syringe, u-100 .3 cc, 31x.6mm .3cc 100/box NO BID 9.72 9.55
Syringe, 60cc 60cc 25/box NO BID 10.86 11.36
Needles 20 GA 1.5" 20GA 100/box NO BID 3.3 2.57
Needles 22 GA 1.5" 22GA 100/box NO BID 6.27 2.57
Needle 18GA 1.0" 18GA 100/box NO BID 3.36 2.57
Needles 25GA 1.0" 25GA 100/box NO BID 7.52 2.57
Cotton Balls bulk box NO BID 4.44 6.58




Cotton Swabs, qtip type box NO BID 3.72 3.69
Exam Gloves- latex w/o powder Large large 100/box NO BID 4.44 3.35
Exam Gloves- latex w/o powder Med medium 100/box NO BID 4.44 3.35
Exam Gloves- latex w/o powder Small small 100/box NO BID 4.44 3.35
Isolation Gowns, disposable 50/ct NO BID 38.08 17.99
Shoe Covers, disposable 100/ct NO BID 5.72 8.72
Surgical Caps, Bouffant type 100/pck NO BID 3.61 3.18
Surgical Mask, Tie on 50/pck NO BID 4.35 2.27
Microscope Slides Plain 100 box NO BID 1.84 1.93
Microscope Cover Slips 100 box NO BID 2.05 2.05
surgical blades #10 #10 100/box NO BID 28.13 11.89
surgical blades #15 #15 100/box NO BID 28.13 11.89
Thermometer Digital each NO BID 1.99 4.55
Tongue Depressors 500/box NO BID 3.92 4.26
Kwik Stop 1.50z each NO BID 4.1 8.49
Elasticon Tape 2 inch 2 inch 12/box NO BID 18.61 18.61
Elasticon Tape 1 inch 1linch 12/bx NO BID 18.52 18.61
Bottle, plastic w Yorker, tapered tip 160z 16 oz box NO BID 9.96 12.38
Bottle, plastic w Yorker, tapered tip 40z 4 0z box NO BID 10.43 8.44
Boston Rounds 160z 25/bx NO BID 9.96 21.66
Pill Crusher each NO BID 2.16 1.19
Pill Cutter each NO BID 3.86 8.17
Pet Piller (Jorvet or equiv) 12/bx NO BID 12.73 10.09
Pill pockets, Greenies, Capsule, Chicken 15.8 oz each NO BID 4.08 3.78
Pet Nurser 20z 20z 6/box NO BID 8.45 (12ct) 8.45 (12ct)
Pet Nurser 40z 40z 6/box NO BID 7.91 1.32 (ea)
Needle, Suture, 3/8 Circle Cut, Size 10, 12/pk size 10 box NO BID 10.8 8.86
Needle, Suture, 3/8 Circle Cut, Size 12, 12/pk size 12 box NO BID 11 8.86
IV Drip Lines 10 drip inj PVL 103" each NO BID 2.9 2.56
Suture Cassette 0 absorb, monofilamet 0 cassette/25M |NO BID 80.23 88.74
Suture Cassette 2-0 absorb, monofilamet 2-0 cassette/25M |NO BID 73.13 74.71
Suture Cassette 3-0 absorb, monofilamet 3-0 cassette/25M |NO BID 61.36 61.42
Vet Wrap 2" 2 inch box NO BID 26.49 30.41
Vet Wrap 3" 3inch box NO BID 36 26.03




Vet Wrap 4" 4 inch box NO BID 18.87 20.47
Gauze Wrap 2 inch box NO BID 1.1 0.81
Porous Tape 2" 2 inch box NO BID 13.95 13.95
Porous Tape 1" 1linch box NO BID 13.95 13.95
Telfa Pads 3x4 inch 100/box NO BID 16.33 16.33
Cast Padding, cotton and rayon blend, 6" 6 inch 4 yards/box NO BID 8.84 15.16
Carpal Splint, Spoon Type 15 inch 15 inch each NO BID 10.45 1.93
Carpal Splint, Spoon Type 18 inch 18 inch each NO BID 13.41 2.5
E Collar 4in (drawstring) 4 inch each NO BID 4.79 4.82
E Collar 5.5in (drawstring) 5.5 inch each NO BID 5.06 4.94
E Collar 10in 10inch each NO BID 1.04 1.1
E Collar 15in 15 inch each NO BID 1.43 1.97
E Collar 25in 25 inch each NO BID 2.81 2.73
Autoclave Indicator Tape 1/2" 1/2 inch box NO BID 2.53 2.53
Surgery Gloves Size 6.5 6.5 box NO BID 28.41 28.21
Surgery Gloves Size 7.0 7 box NO BID 28.41 28.41
Surgery Gloves Size 7.5 7.5 box NO BID 28.41 28.41
Surgery Gloves Size 8.0 8 box NO BID 28.41 28.41
Drapes, Surgery, Disposable 38 100yards/box [NO BID 63.87 61.36
Gauze Pads 3x3 3inchx3inch |200/pckg 7.99 1.18 1.55
Flex Sponge Vetspon Hemostatic Geletin 6/bx NO BID 70.73 70.74
Carb0O2 Lime Absorbent Granules 5 gallon pail NO BID 87 71.88
Instrument Lube Milk gallon bottle NO BID 16.36 17.81
Huck Towels 18" x 18" each NO BID 13.5 7.16
Clipper Blade, #40, Andis Ceramic #40 each NO BID 22.93 21.09
Tatoo Ink Green Paste oz each NO BID 4.69 5.68
Skin Stapler each NO BID 8.86 10.28
Skin Stapler Remover each NO BID 5.68 3.69
Surgical Glue 2ml bottle NO BID 10.17 11.36
Chlorhexedrine Scrub 2% gallon bottle NO BID 14.6 14.6
Anesthesia Mask Feline Large each NO BID 20.09 15.98
Anesthesia Mask Canine Large each NO BID 31.16 24.8
Anesthesia Mask Canine Medium each NO BID |NO BID NO BID

Anesthesia Mask Canine Small each NO BID 31.16 24.8




Endotracheal Tube #3 cuffed #3 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Endotracheal Tube #4 cuffed #4 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Endotracheal Tube #5 cuffed #5 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Endotracheal Tube #6 cuffed #6 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Endotracheal Tube #7 cuffed #7 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Endotracheal Tube #8 cuffed #8 each NO BID 1.23 1.23
Catheter, Insyte 18GA each NO BID 0.9 0.9
Catheter, Insyte 20GA each NO BID 0.9 0.9
Catheter, Insyte 22GA each NO BID 0.9 0.9
Catheter, Insyte 24GA each NO BID 0.9 0.9
Adaptor Plug, Male each NO BID 0.48 0.91
T-Connector each NO BID 2.95 2.56
Leashes, D Ring, polyethylene slip lead 12/pkg NO BID 5.2 5.2
Lubricating jelly tube NO BID 1.4 1.93
Miconazole Shampoo (sebazole equiv) gallon NO BID 140.91 119.63
Pet Carriers, cardboard 12/case NO BID 43.64 31.32
OK Strips box NO BID 12 11.31
Catheter Caps/Injectable each NO BID 4.89 (10ct) .91 (ea)
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