
Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 560 - Sheriffs Office

County VIN/Serial Number 1GNLC2E09ER214343

Equipment/Door Number SB1440

License Plate 1183412

Year 2014

Make Chevrolet

Model Tahoe

Comments (mileage, mechanical issues, other info) 97,145 mi.

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Roy Fikac 9/8/2020 1:34 PM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/9/2020 12:06 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

Confirmed

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 12:12 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 7:54 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 8:22 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 560 - Sheriffs Office

County VIN/Serial Number 1GNLCDEC5GR306302

Equipment/Door Number SB1645

License Plate 1309532

Year 2016

Make Chevrolet

Model Tahoe

Comments (mileage, mechanical issues, other info) 101,278 mi. with transmission needing repairs

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Roy Fikac 9/8/2020 1:38 PM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/9/2020 12:08 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 2:17 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 7:58 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 8:25 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 3FRNF65JX4V685875

Equipment/Door Number UT0430

License Plate 1110285

Year 2004

Make Ford

Model F-650 Truck

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:16 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 2:55 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 2:24 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 8:41 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 8:46 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 5MC1116204P004837

Equipment/Door Number UF0427

License Plate 9065055

Year 2004

Make CPS

Model SBD-240 Belly Dump Trailer

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:15 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 2:53 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 2:27 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 8:49 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 9:02 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number CAT0120HPCAF00495

Equipment/Door Number UMG0508

License Plate NA

Year 2005

Make CAT

Model 120H Motor Grader

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:16 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 3:05 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/11/2020 10:09 AM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/15/2020 9:18 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/15/2020 9:35 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 5F11S101651000209

Equipment/Door Number 2602

License Plate 9048291

Year 2005

Make Wanco

Model WTSP55-LSA Arrow board

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:08 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 2:50 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 2:26 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 8:52 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 8:58 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 5F12S161561004202

Equipment/Door Number 2620

License Plate 9079200

Year 2006

Make Wanco

Model WLMB-SLL Message Board

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:21 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 3:01 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/11/2020 10:11 AM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/15/2020 9:20 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/15/2020 9:39 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 1VRY1119471009078

Equipment/Door Number UBC0803

License Plate 9065123

Year 2007

Make Vermeer

Model BC1000XL Brush Chipper

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:14 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/3/2020 2:51 PM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/16/2020 2:25 PM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/18/2020 8:43 AM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/18/2020 8:48 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 1POCX15EEDP036100

Equipment/Door Number 2952

License Plate NA

Year 2013

Make John Deere

Model CX15 Shredder

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:39 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/8/2020 7:25 AM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/15/2020 9:15 AM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/15/2020 3:42 PM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/16/2020 8:23 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 1POCX15EPDP036103

Equipment/Door Number 2951

License Plate NA

Year 2013

Make John Deere

Model CX15 Shredder

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:43 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/8/2020 7:24 AM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/15/2020 9:17 AM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/15/2020 3:44 PM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/16/2020 8:32 AM



Reason for Status Change REACHED OPERATIONAL LIFE EXPECTANCY

Department 210 - Unified Road Systems

County VIN/Serial Number 1POCX15EKDP036135

Equipment/Door Number 2969

License Plate NA

Year 2013

Make John Deere

Model CX15 Shreeder

Elected Official/Department Head/Authorized Staff
Digital Signature

Terron Evertson 9/3/2020 9:40 AM

 
Receiving Department Signature

 
Method of Status change: This vehicle is to be
considered for: (select one)

Sale at the earliest auction

Authorized Fleet Staff Digital Signature Kevin Teller 9/8/2020 7:26 AM
 
The listed vehicle was involved in an accident. No
pending litigation has been confirmed.

N/A

Authorizing HR Employee Digital Signature Heather Kirkwood 9/15/2020 9:13 AM
 
Title Approved for (Audit) No change needed; current title is still valid

Auditor's Authorized Employee Digital Signature Anabel Macias 9/15/2020 3:46 PM
 
Purchasing Department Signature
Acknowledgement

Mary Watson 9/16/2020 8:28 AM


