Sheets & Crossfield, P.C.

SEP 1 1 2018

309 E. Main St. Round Rock, TX 78664

(512) 255-8877

-July 31, 2018

Invoice No. 45694

Williamson County Williamson County Commissioner's Court Honorable Judge Dan A. Gattis 710 Main Street Georgetown, TX 78626

Somerset Road District 3 & 4 (Somerset Hills - P13) Matter ID: 1027.0810

Professional Fees:

			Hours	Amount
08/06/18	CDC	Phone conference with Mark Dietz regarding possibility of paying off District.	1.20	\$252.00
08/08/18	CDC	Emails to Mark Dietz, attorney for developer; phone conference with Julie Kiley; review email packet from Pam Navarette; read and respond to email from Julie.	1.10	\$231.00
08/09/18	CDC	Phone conference with Phil Haag, attorney for Pulte Homes; conference with Joe England regarding allocation of debt to each district.	1.60	\$336.00
	CDC	Read and respond to emails from Carol Polumbo regarding Somerset.	0.30	\$63.00
08/16/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Joe England regarding Somerset Road Districts.	0.20	\$42.00
08/22/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarette regarding Somerset Road District.	0.20	\$42.00
Sub-total Fees:		4.60	\$966.00	

Total Now Due:

Timekeeper Summary

Name	•	 Hours	Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Charlie Crossfield		4.60	210.00	\$966.00

Sheets & Crossfield, P.C. 309 E. Main St.

309 E. Main St. Round Rock, TX 78664 (512) 255-8877

October 31, 2018 Invoice 46119

Williamson County Williamson County Commissioner's Court Honorable Judge Dan A. Gattis 710 Main Street Georgetown, TX 78626

Somerset Road District 3 & 4 (Somerset Hills - P13) Matter ID: 1027.0810 NOV - 8 2018

Professional Fees:

			Hours	Amount
09/26/18	CDC	Phone conference with Phil Haag, attorney for Pulte; read and respond to email from Phil regarding same.	0.40	\$84.00
10/01/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarette regarding reimbursement on Ronald Reagan III construction; read and respond to email from Christen regarding same.	0.40	\$84.00
10/02/18	CDC	Emails to Carol Polumbo regarding open records request; read and respond to email from Terron.	0.40	\$84.00
10/03/18	CDC	Conference with Julie and Joe regarding reimbursements; phone conference with Carol Polumbo; read and respond to email from Linda Sharpe.	1.20	\$252.00
10/04/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Melanie Denny regarding Somerset agreements.	0.20	\$42.00
10/05/18	CDC	Review open records request response from Linda Sharpe.	0.80	\$168.00
	CDC	Read and respond to emails from Dianne Flores regarding Somerset.	0.30	\$63.00
	TVV	Open, print and save 22 files from Dropbox in response to the open records request for Somerset #3.	0.50	\$32.50
10/08/18	CDC	Review open records request material from Carol Polumbo.	0.90	\$189.00
10/15/18	CDC	Review proposed County reimbursement for cost to construct Reagan; emails to Phil Haag; revise amended development agreement.	2.20	\$462.00
	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarrette regarding culverts and bridges calculations.	0.20	\$42.00

2

			<u>Hours</u>	Amount
10/16/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarrette regarding Somerset.	0.20	\$42.00
10/17/18	CDC	Calculate acquisition costs for Yearwood and Madison tracts; review cost of Yearwood bridge; read and respond to email from Joe England; read and respond to email from Pam Navarrette.	1.30	\$273.00
10/18/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarrette regarding Yearwood.	0.20	\$42.00
10/19/18	DJC	Work on background acquisition cost documents for Somerset Road District reimbursement issues, and conference and correspondence with Joe E. and Pam N. regarding same.	0.60	\$120.00
	CDC	Calculate Yearwood costs; phone conference with Pam N.; emails to Mark Dietz and Joe England; read and respond to email from Pam.	1.80	\$378.00
10/22/18	CDC	Phone conference with attorney Mark Dietz; review open records request from Baird law firm.	0.90	\$189.00
10/23/18	CDC	Read and respond to email from Pam Navarrette regarding Somerset.	0.20	\$42.00
Sub-total Fees:		ees:	12.70	\$2,588.50

Total Now Due:

\$ 2,588.50 GMUK 19/3/20

Timekeeper Summary

Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	Amount
Charlie Crossfield	11.60	210.00	\$2,436.00
Don Childs	0.60	200.00	\$120.00
Terri Woodmancy	0.50	65.00	\$32.50

Sheets & Crossfield, PLLC 309 E. Main St.

Round Rock, TX 78664

FEB 1 1 2019

(512) 255-8877

January 31, 2018 2019
Invoice 46735 GMUC
Per Misty Gray
Per Misty Gray
Description

a sheets & Crossfield

Williamson County Williamson County Commissioner's Court Honorable Judge Bill Gravell Jr. 710 Main Street Georgetown, TX 78626

Somerset Road District 3 & 4 (Somerset Hills - P13) Matter ID: 1027.0810

Professional Fees:					
			_	Hours	Amount
01/09/19	CDC	Phone conference with attorney Mark Dietz.		0.20	\$42.00
Sub-total Fees:					\$42.00
	Total No	ow Due:			\$42.00
Time In a man Our					mu 1913/20
Name Charlie Crossfield		Timekeeper Summary	Hours	Rate 210.00	Amount \$42.00

Sheets & Crossfield, PLLC 309 E. Main St. Round Rock, TX 78664

APR 1 1 2019

(512) 255-8877

And Thermoon sector

March 31, 2019 Invoice 47131

Williamson County Williamson County Commissioner's Court Honorable Judge Bill Gravell Jr. 710 Main Street Georgetown, TX 78626

Somerset Road District 3 & 4 (Somerset Hills - P13) Matter ID: 1027 0810

Matter ID:	1027.0810)			
	Profess	ional Fees:			
				<u> Hours</u>	Amount
03/13/19	CDC	Review emails from Gary Kimball, Phil Haag and Carol Polumbo; read and respond to emails from Julie Kiley and Valerie Covey.		0.90	\$189.00
03/19/19	CDC	Phone conference with Garry Kimball regarding tax rate for Districts 3 and 4.		0.50	\$105.00
	Sub-total F	ees:	•	1.40	\$294.00
Total Now Due:					294.00
		T			JML 10/13/20
Name		Timekeeper Summary	Hours	Rate _	Amount
Charlie Cros	ssfield		1.40	210.00	\$294.00