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Selected #

Selected ($)
# Locked Items Selected Lowest QuantityReEstimatedQtVendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost

0
#0-1 FALSE 4 X 4 NON-   $ 0.04 $ 0.02175 1 60,000 EA 416817 $ 0.04 200/slv, 10 81.5 $ 0.04 131408893 $ 0.0344 200/bag 6.88 $ 0.0344
#0-2 FALSE ALCOHOL P       $ 0.01 $ 0.00765 1 50 BX 1007 $ 4.06 200/bx, 20 81.25 $ 4.06 1113 $ 0.00765 200/box 1.53 $ 0.00765
#0-3 FALSE URINE CHE      $ 30.59 $ 0.22 1 20 BX 10 $ 51.1875 100 Strips/ 51.1875 $ 51.1875 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#0-4 FALSE GRADUATE      $ 0.01 $ 0.01 1 10,000 EA 700 $ 0.017542 100/slv, 50 87.7125 $ 0.0175425131125555 $ 0.0126 100/bag 1.26 $ 0.0126
#0-5 FALSE SILENT KNIG      $ 0.04 $ 0.04 1 5,000 EA 1000 $ 0.069975 1000/Box 69.975 $ 0.069975 138860059 $ 0.082 100/pack 8.2 $ 0.082
#0-6 FALSE GLUCOMET       $ 8.45 $ 0.01 1 10 EA 4006 $ 50 Each 50 $ 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#0-7 FALSE GLUCOMET        $ 0.16 $ 0.16 1 100 BTL 4007 $ 42.575 50 strips/bx42.575 $ 42.575 1740015 $ 0.4826 50/box 24.13 $ 0.4826
#0-8 FALSE INSTANT G    $ 6.81 $ 1.27 1 90 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131246672 $ 1.393333 3/pack 4.18 $ 1.3933333
#0-9 FALSE INSULIN SY     $ 0.13 $ 0.1 1 50 BX 26027 $ 18.07 10/bg, 10bg  90.35 $ 18.07 131255261 $ 0.1068 100/box 10.68 $ 0.1068
#0-10 FALSE LANCETS - U    $ 0.12 $ 0.12 1 50,000 EA 742 $ 0.57025 100/Box 57.025 $ 0.57025 139122987 $ 0.148 200/box 29.6 $ 0.148
#0-11 FALSE ACETAMIN   $ 11.51 $ 0.01306 1 15 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131414351 $ 0.01306 1000/bottle13.06 $ 0.01306
#0-12 FALSE ASA 325MG $ 1.87 $ 0.0184 1 20 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131233468 $ 0.0219 100/bottle 2.19 $ 0.0219
#0-13 FALSE ASPIRIN 81     $ 1.18 $ 0.03 1 30 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#0-14 FALSE CLOTRIMAZ      $ 1.93 $ 1.35 1 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131269288 $ 1.35 each 1.35 $ 1.35
#0-15 FALSE ENSURE PL    $ 3.53 $ 1.40375 1 10 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131296215 $ 1.40375 24/case 33.69 $ 1.40375
#0-16 FALSE FOLIC ACID   $ 7.77 $ 0.0355 1 5 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131408740 $ 0.0355 100/bottle 3.55 $ 0.0355
#0-17 FALSE HYDROCOR      $ 0.12 $ 0.050069 1 720 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 134843522 $ 0.0588 144/box 8.48 $ 0.0588
#0-18 FALSE IBUPROFEN     $ 20.32 $ 0.01474 1 100 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131045529 $ 0.01474 1000/bottle14.74 $ 0.01474
#0-19 FALSE OMEPRAZO  $ 10.49 $ 0.02312 1 30 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131381066 $ 0.02312 1000/bottle23.12 $ 0.02312
#0-20 FALSE LICE SHAM   $ 88.45 $ 60.8275 1 10 EA 75120 $ 100.1 Each 100.1 $ 100.1 131099992 $ 60.8275 4 gallon/ca 243.31 $ 60.8275
#0-21 FALSE IMODIUM    $ 515.93 $ 0.63666 1 100 BX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 133210077 $ 0.63666 12/box 7.64 $ 0.63666
#0-22 FALSE NAPROXEN  $ 0.19 $ 0.02834 1 25 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1853031 $ 0.02834 1000/bottle28.34 $ 0.02834
#0-23 FALSE MILK OF M  $ 4.28 $ 2.19 1 24 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131240815 $ 2.19 each 2.19 $ 2.19
#0-24 FALSE MULTI-VITA  $ 1.67 $ 0.0106 1 50 BTL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11077987 $ 0.01905 1000/bottle19.05 $ 0.01905
#0-25 FALSE AMMONIA  $ 0.69 $ 0.213 1 120 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#0-26 FALSE BENADRYL $ 3.6 $ 0.01684 1 30 BTL 249839 $ 7.95 12/Case 95.4 $ 7.95 131409218 $ 0.01684 1000/bottle16.84 $ 0.01684
#0-27 FALSE ORAJEL MA   $ 1.87 $ 1.87 1 2,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#0-28 FALSE PRENATAL  $ 5.23 $ 0.0375 1 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1915388 $ 0.0731 100/bottle 7.31 $ 0.0731
#0-29 FALSE TRIPLE ANT    $ 0.08 $ 0.0575 1 720 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131411277 $ 0.0575 144/box 8.28 $ 0.0575
#0-30 FALSE TUMS/ANT  $ 2.1 $ 0.0114 1 30,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 131386650 $ 0.0114 150/bottle 1.71 $ 0.0114

No Basket (30)

$ 0 $ 0
0 0

$ 274.6402675 $ 69.04864333333329
Agni Enterprises, LLC B&E MEDICAL SUPPLY AND EQUIPMENT



VendorCatUnitPrice HowSuppliedCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost

58 $ 0.02175 200/bag 43.5 $ 0.02175 440028 $ 1,275.0 4000/cs 85 $ 1,275.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 $ 2.08 200/bx 41.6 $ 2.08 191089 $ 175 200/bx 3.5 $ 175 58204 $ 0.01 200/BOX 1.9 $ 0.01
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 920581 $ 0.22 100/BX 21.54 $ 0.22
0 $ 0.02 each 100 $ 0.02 188670 $ 25 100/bx 2.5 $ 25 12146 $ 0.01 100BX 1.43 $ 0.01
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1019769 $ 8,000.0 20/Bx 32 $ 8,000.0 1019769 $ 2.13 20/BOX 42.54 $ 2.13
153 $ 0.01 each 0.01 $ 0.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 536014500 $ 0.18 102/BOX 17.93 $ 0.18
0 $ 18.75 100/bx 18.75 $ 18.75 740015 $ 2,800.0 50/Bx 28 $ 2,800.0 740015 $ 0.39 50/BOX 19.47 $ 0.39
126 $ 1.27 3/pk 3.82 $ 1.27 580125 $ 540 3/Pk 18 $ 540 112772 $ 4.45 3/PACK 13.35 $ 4.45
0 $ 12.3 100/bx 12.3 $ 12.3 629839 $ 600 50/Bx 12 $ 600 942669 $ 0.1 100/BOX 9.72 $ 0.1
153 $ 0.1202 100/bx 12.02 $ 0.1202 539416 $ 12,500.0 100/Bx 25 $ 12,500.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1189770 $ 0.02 1000/BOTT16.03 $ 0.02
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 280200010 $ 0.78 100/BOTTL 7.8 $ 0.78
125 $ 0.7 36/bt 0.7 $ 0.7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 555693 $ 0.03 36/BOTTLE 1.19 $ 0.03
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 742102 $ 3,250.0 1/ea. 6.5 $ 3,250.0 516722002 $ 3.01 EACH 3.01 $ 3.01
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1048233 $ 420 24/Cs 42 $ 420 64911 $ 1.49 24/CASE 35.7 $ 1.49
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 712059 $ 60 100/Btl 12 $ 60 651620361 $ 0.06 100/BOTTL 6.18 $ 0.06
65 $ 0.07375 144/bx 10.62 $ 0.07375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 769301 $ 0.14 25/BOX 3.56 $ 0.14
0 $ 26.82 250pk/bx 26.82 $ 26.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1181156 $ 0.02 1000/BOTT18.28 $ 0.02
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1166143 $ 150 30/Btl 5 $ 150 167140715 $ 0.09 30/BOTTLE 2.81 $ 0.09
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 648759 $ 2,720.0 32/Cs 272 $ 2,720.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0 $ 7.74 18/bx 7.74 $ 7.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0 $ 8.77 100/bt 8.77 $ 8.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 651620190 $ 0.12 1000/BOTT119.19 $ 0.12
0 $ 2.25 16 oz bt 2.25 $ 2.25 864441 $ 60 1/ea. 2.5 $ 60 864441 $ 2.21 EACH 2.21 $ 2.21
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1111285 $ 350 100/Btl 7 $ 350 633782 $ 0.03 100/BOTTL 2.65 $ 0.03
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1202287 $ 42 10/Bx 3.5 $ 42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 $ 28.58 25/pk 28.58 $ 28.58 497991 $ 900 1000/Btl 30 $ 900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0 $ 6.07 each 6.07 $ 6.07 861263 $ 13,000.0 1/ea. 6.5 $ 13,000.0 103100222 $ 5.03 EACH 5.03 $ 5.03
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 915388 $ 65 100/Btl 6.5 $ 65 904531346 $ 0.06 30/BOTTLE 1.88 $ 0.06
0 $ 0.07625 144/bx 10.98 $ 0.07625 498019 $ 170 144/Bx 34 $ 170 1203087 $ 0.18 25/BOX 4.4 $ 0.18
0 $ 0.0794 50/bx 3.97 $ 0.0794 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 706770137 $ 0.02 150/BOTTL 3.21 $ 0.02

  

$ 0 $ 0 $ 0
0 0 0

$ 115.73134999999999 $ 47,102.0 $ 20.779999999999994
Bound Tree Medical, LLC CBS DME & Medical Supplies D's Ventures, LLC dba LogMet Solutions



VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplied( CostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost

25412 $ 0.03125 2000/CASE 62.5 $ 0.03125 440343 $ 0.03385 200/BG 6.77 $ 0.03385 267673 $ 4.91 200 4.91 $ 4.91
970735 $ 0.0225 200/BOX 4.5 $ 0.0225 191089 $ 0.0124 200/BX 2.48 $ 0.0124 243925 $ 1.63 200 1.63 $ 1.63
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150677 $ 39.84 EA 39.84 $ 39.84 269273 $ 15.54 100 15.54 $ 15.54
700001 $ 0.02 5000/CASE 100 $ 0.02 188670 $ 0.0149 100/SL 1.49 $ 0.0149 39002 $ 0.89 100 0.89 $ 0.89
1000 $ 0.08 1000/CASE 80 $ 0.08 1019769 $ 2.1715 20/BX 43.43 $ 2.1715 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 960302 $ 0.02 1/BX 0.02 $ 0.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 960298 $ 0.3258 50/BX 16.29 $ 0.3258 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 580125 $ 4.3867 3/PK 13.16 $ 4.3867 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 629839 $ 0.114 100/BX 11.4 $ 0.114 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 539418 $ 0.15075 200/BX 30.15 $ 0.15075 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1189770 $ 16.35 BTL 16.35 $ 16.35 46018 $ 8.65 1000 8.65 $ 8.65
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 555685 $ 1.49 BTL 1.49 $ 1.49 46001 $ 0.81 100 0.81 $ 0.81
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 555693 $ 1.22 BTL 1.22 $ 1.22 596770 $ 1.31 36 1.31 $ 1.31
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 742102 $ 3.77 EA 3.77 $ 3.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 518432 $ 1.57958 24/CS 37.91 $ 1.57958 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 712059 $ 6.59 BTL 6.59 $ 6.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 796007 $ 0.050069 144/BX 7.21 $ 0.050069 81679984 $ 8.12 144 8.12 $ 8.12
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1181156 $ 18.66 BTL 18.66 $ 18.66 69176 $ 7.56 500 7.56 $ 7.56
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1166143 $ 3.01 BTL 3.01 $ 3.01 261890 $ 29.31 28 29.31 $ 29.31
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 549418 $ 0.94 1/BX 0.94 $ 0.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 960975 $ 127.15 BTL 127.15 $ 127.15 7200566 $ 4.95 100 4.95 $ 4.95
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 864441 $ 2.26 BTL 2.26 $ 2.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1077987 $ 8.91 BTL 8.91 $ 8.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1202287 $ 0.213 10/BX 2.13 $ 0.213 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 497991 $ 18.45 BTL 18.45 $ 18.45 243094 $ 5.67 24 5.67 $ 5.67
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 586119 $ 7.39 EA 7.39 $ 7.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 556973 $ 4.66 BTL 4.66 $ 4.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 943299 $ 0.133819 144/BX 19.27 $ 0.133819 81679950 $ 9.99 144 9.99 $ 9.99
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1204709 $ 3.28 BTL 3.28 $ 3.28 43030 $ 5.29 150 5.29 $ 5.29

  

$ 0 $ 0 $ 0
0 0 0

$ 0.15375 $ 273.17636799999997 $ 104.63000000000001
Matt Huang/Mini Wing USA McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Medco Sports Medicine



VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost VendorCataUnitPrice HowSupplieCostperBoxTotalCost

157114 $ 0.029 200/SLV 5.8 $ 0.029 441215 $ 4.25 200/bag 4.25 $ 4.25 25412 $ 0.04 200 Each / 7.26 $ 0.04
6818 $ 1.81 200/bx 1.81 $ 1.81 404000702 $ 1.75 200/Box 1.75 $ 1.75 90735 $ 0.01 200 Each / 1.93 $ 0.01
80010 $ 17.8 100/btl 17.8 $ 17.8 189539716 $ 0.2799 100/Bt 27.99 $ 0.2799 10 $ 30.59 1 Bottle / B30.59 $ 30.59
2301 $ 0.0121 100/slv 1.21 $ 0.0121 1125555 $ 0.135 100/bag 1.35 $ 0.135 70000 $ 0.01 5000 Each / 70.53 $ 0.01
1000 $ 0.107 50/bg 5.35 $ 0.107 741431 $ 0.0825 100/pack 8.25 $ 0.0825 1000 $ 0.04 1000 Each / 41.75 $ 0.04
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1540 $ 8.45 1 Each / Ea 8.45 $ 8.45
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1550 $ 0.16 50 Each / B 8.09 $ 0.16
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 574006930 $ 4.15 3/pack 12.45 $ 4.15 74633 $ 6.81 3 Each / Bo20.42 $ 6.81
26027 $ 10.85 100/bx 54.25 $ 10.85 26027 $ 0.1287 100/Box 12.87 $ 0.1287 828155 $ 0.13 100 Each / 12.72 $ 0.13
7155 $ 0.1235 100/bx 12.35 $ 0.1235 6686373 $ 0.1857 100/Box 18.57 $ 0.1857 28 $ 0.12 2000 Each / 237.66 $ 0.12
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578960104 $ 0.01522 1000/Bottle15.22 $ 0.01522 10210 $ 11.51 1 Bottle / B11.51 $ 11.51
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578960901 $ 0.0184 100/Bottle 1.84 $ 0.0184 92101 $ 1.87 1 Each / Ea 1.87 $ 1.87
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 518240164 $ 0.035 36/Bottle 1.26 $ 0.035 91136 $ 1.18 1 Bottle / B1.18 $ 1.18
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 518240063 $ 1.75 1oz/Tube 1.75 $ 1.75 6301 $ 1.93 1 Each / Ea 1.93 $ 1.93
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 57266 $ 7.455 8Bottle/Cas59.64 $ 7.455 57266 $ 3.53 24 Each / C 84.73 $ 3.53
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 693150127 $ 0.0406 100/Bottle 4.06 $ 0.0406 51281 $ 7.77 1 Bottle / B7.77 $ 7.77
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53110 $ 0.074 144/box 10.66 $ 0.074 21135 $ 0.12 144 Each / 17.84 $ 0.12
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578969411 $ 0.159 1000/Bottle15.9 $ 0.159 94110 $ 20.32 1 Bottle / B20.32 $ 20.32
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 781286831 $ 0.075 30/bottle 2.25 $ 0.075 39733 $ 10.49 1 Box / Box10.49 $ 10.49
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11281 $ 63 4/Case 252.17 $ 63 99992 $ 88.45 4 Each / Ca 353.78 $ 88.45
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 302121200 $ 0.66 12/Box 7.92 $ 0.66 21212 $ 515.93 1 Each / Ea 515.93 $ 515.93
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 494830618 $ 35.03 500/Bottle 35.03 $ 35.03 684621900 $ 0.19 100 Each / 18.52 $ 0.19
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578966491 $ 2.9 12oz/Bottle2.9 $ 2.9 12 $ 4.28 1 Bottle / B4.28 $ 4.28
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578965011 $ 0.0106 1000/bottle10.6 $ 0.0106 50101 $ 1.67 1 Bottle / B1.67 $ 1.67
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2012 $ 0.69 50 Each / P 34.35 $ 0.69
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 904530760 $ 0.0358 100/Bottle 3.58 $ 0.0358 18640 $ 3.6 1 Bottle / B3.6 $ 3.6
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2303 $ 1.87 1 Each / Tu 1.87 $ 1.87
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 578965750 $ 0.0375 100/Bottle 3.75 $ 0.0375 57501 $ 5.23 1 Bottle / B5.23 $ 5.23
53210 $ 0.10243 144/bx 14.75 $ 0.10243 598980740 $ 0.064 144/box 9.22 $ 0.064 1209 $ 0.08 144 Each / 11.85 $ 0.08
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 536104815 $ 0.022 150/bottle 3.3 $ 0.022 6732 $ 2.1 24 Each / C 50.31 $ 2.1
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$ 30.83403 $ 122.34391999999998 $ 729.1700000000001

Mercedes Medical Zhou Medical Solutions, LLC
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