BID TABULATION

22IFB116 ASPHALT MIXES
WILLIAMSON COUNTY- TEXAS

Asphalt Inc LLC, dba Lone Star Paving
Tony Bermudez

Texas Materials Group, Inc.
Bailey Lewis

Waller County Asphalt, Inc
Reid Dawson

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

Delivery Site

UNIT PRICING -

DELIVERED UNIT PRICING - PICKED UP

UNIT PRICING -
DELIVERED

UNIT PRICING - PICKED UP

UNIT PRICING -
DELIVERED

UNIT PRICING - PICKED UP

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type B PG 64-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340

S 84.00

N/A

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type B PG 64-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340 with 20% UNFRACTIONATED
RAP

76.50

S 105.00

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type B PG 64-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340 with 20% FRACTIONATED RAP

75.50

S 105.00

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type B PG 64-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340 with 30% FRACTIONATED RAP

67.25

$ 105.00

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type C PG 70-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340

99.00

N/A

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type C PG 70-22 SAC B, TX DOT ITEM
# 340 with 10% FRACTIONATED OR
UNFRACTIONATED RAP

87.75

S 115.00

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type D PG 70-22 SAC B TX DOT ITEM #
340

100.00

N/A

NO BID

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Type D PG 70-22 SAC B TX DOT ITEM #
340 with 10% FRACTIONATED OR
UNFRACTIONATED RAP

93.25

S 115.00

NO BID

Hot Mix Cold Lay Type D SAC B TX DOT|
ITEM #334
To reach 95% Lab Density

101.00

S 115.00

$98.00
BID FOR ASPPM
9202

Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base Type B
TX DOT ITEM #334
To reach 95% Lab Density

101.00
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S 115.00

$98.00
BID FOR ASPPM
9202

Hot Mix Cold Lay Type D SAC B TX DOT|
ITEM #334
To reach 95% Lab Density

Central Maintenance
Facility Road and Bridge
3151 SE Inner Loop
Georgetown, Tx 78626

S 115.00

S 135.00

Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base Type B
TX DOT ITEM #334
To reach 95% Lab Density

Central Maintenance
Facility Road and Bridge
3151 SE Inner Loop
Georgetown, Tx 78626

$ 115.00

$ 135.00

**Minimum Order Quantities**

Item 340- Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement
Mixes (Type B, Type C, Type D)- 200 Tons
Item 334- Hot Mix Cold Lay (Type B & Type D) -
Minimums are Not Applicable




