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1
"BAND-AID" BRAND ADHESIVE BANDAGES ;  3/4" X 3" 
FLEXIBLE FABRIC W/ NON-STICK PAD. (30 to 50 per box) $0.1060 $0.0095 No Bid $0.1000 No Bid $ 0.0121 $ 0.074 $0.0185 $1.3700 $0.1463 $0.2102 No Bid No Bid $0.1862

2
"M.A.D." INTRANASAL DEVICE WITHOUT SYRINGE 
(DEVICE ONLY) $ 9.7944 $ 3.53 No Bid $13.0000 No Bid $ 6.75 $6.5000 $7.7912 $9.2200 $8.9400 $ 4.64 No Bid No Bid $12.5900

3

1 GALLON BIOHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS;  prefer 
10 to 50 bags on a roll or in a bundle. Not more than 50 
per package. $ 0.2305 $0.1400 No Bid $0.2000 No Bid $ 0.075 $ 0.15 0.0698DNMS $1.3900 $0.1770 $0.1558 No Bid No Bid $0.5868

4

10 GALLON BIOHAZARD INFECTION  WASTE BAGS;  
prefer 10 to 50 bags on a roll or in a bundle. Not more 
than 50 per package. No Bid $ 0.09 No Bid $0.1600 No Bid $ 0.13 $ 0.12 $2.4770 No Bid $0.1500 $0.1343 No Bid No Bid $4.1555

5 LARGE BIOHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS $0.8683 $ 0.09 No Bid $0.4333 No Bid $ 0.22 $ 0.24 $0.5619 $1.3900 $0.3900 $ 0.6845 No Bid No Bid $0.5852
6 4 X 4 STERILE GAUZE $ 0.1564 $0.0143 No Bid $0.1500 No Bid $ 0.065 $0.0900 $0.0985 $0.0341 $0.1900 $0.0747 No Bid No Bid $0.1450
7 4" X 4" NON-STERILE SPONGES 8 PLY No Bid $0.0165 No Bid $0.0300 No Bid $ 0.01315 $ 0.02495 $0.0283 $0.1250 $0.0300 $0.0128 No Bid No Bid $0.0410

8
ACETAMINOPHEN , 500MG PER TABLET/CAPLET. 
LOOKING FOR 12 TO 24 COUNT BOTTLES.

9 ADENOCARD 6mg / 2ml (VIALS ONLY) $ 7.973 $2.1700 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.43 $ 4.65 No Bid $ 5.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
AFRIN NASAL SPRAY (OXYMETAZOLINE 
HYDROCHLORIDE 0.05%). LOOKING FOR 1/2 oz. BOTTLES $13.6000 $ 1.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.85 $ 1.35 $ 7.46 $8.2600 $18.5100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.1600

11 AIRWAY: I-GEL SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 1  #8201030 $31.1780 $ 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.98 $ 13.25 $17.0500 $14.5000 $33.7400 $14.2857 No Bid No Bid $13.1300
12 AIRWAY: I-GEL SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 1.5  #8211030 $31.1780 $ 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.98 $ 13.25 $17.0500 $14.3900 No Bid $14.2857 No Bid No Bid $13.1300
13 AIRWAY: I-GEL SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 2  #8202030 $31.1780 $ 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.98 $ 13.25 $17.0500 $14.5000 $33.7400 $14.2857 No Bid No Bid $13.1300
14 AIRWAY: I-GEL SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 2.5  #8225030 $31.1780 $ 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.98 $ 13.25 $17.0500 $14.5000 $33.7400 $14.2857 No Bid No Bid $13.1300

15
AIRWAY: RESUS I-GEL O2 SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 3  
#8703030 $ 21.4276 $ 21.50KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.57 $ 21.99 $28.4100 $34.5100 $61.4680 $23.8095 No Bid No Bid $ 13.13DNMS

16
AIRWAY: RESUS I-GEL O2 SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 4  
#8704030 $51.9633 $ 21.50KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.57 $ 21.99 $28.4100 $30.6100 $61.4680 $23.8095 No Bid No Bid $ 13.13DNMS

17
AIRWAY: RESUS I-GEL O2 SUPRAGLOTTIC, SIZE 5 
#8705030 $ 21.8676 $ 21.50KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.57 $ 21.99 $28.4100 $30.9100 $61.4680 $23.8095 No Bid No Bid $ 13.13DNMS

18 ALBUTEROL 0.083 % UNIT DOSE (30-50 DOSES PER BOX) $ 0.212 $0.1152 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.129 $0.2250 $0.1736 $0.3523 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4658
19 ALCOHOL PREP PADS @ 200 PER BOX $ 0.0075 $0.0099 $ 0.007 $0.0175 No Bid $ 0.0062 $0.0077 $0.4713 $0.1400 $0.2690 $0.0077 No Bid No Bid $0.0105

20

AMIODARONE (or GENERIC - Bidder to specify which) 
150MG / 3ML VIALS  (w/ Benzyl Alcohol) IN DARK 
COLORED VIALS/BOTTLES TO PROTECT FROM LIGHT.    
NO AMPULES ACCEPTED $ 2.4888 $1.8060 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.74 No Bid No Bid $11.1300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 ASPIRIN, ADULT LOW DOSE, 81mg; CHEWABLE TABLETS. $0.0248 $0.0192 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.025 $0.0222 $1.1300 $1.6800 $1.5300 $0.0338 No Bid No Bid $1.6300

22
ASSURE PRISM BLOOD GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS (BOTTLES 
OF 50) $ 0.5666 0.159KVT No Bid $12.5000 No Bid $ 0.198 $0.1900 $0.3680 $0.1552 $0.6192 $0.2321 No Bid No Bid $0.6748

23 ASSURE PRISM MULTI BLOOD GLUCOSE METER (ONLY) $11.6600 0.0000KVT No Bid $12.5000 No Bid $0.0000 $5.6000 $6.4400 $ 12.25 $18.7900 $6.3095 No Bid No Bid $14.0100
24 CASE FOR ASSURE BLOOD GLUCOSE METER No Bid 0.0000KVT No Bid $10.0000 No Bid $0.0000 $0.0000 No Bid $ 3.57 $15.0000 $2.2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 ASSURE PRISM MULTI CONTROL SOLUTION, L1 AND L2 $12.9500 $ 7.09KVT No Bid $12.0000 No Bid $ 9.36 $8.9000 $10.3000 $5.0317 $28.1600 $6.2619 No Bid No Bid $20.7200
26 ATROPINE 8MG/20ML MULTIDOSE VIAL $ 52.267 $41.7900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.46 $31.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $97.1900

27
ATROVENT (IPRATROPIUM BROMIDE) - BIDDER TO 
SPECIFY WHICH:  0.02 % IN 2.5 ML UNIT DOSE $ 0.2544 $0.1200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.1232 $0.2266 $0.1863 $0.3367 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.9400

28
BACK BOARDS - PEDI IMMOBILIZATION DEVICE; W/ 
VELCRO ATTACHMENTS

29
BACK BOARDS - PEDI;  PLASTIC  W/O PINS. (Prefer a 
small version of an adult coffin board)

30

BACK BOARDS (PLASTIC) -ADULT - 72" L  x  (min.)16"W.  
W/ ADULT AND (MIN. OF  6) CHILD STRAPPING 
LOCATIONS. CONCAVE SHAPE PREFERRED. W/O SPEED 
CLIPS. W/ LARGE GLOVE COMPATABLE HANDHOLDS; No Bid $ 135.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 151.14 $150.0000 No Bid $ 118.84 No Bid $176.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

31

BACKBOARD  RESTRAINT STRAPS: TWO PIECE, 5 ft, 
LIMITED USE POLYPROPYLENE WOVEN MATERIAL, W/ 
PLASTIC SIDE RELEASE BUCKLE. W/ PERMANENT STOP 
ON END OF STRAP TO PREVENT IT FROM COMING OFF 
OF THE BUCKLE.  (ORANGE) No Bid $ 1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.63 $ 1.45 No Bid $16.8700 No Bid $1.8928 No Bid No Bid $191.4200

32

BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, 
INFANT, WITH O2 TUBING     (LATEX FREE)   AMBU SPUR 
REQUIRED No Bid $ 12.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.38 $ 12.75 $13.6708 No Bid $25.4800 $13.8554 $ 8.12 No Bid $17.9700

33 BED PANS, FRACTURE STYLE $ 5.3695 $ 0.97 No Bid $2.5000 No Bid $ 1.02 $ 0.95 $ 1.34 $ 0.8DMNS $1.5250 $1.7317 No Bid No Bid $1.4200

34 BENADRYL (DIPHENHYDRAMINE)  50 MG / 1ML  VIALS $ 1.4208 $5.7600 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.99 $1.2000 $1.3060 $2.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.2156

35
BENADRYL LIQUID: 12.5MG/5ML. LOOKING FOR 30 TO 
60CC BOTTLES.

36
BENADRYL TABLETS, 25MG PER TABLET. LOOKING FOR 
12 TO 24 COUNT BOTTLES

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

HX – History
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NBA – No Bid Accepted
KVT - Keep Vendor Together
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37
Betadine Solution (10% Povidone Iodine)     1/2oz 
BOTTLES ONLY

38 BLANKET, READY-HEAT INFANT WARMING COCOON $27.2000 $ 14.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 15.41 $13.8500 $ 16.15 $39.0200 $33.4400 $ 2.48DNMS No Bid No Bid $44.7500

39
BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE POLYESTER; COT, 60" X 90" 
APPROX. SIZE:   NAVY  (Send Sample) No Bid $ 3.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.4025 $ 6.47 No Bid $7.8048 No Bid No Bid 2.4816DNMS

40

BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE, YELLOW.  Approximate  50" X 
84" size. (Send sample) GRAHAM MEDICAL #53382 
VisiBlanket PREFERED No Bid $ 1.86HX No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.86 No Bid $4.0980 $5.6436 No Bid $ 1.92 $ 1.57 No Bid $8.3117

41 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, ADULT: MABIS  style $52.5800 $ 6.32 No Bid $30.0000 No Bid $ 5.24 $ 7.3 $26.2800 $17.5000 $83.7200 $28.8554 No Bid No Bid $34.3160
42 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, CHILD: MABIS style $54.1500 $ 6.41 No Bid $58.0000 No Bid $ 5.06 $ 7.3 $47.1300 $ 18.49 $64.2300 $32.7831 No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, INFANT: MABIS  Style $54.5500 $ 6.41 No Bid $35.0000 No Bid $ 4.92 $7.3000 $54.6500 $ 18.55 $65.0300 $33.4268 No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, LARGE ADULT: MABIS  Style $53.2000 $ 6.41 No Bid $30.0000 No Bid $ 5.44 $ 8.15 $27.5300 $ 20.01 $57.6900 $37.1585 No Bid No Bid $34.3160
45 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, THIGH: MABIS  Style $65.0900 $ 6.72 No Bid $45.0000 No Bid $6.0000 $ 7.75 $19.6000 $28.3300 $40.8200 $43.2435 No Bid No Bid $71.2200

46

BULB SYRINGE 2 OZ, STERILE IN SEALED PACKAGE. FOR 
NASAL AND ORAL ASPERATION IN NEWBORNS AND 
INFANTS. $1.8070 $ 0.35 No Bid $1.7500 No Bid $ 0.62 $ 0.75 $1.1500 $1.0200 $1.0990 $0.4878 No Bid No Bid $0.8932

47
BURETROL SET WITH 1 ULTRASITE INJECTION SITE  B-
Braun 375111 ONLY (NO SUBS) $ 13.9995 $ 5.42 No Bid $13.0000 No Bid $ 5.11 No Bid $5.9180 No Bid $16.7220 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.0145

48
BURN SHEET 60" X 90"      (DYNAREX 3520) or 
(MEDSOURCE MS-BS0033) $6.2216 $ 1.87 No Bid $3.0000 No Bid $ 1.86 $ 1.99 $2.0600 $3.6500 $3.2500 $1.8800 No Bid No Bid $4.0060

49
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10%, 1gm/10ml VIAL  SINGLE DOSE 
UNIT $61.6280 $11.5980 No Bid $24.0000 No Bid $28.3100 $ 11.15DNMS No Bid $22.4490 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.8230

50
CAVI WIPES, DISINFECTANT WIPES: TUB  (13-5100 ONLY 
NO SUB) $10.9966 $11.0300 $ 0.27DNMS $14.0000 No Bid $9.9200 $7.5500 $11.1000 $ 9.02 $14.6200 $ 10.0361DNMS No Bid No Bid 6.8475HX/DEL

51 CHEST SEALS VENTED  H-VENT hvs01 ONLY (NO SUB) $ 17.7728 $ 10.58 No Bid $16.0000 No Bid No Bid $15.0000 9.1156DNMS No Bid No Bid $17.8928 No Bid No Bid $17.9700
52 CHLORAPREPS FREPP APPLICATOR 1.5ML $ 36.1015 $ 1.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 22.98 $ 0.94 $ 1.2962 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53 CID - MULTI GRIP,  ROUND, DISPOSABLE - ADULT SIZE No Bid $ 3.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.75 $3.9000 No Bid $7.8600 $14.0500 $ 4.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid

54
CONFORMING ROLLER BANDAGE - STERILE 4" X 75"; 
individual wrapped $ 1.3625 $ 0.26 No Bid $1.0000 No Bid $0.2400 $0.3300 $0.6700 $0.4700 $1.5240 $ 0.2480HX No Bid No Bid $0.4229

55
CPAP DELUXE MASK LARGE (MERCURY MEDICAL 10-571-
03) (NO SUBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.4700 No Bid No Bid $41.9780 $55.3620 $24.4819 No Bid No Bid $48.9740

56
CPAP DELUXE MASK SMALL/CHILD (MERCURY MEDICAL 
10-571-05) (NO SUBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.2440 $18.0602 No Bid No Bid $48.9740

57
CPAP FLOWSAFE II EZ ADULT SMALL KIT (MERCURY 
MEDICAL 10-573-19) (NO SUBS) $ 87.716 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.4000 $54.4000 $ 63.43 $137.3220 $143.2780 $59.0481 No Bid No Bid $160.2100

58
CYANIDE ANTIDOTE KIT (such as CYANOKIT): 
HYDROXOCOBALAMINE BASED KIT $1,493.9400 $ 1,136.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,230.66 $999.0000 $ 1,188.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,541.6300

59
DEXAMETHASONE 10MG/ML (VIAL ONLY)  NO AMPULE 
ACCEPTED $ 1.9744 $1.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.65 $ 1.11 $1.8396 $5.4700 $2.3330 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.6440

60 DEXTROSE 10%, 10 GM PER 100ML, in 250ML BAGS $8.8145 $ 2.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.04 $2.4000 $ 2.74 $10.7140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.7422
61 DILTIAZEM 25MG/5ML REFRIGERATED VIALS $9.8410 $3.6330 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.57 $ 3.415 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.7820

62

DISPENSING PIN, MICRO PIN; FOR WITHDRAWAL OR 
INJECTION OF MEDICATION FROM RUBBER-STOPPERED 
VIALS. LUER LOCK CONNECTOR. LATEX FREE: B. BRAUN 
# 519-415019 ONLY $ 0.5017 $ 0.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.3000 No Bid $ 0.23DNMS $ 0.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

63

DISPOSABLE SICKNESS (EMESIS) BAG, MEDLINE 
INDUSTRIES # NON70600  @ 25 per package  NON 
LATEX  OR CURAPLEX 1071-10208 No Bid $.34HX No Bid $1.4000 No Bid $0.4400 $0.3400 $1.3004 $ 0.44HX $0.8300 $0.5200 No Bid No Bid $0.4520

64 DROPERIDOL 5MG/2ML VIALS $24.3880 $11.3676 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.4800 No Bid No Bid $9.0640 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.7800

65

DRUG CASE, PELICAN #1550EMS ORANGE HARD SIDED; 
INCLUDING CLEAR POCKETS W/ MULTI POCKET ELASTIC 
POUCHES ATTACHED TO LID TO STORE CONTENTS. SIZE 
= 20.5"L x 16.75"W x 8.5"D (OUTSIDE DIMENSIONS). 
COLOR = ORANGE. $661.9000 $ 291.38 No Bid $650.0000 No Bid No Bid $270.0000 $437.6900 $268.0000 $722.0800 $341.0256 No Bid No Bid $312.6700

66 EASY CAP EtCO2 DETECTOR, ADULT No Bid $ 8.62 No Bid $12.0000 No Bid $ 9.14 $8.9000 $13.3600 $11.3400 $19.3300 $9.8452 No Bid No Bid $15.8000

67
ECG ELECTRODES, PEDI;  10/PKG.  AMBU BLUE SENSOR 
SP (REF: SP-OO-S/10)               (Non-Latex) $0.6560 $0.1990 No Bid $0.8000 No Bid $ 0.222 $ 0.29 No Bid 0.1415DNMS $0.8280 $0.3095 $ 0.179 No Bid $0.5200

68
EMERGENCY BANDAGE, MILITARY STYLE "ISRALIE": 4 
INCH (GREEN PACKAGING) DYNAREX 3683 $ 6.4116 $ 2.78 No Bid $5.2500 No Bid $ 2.77 $ 3.05 $0.0000 $6.2200 $3.5750 $ 3.58HX No Bid No Bid $7.0560

69
EMESIS WASH BASINS, DISPOSABLE,  LARGE  "7 1/4 
QUART"  (NOT THE 500/700 CC BASINS) No Bid $ 0.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.74 No Bid $54.6900 $0.9272 $2.4540 $ 0.97 No Bid No Bid $0.6766

70
EMS SHEARS with SAFETY BANDAGE TIP     7 1/2" (no 
shorter) (Black or Blue handle only) $2.3700 $ 0.68HX No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.62 $ 0.79HX $0.7900 $2.1700 $3.5900 $ 0.68 No Bid No Bid $2.3000

71
EPINEPHRINE 1:10,000 1MG/10ML; PFS      @ 10 to a 
Package.            (NEEDLELESS) No Bid $7.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.6700 $7.0250 No Bid $6.8300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.6830

72
EPINEPHRINE 1:1000 1MG/1ML (VIAL ONLY), AMPULES 
NOT ACCEPTED. $ 24.2136 $17.5700 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 19.94 $ 16.25 $27.1000 $16.8404 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $391.7300

NO BID ACCEPTED

HX – History
DEL – Delivery
DNMS – Did Not Meet Specs
NBA – No Bid Accepted
KVT - Keep Vendor Together
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73
ESMOLOL 10MG/ML (VIAL ONLY)  NO AMPULE 
ACCEPTED $ 6.552 $8.3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.6300 No Bid $16.0300 $11.3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.2448

74

ET TUBE INTRODUCER, FLEXIBLE TUBING THAT WILL 
REMAIN IN DESIRED SHAPE WHILE BEING USED. 15fr. 
DIAMETER With BEND APPROX. 2CM FROM END AND 
MARKINGS TO INDICATE INTUBATION DEPTH.  (send 
sample) No Bid $ 4.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.42 No Bid $9.8200 $4.6700 No Bid $5.9523 No Bid No Bid No Bid

75

ET TUBE INTRODUCER: FLEXIBLE TUBING THAT WILL 
REMAIN IN DESIRED SHAPE WHILE BEING USED. 10fr. 
DIAMETER With BEND APPROX. 2CM FROM END AND 
MARKINGS TO INDICATE INTUBATION DEPTH. (send 
sample) No Bid $ 5.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.42 No Bid $ 9.82 No Bid No Bid $4.7619 No Bid No Bid No Bid

76
ET TUBE RESTRAINT, ADULT, (THOMAS BRAND STYLE) 
(NO SUBSTITUTES) No Bid $ 2.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.68 $ 2.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.9761 No Bid No Bid No Bid

77
ET TUBE; CUFFED, SIZES - 6.0, 7.5, & 8.0mm           (LATEX 
FREE) No Bid $ 1.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.88 $ 0.87 No Bid $1.5100 $5.4260 $ 0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid

78
ET TUBE; UNCUFFED, SIZE RANGES - 3.0,3.5,4.0,4.5,5.0 
& 5.5mm        (LATEX FREE) No Bid $0.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.64 $ 0.81 No Bid No Bid $6.1260 $ 0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid

79

EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC;  
ADJUSTABLE:  INFANT AND PEDI. (AMBU: MINI PERFIT 
ACE 000281106) NO SUB $15.7000 $5.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.16 $5.2000 $6.6800 No Bid $19.3500 $5.5833 $ 3.65 No Bid No Bid

80

EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC; 16 SIZE - 
ADJUSTABLE:  ADULT  (AMBU: PERFIT ACE 000281000)  
NO SUB $15.7000 $5.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.16 $5.2000 $6.6800 No Bid $19.3500 $5.5833 $ 3.65 No Bid No Bid

81
FENTANYL: 0.05MG/ML IN 2ML vials     (total 100mcg. 
per vials)  (VIALS ONLY) $ 1.9408 $ 1.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.97 $4.5600 $2.7340 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

82 FERNO CODE 1 PEDI Bag w/ pouches, RED No Bid $ 162.30DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 270.99DNMS $ 922.43DNMS $ 189.75 No Bid No Bid $ 450.00DNMS
83 FERNO AIRWAY Mgmt/TRAUMA BAGS. Red No Bid $ 267.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 317.37 $299.0000 $458.6600 $404.2600 $988.6800 $310.5769 No Bid No Bid $561.6000

84

GLOVES, POWDER FREE-CHLOROPRENE, NEOPRO EC: 
SIZES: X-TRA SMALL THRU     XX-TRA LARGE               
(Must be MICROFLEX Brand, no substitution allowed) $0.3111 $ 0.22 $ 0.16DNMS $ 0.14DNMS No Bid $ 0.234 $ 0.24 $0.2476 $0.3300 $ 0.132DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4020

85

GLUCAGEN (GLUCAGON)  AS A BOXED SET W/ 1 MG 
VIAL (POWDER) AND 1ML VIAL STERILE WATER FOR 
RECONSTITUTION (BEDFORD LABS NDC 55390-004-01) $474.3200 $ 173.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 223.39 $185.0000 $ 220.94 $38.4DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

86
HALDOL (HALOPERIDOL); 5MG/ML IN 1 ML VIALS (VIALS 
ONLY) $ 1.3336 $ 1.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.1000 $ 0.29 $1.1332 $5.5810 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.8268

87 HALO CHEST SEALS (2 PACK) No Bid $13.7200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.9600 $ 16.25 $ 18.68 $ 15.53 $41.6900 $21.5238 No Bid No Bid $31.9500

88

HAND SANITIZER, ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES W/ 0.5% 
CHLOROXYLENOL  (VIONEX, by METREX ONLY) reorder # 
10-1510   NO SUBSTITUTIONS $ 0.2756 $ 0.06 No Bid $0.3400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4284

89

HAND SANITIZER, PURELL INSTANT LIQUID (with 
Moisturizer) by GOJO, IN 2 OZ. BOTTLES ONLY  (not 4 
oz.) NO SUBSTITUTIONS $1.9495 $ 1.24 No Bid $2.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.98DNMS No Bid $1.9050 $1.9615 No Bid No Bid $4.8000

90

I.V. ADMIN. SET 15 GTT. WITH UNIVERSAL SPIKE, TWO 
ULTRASITE INJECTION SITES, AND SPIN-LOCK 
CONNECTOR. approx. 80-100" LENGTH      (Latex Free) B-
Braun # US1150 ONLY (NO SUBS) $4.3700 $ 2.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.22 $ 1.85 $ 2.33 $3.8602 $9.7100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.7900

91
I.V. ADMIN. SET 60 GTT  W/ 1 ULTRASITE INJECTION SITE      
(Latex Free) No Bid $1.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.53 $1.6000 No Bid $ 4.45 No Bid $4.8171 No Bid No Bid No Bid

92
I.V. CATHETER 14 GA X 1.25";  PROTECTIV  (by 
CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $1.7000 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $1.2498 No Bid No Bid $3.6154

93 I.V. CATHETER 16 GA X 1.25"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $2.8450 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $1.4166 No Bid No Bid $3.9028

94 I.V. CATHETER 18 GA X 1.25"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $ 1.7018 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $1.2498 No Bid No Bid No Bid

95 I.V. CATHETER 20 GA X 1.25"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $ 1.7018 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $ 1.2498 No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 I.V. CATHETER 22 GA X 1.00"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $ 1.7018 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $ 1.2498 No Bid No Bid No Bid

97 I.V. CATHETER 24 GA X .75"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) No Bid $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.33 $1.5000 $ 1.7018 $3.8678 $ 2.1258 $ 1.2498 No Bid No Bid No Bid

98
I.V. CATHETER, CURAPLEX CLEARSAFE COMFORT: SIZES 
FROM 14ga. THRU 24ga. No Bid $ 1.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.3300 No Bid $1.6096 $2.6104 No Bid $ 1.597 No Bid No Bid No Bid

99
I.V. CATHETER: 14ga X 5.25"; 
SUBCLAVIAN/PARICARDIOCENTESIS NEEDLE No Bid $ 18.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.63 No Bid $19.7550 2.6104DNMS No Bid $8.3333 No Bid No Bid No Bid

100

I.V. INJECTION SITE TUBING, with REMOVEABLE 
ULTRASITE INJECTION SITE; 7"-10" LENGTH; LARGE 
BORE   (PREFERRED: B-BRAUN 352244 ONLY)      (Latex 
Free) $ 2.2175 $ 1.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.32 $ 1.25 $ 1.3038 $2.6104 $2.5800 $1.2692 No Bid No Bid No Bid

HX – History
DEL – Delivery
DNMS – Did Not Meet Specs
NBA – No Bid Accepted
KVT - Keep Vendor Together
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101
I.V. PRESSURE INFUSER BAG W/ GAUGE, DISPOSABLE: 
for 1000cc Bags. (Not any type of Blood Pressure cuff) $20.2180 $ 6.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7.09 $15.7500 $9.4820 $ 9.47 No Bid $9.3571 No Bid No Bid No Bid

102

INFECTION ISOLATION KIT, UNI-SIZE WITH LONG 
SLEEVED PERSONAL PROTECTIVE GOWN,  N-95 TYPE 
MASK (universal size), HEAD BOUFFANT,  SHOE COVERS, 
AND INFECTIOUS WASTE BAG IN A PROTECTIVE BAG OR 
POUCH. (COMMERCIAL KIT) (CITY OF BIRMINGHAM KIT)

103
INSTANT GLUCOSE 15 GRAMS (TUBE ONLY, NO TEAR 
OPEN POUCHES) $4.8400 $ 3.12 No Bid $6.0000 No Bid $ 4.05 $2.5000 $4.0667 $6.1864 $5.5130 $3.1927 No Bid No Bid $8.0933

104
INSTANT ICE PACKS 6" X 9" (approximate therapeutic 
time - 20min) $0.9342 $ 0.36 No Bid $1.1000 No Bid $ 0.65 $ 0.61 $0.9417 $0.8000 $1.1346 $0.5604 No Bid No Bid $1.7475

105 IRRIGATION CAP WOUND SHIELD (662209) No Bid $3.3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.18 No Bid $ 3.96 $5.7000 $ 8.6612 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.8992
106 K Y JELLY .09 OZ FOIL PACK No Bid $0.0459 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.04 $ 0.05 $0.1024 $0.0595 $0.1800 $0.0749 No Bid No Bid $0.1997

107
KENDRICK EXTRICATION DEVICE, such as FERNO MODEL 
125 $338.2000 $ 66.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 63.68 $55.0000 $196.7300 $97.7800 $371.1800 $ 59.95 No Bid No Bid $112.1600

108 KETAMINE: 500MG/10ML VIALS $ 11.127 $6.3900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.14 No Bid $7.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.1617DNMS
109 KETOROLAC 60MG/2ML VIAL $ 2.3676 $3.7300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.37 $6.2000 1.12DNMS $3.4200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.7900
110 KING VISION REUSABLE DISPLAY (KVISO1) $2,426.2400 $1,111.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,055.55 $1,145.0000 1041.7DNMS $2,441.1500 $2,179.5700 $1,265.0602 No Bid No Bid No Bid

111
KING VISION VIDEO CHANNELED BLADES, # 3  (Ref. 
KVL03C) $66.6640 $ 42.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 38.88 $40.5000 $44.9900 $60.1500 $85.7170 $44.2160 No Bid No Bid $98.3900

112 LACTATED RINGERS 1000ML BAG $4.1117 $ 2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.45 $ 2.75 $3.0258 $4.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.9767

113

LANCETS - SINGLE USE WITH AUTOMATIC SPRING 
LOADED LANCET RETRACTION AFTER USE (Surgilance 
One-Step safety lancet SLN 240100 {ORANGE} )  -  NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS $ 0.1349 $ 0.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.0727 $ 0.0925 $0.0936 $0.1675 No Bid $0.0992 No Bid No Bid $0.1008

114
LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE AND HANDLE DISPOSABLE 
MILLER 0 (TRULITE )  (NO SUBS) No Bid $9.1900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 19.30UTI No Bid 15.199DNMS 2.757DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.4296DNMS

115
LIDOCAINE  (XYLOCAINE - Bidder to specify which)  2% 
100MG/5ML;  PFS (NEEDLELESS) $ 3.388DNMS $ 4.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.97 $4.5000 No Bid $6.0130 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

116
LUCAS 2 STABILIZATION STRAP (4 PACK) (#11576-
000037) No Bid $ 91.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.1150 $119.8175 $137.7000 $131.7073 No Bid $63.2700 $115.6100

117
LUCAS 2: MANUAL CPR DEVICE, SUCTION CUPS (PHYSIO 
CONTROL BRAND #11576-000047 ONLY) No Bid $ 38.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.5000 $42.2675 $52.3900 $67.8740 $48.7708 No Bid $35.5933 $53.6358

118 LUCAS 2: PATIENT STRAP - 3 PACK (#11576-000051) No Bid $ 84.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.1333 $164.2060 $120.6097 No Bid $77.2667 $116.4000
119 MAGILL FORCEPS, ADULT $17.2700 $ 3.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.46 $ 4.15 $21.1960 $6.6625 $12.5126 $ 3.88 No Bid No Bid $14.4283
120 MAGILL FORCEPS, PEDI $17.2700 $ 2.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.46 $ 4.15 $13.0000 $6.6567 $11.3200 $ 3.88 No Bid No Bid $14.1783
121 MAGNESIUM SULFATE, 1 GM VIALS No Bid $ 2.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.3000 No Bid No Bid $1.8568 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 MALE URINAL, PLASTIC $3.5100 $ 0.57 No Bid $1.2500 No Bid $ 0.45 $0.6500 $3.5400 $0.4117 $ 0.525 $1.2195 No Bid No Bid $1.8483

123

METHYLPREDNISOLONE  (SOLUMEDROL) 125 mg/2 ML 
ACT-O-VIAL WITH STERILE WATER DILUENT (SELF 
CONTAINED UNIT) $ 11.7444 $ 9.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.14 $8.6000 $9.9780 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

124 MULTI TRAUMA DRESSING 10" X 30" $ 4.8968 $ 0.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.98 $ 1.05 $6.0300 $1.7508 $3.5920 $ 0.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid

125

N95 COMPLIANT FACE MASK, MEDIUM: that meets or 
exceeds CDC and NIOSH requirements for Tuberculosis 
protection.

126
NALOXONE (NARCAN - Bidder to specify which) 
2MG/2ML; PFS (NEEDLELESS) $49.1070 $ 23.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.88 $ 33.99 No Bid $34.9060 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

127
NASAL CANNULA,  ADULT, CURVED TIP                             
(LATEX FREE) No Bid $ 0.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4800 $ 0.28 $0.4360 $0.3362 $ 0.5772 $ 0.285 No Bid No Bid $0.9900

128 NASAL CANNULA, PEDI       (LATEX FREE) $ 2.4636 $ 0.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.47 $ 0.57 $15.8760 $0.7158 $2.3570 $ 0.38 No Bid No Bid $2.1620

129

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS, SIZE RANGES - #14, 16, 
18, 20, 22, 24, 26, 28, 30, 32, & 36 (non sterile, w/o 
expiration dates)  ROUSH BRAND #'s 123114 THRU 
123136  (Latex Free) $ 0.341DNMS $ 1.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.06 $ 2.18 $13.6342 $7.0380 No Bid $2.1428 No Bid No Bid No Bid

130

NEBULIZER "T" CONNECTOR:   WITH (1) - 22MM ID END 
and (2) - 22MM OD ENDS.  (INTERSURGICAL # 1982000) 
(NO SUB) No Bid $1.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.3845 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.7495

131

NEBULIZER W/ MASK - ADULT SIZE     TEE PIECE ENDS 
MUST HAVE CONNECTORS OF 22MM OD AND 22MM ID. 
NEEDS TO BE CAPABLE OF NEBULIZING FROM UPRIGHT 
(VERTICLE) POSITION AND ANGLED UP TO 90 DEGREES.   
(Latex Free) (INTERSURGICAL 14836000) NO SUB No Bid $ 0.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.88 No Bid No Bid $5.2320

132

NEBULIZER W/ MASK - CHILD SIZE     TEE PIECE ENDS 
MUST HAVE CONNECTORS OF 22MM OD AND 22MM ID. 
NEEDS TO BE CAPABLE OF NEBULIZING FROM UPRIGHT 
(VERTICLE) POSITION AND ANGLED UP TO 90 DEGREES.   
(Latex Free) (INTERSURGICAL 14846000) NO SUB No Bid $ 0.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.9000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.09 No Bid No Bid $5.2560

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED
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133

NEBULIZER: INDIVIDUAL WRAPPED ITEM. MUST BE 
CAPABLE OF NEBULIZING FROM UPRIGHT (VERTICLE) 
POSITION AND ANGLED UP TO 90 DEGREES.  
INTERSURGICAL #15016000 PREFERRED. (NO SUB) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid

134

NEBULIZER: SUPERSET CATHETER MOUNT W/ DOUBLE 
SWIVEL ELBOW AND PORT (INTERSURGICAL # 3509031) 
(NO SUB) No Bid $1.8400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.29 No Bid No Bid $2.6932

135

NEEDLE, 21ga. X 1.5";  LUER LOCK, W/ BD SAFETYGLYDE 
OR KENDALL MONOJECT MAGELLAN PROTECTED POINT 
SAFETY NEEDLE (NO SUBSTITUTION) No Bid $ 0.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.268 $ 0.27 $0.4138 $0.5298 $0.4690 $0.2559 No Bid No Bid $0.3442

136

NEEDLE, 25ga. X 5/8": LUER LOCK, W/BD SAFETYGLYDE 
OR KENDALL MONOJECT MAGELLAN PROTECTED POINT 
SAFETY NEEDLE No Bid $ 0.13DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.268 $ 0.27 $ 0.4138 $0.9972 $ 0.289 $0.2619 No Bid No Bid $0.5324

137
NEOTECH MECONIUM ASPIRATOR, DISPOSABLE (CAT# 
N0101) $6.3150 $ 4.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.6900 $ 4.15 $ 4.791 $7.7700 $14.7470 $4.6144 No Bid No Bid $14.7188

138 NITRO -BID FOILPAKS: NDC 0168-0326-08 $4.0078 $ 2.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.97 $2.4000 $2.8377 $2.3719 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.1517

139

NITRO TABLETS, 0.4mg @ 25 per bottle. EACH BOTTLE 
TO BE INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED SO AS TO BE 
IDENTIFIED WHEN OPENED. $ 14.5304 $0.4100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.16 $0.6880 $0.4816 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.4492

140 NITROGLYCERIN IN D5W, 25MG/250ML GLASS BOTTLE $36.3783 $ 19.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.22 No Bid $26.3750 $37.5950 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

141

NON REBREATHER MASK (TOTAL) ADULT,  WITH 
RESERVOIR  & TUBING     (LATEX FREE) (NO EXPIRATION 
DATE) No Bid $ 0.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.95 $0.9000 $1.6360 $1.9400 $1.6856 $0.8428 No Bid No Bid $1.5686

142
NON REBREATHER MASK, PEDI; WITH RESERVOIR AND 
TUBING      (LATEX FREE)  (NO EXPIRATION DATE) No Bid $ 0.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.48 $ 1.29 $ 2.1706 $ 1.94 No Bid $1.1190 No Bid No Bid $1.5450

143
NOREPINEPHRINE 0.1%:    4MG/4ML (VIALS ONLY, NO 
AMPULES ACCEPTED) $18.5670 $23.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.65 $ 8.35 $14.7690 $15.7260 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

144
NORMAL SALINE, 0.9%: PREFILLED SYRINGE. 10ML 
VOLUME IN 10ML SYRINGE (LUER LOCK) $0.6807 $ 0.36HX/DEL/KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.4394 $ 0.35 $0.4244 $ 0.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4515

145 NORMAL SALINE, 100 CC BAGS $3.5123 $ 2.23HX/DEL/KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.52 $2.0000 $ 2.27875 $2.6214 $10.2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.9088
146 NORMAL SALINE, 1000 CC BAGS $ 3.5575 $ 2.88HX/DEL/KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.38 $ 2.85 $4.8271 $6.3279 $11.6870 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.5167
147 NORMAL SALINE, 500 CC BAGS $4.1471 $ 2.87HX/DEL/KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.38 $ 2.95 $ 4.0725 $ 8.68 $10.5500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.8000
148 NOSE CLIP PLASTIC $ 1.8048 $0.4762 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.2765 $ 0.27 $1.4329 $2.9800 $1.1120 $0.2979 No Bid No Bid $2.1853

149

OB KIT, W/ SEALED POUCH AND CARDBOARD BOX 
CONTAINER. MOTION MEDICAL DISTRIBUTING (stock #  
1736) ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTIONS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

150
ORAL PHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS - SIZE RANGES:  50,60,70, 
80, 90 & 100 mm       (Latex Free) No Bid $0.1600 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.24 $ 0.17 $18.0100 $0.4320 $5.9600 $ 0.23 No Bid No Bid $3.0417

151

OXYGEN, PRESSURE REGULATOR FOR "D" SIZE TANK,  0-
25 LPM CONSTANT FLOW  - STANDARD BARB; W/ 1 
STANDARD DISS OUTLET WITH CHECK VALVE, BRASS 
CORE FOR REDUCED WEIGHT; WITH PROTECTED 
CONTENTS GUAGE; WITH 5 YEAR OR LONGER 
WARRANTY. No Bid $27.0900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 26.78 $25.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.4457 No Bid No Bid No Bid

152
OXYGEN: "D"  CYLINDER WRENCH, SMALL, ALUMINUM 
ONLY  (NOT PLASTIC) No Bid $1.8200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.26 $ 1.65 $14.8300 $6.7700 No Bid $1.9156 No Bid No Bid $8.3200

153
OXYGEN: "K" CYLINDER REGULATOR WRENCH, 
ALUMINUM, (w/ slotted mounting holes) No Bid $7.6100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7.24 $ 6.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.4268 No Bid No Bid No Bid

154
OXYGEN: FLOW METER; REPLACEMENT OXYGEN TREE - 
PLASTIC No Bid $0.2800 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.24UTI $ 0.49 No Bid $0.6000 No Bid $ 0.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

155

OXYGEN: PRECISION FLOW CONTROL VALVE/ FIXED 
FLOW RATE SETTINGS; (O-25 LPM) with PREATTACHED 
MALE QUICK CONNECT FITTING W/ 1/8" MALE PIPE FOR 
AMBULANCE WALL MOUNTING (NOT FLOW TUBE). No Bid 67.71DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 50.45 No Bid $ 113.19DNMS No Bid No Bid $36.5476 No Bid No Bid No Bid

156

OXYGEN: PRESSURE REGULATOR, HIGH FLOW W/1 
STANDARD DISS OUTLET WITH CHECK VALVE;  FOR "K" - 
SIZE OXYGEN TANKS ON TRUCKS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 61.12UIT $43.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.8902 No Bid No Bid No Bid

157
OXYGEN QUICK CONNECT OHMEDA, (PRECISION 
MEDICAL 2114) No Bid $19.5600 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 21.53 No Bid $ 24.01 No Bid $52.3800 $22.0853 No Bid No Bid No Bid

158
OXYGEN: SUPPLY TUBING, UNIVERSAL (APPROX. 7 feet 
length) No Bid $0.3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.39 $ 0.37 $28.8500 $0.5100 $0.8580 $ 0.44 No Bid No Bid $0.8700

159 PARA  SHIELD FACE SHIELD WITH MASK
160 PATIENT RESTRAINTS LEG, POSEY 2791Q $46.6400 $ 15.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.8500 No Bid $ 21.34 $ 30.15 $33.5400 $35.6265 No Bid No Bid $ 26.25

NO BID ACCEPTED
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161 PATIENT RESTRAINTS WRIST, POSEY 2790Q $34.8000 $ 15.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.8500 No Bid $ 21.05 $ 29.22 $ 33.54 $35.5783 No Bid No Bid $ 25.89

162
PEEP DISPOSABLE DIVERTER, to fit O-TWO Medical 
SMART O2 Bag (O-TWO# 17MP7020-cs) $3.0360 $1.8990 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.77 $ 1.65 $2.4150 No Bid $3.1810 $1.7831 No Bid No Bid $4.9820

163

PEEP, DISPOSABLE VALVE WITH INTEGRAL FILTER: 
30MM FEMALE FITTING & ADJUSTABLE RANGE 0-20 cm 
H2O @ 12 PER BOX (Allied HCP #520073) No Bid $ 3.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.5000 No Bid No Bid $5.5358 No Bid $3.5903 No Bid No Bid No Bid

164
PENLIGHT, DISPOSABLE:W/ POCKET CLIP AND WHITE 
LIGHT. $2.8917 $ 0.64 No Bid $2.8333 No Bid $ 0.72HX $ 0.72 $2.6283 $0.7300 $ 3.183 $1.0150 No Bid No Bid $1.6117

165
PHILIPS EtCO2 ADULT SENSOR, NON-INTUBATED, 
M2526A $ 33.218 $ 8.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.7195DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid

166 PHILIPS EtCO2 PEDI SENSOR, NON INTUBATED; M2524A $ 30.8728 $ 8.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.9000 $11.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.3414DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid

167
PHILIPS EtCO2 SENSOR, ADULT/PEDI INTUBATED; 
M1920 $ 17.5592 $ 7.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.73 $ 9.95 $11.4600 $38.1100 No Bid $ 7.6829dnms No Bid No Bid No Bid

168
PHILIPS EtCO2 SENSOR, NEONATE/INFANT INTUBATED 
M1923 No Bid $ 11.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.7000 No Bid $ 48.33 No Bid $20.2146 No Bid No Bid No Bid

169
PHILIPS HEARTSTART FR-2+ AED, REPLACEMENT 
BATTERY No Bid $ 104.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $122.2000 No Bid No Bid $169.5121 No Bid No Bid No Bid

170 LIFEPAK AC POWER CORD 11140-000015 $129.1300 $ 74.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 71.65 No Bid $ 80.19 $106.1400 $139.9800 $354.5122 No Bid $ 67.64 $105.1900
171 TEST LOAD FOR USE W/LIFEPAK 21330-001365 $170.9400 $ 98.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 93.87 No Bid $105.3000 $139.2600 $202.0200 $111.3614 No Bid $ 62.05 $132.2300
172 CHEST LEAD ECG CABLE SET 11111-000022 $191.9000 $ 140.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 136.39 $144.0000 $152.6500 $201.6400 $193.6000 $160.8554 No Bid $ 128.44 $193.8800

173
LIMB LEAD ECG CABLE SET W/ TRUNK CABLE 11111-
000018 $476.1000 $ 346.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 338.05 $350.0000 $378.7300 $499.6400 $443.3800 $398.8072 No Bid $ 318.44 $481.2000

174
ECG 100MM CHEMICAL THERMAL PAPER (red) 11240-
000016 No Bid $ 1.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.9150 $10.3780 No Bid $9.5000 No Bid

175 PULSE OX ADAPTER CABLE RAINBOW 11171-000037 $331.1800 $198.6300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 84.27 $83.0000 $217.3900 $286.9900 $378.4800 $91.4634 No Bid $ 183.16 $362.4400

176 RAINBOW PULSE OX REUSABLE ADULT 11171-000049 $777.3200 $565.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 589.88 $550.0000 $618.3100 $815.4700 $723.8800 $640.2439 No Bid $520.6000 $810.1200
177 RAINBOW PULSE OX REUSABLE PEDI 11171-000050 $856.2600 $905.0500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 617.97 $540.0000 $681.1100 $898.2600 $797.4100 $670.7317 No Bid $ 573.04 $892.8000

178
PULSE OX SPO2 REUSABLE ADULT FINGER CLIP 2501  M-
LNCS  (2712-25010) No Bid $ 172.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 113.63 No Bid $322.0600 $162.5000 $368.8200 $180.7228 No Bid $244.7200 No Bid

179 SpO2 DISPOSABLE SENSOR: Pedi. 11171-000040 $20.9060 $ 15.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.3600 $ 12.25 $16.6300 $21.9420 $19.4690 $13.4146 No Bid $14.5160 No Bid

180 PHILIPS MRX: Q-CPR REPLACEMENT ADHESIVE PADS No Bid $ 9.33DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
181 THERAPY CABLE FOR MFP 11113-00004 No Bid $ 360.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 351.39 $365.0000 No Bid $520.0300 No Bid $415.9397 No Bid $ 332.12 No Bid
182 MULTI FUNCTION PADS, ADULT  11996-000091 $30.5000 $ 9.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16.49 $ 25.75 $27.5400 No Bid $34.1000 $ 17.25 No Bid $31.1600 No Bid
183 MULTI FUNCTION PADS, PEDI 11996-000093 $67.0800 $ 9.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16.49 $31.0000 $33.3300 $41.8700 $70.0700 $ 18.25 No Bid $37.2400 No Bid
184 NIBP CABLE STRAIGHT HOSE 21300-008147 $134.9800 $ 73.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 71.48UTI No Bid $ 80.19 $106.1400 $106.3700 $84.7108 No Bid $ 67.64 $123.8300

185
PHILIPS NBP, ADULT NON-DISPOSABLE: SIZE RANGE 25-
35CM $ 8.181DNMS $ 35.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 24.75 $15.1000 $9.028DNMS No Bid $14.4578 No Bid No Bid No Bid

186
PHILIPS NBP, INFANT NON-DISPOSABLE: SIZE RANGE 10-
19CM $ 178.39 $ 20.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.95 $ 25.11 $8.864DNMS No Bid $9.9024 No Bid No Bid No Bid

187
PHILIPS NBP, LARGE ADULT NON-DISPOSABLE: SIZE 
RANGE 33-47CM $ 9.229DNMS $ 35.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.5000 $ 25.11 $9.93DNMS No Bid $21.3414 No Bid No Bid No Bid

188
PHILIPS NBP, PEDI NON-DISPOSABLE: SIZE RANGE 18-
26CM No Bid $35.3100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.4000 $ 15.14 8.968DNMS No Bid $11.1927 No Bid No Bid No Bid

189
PHILIPS NBP, THIGH NON-DISPOSABLE: SIZE RANGE 46-
66CM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 33.48 10.62DNMS No Bid $27.3780 No Bid No Bid No Bid

190
PILLOW CASES, DISPOSABLE - PAPER COVERED PATIENT 
SIDE W/ FLUID RESISTANT BARRIER $ 0.22 $0.4300 No Bid $1.7500 No Bid $ 0.1959 $ 0.235 $0.2376 $0.2631 $0.3800 $0.5290 No Bid No Bid $0.3283

191
PILLOWS, DISPOSABLE:   21" X 27" HEAVY WEIGHT. 
(such as Medline NON2439322 or thicker) Send sample. No Bid $ 2.78 No Bid $11.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.8053DNMS $2.6567 No Bid $ 5.25 No Bid No Bid $4.6192

192 PROVIDINE IODINE PREP PADS $ 0.0075DNMS $ 0.03 No Bid $2.0000 No Bid $ 0.0372 $0.0400 $0.0359 $0.0417 $0.0380 $0.0365 No Bid No Bid $0.0511
193 QUANTUM ACR4 CHILD RESTRAINT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $688.5000 $655.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $748.7804 No Bid No Bid $ 292.20DNMS

194
QUIKCLOT COMBAT GAUZE: 3" X 4 YARD - "Z" fold 
packages $40.0200 $ 33.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 32.94 $31.5000 $38.6500 $42.4300 $74.6600 $36.1686 No Bid No Bid $58.6800

195
RAZOR, GALLANT PREPARATION:  CONTOURED HANDLE, 
Platium coated Stainless Steel Blade No Bid $0.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.35 $ 0.363 $0.4250 $0.6351 $ 0.4264 $0.3951 No Bid No Bid $0.9170

196
REGLAN (METOCLOPRAMIDE);   5MG/ML IN 2ML VIALS 
10mg in 2ml vial(VIALS ONLY) $ 1.5228 $ 1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.8200 No Bid $1.4012 $1.4488 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.5264

197 RESTRAINTS SOFT POSEY 2510 (NO SUB) $6.1400 $2.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.1500 $ 3.75 $ 2.93 $4.0700 $5.2100 $5.4800 No Bid No Bid $3.9000
198 RING CUTTER $29.5800 $ 5.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.93 $ 6.15 $29.1800 $11.7800 $35.7100 $4.8717 No Bid No Bid $13.5200
199 ROCHESTER CURVED FORCEPS 8.50" (2812-80994) $ 13.9132 $ 4.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.0676 $38.2900 $ 11.794 $6.5384 No Bid No Bid $20.4720

HX – History
DEL – Delivery
DNMS – Did Not Meet Specs
NBA – No Bid Accepted
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200
ROCURONIUM BROMIDE: 10MG/ML IN 10ML VIALS. 
REFRIGERATED. $ 10.925 $ 8.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.85 $12.4000 $8.6910 $10.1250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

201

SALEM SUMP TUBES, DOUBLE LUMEN, SIZES: 10fr, 12FR 
and  18FR. (w/o expiration date).  (Latex Free)     NOT 
LEVIN TUBE! No Bid $ 1.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.84 $1.8000 $2.0840 $8.8002 $ 2.078 $2.4400 No Bid No Bid No Bid

202
SCALPEL, RETRACTABLE SAFETY STYLE WITH #11 BLADE 
(DYNAREX #4161) $ 1.642 $ 0.84 No Bid $1.5000 No Bid $ 0.75 $ 0.777 $0.9490 $1.0020 $1.0500 $0.8974 No Bid No Bid $1.7980

203 SCOOP STRETCHER: FERNO MODEL 65 $901.7300 $ 348.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $546.5000 $540.0000 $717.2900 $705.7500 No Bid $ 643.39 No Bid No Bid $1,330.8000

204

SHARPS CONTAINER - 5 QUART, KENDALL SHARPS-A-
GOTOR, POINT OF USE: SHARPS CONTAINMENT SYSTEM 
(#4838) No Bid $ 4.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.49 No Bid $5.1100 $ 4.08DNMS $ 5.56DNMS 4.44HX/DEL No Bid No Bid $47.1800

205

SHARPS CONTAINER HIDDEN BRACKET W/ INDIVIDUAL 
KEY - TO FIT KENDALL, SHARPS-A-GATOR SYSTEM: 
(#4841-HK) No Bid $ 6.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5.84 $11.5000 No Bid $ 10.05DNMS $ 6.638DNMS $6.2073 No Bid No Bid $21.2300

206 SHARPS SHUTTLE,  FOR USE IN MED KIT. $6.9700 $ 1.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.44 $ 1.65 $4.2400 $4.6000 $6.8400 $ 1.36 No Bid No Bid $5.4400

207
SODIUM BICARB. 8.4 % 50 ML; (NEEDLELESS) W/ LUER 
LOCK PFS $ 7.37DNMS $16.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18.21 $28.6250 $17.3940 $11.3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

208
SOFT TIP SUCTION CATHETERS; SIZES 6FR, 8FR, 10, 12, 
14FR, 16 & 18FR. No Bid $ 0.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.25 $ 0.27 $ 0.294 $0.3874 $ 2.9149 $0.3333 No Bid No Bid No Bid

209

SPLINT, MULTI-PURPOSE EMERGENCY.WATERPROOF, 
MALLEABLE POLYVINYL/ALUMINUM CONSTRUCTION, 
WASHABLE, REUSEABLE, X-RAY TRANSLUCENT.  36" 
(ORIGINAL SAM SPLINT REQUIRED) No Bid $ 4.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7.11 $ 6.95 $9.8600 $16.0500 $21.4000 $8.7349 No Bid No Bid No Bid

210 SPLINT, PELVIC BINDER -  SAM PELVIC SLING II No Bid $ 65.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 59.17 $57.5000 $68.2400 No Bid $107.6400 $62.6506 No Bid No Bid $99.6800
211 SPLINTS 9", PADDED I.V. ARM BOARD No Bid $ 1.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.82 $ 0.47 $8.2900 $3.2300 $ 1.4037 $0.4146 No Bid No Bid $1.3205

212
SPONGE HEMOSTATIS XSTAT-12  (REVMEDX  RVMFIN-
0001-02) No Bid $ 61.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 35.61UTI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

213
STERILE WATER FOR IRRIGATION, not INJECTION:  250 
CC BOTTLES  BAXTER 2F7112  (NDC # 0338-0004-02) No Bid $ 2.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.42 $ 2.55 $3.1783 $6.9700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.0425

214 STETHOSCOPE DUAL HEAD, GENERIC No Bid $3.4400 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.23 $3.5000 $4.7300 $5.7700 $6.0600 $2.8048 No Bid No Bid $7.2400
STRETCHER REPLACEMENT STRAP FOR STRYKER 
POWER PRO; CHEST HARNESS STRAP w/ SHOULDER 
STRAPS. BOTH SIDES OF CHEST HARNESS STRAPS MUST 
BE ADJUSTABLE.          (BLACK).  CONSISTS OF THE 
ITEMS BELOW.

215 STRYKER 6500001401 $46.8600 $ 28.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.2800 No Bid $47.2700 No Bid No Bid $30.32KVT $ 69.17
216 STRYKER 6500001402 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.89KVT $ 57.96
217 STRYKER 6500001403 No Bid $ 48.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 40.28KVT $ 59.92

218

STRETCHER REPLACEMENT STRAP FOR STRYKER POWER 
PRO; TO SECURE WAIST AND FEET/LEGS.      2 PIECE, 
MINIMUM 80" EXTENDED LENGTH.            (BLACK) No Bid $ 8.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

219

STRETCHER SHEET W/ POLY BACKING FOR FLUID 
BARRIER; SNUGFIT, NON-WOVEN,  FITTED BOTTOM 
WITH ELASTIC CORNERS,  DISPOSABLE; 30" X 84"  (Like 
the Taylor E-Force or Curaplex XPS) No Bid $ 1.88 No Bid $2.2500 No Bid $2.6100 $ 1.58 $1.9700 $2.0000 $2.8100 $ 1.957 $ 1.66HX/DEL No Bid $2.4240

220
STRETCHER SHEET, FLAT TOP W/ POLY BACKING FOR 
FLUID BARRIER; DISPOSABLE:     APPROX. 40" X 90" . No Bid $ 0.48 No Bid $50.0000 No Bid $2.4400 $ 0.41 $2.0572 $0.4868 $0.9214 $ 0.495 No Bid No Bid $0.6248

221
STRETCHER, FLEXABLE: GRAHAM MEDICAL MEGA-
MOVER  MINIMUM 800 LB. WEIGHT CAPACITY No Bid $ 13.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.62 $16.0000 $28.5950 $19.0050 $20.1470 $16.0256 $ 12.99DNMS No Bid $31.0960

222
STRYKER: POWER PRO BASE STORAGE NET (P/N 6500-
001-126) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 221.45 No Bid No Bid $ 59.95 No Bid $ 183.16 No Bid

223
SUCTION CONTAINERS; DISPOSABLE 1200 CC CANISTERS  
W/ 6" DIAMETER                                 (BEMIS SYSTEM II) $4.6639 $ 2.01DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.32 $3.1000 2.129DNMS $5.8700 $14.3530 $ 5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

224
SUCTION TIP, Hi-D Ducanto  by SSCOR  200-00002C  (NO 
SUB)  (NON LATEX) No Bid $ 1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.97 $ 1.95 No Bid $3.3100 $4.1230 $2.0487 No Bid No Bid $5.5900

225

SUCTION TUBING 9/32" ID tubing X 6' W/ MOLDED 
FEMALE CONNECTORS & MALE CONNECTOR   (NON 
LATEX)                    DYNAREX 4693 (NO SUB) No Bid $ 1.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.7470 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 15.86UTI

226
SUCTION, BATTERY POWERED:  S-SCORT III MODEL 
74000, W/ TWO- POSITION REGULATOR (RED COLOR) No Bid $ 598.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 574.55 $540.0000 No Bid $ 901.46 $1,097.4200 $ 43.9756DNMS No Bid No Bid $1,051.2000

227
SUCTION, REPLACEMENT BATTERY FOR S-SCORT III 
[rectangular (80638) battery] No Bid $ 58.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 57.57 $54.0000 No Bid $91.2300 $120.3200 $59.7560 No Bid No Bid $106.4300

228
SUCTION, REPLACEMENT CHARGER (110VAC TO 12VDC) 
FOR S-SCORT III (#80533) No Bid $ 65.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 65.36 $85.0000 No Bid $ 103.21 $136.1200 $ 70.5128DNMS No Bid No Bid $120.4200
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229
SYRINGE, 1 CC - LUER LOCK TIP without needle, 
packaged 5 to a strip, 100 to a box $ 0.1085DNMS $0.4100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1300 $0.0800 $ 0.1099DNMS $0.3500 $0.4480 $0.1465 No Bid No Bid $0.1727

230
SYRINGE, 10 CC - LUER LOCK without needle; packaged 5 
to a strip & 100 to a box. $ 0.1034 $0.1300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1000 $0.1200 $ 0.1511 $0.3000 $5.7408 $0.1084 No Bid No Bid $0.1761

231
SYRINGE, 20 CC - LUER LOCK TIP, without needle; 
packaged (MINIMUM) 40 to a box. $0.3880 $0.2900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.16 $ 0.18 $0.3930 $0.3600 $0.4550 $0.2048 No Bid No Bid $0.2697

232
SYRINGE, 3 CC - LUER LOCK without needle, packaged 5 
to a strip, 100 to a box. $ 0.1307 $ 0.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0600 $ 0.0673 $ 0.0874 $0.1400 $0.0880 $0.0819 No Bid No Bid $0.0928

233 SYRINGE, 60 CC - CATHETER TIP without needle. $ 0.099DNMS $1.1100 No Bid $0.7500 No Bid $ 0.45 $ 0.55 $0.4995 $0.7000 $0.5810 $0.6351 No Bid No Bid $2.3800

234 TAPE 1" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH (NOT PAPER TAPE) $2.2241 $ 0.62 No Bid $2.0000 No Bid $0.6900 $0.7500 $1.5692 $0.6608 $1.1519 $0.7319 No Bid No Bid $1.9954

235 TAPE 2" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH (NOT PAPER TAPE) $4.4000 $ 1.39 No Bid $2.0000 No Bid $ 1.37 $1.5000 $1.7700 $1.2883 $2.3050 $1.4397 No Bid No Bid $3.9908
236 Tape, Coban 1" $1.2977 $ 0.33 No Bid $1.1000 No Bid $ 0.26 No Bid $0.8000 $0.9800 $1.4340 $0.4283 No Bid No Bid $0.7160
237 Tape, Coban 2" $2.3717 $ 0.62 No Bid $2.2500 No Bid $ 0.65 $ 0.59 $1.4556 $1.0600 $2.3920 $0.5958 No Bid No Bid $1.2378
238 TETRACAINE 0.5%. 2ML BOTTLES $ 193.4912DNMS $ 89.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 35.54DNMS $ 176.74 $ 136.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

239
THERMOMETER WELCH ALLYN SURE TEMP PLUS 690 
W/ WALL MOUNT AND ORAL PROBES No Bid $283.6000 No Bid $ 5,000.0 No Bid $ 282.41 $255.0000 217.DNMS $623.0500 $350.5800 $376.2317 No Bid No Bid $ 257.34

240
THERMOMETER PROBE COVERS FOR SURE TEMP PLUS 
690 $0.0413 $0.0400 No Bid $0.0440 No Bid $ 0.0362 $ 0.035 0.03436DNMS $0.0965 $0.6430 $0.0449 No Bid No Bid $0.5916

241
THERMOMETER WALL MOUNTS ONLY FOR SURE TEMP 
690 No Bid $ 38.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.82 $36.6000 $ 34.6DNMS $81.9900 $45.1500 $50.6666 No Bid No Bid No Bid

242
THERMOMETER, TEMPORAL ARTERY: EXERGEN TAT-
2000C  (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

243 Thermovent HME Device (70-580011EA) $ 1.9958 $3.3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.2100 No Bid $ 1.5876 $1.3324 $2.3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.2416
244 TINCTURE OF BENZOIN;  SWAB AMPULES No Bid $1.2400 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.254 No Bid 0.2306DNMS $0.3198 No Bid $0.4522 No Bid No Bid $0.3263

245

TOURNIQUET, IV:  NON-LATEX, POWDER FREE (PRE-
PACKAGED IN BUNDLES OF 50 PREFERRED) - SEND 
SAMPLE No Bid $ 0.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.083 No Bid $0.1462 $0.0926 No Bid $ 0.1178 No Bid No Bid $0.1920

246 TOURNIQUET, TRAUMA (C.A.T. ONLY)   BLACK No Bid $ 23.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 21.49 $ 20.65 $25.3300 $24.9900 $33.3600 $ 21.85 No Bid No Bid $31.2000

247
TRACTION SPLINT, KENDRICK STYLE: 
ADJUSTABLE/FOLDABLE $ 204.6 $141.6100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 112.54 $ 65.15 $ 76.49 $ 97.78DNMS $154.4800 $ 78.85 No Bid No Bid $143.0200

248
TRANSEXAMIC ACID TXA 100MG/ML (VIAL ONLY) NO 
AMPULE ACCEPTED $ 20.847 $11.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.25 No Bid $9.4760 $30.0290 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

249 TRAUMA BAG NAVY (CURAPLEX 020555R) No Bid $ 168.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 63.09DNMS $ 90.76DNMS $ 78.00DNMS $ 69.95DNMS No Bid No Bid $ 64.58DNMS

250
TRIANGULAR BANDAGES, MUSLIN CLOTH 54" X 27" (W / 
O   SAFETY PINS) (PRE-PACKAGED IN BUNDLES OF 12) No Bid $ 0.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.25 No Bid $0.5633 $0.5892 $1.1200 $0.3116 No Bid No Bid No Bid

251
TYLENOL (ACETAMINOPHEN) 500 MG TABLETS. 
LOOKING FOR 12 TO 24 COUNT BOTTLES.

252

TYLENOL (ACETAMINOPHEN) SUSPENSION LIQUID, 160 
MG /5ML: CHILDREN'S DOSAGE. LOOKING FOR 2 oz. 
(60cc) BOTTLES

253
VENI-GARD (BRAND) ADULT 3" X 2.5" IV SITE SECURING 
DEVICE No Bid $ 0.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.3666 $ 0.3665 $1.4163 $1.0400 $0.8290 $0.3614 No Bid No Bid 0.1193DNMS

254

VERSED (MIDAZOLAM - BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 
10MG/2ML CONCENTRATION  IN 2 ML. VIALS     SINGLE 
DOSE UNITS. No Bid $ 1.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.73 No Bid 0.824DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

255 VETBOND SKIN ADHESIVE (TWM3M1469) No Bid $ 20.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.0783 $ 30.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 38.38

256
ZOFRAN (ONDANSETRON) 4MG ORAL DISOLVING 
TABLETS - SINGLE DOSE UNITS   30/BOX $0.3500 $ 0.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0740 $ 0.1996 0.058DNMS $11.0400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4833

257
ZOFRAN (ONDANSETRON) 4MG/2ML VIALS - SINGLE 
DOSE UNITS $ 0.7284 $1.4100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.406 $ 1.26 $13.3800 $0.8252 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.4956

258
DICK MEDICAL BIOTHANE G1 CROSS HARNESS FEMALE 
STRAP BLACK 51173XBKF No Bid $ 40.95KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.72UTI No Bid No Bid $113.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

259
DICK MEDICAL BIOTHANE G1 CROSS HARNESS MALE 
STRAP BLACK 51173XBKM No Bid $ 40.95KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.72UTI No Bid No Bid $30.2400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

260
DICK MEDICAL BIOTHANE G1 CROSS HARNESS 
SHOULDER STRAP BLACK 51174XBKS No Bid 30.8KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 26.39UTI No Bid No Bid $26.3900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

261 DICK MEDICAL BIOTHANE G1 WAIST/LEG STRAP BLACK No Bid 18.6KVT No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18.00UTI No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.3900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
262 SWAT T TOURNIQUETS No Bid $ 8.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.63 $9.2000 $11.5900 No Bid $18.5200 $11.1445 No Bid No Bid $39.5900
263 BACTERIAL/VIRAL FILTER MEDTRONIC 351U5979 $ 5.2048 $3.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.92 $ 0.95DNMS $3.2700 3.05DNMS $3.3000 $ 1.8307DNMS No Bid No Bid $6.5100
264 NEEDLE VISE 1-PORT   1860-00103 No Bid $ 0.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.87
265 ULTRASOUND GEL 0101 AQUASONIC 100,  20G
266 SAPPHIRE MULTI THERAPY INFUSION PUMPS
267 RAINBOW DCIP PEDI REUSABLESENSOR LifePak $2,753.8900 $ 180.00DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 617.97 No Bid $ 450.63DNMS $893.7500 $ 723.88 $ 23.7951DNMS No Bid $ 573.04 $954.1200

268
CARRY CASE TOP POUCH FOR USE W/LIFEPAK 
12/LIFEPAK 15-LifePak No Bid $ 53.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 52.53 No Bid $359.3600 No Bid $ 121.49 $ 26.6506DNMS No Bid $49.4000 $414.2200

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED
NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

NO BID ACCEPTED

HX – History
DEL – Delivery
DNMS – Did Not Meet Specs
NBA – No Bid Accepted
KVT - Keep Vendor Together
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269 LIFEPAK 15 CARRY CASE BACK POUCH-LifePak $135.3300 $76.9000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 74.92 No Bid $ 62.80DNMS No Bid $146.6800 $ 89.5975DNMS No Bid $ 70.68 No Bid

270

LIFEPAK 15 BASIC CARRY CASE W/RIGHT & LEFT 
POUCHES, SHOULDER STRAP (11577-000001) INCLUDED 
AT NO ADDITIONAL CHARGEWHEN CASE ORDERED 
WITH A LIFEPAK 15 DEVICE-LifePak $586.9800 $ 297.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 290.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 74.14DNMS $347.7927 No Bid $ 274.36 No Bid

271
TEMP SENSOR, SKIN PROBE, HIGH DIELECTRIC, 
DISPOSABLE-LifePak $ 10.6405 $ 6.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.8500 No Bid No Bid $5.9280 No Bid

272 LP15 REDI-CHARGE ADAPTER TRAY-LifePak $2,593.0600 $215.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 187.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 267.11 No Bid No Bid $ 177.08 No Bid

273
REDI-CHARGE BASE (POWER CORD NOT INCLUDED)-
LifePak No Bid $ 1,466.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,382.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,385.15 No Bid No Bid $ 1,304.92 No Bid

274 CODE-STAT 11 DATA REVIEW SEAT LICENSE-LifePak No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,510.05 No Bid
275 LP 15 LITHIUM-ION BATTERY-LifePak $ 595.95 $ 436.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 425.46 No Bid $ 477.26 No Bid $766.4200 $567.0732 No Bid $ 402.04 No Bid
276 M-LNCS DB1 SOFT SENSOR-LifePak $ 462.46 $ 177.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2446DNMS No Bid $530.7600 $180.7228 No Bid $ 272.08 No Bid

277
CUFF KIT W/WELCH ALLYN SMALL ADULT, LARGE 
ADULT, THIGH CUFF-LifePak $58.1000 $25.7400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 175.26 $241.0400 $371.9700 $33.5542 No Bid No Bid No Bid

278
REUSE-07-2MQ INFANT CUFF 2-TUBE TWIST LOCK-
LifePak No Bid $19.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.85 $ 17.25 $ 11.27DNMS No Bid $35.0900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

279
REUSE-08-2MQ SMALL CHILD CUFF 2-TUBE TWIST LOCK-
LifePak No Bid $19.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.85 $ 17.25 $ 11.58DNMS No Bid $35.0900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

280 CHILD CUFF 2-TUBE TWIST LOCK-LifePak No Bid $ 21.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 36.31 $23.7951 No Bid No Bid No Bid
281 SIX HOUR RECHARGEABLE SMART BATTERY-LifePak $596.0000 $520.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 536.84 No Bid $791.4634 No Bid No Bid No Bid
282 LAERDAL  RED SLEEVE FOR CPR METER 2 No Bid $37.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 35.73 No Bid No Bid $ 56.09 $ 68.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
283 LAERDAL RUGGED CARRY CASE FOR CPR METER 2 No Bid $ 65.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 70.51 No Bid No Bid $ 102.68 $ 148.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

284
MERCURY MEDICAL BVM SMART BAG WITH PEEP AND 
FILTER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.0000 $ 42.71 No Bid $35.0617 $ 30.07 $ 24.8674DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid

285 MECURY MEDICAL CHILD CUSHION MASK FOR BVM $ 6.9805 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.22 $4.5000 $ 3.808DNMS $ 67.46 $ 64.76 $6.6855 No Bid No Bid No Bid

286
BREATHING CIRCUIT J-CIRCUIT W/WATER TRAP PEDI 
15MM FOR HT70 PLUS No Bid $ 11.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10.65KVT No Bid No Bid $13.8190 $ 12.05 $9.3975 No Bid No Bid No Bid

287
BREATHING CIRCUIT J-CIRCUIT W/O WATER TRAP 
22MM FOR HT70 PLUS No Bid $10.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9.67KVT $9.5500 No Bid No Bid $ 11.18 $19.5265 No Bid No Bid No Bid

288
FLOW SENSOR SEN3420A ADULT/PEDI FOR USE WITH 
NEWPORT HT70 PLUS No Bid $ 43.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 240.21 $ 185.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

289 PROXY INLINE FILTER SPHT6004701 $ 25.12 $ 11.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.9420 $16.3460 $ 21.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
290 AP416-01 MICROBORE INFUSION SET $10.4396 $ 9.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.340466DNMS $16.2563 $ 10.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
291 AP433-01 INFUSION SET
292 COMMUNICATION CABLE $ 92.91 $79.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 73.9DNMS $ 110.44 $ 93.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
293 USB TO 4 PORT RS232 ADAPTER $218.5000 $ 185.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 173.81DNMS $259.1600 $ 220.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO BID ACCEPTED

HX – History
DEL – Delivery
DNMS – Did Not Meet Specs
NBA – No Bid Accepted
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