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2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black,Gray or Dark Blue with Black or Gray interior #1  SO#1 Replacement PPV SB1858 1 $42,590.00 $62,400.00 - $66,112.00 $62,400.00
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black, Gray or Dark Blue with Black or Gray interior #2  SO#2 Replacement PPV SB1873 1 $42,590.00 $62,400.00 - $66,112.00 $62,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black interior #3  SO#3 Replacement PPV SB1651 1 $42,590.00 $71,300.00 - $75,012.00 $71,300.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV Black with Black Interior #4  SO#4 Replacement PPV SB1733 1 $42,590.00 $71,300.00 - $75,012.00 $71,300.00
2021-2023 Single Axle Enclosed Cargo Trailer 2990 GVWR #5  SO#5 Replacement SF0427 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Not bid.
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #6  SO#6 Replacement PPV SB1723 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #7  SO#7 Replacement PPV SB1724 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #8  SO#8 Replacement PPV SB1729 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #9  SO#9 Replacement PPV SB1736 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #10  SO#10 Replacement PPV SB1741 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #11 SO#11 Replacement PPV SB1746 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #12  SO#12 Replacement PPV SB1857 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #13 SO#13 Replacement PPV SB1866 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #14 SO#14 Replacement PPV SB1869 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2021-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4WD Black with Black Interior #15 SO#15 Replacement PPV SB1976 1 $42,590.00 $68,400.00 - $72,112.00 $68,400.00
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4x4 Black with Black Interior #16 SO#16 New PPV 1 $42,590.00 $69,615.00 - $73,327.00 No award   
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4x4 Black with Black Interior #17 SO#17 New PPV 1 $42,590.00 $69,615.00 - $73,327.00 No award   
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4x4 Black with Black Interior #18 SO#18 New PPV 1 $42,590.00 $69,615.00 - $73,327.00 No award   
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4x4 Black with Black Interior #19 SO#19 New PPV 1 $42,590.00 $69,615.00 - $73,327.00 No award   
2022-2023 Ford F150 Crew Cab 4x4 Black or White with Gray Interior #20 SO#20 New Crime Scene Specialist 1 $42,838.00 - - Confirm black. $42,838.00
2021-2023 Ford F250 4x4 Crew Cab Longbed with towing package Black with Gray Interior #21 SO#21 New Livestock Deputy 1 $52,860.00 - - No award   
2022-2023 Ford F150 Crew Cab Short Bed #22 COR#1 Replacement SB0612 1 - $53,371.00 - No award.   MOT transferred a vehicle for this unit.
2022-2023 Chevrolet Tahoe C91 2WD Rear WD PPV Black with Black Interior #23 CON#1-1 Replacement PPV 1B1354 1 $41,842.00 $61,302.00 - $65,762.00 Less $1,300 for graphics.  Confirm no prisoner cage. $61,302.00
2023 Chevrolet Tahoe 9C1 RWD PPV Black with Black Interior #24 CON#3-1 Replacement PPV 3B1543 1 $41,842.00 $66,142.00 - $70,602.00 $66,142.00
2023 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV Black with Black Interior #25 CON#4-1 Replacement PPV 4B1402 1 $41,842.00 $72,637.00 - $77,097.00 $72,637.00
2023 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV Black with Black Interior #26 CON#4-2 New Deputy Constable 1 $41,842.00 $72,637.00 - $77,097.00 $72,637.00
2023 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV Black with Black Interior #27 CON#4-3 New Deputy Constable 1 $41,842.00 $72,637.00 - $77,097.00 No award   
2023 Ford F250 White with Gray Interior #28 FAC#1 New PT Maintenance Tech 1 $55,665.00 $63,253.00 - $55,665.00
2023 Ford Explorer or Equivalent Chevy Model White with Gray Interior #29 FAC#2 New Contracts Coordinator 1 $33,570.00 - - $33,570.00
2023 or newer Ford F250 4x4 Crew Cab White with Gray Interior #30 R&B#1 Replacement UB1462 1 $49,890.00 $54,723.00 - $49,890.00
2023 or newer Ford F250 4x2 Regular Cab with Liftgate White with Gray Interior #31 R&B#2 Replacement UB1549 1 $46,040.00 $52,701.00 - $46,040.00
2023 or newer Ford F250 4x2 Regular Cab with Liftgate White with Gray Interior #32 R&B#3 Replacement UB1552 1 $46,040.00 $52,701.00 - $46,040.00
2023 or newer Ford F250 4x2 Regular Cab White with Gray Interior #33 R&B#4 Replacement UB1548 1 $42,040.00 $49,201.00 - $42,040.00
2023 or newer Ford F250 4x2 Regular Cab White with Gray Interior #34 R&B#5 Replacement UB1550 1 $42,040.00 $49,201.00 - $42,040.00
2023 or newer Ford F150 4x4 Extended Cab White with Gray Interior #35 R&B#6 New Foreman 1 $44,609.00 $42,963.00 - $44,609.00
2023 or newer Ford F150 4x4 Extended Cab White with Gray Interior #36 R&B#7 New Inspector III 1 $44,609.00 $42,963.00 - No award
2023 or newer Ford F150 4x4 Extended Cab White with Gray Interior #37 R&B#8 New Operator IV 1 $44,609.00 $42,963.00 - $44,609.00
2022-2023 Ford F150 Crew Cab 4x4 (W1E) White with Gray Interior #38 WCF#1 New 1 $52,913.00 - - $52,913.00

$1,724,372.00

= LOWEST AND BEST
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