221FB153 Bulk Fuel

) Atlantic Aleol Colonial Oil Mansfield Oil  Petroleum Pinnacle Seratoga

Delivery/Fuel Type X Rack Sun Coast
Petroleum Petroleum Industries Company  Traders Corp  Petroleum ;
Marketing
Tank Wagon
Unleaded 0.2036 0.2250 0.2775 0.3994 0.2500 0.2244(No Bid 0.0975
Diesel 0.2538 0.2250 0.2775 0.3994 0.2500 0.2361(No Bid 0.0975
Total: 0.4574 0.4500 0.5550 0.7988 0.5000 0.4605|No Bid 0.195
Transport Truck
Unleaded 0.2574 0.1290 0.0752 0.0073 -0.0383 -0.0031 0.0009( 0.0652
Diesel 0.2673 0.1290 0.1161 -0.02290 -0.0174 -0.0097 -0.0102| 0.0652
Total: 0.5247 0.2580 0.1913 -0.0156 -0.0557 -0.0128 -0.0093| 0.1304
Generator Refueling

Markup 0.2298 0.975 1.25 0.4018 0.27|No Bid 1.25
Cost Per Stop 475 195 3.42 0 3.7658 100|No Bid 250
Demurrage Per Hr 125 65 75 100|No Bid 95
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