
Ergon Asphalt 
& Emulsions, 

Inc

Martin 
Asphalt 

Company

Wright 
Asphalt 

Products Co 
LLC

1 HFRS-2 5,000 GAL 2.58$                           No Bid  No Bid  No Bid HFRS-2

2 HFRS-2P 150,000 GAL 2.78$                           No Bid  No Bid  No Bid HFRS-2P

3 CRS-2 5,000 GAL 2.58$                           $                          2.97 2.64$                          3.29$                          CRS-2 *P2-CWE-2

4 CRS-2P 5,000 GAL 2.78$                           $                          3.17 3.04$                           No Bid CRS-2P

5 CHFRS-2 15,000 GAL No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                          3.29 CHFRS-2 *P2-CWE-2

6 CHFRS-2P 550,000 GAL 2.78$                           $                          3.17 3.04$                          No Bid CHFRS-2P

7 SS-1 60,000 GAL 2.58$                           $                          2.97  No Bid  No Bid SS-1

8 CSS-1H 10,000 GAL 2.58$                           $                          2.97 2.64$                          2.96$                          CSS-1H *P2 STABILIZER

9 AEP 60,000 GAL 3.48$                           No Bid  No Bid 2.24$                          
AEP *PRIME 
CONCENTRATE

*Substitutions will not be allowed for Bid.

Unit Pricing ITEM

P Squared Emusion Plants LLC

Unit Pricing DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY

UNIT Unit Pricing 

BID TABULATION
23IFB20 ASPHALT EMULSIONS
WILLIAMSON COUNTY- TEXAS
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