NATIONAL BUSINESS

FURNITURE

Ship-To Address michelle.lemke@wilco.org

Quote # QA500516 (v2)

National Business Furniture, LLC

770 South 70th Street

phone (800) 558-1010 x fax: (800) 329-9349

Bill-To Address

michelle.lemke@wilco.org

Milwaukee, WI 53214

MICHELLE LEMKE

WILLIAMSON COUNTY COURT

405 MARTIN LUTHER KNG ST STE 135
GEORGETOWN, TX 78626

Cat: 77-ED4
Cust#: BT6904

(512)943-3674 Source: 0S0021

ltem # Qty| Description Options Lead Catalog Discounq Total
Time Price Price Merch
14064 3 |Pedestal L-Desk Linen White/Gray Patterned Top 6-7 Wks| $2,599.000 $2,419.65 $7,258.95
30887 3 [ateral File Linen White/Gray Patterned Top 6-7 Wks $779.00 $710.60 $2,131.80
32110 2 Bottom Door Bookcase inen White/Gray Patterned Inside  [6-7 Wks| $1,189.000 $1,083.95 $2,167.90
32966 1 [72" Five Shelf Bookcase Black 4-6 Wks $969.00 $920.5 $920.55
Important Information:
DELIVERY LEVEL - INSIDE DELIVERY, INSTALLATION AND DEBRIS REMOVAL
Customer: Your local sales associate is Cam Loveberry
Pricing is based on items and quantities quoted. Any changes will affect quoted price.
Price reflects quoted discount, valid for 30 days from 4/11/2023, with the exception of dated sales and
promos.
Sales Tax will be included only for shipments into locations where we are registered to collect sales tax. Customer may be hable for self Merchandise $13,481.00)
-assessmentif shipmentis into a location where we are not registered to collect lax. If you feel any taxes are charged in error, please make sure S - :
we have received the proper exemption documentation Al documentation will be reviewed Lo ensure it meets stale & local requirements prior Total DISCF)Uﬂt 1’001 .80
toremoving any taxes Merchandise Subtotal 12,479.20
Shipping 2,271.00
Installation 1,500.00
Tax temporarily shown as zero. If order is placed without a valid tax exempt Subtotal 16,250.20
certificate, applicable tax will be added to the order o o ~ _|Total Tax 0.00
| Customer PO#: |Quoted By: CAMLOVEBERRY _Ext: _ On: 04/11/23 | Page1 [Order Total $16,250.20

Quotations & Drawings property of National Business Furniture - ATL. Copyright 2023.
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Continued on next page...
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NATIONAL BUSINESS Quote #QAS00516 .
National Business Furniture, LLC
F U R N lT U R E 770 South 70th Street Milwaukee, Wl 53214
phone (800) 558-1010 x fax: (800) 329-9349
Ship-To Address michelle.lemke@wilco. org Bill-To Address  michelle.lemke@uwilco.org
MICHELLE LEMKE
WILLIAMSON COUNTY COURT
405 MARTIN LUTHER KNG ST STE 135
GEORGETOWN, TX 78626
(512)943-3674 Source: 0S0021
Cat: 77-ED4
Cust#: BT6904
Item # Qty| Description Options Lead Catalol Discount Total
Time Price Price Merch
Merchandise $13,481.00
Total Discount 1,001.80
Merchandise Subtotal 12,479.20
Shipping 2,271.00
Installation 1,500.00
Tax temporarily shown as zero. If order is placed without a valid tax exempt Subtotal 16,250.20
certificate, applicable tax will be added to the order. Total Tax 0.00
Customer PO#: [Quoted By: CAMLOVEBERRY _ Ext: _ On: 04/11/23 | Page2 |Order Total $16,250.20

Quotations & Drawings property of National Business Furniture - ATL. Copynght 2023



Ashlie Holladay

From: Michelle Lemke

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 8:20 AM

To: Ashlie Holladay; Kimberly Johnson
Cc: Sharee Allison

Subject: RE: Quote for Podium

Hello Ashlie,
There is a $50 delivery/install charge.

785-72-50101-9 Podium with Custom Seal $462.00 |

Installation Outside C.0.G $50.00 ;
425-18-81108-0 vheet-Gasters Four (4) $30.00

%

This will give you an idea of cos
Thank you, —
Michelle M. Lemke, CSR, TCRR, RPR, CRR, CRC
Court Reporter

Williamson County Court at Law #5
405 Martin Luther King

Georgetown, TX 78626

512-943-3674

michelie lemke@wilco,org

From: Ashlie Holladay <ashlie.holladay@wilco.org>

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 8:17 AM

To: Kimberly Johnson <kimberly.johnson@wilco.org>; Michelle Lemke <michelle.lemke @wilco.org>
Cc: Sharee Allison <slallison@wilco.org>

Subject: RE: Quote for Podium

Is this amount below the total including delivery and install? $4927?

710 AMaimm St Saite 101
Geargetown TX 75626 _
Office 212843 1551 A

William=on County. Texas G

From: Kimberly Johnson <kimberly. johnson@wilco.org>

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 7:46 AM

To: Ashlie Holladay <ashlie.holladay@wilco,org>; Michelle Lemke <michelle.lemke@wilco.org>
Cc: Sharee Allison <slatlison@wilco.org>

Subject: RE: Quote for Podium

Good morning, Ashlie.

We need to order it as soon as possible. Could we get it into this year’s round instead of waiting for the next budget year?



