
Item Description Container Container Units
Estimated Annual 

Container Quantity

Container 

Unit Price

Container 

Unit Price

Container 

Unit Price

Container 

Unit Price

Selective

1.01 ELEMENT 3A JUG 2.5 GAL 20 105.00$         135.88$         92.40$           97.00$           103.13$         Triclopyr 3

1.02 VASTLAN JUG 2.5 GAL 200 255.00$         235.00$         255.00$         255.00$         190.63$         Boulder 6.3 Triclopyr

1.03 VASTLAN DRUM 15 GAL 33 1,530.00$      No Bid 1,530.00$      1,530.00$      1,143.78$      Boulder 6.3 Triclopyr

1.04 OPENSIGHT PACKAGE 1.25 LBS 400 125.00$         118.75$         125.00$         125.00$         No Bid

1.05 ESPLANADE 200 SC JUG 2.5 GAL 40 3,772.80$      3,772.80$      3,772.80$      3,772.80$      1,968.40$      
Units 1 Gal / Qty 100        

Specticle Flo (Agency)

1.06 OUTRIDER CASE* 1 CASE 2 2,848.50$      3,402.20$      2,500.00$      2,980.00$      3,500.00$      Cryder Sulfosulfuron

1.07 METHOD 240 SL JUG 2.5 GAL 30 892.80$         892.80$         892.80$         892.80$         No Bid

Non-Selective

2.01 ARSENAL JUG 2.5 GAL 500 199.25$         223.43$         140.00$         137.00$         162.50$         Ecomazapyr 2 SL

2.02 ARSENAL DRUM 15 GAL 75 1,106.25$      No Bid 750.00$         795.00$         975.00$         Ecomazapyr 2 SL

2.03 FORFEIT 280 JUG 2.5 GAL 106 82.50$           No Bid 76.25$           75.00$           78.13$           Interline Glufosinate

2.04 FORFEIT 280 TOTE 265 GAL 1 8,745.00$      No Bid 7,950.00$      7,155.00$      8,125.00$      Interline Glufosinate

Miscellaneous

3.01 LIBERATE SURFACTANT JUG 2.5 GAL 20 120.00$         130.00$         83.75$           46.80$           25.00$           Surf-Ac 820

3.03 DEFOAMER JUG 1 GAL 30 49.00$           21.09$           25.00$           36.00$           17.81$           No Foam B

*Assume 20oz Container, 10x20oz Container per Case
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