25IFB29 - Signs and Markers Bid Tab - All Vendors

Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
TMUTCD SIGNS - REGULATORY i Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
1.01 24" Stop/Slow Paddles and 6' Wooden Staff EACH $44.20 $45.00 No Bid $79.94
1.02 24" Stop/Slow Paddles EACH $27.20 $30.54 No Bid $54.94
1.03 7' PVC (Sch 80, 1.25" Dia) EACH $102.00 $14.02 No Bid no bid
1.04 24" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH $21.68 $22.56 $24.00 $24.68
1.05 30" Octagon (H.L.P.) EACH $32.52 $30.49 $37.50 $36.16
1.06 36" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH $46.61 $42.58 $59.75 $72.56
1.07 48" Octagon (H.I.P.) EACH $85.37 $72.77 $199.00 $129.00
1.08 30" Triangle (H.1.P.) EACH $16.94 $18.17 $21.90 $27.26
1.09 36" Triangle (H.L.P.) EACH $24.39 $23.58 $37.75 $29.86
1.10 12"x 6" (H.I.P.) EACH $2.71 $7.84 $3.75 $4.03
1.11 12"x 9" (H.I.P.) EACH $4.07 $8.83 $5.50 $6.05
1.12 15"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.94 $18.17 $37.50 $25.19
1.13 18"x 6" (H.I.P.) EACH $4.07 $8.82 $27.85 $6.05
1.14 18"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH 48.13 $11.79 $11.15 $12.09
1.15 18"x 18" (H..P.) EACH $12.20 $16.06 $16.75 $18.14
1.16 18"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.70 $22.30 $24.18
1.17 21"x 15" (H.I.P.) EACH $11.82 $14.50 $22.30 $17.63
1.18 24"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $21.68 $22.93 $29.75 $32.24
1.19 24"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $27.10 $25.56 $37.15 $40.30
1.20 24"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $32.52 $29.48 $44.55 $48.36
1.21 24"x 42" (H.1.P.) EACH $37.94 $103.65 $62.90 $56.42
1.22 24"x 48" (H.1.P.) EACH $43.36 $42.58 $59.50 $64.48
1.23 30"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $20.33 $20.63 $27.85 $30.23
1.24 30"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $27.10 $25.56 $37.15 $40.30
1.25 30"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $33.88 $30.49 $46.45 $50.38
1.26 30"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $40.65 $35.39 $55.75 $60.45
1.27 30"x 42" (H.I.P.) EACH $47.43 $40.29 $78.50 $70.53
1.28 36"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.36 $17.67 $22.30 $24.18
1.29 36"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $24.39 $23.57 $33.50 $36.27
1.30 36"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $32.52 $29.48 $44.55 $48.36
1.31 36"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $48.78 $41.29 $66.85 $72.54
1.32 48"x 9" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.26 $32.28 $22.30 $24.18
1.33 48"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $43.36 $37.31 $59.50 $64.48
1.34 48"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $54.20 $45.19 $74.25 $80.60
1.35 60"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $67.75 $59.41 $92.90 $100.75
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
TMUTCD SIGNS - WARNING K . Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
2.01 30" Circle (H.I.P.) EACH $35.33 $34.02 $46.45 $50.38
2.02 36" Circle (H.I.P.) EACH $49.85 $44.83 $66.85 $72.54
2.03 12"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $8.13 $12.08 $11.15 $12.09
2.04 18"x 18" (H.L.P.) EACH $12.20 $14.76 $16.75 $18.14
2.05 18"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.69 $22.30 $24.18
2.06 24"x 12" (H.1.P.) EACH $10.84 $13.74 $14.90 $16.12




2.07 24"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $21.68 $21.64 $29.75 $32.24
2.08 24"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $27.10 $25.56 $37.15 $40.30
2.09 30"x 15" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.94 $18.17 $37.50 $25.19
2.10 30"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $33.88 $30.49 $46.46 $50.38
2.11 30"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $40.65 $35.39 $55.75 $60.45
2.12 36"x 12" (H.I.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.67 $22.30 $24.18
2.13 36"x 18" (H.I.P.) EACH $24.39 $23.58 $33.50 $36.27
2.14 36"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $32.52 $29.48 $44.45 $48.36
2.15 36"x 36" (H.I.P.) EACH $48.78 $41.29 $66.85 $72.54
2.16 36"x 48" (H.I.P.) EACH $65.04 $54.34 $89.00 $96.72
2.17 48"x 24" (H.I.P.) EACH $43.36 $37.32 $59.50 $64.48
2.18 48"x 48" (H.I.P.) EACH $86.72 $70.69 $145.00 $128.96
2.19 48"x 60" (H.1.P.) EACH $108.40 $132.07 $220.00 $161.20
2.20 60"x 30" (H.I.P.) EACH $67.75 $59.41 $92.90 $100.75
2.21 66"x 12" (H.1.P.) EACH $29.81 $41.53 $61.00 $44.33
2.22 84"x 24" (H.1.P.) EACH $75.88 $84.15 $154.00 $112.84
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
TMUTCD SIGNS - SCHOOL ) Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
3.01 30" Pentagon (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $41.82 $36.87 $56.00 $59.75
3.02 36" Pentagon (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $59.93 $54.69 $81.00 $86.04
3.03 24"x 8" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $8.68 $12.97 $12.00 $12.75
3.04 24"x 10" (H.1.P. - White) EACH $9.03 $12.43 $15.00 $13.43
3.05 24"x 12" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $13.02 $15.61 $18.00 $19.12
3.06 24"x 48" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green and H.I.P. - White)* EACH $52.08 $53.14 $69.50 $76.48
3.07 30"x 30" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $40.69 $61.90 $56.00 $59.75
3.08 36"x 12" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $19.53 $21.79 $27.00 $28.68
3.09 36"x 36" (D.G. - Florescent Yellow/Green) EACH $58.59 $54.96 $81.00 $86.04
*per TMUTCD S5-1
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
BRACKET/POST AND HARDWARE K . Traffic
Associates Signs B Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4.01 23/8" Post Bracket EACH No Bid $5.57 $2.25 $3.81
4.02 3" Post Bracket EACH No Bid $7.93 $6.95 $15.63
4.03 2 3/8" Back to Back Post Brackets EACH No Bid $0.00 $3.25 $4.74
4.04 Wedge Steel System Anchor (socket and wedge) EACH No Bid $0.00 $28.50 $15.64
4.05 Wedge Steel System Anchor (wedge only) EACH No Bid $0.00 $450 $2.11
4.06 Triangular Slipbase System (complete assembly with tri-base ground stub) EACH No Bid $0.00 $145.00 $128.36
4.07 Triangular Slipbase System (anchor, collar, fasteners — excluding ground stub anchor) EACH No Bid $0.00 $65.00 $67.11
4.08 TXDOT 2 3/8" U-Clamp assembly EACH No Bid $0.00 $5.90 $17.50
4.09 TXDOT 2 7/8" U-Clamp assembly EACH No Bid $0.00 $6.95 $17.50
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
STREET SIGNS BLANKS AND HARDWARE ) ) Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
5.01 6"x 18" Flat (H.I.P. - White) EACH $5.10 $10.20 $7.90 $8.16
5.02 6"x 24" Flat (H.LP. - White) EACH $6.80 $11.50 $10.75 $10.88




5.03 6"x 30" Flat (H.L.P. - White) EACH $8.50 $12.79 $13.40 $13.60
5.04 6"x 36" Flat (H.I.P. - White) EACH $10.20 $14.09 $16.00 $16.32
5.05 9" 24" Flat (H.L.P. - White) EACH $10.20 $14.11 $16.00 $16.32
5.06 9"x 30" Flat (H.I.P. - White) EACH $12.75 $16.06 $20.15 $20.40
5.07 9"x 36" Flat (H.L.P. - White) EACH $15.30 $17.99 $24.10 $24.48
5.08 12"x 24" Flat (H.LP. - White) EACH $13.60 $15.71 $21.50 $21.76
5.09 12"x 24" Flat (H.I.P. - Yellow) EACH $13.60 $15.66 $21.50 $21.76
5.10 Cap Round - 2 3/8" x 5 1/2" Flat Blade Holder EACH No Bid $6.32 $5.25 $5.00
5.11 Cap Round - 2 3/8" x 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH No Bid $16.32 $9.75 $11.19
5.12 Cap Round - 3" x 5 1/2" Flat Blade Holder EACH No Bid $7.93 $9.50 $7.50
5.13 Cap Round - 3" x 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH No Bid $13.41 $15.75 $13.75
5.14 90° Tee - 5 1/2" Flat Blade EACH No Bid $2.73 $5.25 $5.00
5.15 90° Tee - 12" Flat Blade Holder EACH No Bid $5.57 $9.75 $11.19
5.16 6" x 24" Flat (H.1.P.-Vellow) EACH No Bid $10.49 $10.75 $10.88
5.17 12" Adjustable Cross Piece Flat EACH No Bid $7.62 $24.50 $23.75
5.18 Flared Leg Strapping Bracket EACH No Bid $26.34 $2.50 $1.88
5.19 Snap Lock Assembly 1/2"'x.025"x47" EACH No Bid $0.00 $5.50 $4.38
5.20 Strap it Banding EACH No Bid $41.11 $59.00 $60.00
5.21 Buckles for Strap it Banding EACH No Bid $20.90 $45.00 $0.45
5.22 5.5" Adjustable Cross Piece Flat EACH No Bid $4.93 $17.50 $12.50
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
POSTS . ) Traffic
Associates Signs B Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6.01 10'x 2 3/8" 0.D. Round Post EACH No Bid $27.44 $33.75 $15.81
6.02 12'x 2 3/8" 0.D. Round Post EACH No Bid $46.22 $39.75 $23.44
6.03 6' Green U-Channel Post EACH No Bid $12.18 $10.50 $9.40
6.04 6' Galvanized U-Channel Post EACH No Bid $15.50 $12.50 $14.89
6.05 12' Green U-Channel Post EACH No Bid $23.83 $44.00 $21.74
6.06 12'x 2-7/8" 0.D. 10 BWG Post complete assembly with Pins EACH No Bid $0.00 $125.00 $187.73
6.07 11' x 1-3/4" Perforated Square Metal Tubing EACH No Bid $43.73 $42.50 $26.58
10’ Steel T-leg Assembly* — Single complete assembly with 36” x 36” FL DG Coroplast sign, 5’ x 2" .
6.08 square leg base, and two 3’ base ends (feet) 1 3/4” square with 5/16” holes. EACH No Bid $0.00 $215.00 no bid
6.09 4’ x 13/4” square T-leg with 5’ x 2” square base* EACH No Bid $0.00 $60.00 no bid
6.10 3’ x 13/4" Perforated Square Metal Tubing - Base End (Foot)* with pins EACH No Bid $0.00 $30.00 no bid
6.11 5’ x 2" Perforated Square Metal Tubing - Single Leg Base* with stub out and pins EACH No Bid $0.00 $120.00 no bid
*see assembly for single leg base (skid mounted) on lower left corner of sheet BC (5)-21
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
ROLL GOODS . Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
$1,092.00
7.01 7"x 50 Yards - Barricade Tape (H.l.P.) Red / White EACH (Minimum Order $0.00 $199.00 $165.74
600 sq ft)
7.02 7"x 50 Yards - Barricade Tape (H.l.P.) Orange / White EACH $176.32 $0.00 $199.00 $165.74
7.03 30" x 50 Yards - Reflective Sheeting (E.G.) EACH $401.25 $371.25 $480.00 $348.53
7.04 30" x 50 Yards - Reflective Sheeting (H.l.P.) EACH $427.50 $472.50 $625.00 $485.29
7.05 30" x 50 Yards - Reflective Sheeting (D.G.) EACH $821.25 $813.75 $1,690.00 $970.59
7.06 30" x 50 Yards - Non Reflective Sheeting (Black Vinyl) EACH $393.75 $348.75 $189.00 $397.06
7.07 30" x 50 Yards - Non Reflective Sheeting (Orange Vinyl) EACH $401.25 $348.75 $189.00 $397.06
7.08 30" x 50 Yards - E.C. Film EACH $393.75 $303.75 $575.00 $445.59




7.09 48" x 50 Yards - Reflective Sheeting (E.G.) EACH $642.00 $594.00 $795.00 $557.65
7.10 48" x 50 Yards - Reflective Sheeting (H.I.P.) EACH $684.00 $756.00 $990.00 $776.47
7.11 48" x 50 Yards - Non Reflective Sheeting (Black Vinyl) EACH $642.00 $558.00 $299.00 $635.29
7.12 48" x 50 Yards - Non Reflective Sheeting (Orange Vinyl) EACH $642.00 $558.00 $299.00 $635.29
7.13 48" x 50 Yards - E.C. Film EACH $630.00 $486.00 $899.00 $712.94
7.14 6" x 100 Yards - Clear Application Tape EACH $42.25 $59.26 $65.00 $39.85
7.15 12" x 100 Yards - Clear Applicaton Tape EACH $78.00 $118.50 $129.00 $53.17
7.16 24" x 100 Yards - Clear Applicaton Tape EACH $156.00 $237.00 $259.00 $147.21
7.17 30" x 100 Yards - Clear Applicaton Tape EACH $195.00 $296.26 $325.00 $183.93
7.18 9" x 100 Yards Clear Application Tape EACH $f85.;'5//1$06§;2)5 $88.88 $110.00 $64.39
BARRICADE MATERIAL Osburn Newman PaTtrZ:;;:rk Centerline
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
8.01 1"x 8"x 8' Barricade Rail (plank) EACH No Bid $103.67 $17.50 $31.45
8.02 Type | 24" Barricade with Sheeting EACH No Bid $60.56 $75.00 $64.95
8.03 Type Il 24" Barricade with Sheeting EACH No Bid $60.56 $89.00 $75.30
8.04 Type lll 4' Barricade with Sheeting EACH No Bid $187.00 $195.00 $182.94
8.05 Type Il 8' Barricade with Sheeting EACH No Bid $241.00 $225.00 $192.59
8.06 Barricade base/skid (5’- 2” square steel tubing with 6” stub out) EACH No Bid $64.27 $37.50 $19.80
8.07 13/4” x 13/4” x 5’ X-tube barricade stiffener with standard holes EACH No Bid $64.27 $13.75 $19.21
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
FLEXIBLE ROLL UP SIGNS K X Traffic
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
9.01 36" Non Reflective Sign EACH No Bid $0.00 $55.00 $36.86
9.02 36" Reflective Sign EACH No Bid $0.00 $89.00 $72.50
9.03 48" Non Reflective Sign EACH No Bid $0.00 $95.00 $70.88
9.04 48" Reflective Sign EACH No Bid $0.00 $125.00 $97.50
9.05 Rubber Sign Stand (min. 38 Ibs) EACH No Bid $92.22 $105.00 $101.83
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
DELINEATOR AND OBJECT MARKERS K ) Traffic
Associates Signs B Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10.01 62" Soil Mounted Flexible Guide Post w/ Soil Anchor w/ 3" x 12" Yellow H.I.P. Sheeting EACH No Bid $0.00 $29.50 no bid
10.02 28" Cones w/ Reflective Bands - 9.5 Ibs. min EACH No Bid $17.22 $26.90 27.07
10.03 36"- 42" Drums w/ Reflective Bands with Tire Ring Base EACH No Bid $0.00 $43.50 $62.45
10.04 Barrier reflector - GF-1 EACH No Bid $0.00 $2.95 $2.39
10.05 Barrier reflector - GF-2 EACH No Bid $0.00 $9.75 $3.31
10.06 Barrier reflector - CTB EACH No Bid $0.00 $2.25 $2.98
10.07 Temporary Flexible-Reflective Roadway Marker Tabs EACH No Bid $0.00 $0.55 $0.47
10.08 Reflector 6" x 12" (Size 3) EACH No Bid $11.56 $4.90 $3.79
10.09 12" x 36” Object Marker - OM -3L (H.I.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.67 $22.30 $22.77
10.10 12” x 36” Object Marker - OM -3R (H.I.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.67 $22.30 $22.77
10.11 12" x 36” Object Marker - OM -3C (H.1.P.) EACH $16.26 $17.67 $25.00 $22.77
10.12 18” x 18” Object Marker - OM -4 (H.L.P.) EACH $12.20 $21.32 $39.50 $26.01
10.13 36" (yellow or white) Flexible Delineator Post with 2-3" HI Wraps with base EACH No Bid $0.00 $25.00 $34.15
10.14 36" (yellow or white) Flexible Delineator Post with 2-3" HI Wraps EACH No Bid $0.00 $17.50 $31.65




10.15 48" (yellow or white) Flexible Delineator Post with 2-3" HI Wraps with base EACH No Bid $0.00 $29.00 $36.40
10.16 48" (yellow or white) Flexible Delineator Post with 2-3" HI Wraps EACH No Bid $0.00 $21.50 $33.95
10.17 600cc Epoxy Cartridge EACH No Bid $0.00 $35.00 $25.40
10.18 Adhesive 795A EACH No Bid $0.00 $12.50 $10.58
10.19 8" x 20' Butyl Roll EACH No Bid $0.00 No Bid no bid
10.20 8" x 8" Butyl Pads EACH No Bid $0.00 $4.95 $4.18
10.21 Modular Lane Separator Curb System EACH No Bid $0.00 $109.00 no bid
10.22 Reflector 6" x 24" - OM2-2V EACH No Bid $0.00 $8.90 $7.59
Pathmark .
CWZTCDL SUBSTRATES FOR SIGNS BLANKS FOR SHORT-TERM/SHORT DURATION Osburn | Newman | = g, | Centerline
Associates Signs Equipment Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
11.01 24" x 30" 10 MM Coroplast w/ Sheeting and Boarder (various colors) EACH $25.00 $0.00 $27.50 $28.15
11.02 36” x 36” 10 MM Coroplast w/ Sheeting and Boarder (various colors) EACH $45.00 $0.00 $54.00 $50.67
11.03 48" x 96" 10 MM Coroplast w/ Sheeting and Boarder (various colors) EACH $160.00 $0.00 $176.00 $180.16
11.04 60" x 30" 10 MM Coroplast w/ Sheeting and Boarder (various colors) EACH $62.50 $0.00 $68.75 $70.38
11.05 18" x 48" 10MM Coroplast w/Sheeting and Border (various colors) EACH $30.00 $0.00 $33.00 $33.78
11.06 9" x 24" 10 MM Coroplast w/ Sheeting and Border (various colors) EACH $7.50 $0.00 $8.25 $8.45
11.07 18" x 24" 10 MM Coroplast w/Sheeting and Border (various colors) EACH $15.00 $0.00 $16.50 $16.89
11.08 18" x 18" 10 MM Coroplast w/Sheeting and Border (various colors) EACH $11.25 $0.00 $12.50 $12.67
Osburn Newman Pathmark Centerline
MISCELLANEOUS K ) Traffic
Associates Signs B Supply
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
12.01 Temporary Rumble Strips, Yellow EACH No Bid $0.00 $2,450.00 no bid
12.02 Water Ballasted Barrier (Jersey Barrier) 32" min. height (orange) EACH No Bid $0.00 $499.00 $360.00
12.03 Water Ballasted Barrier (Jersey Barrier) 32" min. height (white) EACH No Bid $0.00 $499.00 $360.00
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