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CLAIM FOR ACTUAL MOVING EXPENSES
VR, 2ok _Print or Type All Information T e 31 E e et L DA =
1. Name ol Claimant(s) Parcel No: 15 County: Williamson
Edgar Castro. Project: Bagdad Road / CR 279

[] Residence  [] Business [ ] Farm [ ] Nonprofit [] Sign B4 Other. Electric Panel Relocated to Remainder
2. Address of Property Acquired by State: 3. Address Moved To:
1630 CR 279 Remainder
Liberty Hill, Texas 78664

Claimant’s Telephone No.: -

4. Occupancy of Property Acquired by State: 5. Distance Moved: 10 yards Miles
From (Date): To (Date of Move): 7. Mover’s Name and Address:
07-26-2025 Oscar Carreon
X Owner/Occupant [] Tenant

6. Controlling Dates Mo. Day Yr.

a. First Offer in Negotiation 9. Amount of Claim:

B Dots Property Acquired a. Moving Expenses $13.380.00

¢. Date Required to Move 10 24 2024 b. Reestablishment Expenses | S
8. Property Storage (attach explanation) )

From (Date): To (Date of Move): N/A c.  Searching Expenses $
Place Stored (Name and Address): d.  Tangible Property Loss $

N/A

e. Storage $

10. Temporary Lodging (attach explanation) f. __Temporary Lodging
From (Date): To (Date of Move): N/A g. Total Amount $13,380.00

11. All amounts shown in Block 9 were necessary and reasonable and are supported by attached receipts. Payment of this claim is requested. 1 certify that |
have not submitted any other claim for, or received reimbursement for, an item of expense in this claim, and that [ will not accept reimbursement or
compensation from any other source for any item of expense paid pursuant to this claim. [ further certify that all property was moved and installed at the
address shown in Block 3, ubo;g_ig,msqlancc with the invoices submitted and agreed terms of the move and that all information submitted herewith or

included herein is true and cofrect.
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f Claim:
Date of Claim 8/5/2025
Claimant
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[ certify that I have examined this claim and substantiating documentati and correct and to conform with the

Amount of $ 13,380.00 =
R-3 -Q025
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Date Williamson County Judge




RIGHT OF WAY OF TEXAS, LLC

3411 SAM BAss ROAD, ROUND Rock TEXAS 7868 1
(0) (512) 372.6220

August 5, 2025

TO: Lisa Dworaczyk, Sheets and Crossfield
FROM: Danny Jackson, Right of Way of Texas

SUBJECT: Approval Electric Box Move Claim, Edgar Castro

Williamson County
Bagdad Road
Parcel 15

Edgar Castro

Forms included with this submission include:

Claim for payment of Electric move expense
W-9 Edgar Castro

Paid invoice

Estimate from Oscar Carreon

Approval memo for electric box move payment
Pictures of electric box

Picture of electric box moved

Pictures of replacement electric box

REMARKS

This move is for the moving of the electric box from the acquired dwelling to the remainder
property.

We have verified that the electric box has been moved and therefore recommend payment.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please do not hesitate to call me at
512-922-5930.






Danny Jackson

e ———
From: Danny Jackson j(»
Sent: Thursday, July 3, 2025 11:25 AM = Castro
To: Lisa Dworaczyk Léﬁ Gl
Cc: Sam Nassour; Alison Davis
' . -,733
Subject: RE: Bagdad Road Parcel 15 Electrical Move Sl 790-L

Lisa, hi

Great, | will get with Edgar to get the electric removed as quickly as possible that way the building can be
removed. | will keep you updated.

Thanks,
Danny

Danny Jackson SR/WA, R/W-RAC, R/W-NAC, RIW-URAC
Project Manager

Right of Way of Texas, LLC.

Cell 512-922-5930

danny.jackson@rowtx.com

3411 Sam Bass Road

Round Rock, Texas 78681

From: Lisa Dworaczyk <lisad@scrrlaw.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 3, 2025 11:17 AM

To: Danny Jackson <danny.jackson@rowtx.com>

Cc: Sam Nassour <sam.nassour@rowtx.com>; Alison Davis <alison@scrrlaw.com>
Subject: RE: Bagdad Road Parcel 15 Electrical Move

Danny
The county will approve the estimated cost to relocate the utilities.

Lisa Dwomazg/e
512-738-8731

From: Danny Jackson <danny.jackson@rowtx.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 26, 2025 10:38 AM

To: Lisa Dworaczyk <lisad @scrrlaw.com>

Cc: Sam Nassour <sam.nassour@rowtx.com>; Alison Davis <alison@scrrlaw.com>
Subject: Bagdad Road Parcel 15 Electrical Move

Lisa, hi




“Attached is the electrical relocation estimate that | received from Edgar Castro, parcel 15 on Bagdad Road. This
estimate is to move the electrical from the existing house to allow for the demolition of the house and to reconnect
the electrical to his business and also to connect to the RV’s that are on the remainder and are being occupied by
the displacee’s of the house. I've also attached pictures for your reference.

The reinstallation of the electrical was not included as part of the cost to cure for the business. The electric to the
business goes through this meter on the house. The RVs were moved on the remainder when the displacee’s
moved from the house, there was no previous service to the RV’s this estimate adds this service.

This is not really an eligible relocation expense, but if approved | will submit it as a direct reimbursement to the
parcel owner Edgar Castro.

Please review and let me know if this expense can be reimbursed by Williamson County. If so | will contact Mr.
Castro and have him complete the electrical disconnect.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to call me.

Thanks,
Danny

Danny Jackson SR/IWA, R'W-RAC, R/W-NAC, R/'W-URAC
Project Manager

Right of Way of Texas, LLC.

Cell 512-922-5930

danny.jackson@rowtx.com

3411 Sam Bass Road

Round Rock, Texas 78681
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‘ PROJECT PROPOSAL

June 11,2025

SCOPE OF WORK

« Removal of the existing service conduit and wiring.

e Removal of meter box and main service panel.

e Disconnection of wiring within existing main panel.
Exposure of underground Schedule 40 PVC conduits.
Excavation as needing to reroute underground conduits to new service pole.
Installation of an in-ground pull boxto reconnect office wiring Lo new service.
Installation of new wiring for RVs, water well and office building:
Reinstallation of service conduit, new meter box and main disconnect panel.

« Termination of both service and load-side wiring.

COST ESTIMATE

The proposed total cost for the work listed is $13,380. This amount includes all necessary
equipment rentals, materials and labor provided by a licensed Jourmeyman Electrician and

apprentice-

The proposed work will include Pedernales Electric disconnecting the service power.
Removal of sémace wires from service meter and main panel board.
Removal of service riser conduitand A\'ﬁiéath@:lf head.
Removal of meter box:
B FE=A

Disconnect and removal of wiring fro;?[n:\@in panel and preaker.
i ok /

Rernoval of main panel and sub panel.

. PR | frfies :
Underground schedule 40 PVC conduit\ {be expose
conduits to new service pole- 2 s

Total Cost:

4,




Bagdad Road
Parcel 15 Edgar Castro
Utility Pictures 5-29-25

EX|st|ng utlllty meter attached to house
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New meter box attached to pole on remainder
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Electric to tenants on remainder
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ATT Telephone service
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Electric and Telephone service to business on remainder




Bagdad Road
Parcel 15 Edgar Castro
Vacancy Pictures 8-4-2025







Bagdad Road

Parcel 15 Edgar Castro

Replacement Pictures 8-4-2025






