
WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION 
ANNUAL BID 

CULVERTS-PRECAST BOX FOR UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM 
BID NUMBER:  09WCA057 

 
   Recommend Award To: Hanson Pipe & Precast (only bidder)

DESCRIPTION  Hanson 
ITEM # 

WIDTH HEIGHT UNIT UNIT PRICE 

1 3 1 LF $  No Bid 
2 3 1.5 LF $  No Bid 
3 3 2 LF $  90.39 
4 3 3 LF $ 104.76 
5 4 1 LF $  No Bid 
6 4 2 LF $ 117.07 
7 4 3 LF $ 131.22 
8 4 4 LF $ 138.35 
9 5 1 LF $  No Bid 

10 5 2 LF $ 141.94 
11 5 3 LF $ 156.09 
12 5 4 LF $ 189.73 
13 5 5 LF $ 207.46 
14 6 1 LF $  No Bid 
15 6 2 LF $ 191.42 
16 6 3 LF $ 207.06 
17 6 4 LF $ 222.71 
18 6 5 LF $ 241.70 
19 6 6 LF $ 260.85 
20 7 1 LF $ No Bid 
21 7 2 LF $ 217.29 
22 7 3 LF $ 241.70 
23 7 4 LF $ 266.07 
24 7 5 LF $ 292.26 
25 7 6 LF $ 311.39 
26 7 7 LF $ 333.89 
27 8 1 LF $  No Bid 
28 8 2 LF $ 259.10 
29 8 3 LF $ 283.49 
30 8 4 LF $ 307.90 
31 8 5 LF $ 332.29 
32 8 6 LF $ 349.53 
33 8 7 LF $ 361.66 
34 8 8 LF $ 389.42 
35 9 1 LF $  No Bid 
36 9 2 LF $  No Bid 
37 9 3 LF $ 332.01 
38 9 4 LF $ 354.65 
39 9 5 LF $ 377.30 
40 9 6 LF $ 399.95 
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41 9 7 LF $ 422.62 
42 9 8 LF $ 450.35 
43 10 1 LF $ No Bid 
44 10 2 LF $ No Bid 
45 10 3 LF $ 361.58 
46 10 4 LF $ 403.58 
47 10 5 LF $ 427.85 
48 10 6 LF $ 452.11 
49 10 7 LF $ 474.74 
50 10 8 LF $ 499.01 


