WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT AND

CIVILIAN PERSONNEL

BID NUMBER: 09WCAO035

RECOMMEND AWARD TO: Items 1, 2, 3, 9, 12, 13, 16, 17 - GT Distributors
Iltems 4,5, 6, 7, 8,10, 11, 14, 15 & Cilivian Uniforms - Miller Uniforms

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MILLER UNIFORMS GT DISTRIBUTORS

1 Polo Shirt
Sz. Sml - XXLrg 19.00 19.90
Sz. XXXLrg 21.50 21.90
Altered from Stock Sz 37.00 26.00
Brand Port Authority Port Authority

2 BDU Shirt & Trouser
Sml 26.50 23.74
Sml - Lrg 26.50 23.74
X - Large 26.50 23.74
XX - Large 29.50 26.74
XXX - Large 30.30 28.74
XXXX - Large 31.90 29.74
Special Cuts 53.00 46.00
Brand Propper Propper

3 Tactical Dress Shirts
Short Sleeve
Sml- X Lrg 26.50 22.74
XX - Large 29.50 24.74
XXX - Large 30.30 27.74
Special Cuts 53.00 46.00
Brand Propper Propper
Long Sleeve
Sml- X Lrg 28.70 24.74
XX - Large 31.90 26.74
XXX - Large 33.00 28.74
Special Cuts 57.40 46.00
Brand Propper Propper

4 Pants #8650
Men's
28 - 42 48.95 38.57
44 - 50 53.85 41.83
52 - 54 58.74 45.09
54 & up 63.64 48.35
Brand Blauer Elbeco
Ladies'
4-18 48.95 38.57
20 48.95 41.83
22 & 24 53.85 45.09
26 58.74 48.35
Brand Blauer Elbeco

5 Pants #8680
Men's
28 - 42 71.95 55.94
44 - 50 79.15 60.94
52 - 54 86.34 65.93
54 & up 93.54 70.92
Brand Blauer Elbeco




Ladies'

4-18 71.95 55.94
20 71.95 60.94
22 & 24 79.15 65.93
26 86.34 70.92
Brand Blauer Elbeco

6 Shirts Uniform
Short Sleeve
Sml - X Lrg 49.65 36.08
XX - Large 54.62 42.89
XXX - Large 59.58 42.89
XXXX - Large 65.55 49.71
Over XXXX-Large 74.47 53.12
Brand Blauer Elbeco
Ladies'
Sml - Lrg 49.65 36.08
X - Large and XX - Large 54.62 42.89
Brand Blauer Elbeco

7 Shirts Uniform
Long Sleeve
14 1/2-17 1/2 56.95 39.69
18 & 18 1/2 62.65 47.24
19 68.34 47.24
20 74.04 54,78
Over 20 85.42 58.54
Brand Blauer Elbeco
Ladies'
Sml - Lrg 56.95 39.69
X-Lrg - XX-Lrg 62.65 42.89
Brand Blauer Elbeco

8 Pullover Enforcement Shrt
Sml - X Lrg 49.50(No Bid
XX - Large 54.08|No Bid
XXX - Large 59.40{No Bid
Brand Blauer

9 Stretch Patrol Short
28 - 42 54.34 38.19
44 & up 65.21 42.09
Brand Mocean Mocean

10 Raincoat
Sml - X Lrg 103.00 74.90
XX - Large 113.00 74.90
XXX - Large 123.60 82.90
Over XXX-Large 133.90 82.90
Brand Blauer Neese

11 Jacket
XSml - XLrg 159.50 106.16
XX - Large 175.45 106.16
XXX - Large 191.40 106.16
Over XXX - Lrg 207.35 127.39
Brand Blauer Spiewak

12 Ties
Ladies' 3.95 2.71
Regular 3.95 2.71
Long 4.25 2.99
X - Long 4.50 3.38
Brand S. Broome S. Broome

13 Military Name Strips 3.50 2.95




Brand Propper Propper
14 Gore Tex Jacket
Sml - X Lrg 225.00 245.49
XX - Large 247.50 245.49
XXX - Large 270.00 245.49
Over XXX - Lrg 292.00 294.74
Brand Blauer Spiewak
15 Crosstech Jacket
Sml - X Lrg 262.50 189.27
XX - Large 288.75 189.27
XXX - Large 315.00 189.27
Over XXX - Lrg 341.25 236.19
Brand Blauer Spiewak
16 Tactical Pants - 5.11
Men's
28 through 44 39.00 28.49
46 through 50 49.00 33.49
52 & 54 49.00 33.49
56 & up N/A N/A
Brand 5.11 Tactical 5.11 Tactical
Ladies'
4 through 16 39.00 28.49
20 N/A N/A
21& 24 N/A N/A
26 N/A N/A
Brand 5.11 Tactical 5.11 Tactical
17 Professional Polo
Sml - X Lrg 37.50 28.74
XX - Large 37.50 28.74
XXX - Large 41.50 30.74
Over XXX - Lrg 41.50|N/A
Brand 5.11 Tactical 5.11 Tactical
Civilian Personnel
1 Shirts - Style 1020-01
Men's Short Sleeve
14 -17 1/2 19.45|No Bid
18-211/2 21.45|No Bid
Special Cuts 38.90|No Bid
Brand Edwards
Ladies' Short Sleeve
4t0 20 19.45(No Bid
to 28 21.45|No Bid
Special Cuts 38.90|No Bid
Brand Edwards
Men's Long Sleeve
14 -17 1/2 20.45|No Bid
18-211/2 22.45|No Bid
Special Cuts 40.95(No Bid
Brand Edwards
Ladies' Long Sleeve
4t0 20 20.45|No Bid
to 28 22.45|No Bid
Special Cuts 40.90(No Bid
Brand Edwards
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