

WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
CULVERTS – PRECAST BOX FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY
UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM

BID NUMBER: 09WCA057

NAME OF BIDDER: HANSON PIPE & PRECAST

Mailing Address: 801 AIRPORT BLVD

City: AUSTIN State: TX Zip: 78702

Email Address: Matt.Daniel@hanson.com

Telephone: (512) 385-3950 Fax: (512) 385-1725

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION		UNIT	UNIT PRICE
	WIDTH	HEIGHT		
1	3	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
2	3	1.5	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
3	3	2	Linear Foot	\$ 90.39
4	3	3	Linear Foot	\$ 104.76
5	4	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
6	4	2	Linear Foot	\$ 117.07
7	4	3	Linear Foot	\$ 131.22
8	4	4	Linear Foot	\$ 138.35
9	5	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
10	5	2	Linear Foot	\$ 141.94
11	5	3	Linear Foot	\$ 154.09
12	5	4	Linear Foot	\$ 189.73
13	5	5	Linear Foot	\$ 207.46
14	6	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
15	6	2	Linear Foot	\$ 191.42
16	6	3	Linear Foot	\$ 207.06
17	6	4	Linear Foot	\$ 222.71
18	6	5	Linear Foot	\$ 241.70
19	6	6	Linear Foot	\$ 260.85
20	7	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
21	7	2	Linear Foot	\$ 217.29
22	7	3	Linear Foot	\$ 241.70
23	7	4	Linear Foot	\$ 266.07
24	7	5	Linear Foot	\$ 292.24
25	7	6	Linear Foot	\$ 311.39
26	7	7	Linear Foot	\$ 333.89
27	8	1	Linear Foot	\$ No Bid
28	8	2	Linear Foot	\$ 259.10
29	8	3	Linear Foot	\$ 283.49
30	8	4	Linear Foot	\$ 307.90

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION		UNIT	UNIT PRICE
	WIDTH	HEIGHT		
31	8	5	Linear Foot	\$ 332.29
32	8	6	Linear Foot	\$ 349.53
33	8	7	Linear Foot	\$ 361.66
34	8	8	Linear Foot	\$ 389.42
35	9	1	Linear Foot	\$ No B.I.D
36	9	2	Linear Foot	\$ No B.I.D
37	9	3	Linear Foot	\$ 332.01
38	9	4	Linear Foot	\$ 354.65
39	9	5	Linear Foot	\$ 377.30
40	9	6	Linear Foot	\$ 399.95
41	9	7	Linear Foot	\$ 422.62
42	9	8	Linear Foot	\$ 450.35
43	10	1	Linear Foot	\$ No B.I.D
44	10	2	Linear Foot	\$ No B.I.D
45	10	3	Linear Foot	\$ 361.58
46	10	4	Linear Foot	\$ 403.58
47	10	5	Linear Foot	\$ 427.85
48	10	6	Linear Foot	\$ 452.11
49	10	7	Linear Foot	\$ 474.74
50	10	8	Linear Foot	\$ 499.01
TOTAL				\$

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

- ☐ low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
- ☐ "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:

- The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.
- The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause; pg3, paragraph 9 and agrees to follow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s).

Signature of Person Authorized to Sign BID: [Signature] Date of BID: 8/5/08

Printed Name and Title of Signer: Matt Daniel Area Sales Mgr

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID