WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION
PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER

BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ059

Butler Med Vet TW Medical
Qry (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UCM EST.) [UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Group 1 - Medications/Wormer

Acepromazine Injectable 50cc 10 mg/mi {50 mi botile U862 $25.56 12.45 37.35

Albon 5%{473ml N/A 585,00 22000

Antisedan N/A ~139.00 Y 834.00

Amoxicillin suspension 5mi bt N/A 3.20 76.80

Atropine Injectable SA 100cc 1120 100mil 3,82 & $3.82

Artificial Tears ointment 3.5gm tube 1.68 $20.16 | 1448 35.76 1.60 38.40

Bupivicaine .5% 50 mi bottle] 238 | $4.76 2,99 5.98 2.55 5.10

Buprenarphine carjet , LL 0.3 mg/ml |10 per box 30.39 $364.68 2858 345.00

Calcium Gluconate Injectable 100 ml bottle T i $2.90 3.65 365

Chlarpheniramine Tab 4mg $13.20 4.00 16.00

Cipro (ciprofloxacin) 500mg 100 tablets $35.46 6.66 39.96 6.40 38.40

Panacure 7000m $463.056 | 125.00 | 625.00 | 9765 | 488.25

Pyrantel Pamoate gallon i $58.50 .19.00. 19.00

Depomedrol 20mg 10ml 16.07. | $64.28 22 .25 89.00 36.00 | 144.00

Dexamethasone 2 mg/ml  |100 m! bottle .3.52_ $7.04 499 9.98

Diazepam 5mg/ml {10 mlvial 11.25 $168.75 27.50 412.50 G122 183.00
§Diphenhydramine (Benadryl) 50mg/ml  {10m} 21.59 $21.59 g2 50.00 28.50 114.00

Domiter {(metetomidine) inj 10ml 139:00.:F 1,112.00

Dopram {respiram) 20mg 20ml 368.06 59.99 119.98 48.25 96.50

Doxycycline 100mg, 500tabs 100 mg  |500 tablets $21.02 24,00 24.00 23.40 23.40

Epinephrine 11000 30 m! bottle $2.05 5.99 5.09 5.00 5.00

Flea Preventative Oral - Preferred Capstar or eq 57160 tablets $2,400.00 | 205.00 3,5? 5.00

Furosemide 50 mg/ml  }100 ml bottle $10.27 8,00 8.00

Isofiuorane 250 ml bottle $493.00 26.00 650.00 22.00 550,00

lvermectin oral 10 mg/ml |200 mt bottle $9.94

Ketamine 10 ml $724.50 7.40 | 1,110.00] 5.45 817.50

Ketaprophen 50mg/ml  [100ml $74.26 128.00 128.00

Lidacaine 2% Injectable 100 ml $4.10 0.7(50ml) 0.65 1.30

Marcaine (sea Bupivicaine) 4,10 410




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER
BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ59

Butler Med Vet TW Medical

fMetacam Injectable 100 ml 266,000 $66.00 §6.00 66.00
Ivetoclopramide Injectable 5mg/ml 30 mi =516 ) $5.186 5.65 565 |
{Metronidazole 250 mg  }500 tablets . 14.48 $14.48 15.95 15,95 15,25 15.25
IMetronidazote 500 mg 500 tablets 20,25 $29.25 368.00 36.00 32.65 32.65
Procaine Penicillin G 250 mi botlle 026 | 52/7.80 | 10.95 | 328.50 9.85 29550
Rimadyl or generic 25 mg 180 chews 89.95 $B89.95 89.85 89.85
Rimady! or generic 75 mg 180 chews 1416050 $111.60 132.50 132.50 111.60 111.80
fRimadyl or generic 100 mg 180 chews 136.60 $136.60 162.25 162.25 |:136.60 136.60
BPrazigquantei Injectable 50 ml bottle 20040 $200.40 245,00 245,00
Povidine iodine solution gallon 20:890 ] $10.89 19.09 19.99 12.50 12.50
Panolog ointment 240 mi 41895 $41.89 54.60 54 60 49.00 49.00
Prednisone 5mg 100tab 10.23 $61.38 1.99 11.94 188} 11.28
Propylene glycol USP 98%|gallon 1827 $32.54 16.50 33.00
Heparin (on Manufacturer B/O no ETA) 1,000 uts/m| [30 ml bottle Not Avail Not Avail Not Avail
Cephalexin 500/500 ct i 27-2-7- $163.62 45 00 270.00 40.00 240.00
Cephalexin 250/500 ct 28,41 $170.46 32.50 195.00 29.00 174.00
Clavamox Suspension 14 mi btl 9.50 $142.50 {891 133.85 9.50 142 .50
Clavamox tab 62.5mg 2161005 $488.00 68.00 544 .00 61.00 488.00
Clavamox tab 250mg 186.00 | $1,488.00 207.81 1,662.48 186.00 1488.00
Clavamox Tab 375mg 375 mg tabs £1266.00:] $6,384.001 29500 | 7,080.00 | 268.C0 | 6384.00
Cough Tabs 1000t 53.09 | $323.94 4450 | 267.00
Lactated Ringers/Dextrose 500ml bag x1.6000)  4.80
Lactated Ringers 500 mi bag 1.89 597 = 1.50- = 4.50
Epinephrine _ 30m| i 205 | $2.05 5.99 5.99 5.00 5.00
Erythromycin 1TB 2xdy  |500mg btl 26.02 $260.20 28,00 280.00 | .18.00:7] 180.00
Eye wash 4oz Ak $2.38 1.50 3.00 1.92 3.84
Povidine iodine solution gallon 089 $10.89 19,99 19.99

Rutin Powder No Bid

Ruiin Tabs 500mg No nBid

Safeguard (See Panacur) 1000ml bt .

Terramycin Opthalmic Ointment 1/8oz 10.95 |  $43.80 9.09 36.36 | 8.50 | 34.00




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER
BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ59

Butler Ned Vet TW Niedical
Valerian Root tabs No Bid
\fitamin B complex, Inj 2.94 n/a S 28000 2.50
Yohimbine 2mg 50mi bil 43.75 $262.50 5219 313.14 343,00 258.00
Xylazine, 100mg/ml 100mg 50ml bl 14,0600 $843.60 25.00 1,500.00 18.20 1152.00
Xylazine, 20mg/mi 20mg__|20mi bt " 12.65 | $759.00
$17.876.94 21,270.81
QaTY (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UoM EST) [UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
EGroup 2 - Syringes and Needles
Syringes - Nipro preferred or equivalent
Syringe, 1/2cc, wineedle 29X1/2 1/2cc 100/box 9.94 $397.60 0 B.bh 342.00
Syringe, 3ce, wineedle, LL, 22X1 3ee 100/ box 5.25 $105.00f = 99.80 6.00 120.00
Syringe, 3cc, no needle, LL 3ce 100/hox $48.80f 39.80 5.65 56.50
Syringe, 1cc, wineede, LL, 25X5/8 1cc 100/box $81.90] =050 59.80 8.85 8850
Syringe, 5cc, no needle, LL, NIPRO 5cc 100/box $61.52 14.99 119.92 8.20 65.60
Syringe, 10ct, no needle, LL 10cc 100/ box $91.30 4.99 49,90 9.60 96.00
INeedies, 20GA, 1X1 1/2 1x11/2 _ |100/box $15.78 495 29.70 3.7 22.50
Needles, 22GA, 1X1 1 1/2 1% 112 100/box $15.78 495 29.70 3.75 22 50
[Needles, 25GA, NIPRO $15.78 495]  29.70 3.75] 2250
fiNeedle, Suture, 1/2 cut, Size 10 size 10 |12/pk $52.80 10.95 65.70 11.00 66.00
INeedle, Suture, 1/2 cut, Size 14 size 14 12/pk $62.80 10.95 65.70 11.00 66.00
$938.06 589.92 968,10
Qry (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOM EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Group 3 - Suture {dissolvable)
Suture, chromic gut, 1 cassette #1 50m/cass 64.77 $777.24 491.40 80.00 860.00
Suture, mono, abs, #0, 25M 50 25M 54.55] $3,616.50 3,500.00 45.00] 3150.00]
Suture, mono, abs, 2/0, 25M # 210 25M 50.000 $3,500.00f = 3,010.00 45.00F 3150.00
$8,095.74 7.001.40 7260.00



WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER

BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ59

Butler Med Vet TW Medical
I
DOSE OR MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UQM EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Group 4 — Hospital Supplies

Alcohol 77% 5 gallon 43.24 $129.72) 7 425.00 75.00

Aloeclens ear cleaner gallon w4166 $124.98 58.00 174.00
Anesthesia mask set each No Bid 30.00 £0.00 88.00 176.00
Auto clave Tape 112" sach $60.96]  2.50 60.00 3.25 78.00|
Carbon Dioxide Absarbent 3lb bag $13.84 8.99 17.68 7.50 15.00
Chlorhexidine scrub 2% gallon .-_= $74.96 21,00 84.00 29 50 90.00
Chlorhexidine solution aalion 8,28 $16.56 30.00 60.00 9.00 18.00
Clipper -1 speed - Andis AGC Preferred or equivalent each 117.24 $234.48]...:108.00 216.00 115.00 230.00
Clipper Blades #10 each 18.08 $36.18].::0 1500 30.00 33.00
Clipper Blades #40 each 18.09 $36.18 1500 30.00¢: 00140 28.00
Clipper Blades #7F cach 22.13 $44.26] . 15.00 30.00 20.00
Callar, Elizabethan, 10cm 10cm each 0.93 $9.30 B 10.00
Collar, Elizabethan, 15cm 15cm each 1.75 $17.50 12.00
Collar, Elizabethan, 25¢m 25cm each 2.36 $23.60 20.00
Cotton bails medium 2000 ct 580 $5.80 6.50 6.50 5.50
Cotton tip applicator 8" NS 1000/ box 4,99 $4.99 4.00 4.00) 7 3.00
Kerlix 2580cu/sf 1589 $3.78 47.00
Dilimodine Shampoo 1 gal No Bid 47.00|
Elastikon tape 2" 6 box i =-1=3,52_5 $78.50 93.00
Endotrach tube w/conn Size 3/3.5 |each 3.49 $34.90) ;a2 22 50 37.00
Endotrach tubs w/conn Size 4/4.5 |each 3.49 $34.90] - 72 50 37.00
Endotrach tubs w/conn Size 5/5.5 |each 3.10 $31.00]: 22.50 . 18.50
Endotrach tubs w/conn Size 6/6.5 Jeach 310 $31.00 22.50 1.85 18.50
Endotrach tube wiconn Size 7/7.5 |each 3.10 $31.00): 22.50 1.85 18.50
Endotrach tube w/conn Size B/8.5 feach 3.10 $31.00] ¢ : 22.50 1.85 18.50
Endotrach tube w/conn Size 9/9.5 |each 3.10 $31.000: 0 “ 22.50 1.85 18.50
Endotrach tube w/conn Sz 10/10.5 |each 310 $31.00]" @ 2.25 22 50 185 18.50
Equiflex colorpzak -VETRAP 2" 36/ box 28i55 $28.55 34.00 34.00




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION
PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER
BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ59

Butler iMed Vet TW Medical
Exam Glove -Latex wfo powder Large 50 pairs/box $65.00 5.99 119.80 4.00 80.00
Exam Glove -Latex wfo powder Medium  ]50 pairs/box $65.00 5.99 119.80 4.00 80.00
Exam Glove -Latex w/o powder Small 50 pairs/box $65.00 5 119.80 4.00 80.00
Latex free gloves Large 50 pairs/box $20.582 15.96 5.00 20.00
Latex free gloves Medium 50 pairs/box $20.52 ~15.96 5.00 20.00
Latex free gloves Small 50 pairs/box $20.52 " 15.96 5.00 20.00
Fecal float dry gallon $4.11 . 9.99 5.00 5.00
Fecal float diagnostic kit 50/boc $41.40 15.00 90.00 8.00 48.00
Fecal loop Adult each 520.04 2.10 2520):.71.65 19.80
Fecal loop Puppy gach $20.04 210 25.20 " 1.65 19.80
Fluorets 100 cl 100/ box 510.29 11.90 11.80 9.80 9.80
Forceps 475" each . $14.00] - 53,75 7.50 8.00 16.00
Gauze Sponges, 3x3, 12 ply 200/ bag 114 $45.60 1.50 60.00 1.65 66,00
Instrument Cleaner each ;5;92 $5.92 21.00 21.00 18.00 18.00
Instrument Milk (1 gallon) gallon 1_1:4? $172.05 21.00 315.00 19.75 296.25
Instrument wrap 24x24 non fen each 6.03 $361.80) 002, 179.40 390.00
iV Drip Lines ea $3.28 2.00 2.00
Catheter 20X2 20x2 each 31.42 2.00 1.30
KMR powder 120z 12 oz bottle $10.63 13.00] i 11.50
Littauer Stitchx Scissor 4.5" cheap 4.5" each $11.20]: ~ 5.90 15.00
Malasedict Shampoo (Malaseb) 16 oz bil $120.90 195.00
Microscope caver slips 22x22mm |100 ct $6.88 2.00 8.00 8.32
Microscope slides plain I x1" 100 pkg. $10.50 1.75 10.50 11.70)]
Mineral oil (1 gallon) gatlon $9.20 15.00 15.00[ . 2. 2.65
Mitaban - Mange Dip 10.6 mi bt Pfizer 22.00 440.00) 430.00
Nursers 12 box S =4"86 $7.86 9.00
Peroxide gallon $16.70 8.00 40.00 15 20.75
Piller, Pet 12pk pkg $2.22 16.00 32.00 13.95 27.90
Pill Cutter each . $7.36 5.95 11.90F 7300 6.00
Porous Tape 1"x 10 yd |12 pack 11.08 $22.18 750 15.00 10.55% 21.10
Resco nail trirnmer reg. each 546 $10.92 6.99 13.98 5.80 11.60
Scissors Bandage Cheap each 10.38 $20.78) i 2:95 5.90 9.00 18.00
Stapler remower each 3.66 $3.66|. 125 1.25 4.85 4.85]




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER

BID NUMBER: 09WCAOD59

Butler Nied Vet TW Medical
Stapler, appose, wide each 10.40 $20.80 ' 13.90 10.80 21.60
Stethoscope (Littman) Classic I each 74.20 $74.20 60.00 62.00 62.00
Surgery gloves Triflex size 7 50 pairs/box ; $241.50 285.00 19.50 292.50
Surgical blade #10 - Cincinnati Surgical Pref. or ¢ # 10 100 box $9.89 10.00 21,00 21.00
%ical blade #15 - Cincinnati Surgical Pref. or 4 # 15 100 box $148.35 . 150.00 21.00 315.00
Surgical drape, 30X30 reusable 30x30 pkg $108.00 44 85 8.20 123.00
Surgical drape, 40X40 reusable 40x40 pkg $140.85}:: 5.9 g89.85 13.25 198.75
Surgical Drape, Disposable box $178.26 49.00 294.00 48.50 291.00
Surgical Glue, 2ml 2mil btl $?9.56 a.00 108.00 11.30 135.60
Surgical Masks - tie on 100 pkg $2.21 7.50 7.50 2.50 2.50
Thermometer Digital each $21.36 399 23.94 5.00 30.00
Tongue Depressors Ault ns 500ct 500/ box $1.63 4.00 4.00 3.00 3.00
Vet Wrap 2"X5 yds $28.55} 4 0.30 7.20
Vet Wrap 4"X5 yds $28.55) 080 12.00 23.00 552.00
Tri-Hist Granules 200z pkg $86.64 25.00 100.00 19.50 78.00
$3,640.77 3,862.62
Qry (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOR EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Group 5 — Surgical Instruments

Scissors, metzenbaum curved, 5 1/2" 51/2" each No Bid 510.00 20.00 600.00

Blade handle #3 #3 each No Bid 120.00 6.70 201.00

Towel clamps (Backhaus) 3.5" 3.5" each No Bid 720.00 :8.7D 4056.00

Thumb forceps (Brown-Adson) each No Bid "450.00 17.50 525.00

Spay hook each No Bid 240.00 8.30 249,00

Halsted clamps, curved each No Bid 300.00 12.00 360.00

Halsted clamps, straight each No Bid 300.00 11.00 330.00

Hemostat (Kelly), curved each No Bid 330,00 12.20 366.00

Hemostat (Kelly), straight each No Bid 330.00 11.60 348.00

Rochestercarmalt clamps each No Bid 660.00 11.00 660.00

Allis tissue forceps each No Bid 600.00 20.00 600.00

Needle holder, cutting (Olsen-Hegar) 5.5" | 5.5 each No Bid 900.00 34,001 1020.00




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BIiD TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER
BID NUMBER: 09WCAQ59

Butler Med Vet TW Medical
Spay Packs, Canine No Bid 410,00 440.00 250.00] 1000.00
Spay Packs, Feline No Bid T110,00]  440.00] 220,00  880.00
0 5.340.00 754400
ary (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION DOSE UOM EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Group 6 - Vaccines
DHLPP vaccine 1 ml bettle {25 doses tray 66.52] $6,652.000%:50.00] 5,000.00 66.52 266,08
FVRCP 3-way modified live vaccine 1 dose vial |25 doses tray 71.69 $7,169.00] - 3,200.00 61.95|  245.00
Bordetella - Intranasal vaccine 1 dose vial {25 doses tray 32.00] $5,180.00) .= 6,020.00 78.00 390.00
Bordetella - Injectable 1 dose vial [25 doses pack Pfizer 165.00 330.00
Rabies 1 dose vial |50 doses tray 41.43] $%2,900.10 4,060.00 57.50 115.50!
$21,901.10 18,280.00 1346.58
Qry (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION DOSE UOM EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Group 7 — Flea Control
Continuous Flea Controt - Advantage Preferred 0 - 22 Ibs |6 dose pka. No Bid No Bid
23 - 44 bs |6 dose pkg. No Bid No Bid
45 - 88 bs |6 dose pkg. No Bid No Bid
89 - 132 Ibs|6 dose pkg. No Bid
Frontline Plus for Dogs, Topspot 22 10X3pipette $18,450.00 No Bid
[Frontline Plus for Dogs, 1opspot 44 10X 3pipette 2:00] $18,900.00 No Bid
Frontiine Plus for Dogs, Topspot 88 10X3pipettg 00| $19,575.00 NG Bid
Revolution for Cats 0-5 lbs 3 dose pkg. 2700 2523.00 No Bid
5-15lbs 6 dose pkg. L58.00] 4,350.00|No Bid
$56,925.00 6,375.00



WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER
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Butler Med Vet TW Medical
QTyY (12
MONTH
PROBUCT DESCRIPTION DOSE UoMm EST.) [UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Group 8 -Cleaning disinfectants
[Quaternary disiniectant cleaner Formulation e
hws-256 5gal NoBd |}  } bV Yo 80.00] 960.00
QrY (12
MONTH
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOM EST.) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Group 9 - Personnel/Animal Safety
[Cat Grabber No Bid T 98.00 08.00
Clean Suits Disposable 50ct No Bid
Freeman Cage Net or approved equivalent No Bid
Leather Cat Gloves Large pair No Bid " 61.00 61.00
Med pair No Bid =:61.00 61.00
Small pair No Bid ~61.00 61.00
Masks (tie-on) No Bid . 400 40.00
Muzzles velcro canine (XL, L,M,5,XS) 27.59 $82.77F i 24, 499.80
Protective Goggles 1.41 $70.50
Shoe Covers Footwear Disposable 100/bx £.90 $69.500 . 8.00 80.00
Syringe Pole Bcc Bcc No Bid
Syringe Pole 3cc No Bid
Cead, Animal Control 5foot 12/pk No Bid 374 .40
[Bowl, 58, Heavy Duty, Lrg 1280z ea No Bid 310.00
Bowl, SS, Heavy Duty, Med 640z ea No Bid 80.00
Bowl, SS, Heavy Duty, Small 3207 ea No Bid 120.00




