

ORIGINAL

WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY
REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER

BID NUMBER: 09WCA059

NAME OF BIDDER: BUTLER ANIMAL HEALTH Supply

Mailing Address: 1808 Buckeye Lane
City: Donald Rock State: TX Zip: 78664

Email Address: _____

Telephone: (512) 947-9804 Fax: (614) 652 6176

Mobile Phone: (512) 947-9804

SEE ATTACHED BID SHEETS (PAGES 1 – 5).

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

- ☒ low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
- ☐ "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:

- The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.
- The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause; pg3, paragraph 4 and agrees to follow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s).

Cristine E Wolff Date of Bid: 8/5/08
Signature of Person Authorized to Sign Bid

Printed Name and Title of Signer: CRISTINE E WOLFF

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID

BID SPECIFICATIONS

Transportation charges are to be included in the unit price, unless otherwise specified.

Samples are to be provided upon request. Requested samples will be provided within five (5) days from date of request.

The County requires at least a one (1) year expiration date on those products with a limited shelf life.

Where a brand name is shown, bid the brand name or equal. If substituting a different brand, identify the brand being bid, notate the product/order number to be used in ordering, and provide with bid a catalog or fact sheet (with pictures preferred). Generics are acceptable provided they are equal to the brand requested.

Notate on bid the product number, stock number, or catalog number to be used when product is ordered and indicate how product is shipped (each, dozen, box, case, etc.).

During the contract period if a product is discontinued, the county is to be notified immediately so substitutions or other arrangements can be made.

The County reserves the right to award the bid per item, per group, or a combination of the two.

The County reserves the right to award a primary, secondary, and/or tertiary vendor.

The County will be reviewing any available shelter discount programs offered by pharmaceutical manufacturers.

WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER:

Shipping Address: Williamson County Regional Animal Shelter
Attn: Cheryl Schneider
1855 SE Inner Loop
Georgetown, TX 78626

Billing Address: Williamson County Regional Animal Shelter
Attn: Cheryl Schneider
1855 SE Inner Loop
Georgetown, TX 78626

Point Of Contact: Cheryl Schneider (512) 943-3597

State delivery time after receipt of purchase order NEXT DAY.

For exceptions to stated delivery time, list any products and their delivery time:

Delivery time shall be a consideration in the evaluation process.

Awarded bidder is to notify the County immediately if a product is not going to be shipped in time to be received by the County in the above stated time frame.

In the event the primary vendor cannot supply the order in the specified time, the County will move to the secondary vendor for the order. If the secondary vendor cannot supply the order in the specified time, the County will move to the tertiary vendor.

BID SPECIFICATIONS

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 1 - Medications/Wormer						
Acepromazine injectable 50cc	10 mg/ml	50 ml bottle	003845 (GENERIC)	3	8.52	25.56
Albon	5%	473ml	Pfizer	4	N/A	—
Antisedan			Pfizer	6	N/A	—
Amoxicillin Suspension		5 ml bottle	—	24	N/A	—
Atropine Injectable SA 100cc	1/120 grain	100 ml bottle	GENERIC 002452	1	3.82	3.82
Artificial Tears ointment	3.5 gm	tube	GENERIC 007317	24	1.68	20.16
Bupivacaine .5%		50 ml bottle	Abbott 029415	2	2.38	4.76
Buprenorphine carjet, LL	0.3 mg/ml	10 per box	Abbott 022891	12	30.39	364.68
Calcium Gluconate Injectable		100 ml bottle	GENERIC 002453	1	2.90	2.90
Chlorpheniramine Tab	4mg		GENERIC 004956	4	3.30	13.20
Cipro (ciprofloxacin)	500mg	100 tab	GENERIC 033335	6	5.91	35.46
Panacure		1000ml	001555 INTERVET	5	92.61	463.05
Pyrantel Pamoate		gallon	GENERIC 018149	1	58.50	58.50
Depomedrol	20mg	10ml	Pfizer 002245	4	16.07	64.28
Dexamethasone	2 mg/ml	100 ml bottle	GENERIC 002459	2	3.52	7.04
Diazepam	5 mg/ml	10 ml vial	10x10ml 032977	150	11.25/10	168.75
Diphenhydramine (Benadryl)	50mg/ml		25x1cc 022020	4	21.59/25	21.59
Domitor (metemidol), Inj		10ml btl	Pfizer	8	—	—
Dopram (Respiram) 20mg/ml	20mg/ml	200cc	032251 BAXTER	2	34.03	68.06
Doxycycline 100mg, 500tas	100 mg	500 tablets	GENERIC 005197	1	21.02	21.02
Epinephrine	1/1000	30 ml bottle	GENERIC 002461	1	2.05	2.05
Flea Preventative Oral - Preferred Capstar or equal	Green-57mg	60 tablets	Downers 032706	15	16.00	240.00
Furosemide	50 mg/ml	100 ml bottle	GENERIC 002463	1	10.27	10.27
Isoflurane		250 ml bottle	GENERIC 029405	25	19.72	493.00
Ivermectin oral	10 mg/ml	200 ml bottle	MBO 021533	1	9.94	9.94
Ketamine		10 ml	GENERIC 023026	150	4.83	724.50
Ketaprophen	50mg	100ml	GENERIC 005487		74.26	74.26
Lidocaine 2% injectable		100 ml	GENERIC 002468	2	2.05	4.10
Marcaine (Bupivacaine)			Duplicate		—	—
Metacam injectable		100 ml	BT 025114	1	66.00	66.00
Metoclopramide injectable	5 mg/ml	30 ml	Baxter 006435	1	5.16	5.16
Metronidazole	250 mg	500 tablets	GENERIC 011051	1	14.48	14.48
Metronidazole	500 mg	500 tablets	GENERIC 012044	1	29.25	29.25
Procaine Penicillin G		250 ml bottle	GENERIC 022821	30	9.26	277.80
Rimadyl or generic	25 mg	180 chews	Rimadyl 024743	1	89.95	89.95
Rimadyl or generic	75 mg	180 chews	Rimadyl 024736	1	111.60	111.60
Rimadyl or generic	100 mg	180 chews	Rimadyl 024750	1	136.60	136.60
Praziquantel injectable		50 ml bottle	GENERIC 021498	1	200.40	200.40
Povidine iodine solution		gallon	GENERIC 003660	1	10.89	10.89
Panalog ointment		240 ml	GENERIC 006572	1	41.89	41.89
Prednisone	5mg	100tab	GENERIC 009626	6	10.23	61.38
Propylene glycol USP	99%	gallon	GENERIC 002538	2	16.27	32.54
Eye wash		4 oz	GENERIC 002594	2	1.19	2.38
Heparin	1,000 uts/ml	30 ml bottle	NOT AVAILABLE	2		
Cephalexin		500mg/500 ct	GENERIC 033159	6	27.27	163.62
Cephalexin		250mg/500 ct	GENERIC 033157	6	28.41	170.46
Clavimox Suspension		14 ml btl	Pfizer 032548	15	9.50	142.50
Clavimox Tab	62.5mg		Pfizer 032548	8	61.00	488.00
Clavimox Tab	250mg		Pfizer 032546	8	186.00	1488.00
Clavimox		375 mg tabs	Pfizer 032547	24	266.00	6384.00

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer	Group 1 - Medications/Wormer
Cough Tabs		1000/ct	004095 CELEN	6	53.99	323.94
Lactated Ringers/Dextrose		500ml bag	no bid	3	—	no bid
Lactated Ringers		500ml bag	no bid	3	—	no bid
* Epinephrine — DUPLICATE	30 ml		002461 generic	1	2.05	2.05
* Erythromycin	1TB 2xdaily	500 mg btl	004976 generic	10	26.02	260.20
* Eye Wash DUPLICATE		4 oz	002594 generic	2	1.19	2.38
* Povidine Iodine Solution "		gallon	003660 generic	1	10.89	10.89
* Praziquantel Injectable "		50 ml btl	generic 021495	1	200.40	200.40
Rutin Powder			no bid	4	—	no bid
Rutin tabs	500mg		no bid	24	—	no bid
* Safequard DUPLICATE Panacur		1000 ml btl	no duplicate	20	—	—
Terramycin Ophthalmic Ointment		1/8 oz	028983	4	10.95	43.80
Valerian Root tabs			no bid	24	—	no bid
Vitamin B complex, Inj			002464 generic		2.94	—
Yohimbine	2mg/ml	20ml	004675 WLPD	6	43.75	262.50
Xylazine, 100mg/ml	100mg	50 ml btl	005470 generic	60	14.06	843.60
Xylazine, 20mg/ml	20mg	20 ml btl	005469 generic	60	12.65	759.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 1						\$1767.9

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 2 - Syringes and Needles						
Syringes - Nipro preferred or approved equivalent						
Syringe, 1/2cc, w/needle 29X1/2	1/2cc	100/box	031765 NIPRO generic	40	9.94	397.60
Syringe, 3cc, w/needle, LL, 22X1	3cc	100/ box	029487 nipro	20	5.25	105.00
Syringe, 3cc, no needle, LL	3cc	100/ box	029505 nipro	10	4.88	48.80
Syringe, 1cc, w/needle, LL, 25X5/8	1cc	100/ box	029504 nipro	10	8.19	81.90
Syringe, 5cc, no needle, LL, NIPRO	5cc	100/ box	029507 nipro	8	7.69	61.52
Syringe, 10cc, no needle, LL	10cc	100/ box	029510 nipro	10	9.13	91.30
Needles, 20GA 1X1 1/2	1X1 1/2	100/ box	029475 nipro	6	2.63	15.78
Needles, 22GA, 1 x 1 1/ 2	1X1 1/2	100/bx	029480 nipro	6	2.63	15.78
Needles, 25GA, NIPRO			029483 nipro	6	2.63	15.78
Needle, Suture, 1/2 cut, Size 10	Size10	12/pk	000434 CS	6	8.80	52.80
Needle, Suture, 1/2 cut, Size 14	Size14	12/pk	000436 CS	6	8.80	52.80
TOTAL FOR GROUP 2						\$939.06

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COS PER EACH/BOX/CASI
Group 3 - Suture (dissolvable)						
Suture, chromic gut, 1, cassette	# 1	50 m/ cassette	generic 029210	12	64.77	777.24
Suture, mono, abs, #0, 25M	#0	25M	generic 029249	70	54.55	3818.50
Suture, mono, abs, 2/0, 25M	#2/0	25M	generic 029248	70	50.00	3500.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 3						\$8095.7

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE/SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 4 - Hospital Supplies						
Alcohol 77%		5 gallon	002496 generic	3	43.24	129.72
Aloeclens ear cleaner		gallon	012614 generic	3	41.66	124.98
Anesthesia mask set		each	no bid	2	no bid	no bid
Auto clave Tape	1/2"	each	001498 3M	24	2.54	60.96
Chlorhexidine scrub 2%		gallon	030186 generic	4	18.74	74.96
Chlorhexidine solution		gallon	007081 generic	2	8.28	16.56
Clipper -1 speed - Andis AGC Preferred or approved equivalent		each	024065 Andis	2	117.24	234.48
Clipper Blades #10		each	025104 Jarden	2	18.09	36.18
Clipper Blades #40		each	025107 Jarden	2	18.09	36.18
Clipper Blades #7F		Each	025102 Jarden	2	22.13	44.26
Cotton balls medium		2000 ct	006901 generic	1	5.80	5.80
Cotton tip applicator 6" NS		1000/ box	003263 generic	1	4.99	4.99
Kerlix		250 cu/sf roll	020604 Kendall	2	1.89	3.78
Dilimodine Shampoo		1 Gallon	no bid	6	no bid	—
Elastikon tape	2"	6 box	000924 I:J	6	13.25	79.50
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 3/3.5	each	007944 generic	10	3.49	34.90
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 4/4.5	each	007945 "	10	3.49	34.90
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 5/5.5	each	022035 "	10	3.10	31.00
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 6/6.5	each	022034 "	10	3.10	31.00
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 7/7.5	each	022037 "	10	3.10	31.00
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 8/8.5	each	022039 "	10	3.10	31.00
Endotrach tube w/conn	Size 9/9.5	each	022041 "	10	3.10	31.00
Endotrach tube w/conn	Sz 10/10.5	each	022042 "	10	3.10	31.00
Equiflex colorpak	2"	36/ box	005791 generic	1	28.55	28.55
Autoclave Tape 1/2"	1/2"	roll	dupl	12	dupl	dupl
Carbon Dioxide Absorbent	3lb	bag	023841 generic	2	6.92	13.84
Collar, Elizabethian, 10cm	10cm	ea	013274 generic	10	2.93	29.30
Collar, Elizabethian, 15cm	15cm	ea	013276 generic	10	1.75	17.50
Collar, Elizabethian, 25cm	25cm	ea	013278 generic	10	2.36	23.60
Exam Glove -Latex w/o powder	Large	50 pairs/box	021504 generic	20	3.25	65.00
Exam Glove -Latex w/o powder	Medium	50 pairs/box	021503 generic	20	3.25	65.00
Exam Glove -Latex w/o powder	Small	50 pairs/box	021502 generic	20	3.25	65.00
Latex free gloves	Large	50 pairs/box	031049 generic	4	5.13	20.52
Latex free gloves	Medium	50 pairs/box	031785 generic	4	5.13	20.52
Latex free gloves	Small	50 pairs/box	031047 generic	4	5.13	20.52
Fecal float dry		gallon	002514 generic	1	4.11	4.11
Fecal float diagnostic kit		50/boc	030098 generic	6	6.90	41.40
Fecal loop	Adult	each	000994 Jorg	12	1.67	20.04
Fecal loop	Puppy	each	001654 Jorg	12	1.67	20.04
Fluorets 100 ct		100/ box	002595 generic	1	10.29	10.29
Forceps, 9X9, 4.75	4.75"	ea	002375 Miltex	2	7.00	14.00
Gauze Sponges, 3x3, 12 ply		200/ bag	007937 generic	40	1.14	45.60
Instrument Cleaner		each	005334 Miltex	1	5.92	5.92
Instrument Milk (1 gallon)		gallon	014325 generic	15	11.47	172.05
Instrument wrap 24x24 non fen		each	002993 generic	60	6.03	361.80
IV Drip Lines		ea	022998 VETRO	2	1.64	3.28

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE/SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
IV Catheter 20X2	20X2	ea	010288 <i>terumo</i>	2	.71	1.42
KMR powder 12oz	12 oz	bottle	002292 <i>PET-AG</i>	1	10.63	10.63
Littauer Stitch Scissor 4.5" cheap	4.5"	each	002416 <i>multax</i>	2	5.60	11.20
Malasedict Shampoo (Malaseb)		16 oz bottle	023752 <i>DERMPAT</i>	15	8.03	120.90
Microscope slides plain	3" x 1"	100 pkg.	015218 <i>Jorg</i>	6	1.75	10.50
Microscope cover slips	22x22mm	100 ct	010087 <i>Jorg</i>	4	1.72	6.88
Mineral oil (1 gallon)		gallon	007404 <i>generic</i>	1	9.20	9.20
Mitaban - Mange Dip		10.6 ml btl	<i>PSI 240 DIRECT</i>	20		
Nursers		12 box	000290 <i>PET-AG</i>	1	7.86	7.86
Peroxide		gallon	002522 <i>generic</i>	5	3.74	18.70
Piller, Pet	12pk	pk	004018 <i>H BANS</i>	2	1.11	2.22
Pill Cutter		ea	012747 <i>Jorg</i>	2	3.68	7.36
Porous Tape	1" x 10 yd	12 pack	001415 <i>Kendall</i>	2	11.08	22.16
Resco nail trimmer reg.		each	003245 <i>Resco</i>	2	5.46	10.92
Scissors Bandage Cheap		each	018901 <i>generic</i>	2	10.39	20.78
Stapler remover		each	001543 <i>3M</i>	1	3.66	3.66
Stapler, appose, wide		each	020388 <i>Kendall</i>	2	10.40	20.80
Stethoscope (Littman) Classic II		each	022382 <i>3M</i>	1	74.20	74.20
Surgery gloves Triflex	size 7	50 pairs/box	019733 <i>Paradise</i>	15	16.10	241.50
Surgical blade #10 - Cincinnati Surgical Preferred or approved equivalent	# 10	100 box	007319 <i>generic</i>	1	9.89	9.89
Surgical blade #15 - Cincinnati Surgical Preferred or approved equivalent	# 15	100 box	007322 <i>generic</i>	15	9.89	148.35
Surgical drape 30X30 Reusable	30X30	pkg	002987 <i>KUP</i>	15	7.20	108.00
Surgical drape 40X40 Reusable	40X40	pkg	002989 <i>KUP</i>	15	9.39	140.85
Surgical drape - disposable		box	031928 <i>generic</i>	6	29.71	178.26
Surgical glue, 2ml	2ml	btl	031477 <i>generic</i>	12	6.63	79.56
Surgical Masks - tie on		100 pkg	032692 <i>generic</i>	1	2.21	2.21
Thermometer Digital		each	002772 <i>generic</i>	6	3.56	21.36
Tongue Depressors Ault ns 500ct		500/ box	004669 <i>generic</i>	1	1.63	1.63
Vet Wrap		2" x 5 yds	005791 <i>generic</i>	24	28.55	28.55
Tri-Hist Ganules	20oz	pkg	017036 <i>generic</i>	4	15.32	36.64
Vet Wrap	<i>(36/box)</i>	4" x 5 yds	005791 <i>generic</i>	24	28.55	28.55

TOTAL FOR GROUP 4 \$ 3540.11

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 5 - Surgical Instruments						
Scissors, metzenbaum curved	5 1/2"	each	no BID	30		no BID
Blade handle #3	# 3	each		30		
Towel clamps (Backhaus) 3.5"	3.5"	each		60		
Thumb forceps (Brown-Adson)		each		30		
Spay hook		each		30		
Halsted clamps, curved		each		30		
Halsted clamps, straight		each		30		
Hemostat (Kelly), curved		each		30		
Hemostat (Kelly), straight		each		30		
Rochester carmalt clamps		each		60		
Allis tissue forceps		each		30		
Needle holder, cutting (Olsen-Hegar) 5.5"	5.5"	each		30		
Spay Packs, Canine		each		4		
Spay Packs, Feline		each		4		

TOTAL FOR GROUP 5 \$ 0

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 6 - Vaccines						
DHLPP vaccine (preference Intervet)	1 ml bottle	25 doses tray	029013 Intervet	100	66.52	6652.00
FVRCP 3-way modified live vaccine (preference Intervet)	1 dose vial	25 doses tray	029002 Intervet	100	71.69	7169.00
Bordetella - Intranasal vaccine	1 dose vial	20 doses tray	009507 BI	140	32.00	5180.00
Bordetella - Injectable	1 dose vial	25 doses pack	Pfizer	70		
Rabies	1 dose vial	25 doses tray	032017 Intervet	70	41.43	2900.10

TOTAL FOR GROUP 6 \$ 21901.10

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 7 - Flea Control						
Continuous Flea Control - Advantage preferred or approved equivalent	0-22 lbs	6 dose pkg	no BID	75	no BID	
	23-44 lbs	6 dose pkg	no BID	75	no BID	
	45-88 lbs	6 dose pkg	no BID	75	no BID	
	89-132 lbs	6 dose pkg	no BID	75	no BID	
Frontline Plus for Dogs, Topspot 22		10X3pipette	019505 Merial	75	246.00	18450.00
Frontline Plus for Dogs, Topspot 44		10X3pipette	019506 Merial	75	252.00	18900.00
Frontline Plus for Dogs, Topspot 88		10X3pipette	019507 Merial	75	261.00	19575.00
Revolution For Cats	0-5 lbs	3 dose pkg	Pfizer no	75	no BID	
	5-15 lbs	6 dose pkg	BID	75	"	

TOTAL FOR GROUP 7 \$ 56925

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION		UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 8 – Cleaning Disinfectants						
Quaternary disinfectant cleaner – Formulation hws-256		5 gallons	no BID	12	no BID	

TOTAL FOR GROUP 8 \$ 0 -

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	DOSE	UOM	BRAND OR GENERIC WITH PRODUCT #	QUANTITY 12 mo est.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST PER EACH/BOX/CASE
Group 9 –Personal/Animal Safety						
Cat Grabber		Each	no BID			no BID
Clean Suits Disposable		50 ct	no BID	10		
Freeman Cage Net or approved equivalent		Each	no BID			
Leather Cat Gloves	Large	Pair	no BID			
	Medium	Pair	no BID			
	Small	Pair	no BID			
Masks		50/box	no BID	10		
Muzzles – Velcro Canine (XL, L, M, S, XS)		Assorted/8pk	016083 Jorg	20	27.59	82.77
Protective Goggles		each	021304 generic	50 PAIR	1.41	70.50
Shoe Covers Footwear Disposable		100/Box	032292 Jorg	10	6.90	69.00
Syringe Pole 6cc	6cc		no BID	1		no BID
Syringe Pole 3cc	3cc		no BID	1		
Lead, Animal Control	5 foot	12/pk	no BID	48		
Bowl, SS, Heavy Duty, Lrg	Large	ea	no BID	20		
Bowl, SS, Heavy Duty, Med	Med	ea	no BID	10		
Bowl, SS, Heavy Duty, Sml	Small	ea	no BID	20		

TOTAL FOR GROUP 9 \$ 222.2