

**WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM**  
**ROAD BASE MATERIALS FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY**  
**UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM**

**BID NUMBER: 09WCA027**

NAME OF BIDDER: Texas Crushed Stone Co.

Mailing Address: P.O. Box 1000

City: Georgetown State: Tx Zip: 78627

Email Address: TxCrushStone@msn.com

Telephone: (512) 930-0106 Fax: (512) 244-6055

Mobile Phone: ( )

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENSION
1	Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, Type A, Grade 1	60,000	Ton	\$5.05	\$303,000.00
2	Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, Type A, Grade 2, Class 2	60,000	Ton	\$4.75	\$285,000.00
3	Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, Type E, Grade 4 Foundation Course; Special Gradation	5,000	Ton	\$5.95	\$29,750.00
4	1" x 3" Hard Stone, TxDot Item 432.3	100	Ton	no bid	
5	3" x 5" Hard Stone, TxDot Item 432.3	100	Ton	no bid	
6	12" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3  MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % RETAINED <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">SIEVE SIZE</div> <div style="text-align: center;">% RETAINED</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">15"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">0</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">12"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">0-15</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">8"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">10-50</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">3"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">80-100</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">1"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">90-100</div> </div>	100	Ton	no bid	
7	18" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3  MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % RETAINED <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">SIEVE SIZE</div> <div style="text-align: center;">% RETAINED</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">18"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">0</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">15"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">20-60</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">12"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">45-80</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">8"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">75-100</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">6"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">80-100</div> </div> <div style="display: flex; justify-content: space-between;"> <div style="text-align: center;">- 6"</div> <div style="text-align: center;">0-20</div> </div>	100	Ton	no bid	

WBS

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENSION
8	Crushed Limestone, Base Screenings	100	Ton	\$ 3.05	\$ 305.00
9	Crushed Limestone, Washed Screenings	50	Ton	\$ 8.05	\$ 402.50
10	Crushed Limestone, Dry Screenings	100	Ton	\$ 3.05	\$ 305.00
11	Crushed Limestone, Fill Material	100	Ton	\$ 3.05	\$ 305.00
12	1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, TxDot Item 421	50	Ton	\$ 6.60	\$ 330.00
13	3" Crushed Base	100	Ton	\$ 5.95	\$ 595.00
14	24" Rip Rap	100	Ton	no bid	

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

- ☐ low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
- ☐ "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:

- The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.
- The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause; pg3, paragraph 9 and agrees to follow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s).

W.B. Snead Date of Bid: 5 Aug 08  
Signature of Person Authorized to Sign Bid

Printed Name and Title of Signer: W.B. Snead President

**DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT**

**THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID**