
WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION 

FOR UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM 

ANNUAL CONTRACT 

 

ASPHALT MIXES  
BID NUMBER:  09WC701     

 
     Recommended Award:  Austin Asphalt: Tertiary – Item# 1,2,3 
    Iron Horse:       Primary – Item # 5,6 
                  Tertiary – Item # 1,2,3,4 
                                                RTI:                   Primary – Item# 1,3,4,5 
                                                                         Secondary – Item# 5,6 
              Vulcan:              Primary – Item # 7,8      
      

 
ITEM 

# 
DESCRIPTION Austin Asphalt Cleveland Iron Horse  R.T.I. Vulcan 

1 
Black Base, Type A 
TxDot Item 340 
To reach 95% lab density 

56.00 
Alt. see bid 50.00 

NO BID 52.00 49.50 NO BID 

2 
Asphalt Concrete, Type C 
TxDot Item 340 
To reach 95% Lab density 

61.50 
Alt. see bid 54.00 

NO BID 55.00 53.50 NO BID 

3 
Hot Mix Concrete, Type D 
TxDot Item 340 
To reach 95% Lab density 

63.50 
Alt. see bid 56.00 

NO BID 54.00 53.50 NO BID 

4 
Hot Mix Concrete, Type F 
TxDot Item 340 
To reach 95% Lab density 

NO BID NO BID 57.00 60.00 NO BID 

5 
Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base 
Type D – TxDot Item 334 
To reach 95% Lab density 

NO BID NO BID 58.00 70.00 NO BID 

6 
Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base 
Type A – TxDot Item 334 
To reach 95% Lab density 

NO BID NO BID 58.00 70.00 NO BID 

7 

TxDot Item 330  Limestone 
rock asphalt…see bid 
Type AA 
Type A 
Type B 
Type C 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
SEE BID FOR 
PRICES PER 
EACH YARD 



Type CC 
Type D 

8 

TxDot Item 332 Limestone 
Rock Asphalt (trap Mix) 
Type BS 
Type CS 
Type DS 
Type FS 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
SEE BID FOR 
PRICES PER 
EACH YARD 

 
 
 


