

WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ASPHALT EMULSIONS FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY
UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM

BID NUMBER: 09WC716

NAME OF BIDDER: P2 EMULSION PLANTS

Mailing Address: 516 S. McLENNAN LOOP

City: ELM MOTT State: TX Zip: 76640

Email Address: p2emulsions@sbcglobal.net

Telephone: (254) 829-0330 Fax: (254) 829-0337

Mobile Phone: (254) 716-9940 - ANDY HOPKINS

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	F.O.B. SITE	UNIT	UNIT PRICE
1	HFRS-2 TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
2	CRS-2, (ALTERNATE - CWE-2) TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8	\$ 2.62	Gal	\$ 2.52
3	HFRS-2P TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
4	CRS-2P TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
5	SS-1 Emulsion		Gal	
6	RS-1P Emulsion		Gal	
7	Asphalt Rejuvenation Agent	\$ 2.57	Gal	\$ 2.47
8	Asphalt Emulsion Stabilizer	\$ 2.53	Gal	\$ 2.43
9	Pump Charge			\$ 70.00 IF NEEDED

USE ASPHALT EMULSIONS: - MIN. TANKER DELIVERY: 5000 GALLONS
 - SMALLER QUANTITIES AVAILABLE, SUBJECT TO FREIGHT DIFFERENTIAL
 - DEMURRAGE: FIRST 2-HOURS FREE, \$70.00/HR THEREAFTER

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

☒ low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

☐ "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:

- The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.
- The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause and agrees to follow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s).

Andy Hopkins Date of Bid: 8 APR 09
Signature of Person Authorized to Sign Bid

Printed Name and Title of Signer: ANDY HOPKINS, SALES

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID



Emulsion Plants, L.L.C.

516 S. McLennan Loop
 Elm Mott, Texas 76640
 Phone (254) 829-0330 Fax (254) 829-0337
p2emulsions@sbcglobal.net

Contact: Andy Hopkins Cell: (254) 716-9940

Product Price Sheet for WILLIAMSON County **Effective: 1 May 2009 – 30 September 2009**

Product	Tanker FOB Plant	Tanker FOB Williamson County	Tote/Drum
CWE-2/ CWP	\$2.52/Gallon	\$2.62/Gallon	\$2.72/Gallon
Cold (All) Weather Chip Seal Emulsion/ All Weather Pot Hole Patch Emulsion			
P2 Prime (premixed) ...	\$1.20/Gallon	\$1.30/Gallon	\$1.40Gallon
Premixed, ready to use			
P2 Prime concentrate ...	\$2.43/Gallon	\$2.53/Gallon	\$2.63/Gallon
Mixes with 6 parts water to make a prime, 4 parts water to make a tack			
P2 Stabilizer	\$2.43/Gallon	\$2.53/Gallon	\$2.63/Gallon
Asphalt Base Stabilizer			
P2 Rejuvenator	\$2.47/Gallon	\$2.57/Gallon	\$2.67/Gallon
Asphalt Rejuvenator			
R.O.C	\$2.67/Gallon	\$2.77/Gallon	\$2.87/Gallon
Road Over Coat for Chip Seal Roads			

Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons.
 Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential.

Demurrage: First 2 hours free, \$70.00 per hour there after.
 Pump Charge: \$70.00 if needed.

"Tote" Containers (275 or 330 gallons) cost \$129.00 for each container. Plus material.

Plus Common Carrier Freight. They are re-usable and can be re-filled.

Drum Containers (55 gallons) cost \$26.00 for each container. Plus material.
 Plus Common Carrier Freight.