WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION
FOR UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM
ANNUAL CONTRACT

ASPHALT EMULSIONS
BID NUMBER: 09WC716

Recommended Award: Ergon: Primary —Item # 1, 2, 3,4,5

Secondary — ltem # 7, 8

P2 Emulsion: Primary —Item # 7, 8

Cleveland: Secondary — Item # 1, 3, 4
Tertiary — Item # 2,5

Martin Asphalt: Secondary — Item # 2, 5
Tertiary - Item # 4

MARTIN P2
ITEM DESCRIPTION CLEVELAND ERGON ASPHALT EMULSION
FOB Unit FOB Unit FOB Unit FOB Unit
Site Price Site Price Site Price Site Price
HFRS-2
1 2.1591 1.95 1.8803 1.75 NO BID NO BID
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8
CRS-2,
2 2.0091 1.80 *1.8803 | 1.75 1.88 1.70 2.62 2.52
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8
HFRS-2P
3 2.8091 2.60 2.4803 2.35 NO BID NO BID
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9
CRS-2P
4 2.7091 2.50 2.4803 2.35 2.93 2.75 NO BID
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9
5 SS-1 Emulsion 1.9591 1.75 *1.8803 1.75 1.88 1.70 NO BID
6 RS-1P Emulsion NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Asphalt Rejuvenation Agent NO BID 3.3803 3.25 NO BID 2.57 2.47
. o 2.4803
8 Asphalt Emulsion Stabilizer NO BID 2.35 NO BID 2.53 2.43
FIRST TWO FIRST TWO
Pump Charge HOURS FREE HOURS FREE
9 80.00 80.00 PER LOAD 0.01 PER GAL 70.00
THEREAFTER THEREAFTER

*Award based on delivered price and overall low bid for item # 1-5




