PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY
REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER

BID NUMBER: 0SWCAGQCS59A

NAME OF BIDDER: BUTLER ANIMAL HEALTH SUPPLY LLC
Ms. Cris_Wolff, Territory Manager

Mailing Address: P.0.BOX 7153
City: DUBLIN Slate: _OH Zip: 43017
Email Address: ___cris.wolfi@butierahs.com
Telephone: (_800) B48-5983 x 2341 Fax: ( 614 ) 652-6178
Mobile Phone: ( )

SEE ATTACHED BID SHEETS (PAGES 1 - 5).

All bidders must acknowledge stating delivery times in the Delivery section (page 5 of this bid)

Leo E. McNeil ' /?/f (!5( /{’I; (/L{g{f-f"
Print Name Sign Name

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

| low ilem basis. (Will accept award on “any or all* items.)

"all ar none" basis. (Will accept award of “all” items only. If lefi blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:
=  The bidder confirms that he/she has read the enlire document and agrees fo the terms herein.
+  The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause and agrees to foliow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached
invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s).

He 2 M /V{:-? T Date of Bid: _ April 20, 2009
Signature of Person Authorized fo Sign Bid

Printed Name and Title of Signer: Leo E. McNeil, Executive Vice President & CFO

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
Price List
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ButlerAnimal. | . . . N _ L L
Health Supply |- ... = . .~ R A DO P . e Ul b e
Product Code # | PRODUCT DESCRIPTION - |'sIZE “UoM BRAND NAME_ " |" " UNIT PRICE -
004101 acepromazine injectable 50CC 10 mg/ml Promac 17.74
033158 cephalexin 500 mg capsules 500 count 45.00
032543 clavamox labs 82.5mg 64.65
032545 clavamox fabs 125 mg 119.80
032546 clavamox fabs 250 mg 1587.20
032547 clavamaox tabs 375 mg 281.95
004856 chlorpeniramine 4mg tabs 4mg 1000I£t 5.77
002269 depo medra! 20mg 20mg 20 cc 38.51
002459 Dexaject 2mg injectable 100 cc 443
032877 diazepam inj 5 mg/ml 10 % 10 cc 15.00
005187 doxycycline 100mg tabs 100 mg 500 ct 26.00
002451 epinephrine injectable 1:1000 11mg 30 co 3.57
021488 praziject 50mi Injectable 250.00
009411 xylanzine 50ml injectable 50 cc Sedazine 32.79
022120 Tramadol 50 mg 16.66
001551 Furosemide 50 mg/mi 50 cc Salix 12.42
024743 Rimadyl 25mg _ 84.51
024750 Rimadyl 100mg 143.51
004085 Cough Tabs 1000 ct 73.82
028983 Terramycin Ophthalmic Qintment tube 11.20
025107 Clipper Blades #40 2172
013276 Collar, Elizabethan, 15cm 2.17
013278 Collar, Elizabethan, 25c, 2.93
000994 Fecal Loop 1.71
007404 Mineral ol quart 11.07
031929 Quatemary disinfectant cleaner gallon 17.83
032784 exam gloves Powder Free small 6.36
032785 exam gloves Powder Free Medium 6.36
032786 exam gloves Powder Free Large 6.36
014325 instrument milk gallan 14.95
033096 Pill Pockels, Capsules 27.36
029470 Needles, 18GA, 1.0" 100 ct 3.23
030950 Sharps Container 4QT 2.33
028247 Sulure, mono, abs, 30, 25M 46.25
029269 Suture Pack wineedles, Size# 0 Dozan/box 40.81
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Health Supply | .° = © oo '. S
Product Code # | PRODUCT DESCRIPTION -SIZE . UOM :~
029278 Suture Pack wineedles, Size#t 2/0 Dozen/box 40.81
029276 Suture Pack w/ineedles, Size# 3/0 Dozen/box 40.81
Ciean Suits Disposable, Large No Bid
Clean Suiis Disposabie, Exira Large No Bid
Clean Suits Disposable, 2x No Bid
Blow Dryer for Grooming No Bid
Fold Down (collapsible) Dog Crates Medium No Bid
|_Fold Down (collapsible) Dog Crates Large No Bid
Fold Down (collapsible) Dog Crales Extral.arge No Bid
003277 Cat Carmiers, Disposable, Cardboard Box of 25 44.44
Poop Scoopers No Bid
012610 Oatmeal Shampoo allon 41.97
Disposable Ear Plugs (Human) case No Bid
Bucket, SS, Heavy Duty, 9 quart No Bid
Freeman Cage Net or approved equivalent No Bid
Disposable Masks smil, med, Irg box No Bid
Cat Gloves - Kevlar Small No Bid
Cat Gloves - Kevlar Medium No Bid
Cat Gloves - Kevlar Lage No Bid
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