
 

 

 

 

WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION FOR 

SUPPLEMENTAL PHARMACEUTICALS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE WILLIAMSON COUNTY REGIONAL ANIMAL SHELTER 

BID NUMBER: 09WCA059A 

 

Recommended award: Butler Animal Health Supply -                     item # 2-6, 8-10, 12, 13, 16-19, 21-26, 30, 33-34, 45 

   Med Vet International –                 item # 1, 7, 11, 14, 15, 32, 35-44, 46, 51-54 

   Central Texas Medical Equipment and Supplies –   item # 20, 27-29, 31, 47-49 

 

 

   
 

Butler   Med Vet 
  

Central Texas Medical  Med Whls Inc  

Item # PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOM 
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     

1 Acepromazine Injectable 50cc  
 10 
mg/ml 50ml 17.74     15           

no bid  
    

2 Cephalexin 500mg capsules   500 ct 45.00  

 Award 
based on 
vendor’s 
overall 

low 
prices  45     85.07     

no bid  

    

3 clavamox tabs 
62.5 
mg   64.65     75 210tabs   .68ea     

no bid  
    

4 clavamox tabs 125mg   119.8     149 210tabs   1.25ea     
no bid  

    

5 clavamox tabs 250 mg   197.2     199 210tabs   1.94ea     
no bid  

    

6 clavamox tabs 375 mg   281.95     361 210tabs   2.86ea     
no bid  

    

7 chlorpeniramine 4mg tabs 4mg 1000ct 5.77     4.1 1000tabs   5.32     1.21 100tabs   

8 depomedrol 20 mg 20mg 20cc 38.51     44     64.72 40 mg 

did not 
meet 
specs 

no bid  

    

9 Dexaject 2mg injectable   100cc 4.43     4.5     no bid      
no bid  

    



Item # PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOM 
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     

10 diazepam inj 5mg/ml 10x10cc 15     32.5     45.22     
no bid  

    

11 doxycycline 100mg tabs 100mg 500ct 26     24.5  500ct   38  500 tabs   
no bid  

    

12 epinephrine inj 1:1000 1mg 30cc 3.57     1.25 1ml   7.53     
no bid  

    

13 praziject 50ml injectable   50 ml 250      no bid      
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

14 xylanzine 50 ml inj   50cc 32.79 50ml   25.5 100ml   
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

15 tramadol 50mg     18.66 500tabs    14.75 500tabs   20.61  100/bottle   
no bid  

    

16 furosemide 
50 
mg/ml 50cc 12.42     15.99     73.21 for25/10ml   

no bid  
    

17 rimadyl 25mg     94.51  180ct   135 180chews   126.66     
no bid  

    

18 rimadyl 100mg     143.51  180ct   185 180chews   194.93     
no bid  

    

19 Cough Tabs   1000ct 73.82      no bid     8.44 for 20/box   
no bid  

    

20 Terramycin Opthalmic Ointment tube   11.2     9.7     5.14     
no bid  

    

21 Clipper Blades #40     21.72     21.95     211.05 
for 

40/case 

smallest 
quantity 
sold by 
vendor 

no bid  

    

22 Collar, Elizabethan, 15cm     2.17     2.25     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

23 Collar, Elizabethan, 25cm     2.93     3     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

24 Fecal Loop     1.71     2.1     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

25 Mineral Oil quart   11.07 quart   20     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

26 Quaternary disinfectanct cleaner gallon   17.83     no bid  gallon   35.63     
no bid  

    

27 exam gloves, powder free small   6.36     6.99     5.15     5.25     

28 exam gloves, powder free medium   6.36     6.99     5.15     5.25     

29 exam gloves, powder free large   6.36     6.99     5.15     5.25     

30 instrument milk gallon   14.95     21     36.85     
no bid  

    

31 pill pockets, capsules     27.36      no bid     10.5 for 30   
no bid  

    

32 needles, 18GA, 1.0"   100ct 3.23     2.99     4.4     3.9     

33 sharps container 4qrt   2.33     2.5     106.9 for 30cs   115 
for 40 
case   

34 suture, mono, abs, 3/0,25M     46.25 25M   39 15M   177.33 25M 36/bx   
no bid  

    



Item # PRODUCT DESCRIPTION SIZE UOM 
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     
UNIT 

PRICE     

35 suture pack, w/needles, size#0   12/bx 40.81 12/bx   34 12/bx    170.26     24bx   
no bid  

    

36 suture pack, w/neeldes, size#2/0   12/bx 40.81 12/bx   34 12/bx   75.98 12/bx   
no bid  

    

37 suture pack, w/needles, size#3/0   12/bx 40.81 12/bx   34 12/bx   75.98 12/bx   
no bid  

    

38 clean suits disposable, large     no bid     162.3 25/cs   
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

39 clean suits disposable, extra large     no bid     167.03 25/cs   
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

40 clean suits disposable, 2X     no bid     172.2 25/cs   
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

41 blow dryer for grooming     no bid     318     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

42 fold down (collapsible) dog crates medium   no bid     76.24     95     
no bid  

    

43 fold down (collapsible) dog crates large   no bid     89.56     150     
no bid  

    

44 fold down (collapsible) dog crates x-large   no bid     125     150     
no bid  

    

45 cat carriers, disposable, cardboard   25/bx 44.44 25/bx   34.5 12/bx   
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

46 poop scoopers     no bid     9.99     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

47 oatmeal shampoo gallon   41.97     
no bid 

    29     
no bid  

    

48 disposable ear plugs (Human) case   no bid     
no bid 

    239 
Pr 2000 
case   

no bid  
    

49 bucket, ss, heavy duty, 9 quart     no bid     61.5     34.5  each   
no bid  

    

50 
freeman cage net or approved 
equivalent     no bid      no bid     no bid      

no bid  
    

51 disposable masks, small, med, large box   no bid     5     5.75     
no bid  

    

52 cat gloves-kevlar small   no bid     99.5     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

53 cat gloves-kevlar medium   no bid     99.5     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

54 cat gloves-kevlar large   no bid     126.5     
no bid 

    
no bid  

    

 


