# WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

## **ASPHALT EMULSIONS FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM**

**BID NUMBER: 10WC803** 

NAME OF BIDDER:	ERGON ASPHALT & EMULS	IONS, INC.	
Mailing Address:	11612 RM 2244, BUILDI	NG 1, SUITE 250	
	City: AUSTIN	State: TEXAS Zip: 78738	
Email Address:	cary.brownlee@ergon.com	OR beth.roe@ergon.com	
Telephone: (_512_	) 469-9292	Fax: ( 512 ) 469-0391	
Mobile Phone: (5	12 ) 517-5517		

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES. PLEASE SEE ATTACHMENT ON FOLLOWING PAGE!

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	F.O.B. SITE	UNIT	UNIT PRICE
1	HFRS-2 TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8	\$1.8477	Gal	\$1.75
2	CRS-2, TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8	\$1.8602	Gal	\$1.75
3	HFRS-2P TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9	\$2.4477	Gal	\$2.35
4	CRS-2P TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9	\$2.4602	Gal	\$2.35
5	SS-1 Emulsion	\$1.8477	Gal	\$1.75
6	RS-1P Emulsion	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
7	Asphalt Rejuvenation Agent	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
8	Asphalt Emulsion Stabilizer	NO BID	Gal	NO BID
9	Pump Charge			\$80.00 PER LOAD

### **ATTACHMENT**

This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not ordered. The common carrier bills demurrage at \$80.00 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff. Pump and hose charge is \$80.00 per load.

Effective January 1, 2009, the Federal Environmental Oil Spill Tax was raised to \$0.08 cents per barrel. As a result, Ergon, Inc. has been forced to impose a Federal Environmental Fee of \$0.00133 per gallon of Emulsified Asphalt. This fee is not included in the bid price.

HECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:
low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
l "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
<ul> <li>y signing this form:</li> <li>The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.</li> <li>The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause and agrees to follow necessary requirements</li> </ul>
ne undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the rms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on e accompanying bid sheet(s).
Ignature of Person Authorized to Sign Bid  Date of Bid: AUGUST 3, 2009
ghature of Ferson Authorized to Sign Did
rinted Name and Title of Signer: CARY P. BROWNLEE - AREA SALES MANAGER

### DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID