WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

PRINTING SERVICES
BID NUMBER: 10WCA024

name oF BiopEr: (D FFice  LDtpoT

Mailing Address: _ | H‘ oo j& N h’ﬁ EDI\/&-— 'd::iﬁo
y:_fonk W ot~ st _TX__zp_ (55

Email Address: pﬁH{: Clenrload @ offce J;bpa'r('.‘m..

Telephone: (202~ )y €5 - %%@l )K.ID% Fax (( 212—) 257 - [ >->-)
Mobile Phone: (A2 ) 0"_5 [ - L"’_‘_ﬂa?- }

CHECK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

\ﬁhw item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all” items.)

& -all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all” items anly. If left blank, Jow itam will apply.)

By signing this form:

¢ The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the tarms herein. u{,‘ﬁ F"“*S.} p‘%ﬂndum
» The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause and agrees to follow necessary requlremeﬁég

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authcrized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the
terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount{s) shown on
the accompanying bid sheel(s).

L riorert de/%b&W 14 Date of Bid: _2/5"/09

Signatdre of Person Authorized to Sigh Bld “

Printed Name and Title of Signer: L_m IQW lf.gw }éﬂ @M?Z;{
&5 Sete e
DO NOT SIGN Odﬁ /%/M

BMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
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Group 1 ~ Envelopes

. . , . 5000 +
. Frice far | Price for Price for Price for Price for .
ltem # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Envelopes - White (Gase $55.75 $64.30 | $84.30 $171.45 $282.85 $0.05657
1 Jackets), printing on one each
slde 10-24%
Envalopes - Colored (CIVI $55.75 $64.30 | $84.30 $171.45 §$282.85 $0.05657
2 Jackets), printing on one each
side
Envelopes, Business §56.75 $64.30 | $84.30 3171.45 $282.85 $0.05657
3 Return, #10-24, Without each
Tint, Without Graphics
Envelopes, Business $56.75 $64.30 | $84.,30 $171.45 $282.85 $0.05657
4 Retum, #10-24, Without aach
Tint, With Graphics
Envelopes, Business $68.60 $77.15 | $97.15 $203.80 $347.10 $0.08942
5 Return, #10-24, With each
Security Tint, Without
Graphles .
Envelopes. Business §68.60 | $77.15 | $97.15 $203.80 $347.10 $0.06842
8 Return, #10-24, With each
Sacurlty Tint, With
Graphics
Envelopes, Business $58.60 $67.15 | $20.00 $190.00 $321.45 $0.06429
7 Return, #10-24, Window, each
Without Tint, Without
Graphics
Envelopes, Business $58.680 $67.15 | §30.00 $190.00 $321.45 $0.08429
8 Raturn, #1024, Window, each
Without Tint, With Graphics
Envelopes, Business §71.45 $80.30 | §102.85 §222.15 $385.70 $0.07714
9 Retumn, #10-24, Window, each
With Security Tint, Without
Graphics
Envelopes, Business $71.45 $80.30 | $102.85 $222.15 $385.70 $0.07714
10 Retum, #1024, Window, each
With Security Tirt, With
Graphlcs
Envelopas, Business 855.75 $64.30 | $84.30 $171.45 $282 .85 $0.06857
11 Retum, Color to be each
specified, #10-24 .
Envelopes, 9 X 5 15/16, 874,30 $90.00 | $134.30 $288.60 $535.75 $0.10715
12 (money evidence), printing each
on ona side, #10-24
Envalopes, 6 X 3 3/8, tan, 10465 | $126.15 | $172.30 $358.50 $655.40 $0.13108
13 printing on one side, #10- each
24
Envalopas, 8 1316 X 3 7/8 $104.65 | 5128.15 | $172.30 $358.50 $655.40 $0.13108
14 white, printing on one side, each
#10-24 (Election Retum)
Envelopes, 10 X 4 5/16 $97.15 $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 5608.60 $0.12172
15 white, prifting an two
sldas, #10-24 {car voter's
ballot envelope)
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 tem# Description Price for | Pricefor | Price for Price for Price for 5000 +
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Quantity
Discount
$97.15 $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
Envelopes, 10 5/18 X 4 1
sides, #10-24 (ballot #10 Env
envelope)
Envl 11 a, $087.15 $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
17 elow, Brintng on #10Env | #10 Env | #10 Env #10 Env #10 Env each
sldss #10-24 (ballot by mail #10 Env
envelope)
$97.16 $117.16 | $180.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
E .
8 e oo | #10Env | #10Env  #10Env  #10 Env #10 Env each
ona slde, #10-24 (ballot by #10 Env
mail envelope)
Envelopes, 11 x4 34, $97.15 [ $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
18 mm.o:.f:nng ononeside #10Env | #10 Env | #10 Env #10 Env #10 Env each
#10-24 (baliot by mall #10 Env
anvelopa)
$07.15 $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
Envelopes, 11 % X 5
20 green, printing on tad #10Env | #10 Env | #10 Env #10 Env #10 Env each
sides, #10-24 (affidavit) #10 Env
$97.15 $117.15 | $160.00 $332.85 $608.60 $0.12172
Envalopes, 15 X 10, col
21 tnn;: :g::lﬁed. pﬁntingi:ﬁr #10Env | #10 Env | #10 Env #10 Env #10 Env each
ona side #10-24 (large #10 Env
anvelopes)
Group 2 - Forms NCR-Paper
. . 5000 +
- Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for
tem # Description 250 500 1000 2500 5000 Qua ntity
Discount
NCR - 2 part, Short $14.19 $26.69 $53.38 $133.44 $266.89 .053 each
22 Forms, 4 x 8 1/4, prnting | Black Ink  Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
on one side
R ) $18.63 $36.13 $72.25 $180.62 $361.26 072 each
NCR -2 part, 8% x5 7/8,
23 pinting on one side Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
NCR - 2pant, 8% X7 $18.06 $35.56 $71.13 $177.82 $355,63 .071 each
24 printing on one side, colors | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
fo be specifled
NCR - 2part, 8% x11, | $25.00 | $50,00 | $100.00 $250.00 $500.00 .10 each
25 printing on one side, colors ~ Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
to be specified
NCR -2 part, 8% x 11 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
continuous faed computer
26 form paper with State of
Texas Seal scraanad In
background, printad barder
in blue ink
27 printing o..,pﬁna siu: Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
NCR -2 part, 8% x 14, $85.71 | $122.86  $202.86 $418.57 $76143 |
28 printing on one side, colors 1 1 1 1 1 $0.156 h
to be specifiad Standrad | Standard Standard Standard Standard : eac
| Calor Color Color Color [ Color
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Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

5000 +

ltem # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
NCR -2 part, 8X5,2
pages to & set and 25 sefs
toda Fad. bound on the top, $45.00
Do 1 i 2o aenis | $2250 | 20 $90.00 $22500 | $450.00 | ooop
20 yellow, chip board hacking, | 10 Books | Books 40 Books 100 Books 200 Books E:oal?
top is stapled 3 times, front | Black Ink | Black Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
cover of booklet black inlk Ink
lettering and Willlamson
County Seal (Deputy Voter
Registrar)
a0 NCR -3par,8%x14, | $50.00 $‘13‘|’:éﬁ° $200.00 $500.00 | $1000.00 | .20each
printing on one side Black Ink Ik Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
1 $17.09 332.86 $65.71 $162.86 $324 61 .065 each
NCR -3 8%x 3958,
31 ety Black Ik | Black | BlackInk | Blackink | BlackInk | Black Ink
Ink
NCR - 3 part, 8% x 4. $18.21 $33.88 | $67.9¢6 $167.47 $332.49
32 Short Formm. prining onane | Black Ink | Black | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
side Ink
$24.31 $48.06 | §96.13 $240.32 $480.63 .096 each
NCR -3 part, 8% x5 %,
a3 prining on ae sida Black Ik | Black | BlackInk | Blackink | BlackInk | Black Ink
Ink
NOR - 3 part, 8 % x 7 1. $48.06 §96.13 | $192.25 $480.83 $961.28 $0.1922
a2 Msmo m,ﬁ: with m’t‘um Black Ink | Black Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink each
address, printing on one Ink
side
a5 NCR -3 part, 8% x 11, $138.57 | $194.29 | $321.43 $672.86 $1194.28 $0.239 each
printing on two sides
NCR -3 part, 8% x 11, $100.00 | $151.43 | $264.29 $564.29 $1008.57 $0.218 each
36 printing on one slde, colors
to be specified
NCR -3 part, 8 % x 11, %1251 $178.57 | $290.00 $631.43 $1224.29 $0.245 each
37 Two (2) ink colors, printing
on ona sida
NCR -3 part, 8% x 14 $50.00 $100.00 | $200.00 $500.00 $1000.00 .20 each
38 printing on one side Black Ink | Black Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
Ink
NCR -3 part, 8% x 14 No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
continuous feed computar
39 formn paper, printing on one
gide, printed border in
purple ink with marginal
words
NCR -3 part. 8 % x 11 MNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
conlinudus faad computer form
paper, whita, yallow and plnk
40 copy, red numbering on the
{op right hand comer, seal
scanned In the center of
recelpt, preked hackwards and
three heles punched
NCR -3 part, 8% x5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
continuous fesd computer
a1 form paper, red numbering

an the top right hand
comer, sesl scannad In the
centar of racaipt
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item # Description Pricefor | Pricefor | Price for Price for Price for 5000 +
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Quantity
Discount
NCR -3 partbooks,3 | NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1716 X 6 11/16, priniing on
one side, top page is
42 white, second page is
pink, third pzge Is yallow,
pra-numbered {(bondsmen
fees)
NCR - 4 part, 7 7/8 x & Deleted Deleted Deleted per | Deleted per | Deleted per | Deleted per
printing on two sldas, wrap | Per per Addendum | Addendum | Addendum | Addendum
43 around cover with ¢hip Addendum | Addendum | #1 #1 #1 #1
board, stapled on left end, | #4 #1
33 satsto apad
NCR - 4part 8 1/16 X6, | NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
four colors ( top pate Is
whita then yellow, green,
pink copies) printing an
one slde, 4 page sef, 25
44 o151 @ book, bound on
the top, topis stapled
thras imes, with number
sequerices to be specified
by department (patrol
booklets)
$67.50 $135.00 $270.00 $675.00 £1350.00 27 each
NCR -4 B8lax11,
48 printing o ane side Black Ik | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
Group 3 — Forms Bond Paper
. . . , 5000 +
-~ Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for ,
ltem # Description 250 500 1000 2500 5000 Quantit
1scount
8 % x 11, 20 & Bond P $5.50 $11.00 $22.00 $55.00 $110.00 .022 each
46 CWhto, prntma on o | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
slde
8 % x 11, 20 # Bond Paper | 31100 | $22.00 | $44.00 $110.00 $220.00 $.044 each
47 - Color to be specified, Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
printing on two sides
8% x 11, 20 # Bond $12.88 | §25.76 | $51.52 $128.80 $257.60 $2.58 Per
Paper, prining on two 5 Pads 10 Pads | 20 Pads 50 Pads 100 Pads Pad
48 sides, bound attop or side | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
in quantlties of 50 with chip
board backing, ane ink
color
8% x 11, 20 # Bord $82.86 | $94.20 | $122.86 $194.29 $350.00 $3.50 per
Paper, printing on two 5 Pads 10 Pads | 25 Pads 50 Pads Two pad after
49 sides, bound at top or side | Two Two Twa Two Standard 100 Pads
L:‘uqaﬁ';g‘iﬁnaf igo“m chip | Standard | Standard | Standard Standard Colors Two
colors @ Calors Colors Colors Colors Standard
Colors
\ $5.50 $11.00 $22.00 $55.00 $110.00 022 each
B % x 14, 20 # Bond Paper,
50 printing en one sida P Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
B%x 11. 20 # Bond PEDBI’ $11.00 $22.00 $44.00 $1 10.00 5220.00 .044 each
51 - White, printing on two Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink

sidas
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5000 +

. Price for | Price for | Price for Price for Price for )
ltem # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
; $11.00 $22.00 | 544.00 $110.00 $220.00 .044 each
52 B Bond raP’ | Black Ink | Black | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
sldes Ink
8% x 11, 20% Bond Paper | 510000 | 810142 | $127.14 $275.72 $530.00 $0.106 each
53 - White, black ink, blue
borders, printing on two
sides
8 % x5 %, 20 # Bond $3.31 $6.06 | $12.13 $30.32 $60.63 012 each
54 Pa;:r'Whﬂgl p“n%?,g on Black Ink | Black Black ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
ona sida Ink
w $4.56 $8.56 $17.13 $42.82 $85.63 017 each
BYax5 ¥, 20+ Bond
s5 | Papar, Coiortobe | Black Ink |Black  BlackInk | Blackink | BlackInk | Black Ink
specified, printing o one Ink
side
8% 7. Paer, | 5006 | $1156 | $23.13 $57.62 $115.63 10231 each
56 e e oias P Black Ink | Black  BlackInk | Black Ik | BlackInk | Black Ink
Ink
' $5.50 $11.00 $22.00 $55.00 $110.00 022 ezch
8 |
B AL 20 % BONdPAPer | Black Ink | Black | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
57 10% soreened in Ink
backgraund, printing on
ohe sida.
8% x 5%,2psgesoa | NOBId | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
set and 50 sets to a pad,
bound on the top, printing
on ona sida, tap page Is 20
58 # Bond Paper - white, 2nd
paga Is fiuorascent (color
o be determined at time of
order) adhasive backad
label stock, chip hoard
kacking
| :J;ifciéﬁfffsil'lﬁ'nii"é“ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
time of order, printing on one
slde, congacutively numbered,
59 numbar will ba one Ink color
and the remalning print will ba
black ink, bound at fop In
quantities of 50 with chip board
backing
Group 4 — Letterheads, Postcards, Labels, etc.
, - . . 5000 +
- Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for -
Item # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Lattorhead, 20425 Rag | 57143 | $87.14 | §114.29 $232.86 $395.71 .079 each
60 Bond, Without Graphics 1 1
Standard | Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard
Colar Color Color Color Color Color
Letterhead, 20 #-25Rag | 97143 | $87.14 | §114.29 $232.86 §305.71 079 each
81 Bond, With Graphics 1 1
Standard | Standard | 1 Standard - | 1 Standard 1 Standard 1 Standard
Color Color Color Color Color Color
5 1 x 3 % Postcards, Cotor | $97-14 | $10571  §131.43 $207.14 $271.43 .054 each
62 o ba specifiod, printng on | 1/1 1 11 1/1 n n
two sides Standard | Standard | Standard Standard Standard Standard
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Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

5000 +

ltem # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
$30.94 $50.06 $115.32 $264.70 $526.84 $0.1053
14, Vi
ot on oo sidee " | Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | each
landscape, two holes Black Ink
punched In left margin,
Docket Sheats
’ $20.62 $41.24 $82.48 $150.44 $300.88 .08 each
6 % x 3/4, white labels, 2
64 printed fnes, no textjust | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink  Black Ink | Black Ink
lines
§ % x 4 1/4, white labals, $36.35 $72.12 $144.25 $360.62 $721.25 $0.144 each
65 S g o omsa (Ghain | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink | Black Ink
of Custody)
9% 4 1/4 Door Hanger. §81.43 $120.00 | $192.29 $428.67 $750.00 $0.15 each
) 1 1
87 # Vellum Bristol, col
66 be spaz;;;& ,,n;‘{?,;;iﬁ " | Standard  Standard 1 Standard | 1 Standard 1 Standard 1 Standard
one side Color Color Color Calor Calor Color
11 x 41/4 Door Hanger $81.43 $120.00  §$192.29 $428.57 $750.00 $0.15 each
' 1 1
67 # Vellum Bristal, cal
67 to be spaciied, prningon | Stendard | Standard 1 Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard
ane side Color Calor Color Color Color Color
§X3 Fingerprint Cards, | $92-86 | 8108.57 | $150.00 $244.20 $401.43 $0.08 each
68 white, black Ink, glossy
back, one side
Group 5 — Folders
. . P 5000 +
- Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for .
ltem # Description ‘ Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
914 X 14 Folders. Smaad | NOBid | NoBid | No 8id No Bid [ No Bid No Bid
26 SP104791 - color of
folder to be spacified, tabs
69 on top and left end, fold
over flap on left end with
fastanar, printing on front
slde and top tab
| o % X 14 Folders, colorof | NO Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
folder to be speclfied, tab
70 on top left, fastaner on
inside back of folder,
printing on front side and
tab
0% X 14 Folders, colorof | 1NO Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
folder to be speclfiad, tab
across the top and down
71 the right end, fastenes on

ingide back of foldar,
printing on front side, top
tab, (nside front , and on
back side
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Group 6 — Newsletters, Directories, pamphlets etc.

. . . . . 5000 +
- Price for Price for Price for Price for Price for ,
Item # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Deletad Deleted Delated Par | Deleted Per | Daleted Par | Delsted Per
Employes nawslatter, 8
,,ag‘;f’g 172 x 11, #2 Per Per Addendum | Addendum | Addendum | Addendum
grade offset, 704 whita, Addendum | Addendum | #1 #1 #1 #1
back plus ona colar inks, # #1
70 fold, collate, and stitched,
complete file provided in
publishar format, contains
text, photos, and ¢lip art,
sat-up charges ara to ba
inzludad in the cost
Deleted Deleted Deleted Per | Deleted Per | Deleted Per | Dealeted Per
letter
e et | Per Per Addendum | Addendum | Addendum | Addendum
as follows: 4 pages, 81/2 | Addendum | Addendum | #1 # # #1
X 11, #2 grade offset, 70# | 3 #1
73 white, black plus one color
Inks, folded - fila provided
in publisher format,
contalns text, photos, and
clip art, set-up charges are
o be Includad In the cost
County Directary - 4 $460.00 $501.53 $620.00 $1057 $1742.85 $0.33 each
pages, 2-sided, 8 1/2x 11,
60# husky offeet white, 2
pms color inks, trimmed,
74 folded - complets fila
provided in publisher
format, contains taxt,
phatos, and clip art, set-up
charges are 1o be included
in the cost
:n?ﬁm'snhsm:?g?;xa $254.41 $508.82 $1017.64 $2525.00 $5050.00 $1.01 each
nformation, .
75 two-sided printing. folded, Black Ink | Biack Ink | Black Ink
saddle stitchad
Viclim's Asgsistance No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pamphlet— 11 X 8 7/16,
76 two-sided printing, trl-
folded, glassy paper, blue
and golden ink
Group 7 - Manuals
, . . 5000 +
- Price for Price for Price for Price for Price for .
Item # Description Quantity
280 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Manuals -11 X B 1/2, Unbound unbound unbound unbound unbound unbound
1-sided, black plus 3 calor | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Raplacad with
Inks, with Shariffs Office Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum#1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
lago (provided), set up
7 charyes are to be Included | Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Baund
in tha cost, up to 50 pages | Raplacad with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Raplaced with | Replaged with Replaced with
{training manuals) Addendum #1 ‘ Addandum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addandum #1
Manuals =11 X 8 1/2, 1~ Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbaund Unbound Unbound
sided, black plus 3 color Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with Replaced with
inks, with Sherff's Office Addendum #1 | Addandum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
78 loga ( provided), set up
charges are to ba Included | Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
in the cost, Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with Replacad with | Roplaced with Replzcad with
Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1

51-100 pages
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Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

Price for

5000 +

item # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Unbound Unbound | Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
Meruals -11 X 8 172, 1- Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replacad with Replaced with
79 sided, black ink, set up Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addandum #1
charges ara to ba Included Bound Hound Bound Bound Bound Bound
in the cost 51- 100 pages | Replacad with | Replaced with | Replaced with  Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with
Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addaendum #1 Addandum #1
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 2- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black ink, bi-folded, | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with = Replaced with Replaced with
stapled, sat up charges are | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1J Addendum #1 = Addendum #1 Addsndum #1
80 {f’p‘:i 2}? ',‘,‘3;;’5‘ ?&'ﬁ:ﬁ ﬂ Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
Info) Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #4 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 2- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black ink, bi-folded, | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaged with | Replaced with Replaced with
a1 stapled, setup charges are | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
to ba Included in tha cost Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
51-100 pages Raplaced with | Replaced with | Raplaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with Replaced with
Addendum #1 | Addendum #1_| Addendum #1__| Addendum#1 _Addendum #1 Addendum #1
Manuals -11 X B 1/2, 1~ Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black Ink, stapled, Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with Replaced with
in top left comer, yellow Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
82 paper, set up charges are | _
to beincludedinthe cost  "Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
up to 50 pages Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with
(supplemental guide for Addendum #1 | Addandum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
Election procedures)
Manuals =11 X B 1/2, 1- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sidad, multicolored ink, Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with = Replaced with Replaced with
three holes punched, Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1 Addendum #1
83 ﬁ:gmﬂxga&uﬁ;ﬁdg Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound _ Bound
In tha cost up to 150 pages | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with
(Poll Worker's Manual) Addendum #1 | Addendum#1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1
Manuals -B 1/12 X 14, 1- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sldad, multicalorad card Roplaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with Replaced with
84 stock, b lack ink, two holea | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1 Addendum #1 | Addandum #1 Addendum #1
punched, up o 50 pages  ["Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
(Elaction day qulck Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with
reference) Addendum #1 | Addendum#{ | Addendum#1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum#1 | Addendum #1
Group 8 — continuous feed forms
. - . . . 5000 +
- Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for .
Item # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
91/4 x 4, 3 part continuous | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
faed recalpt forms, pre-
numbered consecutively,
with State of Texas seal,
original is white and
85 labeled eriginal, second
sheet is pink and |abeled
duplicate, and the third
sheet is yellow and labeled
office copy
8% x 11 confinuous feed | INO Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
computer form paper with
86 State of Texas Seal
screened in background,
printing on two sidas,
printed barder in blue ink
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Group 9 - Non-Continuous forms’

, - ) _ . 5000 +
Price for | Price for Prioe for Price for Price for .
Itemn # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
8? ;1‘:(?( 8 112, 1-sided, black $5.50 $11.00 $22.00 $55.00 $110.00 022 each
Group 10 — Lists _ ___
. Replaced Replaced | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replacaqd with
83 x11priningonone | yyn with Addendum #1 | Addendum#1 | Addendum #1 | Addendum #1
side, bound books, comb Addendurn | Addendum
a8 binding, fronvback covers | g1 #
(VR Alpha List for Early
Voting)
. Replaced Replaced | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with | Replaced with
8% x11, pinlingon ona | . with Adgendurn #1 | Addendum #1 AdSBrldum # Addandmnm#1
8a side, stapled in top ieft Addendum | Addendum
comer, 200 pages (Street #q #q
Guida)
- Replaced Replaced Replaced with Replaced with Raplacad with Raplaced with
83 x 11, printingonone | yyp with Addendum #1 | Addendum#1 | Addencum #1 | Addendum #1
side, bound with a spine. | aggendum | Addendum
a0 500 pagss (Election Day #1 #1
Alpha List # of pages
varles)
Group 11 - Business Cards
, . . . . 5000 +
.y Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for .
[tem # Description Quantity
250 500__ 1000 2500 5000 Discount
3 % X 2, While recycled $32.85 $35.75 | $41.45 $90.00 8157.15 $0.03143
o1 stack, one<slded printing, each
black ink, with Logo
3 % X 2, White stock, one- | §23.65 $27.15 | $32.85 §64.30 $107.15 $0.02143
a2 sided prriting, black ink, aach
with Logp
3 % X 2, White recycled $68.55 $71.45 | $77.15 $147.15 $260.05 $0.05001
a3 stock, two-sided printing, each
black Ink, with Logo
3 % X 2, While stock. wo- | $50.65 62.85 68.55 121. 200.05 0.040
04 sided printing, black ink, S s $iz140 ’ ﬁanh‘q. 01
with Logo
3% X2 whiterecyded [ §106.45 | $108.60 | $115.75 $182.85 $285.75 $0.05715
stack, one-gldad printing, each
95 multiple coler ink, with logo
PMS 282 and Black
3 ¥ X 2, white stock, ona- | $98.80 $102.15 | $107.85 $150.00 $221.45 $0.04429
slded printing, multiple h
96 eolor ink, with logo eae
PMS 282 and Black
3% X 2, White recyclad $32.85 $35.75 } $41.45 $90.00 $157.15 $0.03143
stock, one-sided printing, each
97 ralsed lettering, black ink,
with Logo
314 X2, White stock, one- | §23,95 $27.15 $32.85 $64.30 $107.15 $0.02143
o8 sided printing, ralsed each
[ettering, black ink, with
Logo
3 % X 2, White recyclad 63.55 71. 577, .
0 Siock, boeided pa G, 3 $71.45 | §77.15 $147.15 $250.05 zg;:ohsom

raised lettering, black Ink,
with Logo

CNTY PRINTING SERVICES-GENERAL & SPECIALIZED FORMS BID
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. . . , . 5000 +
ltern # Description Pn;gofor Pnscgufor Pqté% Sor ng% ;or ng% gor Quantity
Discount
37 X 2, White stock, two- | $53.65 $62.85 | $68.55 $121.45 $200.05 $0.04001
sided printing, ralsed each
100 Iattering, black Ink, with
Logo
3 1% X 2, white recycled $100.20 $102.45 | $109.60 $207.35 $361.30 $0.07226
stocl, two-s(ded printing, each
101 raised lettering, black and
goldaen Ink, with lpgo
3 % X 2, white stock, two- | $90.65 $96.00 | $101.75 $174.50 $297.00 $0.0594
sided printing, ralsed each
102 lettering, black and golden
Ink, with logo
3 % X 2, tan recycled. $43.60 | $46.45 | $58.60 $117.15 $207.15 $0.04143
stock, one-sided printing, each
103 raised lettering, brown Ink,
with logo
3% X2, tan stock, one- $43.80 $46.45 | $58.60 $117.15 $207.15 $0.04143
sided printing, ralsed each
104 lettering, brown ink, with
logo
3% X 2, tan recycled $43.680 $46.45 | $58.60 $117.15 $207.15 $0.04143
stock, one-slded printing, each
105 raised lettering, brown Ink,
with lago
37 X2, tan stock, one- $43.60 $46.45 $58.60 $117.15 $207.15 $0.04143
sided printing, raised each
106 lattaring, brown Ink, with
loga
Group 12 - Overprinting
_ i , . 5000 +
‘g Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for ,
ltemn # Description Quantity
250 500 1000 2500 5000 Discount
Qvarprinting address $38.57 542 86 $57.14 $108.57 $185.71 037 each
voter applications 1 1
107 Standard | Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard | 1 Standard 1 Standard
Color Color Color Color Color Color
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“County Directory-4 pages, 8 ¥ x 11, 60# husky offset white, 4 pms color inks, trimmed, folded — complete
file provided in publisher format, contains text, photos, and clip art, set-up charges are to be included in the

cost”

tem# 75

Replace description with the following:
“Victim’s Assistance Information, 10 7/8 X 3, two-sided printing, folded, stapled once, staggered pages”

Group #7
Replace Group # 7 on bid sheet with the following information:

Price for

Ttem # Descrintion Price for 10 20 Price for 50 Price for 75 | Price for 100 | 100 + Quantity
om = P manuals manuals manuals manuals ~ manuals Discount
Mamuals =11 X 8 172, 7 wrg W | B | R[] LIT:) *U | **B | *U =R U G
1-sided, black with 3-color
inks, Sheriff’s Office logo
(provided), st up charges arc to
be included in the cost
Pages in black print
1 25 pages (10) £2.20 | S17.10 84 [ 33420 | $11,00 | $85.50 | S16.50 | §1282 | §2200 | $171.0 | 30.22 51,71
Colar Extra 4 5 0 each earch
] 0
77 26-50 pagas (26) 55,72 $20.60 SU | 84120 | $25,60 | $103.0 | 342,90 | 51545 | 85720 5206,0 572 52.062
Color Extra 1. 0 0 0 each each
40
51-75 pages (51) 31120 | $26.10 g2 | 85220 | $56.00 | $130.5 | 3B4.00 | 51957  S112.0 52610 112 $2.612
Color Extra 2. 0 5 0 0 each esch
40
76-100 pages (76) $16.70 | $3).60 S3 | 563.20 | SB3.50 | SI3B.0 | 31252 | 52370 | 5167.0 | 53160 | S1.672 | $3.162
Color Extra 3. 0 5 0 ] i} each each
40
Over 100 pages (101) $22.20 | 537.10 $4 | 57420 | SI[1.0 | 51855 | 51665 2782 | 52220 | 83710 | 222 $3.712
Color Extra 4, 0 0 0 5 0 Q each each
40
Price per colored page 34 34 3 34 34 34 34 34 34 34 34 34
4
w[ ] +¥7 * wp W *rg 17 ) 1] ) *[J |
78 Manusalg -1] X 8 1/2, 1-sided, u
black inl, set up charges are to
be included in the cost
1.25 pages (10 Pages) 5220 | 517.10 S4 | 33420 | $11.00 | $85.50 | S1650 | S1282 | §2200 | $171.0 | 5022 | §1.71
4 5 0 each each
0
26-50 pages (26 Pages) $5.72 $20.60 51 | 54120 | 528,60 | 5103.0 | S4290 | 3154.5 | 55720 206,0 272 52.062
1. 0 0 0 each cach
40




51-75 pages (51 Pages) $11.20 | $26.10 §52 | 55220 @ 856.00 | 5130.5 | $84.00 | $1957 | $112.D $261.0 1.12 32.612
2. 0 5 0 0 cach each
76-100 pagcs (76 Fages) $16.70 | $31.60 53 | 56320 | 5B3.50 | 51580 51252 | $237.0 | §167.0 | 83160 | 51672 | s3.162
3. 0 5 0 0 0 each each
40
Orver 100 pages (101 Pages) $22.20 | §37.10 4 | 57420 | 51110 | S1B5.5 | 51665 | 82782 | §222.0 3710 | 222 s3n2
4. 0 0 0 5 0 0 each each
40
. Price for Price . \ .
. [ +
Item # Description Pr;lc:nff:hlﬂ 20 for 50 Pr:::nﬁ:lrlzs Pn;ﬁz;liﬂﬂ 100Dl Quantnty
) manualg manuals iscoun
Manuals -11 X, 8 1/2, 2-sided, Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
black ink, bi-folded, stapled, set | 11 X 17 Flat HXIT7Fat | 11X 17 Flat 11 X 17 Flat 11 X 17Flat 11 X 17 Flat
up charges are to be included fn | 81/2" X 11 grat Xt | gi2e Xt g1/t Xt st x syt x e
the cost Folded/Stapled Folded/Stapl | Folded/Stapled Folded/Siapled Folded/Stapled Folded/Stapled
{Victim Assistance . ed
Supplemental Info) See Pape Counis in
Parcntheses

79 1-25 pages (16 Pages) $6.10 §12.20 $30.50 84575 361.00 80.61 ezch
26-50 pages (28 Pages) $8.80 $17.60 $44.00 | se6.00 $88.00 $0.88 each
51.75 pages (52 Pages) $14.00 528 00 $70.00 §105.00 $140.00 $1.40 each
76-100 pages (76 Pages) $19.30 $38.60 $96.50 [ 814475 $193.00 $1,93 cach
Over 100 pages NA NA NA NA NA NA

Masuals -1 % 8 1/2, 1-sided, Sec Page Counts in
black ink, stapled, in top left Parentheses
cormer, yellow paper, 5et up
charges arc to be included in
the cost (supplemental guide
for Election procedures)

%0 1-25 pages (10 Pages) §3.29 $6.58 516,45 524,58 $32.90 $0.320 cach
26-50 pages (26 Pages) 53,41 $16.82 342,05 S63.08 584.10 $0.841 each
51-75 pages (51 Pages) 81640 $32.80 S82.00 5$123.00 5164,00 $1.64 each
76-100 pages ﬁﬁ Papes) $24.40 $48.80 $122,00 5183.00 §244.00 $2.44 cach
Over 100 pages (101 Poages) £32.80 565.60 $164.00 3246.00 §328.00 $3.28 each

Manuals -11 X 8 172, 1-gided, Prices are Black Ink,
multicslored ink, three holes Page Quantity Bid in
punched, glossy white paper, Parentheses, Color
setup charges are to be Pages pricing at
included in thecostup to (Poll | hottom of ling item
Wotker's Manual) quote
Pages in blnck print :

g1 1-25 pages { lﬂ_liagm} 86.35 812.71 33178 $47.67 863.56 50.6336
26-50 pages (26 Fages) 516,69 $33.38 $83.45 $125.18 5166.69 $1.659

| 51-75 pages (51 Pages) £32.74 $63.48 $163.69 $245.54 $327.38 $3.2738
76-100 pages (76 Pages) $48.45 $96,90 $224.23 $363.38 $484.50 $4,845

| Over 100 pages (101 Pages) 564.52 $129.04 $322,60 $483.89 $645.19 $6.4519

| Price per colored page 37 (glossy) 37 (glossy) | .37 (glossy) 37 (glossy) .37 (glossy) .57 (glossy)

Mamuls -§ 1/12 X )4, 1-sided, | Price based on

82 multicolored card stock, b lack | guantity in
ink, two holes punched, parentheses
(Election day quick reference) _

1-25 pages (10) $6.35 §12.71 $31.78 $47.67 $63.56 3$0.6356
2650 pages (26) $16.69 $33.38 $83.45 §125.18 %166.69 51,669
5175 pages (51) $32.74 $65.48 £163.69 $245.54 $327.38 $3.2738




| 76-100 pages (76) 548,45 $96.90 $224.23 | §363.38 $4R4.50 $4.845
Over 100 pages (101) $64.52 $129.04 $322.60 $483.89 $645.19 $6,4519
#UJ — unbound - 3 hole punched, **B — comb bound
Group# 10
Replace Group # 10 on bid sheet with the following information:
, - Price for 1 | Price for Price for 10 10 + quantity
Ttemn # Description Tist 5 lists Jists discount
8 ¥4 x 11 printing on one
side, bound books, comb 362.84
e ’ $12.57 $125.69 $12.57 each
88 binding, front/back Black Ink
covers (VR Alpha List Black Ink Black Ini Rlack Ink
for Early Voting)
200 pages
8 % x 11, printing on
%9 one side, stapled in top $4.40 $22.00 $44.00 $4.40 each
left comer, 200 pages Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
(Street Guide)
200 pages
814 x 11, printing on
one gide, bound with a
% spine, (Election Day $13.07 $65.35 | $130.66 $13.07 each
. Black Ink | Black Ink Black Ink Black Ink
Alpha List # of pages
varies)
500 pages
Item# 85

Replace description with the following:
“3 %2 X 2 white, recycled stock, one-sided printing, pms blue 282 and black, with logo”

Item# 96

Replace description with the following:
“3 ¥2 X 2 white stock, one-sided printing, pms blue 282 and black, with logo”



All bidders must acknowledge receipt of Addendum # 1
The addendum consists of 6 pages

Print Name___ VieToL» & DUMAT Title DI RecTs

Sign Name wm Date ?/ 3/3?
B M ? Gl o tien, VP.

T (Yt 51

COMPLETED FORM MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH BID

Sincerely,

Reratin Wancock
Kerstin Hancock
Purchasing Specialist
Williamson County



