WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

PRINTING SERVICES
BID NUMBER: 10WCA024

NAME OF BIDDER: (2*/774 ij,-hg_r, /.72

Mailing Addresa:ayaf. f’ S"( 27!7'2-0 S’{f’ SO0
oy AusTinl state: TX 7 ZB79

Email Address: __[_ MO liha @ P(‘ff\’}‘" lbjfﬂg-_..C.oM

Telephone: (St y 275 - G500 Zsot 101 Fax (SIZ )y HYO-ST775

Mobile Phone: ( 512- ) 7~ OoOT7S

yCK ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:
“1 low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

“all or none" basis. (Will accept award of “all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

By signing this form:
» The bidder confirms that he/she has read the entire document and agrees to the terms herein.
e The bidder is acknowledging the Conflict of Interest Clause and agrees to follow necessary requirements

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder to fully comply with the
terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications, and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on
the accompanying bid sheet(s).

J@ﬂfﬂg ,-% Lﬂ?:?"'"_““ Date of Bid: ____f/? / o7

Signature of Person Authorized to Sign Bid

'T-'- . r ; -
Printed Name and Title of Signer: _£rELOLE [z x/ M@’hﬁ-f’ff’“

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
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Group 1 - Envelopes

ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price tor
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

Envelopes - White {Case
Jackets), printing on one
side 10-244

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes - Colored (Civil
Jackets), printing on one
side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Without
Tint, Without Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Wilhout
Tint, With Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Retum, #10-24, With
Security Tint, Without
Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Retumn, #10-24, With
Security Tint, With
Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Window,
Without Tint, Without
Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Window,
Without Tint, With Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, Business
Retumn, #10-24, Window,
With Security Tint, Without
Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

10

Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Window,
With Security Tint, With
Graphics

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

11

Envelopes, Business
Return, Color 1o be
specified, #10-24

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

12

Envelopes, 9 X 5 15/16,
(money evidence), printing
on one side, #10-24

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

13

Envelopes, 6 X 3 3/8, 1an,
printing on one side, #10-
24

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

14

Envelopes, 8 13/16 X3 7/8
white, printing on one side,
#10-24 (Election Relurn)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

15

Envelopes, 10 X 4 5/16
white, printing on two
sides, #10-24 (car voter's
ballot envelope)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

16

Envelopes, 10 5/16 X 4 1/2
white, printing on two
sides, #10-24 (ballot
envelope)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

17

Envelopes, 11 X 4 3/4,
yellow, printing on two
sides #10-24 (ballot by mail
envelope)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

18

Envelopes, 11 2 X 5 color
1o be specified, printing on
one side, #10-24 (ballot by
malil envelope)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NQC BID

19

Envelopes, 11 X 4 3/4,
white, printing on one side
#10-24 (ballot by mail
envelope)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

20

Envelopes, 11 %2 X5
green, printing on two
sides, #10-24 (affidavit)

21

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Envelopes, 15 X 10, color
to be specilied, printing on
one side #10-24 (large
envelopes)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Group 2 — Forms NCR-Paper

ltemn #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

22

NCR - 2 part, Short
Forms, 4 x 8 1/4, printing
on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

23

NCR - 2 part, B ¥2 x5 7/8,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

24

NCR - 2part, 8% x 7,
printing on one side, colors
to be specified

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

25

26

NCR - 2part,B¥%x 11,
printing on one side, colors
to be specified

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NCR -2part, 8% x11
continuous feed computer
form paper with State of
Texas Seal screened in
background, printed border
in blue ink

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

27

NCR -2 part, 8 '% x 14,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NQ BID

28

NCR -2part, 8 1% x 14,
printing on one side, colors
to be specified

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount |

29

NCR-2part, 6 X5, 2
pages to a set and 25 sets
to a pad, bound on the top,
printing on one side, top
page is white, 2nd page is
yellow, chip board backing,
iop is stapled 3 times, front
cover of booklet black ink
lettering and Williamson
County Seal (Deputy Voter
Reqistrar)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

30

NCR -3part, 8% x 14,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

31

NCR -3 part, 8 %2 x35/8,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

32

NCR -3 part,Bl2x 4,
Short Form, printing on one
side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

33

NCR -3 part, 812 x5 2,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

34

NCR -3 part, B2 x7 15,
Memo reply with return
address, printing on one
side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

35

NCR -3 part, 8% x 11,
printing on two sides

36

NCR -3 part, B % x 11,
printing on ane side, colors
o be specified

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

37

NCR -3 part,Bl2x 11,
Two (2) ink colors, printing
on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

38

NCR -3 part, 8 %2 x 14,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

" 39

NCR -3 part,B% x 14
continuous feed computer
form paper, printing on one
side, printed border in
purple ink with marginal
words

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

40

NCR -3 part, B% x 11
conlinuous feed compulter
form paper, white, yellow
and pink copy, red
numbering on the top right
hand corner, seal scanned
in the center of receipl,
packed backwards and
three holes punched

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

41

NCR -3 part,B'% x5
continuous feed computer
form paper, red numbering
on the top right hand
corner, seal scanned in the
center of receipt

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

42

NCR - 3 part books, 3 1/16
X 6 11/18, printing on one
side, top page is white,
second page is pink, third
page is yellow, pre-
numbered (bondsmen
fees)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

43

NCR -4 part, 7 7/8 x 5,
printing on two sides, wrap
around cover with chip
board, stapled on left end,
33 sets to a pad

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

44

NCR - 4 part, 9 1/16 X G,
four colors ( top palte is
white then yellow, green,
pink copies) printing on one
side, 4 page set, 25 sets to
a book, bound on the top,
top is stapled three times,
with number sequences to
be specified by depariment
(patrol booklets)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

45

NCR -4 part, B2 x 11,
printing on one side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Group 3 -

Forms Bond Paper

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

46

B ¥z x 11, 20 # Bond Paper
- White, printing on one
side

$15.93

$31.85

$53.70

$99.25

$168.50

+.027 PP

47

8 ¥ x 11, 20 # Bond Paper
- Color 1o be specified,
printing on two sides

$16.23

$32.45

$54.90

$102.25

$169.00

+.034 PP

48

8% x11, 20 # Bond
Paper, printing on two
sides, bound at top or side
in quantities of 50 with chip
board backing, one ink
color

49

81 x 11,20 # Bond
Paper, printing on two
sides, bound at top or side
in quantities of 50 with chip
board backing, two ink
colors

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

50

8% x 14, 20 # Bond Paper,
printing on one side

51

B % x 11, 20 # Bond Paper
- White, printing on two
sides

$16.23

$32.45

$54.90

$102.25

$169.00

+.034 PP

$18.75

$37.50

$65.00

$127.50

$220.00

+.044 PP

CNTY PRINTING SERVICES-GENERAL & SPECIALIZED FORMS BID

PAGE B of 15

ORIGINAL



ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

52

8 %2 x 14, 20 # Bond Paper
- White, printing on two
sides

53

$18.75

$37.50

$65.00

8 %2 x 11, 20 # Bond Paper
- White, black ink, blue
borders, printing on two
sides

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$127.50

NO BID

$220.00

+.044 PP

NO BID

NO BID

54

B %2 %5, 20 # Bond
Paper, White, printing on
one side

$9.50

$18.50

$28.50

$60.50

$95.50

+.02 PP

55

B8 % x 5%, 20 # Bond
Paper, Color to be
specified, printing on one
side

$9.50

$18.50

$28.50

$60.50

$95.50

+.02 PP

56

8 % x 7, 20 # Bond Paper,
printing on two sides

$9.50

$18.50

$28.50

$60.50

$95.50

+.02 PP

57

8% x 11, 20 # Bond Paper
with State of Texas Seal
10% screened in
background, printing on
one side.

$15.93

$31.85

$53.70

$99.25

$168.50

+.027 PP

58

8% x 5% ,2pagestoa
set and 50 sets to a pad,
bound on the {op, printing
on one side, lop page is 20
# Bond Paper - white, 2nd
page is fluorescent (color
to be determined at time of
order} adhesive backed
label stock, chip board
backing

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

59

4 1/4 x 5 1/4, 20: bond
paper, paper color lo be
specified at time of order,
printing on one side,
consecutively numbered,
number will be one ink
color and the remaining
print will be black ink,
bound at top in quantities
of 50 with chip board
backing

$397.50

$795.00

$1590.00

$3975.00

$7950.00

$1.59ea

Group 4 — Letterheads, Postcards, Labels, etc.

ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

60

Letterhead, 20 # - 25 Rag
Bond, Without Graphics

$15.93

$31.85

$53.70

$99.25

$168.50

+.027 PP

61

letterhead, 20 # - 25 Rag
Bond, With Graphics

$15.93

$31.85

$53.70

$99.25

$168.50

+.027 PP

62

5 % x 3 % Poslcards, Color
to be specified, printing on
two sides

$21.00

$32.00

$44.00

$110.00

$220.00

.044 PP
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Item #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

63

9 x 14, 67 i Vellum Bristol,
printing on two sides -
landscape, two holes
punched in left margin,
Docket Sheets

$35.00

$70.00

$130.00

$300.00

$600.00

.12ea

64

6 4 x 3/4, white labels, 2
printed lines, no lext just
lines

$35.00

$70.00

$130.00

$300.00

$600.00

.12ea

65

5 % x 4 1/4, white labels,
printing on one side (Chain
of Custody)

$70.00

$130.00

$300.00

$600.00

$1200.00

.22ea

66

9 x 4 1/4 Door Hanger,

67 # Vellum Biristol, color to
be specified, printing on
ane side

$25.00

$35.00

$70.00

$175.00

$250.00

+.049%ea

67"

11 x 4 1/4 Door Hanger,
67 # Vellum Bristol, color
io be specified, printing on

one side

$25.00

$35.00

$70.00

$175.00

$250.00

+.049ea

68"

5 X 3 labels, white, black
ink, printing on one side

$20.00

$30.00

$60.00

$150.00

$300.00

+.06ea

Group 5 -

Folders

ltem #

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

69

972 X 14 Folders, Smead
26 SP104791 - color of
folder to be specified, tabs
on top and lett end, fold
over flap on left end with
fastener, printing on front
side and {op tab

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

70

9% X 14 Folders, color of
folder to be specified, tab
on top left, fastener on
inside back of folder,
printing on front side and
tab

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

71

91 X 14 Folders, color of
folder 1o be specified, tab
across the lop and down
the right end, fastener on
inside back of folder,
printing on front side, lop
tab, inside front , and on
back side

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOC BID

NO BID
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Group 6 — Newsletters, Directories, pamphlets etc.

ltem #

Description

Price for
250

500

Price for |

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

72

Employee newsletter, 8
pages, B 1/2 x 11, #2 grade
offset, 70# white, black
plus one color inks, fold,
collate, and stitched,
complete file provided in
publisher format, conlains
text, photos, and clip art,
set-up charges are to be
included In the cost

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

73

Employee newsletter
above - format changed
as follows: 4 pages, 8 1/2 x
11, #2 grade offset, 704
white, black plus one color
inks, folded - file provided
in publisher format,
conlains text, photos, and
clip art, set-up charges are
to be included in the cost

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

74

County Directory - 4
pages, 2-sided, 8 1/2 x 11,
60# husky offset white, 2
pms color inks, trimmed,
folded - complete file
provided in publisher
format, contains text,
pholos, and clip art, set-up
charges are to be included
in the cost

$87.25

$174.50

$349.00

$872.50

$1745.00

.349%ea.

75

Victim's Assistance
Information, 10 7/8 X3,
two-sided printing, folded,
saddle stitched

$90.00

$180.00

$360.00

$900.00

$1800.00

+.32ea

76

Viclim's Assistance
Pamphlet - 11 X 8 7/16,
two-sided printing, tri-
folded, glossy paper, blue
and golden ink

$90.00

$180.00

$360.00

$900.00

$1800.00

+.32ea

Group 7 - Manuals

ltem #

77

Description

Price for
250

Price for
500

Price for
1000

Price for
2500

Price for
5000

5000 +
Quantity
Discount

Manuals -11 X 8 1/2,

1-sided, black plus 3 color
inks, with Sheriff's OHice
logo (provided), set up
charges are to be included
in the cost, up to 50 pages
(training manuals)

Unbound
$2213.75
Bound

$2367.55

unbound

$3347.20

unbound

$6557.10

unbound

$186,727.60

“unbound

$33,777.10

unbound

$6.76ea.

‘Bound

$3687.20

Bound

$7372.30

Bound

$18,427.60

Bound

$36,853.10

" Bound

$7.37ea.

78

Manuals -11 X B8 1/2, 1-
sided, black plus 3 color
inks, with Sheriff's OHice
logo { provided), set up
charges are to be included
in the cost,

51-100 pages

Unbound
$3902.50

Unbound

$6384.70

Unbound

$13,512.10

Unbound
$31,915.10

Unbound

$67,552.10

Unbound

$13.50ea.

Bound

$4056.30

Bound

$7064.70

Bound

$14,127.30

Bound

$35,315.10

Bound

$70,628.10

Bound

$%14.15ea.
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5000 +

‘g Price for Price for Price for Price for Price for .
ltem # Description Quantit
P 250 500 1000 2500 5000 - y
Discount
Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 1- ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
79 s:led. black 'lnké set L}pd d Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
charges are o be included | ApneNpiM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1
in the cost 51 - 100 pages
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 2- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black ink, bi-folded,
stapled, set up charges are | ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
80 to be included in the cost
up fo 50 pages (Victim Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
Assistance Supplemental
Info) PP ADDEMNDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 2- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black ink, bi-folded, ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
81 stapled, set up charges are
to be included in the cost Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
. ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
51-100 pages
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 1- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, black ink, stapled,
in top left comner, yellow ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDLUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
82 paper, set up charges are
to be included in the cost Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
up to 50 pages .
(supplemental guide for ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM 1
Election procedures)
Manuals -11 X 8 1/2, 1- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound unbound
sided, multicolored ink,
three hotes punched, $2784.50 $5569.00 $11,13B.00 $27,845.00 $55,690.00 $11.00ea.
B3 glossy white paper, set up
charges are 1o be included Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
in the cost up to 150 pages
(Poll Worker's Manual) $3034.50 $6069.00 $12,136.00 $30,345.00 $60,690.00 $12.00ea.
Manuals -8 1/12 X 14, 1- Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound Unbound
sided, multicolored card $1193.84 $1341.88 $2697,55 $6690.48 $13,378.85 $2.68ea.
84 stock, b lack ink, two holes
punched, up to 50 pages Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound Bound
(Election day quick $1443.84 $1841.88 $3647.55 $9190.48 %18,378.85 $3.68ea.
reference)
Group 8 — continuous feed forms
. . . . . 5000 +
ltem # Description Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for Quantit
P 250 500 1000 2500 5000 uantity
. Discount
9 1/4 x 4, 3 part continuous
feed receipt forms, pre-
numberad conseculively,
with State of Texas gea{ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
original is white and
85 labeled orginal, second
sheet is pink and labeled
duplicate, and the third
sheet is yellow and labeled
office copy
8% % 11 continuous feed
computer form paper with
RG Stale of Texas Seal NO BID NO BID NQO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
screened in background,
printing on two sides,
printed border in blue ink
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Group 9 — Non-Continuous forms

. . . . . 5000 +
ltem # Description Prl;:;zofor Prlé:gofor qu%ém Przlcg%éor Pg%%éor Quantity
Discount
_11 X 8 1/2, 1-sided, black
87 ink $15.93 | $31.85 $53.70 $99.25 $168.50 +.027 PP
Group 10 — Lists
82 x 11 printing on one SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
side, bound books, comb Add. 1 Add. 1
88 binding, front/back covers : ’ Add. 1 Add. 1 Add. 1 Add. 1
(VR Alpha List for Early
Voting)
B-:f *:'hl I;F!”ﬁtgg ?nﬂﬂﬂe SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
side, stapled in top le
89 comer, 200 pages (Steet | A00-1 | AT gy Add. 1 Add. 1 Add. 1
Guide)
3‘(‘;"2 ’é“-dprif!t:iﬂg onone SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
SITE, Bouna witn a spine,
90 500 pages (ElectionDay | ~9d-1 | Add.1 Add. 1 Add. 1 Add. 1 Add. 1
Alpha List # of pages
varies)
Group 11 — Business Cards
. . . . . 5000 +
Hem # Description Prg:seofor Prlggofcr Pq%%(f]or Pr;;z(f)or Pg%%éor Quantity
Discount
3% X 2, White recycled
stock, one-sided printing,
91 black k. with Logo $29.95 $39.95 $49.95 $79.95 $149.95 .029ea.
3_ B X 2: White stock, one-
92 jﬁﬁig;g"”g- blackink, | $99.95 | $39.95 $49.95 $79.95 $149.95 .029ea.
3% X 2, White recycled
stock, two-sided printing, :
93 black ink. with Logo $39.95 $49.95 $59.95 $89.95 $159.95 .031ea.
3 1% X 2, White stock, two-
04 sided printing, black ink,
with Logo $39.95 $49.95 $59.95 $89.95 $159.95 .031ea.
3% X 2, white recycled
- stock, one-sided printing,
85 multipte color ink, with logo $39.95 $49.95 $59.95 $89.95 $159.95 .031ea.
d 12 X 2, white stock, one-
sided printing, mulliple
96 color ink, with logo $39.95 $49.95 $59.95 $89.95 $159.95 031ea.
3 12 X 2, White recycled
stock, one-sided printing,
g7 raised Ietiering, black ink, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQO BID
with Logo
3% X 2, White stock, one-
sided printing, raised
ggB lettering, black ink, with NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Logo
3 1 X 2, White recycled
stock, two-sided printing,
g9 raised letiering, black ink, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
with Logo

CNTY PRINTING SERVICES-GENERAL & SPECIALIZED FORMS BID
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. [ . . . . 5000 +
s Price for | Price for Price for Price for Price for .
D t
Item # escnphion 250 500 1000 2500 5000 Quantity
Discount
3% X 2, White stock, two-
sided printing, raised
100 lettering, black ink, with NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Logo
3 %2 X 2, white recycled
stock, two-sided printing,
101 raised lettering, black and NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
golden ink, with logo
3 % X 2, white stock, two-
sided printing, raised
102 lettering, black and golden NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ink, with logo
3% X 2, tan recycled
slock, one-sided printing,
103 raised lettering, brown ink, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
with logo
3% X 2, tan stock, one-
sided printing, raised
104 lettering, brown ink, with NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
logo
3% X 2, tan recycled
stock, one-sided printing,
105 raised lettesing, brown ink, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
with logo
3 X 2, 1an slock, one-
sided printing, raised
106 letteing, brown ink, with NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
logo
Group 12 - Overprinting
. . . ) . 5000 + |
ltern # Description Prgzgeofor Prg:gofor Pr;%%éor ng%éor Pl;%%(f)or Quantity
Discount
Dverpn‘nlipg e_addmss
107 voter applications $25.00 | $35.00 $60.00 $135.00 $260.00 0dea.
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
301 SE INNER LOOP - SUITE 106
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://lwcportals.wilco.org/Procurement/

PRINTING SERVICES
FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID NUMBER: 10WCA024
BIDS MUST BE RECEIVED ON OR BEFORE: AUGUST 04, 2009- 9:30AM
BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED: AUGUST 04, 2009- 10:00AM

ADDENDUM # 2

JULY 29, 2009

Please add the following information to Group# 1 on your bid sheet on page 5:
Item# 3 through item#10

| =
. . . . +
lem # Description Price for | Price for | Price for Price for Price for 5{?5?[“
P 250 500 1000 2500 5000 Hantity
Discount
Envelopes, Business
3 N Return, #10-24, Without NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
part = Tint, Without Graphics, -
gum scal
Envelopes, Business ' i
4 12 Return, #10-24, Without NO BID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
part = Tint, With Graphics, rum
seal
Envelopes, Business )
5 part 2 Retumn, #10-24, With NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
par Security Tint, Without
Graphics, gum scal
Envelopes, Business
6 part 2 Return, #10-24, With NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
part = Seccurity Tint, With
Graphics, gum scal

TVNIDIRIO

ORI




Envelopes, Business

7 part 2 Return, #10-24, Window, | NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
- Without Tint, Without
Graphics, pum scal
Envelopes, Business
8 part 2 Return, #10-24, Window, | NOBID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
p Without Tint, With
Graphics, pum scal
Envelopes, Business
Return, #10-24, Window, | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 part 2 With Sccurity Tint,
Without Graphics, gum
seul
Envelopes, Business
10 part 2 Return, #10-24, Window, | NOBID | NO BID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
P With Sceurity Tint, With
Graphics, gum scal
All bidders must acknowledge receipt of Addendum # 2
The addendum consists of 2 pages
. — e .
Print Name LA (ror 2 / %/ T~ Title /%/%ﬁf
~
—
Sign Name_ZA/((cire /%4”—‘*- Date 5’/5 /OC}
= T 7
COMPLETED FORM MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
Sincerely,
Rerviton Heaneock
Kerstin Hancock
Purchasing Specialist
Williamson County
c



