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1 GALLON BIOHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS,; prefer 10 to 50 bags on a rolf or in a bundle. Not more

1 500 EA than 50 per package. 54801 50/bx 3.00 1es = 30.90
2 £00 EA 10 GALLON BIOHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS; prefer 10 to 50 bags on a roll or in a bundle, Not more 55445 50/bx 437 Slos = 24.85
than 50 per package.
3 500 EA 4 X 4 STERILE GAUZE 8252 100/bx 3.75 12ics = 45,00
4 2500 EA 4" X 4" NON-STERILE SFONGES 8 PLY 12278 200/pk 1.86 20/cs = 37,20
5 4-WAY STOPCOCK W/ SWIVEL MALE LUER LOCK NG BID
6 10 EA AGCU-CHECK (ADVANTAGE) GLUCOMETER {NC SUBSTITUTES) 74830 each G&.44 Blcs = 483.52
7 200 BOTTLES ACCU-CHECK GLUCOMETER SIDE TOUCH TEST STRIFS, BOTTLES (NO SUBSTITUTES) NO BID
8 100 SETS ACCL-CHECK GLUCOMETER, AGCURACY TESTING SUPPLIES (FOR AROVE GLUGCOMETER - SET TO NO BID
TEST HIGH AND LOW RANGE)
a 400 EA ADENOCARD &my / 2ml VIALS NO BID
10 200 EA ALBUTEROL 0,083 % UNIT DOSE (30 DOSES PER BOX) 82189 25/bx 2,76 12/cs = 33,12
11 200 BX ALCOHOL PREP PADS @ 200 PER BOX 68537 200/bx 1.78 10/cs =17.80
AMIODARONE {or GENERIC - Bidder to specify which) 180MG / 3ML VIALS {w/ Benzyl Alcohol} NO
12 250 EA AMFULES ACCEFTED 85578 10ipk 18.18
13 250 EA AMIODARONE {or GENERIC - Biddet to specify which) 150MG / 3ML VIALS: True Aqueous Solution {w/o NO BID
Benzyl Alcohol) NO AMPULES ACCEPTED.
14 100 BTL ASPIRIN, ADULT LOW DOSE, B1mg; CHEWABLE TABLETS. 64857 36/btl 0.85)
15 ASPIRIN, ADULT LOW DOSE, B1mg; DISSOLVES IN YOUR MOUTH TABLET (NOT CHEWABLE TABLETS) NG BID
16 500 EA ATROPINE 1MG/10ML., PFS {NEEDLELESS) NO BID
17 600 EA ATROPINE 1MG/MML VIAL NO BiD
BO68E = Biue
18 S0EA BABY BEANIE, FOR NEW BORNS 80587 = Pink each 0.54
19 25 EAGH BACK BOARDS - PEDI IMMOBILIZATION DEVIGE; W/ VELCRO ATTACHMENTS 36867 each 226,82
20 50 EA BACK BOARDS - PEDI; PLASTIC WO PINS. (Prefer a small version of an adult coffin board) NO BID
BACK BOARDS (PLASTIC) -ADULT - 72" L x (min.}16"W. W/ ADULT AND {MIN. OF &) CHILD STRAPPING
21 SOEA LOCATIONS. CONCAVE SHAPE FREFERRED. W/O SPEED CLIPS. W/ LARGE GLOVE GOMPATABLE NO BID
HANDHOLDS; MINIMUM 450 LBS. LOAD CAPACITY. GRAPHICS: Imprinted with "W C E M 8" on top
surface in minimum of 2 Inch {etters.
BACKBOARD RESTRAINT STRAPS: TWO FIECE, 5 ft, LIMITED USE POLYPROPYLENE WOVEN MATERIAL,
22 10G0 EA W/ PLASTIC SIDE RELEASE BUCKLE. W/ PERMANENT STOP ON END OF STRAP TO PREVENT 1T FROM NO BID)
COMING OFF OF THE BUCKLE. (ORANGE)
03 600 BA BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVQIR-DISPOSABLE, ADULT WITH 02 TUBING (LATEX FREE) AMBU 81050 ench 9.00 12/cs = 108.00
SPUR REQUIRED
N K'L .
Bidders Signature S —~yweei LA men 0§ oy
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BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, CHILD, WITH O2 TUBING  (LATEX FREE) AMBU

24 200 EA SPUR REGUIRED B1825 each 11.85 12/cs = 143.40
25 100 EA BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, INFANT, WITH 02 TUBING (LATEX FREE] AMBU 81048 each 11.85 12/cs = 143.40
SPUR REQUIRED
28 50 BX "BAND-AID" BRAND ADHESIVE BANDAGES ; 3/4" X 3" FLEXIBLE FABRIC W/ NON-STICK PAD. 13388 100/bx 3.34 12/cs = 40.08]
27 100 EA BED PANS, FRACTURE STYLE 84442 each| 0,21 24fes = 2184
28 750 EA BENADRYL {DIPHENHYDRAMINE - BIDDER TQ SPECIFY WHICH) 50 MG / 1ML VIALS 844 25/bx 21.88 40/cs = BT4.40
Diphenhydramine
28 500 EA BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE POLYESTER; COT, 60" X 80" SIZE 173721 each 8,42 12/es = 77.04
BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE, INSULATED FOAM LAYER W/ WATERPROOF POLY BACKING: TO BE USED AS
30 200 EA PRIMARY BLANKET AND WEATHER/WIND RESISTANT LAYER - The Thicker the Better, Approximate 0" §8725 each 3.72 18/cs = 86.96
X BO" size. {Send sample)
31 1040 EA BLOGD COLLECTION NEEDLE TUBE HOLDER 71857 250/hg 8.24 dics = 32,96
32 1000 EA BLOOD COLLECTION, MULTISAMPLE LUER ADAPTER (FEMALE); To Draw Blood from SYRINGE 79581 100/bx 10.64 10/es = 106,40,
a3 1000 EA BLOOD COLLECTION, MULTISAMPLE LUER ADAPTER (MALE); To Draw Biood from 1.V. Catheter NO BID
a4 2000 EA BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES {PLASTIC TUBES ONLY); GREEN TOP W/ 68 UNITS LITHIUM HEPRIN, 4 ML NO BID
DRAW GLASS TUBES WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED!
BELOOD COLLECTION TUBES, (PLASTIC TUBES ONLY) - RED TOP, 5 ML DRAW GLASS TUBES WILL NOT
35 3000 EA BE ACCEPTED! NO BID
el 100 EA BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, ADULT: MABIS 50B-01-148-011 ONLY NO BID
37 25 EACH BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, ADULT: NON-LATEX §6298 each 19.76 20/cs = 395.20
38 30EA BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, CHILD: MABIS 5608-01-149-015 ONLY NO 81D
39 50EA BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, INFANT: MABIS 508-01-148-013 NG BID
40 S50 EA BLOOD PRESSURE GUFF, LARGE ADULT: MABIS 508.01-149.016 ONLY NO BID
a1 25 EA BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, THIGH: MABIS 508-01-148.017 ONLY NO BID
BLOOD TRANSFER DEVICE, HOLDER W/ PREATTACHED MULTIPLE SAMPLE FEMALE LUER ADAPTER -
42 1000 EA {BECTON, DICKINSON, AND CO. only) REF. 364880 To Draw Blood from Syringe 85408 100/hx 67.23 Yes =134.46
43 1000 EA BLOOD TRANSFER DEVICE, HOLDER W/ PREATTACHED MULTIPLE SAMPLE MALE LUER ADAPTER NO BID
{BECTON, DICKINSON, AND CO. PREFERRED) To Draw Blood from LY. Catheter
44 2000 EA BLUNT CANNULA - 18 GAUGE {METAL}; FOR NEEDLELESS |V USE. NO BID
45 2000 EA BLUNT CANNULA - PLASTIC; FOR NEEDLELESS IV USE. (BAXTER IV-3345) NO BID
46 BLUNT FILTER NEEDLE, 18GA X 1.5" 67615 100/hx 28.89 10/cs = 288,989
BULB SYRINGE 2 0Z, STERILE IN SEALED PACKAGE. FOR NASAL AND ORAL ASPERATION IN
- 40,00
47 250 EA NEWBORNS AND INFANTS. 683731 each 0.80/ 50ics - 40.0
Bidder's Signature:__: e (= S
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48 200 EA GALCIUM CHLORIDE 10%, 1gm/10mi VIAL SINGLE DOSE UNIT 81744 25/bx| 45,43
48 100 EA CARPOJECT INJECTOR NO BID
50 250 EA GHARGOAL, ACTIVATED, wio Sorbital - 50 GM (BOTTLES ONLY) 802517‘:;: each 20.26 12fcs = 243,12
51 20EA CHILD TRANSPORT SEAT, "FERNO PED] MATE" NO BID
52 1500 EA CIP - MULTI GRIP, ADULY ROUND, ISPOSABLE NO BID,
53 &0 BOTTLES CIDEX OPA DISINFECTANT {no substitutions); in gallon botiles 64477 gallen 39.84 4fcs = 169,36
54 2000 EA CLIP LOCK CANNULA, SAFELINE: TO BE SHIPPED IN BOXES OF 100, (PLASTIC) NO BID
55 500 EA CONFORMING ROLLER BANDAGE - STERILE 4" X 75"; individual wrapped 73984 12/bx, 6.87 Bics = 54.95
{CONTINUOUS POSITIVE AIRWAY PRESSURE SYSTEM (CPAP]: SUPPLIED AS A SINGLE PATIENT UNIT,
INCLUDING FACE MASK, HARNESS, OXYGEN SUPPLY TUBING AND FLOW ACCELERATOR W/ MINIMUM
THREE SIZES AVAILABLE (5M, MED, & LG). THE UNIT MUST BE COMFLETELY SELF CONTAINED,
56 FORTABLE AND DISPOSABLE (A SEPARATE PRESSURE GENERATOR IS UNACCEPTABLE), NO NO BID
EXCEPTIONS. THE SYSTEM MUST BE "FULLY OPEN" TO ALLOW ORAL SUCTIONING AND APPLICATION
OF NEBULIZED MEDICATIONS WITHOUT INTERRUPTICN OF CPAP THERAPY IN ORDER TC PREVENT OR
MINIMIZE POSITIVE END EXFPIRATORY PRESSURE {PEEF).
57| 100 EA DELEE MUCOUS TRAFP 8 FR, w/ bulb suction device attached.  (Latex Free) NO BID
58 1500 EA DEXTROSE 25GM/SOML; PFS @ 10to a Pack. {NEEDLELESS) NO BID
59 100 EA DILTIAZEM 25MG/SML POWDER (NON REFRIGERATED) - NEEDLELESS NO BID
-] 250 EA DILTIAZEM 25MG/SML REFRIGERATED VIALS NO BID
61 DISPENSING PN, MICRO PIN; FOR WITHDRAWAL OR INJECTION OF MEDICATION FROM RUBBER- NO BID
STOPPERED VIALS. LUER LOCK CONNECTOR. LATEX FREE: B. BRAUN # 519-415019 ONLY
DISPENSING PIN, PLASTIC; FOR WITHDRAWAL OR INJECTION OF MEDICATION FROM RUBBER-
62 STOPPERED VIALS, LUER LOCK CONNECTOR. LATEX FREE. PREFER 3/4" TO 1" PIN LENGTH {Send NO BID
sample)
a3 DUAL CANNULA DEVICE W/O SYRINGE. WITH 2 CANNULAS IN ONE UNIT, STEEL CANNULA FOR SYRINGE NG BID
FILLING & PLASTIC BLUNT CANNULA FOR ACCESS INTO A SPLiT SEPTUM.
54 1000 EA DISPOSABLE SICKNESS {(EMESIS) BAG, MEDLINE INDUSTRIES # NON7080D @ 25 per package NON NO BID
LATEX NO SUBSTITUTIONS.
65 2E0 EA DOPAMINE PREMIX 400MG / 250ML BAG 72378 each 5.56 12/es = 66.72,
DRUG CASE, PELICAN HARD SIDED; INCLUDING CLEAR POCKETS W/ MULT! POCKET ELASTIC
86 10 BA POUCHES ATTACHED TO LID TO STORE CONTENTS. SIZE = 20.5"L x 16.75"W x 8,5"D [OUTSIDE NO BiD
DIMENSIONS}. COLOR = ORANGE.
&7 1060 EA DUTY BELT, NYLON, WITH PLASTIC BUCKLE; ADJUSTABLE SIZES. NO BID
Bidder's Signalure; A ls = el
Bidder's Mame:__Moore Medical |L.C " Sandra Wollschiager Date:_B8/3/08 Page 3



ECG ELECTRODES, ADULT; &PKG: FOR 12 LEAD “CLIP ON |.EAD” USE . HIGH TAGK {not "SNAP ON™)

68 1000 Pkg. {Non-Latex} NO BID
ECG ELECTRODES, PEDI; 10/PKG. FOR 12 LEAD "CLIP ON LEAD" USE. HIGH TACK {Non.Latex) AMBU
53 200 Pko. BLUE SENSOR "N" PREFERED NO BID
70 250 EA EMESIS WASH BASINS, DISPOSABLE, LARGE "7 1/4 QUART" (NOT THE £00 CC BASINS) 79442 each 0.58 50/cs = 29.50
71 200 EA EMS SHEARS with SAFETY BANDAGE TIP (PLASTIC TIP, such as Atwater Carey) 7 1/2" (No shorter) NO BID
72 200 EA EMS SHEARS with SAFETY BANDAGE TIP (STRAIGHT METAL OR PLASTIC TiP, not bent) 7 1/2" {no NO BID
shorter)
73 200 EA EMS SHEARS with SAFETY BANDAGE TIP (w/ BANDAGE LIFTER TiP) 7 1/2" (no shorter) NO BID
74 100 EA EPI AUTO INJECTION PEN, ADULT: SINGLE DOSE UNIT {0.3MG) 15738 each £9.33 12/cs = 711.86
75 100 EA EPI AUTO INJECTION PEN, PEDI: SINGLE DOSE UNIT {0.15MG.) 61021 each £9.33 i2/lcs=711.96
76 1500 EA EFINEFPHRINE 1:10,000 1{MG/10ML; PFS @ 10 to a Package. {NEEDLELESS) 77349 10/pk 39.10 S/cs = 185.50
77 250 EA EPINEPHRINE 1:1080 1MG/ ML VIAL OR AMPULE SINGLE DOSE UNIT Ar?psi::: 25/bx 27.20 16/cs = 435.20
78 250 EA ESOPHAGEAL INTUBATION DETECTION DEVICE, AMBU TUBECHEK-B {BULB VERSION) 64521 each 2.32 20/cs = 48,40
70 200 EA ET TUBE INTRODUGCER, FLEXIBLE TUBING THAT WILL REMAIN IN DESIRED SHAPE WHILE BEING USED. NG BID
15fr. DIAMETER With BEND APFROX. 2CM FROM END AND MARKINGS TO INDICATE INTUBATION DEFTH.
a0 100 EA ET TUBE INTRODUGER: FLEXIBLE TUBING THAT WILL RENAIN IN DESIRED SHAPE WHILE BEING USED. NO BID
10fr. DIAMETER With BEND APPROX. 2CM FROM END AND MARKINGS TO INDICATE INTUBATION DEPTH.
81 250 EA ET TUBE RESTRAINT, ADULT, (THOMAS BRAND STYLE) {NO SUBSTITUTES) 54246 each 2.58 100/cs = 258.00
B2 100 EA ET TUBE RESTRAINT, CHILD, {THOMAS BRAND STYLE) (NO SUBSTITUTES) 54288 each 2,58 100/cs = 258,00
B8.0mm = 15181,
83 1000 EA ET TUBE; GUFFED, SIZES - 6.0, 7.0, & 8.0mm (without expiration dates) {LATEX FREE) 7.0mm = 15183, each 113 100/cs = 113.00
8.0mm = 151898
2.5mm = 47683,
3.0mm = 47684,
ET TUBE; UNGUFFED, SIZE RANGES - 2.5, 3.0,3.5,4.0,4.5,5.0 & §.5mm {without expiration dates) 3.5mim = 47685,
B4 100 EA ! ' T T : p 4,0mm = 47686, each 1.07 100/es = 107.00
{LATEX FREE}
4.5mm = 47689,
5.0mm = 47680,
55mm = 47962
B5 200 EA EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC; ADJUSTABLE: INFANT AND PEDI. {AMBY) 65666 each 4.98 30/cs = 148.40
B8 500 EA EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC; 16 SIZE - ADJUSTABLE: ADULT (AMBLU 58897 each 4.98| 30/es = 148.40
87| 200 EA EYE PROTECTION GLASSES W/ ANS! Z87.1 COMPLIANCE - UVEX ASTRO SPEC 3000 46471 each 4.44 200fes = 886.00
EYE PROTECTION GLASSES W/ ANSI Z87.1 COMPLIANCE - UVEX ASTRO SPEGC 3000: OVER THE
R 200/¢s - 1088.00,
88 50 EACH GLASSES STYLE 47838 each 5.44 es t
Bidder's Signature; J b D i R
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89 500 EA FLUIDSHIELD MASK WITH VISOR 82669 251y .89 Bics = 78.12
GEAR BAG, TO STOW BUNKER BOOTS, PANTS, COAT, HLEMET AND GLOVES. Minimum size shall be
241 X 18°H X 15"W. GEAR BAG MATERIAL SHALL BE AT LEAST 1000 DENIER CORDURA OR SIMILAR
50 20 MATERIAL, ABRASION AND TEAR RESISTANT. COLOR SHALL BE ROYAL OR NAVY BLUE W/ WHITE NO BID
"STAR OF LIFE" LOGO (minimum size 6") AND THE LETTERS “WILLIAMSON COUNTY EMS" IN WHITE
COLOR, (Letter size minimum 3")
o1 GLOVES, POWDER FREE; NON-LATEX. SIZES: XTRA SMALL THRU XXXTRA LARGE. MUST MEET OR O BID
EXCEED EMERGENCY MEDICAL GLOVE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 1868, 2003 EDITION
5 = 76083,
GLOVES, POWDER FREE-CHL.OROPRENE, NEOPRO EC: SIZES: XTRA SMALL THRU XXXTRA LARGE M = 75084, e
52 120BOXESEA o) ct be MICROFLEX Brand, no substitution allowed) L = 78085, S0/bx 7.84 10/cs = 76,40
XL - 78067
GLUCAGEN (GLUGAGON) AS A BOXED SET W/ 1 MG VIAL (FOWDER) AND 1ML VIAL STERILE WATER -
o3 200 EA FOR RECONSTITUTION {BEDFORD LABS NDC 55350-004-01) 1378 each 74.36 240/cs = 17648.40
o4 50 EA GOGGLES FOR SPLASH PROTECTION WITH SIDE VENTS AND ANTIFOG LENS, DISPOSABLE 53099 each 1.69 36lcs = 60,84
. HAND SANITIZER, ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES W/ 0.5% GHLOROXYLENOL (VIONEX, by METREX ONLY) i
95 5000 EA eordes # 101510 NO SUaSTITUTIONS 35387 50/bx 6.56 10ics = 65,60
HAND SANITIZER, PURELL TFX TOLGH FREE DISPENSER (SKU: 272012), HOLDS 1200 ml REFILL OF _
86 PURELL FORM SANIT e 82057 each 16.48 12/cs = 197.76
HAND SANITIZER, PURELL TFX 1200 ml REFILL, NON-AEROSOL FOAMING SANITIZER (SKU: 5392.02); TO -
97 USE WITH PURELL TRX TOUCH FREE DISPENSER 2181 each 24.28 2les = 48.52
o HAND SANITIZER, PURELL APX AEROSOL FOAMING SANITIZER; 15 oz, CANISTER: FOR USE WITH O BID
PURELL APX AEROSOL DISPENSING SYSTEM (FURELL SKU: 9888-12)
o HAND SANITIZER, PURELL APX AEROSOL DISPENSING SYSTEM FOR FURELL FOAMING HAND o BID
SANITIZER (SKUi: 9888-12)
HAND SANITIZER, PURELL INSTANT LIQUID {with Molsturizer) by GOJO, IN 2 OZ. BOTTLES ONLY {niot 4 -
100 250 EA o) NO SUBSTITUTIONS 71585 each 1,31 24/es = 31.44
101 200 EA HUBER NEEDLE, SURECAN SAFETY W/ PASSIVE SAFETY CLIP: 20 Ga. X 1 in. (REF. NUMBER 471745} by O BID
B. BRAUN - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
102 2000 EA LV. ADMIN. SET 15 GTT. WITH 2 SAFELINE INJECTION SITES to accept standard needles and blunt NO BID
cananulas {not Luer activated). approx. 100" LENGTH  [Latex Free)
103 250 EA V. ADMIN. SET 60 GTT W/ 1 SAFELINE INJECTION SITE to accept standard needles and blunt cannuias MO BID
{not Luer activated)  (Latex Free)
104 200 EA i.V. CATHETER 10ga X 3"; ED ANGIOCATH NO BID
105 200 EA LV. CATHETER 12ga X 3"; BD ANGIOGATH 71042 10/bx 132.42 Slcs = 662.10
108 30 BX LV. CATHETER 14 GA X 1.25"; PROTECTIV (by CRITIKON) 72288 50/bx 94.78 4les =379.12
107 10 BX LV. CATHETER 14 GA X 1.25"; JELCO CONVENTIONAL CATHETER 59735 50/hx a7.81 dles = 151.64
108 10 BX LV. GATHETER 14 GA X 2°; SURFLO CATHETERS by TERUMO 59744 50/bx 36.38

t
4
Bidders Signature,Z Y da. D
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109 100 BX .V, CATHETER 18 GA X 1.25"; PRGTECTIV {by CRITIKON}) 728868 50/bx 84.78 4fes = 379,12
110 100 BX V. CATHETER 18 GA X 1.25%; PROTECTIV {by CRITIKON) 72281 50/bx 4.8 4fes = 379.12
111 100 BX 1.V. GATHETER 20 GA X 1.25"; PROTECTIV {by GRITIKON) 72282 50/bx 84.78 Alcs=379.12
112 30 BX V. CATHETER 22 GA X 1.00%; PROTEGTIV (by CRITIKON) 72290 50/bK 8478 4jcs = 378.12
113 30 BX LV. GATHETER 24 GA X .75"; PROTECTIV (by GRITIKON) 72291 50/bx 8478 4fcs = 379.12
1.V INJECTION SITE TUBING, with PRE-SLIT {SAFELINE) REMOVEABLE INJEGTION SITE to accept
114 4000 EA stapdard needles and blunt cannulas {net Luer activated) ; 7 LENGTH; LARGE BORE oniy (B. BRAUN NO BID
MEDICAL "NF 1322" style only) ({Latex Free)
1185 10 EA LV. POLE; STRETGHER MOUNT NO BID
118 100 EA 1.v. PRESSURE INFUSER BAG W/ GAUGE, DISPOSABLE: for 1000cc Bags. NO BID
INFEGTION (SOLATION KIT, UNISIZE WITH LONG SLEEVED PERSONAL PROTEGTIVE GOWN, N-95 TYPE
17 200 EA MASK {universal size), HEAD BOUFFANT, SHOE COVERS, AND INFECTIOUS WASTE BAG IN A NO BID
PROTECTIVE BAG OR POUGH. (COMMERCIAL KIT)
118 1200 EA INSTANT GLUCOSE 15 GRAMS (TUBE ONLY) 80915 3ipk 8,85 12fcs = 118.20
118 400 EA INSTANT IGE PACKS 6" X 8" 80545 each 0.43 24/es = 10.32
120 300 EA IPRATROPIUM BROMIDE (ATROVENT - BIDDER TO SFECIFY WHICH) 0.02 % IN 2.6 ML LUNIT DOSE 82188 25ibx 268 24/cs = 64,32
124 50 EA KING LTS-D AIRWAY, SIZE 3 W/ YELLOW CONNECTOR - KLTSDA403 (Tube only, not a kit) NO BID
122 100 EA KING LTS-D AIRWAY, SIZE 4 W/ RED CONNECTOR - KLTSD404 {Tube only, not a kit) NO BID
123 50 EA KING LTS-D AIRWAY, S1ZE 5 W/ PURPLE CONNECTOR - KLTSD405 (Tube anly, not a kit) NO BID
68572
124 25 BX K Y JELLY .08 OZ FOIL PAGK il 1447bx 3.77 12ics = 45.24
125 10EA KENDRICK EXTRICATION DEVICE, such as FERNG MODEL 125 NO BID
LANCETS - SINGLE USE WITH AUTOMATIC SPRING LOADED LANCET RETRACTION AFTER USE ~
128 75 BX (Surgilance One-Step safety lancet SLN 240100 {ORANGE} ) « NO SUBSTITUTIONS 68662 100/6= 1379 16/es = 208.85
27 LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE: (MACINTOSH STYLE) MUST FIT STANDARD RUSCH STYLE NO BID
HANDLE SIZE #0,1,2,3,4
128 LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE: [MILLER STYLE) MUST FIT STANDARD RUSCH STYLE SWALL O BID
HANDLE SIZE #1,2.3.4
T=15185,
128 25 EAGH LARYNGDSCOPE BLADES (MAGINTOSH STYLE, RUSCH BRAND ONLY) -NOT DISP, HOT FIBER OFTIC 2=15185, aach 13.85
80,1,2,3,4 3=15187,
4=15188
T=18181,
130 25 EACH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES (MILLER STYLE, RUSGH BRAND ONLY) - NOT DISP, NOT FIBER OPTIC #1,2,3,4 g = :g:gg each 13.86
- »
4= 15184
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131 S0 EA LARYNGOSCGOFE BULB - LARGE, to fit RUSCH brand biadas, 679585 each
132 50 EA LARYNGOSCOPE BULB - SMALL, to fit RUSCH brand blades. 687954 sach
16178,
133 10 EA LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, RUSCH, LARGE each
Medium
134 10 EA LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, RUSCH, SMALL 1 5;;5: each
135 600 EA LIDOCAINE (XYLOCAINE - Bidder to specify which) 2% 100MG/SML; PFS (NEEDLELESS) NO BID
1386 100 EA LIDOCAINE PREMIX: 2GM/S00ML CONCENTRATICON IN 500ML. BAGS NO BID
137 25 EA MAGILL FORCEPS, ADULT 12071 each
138 25 EA MAGILL FORCEPS, PEDI 12872 each
139 160 EA MAGNESIUM SULFATE PREMIX, 4GM/G0ML CONCENTRATION IN 50ML. BAGS ONLY NO BID
140 100 EA MALE URINAL, PLASTIC 85283 each 0,498 48/cs = 43,20
141 20 EA MAXI DUFFLE BAG WITH 4 SEPARATE ZIPFERED COMPARTMENTS: COLOR - SOLID BLUE NO BID
142 20 EA MAX] DUFFLE BAG, INFECTION CONTROL STYLE, WITH 4 SEPARATE ZIPPERED COMPARTMENTS: NO BID
COLOR - SOLID BLUE
143 500D EA MEDIC ANTI-STICK NEEDLE {SAFELINE G4100 ar EQUIVELANT) NO BID
144 10EA MEGA DUFFLE O2 VERSION WITH 5§ OR 8 SEPARATE ZIPPERED EXTERNAL COMPARTMENTS (COLOR - NO BID
SOLID RED) {140223RD OR EQUIVELANT)
145 10EA MEGA DUFFLE 02 VERSION, INFECTION CONTROL STYLE, WITH 5 OR & SEPARATE ZIFPERED NG SID
EXTERNAL COMPARTMENTS (COLOR - SOLID RED) (140223RD OR EQUIVELANT)
MELKER EMERGENCY CRICOTHYROTOMY CATHETER SET, CUFFED, W/ SMM AIRWAY CATHETER
146 200 EA INNER DIAMETER. (GPN # G26924; RECRDER #: C-TCCSB-500-SPOPS) NO SUBSTITUTIONS. (SPECIAL NO BID
COPERATIONS SETS, CUSTOM PACKAGED IN SLIP PEEL-POUCH DESIGN.)
147 260 EA METHYLPREDNISOLONE (SOLUMEDROL) 125 mg/2 ML ACT-OVIAL WITH STERILE WATER DILUENT ND BID
{SELF CONTAINED UNIT)
148 760 EA MORPHINE SULFATE 10MGAML. CONCENTRATION IN 1 ML. VIALS - SINGLE DOSE UNIT {NOT AMPULES) NO BID
148 200 EA MULTI TRAUMA DRESSING 10" X 30" 77704 each| 0.95 28/cs = 23,75
150 200 EA N95 COMPLIANT FACE MASK, LARGE: that meets or exceeds CDG and NIOSH requirements for 72181 20bx 13.42 8ics = 107.36
Tubearculosis protection.
151 200 EA NS5 COMPI:EANT FAGE MASK, MEDIUM: that meets or exceeds CDC and NIOSH requirements for 77077 20/bx 13.42 Bles = 107.37
Tuberculosis protection.
152 200 EA N9S COMPLIANT FAGE MASK, SMALL: that meats or exceeds CDG and NIOSH reguirements for 3328 20/bx 13.42 8lcs = 107.38
Tuberculosis protection.
183 & EA NS5 FIT TEST KIT {to match above masks). ;‘:f:::l each 130.77

Bidder's Signature, gm_\,i::_h o Lz
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154 100 BX NAIL POLISH REMOVER PACKS BESEE 100/bx 2.47 10/cs = 24.70
185, 750 EA NALOXONE {NARCAN - Bidder to specify which) 2MG/2ML; PFS (NEEDLELESS) 88719 each 14.01
156 4000 EA NASAL CANNULA, ADULT, CURVED TIP (LATEX FREE) 50805 each 0.50 50/cs = 25.00
201 = 52482,
24f = 52484,
157 160 EA NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS, SIZE RANGES - #20, 24, 28, 32, & 26 (non sterile, w/o expiration dates}) 28f = 52486 each 214
ROUSH BRAND #'s 123120 THRU 123136 (l.atex Free) - ' "
32f = 52488,
36f = 52480
158 5000 EA NEEDLE, 21ga. X 17; LUER LOCK, W/ SAFETYGLYDE PROTECTED POINT {SEND PICTURES OR SAMPLE) NO BID
188 2500 EA NEEDLE, 25 ga. X 5/8"; LUER LOCK, W/ SAFETYGLYDE PROTECTED POINT {SEND FICTURES OR 60262 1001bx 13.05 10/cs = 138,60
SAMPLE)
160 40EA NITRO $PRAY, 80 METERED DOSE BOTTLE 79541 each 111.18
161 10000 EA NON REBREATHER MASK (TOTAL) ADULT, WITH RESERVOIR & TUBING  (LATEX FREE} 60789 each 0.96 E0/cs = 48.00
162 1000 EA NON REBREATHER MASK, PEDH; WITH RESERVOIR AND TUBING (LATEX FREE) 60808 each 115 50/cs = 57.50
163 500 EA NORMAL SALINE FOR INJECTION, 0.9%; 10 ML SINGLE DOSE VIAL NO BID
NORMAL SALINE, 0.9%, PREFILLED SYRINGE, 5ML VOLUME IN SML SYRINGE (NOT LUER LOCK,
5 \ , \ .
164 000 EA NEEDLELESS) NO BID
165 NORMAL SALINE, 100 CC BAGS (BAXTER 2B1307; NDC 0328-0040-48) NO BID
166 2000 EA NORMAL SALINE, 1000 CC BAGS 69411 each 0.85 12fes = 10.20
187 2000 EA NORMAL SALINE, 500 GG BAGS 69412 each 0.84 24ics = 20.18)
168 150 EA NUBAIN; 10MGHML VIAL -NOT AMPULES NO BID
168 50 EA OB KIT, W/ SEALED POUCH AND CARDBOARD BOX CONTAINER. MORRISON MEDICAL PRODUCTS (stock NG BID
# DIB7NL) ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTIONS.
40mm = 66539,
170 100 EA ORAL PHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS - SIZE RANGES: 40,60,80,100, MM {Latex Free) ggzm = :g::;' each 0.3 B7BICS = 74.88
400mim = 66544
OXYGEN - BAG VALVE MASK TO NEBULIZER GONNECT KIT: to CONTAIN ALL COMPONENTS NEEDED
171 200 EA TO SUPPLY NEBULIZED MEDICATIONS TO NON-BREATHING PATIENTS VIA A BAG VALVE MASK NG BID
(resuscitator). (EMERGENCY MEDIGAL PRODUCTS # "EMPNEB1" ONLY)
172 160 EA OXYGEN: "D" CYLINDER WRENCH, SMALL, ALUMINUM ONLY (NOT PLASTIC) 11874 each 2.71
473 15EA OXYGEN: "K” CYLINDER LOADING SYSTEM (OzX by Ferno) NO BID
174 50 EA OXYGEN: "K" CYLINDER REGULATOR WRENCH, ALUMINUM, (w/ slotted mounting holes) NO BID
175, 50 EA OXYGEN: CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR MOUNTING ONE “D* CYL. BOTTLE on UNIT. NO BID
Biddars Signatuse; M\ £ My S o
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NO BID

176 50 EA OXYGEN: CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR MOUNTING TWO D" GYL. BOTTLES an UNIT.

OXYGEN: CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR MOUNTING ONE OR TWG "D" GYL BOTTLES on UNIT; "KKK
177 S0 EA APPROVED MOLNT" NOBID
178 25EA OXYGEN: CYLINDER SLEEVE, SOFT BAG, WITH VELCRO ATTACHMENTS TO FIT *D" CYL. NO BID
179 OXYGEN FLOW METER WALL OUTLET ADAPTER: OHIO QG 02 INLET; 1/8" NPT MALE NO BID

OXYGEN: PRECISION FLOW CONTROL VALVE! FIXED FLOW RATE SETTINGS; (OFf,
180 50 EA 1,2,3,4,6,8,10,12,15,20, and 25 LPM) with PREATTACHED MALE QUICK CONNECT FITTING W/ 1/8" MALE NO BID
PIPE THREADS.

181 30 EA OXYGEN: FLOW METER; REPLACEMENT OXYGEN TREE - PLASTIC NO BID
182 500 EA OXYGEN: NEBULIZER W/ MASK - CHILD SIZE (HUDSON RG # 1885, 1707, or 1713 ONLY) (Latex Free) NO BID
183 500 EA OXYGEN: NEBULIZER W/ MASK - ADULT SIZE (HUDSON RC! # 1885, 1706, or 1710 ONLY)  {Latex Free) NO BID

OXYGEN: NEBULIZER, WITH TUBING, MOUTH PIECE, OXYGEN SUPPLY TUBE, AND RESERVOIR TUBE.
184 400 EA {HUDSON MICROMIST KIT # 1883 only) {Latex Free) 63484 So/es 43.25

OXYGEN: PRESSURE REGULATOR FOR "D" SIZE TANK, 0-25 LPM CONSTANT FLOW NON ALUMINURM
185 50 EA CONSTRUCTION W/ PROTECTED CONTENTS GAUGE, W/ 6 YEAR OR LONGER WARRANTY (example = NO BID

LSP RHINO BRASS REGLLATOR)
186 10 EA OXYGEN: PRESSURE REGULATOR, HIGH FLOW: FOR "K” - SIZE OXVGEN TANKS NO BID
187 OXYGEN: SUPPLY TUBING, UNIVERSAL (APPROX. 7 faat length) NO BID
188 500 EA PARA SHIELD FACE SHIELD WITH MASK NO BIB
189 400 EA PENLIGHT, DISPOSABLE:W/ POCKET GLIP AND WHITE LIGHT. 81238 6/pk 3.52 60/CS - 211.20
31 2000 ER ;g;;;g;rv CASES, DISPOSABLE - PAPER COVERED (TIDI BRAND, by BANTA HEALTHGARE I such as EMP 7077 <o0fcs 2069
232 500 EA PILLOWS, DISPOSABLE: 21 oz. NO BID
233 100 EA PILLOWS, DISPOSABLE: INFLATEABLE NO BID
234 150 €A PILLOWS, MEDLINE NYLEX ULTRA (MDT 218716); NON-DISPOSABLE NO BID
235 150 EA PITOCIN (OXYTOGIN) 10 UNITS VIAL  Non Refrigerated Styte only NG BID
236 50 BX PROVIDINE IODINE PREP PADS 68648 100ibx 277 20/CS = 55.40
237 30EA RAINGOATS W/ HOODS AND EMS LOGO, 48" PYC VINYL of longer: Sizes - Sm to XXL; GOLOR YELLOW. NO BID
238 500 EA RAZOR, SHAVE PREP, 2 SIDED, NON STERILE, FIXED HEAD Medtine # DYND70835H ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO BID
238 20 EA REPLAGEMENT MANOMETER, FOR BP GUFF NO BID
240 30EA RES-CUE PUMP, HAND HELD SUGTION UNIT. 65667 each 33.62 20/cs = 642,40
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241 100 EA RES-CUE PUMP, HAND HELD SUCTION REPLACEMENT CANISTERS 65668 each T7.07
242 280 EA ResQPOD CIRCULATORY ENHANCER NO BID
243 10EA RING CUTTER 11702 each 6.22
244 100 EA SALEM SUMP TUBES, DOUBLE LUMEN, SIZES: 12FR and 18FR. (w/o expiration date). (Latex Free) NOT NO BID
LEVIN TUBE!
245 10EA SCO0P STRETGHER: FERNG MODEL 65 NO BID
248 S00EA SHARPS CONTAINER - 5§ QUART, KENDALL SHARPS-A-GOTOR, POINT OF USE: SHARPS CONTAINMENT 85762 each 2.49 a0/es = 7470
SYSTEM (#4838)
247 800 EA SHARPS CONTAINER - 8 QUART, KENDALL SHARPS-A-GATOR POINT OF USE: SHARPS CONTAINMENT NO BID
SYSTEM
248 B0 EA SHARPS CONTAINER HIDDEN BRACKET W/ INDIVIDUAL KEY - TO FIT KENDALL, SHARPS-A-GATOR NO BID
SYSTEM: (#4841-HK)
249 1000 EA SHARPS SHUTTLE, by SAGE: SINGLE USE CONTAINERS {1™ X &) 53649 each 1,45 24/cs = 34.80
250 500 EA SODIUM BICARB. 8.4 % 50 ML; (NEEDLELESS) W/ LUER LOGK PF& NO BiD
SOFT RESTRAINTS, COMMERCIAL. TO SECURE PATIENT FEET AND HANDS TO STRETCHER. NOT
251 NO BID
LEATHER.
8f = 62786,
252 100 EA SOFT TIP SUCTION CATHETERS; SIZES 8FR, 14FR, 8 18FR. (without expiration date) 14f = 62788, each 0.45 80fcs = 22.50
18f = 62793
SPLINT, MULTI-PURPOSE EMERGENCY.WATERPROOF, MALLEABLE POLYVINYL/ALUMINUM
253 100 ea CONSTRUCTION, WASHABLE, REUSEABLE, X-RAY TRANSLUCENT {example: SamSplint) PREFER 37155 each 6,32 60/cs « 379.20
MULTIPLE SIZES AVAILABLE.
254 200 EA SPLINTS 15"-18", PADDED WOOD BOARD {not L.V. Arm Board) 15" = 79631 each 1.81 24/cs = 43.44
255 200EA SPLINTS 36", PADDED WOOD BOARD 75692 each 291 24/cs = £69.84
258 200 EA SPLINTS 54", PADDED WOQOD BOARD 79693 each 3,85 24/cs = 82,40
257 200 EA SPLINTS 8", PADDED 1.V. ARM BOARD 47788 8/pk 3.97
258 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION, 10ML. VIAL NO BID
253 1000 EA gg{iﬁl‘j WATER FOR IRRIGATION, not for INJECTION: 250 CC BOTTLES BAXTER 2F7112 (NPC # 0338- 45311 each 143 2djes = 34.32
280 100 ER STETHOSCOPE DUAL HEAD, GENERIC 66242 each 2.86 50/es = 143.00
281 100 EA STETHOSCOPE, PEDIATRIC SERIES 66246 each 3.53 50/es = 176.50
262 25 EA STRETCHER NET FOR FERNO MODEL 93 ES (HARTWELL MEDICAL CATCH ALL - only) NO BID
283 100 EA STRETCHER REPLACEMENT STRAP; FERNO - TO SECURE WAIST AND FEET/LEGS, 5FT, 2 PIECE NO BID
{BURGUNDY)
Biclder's Slgnatum;m
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264 50 EA STRETCHER REPLAGEMENT STRAP; FERNQ -THE CHEST HARNESS STRAP w/ SHOULDER STRAPS. NO BID
BOTH SIDES OF CHEST HARNESS STRAPS MUST BE ADJUSTABLE. {BURGLINDY)
265 5000 EA STRETCHER SHEET, FLAT TOP, DISPOSABLE; 40" X 72" . (GRAHAM MEDIGAL # 304 - WHITE) NO BID
STRETGHER SHEET; SNUGFIT, NON-WOVEN, FITTED BOTTOM WITH ELASTIC CORNERS, FLUID —
288 5000 EA REPELLANT, DISPOSABLE; 30" X 84", (GRAHAN MEDICAL # 44647 . 8LUE) 71184 Sipk 4.85 10fcs = 48.50
STYLETTE, SATIN-SLIP by MALLINCKRODT; with malieable aluminum covered with plastic sheath, SIZE
67 200 EA BFR. Part # 502501 NO SUSSTITUTIONS NOBID
268 500 EA STYLETTE; SATIN SLIP by MALLINCKRODT; with maiteable aluminum covered with plastic sheath; SiZE NO BID
12FR. Part # 502505 NO SUBSTITUTIONS
269 250 EA SUGCINYLCHOLINE (ANECGTINE) 200 MG / 10ML VIALS (MUST BE SHIPPED REFRIGERATED) NO BID
270 250 EA SUCCINYLCHOLINE (ANECTINE) 200 MG / 10ML VIALS NON-REFRIGERATED STYLE NO BiD
271 200 EA SUCTION CONTAINERS; DISPOSABLE 1280 CC CANISTERS W/ 6" DIAMETER {BEMIS 53554 each 2.46 48jcs = 118.08
SYSTEM I}
272 3o0 EA SUCTION TIP, Hi-D "BIG STICK" by SSCOR part # 44241 W/ CONTROL VENT  {NON LATEX) 68727 each 8.24 10/cs = 82,40
SUCTION TUBING 8/16™ (inside diameter tubing) X 6' W/ MOLDED FEMALE CONNECTORS & MALE
s 300 EA CONNECTOR (NON LATEX) NO BiD
274 10EA SUCTION, BATTERY POWERED: S$-SCORT Il W/ TWO- POSITION REGULATOR (RED COLOR) 62485 each 574.33
275 5EA SUCTION, REPLACEMENT BATTERY FOR S-SCORT Ili 73223 each 42,68
276 10EA SUCTION, REPLACEMENT CHARGER (110VAC TO 12VDC} FOR S-SCORT i NO 8ID
277 1000 EA SYRINGE, 1 CC - SLIP TIP without needle, packaged 5 to a strip, 100 to a box NO BID
278 2000 EA SYRINGE, 10112 CC - LUER LOGK without needle; packaged 5 to a strip & 100 to a box. NO BID
279 2000 EA SYRINGE, 20 CC - SLIP TIP, without needle; packaged {MINIMUM} 40 to a box. NO BID
280 1000 EA SYRINGE, 3 CC - LUER LOCK without needle, packaged 5 to a strip, 100 to a box. NO BID|
28 500 EA SYRINGE, 30/35 CC - SLIP TIP without needle 81843 50/bx 17.87 5lcs = 87.85)
282 500 EA SYRINGE, 60 CC - CATHETER TIP without needle 85267 30/bx 14,56 4les = 68.24
283 500 EA SYRINGE, 60 CC - LUER LOCK without needle 79570 25/bx 11.04 Bics = 66.24
284 200EA SYRINGE, 60CC - SLIP TIP without needie NO BID
285 100 BX TAPE 1" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH (NOT PAPER TAPE} 67544 12/bx 6.94 12/cs = B3.28
286 200 BX TAPE 2" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH (NOT PAPER TAPE} 43155 Bibx 6.94 12/cs = 83.28
287 20 EA TARP WITH STRAPS, HEAVY DUTY, REUSEABLE; for MOVING PATIENTS ACROSS ROUGH GROUND, OUT NO EID
OF BUIL.DINGS, AND/OR FROM ACCIDENT SCENES: minimum 400 Ibs load capacity
Bidder's Signature: Sy n B (8w SoE
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288 1000 EA THERMOMETER COVERS, for ELECTRONIC {DIGITAL) THERMOMETER NO BID
289 50 EA THERMOMETER, ELECTRONIC {DIGITAL), W/ BLUE MARKINGS INDICATING ORAL USE ONLY. NO BID
280 50 EA THERMOMETER, ELECTRONIC (DIGITAL), W/ RED MARKINGS INDICATING RECTAL USE ONLY. NO BID
204 a0 EA THERMOMETER, TEMPORAL ARTERY, HOSPITAL OR DOCTOR OFFICE STYLE (SEND LITURATURE OR NO BID

SAMPLE)
282 200 EA TINCTURE OF BENZOIN; SWAB AMPULES NO BID
283 200 EA TINCTURE OF BENZOIN; SWABSTICKS 77783 50/bx 8,46 10/cs = 84.80
294 2000 EA TOURNIQUET, NON-LATEX (PRE-PAGKAGED-IN-BUNDLES-OF-60) 65324 10/bx 1.27 400/cs = 508.80
285 25 EA TRACTION SPLINT, FARE TECH ADJUSTABLE; ADULT £2286 each 128.57
296 25 EA TRACTION SPLINT, FARE TECH ADJUSTABLE; CHILD 76217 each 128.57
207 20 EA TRAUMA BAG W/ THREE EXTERIOR POCKETS AND DIVIDED CENTRAL COMPARTMENTS - ROYAL BLUE NO BID

(BIDDER TO SEND EXAMPLE OR PICTURE OF BAG WITH BID) ;
208 5000 EA ;f;!:\;!}GULAR BANDAGES, MUSLIN CLOTH 54" X 27" (W /O SAFETY PINS) (PRE-PACKAGED IN BUNDLES 59550 12/pk 2.78 20fcs = 56.60
289 100 EA TUBEX INJECTOR NO BID

VALIUM (DIAZEPAM - BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 10MG/2ML CONCENTRATION IN 2 ML. P.F.5.
300 300 EA (NEEDLELESS) NO BID
301 100 EA VECURONIUM BROMIDE, 10 mg / 10mi VIAL (KIT w/ STERILE WATER DILUENT INCLUDED} NO BID
302 2000 EA VENI-GARD {BRAND} ADULT 3" X 2.5" IV SITE SECURING DEVICE NO BID
303 1000 EA VENI-GARD (BRAND) JUNIOR 2.5" X 1.625" |V SITE SECURING DEVICE NO BID

VERSED {(MIDAZOLAM - BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 10MG/ZML CONCENTRATION N 2 ML. VIALS
304 250 EA SINGLE DOSE UNITS. NO BiD
308 250 EA ZOFRAN (ONDANSETRON) 4MG/2ML VIALS - SINGLE DOSE UNITS NO BID
308! ZOFRAN (ONDANSETRON) 4MG,2ML ISEGURE PRE-FILLED SYRINGE NO BID

<: !
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